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118th  H.R. 1511 

Renewing 
Immigration 
Provisions of 
the 
Immigration 
Act of 1929 

Representative 
Zoe Lofgren  

Would update the 
qualifications needed to 
establish permanent 
residency and obtain a green 
card in the U.S. Introduced  Support   

Sent letter to 
Rep. Lofgren 
4/18/23 

118th  S. 188 

Wildfire 
Emergency 
Act of 2023 

Senator Dianne 
Feinstein 

Would direct the Secretary of 
Agriculture to select and 
implement landscape-scale 
forest restoration projects, to 
assist communities in 
increasing their resilience to 
wildfire, and for other 
purposes. Introduced  Monitor N/A 

118th  H.R. 773 

Homelessness 
and 
Behavioral 
Health Care 
Coordination 
Act of 2023 

Representative 
Madeleine 
Dean  

Would authorize a grant 
program within the 
Department of Housing and 
Urban Development for local 
governments, continuums of 
care, and community-based 
organizations to provide 
services for people 
experiencing homelessness 
and better coordinate 
services.  Introduced  Support   

Sent Mayor 
letter to House 
and Senate 
leadership 
12/11/23  
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118th  S. 24 

Fighting 
Homelessness 
through 
services and 
Housing Act  

Senator Dianne 
Feinstein 

Would authorize a grant 
program within the 
Department of Housing and 
Urban Development for local 
governments, continuums of 
care, and community-based 
organizations to provide 
services for people 
experiencing homelessness 
and better coordinate 
services.  Introduced  Monitor N/A 

118th  S. 870 
Fire Grants 
and Safety Act 

Senator Gary 
Peters 

Would extend the Assistance 
to Firefighters Grant program, 
staffing for Adequate Fire and 
Emergency Response grant 
program, and the United 
States Fire Administration 
through 2030. 

Enacted 
into law Support   

Sent letter to 
Congressional 
Delegation 
5/15/23 

117th & 
118th  

S. 1323/ 
H.R. 2891  

SAFE Banking 
Act of 2023 

Senator 
Merkley; 
Representative 
Joyce  

Would allow cannabis and 
cannabis-related businesses 
to access traditional banking 
services such as lines of 
credit, loans, and wealth 
management. 

Passed 
the House 
in 117th 
Congress, 
Heard in 
Senate 
Policy 
Committee 
in 118th 
Congress  Support  

Sent letter to 
Congressional 
Leadership 
12/12/23 and 
5/18/23 
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118th  H.R. 3557 

American 
Broadband  
Deployment 
Act of 2023 

Representative 
Earl Carter 

Would erode the City's ability 
to maximize public safety and 
public benefit from rights-of-
way, as well as failing to 
establish requirements for  
telecommunications providers 
to work with local 
governments to close the 
digital divide.  

Marked up 
by House 
Energy 
and 
Commerce 
Committee  Oppose  

Sent letter to 
Congressional 
Delegation 
5/24/23 

118th  S. 1704 EVs for all Act Senator Booker 

Would direct the Secretary of 
Energy to establish a grant 
program to facilitate electric 
vehicle sharing services 
operated at public housing 
projects, and for other 
purposes. Introduced  Support 

Sent letter to 
Congressional 
Delegation 
6/7/23 

118th  
H. R. 
2701 

Online Privacy 
Act  

Representative 
Eshoo  

Would create user data 
rights, places limitations and 
obligations on the ability of 
companies to collect and use 
user data and establishes a 
Digital Privacy Agency to 
enforce privacy laws. Introduced  Support   

Sent letter to 
Reps. Lofgren 
and Eshoo 
5/12/23 

118th  H.R. 1837 

Investing in 
Our 
Communities 
Act 

Representative 
Kustoff 

Would reinstate the exclusion 
from gross income for  
interest on certain bonds 
issued to advance the 
refunding of a prior bond 
issue. Introduced  Support 

Sent letter to 
Reps. 
McCarthy and 
Jeffries 4/24/23 
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118th  
S. 1724/ 
H.R. 3473 

Bicycle 
Commuter Act 
of 2023 

Senator Brown; 
Representative 
Blumenauer 

Would amend the Internal 
Revenue Code to modify 
employer-provided fringe 
benefits for bicycle 
commuting. Introduced  Support 

Sent letter to 
Rep. 
Blumenauer 
6/29/23 

118th  
S. 1557/ 
H.R. 3238  

Affordable 
Housing Credit 
Improvement 
Act 

Senator 
Cantwell; 
Representative 
LaHood 

Would expand and 
strengthen the Low-Income 
Housing Tax Credit. Introduced  Support   

Sent letter to 
Congressional 
Leadership and 
San José 
delegation 
6/30/23; Mayor 
signed Mayor's 
and CEO's 
Housing letter 
8/23/23 

118th  S. 2701 
Housing for All 
Act of 2023  Senator Padilla  

Would increase federal 
funding for affordable housing 
and addressing 
homelessness. Introduced  Support   

Mayor 
supported 
7/26/23; Big 
City Mayors’ 
letter  

118th  H.R. 3372 

To establish a 
safety data 
collection 
program for 
certain six-
axle vehicles, 
and for other 
purposes 

Representative 
R. Johnson 

Would establish a 10-year 
“pilot program” for states to 
test 91,000-pound trucks, a 
14% weight increase over the 
current limit of 80,000 
pounds. Introduced  Monitor N/A 

118th  H.R. 3965 

Extreme Heat 
Emergency 
Act of 2023 

Representative 
Gallego 

Would add extreme heat to 
the list of major disasters. Introduced  Monitor N/A 
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118th  S. 2654 

Water 
Efficiency, 
Conservation, 
and 
Sustainability 
Act of 2023 Senator Padilla  

Would increase efficiency and 
conservation in public water 
systems, and for other 
purposes. Introduced  Monitor N/A 

118th  
S. 2933/ 
H.R. 4531 

Safe 
Response Act 

Senator 
Baldwin 

Would reauthorize elements 
of the Support Act and 
expands the federal response 
to the opioid crisis. These 
bills help provide coverage for 
mental and behavioral health 
treatment, expand telehealth, 
reauthorize Medicaid 
coverage for substance use 
disorders, improve testing 
capabilities for controlled 
substances, increase trauma-
informed care for children, 
and revamp opioid monitoring 
and regulation.  

Passed 
the House  Support   

Sent letter to 
House 
Leadership 
8/17/23 

118th  S. 2286 

Streamlining 
Federal 
Grants Act of 
2023 Senator Peters 

Would improve the 
effectiveness and 
performance of certain 
federal financial assistance 
programs. Introduced  Support 

Sent letter to 
Sen. Peters 
9/27/23 

118th  
S.1257/ 
H.R. 3776 

Family 
Stability and 
Opportunity 
Vouchers Act 
of 2023 

Senator Van 
Hollen; 
Representative 
Neguse 

Would pair housing vouchers 
with customized support 
services to increase 
economic  
mobility in families. Introduced  Support   

Sent letter to 
Congressional 
Leadership 
10/6/23 
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118th  H.R. 5433  

Child Care 
Stabilization 
Act 

Representative 
Katherine Clark  

Would extend the Child Care 
Stabilization Program through 
fiscal year 2028.  Introduced  Support   

Sent letter to 
Rep. Lofgren 
12/15/23 

118th  H.R. 5807 

Microgrid 
Controllers 
Energy Credit 

Representative 
Panetta 

Would amend the Internal 
Revenue Code of 1986 to 
extend the energy credit with 
respect to microgrid 
controllers. Introduced  Monitor N/A 

118th  H.R. 5618 

Clean Energy 
Victory Bond 
Act of 2023 

Representative 
Lofgren 

Would direct the Secretary of 
the Treasury to issue Clean 
Energy Victory Bonds. Introduced  Monitor N/A 

118th  S. 1685 
SUPERSAFE 
Act Senator Padilla  

Would direct the 
Administrator of the 
Environmental Protection 
Agency to establish a 
consortium relating to 
exposures to toxic 
substances and identifying 
chemicals that are safe to 
use. Introduced  Monitor N/A 

118th  S. 2224 

Stop 
Predatory 
Investing Act  Senator Brown  

Would amend the Internal 
Revenue Code of 1986 to 
deny interest and 
depreciation deductions for 
taxpayers owning 50 or more 
single family properties. Introduced Support 

Sent letter to 
sponsors 
2/13/24 



Attachment A: 2023-2024 Intergovernmental Relations Priority Federal Legislation Log 
 

Last Updated 12/06/24        Page 7 of 11 

Congress  
Bill 
Number Bill Title  Bill Sponsor Bill Summary  Bill Status  

City 
Position  

Action(s) 
Taken 

118th  H.R. 5145 

Working for 
Immigrant 
Safety and 
Empowerment 
Act of 2023 

Representative 
Jayapal 

Would extend immigration 
benefits to survivors of 
domestic violence, sexual 
assault, human trafficking, 
and other gender-based 
violence, and for other 
purposes. Introduced Support 

Sent letter to 
sponsors 
2/13/24 

118th  H.R. 1325 

Asylum 
Seeker Work 
Authorization 
Act 

Representative 
Pingree 

Would permit asylum seekers 
to be eligible for employment 
in the U.S.  Introduced Support 

Sent letter to 
sponsors 
2/13/24 

118th  
S. 2713/ 
H.R. 6203 

Farmers 
Feeding 
America Act  

Senator Casey, 
Representative 
Salinas 

Would double funding for the 
Emergency Food Assistance  
Program to provide funding 
and food to emergency 
feeding organizations such as 
shelters and food banks. This 
program also supports local 
agriculture by enabling the 
U.S. Department of 
Agriculture to purchase food 
directly from producers. Introduce Support 

Sent letter to 
sponsors, Sen. 
Padilla, and 
Rep. Panetta 
12/8/23 

118th  H.R. 6655 

A Stronger 
Workforce for 
America Act 

Representative 
Foxx 

Would amend and 
reauthorize the Workforce 
Innovation and Opportunity 
Act. 

Passed 
the House  Monitor  N/A 

118th  
S. 3024/ 
H.R. 5886 

Promoting 
Access to 
Broadband Act  

Senator Durbin; 
Representative 
Robin 

Would help states increase 
awareness and enrollment in 
the Federal Communications 
Commission's Lifeline 
program and Affordable 
Connectivity Program Introduced Support 

Sent to 
sponsors, Sen. 
Padilla 
12/12/23 
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118th  H.R. 6129 

Studying 
NEPA's 
Impact on 
Projects Act 

Representative 
Panetta 

Would require the Council on 
Environmental Quality to 
publish an annual report on 
environmental reviews and 
causes of action based on 
compliance with the National 
Environmental Policy Act of 
1969, and for other purposes. Introduced Monitor  

Sent letter to 
sponsors on 
04/3/24 

118th  H.R. 6929 

Affordable 
Connectivity 
Program 
Extension Act 
of 2024 

Representative 
Clarke 

Would extend and provide 
funding for the Affordable 
Connectivity Program. Introduced  Support 

Sent letter to 
sponsors 
01/12/24 and 
4/12/2024 

118th  H.R. 6970 

Decent, 
Affordable, 
Safe Housing 
for All Act 

Representative 
Hoyle 

Would provide grants, loans, 
tax credits, and other 
assistance to promote the 
building, maintenance, and 
affordability of housing. Introduced  Monitor  N/A 

118th  H.R. 7024 

Tax Relief for 
American 
Families and 
Workers Act of 
2024 

Representatives 
Smith and 
Wyden 

Would increase and update 
child tax credit provisions, 
increase the low-income 
housing tax credit, and modify 
tax allowances. 

Passed 
the House  Support 

Sent letter to 
sponsors 
02/09/24 

118th  H.R.7126 

AV 
Accessibility 
Act 

Representatives 
Stanton and 
Mast  

Would provide people with 
disabilities better access to 
the mobility and 
independence benefits of 
ride-hail autonomous 
vehicles. Introduced  Monitor  N/A 
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118th  S. 3612 

Access to 
Family 
Building Act 

Representative 
Duckworth 

Would provide a statutory 
right to access assisted 
reproductive technology (e.g., 
in vitro fertilization). Introduced  Support 

Sent letter to 
sponsors 
3/7/24 

118th  H.R. 7023 

Creating 
Confidence in 
Clean Water 
Permitting Act 

Representative 
Rouzer 

Would director the 
Environmental Protection 
Agency to develop new or 
revised water quality criteria 
for states through a rule. 

Passed 
the House Monitor  N/A 

118th  S. 3830 

Low-Income 
Household 
Water 
Assistance 
Program 
Establishment 
Act Senator Padilla  

Would establish a permanent, 
nationwide water assistance 
program to help families 
afford their water bills. Introduced  Support 

Sent letter to 
sponsor 
6/12/24 

118th  S. 4134 

Drought Relief 
Obtained 
Using 
Government 
Help Today 
Act Senator Padilla  

Would amend WIFIA 
regarding the total amount of 
federal assistance for water 
projects. Introduced  Support 

Sent letter to 
sponsor 
6/12/24 

118th  H.R. 8596 

Maximizing 
Agency 
Integration on 
Letter Theft 
Act  

Representatives 
Panetta and 
Kim 

Would establish cross-agency 
coordination on mail theft and 
raises it as a priority for 
federal law enforcement.  Introduced  Support 

Sent letter to 
sponsors 
6/12/24 
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118th  H.R. 7944 

Water 
Systems 
PFAS Liability 
Protection Act 

Representative 
Curtis 

Would exempt certain entities 
from liability under CERCLA 
with respect to releases of 
perfluoroalkyl and 
polyfluoroalkyl substances, 
and for other purposes. Introduced  Support 

Sent letter to 
sponsors 
6/25/24 

118th  S. 3444 

Local 9–8–8 
Response Act 
of 2023 Senator Padilla  

Would amend the 
Communications Act of 1934 
to improve the accessibility of 
9–8–8, and for other 
purposes. Introduced  Monitor  

Sent letter to 
sponsors 
11/25/24 

118th  H.R. 7581 

Improving Law 
Enforcement 
Officer Safety 
and Wellness 
Through Data 
Act 

Representative 
Bishop 

Would require the 
Department of Justice to 
report on targeted attacks on 
law enforcement officers and 
the mental health resources 
that are available to law 
enforcement officers. 

Passed 
the House  Monitor  N/A 

118th  H.R. 8582 

Federal 
Disaster 
Assistance Act 

Representative 
Brownley 

Would improve Federal 
disaster management and 
response for disadvantaged 
communities, and for other 
purposes. Introduced  Monitor  N/A 

118th H.R. 8581 

Disaster Loan 
Forgiveness 
Act 

Representative 
Brownley 

Would amend the Small 
Business Act to provide for 
cancellation or repayment for 
certain Small Business 
Administration disaster loan. Introduced Monitor  N/A 
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118th S. 1267 

Fair Housing 
Improvement 
Act Senator Kaine 

Would amend the Fair 
Housing Act to prohibit 
discrimination based on 
source of income, veteran 
status, or military status. Introduced Monitor  N/A 

118th H.R. 3776 

Family 
Stability and 
Opportunity 
Act 

Representative 
Neguse 

Would authorize a new type 
of housing choice voucher to 
increase housing 
opportunities and improve life 
outcomes of poor children. Introduced Monitor  N/A 

118th H.R. 8980 

Securing Help 
for Immigrants 
through 
Education and 
Legal 
Development 
Act 

Representative 
Garcia 

Would provide grants to 
support the recruitment, 
training, and development of 
staff and infrastructure 
needed to support the due 
process rights of individuals 
facing deportation. Introduced Support 

Sent letter to 
sponsors 
11/04/24 

118th S. 4814 

Transportation 
Assistance for 
Olympic and 
World Cup 
Cities Act 

Senator 
Cantwell 

Would provide assistance for 
cities hosting international 
sporting events taking place 
in the United States, and for 
other purposes. Introduced Support 

Sent letter to 
sponsors 
11/25/24 

118th H.R. 2892 

Weather Alert 
Response and 
Notification 
Act 

Representative 
Langworthy 

Would study the effectiveness 
of local alerting systems in 
disseminating timely and 
relevant information during 
weather-related emergencies. Introduced Support 

Sent letter to 
sponsors 
12/6/24 
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AB 2 Ward, D 
 

Recycling: 
solar 
photovoltaic 
modules. 

06/28/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/14/2023) 

08/31/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The Electronic Waste Recycling Act of 2003 (act) requires a retailer selling a covered electronic 
device in this state to collect from a consumer at the time of retail sale a covered electronic waste 
recycling fee or a covered battery-embedded waste recycling fee, as specified. The act defines 
“covered electronic device” to include certain video display devices and battery-embedded 
products. The act requires all charges collected pursuant to the act to be deposited into specified 
subaccounts within the Electronic Waste Recovery and Recycling Account, and outlines certain 
other requirements related to the establishment, adjustment, and administration of the charge. 
Moneys in the subaccounts are continuously appropriated for specified purposes, including, but 
not limited to, paying covered electronic waste recycling fee refunds and making electronic waste 
recovery and recycling payments. Current law incorporates the requirements and other provisions 
of the act by reference as requirements and provisions of the hazardous waste control laws. The 
act also expressly authorizes the Department of Toxic Substances Control (DTSC) to enforce the 
act, and all regulations adopted pursuant to the act, through the hazardous waste control laws. A 
violation of the hazardous waste control laws is a crime. This bill would, among other things, 
expand the definition of “covered electronic device” to include a “customer-owned solar PV 
module,” as defined, thereby expanding the scope of the act to include covered solar photovoltaic 
(PV) module products, for limited purposes, as provided. The bill would also require, on or before 
October 1, 2026, and on or before October 1 each year thereafter, CalRecycle to establish a 
covered solar PV recycling fee based on the reasonable regulatory costs to administer covered 
electronic waste recycling. The bill would require the charge to be imposed upon a consumer or a 
service provider serving the consumer for the purchase of a new or refurbished covered solar PV 
module product. The bill would also require the charge to be adjusted annually based on the 
California Consumer Price Index. The bill would create the Covered Solar PV Module Recycling 
Fee Subaccount as a continuously appropriated fund in the Electronic Waste Recovery and 
Recycling Account. Because the funds deposited to the Covered Solar PV Module Recycling Fee 
Subaccount would be a new source of funds in the continuously appropriated subaccount within 
the continuously appropriated Electronic Waste Recovery and Recycling Account, the bill would 
make an appropriation.   (Based on  06/28/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 6 Friedman, D 
 

Transportation 
planning: 
regional 
transportation 
plans: 
reduction of 
greenhouse 
gas emissions. 

05/30/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
TRANS. on 
5/30/2024) 

07/02/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law requires certain transportation planning agencies to prepare and adopt regional 
transportation plans directed at achieving a coordinated and balanced regional transportation 
system. Current law requires that each regional transportation plan include a sustainable 
communities strategy prepared by each metropolitan planning organization in order to, among 
other things, achieve certain regional targets established by the State Air Resources Board for the 
reduction of greenhouse gas emissions from automobiles and light trucks in the region for 2020 
and 2035, respectively. Current law requires the state board to update the regional targets every 8 
years until 2050. Current law requires a metropolitan planning organization, before adopting a 
sustainable communities strategy, to quantify the reduction in the emissions of greenhouse gases 
projected to be achieved by the sustainable communities strategy and set forth the difference, if 
any, between the amount of that reduction and the regional targets. This bill would require the 
state board to update the regional targets indefinitely, rather than only until 2050, and authorize 
the state board to update the years to which those targets apply, as specified.   (Based 
on  05/30/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ChbyE29FvMb8hzaXniGAgmVTjyV8EYKEQ/BMnJG7rqrA7LBLtYOVu+c7P0bEC2eNvv9qEMGP84Yh7cVr3fjlKuE+J/5MBX2Zz+Xdgj9UhG0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/328
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_2_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_2_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_2_94_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=G5dlU49mCp3iAMAS4WhpEEeqm/mMI9vgxanS7Q45tBEYP8eK3ODQPmGHbVMso3ahDofBo4APsULebhKAkQGrA0EWJ66BNks3W6g0I3EpaFU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/445
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_6_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_6_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_6_97_A_bill.pdf
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AB 7 Friedman, D 
 

Transportation: 
planning: 
project 
selection 
processes. 

09/01/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
INACTIVE 
FILE on 
9/11/2023) 

08/31/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The Transportation Agency is under the supervision of the Secretary of Transportation, who has 
the power of general supervision over each department within the agency. The secretary, among 
other duties, is charged with developing and reporting to the Governor on legislative, budgetary, 
and administrative programs to accomplish coordinated planning and policy formulation in matters 
of public interest, including transportation projects. On and after January 1, 2025, and to the extent 
applicable, feasible, and cost effective, this bill would require the agency, the Department of 
Transportation, and the California Transportation Commission to incorporate specified goals into 
program funding guidelines and processes.    (Based on  09/01/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 9 Muratsuchi, D 
 

Greenhouse 
gases: market-
based 
compliance 
mechanism. 

04/17/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Died on 
inactive file.  

02/01/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The California Global Warming Solutions Act of 2006 authorizes the State Air Resources Board to 
include the use of market-based compliance mechanisms in regulating greenhouse gas emissions. 
The act requires the state board to prepare and approve a scoping plan for achieving the 
maximum technologically feasible and cost-effective reductions in greenhouse gas emissions and 
to update the scoping plan at least once every 5 years. This bill would require the state board to 
initiate a regulatory process to evaluate potential updates to the market-based compliance 
mechanism, and would require regulatory changes to take effect no later than January 1, 2025. 
The bill would require the evaluation to focus on specified items, including whether the supply of 
emission allowances and carbon offsets are consistent with a linear trajectory toward the statewide 
greenhouse gas emissions reduction goal established in the state board’s most recent scoping 
plan, rules for banking allowances to use for future compliance, and recommendations made by 
the Independent Emissions Market Advisory Committee and the state board’s environmental 
justice advisory committee. The bill would require the state board, beginning January 1, 2028, and 
subsequently on a triennial basis, as specified, and in consultation with the Independent Emissions 
Market Advisory Committee and the environmental justice advisory committee, to conduct an 
evaluation of the market-based compliance mechanism, as provided.   (Based on  04/17/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 11 Jackson, D 
 

Milton Marks 
“Little Hoover” 
Commission on 
California State 
Government 
Organization 
and Economy. 

03/23/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law establishes the Milton Marks “Little Hoover” Commission on California State 
Government Organization and Economy (the commission) for the purpose of securing assistance 
for the Governor and itself in promoting economy, efficiency, and improved service in the 
transaction of the public business, as specified, and in making the operation of all state 
departments, agencies, and instrumentalities, and all expenditures of public funds, more directly 
responsive to the wishes of the people as expressed by their elected representatives through 
various means. Existing law declares that the availability of housing is of vital statewide 
importance. Current law declares that the provision of housing affordable to low- and moderate-
income households requires the cooperation of all levels of government. Current law declares that 
housing prices in California have risen dramatically in all parts of the state in the past decade, 
while the wealth gap, especially the racial wealth gap, continues to be a growing problem in 
California. This bill would require the commission to study the causes and effects of the rising cost 
of living in California and develop solutions toward making California a more affordable place to 
live, as specified. The bill would require the commission to meet quarterly, as specified. The bill 
would require the commission to complete 2 reports describing the commission’s findings and 
recommendations, as specified. The bill would repeal these provisions as of January 1, 
2027.   (Based on  03/23/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=/Z4zzSJ8Ilr+RfhjF82xMq0+YNSxBqj4Hh1uD3eoHbor67eeCzeAC4bNh7tFarleLk9pR9tCwMDH2BTyJyFLSTbjEU8MrYNPlPwdKku1AOQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/445
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_7_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_7_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_7_95_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=dLpyR4Wto9sSiBuslnp0IIIK8R0ZSgvyacPoSny7+AijPYaUZLkE+Cdtnve4vmDx3ygzqYOp9OGrQEZW/FlD4LlMlJdZeB4tk2lARtI68Kk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/452
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_9_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_9_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_9_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=jNDdvT483fiZw6jUG3mtICd+XEkC5kG5jkccz1JLEA53TKToeUk+u6FGVNEIfy2xxTx37jWzq7LKrYXfRO7yl+HyHLJQAD2Z1G9nkkLXJIU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/379
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_11_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_11_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_11_97_A_bill.pdf
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AB 12 Haney, D 
 

Tenancy: 
security 
deposits. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
733, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would, beginning July 1, 2024, instead prohibit a landlord from demanding or receiving security for 
a rental agreement for residential property in an amount or value in excess of an amount equal to 
one month's rent, regardless of whether the residential property is unfurnished or furnished, in 
addition to any rent for the first month paid on or before initial occupancy. The bill, unless the 
prospective tenant is a service member, as defined, would prohibit a landlord from demanding or 
receiving security for a rental agreement for residential property in an amount or value in excess of 
2 months' rent, in addition to any rent for the first month, if the landlord (1) is a natural person or a 
limited liability corporation in which all members are natural persons and (2) owns no more than 2 
residential rental properties that collectively include no more than 4 dwelling units offered for rent. 
This bill contains other related provisions and other existing laws.   (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

AB 12 
SUPPORT 
9Aug23 
AB 12 GOV RFS 
10Sept23  

Support 

AB 18 Patterson, 
Joe, R 
 

Controlled 
substances. 

12/05/2022 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law makes it a crime to possess for sale or purchase for purpose of sale, transport, sell, 
furnish, administer, give away, manufacture, compound, convert, produce, derive, process, or 
prepare various controlled substances, including, among others, fentanyl, peyote, and various 
other opiates and narcotics. This bill would require a person who is convicted of, or who pleads 
guilty or no contest to, the above crimes to receive a written advisory of the danger of 
manufacturing or distribution of controlled substances and that, if a person dies as a result of that 
action, the manufacturer or distributor can be charged with voluntary manslaughter or 
murder.   (Based on  12/05/2022 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 21 Gipson, D 
 

Peace officers: 
training. 

12/05/2022 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law requires the Commission on Peace Officer Standards and Training (POST) to require 
field training officers who are instructors for the field training program to have at least 8 hours of 
crisis intervention behavioral health training to better train new peace officers on how to effectively 
interact with persons with mental illness or intellectual disability. This bill would require the 
commission to revise that training to include instruction on how to effectively interact with persons 
with Alzheimer’s disease or dementia. The bill would specify that a field training officer who 
completed the training prior to January 1, 2025, or who is exempt from completing the training, is 
not required to take the updated training, but would require a field training officer who has not 
completed the training on or after January 1, 2025, or who is not exempt from completing the 
training, to complete the revised training. The bill would exempt jurisdictions that, prior to January 
1, 2024, develop a training that meets the same requirements.    (Based on  12/05/2022 text) 

AB 
21_SUPPORT15
May23 

Support 

AB 24 Haney, D 
 

Emergency 
response: 
opioid 
antagonist kits. 

04/26/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would require the State Department of Public Health to compile a list of all counties that are 
experiencing an opioid overdose crisis, as defined, and publish the list on its internet website. The 
bill would also require the department to provide opioid antagonist kits free of charge to as many 
designated facilities as possible in the counties on the list, to create the opioid antagonist poster 
with easy-to-understand instructions and graphics on the administration of the attached opioid 
antagonist nasal spray, and to make the determination on how best to allocate and distribute its 
limited supply of opioid antagonist among its various programs in the event of an opioid antagonist 
supply shortage.   (Based on  04/26/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=4prcoNyLMCHZCfISr2Kg2NmhnB4Pq4pq81SkYDqBhUm6Ub+k0+ez/1J5SISYq/Jv+g2NQ+Iss+IkLaJHgD6ZQPFELXNjqv2PaB/tLkZ+Uuw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/503
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_12_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_12_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=D394CDAC-154A-4B1D-A964-6B46C0D17ED1
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=D394CDAC-154A-4B1D-A964-6B46C0D17ED1
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=D394CDAC-154A-4B1D-A964-6B46C0D17ED1
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=FE0693F1-1C27-47D5-9E96-39A4C206BBBB
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=FE0693F1-1C27-47D5-9E96-39A4C206BBBB
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=DLeM6jVyS09731To+aAGJEGJuf7Fv3tiAqYr196nQTtKsuUooChtEQxQdMMy0oJnTTPp8I7drrshyxh0eor0mz9ykrBG7r+JNxqncijsi7k=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/354
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/354
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_18_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_18_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=lkvJuTK8rYjOqPEsALghT4HHMhsALHs++ZD9eiWm34l9p7ZQxsM3MLa0BVJKPMIutdhyB3ibl/I6Wp+eGSQZvEOxBW2GISllQT/rV1eYz6g=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/451
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_21_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_21_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=450BA683-89E2-4163-89F5-7A111A5572A1
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=450BA683-89E2-4163-89F5-7A111A5572A1
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=450BA683-89E2-4163-89F5-7A111A5572A1
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=LSmpTz7VxdMjh9NeRxGdor+4hCgg6g4Ac4wK1qlkmQRH+3yAr0P5rHu9jWFkQgak12vWuDGcCf2apjlm38ZLxKZccLnXH4wxDtZVlPPiGvE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/503
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_24_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_24_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_24_95_A_bill.pdf
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AB 28 Gabriel, D 
 

Firearms and 
ammunition: 
excise tax. 

09/26/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/26/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
231, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

09/26/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law establishes the California Violence Intervention and Prevention (CalVIP) Grant 
Program, administered by the Board of State and Community Corrections, to award competitive 
grants for the purpose of violence intervention and prevention. This bill, the Gun Violence 
Prevention and School Safety Act, would, commencing July 1, 2024, impose an excise tax in the 
amount of 11% of the gross receipts from the retail sale in this state of a firearm, firearm precursor 
part, and ammunition, as specified. The tax would be collected by the state pursuant to the Fee 
Collection Procedures Law. The bill would require that the revenues collected be deposited in the 
Gun Violence Prevention and School Safety Fund, which the bill would establish in the State 
Treasury. The bill would require the moneys received in the fund to be used to fund various gun 
violence prevention, education, research, response, and investigation programs, as specified. The 
bill would require the Director of Finance to transfer, as a loan, $2,400,000 from the General Fund 
to the California Department of Tax and Fee Administration to implement these provisions, as 
specified.   (Based on  09/26/2023 text) 

AB 28 
Support_26June
23 
AB 28 Support 
3August23 
AB 28 GOVRFS 
20Stept23 

Support 

AB 29 Gabriel, D 
 

Firearms: 
California Do 
Not Sell List. 

02/15/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law requires the Department of Justice, upon submission of firearm purchaser information 
by a licensed firearm dealer, to examine its records to determine whether a potential firearm 
purchaser is prohibited by state of federal law from possessing, receiving, owning, or purchasing a 
firearm. Current law requires the department to participate in the National Instant Criminal 
Background Check System. This bill would require the Department of Justice to develop and 
launch a secure Internet-based platform to allow a person who resides in California to voluntarily 
add their own name to the California Do Not Sell List. The bill would require the department to 
ensure that information on the list is uploaded and reflected in the National Instant Criminal 
Background Check System. The bill would make it a crime, punishable as a misdemeanor, to 
transfer a firearm to a person who is validly registered on the California Do Not Sell List.    (Based 
on  02/15/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 33 Bains, D 
 

Fentanyl 
Misuse and 
Overdose 
Prevention 
Task Force. 

10/13/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/13/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
887, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/13/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would, subject to an appropriation, establish the Fentanyl Misuse and Overdose Prevention Task 
Force to undertake various duties relating to fentanyl misuse, including, among others, collecting 
and organizing data on the nature and extent of fentanyl misuse in California and evaluating 
approaches to increase public awareness of fentanyl misuse. The bill would require the task force 
to be cochaired by the Attorney General and the State Public Health Officer, or their designees, 
and would specify the membership of the task force.   (Based on  10/13/2023 text) 

AB 33 
SUPPORT 
_15May23 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=HYhkEnfJ99hjzVXzNABjKNfx9rwfOb+WLS47HH24mVoyk1rWkyx0mlsvXPmVcvWdUl28ZJTUruSEQHrxi5g8FDhZpuGCn15Kr+4ReHIFwHg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/371
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_28_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_28_92_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=23C42CB4-886B-4AE1-8E67-3093338DE5B8
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=23C42CB4-886B-4AE1-8E67-3093338DE5B8
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=23C42CB4-886B-4AE1-8E67-3093338DE5B8
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=81D47010-D4DC-4D08-9C03-2AA8E667C255
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=81D47010-D4DC-4D08-9C03-2AA8E667C255
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=DE411076-1C30-4291-91D1-2B0EE3D25D08
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=DE411076-1C30-4291-91D1-2B0EE3D25D08
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=MCyhAyUgXhFvBi4ivfDTYQmIH0UjLvvOrAE3JAspLSI7PICDzpAyJ3DRa9UL6UEbqsNOE3pw33nT2vtQoz0ONJg0G2LkIDWpKogn77Fd94M=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/371
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_29_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_29_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_29_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=d2hv88mqKjOYHsZGT/RGQHzGhfHnSy5ZCm956872/2zfZ71I3pTEqOx/KCIGY0aeX84DkBP4Eiy0z0Rk1IW93at5aMTYJjNJ/fVL/SiDyTY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/316
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_33_90_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_33_90_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=919B47AF-30DC-44C0-94BB-6F6BF91E235F
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=919B47AF-30DC-44C0-94BB-6F6BF91E235F
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=919B47AF-30DC-44C0-94BB-6F6BF91E235F
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AB 38 Lee, D 
 

Light pollution 
control. 

06/28/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/14/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The Warren-Alquist State Energy Resources Conservation and Development Act requires the 
State Energy Resources Conservation and Development Commission to adopt, among other 
regulations, lighting and other building design and construction standards that increase efficiency 
in the use of energy for new residential and nonresidential buildings to reduce the wasteful, 
uneconomic, inefficient, or unnecessary consumption of energy, including energy associated with 
the use of water, and to manage energy loads to help maintain electrical grid reliability. Current 
law also requires the commission to adopt standards for minimum levels of operating efficiency 
and other cost-effective measures to promote the use of certain energy- and water-efficient 
appliances. This bill would require, with certain exceptions, a state agency, as defined, to ensure 
that an outdoor lighting fixture that is newly installed on or after January 1, 2024, on a structure or 
land that is owned, leased, or managed by the state agency meets prescribed criteria, including 
using a lamp with a correlated color temperature that does not exceed 2,700 Kelvin.    (Based 
on  06/28/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 40 Rodriguez, D 
 

Emergency 
medical 
services. 

10/13/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/13/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
793, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/13/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Emergency Medical Services System and the Prehospital Emergency Medical Care 
Personnel Act creates the Emergency Medical Services Authority, which is responsible for the 
coordination of various state activities concerning emergency medical services. Among other 
duties, existing law requires the authority to develop planning and implementation guidelines for 
EMS systems, provide technical assistance to current agencies, counties, and cities for the 
purpose of developing the components of EMS systems, and receive plans for the implementation 
of EMS and trauma care systems from local EMS agencies. Current law makes a violation of the 
act or regulations adopted pursuant to the act punishable as a misdemeanor. This bill, on or before 
December 31, 2024, would require the authority to develop and implement an electronic signature 
for use between the emergency department medical personnel at a receiving hospital and the 
transporting emergency medical personnel that captures the points in time when the ambulance 
arrives at the hospital emergency department bay and when transfer of care is executed for 
documentation of ambulance patient offload time, as defined. The bill would require every local 
EMS agency, by July 1, 2024, to develop a standard not to exceed 30 minutes, 90% of the time, 
for ambulance patient offload time and report the standardized time to the authority. The bill would 
authorize local EMS agencies to engage stakeholders in developing this standard, as 
specified.   (Based on  10/13/2023 text) 

AB 40 
SUPPORT 
13April23 
AB 40 GOVRFS 
20Sept23 

Support 

AB 41 Holden, D 
 

Telecommunic
ations: The 
Digital Equity in 
Video 
Franchising Act 
of 2023. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto stricken 
from file.  

10/08/2023 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

The Digital Infrastructure and Video Competition Act of 2006 establishes a procedure for the 
Public Utilities Commission to issue state franchises for the provision of video service, defined as 
video programming services, cable service, or open-video system service, except any video 
programming provided by a commercial mobile service provider, as defined in federal law, or video 
programming provided as part of, and via, a service that enables users to access content, 
information, email, or other services offered over the public internet. This bill would revise and 
recast the Digital Infrastructure and Video Competition Act of 2006 to, among other things, rename 
the act as the Digital Equity in Video Franchising Act of 2023, require the commission to conduct 
any hearings and issue a state franchise or a reject each application for a state franchise not more 
than 120 days after the commission has deemed the application complete, and extend deadlines 
related to the commission’s review of applications for state franchises.    (Based on  09/12/2023 
text) 

AB 41 Support 
3August23 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=TdYmWiS4WJLrz0u5qXm59X60Zx6TZoKq4A3QJcVosO9fo96lS8G91R1FYNqa5BZSuC4+hHO69xd8kvIgBzwCHWuBopE34WIMtwI66pI/OmQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/308
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_38_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_38_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_38_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=0bIyGmR9mVbUAuAvT99C6oBnWizH9ZTHT6kzEC3k8Nt7BIkPQiA9An8RItEGaARaRP5TxOdRe/BccCNugOkIVf9SykGj2ahSFgmE938ZbwA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/443
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_40_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_40_92_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=36605531-B927-4964-92F9-27B654CF58EB
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=36605531-B927-4964-92F9-27B654CF58EB
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=36605531-B927-4964-92F9-27B654CF58EB
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=02A72F39-8031-4838-A0D1-33C9A3D7F9BA
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=02A72F39-8031-4838-A0D1-33C9A3D7F9BA
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=tsmEUGHvV3O0xijeFNlqThjtdjr5vGJa0YnvhD0zohdI/f1vVdacBmRMzNKlPCSg4LNr9z6qFLsTpT4HvQztojkufkg2en0MTQWrSqgydV0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/370
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_41_90_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_41_90_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_41_90_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=93A426AC-FACF-4738-960A-C2B9F32EB07F
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=93A426AC-FACF-4738-960A-C2B9F32EB07F


Attachment B: Intergovernmental Relations Priority State Legislation Log 
 

Last Updated 12/06/24        6 
 

Measure Author Topic Current 
Text 

Status Location Brief Summary Attachments Position 

AB 42 Ramos, D 
 

Tiny homes: 
temporary 
sleeping 
cabins: fire 
sprinkler 
requirements. 

10/10/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/10/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
725, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/10/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Planning and Zoning Law, among other things, provides for the creation of accessory dwelling 
units by local ordinance, or, if a local agency has not adopted an ordinance, by ministerial 
approval, in accordance with specified standards and conditions. Existing law prohibits a local 
agency from requiring an accessory dwelling unit to provide fire sprinklers, if they are not required 
for the primary residence. This bill, until January 1, 2027, would prohibit a local agency from 
imposing or enforcing any requirement to provide fire sprinklers for a temporary sleeping cabin that 
is on a site with 50 or fewer temporary sleeping cabins. The bill would define "temporary sleeping 
cabin" to mean a nonpermanent structure that is intended to provide temporary housing to people 
experiencing homelessness or at risk of homelessness, has a total floor area of less than 250 feet, 
and does not include plumbing. The bill would require a temporary sleeping cabin that does not 
include fire sprinklers to comply with alternative fire life and safety standards that include 
providing, among other things, a smoke alarm and carbon monoxide alarm in the unit, a fire 
extinguisher in the unit, and ingress and egress that facilitates rapid exit of the temporary sleeping 
cabin.   (Based on  10/10/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 43 Holden, D 
 

Greenhouse 
gas emissions: 
building 
materials: 
embodied 
carbon trading 
system. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/07/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
316, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/07/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The California Global Warming Solutions Act of 2006 requires the State Air Resources Board to 
ensure that statewide greenhouse gas emissions are reduced to at least 40% below the 1990 level 
by 2030. Under the act, a violation of a rule, regulation, order, emission limitation, emission 
reduction measure, or other measure adopted by the state board under the act is a crime. This bill 
would, among other changes, eliminate the interim target of 20% net reduction. The bill would 
require the baseline described above to be established based on either an industry average of 
environmental product declarations reported for the 2026 calendar year or on the most relevant, 
up-to-date information available, as determined by the state board. The bill would also require the 
established targets to begin to apply no sooner than January 1, 2027, and 2 years after the 
baseline is established. The bill would delete the requirement that the state board form and 
maintain a technical advisory committee, and would instead require the state board to consult 
experts to advise the state board on methods to reduce the carbon intensity of building materials 
and covered projects, as specified. The bill would also exempt violations of these requirements 
from criminal penalties and authorize the imposition of specified civil penalties for those violations. 
The bill would express the intent of the Legislature regarding the applicable civil penalties. This bill 
contains other related provisions and other existing laws.   (Based on  10/07/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 49 Soria, D 
 

Affordable 
housing. 

12/05/2022 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Died at 
Desk.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would express the intent of the Legislature to enact legislation that would increase the supply of 
affordable housing and reduce homelessness.   (Based on  12/05/2022 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=mHeyopFGddE1uHji5eD4qQKvh3p1tAwGpovzxO+m4hN9Tzf/fujlIlbP/1THoaeOygckMokqiY5NPyaWgBy2IYyTmSmJ1/ZoVAzTofuTO3c=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/473
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_42_90_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_42_90_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=CzFYz5Akt+eRrUhdbJcJvRCYC9D6X9Emtc5JT3cM8GO2WwEeUcHZuE6EZzDMsqm1Yl5aCuRo0Qdh9t44HPVrehsN+IqYFuT4MyGhpNGYefY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/370
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_43_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_43_91_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Qjml81VLAxEAexJJufmUqw/scyhE9r6/A4hRmYb0Olt88+dc5K813GgCCLWvqqCClrWk8XuLDmFk9A+b/Ge5PsW+ZVv5GRZf0gpUgkGCe04=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/309
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_49_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_49_99_I_bill.pdf
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AB 50 Wood, D 
 

Public utilities: 
timely service: 
customer 
energization. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/07/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
317, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/07/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Existing law authorizes the Public Utilities Commission to fix the rates and charges for every public 
utility, and requires that those rates and charges be just and reasonable. Existing law requires the 
commission to enforce rules governing the extension of service by electrical corporations. This bill 
would require the commission to determine the criteria for timely service for electric customers to 
be energized, including, among other things, categories of timely electric service through 
energization, as specified. The bill would require each electrical corporation that energized less 
than 35% of customers with completed applications exceeding 12 months in duration by January 
31, 2023, to submit a report to the commission, as specified, on or before December 1, 2024, 
demonstrating that the electrical corporation has energized 80% of customers with applications 
deemed complete as of January 31, 2023, as specified. To improve the accuracy of projected 
demand and facilitate achievement of the goal of timely electric service through energization, the 
bill would require each electrical corporation to evaluate and update, as necessary, its existing 
distribution planning processes. In order to inform the commission's determination of criteria for 
timely service, the bill would require the commission to annually collect certain information from 
each electrical corporation until new reporting requirements are established. This bill contains 
other related provisions and other existing laws.   (Based on  10/07/2023 text) 

AB 50 
Support.pdf 
AB 50 
Support_26June
23 
AB 50 GOVRFS 
20Sept23 

Support 

AB 51 Bonta, D 
 

Early childcare 
and education: 
California state 
preschool 
program. 

09/26/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/26/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
618, 
Statutes of 
2024 

09/26/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Early Education Act establishes the California Universal Preschool Planning Grant Program 
with the goal of expanding access universally to preschool programs for 3- and 4-year-old children 
across the state through a mixed-delivery system, as defined. The act requires the Superintendent 
of Public Instruction to establish rules and regulations for the staffing of all preschool programs 
under contract with the State Department of Education. This bill would, notwithstanding any 
provision of the act to contrary, require the department to, among other things, provide prospective 
California state preschool program providers an equitable opportunity to establish a trained 
workforce and administrative systems, and technical assistance on how to meet the requirements 
of Title 5 of the California Code of Regulations, as provided.   (Based on  09/26/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=tsq/Nc4dHpCgFE3hHdnMzGjZnCAyivtH059X5XlJegdlVZ4YStYctpEDskPmM8VZQa1lR/TQRL4lKpmyu7vg8QETwtD3YYfjAYWgyTpub4M=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/418
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_50_89_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/ab_50_89_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=2E350C63-0912-4B8E-90BA-E0E3668D188B
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=2E350C63-0912-4B8E-90BA-E0E3668D188B
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=224AD7ED-41BF-4C31-94DB-947E0028EB51
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=224AD7ED-41BF-4C31-94DB-947E0028EB51
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=224AD7ED-41BF-4C31-94DB-947E0028EB51
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=CE7627D0-C670-4CFA-A899-4B80F5A6DE4A
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=CE7627D0-C670-4CFA-A899-4B80F5A6DE4A
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Cr2QR0zcKPbqveIt5ZMhqVt+cPgZNoYg5Xaa40zdWo01eCMuRut+qKwa4lC5TM9mt+VZxdtzgdHIIKN6V/99ME0tf15DLfRaHaXGgs9KbS4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/495
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_51_88_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_51_88_C_bill.pdf
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AB 52 Grayson, D 
 

Income tax 
credit: sales 
and use taxes 
paid: 
manufacturing 
equipment: 
research and 
development 
equipment. 

09/22/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/22/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
Governor. 

09/22/2024 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

The Bradley-Burns Uniform Local Sales and Use Tax Law authorizes counties and cities to impose 
local sales and use taxes in conformity with the Sales and Use Tax Law, and existing laws 
authorize districts, as specified, to impose transactions and use taxes in accordance with the 
Transactions and Use Tax Law, which generally conforms to the Sales and Use Tax Law. 
Exemptions from state sales and use taxes are automatically incorporated into the local tax laws. 
The Sales and Use Tax Law imposes state taxes on retailers measured by the gross receipts from 
the sale of tangible personal property sold at retail in this state, or on the storage, use, or other 
consumption in this state of tangible personal property purchased from a retailer for storage, use, 
or other consumption in this state. The Sales and Use Tax Law provides various exemptions from 
those taxes, including a partial exemption from those taxes, on and after July 1, 2014, and before 
July 1, 2030, for the gross receipts from the sale of, and the storage, use, or other consumption of, 
qualified tangible personal property, as defined, that is, among other things, purchased by a 
qualified person for use primarily in manufacturing, processing, refining, fabricating, or recycling of 
tangible personal property, as specified, or purchased for use by a qualified person to be used 
primarily in research and development. Current law prohibits the exemption described above from 
applying with respect to any tax levied by a county, city, or district pursuant to, or in accordance 
with, the Bradley-Burns Uniform Local Sales and Use Tax Law or the Transactions and Use Tax 
Law, sales and use taxes imposed pursuant to certain provisions of the Sales and Use Tax Law, 
and sales and use taxes imposed pursuant to certain provisions of the California Constitution. The 
Personal Income Tax Law and the Corporation Tax Law allow various credits against the taxes 
imposed by those laws. This bill would allow, for a taxable year beginning on or after January 1, 
2025, and before January 1, 2030, a credit against those taxes to a taxpayer in an amount equal 
to the amount of tax reimbursement paid during the taxable year for sales tax on gross receipts 
that would be exempt from taxation under the Sales and Use Tax Law pursuant to the sales and 
use tax exemption described above but for the provision that prohibits that exemption from 
applying with respect to any tax levied by a county, city, or district pursuant to, or in accordance 
with, the Bradley-Burns Uniform Local Sales and Use Tax Law or the Transactions and Use Tax 
Law, sales and use taxes imposed pursuant to certain provisions of the Sales and Use Tax Law, 
and sales and use taxes imposed pursuant to certain provisions of the California 
Constitution.    (Based on  09/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 53 Fong, Vince, 
R 
 

Motor Vehicle 
Fuel Tax Law: 
suspension of 
tax. 

12/05/2022 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would suspend the imposition of the tax on motor vehicle fuels for one year. The bill would require 
that all savings realized based on the suspension of the motor vehicle fuels tax by a person other 
than an end consumer, as defined, be passed on to the end consumer, and would make the 
violation of this requirement an unfair business practice, in violation of unfair competition laws, as 
provided. The bill would require a seller of motor vehicle fuels to provide a receipt to a purchaser 
that indicates the amount of tax that would have otherwise applied to the transaction.   (Based 
on  12/05/2022 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=nCm/3MTCZn7DHxcrAnDO9+84PXjtS7sUPNfboyBLQf4V2vuDy2Xn9Z8+V/mhm+ossrRJKqikojLdwIG2Z0IZWgS3TeTgxEsRsbbgNmXd5B0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/433
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_52_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_52_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_52_94_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Vc9ZuYf2SCx9CYiLNWdoS1b3E+wtHXw1S04K7BXeVYXP7pNH27efFXntVc8YL/IgJLKkNm9mkLIDcfdyDV6kqTUmkegP5W/ilrBmwgrGCkc=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/315
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/315
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_53_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_53_99_I_bill.pdf
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AB 57 Kalra, D 
 

California 
Pocket Forest 
Initiative. 

10/08/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

01/30/2024 - 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto stricken 
from file.  

10/08/2023 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Would establish the California Pocket Forest Initiative in the department and would authorize the 
Department of Forestry and Fire Protection to coordinate implementation of the initiative in 
conjunction with the California Urban Forestry Act of 1978. The bill would authorize the department 
to provide grants to cities, counties, districts, nonprofit organizations, the California Conservation 
Corps or certified community conservation corps, public universities, public community colleges, 
and public schools to establish pocket forests on public lands, as provided. The bill would require 
the department to prioritize disadvantaged communities and communities that lack publicly 
accessible green space for these grants. The bill would require the department to partner with one 
or more academic institutions to test, and submit a report on or before January 1, 2030, to the 
Legislature that evaluates, the applicability and effectiveness of the Miyawaki method, as defined, 
to restore degraded lands and reforest urban areas in multiple regions throughout 
California.    (Based on  09/14/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 59 Gallagher, R 
 

Taxation: 
renter’s credit. 

04/05/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Personal Income Tax Law authorizes various credits against the taxes imposed by that law, 
including a credit for qualified renters in the amount of $120 for spouses filing joint returns, heads 
of household, and surviving spouses if adjusted gross income is $50,000, as adjusted, or less, and 
in the amount of $60 for other individuals if adjusted gross income is $25,000, as adjusted, or less. 
Current law requires the Franchise Tax Board to annually adjust for inflation these adjusted gross 
income amounts. For 2021, the adjusted gross income limit is $87,066 and $43,533, respectively. 
Current law establishes the continuously appropriated Tax Relief and Refund Account in the 
General Fund and provides that payments required to be made to taxpayers or other persons from 
the Personal Income Tax Fund are to be paid from that account. This bill, for taxable years 
beginning on or after January 1 of the taxable year that includes the date on which funding is first 
authorized for purposes of this bill and for the succeeding 4 taxable years, and only when specified 
in a bill relating to the Budget Act, would increase the credit amount to $2,000 for spouses filing 
joint returns, heads of households, and surviving spouses and $1,000 for other individuals. In the 
event the increased credit amount is not specified in a bill relating to the Budget Act, the existing 
credit amounts, as described above, would be the credit amounts for that taxable year.    (Based 
on  04/05/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 62 Mathis, R 
 

Statewide 
water storage: 
expansion. 

04/20/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law establishes within the Natural Resources Agency the State Water Resources Control 
Board and the California regional water quality control boards. Current law requires the work of the 
state board to be divided into at least 2 divisions, known as the Division of Water Rights and the 
Division of Water Quality. This bill would establish a statewide goal to increase above- and below-
ground water storage capacity by a total of 3,700,000 acre-feet by the year 2030 and a total of 
4,000,000 acre-feet by the year 2040. The bill would require the Department of Water Resources, 
in consultation with the state board, to take reasonable actions to promote or assist efforts to 
achieve the statewide goal, as provided. The bill would require the department, beginning July 1, 
2027, and on or before July 1 every 2 years thereafter until January 1, 2043, in consultation with 
the state board, to prepare and submit a report to the Legislature on the progress made to achieve 
the statewide goal.    (Based on  04/20/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=P/U4nycvYOfaoYtr/VMzHNg1ixJmD1OPfpCzKiL5DN0vJdVcrCfOo3+byWP659RnTr+zf/OAv9+0SlPvuA7ZUCFkN/V0yvZ22MxPanzlNb4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/436
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_57_95_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_57_95_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_57_95_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=vrQKUqsC3pSAZQxTbc9zPUDlnRBZPYtdvnnXdIxfhSiX2kT3pIVxwjs1uM6FixRPlOmbNnOcQ0UwcMXqJW8Y/PN09ktdcacG40rCe1nDvPg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/429
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_59_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_59_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_59_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=QU+xqo1z213iSzwM2TqcyPYnbcTWw5oor1zYIAoirxBxZxJDF717EGRQnVZijaAJGq4nTzTmqvmvmNg9EOy8/Uh5iUJ1egIcv4nl+2vJuBY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/439
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_62_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_62_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_62_97_A_bill.pdf
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AB 67 Muratsuchi, D 
 

Homeless 
Courts Pilot 
Program. 

03/13/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/28/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would, upon an appropriation by the Legislature, create the Homeless Courts Pilot Program, 
which would remain in effect until January 1, 2029, to be administered by the Judicial Council for 
the purpose of providing comprehensive community-based services to achieve stabilization for, 
and address the specific legal needs of, homeless individuals who are involved with the criminal 
justice system. The bill would require applicant cities or counties seeking grant funds to provide a 
number of specified services or program components, including, but not limited to, a diversion 
program enabling participating defendants to have specified charges dismissed upon completion 
of a program, provision of temporary, time-limited, or permanent housing during the duration of the 
program, and a dedicated representative to assist defendants with housing needs. The bill would 
require an applicant for grant funding under the program to submit a plan for a new homeless court 
program or expansion of an existing homeless court program, and would require any funding 
awarded to an applicant to be used in accordance with that plan.    (Based on  03/13/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 68 Ward, D 
 

Land use: 
streamlined 
housing 
approvals: 
density, 
subdivision, 
and utility 
approvals. 

04/12/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would require a local government to approve a proposed housing development pursuant to a 
streamlined, ministerial approval process if the development meets certain objective planning 
standards, including, but not limited to, a requirement that the proposed parcel for the 
development be a climate-smart parcel, as described, or be included in the applicable region’s 
sustainable communities strategy as a priority development area. The bill would set forth 
procedures for approving these developments and would set forth various limitations for these 
developments. The bill would authorize the Department of Housing and Community Development 
to review, adopt, amend, and repeal guidelines, rules, and regulations to implement uniform 
standards or criteria that supplement or clarify the terms, references, or standards set forth by this 
process.   (Based on  04/12/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 69 Waldron, R 
 

Transportation: 
traffic signal 
synchronization
: roadway 
improvement 
projects. 

12/09/2022 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The State Air Resources Board is required to adopt a statewide greenhouse gas emissions limit 
equivalent to the statewide greenhouse gas emissions level in 1990 to be achieved by 2020 and to 
ensure that statewide greenhouse gas emissions are reduced to at least 40% below the 1990 level 
by 2030, and to adopt rules and regulations in an open public process to achieve the maximum, 
technologically feasible, and cost-effective greenhouse gas emissions reductions. The act 
authorizes the state board to include the use of market-based compliance mechanisms. Existing 
law requires all moneys, except for fines and penalties, collected by the state board from the 
auction or sale of allowances as part of a market-based compliance mechanism to be deposited in 
the Greenhouse Gas Reduction Fund and to be available upon appropriation. Current law requires 
the Department of Finance, in consultation with the state board and any other relevant state 
agency, to develop, as specified, a 3-year investment plan for the moneys deposited in the 
Greenhouse Gas Reduction Fund. Current law authorizes moneys in the fund to be allocated, as 
specified, for an investment in a traffic signal synchronization component that is part of a 
sustainable infrastructure project if the component is designed and implemented to achieve cost-
effective reductions in greenhouse gas emissions and includes specific emissions reduction 
targets and metrics to evaluate the project’s effect. This bill would additionally authorize moneys in 
the fund to be allocated for an investment in a traffic signal synchronization component that is part 
of a roadway improvement project requiring multiple signals, including, but not limited to, 
multimodal redevelopment projects, rail trail projects, urban renewal projects, or a project near 
transit facilities, if the component is designed and implemented to achieve cost-effective 
reductions in greenhouse gas emissions and includes specific emissions reduction targets and 
metrics to evaluate the project’s effect.   (Based on  12/09/2022 text) 

AB 69 
SUPPORT_12.0
5.23.pdf 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=6RvvLTzhjDJJZHllkKOFMi3PzwlSme91cqC38PNyRGPk5hSa4Mil8/Ud3DRFnI4+akiMAqDR7/VLMFNRaL4iDh2zDajPA6+i4NwQdteyB7Y=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/452
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_67_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_67_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_67_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=URR0YCQVsxtORSzUBryFQqiFuDQ4Tz1+X/bvpxys4Tw9A7g4xzdvGj9nC7jrUojoon2rPm+rOxekNY7dC7kymhA/fPJY0txX7RMbcWGdlN4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/328
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_68_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_68_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_68_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=LGuKew+AeslZikWdP2kldrKl8FZRyDdCHC0Ve+1AfkXmrBtqFFpO6VlQbnb7PUf9NYLMLvaxlpn8vIAB1WpPE6uyoY1x/1yrZ8Ki9i+Rnps=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/387
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_69_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_69_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=D9B6D54F-9165-45CE-9C72-C8F31E969B29
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=D9B6D54F-9165-45CE-9C72-C8F31E969B29
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=D9B6D54F-9165-45CE-9C72-C8F31E969B29
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AB 73 Boerner, D 
 

Vehicles: 
required stops: 
bicycles. 

03/09/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
TRANS. on 
6/14/2023) 

07/02/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law requires the driver of any vehicle, including a person riding a bicycle, when 
approaching a stop sign at the entrance of an intersection, to stop before entering the intersection. 
A violation of this requirement is an infraction. This bill would require a person who is 18 years of 
age or older riding a bicycle upon a two-lane highway when approaching a stop sign at the 
entrance of an intersection with another roadway with two or fewer lanes, where stop signs are 
erected upon all approaches, to yield the right-of-way to any vehicles that have either stopped at 
or entered the intersection, or that are approaching on the intersecting highway close enough to 
constitute an immediate hazard, and to pedestrians, as specified, and continue to yield the right-of-
way to those vehicles and pedestrians until reasonably safe to proceed. The bill would require 
other vehicles to yield the right-of-way to a bicycle that, having yielded as prescribed, has entered 
the intersection. The bill would state that these provisions do not affect the liability of a driver of a 
motor vehicle as a result of the driver’s negligent or wrongful act or omission in the operation of a 
motor vehicle.    (Based on  03/09/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 74 Muratsuchi, D 
 

Vehicles: street 
takeovers, 
sideshows, and 
racing. 

03/23/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would make it a crime for a person to knowingly attend, participate in, or aid and abet the 
commission of, a vehicle sideshow or street takeover, as defined. The bill would make a violation 
of this offense punishable as a misdemeanor or felony if the person convicted is a performing 
driver, as specified. The bill would make a violation of this offense punishable as a misdemeanor if 
the person convicted is not a performing driver, including a spectator or passenger in a performing 
vehicle, as specified. The bill would, if the convicted person is a performing driver, authorize the 
court to have the performing vehicle impounded for up to 30 days and require the court to suspend 
the driver’s license for 90 days to 6 months. The bill would impose 2 violation points against a 
driver’s record for a conviction of this offense. The bill would change the commencement date of 
the above-mentioned license suspension provisions to January 1, 2024, and include the crimes of 
reckless driving and attending, participating, or aiding and abetting in a vehicle sideshow or street 
takeover in these provisions. The bill would additionally make it a crime for a person to operate a 
motor vehicle at any time when that person’s driving privilege is suspended or revoked for a 
conviction of attending, participating, or aiding and abetting in a vehicle sideshow or street 
takeover, if the person has knowledge of the suspension or revocation. The bill would make a 
violation of this offense punishable as a misdemeanor, as specified. By creating new crimes and 
increasing punishments for existing crimes, this bill would impose a state-mandated local 
program.    (Based on  03/23/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 83 Lee, D 
 

Political Reform 
Act of 1974: 
contributions 
and 
expenditures 
by foreign-
influenced 
business 
entities. 

12/16/2022 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Died on 
third reading 
file.  

02/01/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Political Reform Act of 1974 prohibits a foreign government or foreign principal from making 
any contribution, expenditure, or independent expenditure in connection with the qualification or 
support of, or opposition to, a state or local ballot measure or an election for a state or local office. 
The act prohibits a person or committee from soliciting or accepting a contribution from a foreign 
government or foreign principal for the same purposes. The act makes a violation of these 
prohibitions a misdemeanor. This bill would expand these prohibitions to include contributions, 
expenditures, or independent expenditures made by a foreign-influenced business entity, as 
defined, in connection with an election or ballot measure. The bill would require a business entity 
that makes a contribution, expenditure, or independent expenditure to file with the filing officer and 
the applicable candidate or committee a statement of certification, signed by the entity’s chief 
executive officer under penalty of perjury, avowing that the entity was not a foreign-influenced 
business entity on the date the contribution, expenditure, or independent expenditure was 
made.    (Based on  12/16/2022 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=GBClWlSrfdz2Lf8PRVmCsIX4wQi2p3DnvFIMDQLcZwq/aQvJBF6X3M74fKdAUFXf3GHFfuAVom7MBEYNUuxPsf69tGWO4Tpsee2qV1d5dDQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/389
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_73_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_73_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_73_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=WP2ZtYHx+fkdLl9aptX5EZ2aO2KvWaJmttS+WY2ycZl6AdOFChRIH+JIuNgdqcmGzgAWl9QYTz+9FZ3wSC5BIS6+3UEnAphK6tf227gfJf8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/452
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_74_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_74_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_74_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=PS+fMJ0V9YOMI3/JvlIKIlKSCnyym9UcHeo4f0jLw6VggmX3uN+381RNAgwjcKC9b+rx5hzBYObX8THuDVQ5N6GrE5WIgQIYTgtqn0Nb+GU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/308
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_83_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_83_99_I_bill.pdf
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AB 84 Ward, D 
 

Property tax: 
welfare 
exemption: 
affordable 
housing. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
734, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

(1) Existing property tax law, in accordance with the California Constitution, provides for a "welfare 
exemption" for property used exclusively for religious, hospital, scientific, or charitable purposes 
and that is owned or operated by certain types of nonprofit entities, if certain qualifying criteria are 
met. Existing law defines "property used exclusively for religious, hospital, or charitable purposes" 
to include facilities in the course of construction on or after the first Monday of March 1954, as 
specified. This bill would expand this partial exemption to property acquired, rehabilitated, 
developed, or operated, or any combination of these factors, with financing from qualified 501(c)(3) 
bonds, as defined.    (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 86 Jones-
Sawyer, D 
 

Homelessness: 
Statewide 
Homelessness 
Coordinator. 

04/20/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/14/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would require the Governor to appoint a Statewide Homelessness Coordinator, within the 
Governor’s Office, to serve as the lead person for ending homelessness in California. The bill 
would require the coordinator to perform prescribed duties, including, among others, identifying a 
local leader in each relevant city, county, city and county, or other jurisdiction to serve as a liaison 
between the coordinator and that jurisdiction, overseeing homelessness programs, services, data, 
and policies between federal, state, and local agencies, coordinating the timing of release of funds 
and applications for funding for housing and housing-based services impacting Californians 
experiencing homelessness, and, in collaboration with local leaders, providing annual 
recommendations to the Legislature and the Governor, as specified. The bill would authorize the 
coordinator to adjust state goals to the extent allowed by state law.   (Based on  04/20/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 88 Sanchez, R 
 

Criminal 
procedure: 
victims’ rights. 

10/13/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/13/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
795, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/13/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law authorizes a court, under specified circumstances, to resentence a defendant 
convicted of a felony offense. Under existing law, resentencing can be granted without a hearing 
upon stipulation of the parties. This bill would require a victim of the crime who wishes to be heard 
regarding the resentencing to notify the prosecution of their request for a hearing within 15 days of 
being notified that resentencing is being sought, and would require the court to provide an 
opportunity for the victim to be heard.    (Based on  10/13/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ng4obT3E86AItaK1sZP+DLKDcr+u6CMinOEwNnu6r24r1vq/aXSUNPnS19YrpXze6qAgKEx4TEEUKQpovSmzSIbY+4S4CjxnXevJ73Z2+Lk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/328
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_84_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_84_92_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=2T4rxJ8z691P5ZWk8S7y5/fCBQnR7gRbpZfK+pP+JzqhZV6RS1V2MUropVSOvpNG/GQaigWSeAvM/SztATIcHtHYxt69AC4nddlePXgyJys=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/378
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/378
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_86_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_86_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_86_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=j2Ykvk+lD9ZUZR1Qsbb4DDWGiWjnpyHGjGjSz6/1yEsJK4xix+Tvaz2IXF2+Rr7McAu1YgQAeeOWDkvvWZiISO2dUc0veDQKB3VFK0WqV/0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/329
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_88_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_88_96_C_bill.pdf
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AB 96 Kalra, D 
 

Public 
employment: 
local public 
transit 
agencies: 
autonomous 
transit vehicle 
technology. 

10/08/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
419, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/07/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would require a public transit employer, at least 10 months before beginning a procurement 
process to acquire or deploy any autonomous transit vehicle technology for public transit services 
that would eliminate job functions or jobs of a workforce, to provide written notice to the exclusive 
employee representative of the workforce affected by the autonomous transit vehicle technology of 
its determination to begin that procurement process. The bill would require the public transit 
employer and exclusive employee representative, upon written request by the exclusive employee 
representative, to commence collective bargaining within a specified time period on certain 
subjects, including creating plans to train and prepare the affected workforce to fill new positions 
created by the autonomous transit vehicle technology. The bill would vest the Public Employment 
Relations Board (PERB) with jurisdiction to process unfair practice charges alleging violations of 
these provisions, but only as to transit district employers where PERB has jurisdiction to process 
unfair practice charges. Should an employee organization file an unfair practice charge with 
PERB, the bill would require PERB’s powers and duties to apply, as appropriate, and would 
require PERB’s regulations to apply. The bill would authorize PERB to make additional emergency 
regulations, as specified.   (Based on  10/08/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 99 Connolly, D 
 

Department of 
Transportation: 
state roads and 
highways: 
integrated pest 
management. 

09/25/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/25/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
Governor. 

09/25/2024 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Would require the Department of Transportation to adopt, on or before January 1, 2026, a 
statewide policy to use integrated pest management, as defined, on state roads and highways, as 
specified, and to implement the statewide policy in cities or counties that have adopted integrated 
pest management approaches to roadside vegetation management. The bill would require the 
Department of Transportation, in developing the statewide policy, to consult with the Department 
of Pesticide Regulation and the University of California Statewide Integrated Pest Management 
Program. The bill would require the Department of Transportation, when operating in a city or a 
county that has adopted an integrated pest management policy that is more restrictive than the 
statewide policy, to the extent feasible, to operate in a manner consistent with the city’s or county’s 
integrated pest management policy, as specified. The bill would require the Department of 
Transportation, on or before December 31, 2026, and annually thereafter, to make publicly 
available on its internet website the amount, location, and type of pesticides, and the pesticide 
formulation, by city and county, it uses, and, at least 24 hours before applying a pesticide, would 
require the Department of Transportation to provide on its internet website and mobile application, 
and through any other means of communication deemed appropriate by the applicable state 
transportation district, information on when and where it plans to apply the pesticide.   (Based 
on  09/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 106 Gabriel, D 
 

Budget Acts of 
2022 and 2023. 

04/15/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

04/15/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 9, 
Statutes of 
2024 

04/15/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would amend the Budget Act of 2022 and the Budget Act of 2023 by amending, adding, and 
repealing items of appropriation and making other changes. This bill contains other related 
provisions and other existing laws.   (Based on  04/15/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ZfLYvGQG8o+RyPQKlieSZZ1vULBgld4WReZGNr2+KNjIsZJHez3JfMfi9jdVqoNPmndEuhai/RWywk8WvjiZ3sJnJbinBQo2/W1Wwz1aazw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/436
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_96_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_96_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=5VkY61owIWBe4Mn+LXPT/ATA66mhMTq2xhqqgMIifis6FgkcrQfirOqM6ae+3bSZQL5n8wJMHvzs+yMEdlXYnNk/jNkbgcDH3+Kxj6X4jos=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/310
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_99_93_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_99_93_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0051-0100/ab_99_93_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ucb26BYnXoJpCoB08fTaPL2VC3Ofjyd/Wg91qXEQaWgktYMnxJmjxhXiZqtDFFaS7YKXgyjRJiNki5bQAm8NW077onIGucLZot3PWUqA4Qg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/371
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0101-0150/ab_106_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0101-0150/ab_106_96_C_bill.pdf
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AB 224 Rubio, 
Blanca, D 
 

Worker status: 
employees and 
independent 
contractors: 
newspaper 
distributors and 
carriers. 

09/20/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/20/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
298, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/20/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires a 3-part test, commonly known as the “ABC” test, to determine if workers are 
employees or independent contractors for determining if works are employees under wage orders. 
Current law establishes that, for purposes of the Labor Code, the Unemployment Insurance Code, 
and the wage orders of the Industrial Welfare Commission, a person providing labor or services for 
remuneration is considered an employee rather than an independent contractor unless the hiring 
entity demonstrates that the person is free from the control and direction of the hiring entity in 
connection with the performance of the work, the person performs work that is outside the usual 
course of the hiring entity’s business, and the person is customarily engaged in an independently 
established trade, occupation, or business. This test is known as the “ABC” test, as described 
above. Current law charges the Labor Commissioner with the enforcement of labor laws, including 
worker classification. Current law exempts specified occupations and business relationships from 
the application of Dynamex and the provisions described above. These exemptions include a 
temporary exemption for newspaper distributors working under contract with a newspaper 
publisher and newspaper carriers, as those terms are defined, until January 1, 2025. Current law, 
as part of that temporary exemption, requires every newspaper publisher or distributor that hires or 
directly contracts with newspaper carriers to submit prescribed information on carrier payroll taxes, 
wage rates, and wage claims to the Labor and Workforce Development Agency (LWDA), on or 
before March 1, 2022, March 1, 2023, and March 1, 2024. This bill would extend the operation of 
that exemption until January 1, 2030. The bill would require the information on carrier payroll 
taxes, wage rates, and wage claims to be reported to the LWDA on or before March 1, 2025, 
March 1, 2026, March 1, 2027, March 1, 2028, and March 1, 2029.   (Based on  09/20/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 234 Bauer-Kahan, 
D 
 

Microparticles. 03/30/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would enact the Synthetic Polymer Microparticles in Cosmetic and Cleaning Products Prevention 
Act. The bill would prohibit a synthetic polymer microparticle from being placed on the market in 
this state as a substance on its own or, where the synthetic polymer microparticles are present to 
confer a sought-after characteristic, in mixtures in a concentration equal to or greater than 0.01% 
by weight. The restriction would apply on and after specified dates depending on the type of 
product, as described, except as otherwise provided. The bill would specify the screening tests 
and pass criteria to be used for purposes of determining compliance with this prohibition. The bill 
would make a person who violates this prohibition liable for a civil penalty not to exceed $5,000 
per day for each violation, in addition to any other penalty established by law. The bill would 
authorize the civil penalty to be assessed and recovered in a civil action brought by a city attorney, 
a district attorney, a county counsel, or the Attorney General in any court of competent 
jurisdiction.   (Based on  03/30/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=OgVey3t8oFKVqR5BZlYnfvcY81AfNC8GrVR8JkF9s1+kOYtxtO4L15+6YH+ou5jYzk7rc/Aas5VceWOekAoWiv16nu8oRHT3N1lmFxO4mt0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/323
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/323
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0201-0250/ab_224_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0201-0250/ab_224_96_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=TdlYXG8QNKVRUBEqCDtAKzGwFSD2v/dDuOzHju04efa8giGVIO/17EFyi8z5iFLvJB0GgrAo9WUcxIis7KDPXMNnUchdYrvPstU9C4kEHaw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/434
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/434
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0201-0250/ab_234_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0201-0250/ab_234_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0201-0250/ab_234_97_A_bill.pdf
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AB 240 Kalra, D 
 

Dogs and cats: 
California 
Spay-Neuter 
Fund. 

02/28/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law establishes the Pure Pet Food Act of 1969, which is administered by the State 
Department of Public Health. Under the act, every person who manufactures a processed pet 
food, as defined, in California is required to first obtain a license from, and every person who 
manufactures a processed pet food for import into California from another state is required to first 
obtain a registration certificate from, the State Department of Public Health. Current law excludes 
from the definition of “processed pet food” fresh or frozen pet foods subject to the control of the 
Department of Food and Agriculture. Under existing law, an annual license or registration 
certificate shall only be issued when certain conditions are met, including, among others, when the 
applicant submits to the State Department of Public Health the label that would be attached to the 
container of each type of processed pet food. Current law also provides that, unless a different 
penalty is expressly provided, a violation of any provision of the Food and Agricultural Code is a 
misdemeanor. This bill would require the Department of Food and Agriculture to collect, on an 
annual basis, a charge of $200 from a manufacturer of dog and cat food, as defined, for each label 
submitted by the manufacturer to the State Department of Public Health for dog and cat food, as 
provided.    (Based on  02/28/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 241 Reyes, D 
 

Vehicular air 
pollution: Clean 
Transportation 
Program: 
vehicle 
registration and 
identification 
plate service 
fees: smog 
abatement fee: 
extension. 

06/26/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Died on 
inactive file.  

02/01/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law, until January 1, 2024, increases the smog abatement fee on certain vehicles by a 
specified amount and requires the revenues generated by the increase to be deposited in the Air 
Quality Improvement Fund and the Alternative and Renewable Fuel and Vehicle Technology Fund. 
Current law, until January 1, 2024, increases vehicle registration fees and certain service fees for 
identification plates by specified amounts. Current law requires the revenue generated by the 
increase in those fees to be deposited in the Alternative and Renewable Fuel and Vehicle 
Technology Fund and either the Air Quality Improvement Fund or the Enhanced Fleet 
Modernization Subaccount, as provided. This bill would extend the increases in those charges to 
July 1, 2035.    (Based on  06/26/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 246 Papan, D 
 

Product safety: 
menstrual 
products: 
perfluoroalkyl 
and 
polyfluoroalkyl 
substances. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto stricken 
from file.  

10/08/2023 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Current law prohibits, beginning January 1, 2025, a person or entity from manufacturing, selling, 
delivering, holding, or offering for sale in commerce any cosmetic product that contains 
intentionally added perfluoroalkyl and polyfluoroalkyl substances (PFAS), as defined. Current law 
similarly prohibits, beginning January 1, 2025, any person from manufacturing, distributing, selling, 
or offering for sale in the state any new, not previously owned, textile articles that contain 
regulated PFAS, except as specified, and requires a manufacturer to use the least toxic alternative 
when removing regulated PFAS in textile articles to comply with these provisions. This bill would, 
beginning January 1, 2025, similarly prohibit any person from manufacturing, distributing, selling, 
or offering for sale in the state any menstrual products that contain regulated PFAS, and requires a 
manufacturer to use the least toxic alternative when removing regulated PFAS in menstrual 
products to comply with these provisions. The bill would require a manufacturer of a menstrual 
product to provide persons that offer the product for sale or distribution in the state with a 
certificate of compliance stating that the menstrual product is in compliance with these provisions 
and does not contain any regulated PFAS.   (Based on  09/12/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=5zdoKWT6BAXNp+oGmlNVev62sjlDqvvOJthSaX4MUTiiYFtQwL3ZnP9DdTLdU8VRNuhc/bmS5CPkTEfhE3o+UOLfmLS5bo/p8VUQRctctsg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/436
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0201-0250/ab_240_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0201-0250/ab_240_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0201-0250/ab_240_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=4gsQn6OsKxyxgmphyT2oIDJ04UyvjufOlJ9uCj7fOXdIiCzP1RVNardnT/S2PQMyxi10BkxLHKeUJrUaEXPWMHVsTpUj6M93DykKAWjzbGo=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/374
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0201-0250/ab_241_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0201-0250/ab_241_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0201-0250/ab_241_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=rREdVGXnLZadPjcfb76g52NwLZQDbXcqxwJt3+VAMZBYoWrnDypZww5SEJ5h2aDpcG5U7UQKZcJEdjgO7i3HS0uwxmB7W/4WLNqnCJr1NCc=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/362
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0201-0250/ab_246_93_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0201-0250/ab_246_93_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0201-0250/ab_246_93_E_bill.pdf
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AB 247 Muratsuchi, D 
 

Education 
finance: school 
facilities: 
Kindergarten 
Through Grade 
12 Schools and 
Local 
Community 
College Public 
Education 
Facilities 
Modernization, 
Repair, and 
Safety Bond 
Act of 2024. 

07/03/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

07/03/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 81, 
Statutes of 
2024 

07/03/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would set forth the Kindergarten Through Grade 12 Schools and Local Community College Public 
Education Facilities Modernization, Repair, and Safety Bond Act of 2024 as a state general 
obligation bond act that would provide $10,000,000,000 to construct and modernize education 
facilities, including $8,500,000,000 for elementary and secondary educational facilities and 
$1,500,000,000 for community college facilities, as specified. This bond act would become 
operative only if approved by the voters.   (Based on  07/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 251 Ward, D 
 

California 
Transportation 
Commission: 
vehicle weight 
safety study. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/07/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
320, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/07/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Existing law establishes the California Transportation Commission (CTC) to advise and assist the 
Secretary of Transportation and the Legislature in formulating and evaluating state policies and 
plans for transportation programs in the state. Existing law tasks the CTC with various 
transportation-related studies and reports to the Legislature. This bill would require the CTC to 
convene a task force to study the relationship between vehicle weight and injuries to vulnerable 
road users, such as pedestrians and cyclists, and degradation to roads, and to study the costs and 
benefits of imposing a passenger vehicle weight fee to include consideration of vehicle weight. The 
bill would require the CTC, by no later than January 1, 2026, to prepare and submit a report to the 
Legislature, as specified. This bill contains other related provisions and other existing 
laws.   (Based on  10/07/2023 text) 

AB 251 
Support_17Marc
h2023.pdf 

Support 

AB 257 Hoover, R 
 

Encampments: 
penalties. 

01/03/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would prohibit a person from camping, as defined, in a street, sidewalk, or other public property 
within 500 feet of a school. The bill would authorize a city attorney, county counsel, or district 
attorney to bring an action for a violation of this prohibition. The bill would make a person who 
violates this prohibition liable for a civil fine of not more than $10 in an action brought by the city 
attorney of the city or the county counsel or the district attorney of the county where the violation 
occurred.   (Based on  01/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=s2LQIWNtPG7YMl/FE+xyO8Cv1SztmcfGi7f3VdWiNKWazLMjb7cWfPWaVTlCW2U89/JHdezTBBnLQ8+pOf42+PcCLLXrP4HT7L7Q4v2W3H8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/452
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0201-0250/ab_247_93_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0201-0250/ab_247_93_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=vZThOOqI46JSrGccu4fZHmnYvbzZJmLlBDPkgCsKhtBp3r2nYfgBl/78ULRhh6dhImc2LZPE0GJB382ViDsmIFYLhDWYCzoJ7ueqg1e/Woo=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/328
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0251-0300/ab_251_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0251-0300/ab_251_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E220D3EC-62A0-4628-A5D4-656576C63C30
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E220D3EC-62A0-4628-A5D4-656576C63C30
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E220D3EC-62A0-4628-A5D4-656576C63C30
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=UcoVzuvhD7VD0rkknJ/hCaRZUKwAtaa/75ZZOZRhsO4hg+M6xpGNl/+uv9KjomxehqGp5Li4aR7aYCZhEzsakV95u/hFjBWKvdKWQrYScHw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/431
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0251-0300/ab_257_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0251-0300/ab_257_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0251-0300/ab_257_97_A_bill.pdf
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AB 259 Lee, D 
 

Wealth Tax: 
False Claims 
Act. 

01/19/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would, for taxable years beginning on or after January 1, 2024, and before January 1, 2026, 
impose an annual tax at a rate of 1.5% of a resident of this state’s worldwide net worth in excess 
of $1,000,000,000, or in excess of $500,000,000 in the case of a married taxpayer filing 
separately. The bill would, for taxable years beginning on or after January 1, 2026, impose an 
annual tax at a rate of 1% of a resident’s worldwide net worth in excess of $50,000,000, or in 
excess of $25,000,000 in the case of a married taxpayer filing separately. The bill would also 
impose, for taxable years beginning on or after January 1, 2026, an additional tax at a rate of 0.5% 
of a resident’s worldwide net worth in excess of $1,000,000,000, or in excess of $500,000,000 in 
the case of a married taxpayer filing separately. The bill would describe worldwide net worth with 
reference to specific federal provisions and would provide that worldwide net worth does not 
include specific assets, including personal property situated out of state, directly held real property, 
or liabilities related to directly held real property. The bill would also authorize the Franchise Tax 
Board to adopt regulations to carry out these provisions, including regulations regarding the 
valuation of certain assets that are not publicly traded. The bill would require new certifications by 
taxpayers, made under penalty of perjury.    (Based on  01/19/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 262 Holden, D 
 

Children’s 
camps: safety 
and regulation. 

09/22/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/22/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
341, 
Statutes of 
2024 

09/22/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The California Community Care Facilities Act generally provides for the licensing and regulation of 
community care facilities, including child daycare facilities, by the State Department of Social 
Services. Current law also requires the State Public Health Officer to establish rules and 
regulations establishing minimum standards for organized camps, defined as a site with a program 
and facilities established for the primary purposes of providing an outdoor group living experience 
with social, spiritual, educational, or recreational objectives, for 5 days or more during one or more 
seasons of the year, except as specified. This bill, subject to an appropriation by the Legislature 
for this purpose, would require the State Department of Social Services to prepare a report, in 
consultation with a wide variety of stakeholders, regarding approaches for children’s camp health 
and safety regulation and oversight. The bill would require the stakeholder group to be composed 
of representatives of designated state entities, including, but not limited to, the State Department 
of Public Health and the State Department of Education, and other stakeholders, such as parent 
advocate groups and local parks and health departments. The bill would require the department, 
following consultation with the stakeholder group, and within 24 months after funds are 
appropriated, to submit its recommendations in a report to the Legislature, as specified.   (Based 
on  09/22/2024 text) 

AB_2672_LOS_
SJCE.pdf 

Support 

AB 271 Quirk-Silva, D 
 

Homeless 
death review 
committees. 

09/01/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/01/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
135, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

08/16/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would authorize counties to establish a homeless death review committee for the purposes of 
gathering information to identify the root causes of death of homeless individuals and to determine 
strategies to improve coordination of services for the homeless population. The bill would establish 
procedures for the sharing or disclosure of specified information by a homeless death review 
committee.   (Based on  09/01/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=tklc+OHIqKvJEnJpOQymH+b+McJVdt8s8g+363mNPDk9pyfqSGTTChQBjpXm/CRXMXWG0dlYV6ClsYqWXx4P3qhWfxaUJaOo5tHPBO0mYvc=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/308
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0251-0300/ab_259_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0251-0300/ab_259_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ERJEBR6dqkkilvKe/AMMYSEBj85mNRkQ6KN5dScQsSaFaDg3tyUJoGiYQUCJciH0ioYzZFhTsMwH3SoPZxg6icGVbvA17ezJzigxXYkqqJM=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/370
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0251-0300/ab_262_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0251-0300/ab_262_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=BA4CB6E5-EA66-4FD1-9EDD-A7291CFDC6F2
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=BA4CB6E5-EA66-4FD1-9EDD-A7291CFDC6F2
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=jIjPvZPvSByzTM1XqwPpmDAf/RWGgtDyaeRik9qwOLR2wvX9XrKqwz6tdUQELLdHIbHD1t5Hjt8trzSFQpU/lTX5nz9Bzyn8riHm7CrG95Y=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/488
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0251-0300/ab_271_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0251-0300/ab_271_95_C_bill.pdf
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AB 276 Dixon, R 
 

Vehicles: 
electronic 
wireless 
communication 
devices. 

03/13/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would make it an infraction for a person under 21 years of age to drive a motor vehicle while using 
a wireless telephone or an electronic wireless communications device, even if equipped with a 
hands-free device. The bill would create an exception to that prohibition for a person 18 to 20 
years of age, inclusive, who is using a wireless telephone or an electronic wireless 
communications device, as defined, while driving, when the telephone or device is used 
exclusively as required by, and in the course and scope of, the person’s work activities. By 
expanding the scope of an existing crime, the bill would impose a state-mandated local 
program.   (Based on  03/13/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 281 Grayson, D 
 

Planning and 
zoning: 
housing: 
postentitlement 
phase permits. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
735, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Existing law, which is part of the Planning and Zoning Law, requires a local agency to compile a 
list of information needed to approve or deny a postentitlement phase permit, to post an example 
of a complete, approved application and an example of a complete set of postentitlement phase 
permits for at least 5 types of housing development projects in the jurisdiction, as specified, and to 
make those items available to all applicants for these permits no later than January 1, 2024. 
Existing law establishes time limits for completing reviews regarding whether an application for a 
postentitlement phase permit is complete and compliant and whether to approve or deny an 
application, as specified, and makes any failure to meet these time limits a violation of specified 
law. Existing law defines various terms for these purposes, including "local agency" to mean a city, 
county, or city and county, and "postentitlement phase permit," among other things, to exclude a 
permit required and issued by a special district. This bill would require a special district that 
receives an application from a housing development project for service from a special district or an 
application from a housing development project for a postentitlement phase permit, as specified, to 
provide written notice to the applicant of next steps in the review process, including, but not limited 
to, any additional information that may be required to begin to review the application for service or 
approval. The bill would require the special district to provide this notice within 30 business days of 
receipt of the application for a housing development with 25 units or fewer, and within 60 business 
days for a housing development with 26 units or more. The bill would define various terms for 
these purposes. By imposing additional duties on special districts, the bill would impose a state-
mandated local program. This bill contains other related provisions and other existing 
laws.   (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 284 Patterson, 
Joe, R 
 

Department of 
Housing and 
Community 
Development: 
annual report: 
Homeless 
Housing, 
Assistance, 
and Prevention 
program. 

01/24/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Under current law, grants under the Homeless Housing, Assistance, and Prevention (HHAP) 
program are allocated in 4 rounds of funding, administered by the California Interagency Council 
on Homelessness, as provided. Current law requires the Department of Housing and Community 
Development to submit an annual report to the Governor and both houses of the Legislature on 
the operations and accomplishments during the previous fiscal year of the housing programs 
administered by the department. Current law requires that the report include, among other things, 
the number of units assisted by those programs and the number of individuals and households 
served and their income level. This bill would additionally require that this report include an 
evaluation of the HHAP program.    (Based on  01/24/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=EIbhlYEDnSxvcbJ63lB3o0a0u8vuGFeojYPrvcxSWNiW5W7d4rWe9ZEQ98yPIonjDg07pJAReb25ii2zTlI+8NWzLc4g91kIDa9tWDCpYRU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/386
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0251-0300/ab_276_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0251-0300/ab_276_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0251-0300/ab_276_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=TmftVdVIEHnll79BjtsVIOvIP8im5YK3M6Bg5V0lkERhYxtZyhjBKQZlLnNa4ZnneCZRxr4+lD+GoOFdDTksunXNqSranVH2CblSs7YUa3c=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/433
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0251-0300/ab_281_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0251-0300/ab_281_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=YYES1usjANvhvQgkepboTLjZzk2akhFsPLuSg7d0eJC3KXHiySZPO9h4yGs4GoZfG2uqjdjQWsiRm5Vz6otFVV//DahvOmCPKB5MMo+G7MA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/354
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/354
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0251-0300/ab_284_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0251-0300/ab_284_99_I_bill.pdf
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AB 287 Garcia, D 
 

California 
Global 
Warming 
Solutions Act of 
2006: 
Greenhouse 
Gas Reduction 
Fund: 
competitive 
grant 
programs: 
funding 
objectives. 

01/24/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law requires the moneys from the Greenhouse Gas Reduction Fund to be used to facilitate 
the achievement of reductions of greenhouse gas emissions consistent with the California Global 
Warming Solutions Act of 2006 and, where applicable and to the extent feasible, to maximize 
economic, environmental, and public health benefits to the state, among other goals. This bill, 
beginning July 1, 2025, would require state agencies administering competitive grant programs 
that allocate moneys from the fund to give specified communities preferential points during grant 
application scoring for programs intended to improve air quality, to provide for a specified 
application timeline, and to allow applicants from the Counties of Imperial and San Diego to 
include daytime population numbers in grant applications.   (Based on  01/24/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 295 Lowenthal, D 
 

Residential real 
property: 
foreclosure. 

07/18/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

07/18/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
142, 
Statutes of 
2024 

07/18/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law prescribes various requirements to be satisfied before the exercise of a power of sale 
under a mortgage or deed of trust and prescribes a procedure for the exercise of that power. This 
bill would prohibit a person from contacting, soliciting, or initiating communication with an owner to 
claim the surplus funds from a foreclosure sale of the owner’s residence before 90 days after the 
trustee’s deed has been required.   (Based on  07/18/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 303 Davies, R 
 

Firearms: 
prohibited 
persons. 

09/08/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
161, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

09/08/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires the Attorney General to establish and maintain an online database known as 
the Prohibited Armed Persons File, sometimes referred to as the Armed Prohibited Persons 
System, to cross-reference persons who have ownership or possession of a firearm, and who, 
subsequent to the date of ownership or possession of that firearm, fall within a class of persons 
who are prohibited from owning or possessing a firearm. Current law requires the Attorney 
General to provide investigative assistance to local law enforcement agencies to better ensure the 
investigation of individuals who are armed and prohibited from possessing a firearm. This bill 
would require the Attorney General to provide specific information to local law enforcement 
agencies involving prohibited persons, including, but not limited to, personal identifying 
information, case status, and information regarding previous contact with the prohibited person, as 
specified.   (Based on  09/08/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 305 Villapudua, D 
 

California Flood 
Protection 
Bond Act of 
2024. 

04/25/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
N.R. & W. 
on 
5/22/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would enact the California Flood Protection Bond Act of 2024 which, if approved by the voters, 
would authorize the issuance of bonds in the amount of $4,500,000,000 pursuant to the State 
General Obligation Bond Law for flood protection projects, as specified. The bill would provide for 
the submission of these provisions to the voters at the November 5, 2024, statewide general 
election.   (Based on  04/25/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=yq1yWudi+m0xwaF1sxTeXAKCZKWeYLbpK4DoNgSgOqrkVRK7wf9KH50n+9XaPGBUfSGYa+bYyoXOWxSIzsCay9Usu2dMs/homqt1KFtPz4A=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/440
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0251-0300/ab_287_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0251-0300/ab_287_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=7BqE+CLlQfwwXc5KDLd1hxppdzNDxmQy4rc/NAgioQ3iJAbQ5ZVsuf6nYYJ9gj3WlbY7Bh6ZtDBQyQUc4+tBB0pKwoxw3HAv9Abpr5jiVJA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/385
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0251-0300/ab_295_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0251-0300/ab_295_92_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=+pHCBdF1MTBtEpHa76LVmyouf3rZYEudDNgjcFV+ZxmjUiF5iNUEjD96A1ah1TTsDc58XqHVGdwLcNnxLniQ8X/TZ9DUszNlBZlB7iwFASU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/455
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_303_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_303_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=bd9Uk2Cn6YxzkJ2S3LZQNE+LUIrH+3QTN5XiGmAngZWteGmdpH9a0372UxwxhBeVUYHcx0dYbm2ZTdT52ZOwD2CN189D6fP71XDe9N813Bs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/357
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_305_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_305_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_305_96_A_bill.pdf
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AB 309 Lee, D 
 

The Social 
Housing Act. 

10/07/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

01/30/2024 - 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto stricken 
from file.  

10/07/2023 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Would enact the Social Housing Act and would create, in the Department of General Services, the 
Social Housing Program, the mission of which would be to ensure that qualified social housing 
developments are produced on leased state property to help address the housing crisis, as 
specified. The bill would authorize the program to identify and develop up to 3 qualified social 
housing projects, as specified, with the intent to use the results to inform public policy related to 
developing an independent public entity to develop statewide qualified social housing. The bill 
would require the program to solicit bids to develop qualified social housing units, and prioritize 
bids that demonstrate long-term revenue neutrality or a cost rent model, as those terms are 
defined. The bill would require the program to employ 2 different leasing models, the rental model 
and the ownership model, as specified, in creating social housing. The bill would prohibit a city or 
county from denying a social housing development authorized under the program. The bill would 
authorize a city or county to propose objective design review standards, as specified, and 
authorize a city or county to propose modifications to mitigate any specific, adverse impacts on 
public health or safety, as specified.   (Based on  09/18/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 312 Reyes, D 
 

State 
Partnership for 
Affordable 
Housing 
Registries in 
California Grant 
Program. 

03/30/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would establish, subject to appropriation by the Legislature, the State Partnership for Affordable 
Housing Registries in California Grant Program to provide technical assistance to eligible entities, 
as defined, for the purpose of creating a state-managed online platform of affordable housing 
listings, information, and applications. The bill would require the department to administer the 
program and to adopt guidelines for this purpose. The bill would require the department to develop 
a housing preapplication to standardize applications for affordable housing and to solicit 
participation of eligible entities no later than January 1, 2026, and to launch the platform no later 
than July 1, 2027. The bill would require the department to provide technical assistance to 
participating entities and to ensure equitable access to database users, as specified. The bill 
would authorize the department to coordinate with the Office of Data and Innovation to carry out 
the requirements of the program and to contract with vendors pursuant to existing provisions of 
state contract law, as specified. The bill would establish minimum requirements for the platform 
and would require a vendor selected to create and maintain the platform to demonstrate specified 
capabilities and implement those requirements. The bill would exempt from disclosure as a public 
record any personally identifiable information collected by the platform or shared between eligible 
entities and the department in administering the program.    (Based on  03/30/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 316 Aguiar-Curry, 
D 
 

Vehicles: 
autonomous 
vehicles. 

09/22/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

03/03/2024 - 
Last day to 
consider 
Governor's 
veto 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
58.5.  

09/22/2023 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Would require a manufacturer of an autonomous vehicle to report to the Department of Motor 
Vehicles a collision on a public road that involved one of its autonomous vehicles with a gross 
vehicle weight of 10,001 pounds or more that is operating under a testing permit that resulted in 
damage of property, bodily injury, or death within 10 days of the collision.   (Based on  09/12/2023 
text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=KTmvEyxLaIVC3B8qQEQ/BJCwj84w835QwtThjX+XMMz/4+nK1wM1uYErj2gxDVaMxpSQBOknSx83ThHrqy+Q1uOox8LKuU4UHs0FFnB3Xis=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/308
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_309_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_309_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_309_94_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=/imK8TCtTVXwVW111l2GgRAck4vQM0d9YPqKOhQzD7j7CGvXqzid+R+KzkN/s0/7plD4u3fuQ8RF7PeOm4eRS8B3Vzun+nm5uPoyv73xtzg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/374
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_312_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_312_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_312_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=F86ypShGsRCHkLBoL9fJFzTC6rszp0lFUEpe1cb2FD8EDX9AOSrSs83GmA/hX18WcG89iLqiDGd8n6KI7yv+m/lWKtYpwz+bFrOTpiI/bBE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/430
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/430
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_316_96_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_316_96_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_316_96_E_bill.pdf
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AB 323 Holden, D 
 

Density Bonus 
Law: purchase 
of density 
bonus units by 
nonprofit 
housing 
organizations: 
civil actions. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
738, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Existing law, commonly referred to as the Density Bonus Law, requires a city or county to provide 
a developer that proposes a housing development within the city or county with a density bonus 
and other incentives or concessions, as specified, if the developer agrees to construct, among 
other options, specified percentages of units for moderate, lower, or very low income households 
and meets other requirements. This bill would instead require the developer and the city or county 
to ensure that the for-sale unit that qualified the developer for the award of the density bonus is (1) 
initially sold to and occupied by a person or family of the required income, or (2) if the unit is not 
purchased by an income-qualified person or family within 180 days after the issuance of the 
certificate of occupancy, the qualified nonprofit housing organization that is receiving the above-
described welfare exemption meets specified requirements, including having a determination letter 
from the Internal Revenue Service affirming its tax-exempt status, as specified, being based in 
California, and the primary activity of the nonprofit corporation being the development and 
preservation of affordable home ownership housing in California that incorporates within their 
contracts for initial purchase a repurchase option that requires a subsequent purchaser that 
desires to sell or convey the property to first offer the nonprofit corporation the opportunity to 
repurchase the property pursuant to an equity sharing agreement or a specified recorded contract 
that includes an affordability restriction. By imposing these requirements on local agencies with 
respect to density bonuses, this bill would impose a state-mandated local program. This bill 
contains other related provisions and other existing laws.   (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 328 Essayli, R 
 

Sentencing: 
dismissal of 
enhancements. 

01/30/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

01/12/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(1). 
(Last 
location was 
PUB. S. on 
2/9/2023) 

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law generally authorizes a court to dismiss an action or to strike or dismiss an 
enhancement in the furtherance of justice. Current law requires a court to dismiss an 
enhancement if it is in the furtherance of justice to do so, except if dismissal of that enhancement 
is prohibited by any initiative statute. This bill would also prohibit a court from dismissing specified 
firearms-related enhancements.    (Based on  01/30/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 333 Nguyen, 
Stephanie, D 
 

Vehicles: 
abatement of 
abandoned 
vehicles. 

01/30/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law authorizes a county satisfying specified conditions to establish a service authority for 
the abatement of abandoned vehicles and to impose a $1 vehicle registration fee. Current law 
authorizes a service authority to adopt an ordinance establishing procedures for the abatement, 
removal, and disposal, as a public nuisance, of an abandoned, wrecked, dismantled, or 
inoperative vehicle or part of the vehicle from private or public property and for the recovery of 
costs associated with the enforcement of the ordinance. This bill would allow the ordinance to 
provide for the issuance of permits or licenses, consistent with local nuisance codes and in 
cooperation with local code enforcement authorities, regarding the temporary parking allowance of 
abandoned, wrecked, dismantled, or inoperative vehicles and to authorize any necessary 
investigations and inspections related to the determination of a public nuisance.   (Based 
on  01/30/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=uwxd5zCr8kceZqSFtYhZMu0tb1r/FpVNKtYSrxWC/CUhlptPXSY10n70Od2y+ybMGpJ1T5RwsgmAw7IplqgBt/uwAYMpdwF6laRtWHSs3B4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/370
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_323_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_323_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=0Io3YIPn+nBATXO0Q1QbvFfVsRZUislASPprx81vZuD/1B+NzW9Iaf5REThbnHUaQg5JVJDSN6IxX4ece7OAN6kjAjKJqox6GYDvDmZ0A18=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/381
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_328_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_328_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=QrNMzy2JUEZE6/3+27p+BMblZiQVcMdnRq0W1GlzmWtY1gJCIbcNELvyWFSXOS8p36zNnaxJ+Hk8DPikpTlp1k3ErDO+xP6u/U+ILjxAtIc=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/356
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/356
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_333_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_333_99_I_bill.pdf
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AB 334 Rubio, 
Blanca, D 
 

Public 
contracts: 
conflicts of 
interest. 

09/30/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/30/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
263, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

09/30/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law prohibits members of the Legislature and state, county, district, judicial district, and 
city officers or employees from being financially interested in any contract made by them in their 
official capacity, or by any body or board of which they are members. Current law authorizes the 
Fair Political Practices Commission to commence an administrative or civil action against persons 
who violate this prohibition, as prescribed, and includes provisions for the collection of penalties 
after the time for judicial review of a commission order or decision has lapsed, or if all means of 
judicial review of the order or decision have been exhausted. Current law identifies certain remote 
interests in contracts that are not subject to this prohibition and other situations in which an official 
is not deemed to be financially interested in a contract. Current law makes a willful violation of this 
prohibition a crime. This bill would establish that an independent contractor, who meets specified 
requirements, is not an officer for purposes of being subject to the prohibition on being financially 
interested in a contract. The bill would authorize a public agency to enter into a contract with an 
independent contractor who is an officer for a later phase of the same project if the independent 
contractor did not engage in or advise on, as specified, the making of the subsequent contract. 
This bill would establish that a person who acts in good faith reliance on these provisions is not in 
violation of the above-described conflict-of-interest prohibitions and would prohibit them from being 
subject to criminal, civil, or administrative enforcement under those prohibitions if the initial 
contract includes specified language and the independent contractor is not in breach of those 
terms.   (Based on  09/30/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 340 Fong, Vince, 
R 
 

California 
Environmental 
Quality Act: 
grounds for 
noncompliance. 

01/30/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) prohibits an action or proceeding from being 
brought in a court to challenge the approval of a project by a public agency unless the alleged 
grounds for noncompliance are presented to the public agency orally or in writing by a person 
during the public comment period provided by CEQA or before the close of the public hearing on 
the project before the issuance of the notice of determination. This bill would require the alleged 
grounds for noncompliance with CEQA presented to the public agency in writing be presented at 
least 10 days before the public hearing on the project before the issuance of the notice of 
determination. The bill would prohibit the inclusion of written comments presented to the public 
agency after that time period in the record of proceedings and would prohibit those documents 
from serving as basis on which an action or proceeding may be brought.   (Based on  01/30/2023 
text) 

 Monitor 

AB 341 Ramos, D 
 

Gambling: local 
moratorium. 

05/22/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

05/22/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 8, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

05/22/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires the Department of Justice to investigate any violations of, and to enforce, the 
Gambling Control Act. Under the act, a city, county, or city and county may authorize controlled 
gambling consistent with state law. Current law, however, prohibits an ordinance that would result 
in an expansion of gambling in the city, county, or city and county from being valid unless the 
amendment is approved by a majority of the voters. Current law requires an amendment to a city 
or county ordinance relating to a gambling establishment or the act to be submitted to the 
department for review and comment before the ordinance is adopted by the city or county. Prior 
law, until January 1, 2023, prohibited the commission from issuing a gambling license for a 
gambling establishment that was not licensed to operate on December 31, 1999, except as 
specified. This bill would reenact that prohibition until January 1, 2043, and would prohibit the 
commission from issuing a gambling license for a gambling establishment that was not licensed to 
operate on December 31, 2022, and that is pending before the commission as of January 1, 
2024.    (Based on  05/22/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=vQYzBcIHnuvrsucIcNT2jqEf97tNDflMY47mRWCtQcA8TnAOjaFw/+EB5nsBQY54GVQq+MiPgir2eWGVuTN9dacfUCdr7fbVJWeWBSY5Kgs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/323
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/323
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_334_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_334_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Lv/Qb0M4ctq+20IDvAwQE9KIfNwIgYwn5isSMLIQYo8czf9ut8rbZv4lelAK2XdG/QP2OVVatGASzj51e4lFW3MyXLQ3IBL0ppSUsa6FKEA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/315
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/315
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_340_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_340_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=qN1eYdemgan8ptjpM00e6KqtHhAe0/5e7COXn3EW2FQo7rmidYs79I8hN8FDOh1UuxxXZusSbL7GOC3e4QUnJDWcDdR40WdzC9yZ1PL4VP4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/473
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_341_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_341_95_C_bill.pdf


Attachment B: 2023-2024 Intergovernmental Relations Priority State Legislation Log 
 

Last Updated 12/06/24        23 
 

Measure Author Topic Current 
Text 

Status Location Brief Summary Attachments Position 

AB 344 Wood, D 
 

Electricity: 
load-serving 
entities: 
offshore wind 
facilities. 

01/31/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would expressly authorize electrical corporations, electric service providers, and community 
choice aggregators to jointly enter into agreements to procure electricity generated from offshore 
wind facilities.   (Based on  01/31/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 355 Alanis, R 
 

Firearms: 
assault 
weapons: 
exception for 
peace officer 
training. 

09/26/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/26/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
235, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

09/26/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires the loan of a firearm to be processed through a licensed firearm dealer. 
Current law exempts from this requirement the loan of a firearm to a person enrolled in the course 
of basic training prescribed by the Commission on Peace Officer Standards and Training, or any 
other course certified by the commission, for purposes of participation in the course. Current law 
prohibits the sale, transfer, or possession of a large-capacity magazine, as defined. Current law 
exempts from this prohibition the sale or transfer to, or the possession by, a peace officer or retired 
peace officer, as specified, or to or by a person enrolled in the course of basic training prescribed 
by the Commission on Peace Officer Standards and Training, or any other course certified by the 
commission, for purposes of participation in the course, as specified. Current law prohibits the 
sale, transfer, or possession of an assault weapon, as specified. Current law exempts from this 
prohibition the sale or transfer of an assault weapon to, or the possession of an assault weapon 
by, a peace officer, as specified. This bill would also exempt from this prohibition the loaning of an 
assault weapon to, or the possession of an assault weapon by, a person enrolled in the course of 
basic training prescribed by the Commission on Peace Officer Standards and Training, while 
engaged in firearms training and being supervised by a firearms instructor.    (Based 
on  09/26/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 361 Ward, D 
 

Vehicles: 
photographs of 
bicycle lane 
parking 
violations. 

10/08/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
432, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/07/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law authorizes a public transit operator, as defined, to enforce parking violations in 
specified transit-only traffic lanes through the use of video imaging and to install automated 
forward facing parking control devices on public transit vehicles for the purpose of video imaging 
parking violations occurring in transit-only traffic lanes, as specified. Current law requires a 
designated employee of a city, county, city and county, or a contracted law enforcement agency 
for a special transit district, who is qualified by the city and county or the district to issue parking 
citations, to review video image recordings for the purpose of determining whether a parking 
violation occurred in a transit-only traffic lane and to issue a notice of violation to the registered 
owner of a vehicle within 15 calendar days, as specified. Current law makes these video image 
records confidential, and provides that these records are available only to public agencies to 
enforce parking violations. Current law requires an operator who implements an automated 
enforcement system described above to report to specified committees of the Legislature on the 
system’s effectiveness and impact on traffic outcomes, among other things, as specified. This bill 
would, until January 1, 2030, authorize a local agency, as defined, to install automated forward 
facing parking control devices on city-owned or district-owned parking enforcement vehicles for the 
purpose of taking photographs of parking violations occurring in bicycle lanes.   (Based 
on  10/08/2023 text) 

AB 361 - 
Support_04.17.2
3.pdf 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=GdO+SDV+fB++220e4yuSU82/EZjeHxWRpwaIUA20i/NLfiCzAiwl5h36RN07MRJKrEPW6Es7eyJmWdCba2H+m1Z/+KSe/RGJqETqWZ5u4Zg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/418
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_344_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0301-0350/ab_344_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=dB0Nymraubsqq48baM1og9S4prIS032mb5HTWkxPXcQaYVBr/BNximOVyvCD0HlxO+LlXfOXUFDpIoYQtVxQciw09lWeWrVGjRAtof2VXAI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/363
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_355_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_355_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=q1RIbl5MIH+aGAP6FC6Lqg1ZyaItXzJaK2WeTQM5oQDeNPLY8WOC69S4J71Fm/ET3Ji995mJ1AkMTGrfgPp1JewsooyVFrHBpEIdHE7m+Ro=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/328
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_361_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_361_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=8708139C-FA79-466A-BE1D-4EC1422EDE35
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=8708139C-FA79-466A-BE1D-4EC1422EDE35
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=8708139C-FA79-466A-BE1D-4EC1422EDE35
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AB 362 Lee, D 
 

Real property 
taxation: land 
value taxation 
study. 

02/01/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would require the California Department of Tax and Fee Administration to conduct or commission 
a study on the efficacy of a statewide land value taxation system as an alternative to the current 
appraisal methods utilized for real property taxation. The bill would require the study to be 
provided to the Legislature by January 1, 2025. The bill would make related findings and 
declarations.   (Based on  02/01/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 363 Bauer-Kahan, 
D 
 

Pesticides: 
neonicotinoids 
for 
nonagricultural 
use: 
reevaluation: 
control 
measures. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
520, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/08/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would, beginning January 1, 2025, prohibit a person from selling, possessing, or using a pesticide 
containing one or more neonicotinoid pesticides, as defined, for any nonagricultural use on 
nonproduction outdoor or ornamental plants, trees, or turf, except as provided. The bill would 
require the department to evaluate, taking into account relevant routes of exposure, the potential 
impacts of those neonicotinoid pesticide uses on pollinating insects, aquatic ecosystems, and 
human health. The bill would require the department, among other things, to issue a determination 
on those impacts on or before July 1, 2027, and adopt necessary control measures for the use of 
neonicotinoid pesticides on or before July 1, 2029.   (Based on  10/08/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 367 Maienschein, 
D 
 

Controlled 
substances: 
enhancements. 

03/22/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law imposes an additional and consecutive 3- or 5-year term in the state prison on a 
person who personally inflicts great bodily injury on a person in the commission of a felony, as 
specified. This bill, until January 1, 2029, would state that, for purposes of this enhancement, a 
person inflicts great bodily injury when they sell, furnish, administer, or give away fentanyl or an 
analog of fentanyl and the person to whom the substance was sold, furnished, administered, or 
given suffers a significant or substantial physical injury from using the substance. The bill would 
specify that this provision does not apply to juvenile offenders.   (Based on  03/22/2023 text) 

AB 367 
SUPPORT BCM 
22March23 

Monitor 

AB 372 Nguyen, 
Stephanie, D 
 

CalWORKs: 
eligibility: 
income 
exclusions. 

10/08/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

01/29/2024 - 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto stricken 
from file.  

10/08/2023 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Current law provides for the California Work Opportunity and Responsibility to Kids (CalWORKs) 
program under which each county provides cash assistance and other benefits to qualified low-
income families. Under existing law, certain types of payments received by recipients of aid under 
the CalWORKs program, including income from a college work-study program, as specified, are 
exempt from consideration as income for purposes of determining eligibility and aid amount. This 
bill would, commencing January 1, 2025, or on the date that the State Department of Social 
Services notifies the Legislature that the California Statewide Automated Welfare System can 
perform the necessary automation to implement this change, additionally exempt income up to 
200% of the federal poverty level that is received by an apprentice or preapprentice for performing 
work as part of a specified apprenticeship program or preapprenticeship program from 
consideration as income for purposes of determining eligibility or calculating grant amounts under 
the CalWORKs program.    (Based on  09/18/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=yqKO4OqsDSTElPIkLfHAWLKtwPKdzGJUERnDsdgRAv+9eojp9ONSCGyyZb+mZRf4z9Hbz1vQqkjPpyeIuPS3AKZnvKI19g1SZmZ0jrpQZAI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/308
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_362_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_362_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=NShO2eWLvhJV29vmociLUa6as3vYa92k1XLki5Cg7muRP97Gj3vrZ97bHxn9Qka+9VJvyvCSyEPRTwJ92kQlrA7yxf4JiJcvrjRRObD5mHI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/434
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/434
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_363_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_363_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=GwZr8+BkKPWecmxvzo7ZEqjz3HGqbwi0IVMswZSog0UFMNazTScZ4TaC7jW8Mgz3jODAtbQnQLb7UdaRZKYy2p7JIOAAMwlZhvOJ7iIuDSs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/388
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/388
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_367_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_367_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_367_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=D19C06F7-AA93-4061-BDB2-2C93CBCB3D83
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=D19C06F7-AA93-4061-BDB2-2C93CBCB3D83
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=D19C06F7-AA93-4061-BDB2-2C93CBCB3D83
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=/dAfEFQcKQDxeq70VM4AmyfuzfzVsYbyMARybNkpd2kJu1pq2k7ajCpAcbnUEIakLguaprqMtV2BzX/b5SFaYG+G66x6detKihI77QE2Ibs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/356
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/356
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_372_95_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_372_95_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_372_95_E_bill.pdf
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AB 374 Haney, D 
 

Cannabis: retail 
preparation, 
sale, and 
consumption of 
noncannabis 
food and 
beverage 
products. 

10/08/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto stricken 
from file.  

10/08/2023 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Current administrative law specifies that a licensed retailer or licensed microbusiness authorized 
for retail sales who operates a consumption area on the licensed premises in accordance with this 
provision may sell prepackaged, noncannabis-infused, nonalcoholic food and beverages if the 
applicable local jurisdiction allows. This bill would authorize a local jurisdiction, if specified 
conditions are met, to allow for the preparation or sale of noncannabis food or beverage products, 
as specified, by a licensed retailer or microbusiness in the area where the consumption of 
cannabis is allowed, to allow for the sale of prepackaged, noncannabis-infused, nonalcoholic food 
and beverages by a licensed retailer, and to allow, and to sell tickets for, live musical or other 
performances on the premises of a licensed retailer or microbusiness in the area where the 
consumption of cannabis is allowed. The bill would additionally specify that these provisions do not 
authorize a licensed retailer or microbusiness to prepare or sell industrial hemp or products 
containing industrial hemp, as provided.   (Based on  09/12/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 394 Hoover, R 
 

Housing: 
Building Homes 
and Jobs Act: 
report. 

03/01/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Building Homes and Jobs Act, imposes a fee, except as provided, of $75 to be paid at the 
time of the recording of every real estate instrument, paper, or notice required or permitted by law 
to be recorded, per each single transaction per single parcel of real property, not to exceed $225. 
Current law requires that a county recorder send revenues from this fee, as provided, to the State 
Controller for deposit in the Building Homes and Jobs Trust Fund. Current law, for moneys 
collected on and after January 1, 2019, requires 20% of all moneys in the fund, upon appropriation 
by the Legislature, to be expended for affordable owner-occupied workforce housing. This bill 
would require the Department of Housing and Community Development to create and submit a 
report to the Legislature that includes specified information relating to the expenditure of the 
above-described moneys for affordable owner-occupied workforce housing, including how those 
moneys are being utilized and the number of new homeowners as a result of the expenditure of 
those moneys, among other things.   (Based on  03/01/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 399 Boerner, D 
 

Water 
Ratepayers 
Protections Act 
of 2023: 
County Water 
Authority Act: 
exclusion of 
territory: 
procedure. 

10/13/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/13/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
802, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/13/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The County Water Authority Act provides for the formation of county water authorities and grants 
to those authorities specified powers with regards to providing water service. The act provides 2 
methods of excluding territory from any county water authority, one of which is that a public 
agency whose corporate area as a unit is part of a county water authority may obtain exclusion of 
the area by submitting to the electors within the public agency, at any general or special election, 
the proposition of excluding the public agency's corporate area from the county water authority. 
Current law requires that, if a majority of the electors approve the proposition, specified actions 
take place to implement the exclusion. This bill, the Water Ratepayers Protections Act of 2023, 
would additionally require the public entity to submit the proposition of excluding the public 
agency's corporate area from the county water authority to the electors within the territory of the 
county water authority. The bill would require the 2 elections to be separate; however, the bill 
would authorize both elections to run concurrently. The bill would require the ballot materials to 
include a fiscal impact statement, as described.    (Based on  10/13/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=NEHEPq++OlodnU8cOFMifFfra5JWaq9CEUVSdfRwZSlAy+mE9/qvWoM2qhBe9t7ntwAOgLA7phfFF4gpbVs4FsAUATZ1T96dPOUaMfPkQbo=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/503
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_374_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_374_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_374_94_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=mxTreOQnwZCuB7qUk5LOLlJhWeUMqz0D+DPXKGP9iGFkoN2/FyqBJJ6+Z2vLYjNTQSAfqSc4+tFGnm2+KFBIUV5uoVx2DgrF8wZ0CdB0UFY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/431
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_394_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_394_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_394_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=z91MZJBUQP3i7cfv9pOmKxYj4qhRw6pqWtIU7kyLo5qNdz3Lck0FXDBP8/cOS5/jrX1YCma/hFqH/NE1ikNfHb7QYKpRqPhHlJIxvfWmDuU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/389
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_399_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_399_94_C_bill.pdf
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AB 400 Rubio, 
Blanca, D 
 

Local agency 
design-build 
projects: 
authorization. 

09/22/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/22/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
201, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

09/22/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law authorizes a local agency, as defined, with approval of its governing body, to procure 
design-build contracts for public works projects in excess of $1,000,000, awarding the contract 
either to the lowest bid or the best value. “Local agency” is defined, in part, for this purpose to 
include specified local and regional agencies responsible for the construction of transit projects, 
including any joint powers authority formed to provide transit service. Current law, among other 
requirements for the design-build procurement process, requires specified information submitted 
by a design-build entity to be certified under penalty of perjury. These provisions authorizing the 
use of the design-build procurement process are repealed on January 1, 2025 .This bill would 
delete from the definition of “local agency” any joint powers authority formed to provide transit 
services, and would instead expand that definition to include any joint powers authority responsible 
for the construction of transit projects, thereby authorizing additional joint powers authorities to use 
the above-described design-build procurement process. The bill would extend the repeal date to 
January 1, 2031.   (Based on  09/22/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 410 Jones-
Sawyer, D 
 

Shared mobility 
devices. 

07/06/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

07/06/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 36, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

07/06/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires a shared mobility service provider to affix to each shared mobility device a 
tactile sign containing raised characters and accompanying braille, as specified, to identify the 
device for the purpose of reporting illegal or negligent activity. Current law requires the sign to 
include the company name, email address, and telephone number of the service provider. This bill 
would repeal the requirements relating to tactile signs described above until January 1, 2024. The 
bill, commencing January 1, 2024, would add to those tactile sign requirements that the raised 
characters be at minimum 1/2 inch high and in a color that contrasts with the signage background, 
and would delete the requirement that the sign contain the email address of the service 
provider.    (Based on  07/06/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 411 Bennett, D 
 

California 
Recreational 
Trails and 
Greenways 
Act. 

03/16/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would require the Department of Parks and Recreation to establish the California Recreational 
Trails and Greenways Program to, beginning in 2024, award competitive grants on a biennial basis 
for new, expanded, or improved public access opportunities through nonmotorized recreational 
trail creation, improvement, enhancement, and restoration projects. The bill would create the 
California Recreational Trails and Greenways Fund in the State Treasury, and would require that 
specified moneys, including, to the extent consistent with Proposition 68, unexpended Proposition 
68 moneys that revert to the administering agency for allocation, upon appropriation by the 
Legislature, be deposited into the fund and, upon appropriation by the Legislature, be available for 
allocation by the department for purposes of the program, as specified. In order to reduce the 
financial burdens associated with frontloaded cost structures and match requirements, the bill 
would authorize the department to create a loan or grant process for advanced payment and 
match assistance to reduce barriers to participation in the program.    (Based on  03/16/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=mMx+u9mkpVyl19UVajpvpL0/vlQ9H26Orq3dsmMIHVisNuYkMCitSx1KJPyXfEZ5hFjHwkzF3JURZdu+jH8c5eSLogSIYmL22PVUk0O6t54=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/323
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/323
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_400_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0351-0400/ab_400_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=vJWvmtGTlurlprTJl1aPmFK/z37Xwlm88JVae4kwjSB48mdAhj8o3Ap79I3o+vju9jfpLN4lxIbrMMSDve1R8l1Hpoe2QHmIviLRoF1J76U=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/378
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/378
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_410_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_410_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Xel3ikUTuz6tOykM0c+7AyjD+GDNj64Jyp0un/W2yjLCtBsHpTLiyAGfHF0O1tP6gSa/k5iaTGp0wA5F0Rf9XSDg1OUO2wO5UxJ7yw3ubfA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/368
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_411_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_411_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_411_98_A_bill.pdf
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AB 413 Lee, D 
 

Vehicles: 
stopping, 
standing, and 
parking. 

10/10/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/10/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
652, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/10/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would prohibit the stopping, standing, or parking of a vehicle within 20 feet of the vehicle approach 
side of any unmarked or marked crosswalk or 15 feet of any crosswalk where a curb extension is 
present, as specified. The bill would, prior to January 1, 2025, authorize jurisdictions to only issue 
a warning for a violation, and would prohibit them from issuing a citation for a violation, unless the 
violation occurs in an area marked using paint or a sign.   (Based on  10/10/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 421 Bryan, D 
 

Elections: 
referendum 
measures. 

09/08/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
162, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

09/08/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law imposes ballot layout specifications, including, among other things, the content of the 
ballot label, defined as that portion of the ballot containing the names of the candidates or the 
statement of a measure. Existing law requires the ballot label to include, among other things, a 
condensed version of the ballot title and summary and a list of the names of supporters and 
opponents, as specified. Current law defines the ballot title and summary and requires that it 
include a summary of the chief purpose and points, including the fiscal impact, of any measure 
that appears in the state voter information guide. Current law requires the ballots used when voting 
on a statute referred to the voters as a referendum measure to use words asking the voter whether 
the statute that is the subject to referendum should be adopted, followed by the choices “Yes” and 
“No.” This bill would revise the ballot title and summary and ballot label requirements for statewide 
referendum measures by instead requiring that the ballot title and summary be posed in the form 
of a question asking whether the state should keep or overturn the law that is proposed to be 
overturned, followed by a summary of the chief purposes and points of the law. The bill would 
require this question and a condensed version of the summary to be included on the ballot label. 
The bill would require the ballot title and summary that appears in the state voter information guide 
for a statewide referendum measure to be followed by the measure’s top funders, as 
specified.   (Based on  09/08/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 422 Alanis, R 
 

Natural 
Resources 
Agency: 
statewide water 
storage: 
tracking. 

02/02/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would require the Natural Resources Agency, on or before June 1, 2024, to post on its publicly 
available internet website information tracking the progress to increase statewide water storage, 
and to keep that information updated.    (Based on  02/02/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=MYc9+6m/eBecY/YOagqRKBgDmkotyU891dpb0MT7zhd2C3vMXaipNfR3q6OVJjODe/NCwxP0ngM8x9EhyXxyDLRMgBmDeUP0NSKdB1EEXBQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/308
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_413_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_413_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=BUb4pj0CFBmxrhK51v0HuM8jbgbKXXI+SMmZ0MlB3NIhP4PEK4phPpmlO/P2Hqj71F/bWKuUd0MiJWYXnscFMKu2RNF623xf/FsTV1xS4cA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/447
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_421_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_421_91_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=9kY5jriYSe/pfUONLzYORZFF02No7fC3pKJ/6bKqpkLTtDUOcBCcrD1LYnUvpPjDb7MLa0UWH+Rb004pJgto8jIdm8B7cUeLc1dSdJrJlbM=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/363
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_422_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_422_99_I_bill.pdf
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AB 426 Jackson, D 
 

Unlicensed 
residential 
foster care 
facilities: 
temporary 
placement 
management. 

10/08/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
438, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/07/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law prohibits an unlicensed community care facility, as defined, from operating in the state, 
and prohibits a person, firm, partnership, association, or corporation within the state, or state or 
local public agency, from operating, establishing, managing, conducting, or maintaining a 
community care facility in this state, without a current, valid community care facility license. 
Current law authorizes the department to assess an immediate civil penalty in the amount of $200 
per day for a violation of either or both of those prohibitions, as specified. This bill would 
additionally authorize the department to assess an immediate civil penalty in the amount of $1,000 
for each day of the violation on a person, as defined, who provides residential care to 
children.    (Based on  10/08/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 430 Bennett, D 
 

Community 
land trusts: 
welfare 
exemption: 
assessment: 
foreclosure 
sales: financial 
assistance. 

07/10/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/21/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

(1)Current property tax law, pursuant to constitutional authorization, provides for a “welfare 
exemption” for property used exclusively for religious, hospital, scientific, or charitable purposes 
and that is owned or operated by certain types of nonprofit entities, if certain qualifying criteria are 
met. For the 2022–23 fiscal year through the 2027–28 fiscal year, in the case of an owner of 
property that is a community land trust, as defined, existing property tax law requires that a unit 
continue to be treated as occupied by a lower income household for these purposes if the 
occupants were lower income households on the lien date in the fiscal year in which their 
occupancy of the unit commenced and the unit continues to be rent restricted, notwithstanding an 
increase in the income of the occupants of the unit to 140% of area median income, adjusted for 
family size. Current law requires that a lease between a community land trust and a lower income 
household satisfy specified requirements in order for these provisions to apply, including being a 
renewable 99-year ground lease and a public agency or official must make a finding that the 
contract serves the public interest of creating or preserving affordable housing, as provided. This 
bill would eliminate specified requirements of a lease agreement between a lower income 
household and a community land trust in order for the unit to continue to be treated as occupied by 
a lower income household, as described above.    (Based on  07/10/2023 text) 

AB 430 Letter of 
Support 
04.03.24.pdf 

Support 

AB 434 Grayson, D 
 

Housing 
element: notice 
of violation. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
740, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires each county and city to adopt a comprehensive, long-term general plan for 
the physical development of the county or city, and specified land outside its boundaries, that 
includes, among other mandatory elements, a housing element. Upon adoption of a housing 
element or amendment to an adopted housing element, current law requires the planning agency 
to submit a copy to the Department of Housing and Community Development, as provided, and 
requires the department to evaluate the adopted housing element or amendment and report its 
findings to the planning agency within 90 days. This bill would, instead, require the department to 
review an adopted housing element or amendment and report its findings to the local planning 
agency within 60 days.   (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Y1DxuLn5nTmJnuHMN2YAFktwDEcKxHSL5XiMCmK4GGF+tUhqgDxYMaSQKWcBM8AWumuqcPk/zh+sVEyIonNxEnvvAkF/cel2KHvi4GvpMwY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/379
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_426_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_426_91_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=uj+210KWVOfIXgj4jO2za+AwaixEe4HRE3X6XZ2HnMqidDDyEeKtXvVmSC8XuolurShdyxC52PeJiyhFiXzo/W9Sxmpm4D5yOCqZ4b1yMNE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/368
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_430_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_430_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_430_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=4F4D0F2C-BF40-4E8C-9782-41BD05070670
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=4F4D0F2C-BF40-4E8C-9782-41BD05070670
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=4F4D0F2C-BF40-4E8C-9782-41BD05070670
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=DkMoZMcgv/8IHa46eXjhXqzZjwe/wLu6C/2f0Y5XcCuM7poRknjdpBvPh65VTK7xhDxV5gh980BZ/tgA5gTxCefZ8sD8amrkCg7l/DnQAJU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/433
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_434_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_434_94_C_bill.pdf
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AB 436 Alvarez, D 
 

Vehicles. 10/13/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/13/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
803, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/13/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law prohibits a local authority from enacting or enforcing an ordinance on matters covered 
by the Vehicle Code unless expressly authorized by the Vehicle Code. Current law authorizes 
local authorities to adopt rules and regulations by ordinance or resolution regarding specified 
matters, including, among others, crossing guards, the operation of bicycles, the removal of 
illegally parked vehicles, and cruising, as defined. This bill would remove the authorization for a 
local authority to adopt rules and regulations by ordinance or regulation regarding 
cruising.    (Based on  10/13/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 437 Jackson, D 
 

State 
government: 
equity. 

09/01/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
INACTIVE 
FILE on 
6/27/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law creates, within the Government Operations Agency, a Chief Equity Officer, who is 
appointed by, and serves at the pleasure of, the Governor. Current law requires the Chief Equity 
Officer to improve equity and inclusion throughout state government operations and authorizes the 
Chief Equity Officer to engage with state entities for these purposes. This bill would require state 
agencies and departments, in carrying out their duties, to consider the use of more inclusive 
practices to advance equity, as specified.   (Based on  09/01/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 440 Pellerin, D 
 

Ballot 
measures. 

07/03/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

07/03/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 82, 
Statutes of 
2024 

07/03/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires a constitutional amendment, bond measure, or other measure submitted to 
the people by the Legislature to appear on the ballot of the first statewide election occurring at 
least 131 days after the adoption of the proposal. Pursuant to the time limit specified above, 
Assembly Constitutional Amendment 13 (ACA 13) of the 2023–24 Regular Session is scheduled to 
appear on the ballot of the statewide general election occurring on November 5, 2024. If approved 
by the voters, ACA 13 would provide that an initiative measure that includes one or more 
provisions that amend the Constitution to increase the voter approval requirement to adopt any 
state or local measure is approved by the voters only if the proportion of votes cast in favor of the 
initiative measure is equal to or greater than the highest voter approval requirement that the 
initiative measure would impose. ACA 13 would specify that this requirement applies to statewide 
initiative measures that appear on the ballot on or after January 1, 2024. ACA 13 would also 
expressly authorize a local governing body to hold an advisory vote for the purpose of allowing 
voters within the jurisdiction to voice their opinions on an issue. This bill would call a special 
election to be consolidated with the statewide general election scheduled for November 3, 2026, 
and would instead require the submission of ACA 13 to the people at that election.   (Based 
on  07/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=GgfTytH/6YCZ8tmQoR+gROJK6sjHv54h2CXnE1ODofttoiEQz2aYNZaJi7ItviqmBvHxqdwsIIUFGXiwAMqWmSJrKyMFYWOqK1Ys1SghoSU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/504
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_436_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_436_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=lzxnLjK+n+tK7Qu6ePXE4zrVKfCPUivvUZjDxZPYhLwI5xpE36dQMfuOxszAknnggDHqNdo1Do4eD3RJy6rZTeH9BcRu6Glp6/ed9Ywe9gE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/379
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_437_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_437_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_437_95_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=iVlILWtk2NBfNkPyCg11lZ6seL5dmkTS83ff3hK7eYVuJz7XcTlTrtNOqfn7uw2TCBs7nr1BtFZPnthCGLz0vRLakwTFKTavNS0XQcgy9M0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/438
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_440_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_440_94_E_bill.pdf
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AB 441 Haney, D 
 

Temporary 
food facilities: 
permitting: 
farmers’ 
markets and 
night markets. 

08/16/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The California Retail Food Code establishes uniform health and sanitation standards for temporary 
food facilities, and defines a temporary food facility to mean a food facility approved by an 
enforcement officer to operate at a fixed location for the duration of a community event, as 
specified. Current law defines a community event as an event conducted for not more than 25 
consecutive or nonconsecutive days in a 90-day period and that is of a civic, political, public, or 
educational nature, including state and county fairs, city festivals, circuses, and other public 
gathering events approved by the local enforcement agency. Current law prohibits a temporary 
food facility from being open for business without a valid permit. Current law requires an 
enforcement agency to issue a permit when investigation has determined a proposed facility 
meets the specifications of approved plans or conforms to the requirements of the California Retail 
Food Code. Current law provides that a permit is only valid for the person, location, type of food 
sales, or distribution activity and, unless suspended or revoked for cause, for the time period 
indicated. A violation of the California Retail Food Code is a misdemeanor. This bill would include 
in the definition of a community event a farmers’ market or night market conducted for not more 
than 90 consecutive or nonconsecutive days in a 12-month period. The bill would require a permit 
issued for a temporary food facility that operates at a farmers’ market or night market to be valid 
for all locations of that community event. The bill would designate a permit issued pursuant to 
these provisions as a farmers’ market or night market temporary food facility permit.   (Based 
on  08/16/2023 text) 

AB 441 
SUPPORT_5Ma
y23 

Support 

AB 443 Jackson, D 
 

Peace officers: 
determination 
of bias. 

10/08/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
439, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/07/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would, commencing January 1, 2026, require the Commission on Peace Officer Standards and 
Training (POST) to establish a definition of “biased conduct,” as specified, and would require law 
enforcement agencies to use that definition in any investigation into a bias-related complaint or an 
incident that involves possible indications of officer bias, and to determine if any racial profiling 
occurred, as defined. The bill would also require POST to develop guidance for local law 
enforcement departments on performing effective internet and social media screenings of officer 
applicants.   (Based on  10/08/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 455 Quirk-Silva, D 
 

Firearms: 
prohibited 
persons. 

09/26/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/26/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
236, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

09/26/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law prohibits a person who has been taken into custody because that person is a danger 
to themselves or others, or has been certified for intensive treatment due to a mental disorder or 
mental illness, from possessing or receiving a firearm, as specified. Current law prohibits a person 
who has been placed under conservatorship by a court, has been found mentally incompetent to 
stand trial, has been found not guilty of specified crimes due to reason of insanity, has been 
adjudicated by a court to be a danger to others as a result of a mental disorder or mental illness, or 
who has been adjudicated to be a mentally disordered sex offender from possessing or receiving a 
firearm, as specified. A violation of any of the prohibitions is punishable as a crime. Current law 
authorizes a court to grant pretrial diversion, for a period no longer than 2 years, to a defendant 
suffering from a mental disorder, on an accusatory pleading alleging the commission of a 
misdemeanor or felony offense, in order to allow the defendant to undergo mental health 
treatment. This bill would, on July 1, 2024, authorize the prosecution to request an order from the 
court, as specified, to prohibit a defendant subject to pretrial diversion from owning or possessing 
a firearm because they are a danger to themselves or others until they successfully complete 
diversion or their firearm rights are restored, as specified.    (Based on  09/26/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=atG4pG+NUjueb0AvfPJMhLqqS10cGuhGnDy4OUeJNERiHa6WU3HDsmI24ONwDkvU0fLSm/77SCFqeR23Dvh5skpORB6qq2Wf4bFQGPzQvAM=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/503
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_441_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_441_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_441_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=49B35C9B-2853-483F-A6BB-BAA03F10EBF5
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=49B35C9B-2853-483F-A6BB-BAA03F10EBF5
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=49B35C9B-2853-483F-A6BB-BAA03F10EBF5
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=QpSi+wxu4861Uda9GvUGTPBMBPgp20II2Q2BmTnthKbsIYHOD9xDhFTD9RQDOqJHZpQZVn8ntDb53LuKkVZS28Hx2IiAGXM0lkCUuDA4Qkk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/379
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_443_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0401-0450/ab_443_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=/vHK21TWp7jRdDoGkSAScCDPsksO3nbv8j3opPsR4cnl12RyfF1mjXxBHuPehLC+1n72++TK1WZOoeGRW9xZOIJofNVcg+iIZrvqNTT4sho=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/488
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_455_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_455_94_C_bill.pdf
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AB 457 Aguiar-Curry, 
D 
 

Beverage 
containers: 
recycling: 
redemption 
payment and 
refund value: 
annual 
redemption and 
processing fee 
payments. 

09/22/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/20/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
Governor. 

09/20/2024 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

The California Beverage Container Recycling and Litter Reduction Act, a violation of which is a 
crime, requires a distributor of beverage containers, as defined, to pay to the Department of 
Resources Recycling and Recovery a monthly redemption payment for every beverage container 
sold or transferred, as provided. The act requires the department to deposit those amounts into the 
California Beverage Container Recycling Fund. The fund is continuously appropriated to, among 
other things, pay refund values and administrative fees to processors that receive empty beverage 
containers from recyclers. The act specifies that a beverage container that is a box, bladder, or 
pouch, or similar container, containing wine or distilled spirits has a redemption payment and 
refund value of $0.25. This bill would reduce the redemption payment and refund value for one of 
those wine or distilled spirit beverage containers, if it has a capacity of less than 24 fluid ounces, 
from $0.25 to $0.10. $0.10, beginning January 1, 2025.   (Based on  09/04/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 458 Jones-
Sawyer, D 
 

Shared mobility 
devices: 
insurance. 

10/08/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
440, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/07/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law would provide that insurance coverage offered, made available, or confirmed under 
the above-described provisions is not a group insurance policy. The bill would also provide that the 
requirement on shared mobility service providers to offer, make available, or confirm insurance 
coverage for bodily injury or death suffered by a pedestrian involving the negligent conduct of the 
user does not prohibit an aggregated cap on that insurance coverage, and does not limit or 
supersede the requirement that the commercial general liability insurance maintained by the 
shared mobility service provider has limits not less than $5,000,000 aggregate for all occurrences 
during the policy period.   (Based on  10/08/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 459 Kalra, D 
 

Peace officers: 
Attorney 
General: 
reports. 

07/03/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/5/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law requires each state and local agency that employs peace officers to annually report to 
the Attorney General data on all stops conducted by the agency’s peace officers, and requires that 
data to include specified information, including the time, date, and location of the stop, and the 
reason given to the person stopped at the time of the stop. Current law also makes all stop data 
and reports public records. This bill would revise these provisions to require each state and local 
agency that employs peace officers to report stop data to the Attorney General, as described 
above, by March 1, as specified. The bill would require those agencies to report semiannually 
reporting if reporting issues or unresolved errors are identified in their submissions, as specified. 
By imposing new duties on local agencies, the bill would impose a state-mandated local 
program.   (Based on  07/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 460 Bauer-Kahan, 
D 
 

State Water 
Resources 
Control Board: 
water rights 
and usage: civil 
penalties. 

09/22/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/22/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
342, 
Statutes of 
2024 

09/22/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Under current law, the diversion or use of water other than as authorized by specified provisions of 
law is a trespass, subject to specified civil liability. This bill would require the State Water 
Resources Control Board to adjust for inflation, by January 1 of each year, beginning in 2026, the 
amounts of civil and administrative liabilities or penalties imposed by the board or in water right 
actions brought at the request of the board, as specified.   (Based on  09/22/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=YozXEyAZMFoE67soHLxPdhSSDFotXAsBhlIYChjxV+EbSRDXl6nkN/aoyxGAFqxq43Om3oHXQQR6GfgRXoIS9zsz7zcpTnVpCS22Rbec3OA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/430
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/430
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_457_90_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_457_90_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_457_90_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=VpJIr8JWx14Vhbhbn53guvzT1FajPNIM1gvKjvuYBILPLKDAVdhYtin6jVTFiuPtKEb0a5GdZI//ojvDdAph7viAsmGFDqTbZESLbGjm5QE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/378
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/378
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_458_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_458_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=q02cN0rRKdOu14cd6GZuf91OTKd/DCaGm6BBH+BvQ+lCuef8s8F6XTgMFzk2bz8CmcONQFzhHsE3zjPPoMf4IgMOHztudu7Oso26wifsRhQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/436
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_459_93_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_459_93_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_459_93_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=LYrVC5CQWdc1LTqrFOKw+DpqetADRVi40MTSviRTNpda/Xi6tl3rxHTF7UJvQVLDXs++S/PavoMqsYzfViBj1BuAHLLoZ8ZneWfDK9xLkLs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/434
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/434
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_460_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_460_91_C_bill.pdf
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AB 463 Hart, D 
 

Electricity: 
prioritization of 
service: public 
transit vehicles. 

02/06/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law requires the Public Utilities Commission to establish priorities among the types or 
categories of customers of every electrical corporation and every gas corporation, and among the 
uses of electricity or gas by those customers, to determine which of those customers and uses 
provide the most important public benefits and serve the greatest public need, and to categorize all 
other customers and uses in order of descending priority based on these standards. Current law 
requires the commission, in establishing those priorities, to consider, among other things, the 
economic, social, and other effects of a temporary discontinuance in electrical or gas service to 
certain customers or for certain uses, as specified. If an electrical or gas corporation experiences a 
shortage of capacity or capability and is unable to meet all demands by its customers, existing law 
requires the commission to order that service be temporarily reduced by an amount that reflects 
the established priorities for the duration of the shortage. This bill would require the commission, in 
establishing those priorities, to also consider the economic, social equity, and mobility impacts of a 
temporary discontinuance in electrical service to the customers that rely on electrical service to 
operate public transit vehicles.    (Based on  02/06/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 469 Fong, Vince, 
R 
 

California 
Public Records 
Act 
Ombudsperson
. 

10/07/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

01/30/2024 - 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto stricken 
from file.  

10/07/2023 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Would, subject to appropriation, establish the Office of the California Public Records Act 
Ombudsperson. The bill would require the Governor to appoint the ombudsperson subject to 
certain requirements. The bill would require the ombudsperson to receive and investigate requests 
for review, as defined, determine whether the denials of original requests, as defined, complied 
with the California Public Records Act, and issue written opinions of its determination, as provided. 
The bill would require the ombudsperson to create a process to that effect, and would authorize a 
member of the public to submit a request for review to the ombudsperson consistent with that 
process. The bill would require the ombudsperson, within 30 days from receipt of a request for 
review, to make a determination, as provided, and would require the state agency to provide the 
public record if the ombudsperson determines that it was improperly denied. The bill would require 
the ombudsperson to create a process through which a person whose information is contained in a 
record being reviewed may intervene to assert their privacy and confidentiality rights, and would 
otherwise require the ombudsperson to maintain the privacy and confidentiality of records, as 
provided. The bill would require the ombudsperson to report to the Legislature, on or before March 
31, 2025, and annually thereafter, on, among other things, the number of requests for review the 
ombudsperson has received in the prior year.   (Based on  09/18/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 471 Kalra, D 
 

Cannabis 
catering. 

05/01/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Medicinal and Adult-Use Cannabis Regulation and Safety Act (MAUCRSA), among other 
things, consolidates the licensure and regulation of commercial medicinal and adult-use cannabis 
activities. Under MAUCRSA, the Department of Cannabis Control has sole authority to license and 
regulate commercial cannabis activity, which MAUCRSA defines to include, among other activities, 
the delivery and sale of cannabis and cannabis products as provided for therein, and acting as a 
cannabis event organizer for temporary cannabis events. This bill would add acting as a cannabis 
caterer for a private event to the definition of commercial cannabis activity.    (Based 
on  05/01/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=JLdJmLj27lgabcpL4h68h00v+qZp2ZHcFGqJLrGlb4YeKdQ4tAJYf145zQcEps+dWW40+ygWhYgStZpXtSNCdu58I5a7i/J6txmqPWgguX8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/317
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_463_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_463_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=PyewPLW2CdtCCuvnPLxLmv6wXbCgtFbLzqxE6A5B8BhhYmuQZdjOERCW7kn/HNlvKnBSKLGePFiqB3n436GEBNXUY0DadK3tba40cDKau60=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/315
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/315
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_469_95_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_469_95_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_469_95_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=tElSfSKb5gXa6+pWG5S7ab2T81rDaYdJ9w1BNo0vkgghhT0zKTI4TOudh+nK01WnJbjS//mTdkpP+xRJ5X1PHj1fGTgfsOkXMbAKnJGcnHA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/436
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_471_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_471_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_471_98_A_bill.pdf
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AB 474 Rodriguez, D 
 

State Threat 
Assessment 
Center: 
transnational 
criminal 
organizations. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

01/30/2024 - 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto stricken 
from file.  

10/08/2023 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Existing law, the California Emergency Services Act, creates, within the office of the Governor, the 
Office of Emergency Services, which is responsible for addressing natural, technological, or 
human-caused disasters and emergencies, including responsibility for activities necessary to 
prevent, respond to, recover from, and mitigate the effects of emergencies and disasters to people 
and property. This bill would find and declare that the State Threat Assessment Center (STAC) 
serves as California's information-sharing clearinghouse of strategic threat analysis and situational 
awareness reporting for statewide leadership and the public safety community, as specified, and 
that the STAC is California's state primary fusion center, as designated by the Governor, and is 
operated by the Department of the California Highway Patrol, the Office of Emergency Services, 
and the Department of Justice. The bill would make other findings and declarations related to drug 
trafficking and transnational criminal organizations. This bill contains other related provisions and 
other existing laws.   (Based on  09/13/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 480 Ting, D 
 

Surplus land. 10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
788, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law prescribes requirements for the disposal of surplus land by a local agency, as defined, 
and requires, except as provided, a local agency disposing of surplus land to comply with certain 
notice requirements before disposing of the land or participating in negotiations to dispose of the 
land with a prospective transferee, particularly that the local agency send a notice of availability to 
specified entities that have notified the Department of Housing and Community Development of 
their interest in surplus land, as specified. Under current law, if the local agency receives a notice 
of interest, the local agency is required to engage in good faith negotiations with the entity desiring 
to purchase or lease the surplus land. This bill would define the term “dispose” to mean the sale of 
the surplus property or a lease of any surplus property entered into on or after January 1, 2024, for 
a term longer than 15 years, including renewal options, as specified. The bill would provide that 
“dispose” does not include entering a lease for surplus land on which no development or 
demolition will occur, regardless of the term of the lease.   (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 491 Wallis, R 
 

Local 
government: 
fines and 
penalties. 

06/03/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
JUD. on 
5/29/2024) 

07/02/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law authorizes the legislative body of a local agency, as defined, to make, by ordinance, a 
violation of an ordinance subject to an administrative fine or penalty, as specified. Current law 
requires the local agency to set forth by ordinance the administrative procedures that govern the 
imposition, enforcement, collection, and administrative review by the local agency of those 
administrative fines or penalties. Current law authorizes a person contesting a final administrative 
order or decision to seek review by filing an appeal to be heard by the superior court, as specified. 
This bill would make the above-described appeal the exclusive means of judicial review for an 
administrative fine or penalty that does not exceed a specified amount and that is imposed for 
violation of a local law regulating or prohibiting commercial cannabis activity, as specified.   (Based 
on  06/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=CQu4g25LPjBUkzfVheBphhEATzsynej3e5bH/sV2xiT6Nw2vIK3lAktNtSn1RMHNYTZJvkW/GD7WLjDem9TQ2J5e2NqdE6oVefblJLDJML0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/443
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_474_98_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_474_98_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_474_98_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ltzVckgbGhdVH3DQu2Eu/+BJKyJRicL0EV3pZEUo9T5yYXlDKhVq63JsYAmkxQov/DhdmV7PnM+Ok4WZA001X4YpgJ+aHQcP0SUy77wbf/M=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/360
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_480_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_480_91_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=HRmP1DJdLLY5EqSo9kf2KjnXjJ1OYXr0MpIcdzmjhD5Zo334WDQBexghEXtTVlx3NbszXqB0ExfIOHUPib3izxg3bpjWk2ss5ZHRGm/fgII=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/372
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_491_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_491_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0451-0500/ab_491_96_A_bill.pdf
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AB 504 Reyes, D 
 

State and local 
public 
employees: 
labor relations: 
strikes. 

10/08/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

01/29/2024 - 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto stricken 
from file.  

10/08/2023 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

The Meyers-Milias-Brown Act and the Ralph C. Dills Act regulate the labor relations of employees 
and employers of local public agencies and the state, respectively. Those acts grant specified 
employees, including, among others, certain employees of fire departments, of local public 
agencies and the state the right to form, join, and participate in the activities of employee 
organizations of their choosing and require public agency employers, among other things, to meet 
and confer with representatives of recognized employee organizations and exclusive 
representatives on terms and conditions of employment. The acts grant the Public Employment 
Relations Board the power to hear specified disputes in relation to these provisions and to make 
determinations regarding them. This bill would provide, except as specified, that it is not unlawful 
or a cause for discipline or other adverse action against a public employee for that public 
employee to refuse to enter property that is the site of a primary strike, perform work for a public 
employer involved in a primary strike, or go through or work behind a primary strike line. The bill 
would prohibit a public employer from directing a public employee to take those actions. The bill 
would authorize a recognized employee organization to inform employees of these rights and 
encourage them to exercise those rights.    (Based on  09/18/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 508 Petrie-Norris, 
D 
 

Probation: 
environmental 
crimes. 

09/30/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/30/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
264, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

09/30/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law authorizes courts generally to suspend a criminal sentence and make and enforce 
terms of probation for a period not to exceed 2 years. Current law authorizes courts in 
misdemeanor cases to suspend a sentence and make and enforce terms of probation for a period 
not to exceed one year. This bill would instead authorize a court, for entities with more than 10 
employees, to impose a period of probation for a maximum period of 5 years in specified crimes 
relating to, among other things, dumping in waterways, pesticides, oil dumping and spills, waste 
management, and animal cruelty.   (Based on  09/30/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 510 Jackson, D 
 

Public social 
services: 
purposes. 

04/13/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law establishes various public social services programs, including, among others, 
CalWORKs and the State Supplementary Program for Aged, Blind and Disabled. Current law sets 
forth the purposes of public social services for which state grants are made to counties that 
include, among others, providing reasonable support and maintenance for needy and dependent 
families and persons. This bill would instead state that providing reasonable support and 
maintenance for needy and vulnerable children, adults, and families is a purpose of public social 
services.   (Based on  04/13/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=YiXgjvTetcPHYq5h0Nl7HxXW5mzRP4vfvPvrXabml7AYYhFPKbICZrWrcv5CjszT4BOnXWCDIbP3dt1yBbGZdGo+LOxxGiaQvlBVmXxyUxA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/374
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_504_92_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_504_92_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_504_92_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=479lKMJqCavTvB5byxxCmdemmXcBsIo2H/Hhre81qqMxXqoNc9ABE6l54TPr+XJlzuqMqGacUjvymjFlO8Aem2D5PHgXXrI9jIlBj3rn+NQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/454
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/454
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_508_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_508_96_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=I//xI4AiBkgYh27p1C4UqEfHPJu9LqgusjiaonpzumF8Y/lHMLnhw8IgRIhBFxA9s/9/U9tzawX/plCEhgobbdTnUzkytxSBTLCtncb7cGI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/379
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_510_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_510_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_510_98_A_bill.pdf
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AB 519 Schiavo, D 
 

Affordable 
Housing 
Finance 
Workgroup: 
affordable 
housing: 
consolidated 
application and 
coordinated 
review process. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
742, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law establishes the Department of Housing and Community Development and sets forth 
its powers and duties, including promoting the development of affordable housing in the state. 
Current law creates the California Housing Finance Agency within the department and authorizes 
the agency to make loans to finance affordable housing. Current law establishes the California Tax 
Credit Allocation Committee to allocate specified federal low-income housing tax credits. Current 
law also establishes the California Debt Limit Allocation Committee for the purpose of 
implementing the volume limit for the state on private activity bonds established pursuant to 
federal law. Under existing law, the committee’s duties include annually determining a state ceiling 
on the aggregate amount of private activity bonds that may be issued, and allocating that amount 
among state and local agencies. This bill would require specified reviewing entities, as defined as 
the above-described entities, to jointly convene an Affordable Housing Finance Workgroup to 
develop recommendations for state-administered programs to utilize a consolidated application for 
multifamily affordable rental housing developers to use to obtain grants, soft loans, low-income 
housing tax credits, tax exempt bonds, federal funds, as applicable, and other types of subsidies 
for building affordable housing, and develop a coordinated review process for the application, as 
described. The bill would require the workgroup to include representatives of the reviewing 
entities, nonprofit and for-profit affordable housing developers, and local and tribal governments. 
The bill would require the workgroup to identify specified information, including any state-
administered program that may utilize the consolidated application and coordinated review 
process, and a timeline for developing a single consolidated application and coordinated review 
process.    (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 527 Calderon, D 
 

Urban forestry: 
school 
greening 
projects: 
grants. 

07/05/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
7/10/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The California Urban Forestry Act of 1978 requires the Department of Forestry and Fire Protection 
to implement a program in urban forestry to encourage better tree management and planting in 
urban areas to increase integrated, multiple-benefit projects by assisting urban areas with 
innovative solutions to problems, as provided. The act authorizes the Director of Forestry and Fire 
Protection to make grants to provide assistance of 25% to 90% of costs for projects, as provided. 
This bill would require funds appropriated or allocated to the Department of Forestry and Fire 
Protection for the bill’s purposes to be administered to support school greening, as defined, by 
providing grants to eligible local educational agencies, as defined, nonprofit organizations, cities, 
counties, and districts, including special districts, through a competitive grant process that the bill 
would require the department to develop, including guidelines and selection criteria, as specified, 
on or before July 1, 2024. The bill would require the department, before developing the grant 
process, to hold at least 2 public hearings to gather public input on the grant process development. 
The bill would, upon appropriation in the annual Budget Act, require funding for these purposes to 
be transferred to the School Greening and Resiliency Fund, which the bill would establish in the 
State Treasury.   (Based on  07/05/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=6c0M8c1VZcLe3vj7o4V845ZdR9yVzUN0yFKjklkHAxgI56LG1ns22vgb0Wh63nwJdKV69bS6hi8A9ugWc4T49emtAKFapXs0jUY+PLxW+P0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/441
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_519_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_519_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=wrp0x7XiE5UhOFtuokb02uYPIIh0ikIgb9XzAD8/VHAwuEfqrT1i/FIgzTlrQMbu9d8Ib5zFH3yrn8089I+XLfUvKnC+Q6vmdpjJsAcjQXg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/448
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_527_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_527_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_527_97_A_bill.pdf
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AB 529 Gabriel, D 
 

Adaptive reuse 
projects. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
743, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Planning and Zoning Law requires the Department of Housing and Community Development 
to determine whether the housing elementin each county and city is in substantial compliance with 
specified provisions of that law. Current law, for award cycles commenced after July 1, 2021, 
awards a city, county, or city and county, that has adopted a housing element determined by the 
department to be in substantial compliance with specified provisions of the Planning and Zoning 
Law and that has been designated by the department as prohousing based upon their adoption of 
prohousing local policies, as specified, additional points in the scoring of program applications for 
housing and infrastructure programs pursuant to guidelines adopted by the department, as 
provided. Current law defines “prohousing local policies” as policies that facilitate the planning, 
approval, or construction of housing, including, but not limited to, local financial incentives for 
housing, reduced parking requirements for sites that are zoned for residential development, and 
the adoption of zoning allowing for use by right for residential and mixed-use development. This 
bill would add the facilitation of the conversion or redevelopment of commercial properties into 
housing, including the adoption of adaptive reuse, as defined, ordinances or other mechanisms 
that reduce barriers for these conversions, to the list of specified prohousing local 
policies.   (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 530 Boerner, D 
 

Vehicles: 
electric 
bicycles. 

07/13/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would prohibit a person under 12 years of age from operating an electric bicycle of any class. The 
bill would state the intent of the Legislature to create an e-bike license program with an online 
written test and a state-issued photo identification for those persons without a valid driver’s 
license, prohibit persons under 12 years of age from riding e-bikes, and create a stakeholders 
working group composed of the Department of Motor Vehicles, the Department of the California 
Highway Patrol, the Transportation Agency, bicycle groups, policy and fiscal staff, and other 
relevant stakeholders to work on recommendations to establish an e-bike training program and 
license. Because the bill would prohibit certain persons from riding electric bicycles, the violation of 
which would be a crime, the bill would impose a state-mandated local program.    (Based 
on  07/13/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 531 Irwin, D 
 

The Behavioral 
Health 
Infrastructure 
Bond Act of 
2023. 

10/12/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/12/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
789, 
Statutes of 
2023. 

10/12/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would provide that projects funded by the Behavioral Health Infrastructure Bond Act of 2024 that 
provide housing for individuals and families who are experiencing homelessness or who are at risk 
of homelessness and who are inherently impacted by or at increased risk for medical diseases or 
conditions due to the COVID-19 pandemic or other communicable diseases and are disbursed in 
accordance with the Multifamily Housing Program, or projects that are disbursed in accordance 
with the Behavioral Health Continuum Infrastructure Program, are a use by right and subject to the 
streamlined, ministerial review process. The bill would define use by right for these purposes to 
mean that the local government’s review of the project does not require a conditional use permit, 
planned unit development permit, or other discretionary local government review or approval that 
would constitute a project subject to the approval process in CEQA.    (Based on  10/12/2023 text) 

AB 531 Support 
25Aug23 

Mayor 
Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=yqRHLu6C/wtrsi1mtit+inMrcEtT0ERn3WQIrIEHjQ+JG20Q1VmypNj3Mk1QyrGkXI3E2k/Ben3F07pkgNvM/BPTc5PbUNiLzPj82SgvooY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/371
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_529_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_529_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=+CKTy37GvXznspajE19OP5G7BhEJNZG7bzNl3BlEKsyxmFz5g+Mkcf7yH3c/alnvtvXPmUBz+u9V+wc0FBJ/7GKvneaA3HA8yN3j/lktJfc=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/389
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_530_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_530_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_530_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=uqSBoR1Ih9ll6fAZeIuPPYo1KPMq3/g81NQoWRotUDED5vPahdQzzrB93JJX7jGx+qJEPKz66Br+s0pzyyyttJA1zPzzU7u4Q0jw5S8Yiq0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/442
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_531_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_531_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=D5C3146E-E371-4633-A77D-5C61000C7B7A
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=D5C3146E-E371-4633-A77D-5C61000C7B7A
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AB 534 McCarty, D 
 

Local agencies: 
airports: 
customer 
facility charges. 

10/10/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/10/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
657, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/10/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

(1) Existing law authorizes airports to require rental companies to collect a customer facility charge 
or an alternative customer facility charge under specified circumstances for purposes that include 
financing, designing, and constructing airport vehicle rental facilities and common-use 
transportation systems. Existing law, beginning January 1, 2024, provides that the authorization for 
an airport to impose a customer facility charge becomes inoperative when the bonds used for 
financing are paid, except as specified. This bill would delete the provision ending the 
authorization described above.    (Based on  10/10/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 538 Holden, D 
 

Multistate 
regional 
transmission 
system 
organization: 
membership. 

05/01/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law provides for the establishment of an Independent System Operator (ISO) as a 
nonprofit public benefit corporation and requires the ISO to ensure efficient use and reliable 
operation of the electrical transmission grid consistent with achieving planning and operating 
reserve criteria no less stringent than those established by the Western Electricity Coordinating 
Council and the North American Electric Reliability Council. The Clean Energy and Pollution 
Reduction Act of 2015 provides for the transformation of the ISO into a regional organization, with 
the approval of the Legislature, pursuant to a specified process. That process provides that 
modifications to the ISO’s governance structure, through changes to its bylaws or other corporate 
governance documents, will not become effective until the ISO, the Public Utilities Commission 
(PUC), the State Energy Resources Conservation and Development Commission (Energy 
Commission), the State Air Resources Board (state board), the Governor, and the Legislature take 
specified actions on or before January 1, 2019. This bill would prohibit a California electrical 
transmission facility owner, a retail seller of electricity, or a local publicly owned electric utility from 
joining a multistate regional transmission system organization, as defined, unless the bylaws or 
other organizational documents that govern the organization, and the organization’s operations, 
meet Federal Energy Regulatory Commission requirements and other specified 
requirements.    (Based on  05/01/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 545 Pellerin, D 
 

Elections: 
access for 
voters with 
disabilities. 

10/10/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/10/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
658, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/10/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires elections officials to furnish each polling place with specified supplies for an 
election. This bill would expand the list of required supplies to include specified items to assist 
voters with disabilities.    (Based on  10/10/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=WsfULiPE4sUMuZlfYhVO7y0jccM032SAR8KgHiCaTGeXwf0nOiEJYz3KkTg974Xi0gag8XyTNtktJNMKSxlR/qtYQEfyv55NX0Z59ThNOao=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/350
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_534_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_534_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=MhWVCIDNOfSHT8lejKp+IiV0zkMTtUE20vm0cqOComcqcA0wU1F0SmedAx8UmY0uYOAKQIp/AsfL8uvsmFCioSGUgoRiiwmrDGdfRoyVLZk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/370
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_538_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_538_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_538_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=HL8Wq1R8nUps5B2OfgQdyc4V3JqPdwPHSemLsrFeCSmo+ZQxs5agjzRHjOykDsHFWmh8tBE32VJp8l0wwcyaElsyW+1AFvqoQ8Q66F7NEEo=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/438
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_545_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_545_96_C_bill.pdf
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AB 548 Boerner, D 
 

State Housing 
Law: 
inspection. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
744, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law deems a building, portion of a building, or premises on which a building is located to 
be a substandard building if any one of specified conditions exists to the extent that it endangers 
the life, limb, health, property, safety, or welfare of the public or its occupants. Current law deems 
a building, portion of a building, or premises on which a building is located to be in violation of the 
State Housing Law if it contains lead hazards, as specified, that are likely to endanger the health of 
the public or the occupants. This bill would require local enforcement agencies, by January 1, 
2025, to develop policies and procedures for inspecting a building with multiple units if an 
inspector or code enforcement officer has determined that a unit is substandard or is in violation of 
the State Housing Law, and the inspector or code enforcement officer determines that the defects 
or violations have the potential to affect other units of the building, as specified. If the local 
enforcement agency determines the substandard condition could reasonably affect other units, the 
bill would require notice be given to the property owner, as specified, and the units reinspected to 
verify correction of the violations.    (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 550 Schiavo, D 
 

Homelessness: 
point-in-time 
count results: 
meetings. 

04/05/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Planning and Zoning Law requires each city, county, and city and county to prepare and adopt 
a general plan that contains certain mandatory elements, including a housing element. Current law 
requires the housing element to identify the existing and projected housing needs of all economic 
segments of the community. Current federal law requires a continuum of care, a group organized 
under the federal McKinney-Vento Homeless Assistance Act, to develop a plan that includes 
planning for and conducting, at least biennially, a point-in-time count of homeless persons within 
the geographic area. Current law requires that information from the point-in-time count be used to, 
among other things, allocate funding for the Homeless Emergency Aid program and Homeless 
Housing, Assistance, and Prevention program. This bill would require a city, county, and city and 
county, within 60 days after the local continuum of care releases the results of a point-in-time 
count for a city, county, or city and county’s jurisdiction, to, among other things, agendize the 
point-in-time count results at a meeting of the city, county, or city and county and present the steps 
the city, county, or city and county is taking to prevent and end homelessness, including, but not 
limited to, consideration of specified actions.   (Based on  04/05/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 551 Bennett, D 
 

Public Utilities 
Commission. 

09/20/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/20/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
299, 
Statutes of 
2024 

09/20/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires the Public Utilities Commission to submit amendments, revisions, or 
modifications of its Rules of Practice and Procedure to the Office of Administrative Law for prior 
review, but exempts from that requirement general orders, resolutions, or other substantive 
regulations. This bill would clarify that regulations and guidelines related to the California 
Environmental Quality Act are also exempt from that requirement.   (Based on  09/20/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=MhyJTi2aN9H5KnFpXjpmZ8LgORic9M5F8CJ8BwljvcclufUsGJ96p6GIPctNJH66jj5gtYpODQrbe8+FE4DvJMtDasxkg+zQKwmlzjr1FdU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/389
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_548_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_548_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=jux5vNyffiD9smo4+aqiQ3xVU6+6sV34lf3KrFfL5S+oetCL70nWYjs5UgWRPf+BVfXPaI2PzZktXDWHOjFR8Evc/WcMvsogBU/Zv4KxW8M=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/441
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_550_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_550_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0501-0550/ab_550_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=KuobdjF+SqgFyOE+D47FgYCojNWh5Kw9s5P/bOGqLDYlBFwmDKJTuPKva7RIt4K6JBYtmaT/BlrnfD182KNFUOGSs7nbJghvGBK7tHIlL1Y=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/368
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_551_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_551_92_C_bill.pdf
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AB 565 Lee, D 
 

Water quality: 
pollution 
prevention 
plans. 

03/16/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
E.Q. on 
5/3/2023) 

07/02/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The Porter-Cologne Water Quality Control Act establishes a statewide program for the control of 
the quality of all the waters of the state. The act authorizes the State Water Resources Control 
Board, a California regional water quality control board, or a publicly owned treatment works to 
require a discharger, as defined, to complete a pollution prevention plan if the discharger meets 
certain criteria. This bill would repeal an obsolete provision of law relating to pollution prevention 
plans and would make a conforming change.    (Based on  03/16/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 572 Haney, D 
 

Common 
interest 
developments: 
imposition of 
assessments. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
745, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Davis-Stirling Common Interest Development Act defines and regulates common interest 
developments, including the establishment and imposition of assessments. Current law limits 
increases in regular assessments and the aggregate of special assessments that the board may 
impose in any fiscal year without the approval of a majority of a quorum of members, as specified. 
This bill would, with certain exceptions, prohibit an association that records its original declaration 
on or after January 1, 2025, from imposing an increase of a regular assessment on the owner of a 
deed-restricted affordable housing unit that is more than 5% plus the percentage change in the 
cost of living, not to exceed 10% greater than the preceding regular assessment for the 
association’s preceding fiscal year.   (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 573 Garcia, D 
 

Organic waste: 
meeting 
recovered 
organic waste 
product 
procurement 
targets. 

07/13/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/14/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law requires the State Air Resources Board to approve and begin implementing a 
comprehensive short-lived climate pollutant strategy to achieve a certain reduction in statewide 
emissions of methane, including a goal of a 75% reduction in the level of the statewide disposal of 
organic waste from the 2014 level by 2025. Current law requires the Department of Resources 
Recycling and Recovery, in consultation with the state board, to adopt regulations to achieve these 
organic waste reduction goals, that provide for, among other things, the calculation by the 
department of recovered organic waste product procurement targets for each local jurisdiction, and 
that may include penalties to be imposed by the department for noncompliance. This bill would 
require the department, for purposes of those regulations, to allow a local jurisdiction, until 
December 1, 2031, in procuring recovered organic waste products to meet the target procurement 
requirements, to use California-derived recovered organic waste that the local jurisdiction sends 
for processing at a facility or operation outside of the state that meets certain conditions, as 
provided.   (Based on  07/13/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=/HkxSVOm5pMDtlCTfoUo1HSNUw7Bnx+isDs30T0Hs1vgkilcAbadhlC6CrrHKNKxClMbAIB+JwBRc0V3gmhv8fcJokIWQ/GRBiKrWDnAkR4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/308
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_565_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_565_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_565_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=yyqC5LrQwEPUTSaiGhgDgDdN2+0SEawnmPUWUmF+oGEIu/adFna9+MG64dtK3hp0isebccuE1AUXmAXKtyxJdiGr304L12u8TT2iDdwkk0c=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/503
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_572_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_572_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=0xiU5/wDA7Q/hcJWlAOYKDGT03lNwARdP1NPZ6zQYurtM9Pw9WNzL+1j6iNg9J5mS/o3OnPbdWmBY1GW+1hcddu3HdnCjiEAMCdtNgbl1yw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/440
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_573_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_573_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_573_95_A_bill.pdf
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AB 574 Jones-
Sawyer, D 
 

Firearms: 
dealer records 
of sale. 

09/26/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/26/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
237, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

09/26/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires each firearm dealer to keep a register or record of each firearm transaction 
and requires that register or record to include certain specified information, including information 
about the purchaser, information about the firearm, and the answers to certain questions by the 
purchaser or transferee relating to their eligibility to own or possess a firearm. This bill would, 
beginning on March 1, 2025, additionally require the register or record to include the 
acknowledgment by the purchaser or transferee that they have, within the past 30 days, confirmed 
possession of every firearm that they own or possess. This bill would incorporate additional 
changes to Section 28160 of the Penal Code proposed by AB 1420 to be operative only if this bill 
and AB 1420 are enacted and this bill is enacted last.    (Based on  09/26/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 575 Papan, D 
 

Paid family 
leave. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto stricken 
from file.  

10/08/2023 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Current law authorizes the Employment Development Department to administer the disability 
insurance compensation program, which includes family temporary disability insurance benefits or 
paid family leave. Current law requires the department to develop a certification form for an 
employee taking leave to bond with a minor child within the first year of the child’s birth or 
placement in connection with foster care or adoption. Commencing February 1, 2025, this bill 
would instead require the department to develop a certification form for an employee taking leave 
to bond with a minor child within one year of the child’s birth, placement of the child in connection 
with foster care or adoption, or an individual’s assumption of responsibilities for the child in loco 
parentis.    (Based on  09/18/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 578 Berman, D 
 

Multifamily 
Housing 
Program: No 
Place Like 
Home 
Program. 

05/18/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/21/2023) 

08/31/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Under current law, the principal and accumulated interest of a loan issued under the Multifamily 
Housing Program is due and payable upon the completion of the term of the loan. Current law 
prohibits the amount of the required loan payments from exceeding 0.42% per annum for the first 
30 years of the loan term. This bill would prohibit, for the first 30 years of the loan term, the amount 
of the required loan payments from exceeding 0.42% per annum or $260 per assisted unit, 
whichever is less. The bill would authorize the department to adjust the $260 cap for inflation 
based on the California Consumer Price Index, as specified.    (Based on  05/18/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=9+/w89+QfIh+4GvktDiXYGlO+Qxgs0yBZdCVH9VlxeQntcbt+R+B94xWT0e9QmRgxfK+yl1/MxmcmS54OrV3m7PrmLMNSPEd5BtDW4tmqPg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/378
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/378
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_574_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_574_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=/RwOvEHYmXcWzppOFc6NeUS4LVAmNLDMdcTnnL1eRd76gLCzmGud60dsV/iVx1WgXGCfpWfloXHbpqjKbt7Fu+PhVWTDMvY2u5R41MLNuks=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/362
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_575_93_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_575_93_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_575_93_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=9k3PlLdmbE7j0gDWCBSw9R95qVkGv7EQ9SNaJW7qDSsJNnHJ12FQ1oIzBRrDry00xpjMDJpppNxAlQgqo4E/VG3wtwVnyhQQf2bJXk361Us=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/364
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_578_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_578_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_578_98_A_bill.pdf
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AB 585 Rivas, 
Robert, D 
 

Climate 
change: 
infrastructure 
and clean 
energy 
projects: 
assessments. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/07/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
336, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/07/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The California Global Warming Solutions Act of 2006 designates the State Air Resources Board 
(state board) as the state agency responsible for monitoring and regulating sources emitting 
greenhouse gases. Existing law vests the Public Utilities Commission (PUC) with regulatory 
jurisdiction over public utilities, including electrical corporations, as provided. Existing law requires 
the PUC and the State Energy Resources Conservation and Development Commission (Energy 
Commission) to undertake specified actions to advance the state's clean energy and pollution 
reduction objectives. This bill would request the CCST, in its discretion, every 3 years, to assess 
the infrastructure project types, scale, and pace necessary to achieve the state's energy, climate 
change, and air quality goals, as specified. The bill would also require GO-Biz, in consultation with 
the Energy Commission, the PUC, and the state board, to prepare an assessment of the barriers, 
challenges, and impediments limiting the deployment and development of clean energy projects, 
as specified. The bill would require GO-Biz to submit this assessment to the Legislature on or 
before January 1, 2026. The bill would also require the assessment to be considered and 
incorporated into the work carried out by the Infrastructure Strike Team convened by the 
Governor. This bill contains other related provisions and other existing laws.   (Based 
on  10/07/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 591 Gabriel, D 
 

Electric vehicle 
service 
equipment: 
connectors and 
public 
accessibility. 

05/31/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
TRANS. on 
5/10/2023) 

07/02/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would require that any electric vehicle service equipment that is capable of charging a light-duty 
electric vehicle and is installed or substantially retrofitted, as defined, except for private use at a 
single-family residence or multifamily residence, include a universal connector, as defined, and be 
publicly accessible. The bill would require an owner or operator of CHAdeMO electric vehicle 
service equipment, as defined, that is in operation on January 1, 2024, except where it is located 
at a single-family residence or multifamily residence and is only for private use, to maintain the 
CHAdeMO electric vehicle service equipment in good working condition until at least January 1, 
2029.   (Based on  05/31/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 592 Wilson, D 
 

Vehicles: 
commercial 
nonfranchise 
solid waste 
haulers: pilot 
program. 

09/22/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/22/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
202, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

09/22/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would, until January 1, 2028, authorize the Counties of Alameda, Contra Costa, and Solano to 
create a 3-year pilot program to regulate the transport of solid waste by commercial nonfranchise 
solid waste haulers, as defined, on public roads in unincorporated areas of the county, as 
provided.   (Based on  09/22/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=JUbJG4Eh4c6ny4M+J7n1E38am54+1aJHCwi28skBTF2/MY94wPo5ixxYZfkS9azs+FWY7901tH7wSjOBPWeH5K+qh/0CGZ+QB71VLmPvbw4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/365
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/365
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_585_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_585_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=vxdzHHufVIO/Gla/sAcMJhgnkEKQtwVzcLa9P+DERknikh1PPIbFjFPWNZwSkm7HjOAb0qN7D1Sa77XEapSzZ1B1IoakVpVgmKTkhccNsXY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/371
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_591_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_591_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_591_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=EskykKWkt6Hf9EZZ9KYuRvYVOKIGJ0t4HOK3mZYPU743lmRFN/MM6XbD+mViqnyTmHb2H1Cz+kheymwxL5ygHbUdBkEHHzDHFOLfdTdiEgE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/502
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_592_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_592_95_C_bill.pdf
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AB 593 Haney, D 
 

Carbon 
emission 
reduction 
strategy: 
building sector. 

07/13/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/9/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would require the State Energy Resources Conservation and Development Commission, on or 
before June 1, 2024, to adopt a strategy, with milestones, to reduce emissions of greenhouse 
gases for the building sector, as provided. The bill would require the commission, in developing the 
strategy, to consult and collaborate with certain entities, to hold at least 2 public workshops, and to 
convene stakeholder sessions. The bill would require the commission, on or before September 31, 
2024, to submit the adopted strategy to the relevant policy committees of the Legislature.    (Based 
on  07/13/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 595 Essayli, R 
 

Animal 
shelters: 72-
hour public 
notice: 
euthanasia: 
study. 

04/12/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law declares that it is the policy of the state that no adoptable animal should be euthanized 
if it can be adopted into a suitable home. Current law also declares that it is the policy of the state 
that no treatable animal should be euthanized. This bill, Bowie’s Law, would require all animal 
shelters, as defined, to provide public notice on their internet website at least 72 hours before 
euthanizing any dog, cat, or rabbit, except as provided. The bill would require that notice to 
indicate that the animal is subject to euthanasia and to include information about the animal and its 
availability for adoption.    (Based on  04/12/2023 text) 

AB 595 
Amended 
Oppose 
CalAnimals 
Coalition Final 
April 3 2023.pdf 

Oppose 

AB 605 Arambula, D 
 

CalFresh Fruit 
and Vegetable 
Supplemental 
Benefits 
Expansion 
Program. 

03/22/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would establish the CalFresh Fruit and Vegetable Supplemental Benefits Expansion Program and 
create the CalFresh Fruit and Vegetable EBT Expansion Fund in the State Treasury. The program 
would include a process and guidelines for the State Department of Social Services to, upon the 
deposit of sufficient moneys in the fund, enroll authorized retailers to enable those authorized 
retailers to provide supplemental benefits to CalFresh recipients who purchase fresh fruits and 
vegetables. The bill would authorize the department to initially allocate from any appropriation 
made for the purposes of the program, 40,000,000 for large authorized retailers that are not direct 
farm-to-consumer authorized retailers to provide supplemental benefits, $20,000,000 for small 
authorized retailers that are not direct farm-to-consumer authorized retailers to provide 
supplemental benefits, and $30,000,000 for direct farm-to-consumer authorized retailers to provide 
supplemental benefits. The bill would also require the department to provide grants to small 
authorized retailers that are not direct farm-to-consumer authorized retailers to offset the cost of 
technological upgrades required to offer supplemental benefits and would authorize the 
department to allocate up to $1,000,000 from any appropriation made for the purposes of the 
program to provide those grants.   (Based on  03/22/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=+jBOyMcSP60L98MzInYXdRyvh3OfUN2yzjM2uZEAETnTMIuKUTQq+T6HRKpHTLN4xif8WwpX7YkhhZ0FlotOVzmHeM+W3/bzqGA3IcZCHRI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/503
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_593_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_593_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_593_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=HQgKADw38Hykiw33cpUxJUEihk/43rCbCu0LJ8P1ToiDD/WW6qw5QgoI6/xMqd5GcPtEKOwykDVNuHDfuSno+fVsXQXKK9ek7u6RAhh9BTo=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/381
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_595_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_595_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0551-0600/ab_595_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=9C00CA78-6D95-4A22-9367-3B5FA7D90C8D
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=9C00CA78-6D95-4A22-9367-3B5FA7D90C8D
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=9C00CA78-6D95-4A22-9367-3B5FA7D90C8D
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=9C00CA78-6D95-4A22-9367-3B5FA7D90C8D
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=9C00CA78-6D95-4A22-9367-3B5FA7D90C8D
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=9C00CA78-6D95-4A22-9367-3B5FA7D90C8D
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=iWKrguYpI+nW+5BrIW5Z2Qo/ZV7pse8qUbe6QyVlFj/gIuC1Hxk0CN0FvzxFZ5tQYvCXcpSGnFqf+oATqbpDIh04ydd10kYq7QuU75U1wyg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/464
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0601-0650/ab_605_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0601-0650/ab_605_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0601-0650/ab_605_98_A_bill.pdf
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AB 610 Holden, D 
 

Fast food 
restaurant 
industry: Fast 
Food Council: 
health, safety, 
employment, 
and minimum 
wage. 

03/25/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

03/25/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 4, 
Statutes of 
2024 

03/25/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law establishes an hourly minimum wage for fast food restaurant employees, as 
described, authorizes the Fast Food Council to increase the hourly minimum wage pursuant to 
specified parameters, and sets forth requirements, limitations, and procedures for adopting and 
reviewing fast food restaurant health, safety, and employment standards. Current law defines 
terms for these purposes, including defining “fast food restaurant” to mean a limited-service 
restaurant in the state that is part of a national fast food chain. Current law exempts from the 
definition of “fast food restaurant” an establishment that on September 15, 2023, operates a 
bakery in a prescribed manner, as long as it continues to operate such a bakery. Current law also 
exempts certain restaurants in grocery establishments. This bill would exempt additional 
restaurants from the definition of “fast food restaurant,” including such restaurants in airports, 
hotels, event centers, theme parks, museums, and certain other locations, as prescribed.   (Based 
on  03/25/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 637 Jackson, D 
 

Zero-emission 
vehicles: fleet 
owners: rental 
vehicles. 

09/29/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/29/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
Governor. 

09/29/2024 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Current law generally designates the State Air Resources Board as the state agency with the 
primary responsibility for the control of vehicular air pollution. Current law requires the state board 
to adopt and implement motor vehicle emission standards, in-use performance standards, and 
motor vehicle fuel specifications for the control of air contaminants and sources of air pollution the 
state board has found to be necessary, cost effective, and technologically feasible, to carry out 
specified purposes, unless preempted by federal law. This bill would, if the state board adopts a 
regulation on or after April 28, 2023, requiring a fleet owner to acquire zero-emission vehicles as 
part of its fleet, require the state board to authorize the rental of a zero-emission vehicle or 
vehicles for a cumulative total of 260 days in a calendar year to be deemed ownership of one zero-
emission vehicle for purposes of meeting that obligation. The bill would provide that a fleet owner 
that rents a zero-emission vehicle pursuant to this authority is not precluded from including that 
vehicle in their fleet for purposes of calculating any zero-emission vehicle acquisition 
requirement.   (Based on  09/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 642 Ting, D 
 

Law 
enforcement 
agencies: facial 
recognition 
technology. 

05/01/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would prescribe the acceptable and prohibited uses for facial recognition technology (FRT), as 
defined, by a law enforcement agency or peace officer, as defined. The bill would set certain 
requirements for FRT systems and reference databases, as defined, used by law enforcement 
agencies. The bill would require the Department of Technology, in consultation with the Chief of 
the Office of Information Security, to issue standards to ensure the confidentiality and 
cybersecurity of FRT data and results. The bill would require law enforcement agencies to 
establish written policies that adhere to those standards. The bill would require law enforcement 
agencies utilizing FRT to keep certain records and to annually report certain data to the California 
State Auditor. The bill would require any law enforcement agency utilizing FRT to have a written 
policy, as specified, and to post that policy on their internet website. The bill would require a law 
enforcement agency to provide certain information to any person that FRT is used to 
identify.    (Based on  05/01/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=AgveILbFno1bJSP0ZtTVT3haE8CnUsa6MWgJaS1/GhU1YXN1PGVLujPG7+b5bPU12I5SS2kgerZ0z8VkLI6KI2lrpD2wiKkPK0GjRlZn+Ys=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/370
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0601-0650/ab_610_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0601-0650/ab_610_92_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=MBL0C1AXyUBC4zkN65IarwInOvrejiEpChQSt6APKNOFB6+mh+NqfloQSoj03rzsjyVpivAqvWtUdbDBQYgnLP76vb9SAvzlFpt52Cs3ktg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/379
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0601-0650/ab_637_93_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0601-0650/ab_637_93_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0601-0650/ab_637_93_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=I1TAVeHzoMvFtm4Y/+aon03nByiskVDzDltxxk30OuIGQIRg8Synqc0umYYTb2wa2gi6rLutZE14W8wjnNrPJl6wTb001VI5s/sp/4kzESQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/360
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0601-0650/ab_642_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0601-0650/ab_642_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0601-0650/ab_642_95_A_bill.pdf
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AB 643 Berman, D 
 

Electric Rule 
21: 
interconnection
: distributed 
renewable 
generation. 

05/01/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Public Utilities Commission’s Electric Rule 21 establishes a tariff that describes the 
interconnection, operating, and metering requirements of generation facilities to be connected to 
an electrical corporation’s distribution system. This bill would require the commission, on or before 
March 31, 2024, to commence the consideration of adopting mechanisms, as provided, for 
distributed renewable generation interconnections to enforce timelines, reduce administrative 
burden, and provide transparency and certainty to customers. The bill would require the 
commission, in considering the adoption of mechanisms, to create process improvements to, and 
potential timelines for, Electric Rule 21 to address certain types of delays.    (Based 
on  05/01/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 645 Friedman, D 
 

Vehicles: 
speed safety 
system pilot 
program. 

10/13/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/13/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
808, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/13/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would authorize, until January 1, 2032, the Cities of Los Angeles, San Jose, Oakland, Glendale, 
and Long Beach, and the City and County of San Francisco to establish a Speed Safety System 
Pilot Program if the system meets specified requirements. The bill would require a participating city 
or city and county to adopt a Speed Safety System Use Policy and a Speed Safety System Impact 
Report before implementing the program, and would require the participating city or city and 
county to engage in a public information campaign at least 30 days before implementation of the 
program, including information relating to when the systems would begin detecting violations and 
where the systems would be utilized. The bill would require a participating city or city and county to 
issue warning notices rather than notices of violations for violations detected within the first 60 
calendar days of the program. The bill would also require a participating city or city and county to 
develop uniform guidelines for, among other things, the processing and storage of confidential 
information. The bill would designate all photographic or administrative records, not including data 
about the number of violations issued or the speeds at which they were issued for, made by a 
system as confidential, and would only authorize public agencies to use and allow access to these 
records for specified purposes.    (Based on  10/13/2023 text) 

AB 645 - 
Support_04.06.2
3.pdf 

Sponsor 

AB 653 Reyes, D 
 

Public housing 
authorities: 
reports. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
672, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/27/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law establishes the Department of Housing and Community Development within the 
Business, Consumer Services, and Housing Agency. Under current law, the department is 
responsible for administering various housing programs throughout the state, including, among 
others, the California Emergency Solutions and Housing Program, which, among other things, 
provides rental assistance and housing relocation and stabilization services to ensure housing 
affordability for people who are experiencing homelessness or who are at risk of homelessness. 
The Housing Authorities Law creates a housing authority in each county and each city, which is 
authorized to transact business and exercise specified powers upon adoption of a resolution by 
the governing body of the county or city declaring that there is a need for the authority to function. 
Among other things, existing law authorizes a housing authority to provide leased housing to 
persons of low income. This bill would require all public housing authorities to report specified 
data, including their monthly success rates as of the first of each month, to the department 
beginning on July 1, 2025, and annually thereafter, as specified. Because the bill would require 
local housing authorities to perform additional duties, it would impose a state-mandated local 
program. The bill would require the department to make the data publicly available, beginning on 
January 1, 2026, and each year thereafter.   (Based on  09/27/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=kglUbVeX3og47+q4f0tJf9Csaj0HP1IrmODBJ0w2kJNH/5w+1SC+nL6r6q6nPJZxP9GvJa0YCxA3HiOizAM7HOqQn3Yy+lz5WFaoZG+sbRQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/364
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0601-0650/ab_643_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0601-0650/ab_643_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0601-0650/ab_643_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Sn458SLjuM5sDyDOJIl98OZQQrcUEncd8TohdA91Qwj+ojTjAGyqCBOQ9qK4TtufnKCTg8MqfOZGdXjhOXEA0Ugml8ErkD0pfthX9+mCGBM=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/445
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0601-0650/ab_645_88_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0601-0650/ab_645_88_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=960E22A8-37A8-4DFB-A159-8DBFD9E045D9
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=960E22A8-37A8-4DFB-A159-8DBFD9E045D9
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=960E22A8-37A8-4DFB-A159-8DBFD9E045D9
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Ea0bUEvhBRHPWlPlXSI8A9yGg27KUf/cXInVyKCPSAUqvc67etPMjQOzzejBbeudYDttSMoNFn5e0LtgXRbl2amVvo70nQhvhmaau6G0VE0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/374
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0651-0700/ab_653_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0651-0700/ab_653_91_C_bill.pdf
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AB 660 Irwin, D 
 

Food and 
beverage 
products: 
labeling: quality 
dates, safety 
dates, and sell-
by dates. 

09/28/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/28/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
911, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/28/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Milk and Milk Products Act of 1947 regulates milk and milk products and establishes 
standards for the manufacturing, handling, processing, and marketing of milk and milk products. 
Current law requires that there appear on the package or container of market milk, market cream, 
and other milk products made from market milk or any component or derivative of market milk the 
date established by the processor as the date on which, in order to ensure consumer quality, the 
product is normally removed from the shelf or similar location from which the milk product is 
offered for sale to the consumer. This bill would instead require that there appear on the package 
or container of those milk products the date established by the processor as the date by which the 
product should normally be used to ensure consumer quality.   (Based on  09/28/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 662 Boerner, D 
 

Federal 
Broadband 
Equity, Access, 
and 
Deployment 
Program funds: 
administration. 

07/13/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/14/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law requires the Public Utilities Commission to establish specified accounts within the 
California Advanced Services Fund (CASF), including, among other accounts, the Broadband 
Infrastructure Grant Account and the Federal Funding Account. Existing federal law, the 
Infrastructure Investment and Jobs Act of 2021, establishes the federal Broadband Equity, Access, 
and Deployment Program (BEAD Program). Under that act, Congress appropriated 
$42,450,000,000 to the Assistant Secretary of Commerce for Communications and Information to 
carry out the BEAD Program, under which the Assistant Secretary makes grants to states, as 
provided. This bill would require the commission, in administering federal BEAD Program funds 
pursuant to the federal Infrastructure Investment and Jobs Act of 2021, to follow federal guidelines, 
as defined. Except as provided, the bill would prohibit the commission from imposing any 
additional rules, processes, procedures, prohibitions, funding prioritizations, or eligibility criteria on 
any applicant, as defined, that are not explicitly required by the federal guidelines. The bill would 
require the commission, in exercising any discretion in adopting rules, processes, and procedures 
to administer BEAD Program funds, to adopt rules, processes, and procedures that, among other 
things, use the most robust, granular, and accurate broadband availability data.   (Based 
on  07/13/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 667 Maienschein, 
D 
 

Firearms: gun 
violence 
restraining 
orders. 

01/03/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
PUB. S. on 
5/1/2024) 

07/02/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law authorizes a court to issue a gun violence restraining order to prohibit a person from 
purchasing or possessing a firearm or ammunition for a period of one to 5 years, subject to 
renewal for additional one- to 5-year periods, if the subject of the petition poses a significant 
danger of self-harm or harm to another in the near future by having a firearm and the order is 
necessary to prevent personal injury to the subject of the petition or another. Current law makes it 
a crime to own or possess a firearm in violation of a gun violence restraining order. If the court 
finds evidence of an extreme risk of violence, including repeated and egregious instances of 
specified facts, and those facts existed 12 months prior to a petition being filed, this bill would 
require a court to issue a gun violence restraining order for 5 years. By expanding the scope of an 
existing crime, this bill would impose a state-mandated local program.   (Based on  01/03/2024 
text) 

AB 667 - Support 
05.14.24.pdf 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=L42GwPYoj4sT4gKpvn5mcsLFZWn+qBSAYYpSupuVFJxyAboiOigvTk94BdSRNluc3p6l0TL4C0P1GSTbF3lPsf3VTNXY+hqfKxstsAyQqRY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/442
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0651-0700/ab_660_88_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0651-0700/ab_660_88_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=sJ99j+5j014mQBxSYP+Hv4ui2ikACyXkWeEML+83MjSI3SGy3+BgJ3EhJKjLnKi+TE7wJZCYzWTmg+dLfU+7g/ge8Y054P/cN2L1Fs2Nn04=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/389
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0651-0700/ab_662_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0651-0700/ab_662_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0651-0700/ab_662_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=33/9tbk0yVzWeWHQG/XyyNF1ysee6j5fGOFSUB7QYXRqYcq+Hnq5DT3rWxq1LNKeRatY80Qtd0ixLmU/Ze6yOxzFxQ8qfKghsOBBv5r9uGc=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/388
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/388
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0651-0700/ab_667_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0651-0700/ab_667_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0651-0700/ab_667_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=082FE4DF-589E-4711-9596-D10D817490A0
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=082FE4DF-589E-4711-9596-D10D817490A0
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AB 675 Soria, D 
 

Controlled 
substances. 

05/03/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law prohibits the possession of certain controlled substances including cocaine, heroin, 
and methamphetamine while armed with a loaded and operable firearm. A violation of this 
prohibition is punishable as a felony punishable by incarceration in the state prison. This bill would 
additionally prohibit the possession of a heroin analog, fentanyl, and a fentanyl analog while armed 
with a loaded and operable firearm. The bill would require that, for purposes of this crime, a person 
possessing a substance containing fentanyl or a fentanyl analog must have knowledge that the 
substance is fentanyl or a fentanyl analog. By expanding the application of an existing crime, this 
bill would impose a state-mandated local program.   (Based on  05/03/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 676 Bennett, D 
 

Water: general 
state policy. 

10/08/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

01/25/2024 - 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto stricken 
from file.  

10/08/2023 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Would specify that the use of water for domestic purposes includes water use for human 
consumption, cooking, sanitary purposes, care of household livestock, animals, and gardens, fire 
suppression and other safety purposes, and a purpose determined to be a domestic purpose as 
established by the common law.   (Based on  09/12/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 679 Wicks, D 
 

Family 
childcare 
homes: meals: 
reimbursement 
rates. 

05/02/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law requires a school district or county superintendent of schools maintaining a 
kindergarten or any of grades 1 to 12, inclusive, to provide a needy pupil with one nutritionally 
adequate free or reduced-price meal during each schoolday, and two school meals free of charge 
during each schoolday to any pupil who requests a meal without consideration of the pupil’s 
eligibility for a federally funded free or reduced-price meal, and sets the reimbursement rate for 
meals served by family daycare homes at 75 percent of the meals served. This bill would increase 
the reimbursement rate for meals served in family childcare homes to instead be 100 percent of 
the eligible meals served. The bill would define “family childcare homes” to mean the same as 
“family daycare homes,” as provided.   (Based on  05/02/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 701 Villapudua, D 
 

Controlled 
substances: 
fentanyl. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
540, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/09/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law classifies controlled substances into 5 schedules and places the greatest restrictions 
and penalties on the use of those substances placed in Schedule I. Current law classifies the drug 
fentanyl in Schedule II. Existing law prohibits a person from possessing for sale or purchasing for 
purposes of sale specified controlled substances, including fentanyl, and provides for 
imprisonment in a county jail for 2, 3, or 4 years for a violation of this provision. Current law also 
imposes an additional term, and authorizes a trial court to impose a specified fine, upon a person 
who is convicted of a violation of, or of a conspiracy to violate, specified provisions of law with 
respect to a substance containing heroin, cocaine base, and cocaine, if the substance exceeds a 
specified weight. This bill would add fentanyl to the substances for which additional terms or fines 
can be imposed and would require a defendant who violates those laws with respect to a 
substance containing heroin, fentanyl, or cocaine, as specified, to know of the substance’s nature 
or character as a controlled substance to be subjected to an additional term and authorized 
fine.    (Based on  10/08/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=nH1oe3XvekI3KW1gaHBgr3pFkvsX3l0FdqhrfCIkoQaghJELou7iRjjEFibpxonxcMKEKLtCkFBjo1EK1a5qLJio8Ye/f28GtswuH/hMGsM=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/309
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0651-0700/ab_675_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0651-0700/ab_675_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0651-0700/ab_675_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=/TrYmhrIlWy6m0PTjfEMSdJh9IyaBQWovg4sGQVJ12GU2/iMzi+3JHITbne6Ftz3FPBdrv26xbSCTqNcuQeYDxXGN3dEfaXNrGo/95pKhr8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/368
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0651-0700/ab_676_93_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0651-0700/ab_676_93_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0651-0700/ab_676_93_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ShhzoothvG3BUYgYqNHx77nEoQgEL3IgeklSNI08e/ZT1aHTSn8T24UdKqLvoYZEq8rOfQMsLyYddByJT1pzGJ/liWBoUARDCppR9sgWHKU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/306
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0651-0700/ab_679_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0651-0700/ab_679_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0651-0700/ab_679_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=2UiCWMGQq2MDRGpzK8ydCrnyKsz336ZiSsq6sRi1QpWpc8xgA5oIawStQoNqvWoKTUQ4FzIbzYSjruxAWcanVz1NXX3pNAUbgAJh0tv/Nrg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/357
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0701-0750/ab_701_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0701-0750/ab_701_94_C_bill.pdf
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AB 739 Lackey, R 
 

Public 
retirement 
systems: 
defined benefit 
plans: funding. 

02/13/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The California Public Employees’ Pension Reform Act of 2013 (PEPRA) generally requires a 
public retirement system, as defined, to modify its plan or plans to comply with the act. PEPRA 
prohibits a public employer’s contribution to a defined benefit plan, in combination with employee 
contributions to the plan, from being less than the normal cost rate, as defined, for the plan in a 
fiscal year. Current law authorizes a public retirement system to suspend contributions if certain 
conditions are satisfied, one of which is that the plan be funded by more than 120%, based on a 
computation by the retirement system actuary in accordance with specified standards, that is 
included in the annual valuation. This bill would revise the conditions for suspending contributions 
to a public retirement system defined benefit plan to increase the threshold percentage amount of 
plan funding to more than 130%.   (Based on  02/13/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 742 Jackson, D 
 

Law 
enforcement: 
police canines. 

05/18/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Died on 
inactive file.  

02/01/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would prohibit the use of an unleashed police canine by law enforcement to apprehend a person 
unless the person is being pursued for a felony that threatened or resulted in the death of or 
serious bodily injury to another person and the person poses an imminent danger of death or 
serious bodily injury to the officer or to another person and any use of a police canine for crowd 
control. The bill would prohibit a police canine from being used to bite unless there is an imminent 
threat of death or serious bodily injury to the officer or another person by the person against whom 
the canine is used. The bill would attribute the death of or serious bodily injury to a person caused 
by a police canine to the canine‘s handler as constituting deadly force. The bill would prohibit law 
enforcement agencies from authorizing any use or training of a police canine that is inconsistent 
with this bill.    (Based on  05/18/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 744 Carrillo, Juan, 
D 
 

California 
Transportation 
Commission: 
data, modeling, 
and analytic 
software tools 
procurement. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
541, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/09/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would require the California Transportation Commission to convene relevant state agencies to 
assess the procurement and implementation of data, modeling, and analytic software tools to 
support the state’s sustainable transportation, congestion management, affordable housing, 
efficient land use, air quality, economic, and climate change strategies and goals, as provided. On 
or before July 1, 2025, the bill would require the commission to develop a proposal to procure 
data, modeling, and analytic software tools and a process to grant access to the data it procures 
directly, or provide a process for direct allocation of funding to agencies for data procurement, or 
both of those, as provided.   (Based on  10/08/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 755 Papan, D 
 

Water: public 
entity: water 
usage demand 
analysis. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
542, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/09/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law authorizes a public entity that supplies water at retail or wholesale within its service 
area to adopt, in accordance with specified procedures, and enforce a water conservation 
program. This bill would require a public entity, as defined, to conduct a water usage demand 
analysis, as defined, prior to completing, or as part of, a cost-of-service analysis conducted to set 
fees and charges for water service that are consistent with applicable law. The bill would require a 
public entity to identify, within the water usage demand analysis, the costs of water service for the 
highest users, as defined, incurred by the public entity, and the average annual volume of water 
delivered to high water users.    (Based on  10/08/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Iku0n5FMCci20XVjuuWyx2u3ENDp75tKjPkgrbjJ4z0rwFA2Qb6fwfj+16DCDGAdidE7CbDL654Lj+b3CXY//2ix03dkzwa80bAl6ygp5eU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/366
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0701-0750/ab_739_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0701-0750/ab_739_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=bCwE2VGBoua8yiynwnJgUPnql4AJa2e1MukS0lMNamALjFGgxwJi2kGZQ82TNUs3JXCCYG3seleCFLRf6qm8K1gyBV9Ax7ujmuUVU4a+9eA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/379
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0701-0750/ab_742_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0701-0750/ab_742_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0701-0750/ab_742_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=VT13p4nKTzonpVfArbwmaZlxaNWRJ79V2WqPe8Szf5QM83TCp63c3P6Ui063wkglhaGSJg1wuywSy2wyNpjI813QpIU0GBNls67Lz7rhENU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/474
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/474
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0701-0750/ab_744_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0701-0750/ab_744_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=e8CQPSGttthMLKtSF5m//5VRQGs+eVCUmXndMjhODF39V5+pY3jsUwBNBL+OAm7bT8HQX9+RAeR3LKtgSTF4nTfu2HfFddPthl3d3nlkg6Q=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/362
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0751-0800/ab_755_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0751-0800/ab_755_92_C_bill.pdf
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AB 793 Bonta, D 
 

Privacy: 
reverse 
demands. 

04/19/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
JUD. on 
6/27/2023) 

07/02/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The United States Constitution generally requires a state to give full faith and credit to the public 
acts, records, and judicial proceedings of every other state. Current law sets forth procedures by 
which a person may enforce a judgment for the payment of money issued by the court of a state 
other than California. The Electronic Communications Privacy Act determines how governmental 
entities may access information on electronic devices and from electronic communication service 
providers, as defined. Current law requires a California corporation that provides electronic 
communication services or remote computing services to the general public to comply with a 
warrant issued by another state to produce records that would reveal the identity of the customers 
using those services, data stored by, or on behalf of, the customer, the customer’s usage of those 
services, the recipient or destination of communications sent to or from those customers, or the 
content of those communications as if that warrant had been issued by a California court, except 
as specified. This bill would prohibit any government entity from seeking, or any court from 
enforcing, assisting, or supporting, a reverse-keyword or reverse-location demand, as defined, 
issued by a government entity or court in this state or any other state. The bill would prohibit a 
person or California entity from complying with a reverse-keyword or reverse-location 
demand.    (Based on  04/19/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 799 Rivas, Luz, D 
 

Interagency 
Council on 
Homelessness: 
funding: state 
programs. 

09/19/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/19/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
263, 
Statutes of 
2024 

09/19/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires the Governor to create an Interagency Council on Homelessness, consisting 
of specified members. Among other goals, existing law requires the council to coordinate existing 
funding and applications for competitive funding. Current law requires the council to create a 
statewide data system, which is known as the Homeless Data Integration System, that collects 
local data through the Homeless Management Information System, with a goal of matching data 
on homelessness to programs impacting homeless recipients of state programs. Current law also 
requires the council to collect, compile, and make available to the public financial data provided to 
the council from all state-funded homelessness programs. Current law defines state programs as 
any programs a California state agency or department funds, implements, or administers for the 
purpose of providing housing or housing-based services to people experiencing homelessness or 
at risk of homelessness, except as specified. This bill would additionally require the council to 
include the Governor’s Tribal Advisor. The bill would remove the above-mentioned reference to 
competitive funding and would instead require the council to coordinate applications for funding. 
The bill would require council staff to develop and regularly maintain a strategic funding guide and 
a calendar of new or existing funding opportunities. The bill would require agencies and 
departments administrating state programs to provide the council updated information on new or 
existing funding opportunities on a quarterly basis. The bill would also require council staff to 
collect fiscal and outcome data, as defined, from state agencies and departments administering 
state homelessness programs with a grantee or entity that is required to enter data elements on 
the individuals and families it serves into its local Homeless Management Information System, as 
specified.   (Based on  09/19/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=eaoTBBcXqg1Y5hMFdlQclmqzSm9KKw0z5BBBjuvbGv4JLZJmlsseAMbTKS0Fhi2MpbfTTwqSovm6VgC6SPIzAPknI5NI/8/9T9heZ0/HjZI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/495
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0751-0800/ab_793_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0751-0800/ab_793_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0751-0800/ab_793_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=dVPy7WYwWs4uSYV1VYob9L40sbesXybvpvCx1BrTRZUIR+tDY1meZd5LP0QXhpDxMqiqAZ+pnYh2nob3GvqonquSXJy5ezihtNWQLsMWowY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/300
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0751-0800/ab_799_89_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0751-0800/ab_799_89_C_bill.pdf
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AB 812 Boerner, D 
 

Housing 
development 
approvals: 
reserving 
affordable units 
in or near a 
cultural district 
for artists. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
747, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires the Arts Council to establish criteria and guidelines for certification of state-
designated cultural districts and collaborate with other public agencies and private entities to 
maximize the benefits of state-designated cultural districts. The Planning and Zoning Law imposes 
various requirements on cities and counties with regard to their review and approval of certain 
housing developments. This bill would authorize a city or county that requires, as a condition of 
approval, that a certain percentage of units of a residential development be affordable housing, as 
specified, to reserve for artists up to 10% of those required affordable housing units, except as 
provided, if certain conditions are met, including that the units reserved are located within or within 
one-half mile from a state-designated cultural district or within a locally designated cultural district, 
as specified.    (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 817 Pacheco, D 
 

Open 
meetings: 
teleconferencin
g: subsidiary 
body. 

05/29/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
L. GOV. on 
5/1/2024) 

07/02/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The Ralph M. Brown Act, requires, with specified exceptions, each legislative body of a local 
agency to provide notice of the time and place for its regular meetings and an agenda containing a 
brief general description of each item of business to be transacted. Current law authorizes the 
legislative body of a local agency to use alternate teleconferencing provisions during a proclaimed 
state of emergency (emergency provisions) and, until January 1, 2026, in certain circumstances 
related to the particular member if at least a quorum of its members participate from a singular 
physical location that is open to the public and situated within the agency’s jurisdiction and other 
requirements are met (nonemergency provisions). Current law imposes different requirements for 
notice, agenda, and public participation, as prescribed, when a legislative body is using alternate 
teleconferencing provisions. The nonemergency provisions impose restrictions on remote 
participation by a member of the legislative body and require the legislative body to provide 
specific means by which the public may remotely hear and visually observe the meeting. This bill, 
until January 1, 2026, would authorize a subsidiary body, as defined, to use similar alternative 
teleconferencing provisions and would impose requirements for notice, agenda, and public 
participation, as prescribed. The bill would require at least one staff member of the local agency to 
be present at a designated primary physical meeting location during the meeting. The bill would 
require the local agency to post the agenda at the primary physical meeting location. The bill 
would require the members of the subsidiary body to visibly appear on camera during the open 
portion of a meeting that is publicly accessible via the internet or other online platform, as 
specified. The bill would also require the subsidiary body to list a member of the subsidiary body 
who participates in a teleconference meeting from a remote location in the minutes of the meeting. 
In order to use teleconferencing pursuant to this act, the bill would require the legislative body that 
established the subsidiary body by charter, ordinance, resolution, or other formal action to make 
specified findings by majority vote, before the subsidiary body uses teleconferencing for the first 
time and every 12 months thereafter.   (Based on  05/29/2024 text) 

AB 817 - Support 
05.14.24.pdf 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=sYQDyku4FC7TT3M5+xGFCPH0SANzQxUETRmIjopDrZCWuWOEzxu/s+tYtMt/ZT9vBLdxuKPh5Ktqam3yjedtKYn8yZ062n1dnpP0HctlEc8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/389
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0801-0850/ab_812_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0801-0850/ab_812_92_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Zwxwx2HgA5kxoP50kT0tAlPJUXXWIOVRaeLOWeuX3v8Ng4QJLuxvpqTlVxHuuURCrFNqC4pPD14y1oYgfvZrbQ5r4i4MNao5fGPop318W5w=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/450
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0801-0850/ab_817_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0801-0850/ab_817_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0801-0850/ab_817_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=3F5CE18F-43D5-487C-80C2-CB374731D054
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=3F5CE18F-43D5-487C-80C2-CB374731D054
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AB 821 Grayson, D 
 

Planning and 
zoning: general 
plan: zoning 
ordinance: 
conflicts. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
748, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Planning and Zoning Law requires each county and city to adopt a comprehensive, long-term 
general plan for the physical development of the county or city, and of certain land outside its 
boundaries. Current law requires that county or city zoning ordinances be consistent with the 
general plan of the county or city by January 1, 1974. Current law authorizes any resident or 
property owner to bring an action or proceeding in the superior court to enforce compliance with 
these provisions within 90 days of the enactment of any new zoning ordinance or the amendment 
of any existing zoning ordinance. Current law requires a zoning ordinance to be amended within a 
reasonable time so that it is consistent with the general plan in the event that the ordinance 
becomes inconsistent with the plan by reason of amendment to the plan. This bill would 
additionally authorize any resident or property owner to bring an action or proceeding in the 
superior court to enforce compliance with these provisions within 90 days of the failure of a local 
agency to amend a zoning ordinance within a reasonable time of the zoning ordinance becoming 
inconsistent with the general plan due to amendment to the plan or to any element of the 
plan.   (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 824 Calderon, D 
 

Highway 
greening: 
statewide 
strategic plan. 

07/03/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/14/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would enact the Highway Greening Act, which would require the department to complete a 
statewide strategic plan, as specified, to work to achieve at least a 10% increase of green 
highways, as defined, in urban areas, disadvantaged communities, and low-income communities 
by 2035. The bill would require the Department of Transportation to submit the plan to the 
Legislature and specified committees of the Legislature on or before June 30, 2025.    (Based 
on  07/03/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 825 Bryan, D 
 

Vehicles: 
bicycles on 
sidewalks. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto stricken 
from file.  

10/08/2023 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Would, until January 1, 2031, and except as specified, prohibit a local authority from prohibiting the 
operation of a bicycle on a sidewalk adjacent to a highway or corridor that does not include a 
Class I, Class II, or Class IV bikeway, as defined, and would require the Commissioner of the 
California Highway Patrol to submit a report to the Legislature regarding the effects of that 
prohibition.   (Based on  09/18/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 835 Lee, D 
 

State Fire 
Marshal: 
building 
standards: 
single-exit, 
single stairway 
apartment 
houses: report. 

10/07/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/07/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
345, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/07/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires the California Building Standards Commission to approve and adopt building 
standards and to codify those standards in the California Building Standards Code. Current law 
requires the State Fire Marshal to research and develop, and authorizes the State Fire Marshal to 
propose to the California Building Standards Commission, mandatory building standards for fire 
resistance based on occupancy risk categories in very high, high, and moderate California fire 
severity zones, as provided. This bill would require the State Fire Marshal to research standards 
for single-exit, single stairway apartment houses, with more than 2 dwelling units, in buildings 
above 3 stories and provide a report to specified legislative committees and to the California 
Building Standards Commission by January 1, 2026. The bill would require this report to address 
fire and life safety or emergency activities in single-exit, single stairway apartment houses, with 
more than 2 dwelling units, in buildings above 3 stories. The bill would repeal the above-mentioned 
provisions on January 1, 2028.   (Based on  10/07/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=OcpGbv+l+M0ae94/ANav2PdI7b9DdoKz5OK39CvyJ0FqJID3jl86PVelr32rOy+6CEhKuW47ndQR0ztAVjBG6HeD6XF5567S7bgLGlAFjH0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/433
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0801-0850/ab_821_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0801-0850/ab_821_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=QS52JQSxK93Gv+Mtoz+gGIPE04GAOVnxW2WNa0jgtKDEbMMVes0JhDCHrl59UkadQ/g9tNCcbLEHJN6mKI8mFw78HM+QgVnlt+lDZqbLheU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/448
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0801-0850/ab_824_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0801-0850/ab_824_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0801-0850/ab_824_95_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=LdGpdLJpTcAZp0Ier1rI+sC2PRBN/KWIM6+ZoEYsjcD6dvorQWoHZaDdxYQg1L3a5JvbPRptdX6KcbMpCkNrHL8VIsk1qY5n8fPtJ16D3Vg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/447
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0801-0850/ab_825_95_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0801-0850/ab_825_95_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0801-0850/ab_825_95_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=S3ut+0iZK0EuQrC1kOQKTUvDzmklbKFAps6OgZQljvfSCykCp2FbED0+TTZjdZ7p99bLQ2KfYjRml5txeu5tfADh3HItJUyLJ8SGGym/moY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/308
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0801-0850/ab_835_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0801-0850/ab_835_93_C_bill.pdf
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AB 841 Berman, D 
 

State Energy 
Resources 
Conservation 
and 
Development 
Commission: 
Industrial Heat 
Electrification 
Roadmap. 

07/06/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/21/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would require the State Energy Resources Conservation and Development Commission, on or 
before January 1, 2025, to submit to the Legislature an Industrial Heat Electrification Roadmap, 
which would, among other things, identify the industrial subsectors for various California facilities 
that use heat application equipment operating at or below 1,000 degrees Celsius and their 
locations and evaluate various issues related to industrial electrification, as specified. The bill 
would authorize the commission to consult with the State Air Resources Board to include in the 
roadmap an estimate of the reductions in emissions of greenhouse gases and criteria air 
pollutants, and commensurate health benefits, from electrifying the identified industrial 
subsectors.   (Based on  07/06/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 846 Bonta, D 
 

Housing 
programs: rent 
increases. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
674, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/27/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Zenovich-Moscone-Chacon Housing and Home Finance Act prohibits “affordable rent” for 
certain rental housing developments that receive assistance on or after January 1, 1991, from 
exceeding a specified percentage based on the area median income adjusted for family size 
appropriate for the unit and whether the household is an acutely low income household, extremely 
low income household, very low income household, lower income household, or moderate-income 
household. Current law defines “area median income,” “adjustments for family size appropriate to 
the unit,” and “moderate-income household” for these purposes. This bill would, for an above-
described rental housing development that dedicates 80% of units to lower income households, as 
specified, prohibit affordable rent from exceeding the rent prescribed by deed restrictions or 
regulatory agreements pursuant to the terms of public financing or public financial assistance for 
the rental housing development, if the rental housing development receives specified awards on or 
after January 1, 2025. The bill would also modify the above-described definitions.   (Based 
on  09/27/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 850 Ting, D 
 

Homeless 
Housing, 
Assistance, 
and Prevention 
program: round 
4 funds. 

02/14/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law provides for the allocation of funding under the Homeless Housing, Assistance, and 
Prevention program among continuums of care, cities, counties, and tribes in 4 rounds, which are 
to be administered by the Interagency Council on Homelessness. Current law requires 
$1,000,000,000 be made available, upon appropriation by the Legislature, in the 2022–23 fiscal 
year for implementing round 4 of the program, and requires all round 4 program funds be 
expended by June 30, 2027, or revert to, and be paid and deposited in, the General Fund. This bill 
would instead require all round 4 program funds be expended by July 1, 2027, and would make 
conforming changes.   (Based on  02/14/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=DAlc8ASqssYH+p9l994bS5g8ZhjWEzWh7PXCt+d741hgBbt6jdFU/kRRZ3OidUE/O0L19lgUINyNMYV4zAPCux54VpR+ftIaShZmc2xYPaA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/364
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0801-0850/ab_841_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0801-0850/ab_841_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0801-0850/ab_841_94_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=UcLym7ja0DF5u/FNwKnoz4OjLsuWBeOmvKbrjuEJSb5gBce15i0QIVN4xKHjJxf36Z71/t8eXtb5tUmknpyLN6KahosY2pkTVDyiPQ8Yywk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/495
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0801-0850/ab_846_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0801-0850/ab_846_91_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=iDn5Kn3iOhwiA3Abx++1XtprNUEdR4yL5Zzop0KnxOu1uZOcGS43aGeldf82uGOyklGaGWOqCduFJm+94OGvxoFGchlAqZ4H9LpVXFV2bX0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/360
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0801-0850/ab_850_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0801-0850/ab_850_99_I_bill.pdf
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AB 875 Gabriel, D 
 

Courts: data 
reporting. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

01/29/2024 - 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto stricken 
from file.  

10/08/2023 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

The Sargent Shriver Civil Counsel Act requires the Judicial Council to develop one or more 
programs to provide competitive grants to provide legal counsel to low-income persons who 
require legal services in civil matters involving specific types of civil matters, including, among 
others, housing-related matters, probate conservatorships, guardianships, and domestic violence 
and civil harassment restraining orders. Current law requires the Judicial Council to consider 
various factors, including, among others, the unmet need for legal services in the geographic area 
to be served, in selecting and renewing participating programs. Current law requires program 
applicants, among other things, to describe how the program would be administered and the 
means by which the program would serve the particular needs of the community, such as by 
providing representation to limited-English-speaking clients. Commencing January 1, 2025, this bill 
would require courts to report specified information to the Judicial Council each month regarding 
unlawful detainer cases, aggregated by ZIP Code. The bill also would require courts to report to 
the Judicial Council case summary data on COVID-19 Rental Debt in Small Claims Court, 
aggregated by ZIP Code. The bill would require the Judicial Council, every 4 months, to post all 
information received about unlawful detainer cases in a publicly available electronic spreadsheet 
that may be downloaded from its internet website.   (Based on  09/14/2023 text) 

AB 875 
SUPPORT 
28Aug23 
AB 875 GOVRFS 
20Sept23 

Support 

AB 893 Papan, D 
 

Personal 
vehicle sharing 
programs. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
547, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/09/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law generally governs the transactions between a rental car company, also referred to as 
a rental company, and its customers, including, among other provisions, required disclosures by a 
rental company, mandatory contract provisions for a vehicle rental agreement, restrictions on a 
rental company’s use of electronic surveillance technology, and authorization for a rental company 
to collect specific types of fees and charges from its customers. Current law defines “rental 
company,” among other terms, for purposes of those provisions. This bill would define the term 
“personal vehicle sharing program” for purposes of these provisions as a person or entity that, for 
monetary compensation, facilitates the rental of passenger vehicles to the public, including via a 
peer-to-peer internet website, application, or other platform, that connects a vehicle owner with a 
vehicle driver to facilitate sharing or renting a vehicle for consideration, as specified.   (Based 
on  10/08/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=cc6MQARfZKSUiCic9/r9bkcQ5GgY9QiHMg2sd0Qe04jLTnBAMJ80efYgMLdVDrUE0v1ugS1Cw62DdfdOre9fE6Ptph3/4zuxeIAnIC0q+xA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/371
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0851-0900/ab_875_97_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0851-0900/ab_875_97_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0851-0900/ab_875_97_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=3A66803C-5567-43BC-987C-29299339F896
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=3A66803C-5567-43BC-987C-29299339F896
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=3A66803C-5567-43BC-987C-29299339F896
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=C17D6CBE-3862-42DD-84FF-C57AC4CCA7D0
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=C17D6CBE-3862-42DD-84FF-C57AC4CCA7D0
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=j97VEplszMagT5pAZBZrIFD5z0/FaQcl3K1/1omlmVG5vDbviXalWaVeDK21h7NCi4n7m6z4JEdMzT3O+/CQ0dETmZWMAuwyCv1YrDDxTeM=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/362
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0851-0900/ab_893_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0851-0900/ab_893_91_C_bill.pdf
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AB 894 Friedman, D 
 

Parking 
requirements: 
shared parking. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
749, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Planning and Zoning Law requires each county and city to adopt a comprehensive, long-term 
general plan for its physical development, and the development of certain lands outside its 
boundaries, that includes, among other mandatory elements, a housing element. Current law also 
authorizes the legislative body of a city or a county to adopt ordinances establishing requirements 
for parking. When an entity receiving parking is not using that parking to meet public automobile 
parking requirements, this bill would require a local agency, as defined, to allow entities with 
underutilized parking to share their underutilized parking with the public, local agencies, or other 
entities, if those entities submit a shared parking agreement, as defined, to the local agency, and 
information identifying the benefits of the proposed shared parking agreement. The bill would 
require a local agency to allow parking spaces identified in a shared parking agreement to count 
toward meeting automobile parking requirements for a new or existing development or use, 
including, but not limited to, shared parking in underutilized spaces and in parking lots and 
garages that will be constructed as part of the development or developments when specified 
conditions regarding the distance between the entities that will share the parking are met. The bill 
would require a local agency to approve the shared parking agreement if it includes, among other 
things, a parking analysis using peer-reviewed methodologies developed by a professional 
planning association, as specified. The bill would require a local agency to decide whether to 
approve or deny the shared parking agreement and determine how many parking spaces can be 
reasonably shared between uses to fulfill parking requirements if the shared parking agreement 
does not include this parking analysis. If the local agency is required to decide whether to approve 
or deny an agreement for specified developments under these provisions, the bill would require 
the local agency to notify all property owners within 300 feet of the shared parking spaces of the 
proposed agreement and to hold a public meeting if it receives a request to do so within 14 days of 
notifying property owners, as provided. The bill would specify that these notification and public 
meeting requirements would not apply to local agencies that enact an ordinance that provides for 
shared parking agreements, including ordinances enacted before January 1, 2024.    (Based 
on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 909 Hoover, R 
 

Solid Waste 
Disposal and 
Codisposal Site 
Cleanup 
Program. 

03/30/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would authorize the Department of Resources Recycling and Recovery, beginning July 1, 2024, 
and upon appropriation by the Legislature, to collect and properly manage illegally disposed 
hazardous waste and household hazardous waste, as defined, regardless of whether they were 
codisposed with nonhazardous solid waste. The bill would require the department to annually seek 
up to $500,000 from the Department of Toxic Substances Control in reimbursement for grants 
awarded and program costs incurred. The bill would also prohibit the department from expending 
funds from the Integrated Waste Management Fund for purposes of this program in excess of the 
amount reimbursed by the Department of Toxic Substances Control.   (Based on  03/30/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 919 Kalra, D 
 

Residential real 
property: sale 
of rental 
properties: right 
of first offer. 

02/14/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would require an owner of residential real property, defined to include a single-family residential 
property that is occupied by a tenant or a multifamily residential property to take various actions 
before offering the residential real property for sale to any purchaser, soliciting any offer to 
purchase the residential real property, or otherwise entering into a contract for sale of the 
residential real property. The bill would exempt certain transfers of a residential real property from 
its provisions, including, among others, a transfer between spouses, domestic partners, parent and 
child, siblings, grandparent and grandchild, a transfer pursuant to a court order, and a transfer by 
eminent domain.   (Based on  02/14/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=8W/ONdarmGgqpwIIV540KS4Fbm80F7PhGT/TJjLAung9vMXqUwfYL0YCML3IkhZfDpbBWYgJnMIEniKLzq9AI6MlnF0BVCdlnZizFBcKO4Q=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/445
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0851-0900/ab_894_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0851-0900/ab_894_91_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=D/gmdUI2/aWPmnyMOuHBa+ycxuEgH4QYj3SQeXClhrZL+VtiJDDCdZVrKO8xi34wc/faFrrTX+nomnf4coSEq+xFustDfowgeUBER/YQqrE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/431
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0901-0950/ab_909_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0901-0950/ab_909_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0901-0950/ab_909_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Nu1rwt5gjP3BYPnFW7svpb0fhow5Z09Jd5ZD2c7LdDqsCfsU5eJZ50WqsWr/XWvRvxvdF5qv/PS9YRI8fjd3iWhRv3cgyuu31jviQPVdYxc=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/436
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0901-0950/ab_919_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0901-0950/ab_919_99_I_bill.pdf
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AB 925 Ta, R 
 

Vehicle 
removal: 
expired 
registration. 

07/21/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

07/21/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 92, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

07/21/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law authorizes a peace officer or a regularly employed and salaried employee who is 
engaged in directing traffic or enforcing parking laws and regulations to remove a vehicle that, 
among other things, is parked or left standing upon a highway for 72 or more consecutive hours in 
violation of a local ordinance authorizing removal or is found or operated upon a highway, public 
land, or an offstreet parking facility with a registration expiration date in excess of six months 
before the date it is found or operated. This bill would require a peace officer or a regularly 
employed and salaried employee who is engaged in directing traffic or enforcing parking laws and 
regulations to verify, using available Department of Motor Vehicles records, that no current 
registration exists for a vehicle before removing the vehicle. The bill would prohibit a vehicle from 
being removed if it has a current registration on file with the department or if the officer or 
employee does not have immediate access to the department’s records. By requiring a higher 
level of service from law enforcement officers, this bill would impose a state-mandated local 
program.   (Based on  07/21/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 929 McKinnor, D 
 

Alcoholic 
beverage 
licenses: off-
sale privileges: 
airports. 

02/14/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would authorize an airport operator, as defined, to permit or prohibit the sale of alcoholic 
beverages for off-sale consumption by the holder of an on-sale license located in an airport 
terminal. If so permitted, the bill would authorize the on-sale licensee to sell alcoholic beverages 
for off-sale consumption in the airport terminal subject to specified requirements, including that the 
license permits on-sale consumption of the type of alcohol being sold for off-sale consumption. 
The bill would require the licensee to notify the department before selling any alcoholic beverages 
for off-sale consumption in the airport terminal. The bill would authorize the department to impose 
conditions on a licensee selling alcoholic beverages under these provisions and would permit a 
licensee to petition the department to modify or remove a condition within 10 days following 
imposition of the condition, as provided.   (Based on  02/14/2023 text) 

AB 929 - 
Support_04.07.2
3.pdf 

Support 

AB 930 Friedman, D 
 

Local 
government: 
infrastructure 
financing 
districts: 
Reinvestment 
in Infrastructure 
for a 
Sustainable 
and Equitable 
California 
(RISE) districts: 
housing 
development: 
restrictive 
covenants. 

06/13/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/5/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law authorizes certain local agencies to form a community revitalization authority within a 
community revitalization and investment area, as described, and authorizes an authority to, among 
other things, provide for low- and moderate-income housing and issue bonds, as provided. Current 
law authorizes a community revitalization and investment plan to provide for the division of taxes 
within the plan area. This bill would authorize the legislative bodies of 2 or more specified local 
governments to jointly form a Reinvestment in Infrastructure for a Sustainable and Equitable 
California district (RISE district) in accordance with specified procedures. The bill would require at 
least one of the local governments to be a city or county within the proposed RISE district 
boundaries. The bill would authorize a local government that lacks the authority to levy a property 
tax to join a RISE district, by resolution, as specified. The bill would prohibit a RISE district from 
including territory within the jurisdiction of a participating local government unless the city or county 
where the territory is located is also a participating local government.   (Based on  06/13/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=/ohaIAuWGJ2kBiF/MuRXxOOZDdncRIRi6vuCCh48i2FTqumQz1u7/v5Y9+p7XbblDdFpbUtEFEmeC0mDvd3sCh1njcY6JM+RqJ2XHchJ6gw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/453
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0901-0950/ab_925_97_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0901-0950/ab_925_97_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Yd8D2HYIPXHJd1VjHSGsriXcYQW85RJOEAbBPLevOq+mERExjBJcHsJ5v8E/UJ4yvkZmbHimdx3sZ/gD7C2wmQgtg0Tzs3vt1iJ2NLoXXl4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/380
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0901-0950/ab_929_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0901-0950/ab_929_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=0CF03DAE-0133-4C8A-933E-8222B90705B5
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=0CF03DAE-0133-4C8A-933E-8222B90705B5
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=0CF03DAE-0133-4C8A-933E-8222B90705B5
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=b0Ek9ehfxJd4WlGLjPqITboJxl8gdVnWFwS3jR+sftjNv0zXuROMQwRGY446FFbmX4WLIWDNWNpyabxwpsUdYE1PosdQ2ChRJTr+4Jt5h84=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/445
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0901-0950/ab_930_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0901-0950/ab_930_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0901-0950/ab_930_94_A_bill.pdf
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AB 939 Pellerin, D 
 

Santa Clara 
Valley Water 
District. 

09/08/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
170, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

09/08/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Santa Clara Valley Water District Act creates the Santa Clara Valley Water District, and 
authorizes the district to provide for the conservation and management of flood, storm, and 
recycled waters, and other waters, for beneficial uses and to enhance natural resources in 
connection with carrying out the purposes of the district. The act authorizes the district to levy ad 
valorem taxes or assessments in the district to pay the general administrative costs and expenses 
of the district, to carry out the act’s objects or purposes, and to pay the costs and expenses of 
constructing or extending works within the district. The act additionally authorizes the district to 
levy taxes or assessments upon all property or all real property within a portion of the district for 
specified purposes. The act authorizes the district to issue bonds for specified purposes, and 
requires that the bonds be paid by revenue derived from those tax levies and assessments, except 
the ad valorem taxes or assessments. This bill would additionally authorize the district to use the 
revenues from the ad valorem taxes or assessments to pay for the bonds.    (Based 
on  09/08/2023 text) 

AB 939 - 
Support_03.23.2
3.pdf 

Support 

AB 965 Carrillo, Juan, 
D 
 

Local 
government: 
broadband 
permit 
applications. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
553, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/09/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Permit Streamlining Act governs the approval process that a city or county is required to 
follow when approving, among other things, a permit for construction or reconstruction for a 
development project for a wireless telecommunications facility and a collocation or siting 
application for a wireless telecommunications facility. This bill, except as specified, would require a 
local agency to undertake batch broadband permit processing, as defined, upon receiving 2 or 
more broadband permit applications for substantially similar broadband project sites submitted at 
the same time by the same applicant, within a presumptively reasonable time, as defined. The bill 
would define “local agency” for these purposes to mean a city, county, city and county, charter city, 
special district, or publicly owned utility, other than certain publicly owned electric utilities. If a local 
agency does not approve those broadband permit applications for substantially similar broadband 
project sites and issue permits, or reject the applications and notify the applicants, within the 
presumptively reasonable time or longer period permitted under applicable law, the bill would 
require that all of those permits be deemed approved.   (Based on  10/08/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 971 Lee, D 
 

Vehicles: 
transit-only 
traffic lanes. 

10/10/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/10/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
672, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/10/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law prohibits a person from operating a motor vehicle, or stopping, parking, or leaving a 
vehicle standing, on a portion of the highway designated for the exclusive use of public transit 
buses, subject to specified exceptions. Current law also requires a public transit agency, with the 
agreement of the agency with jurisdiction over the highway, to place and maintain signs and traffic 
control devices indicating that a portion of a highway is designated for the exclusive use of public 
transit buses, as specified. This bill would instead make these provisions applicable to transit-only 
traffic lanes. The bill would define transit-only traffic lanes as any designated transit-only lane on 
which use is restricted to mass transit vehicles, or other designated vehicles including taxis and 
vanpools, during posted times.    (Based on  10/10/2023 text) 

AB 971 - 
Support_05.25.2
3.pdf 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=pPKr/lGt0qJIUcVkHbFwYpY5T79t8QBioO4BEkNwqjRjpEKzncjbYSAfnivEhbY3aEBFSrEgCWEcDD0wg4e6qVHs5MNRNe4ZkWQh71RcIQw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/438
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0901-0950/ab_939_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0901-0950/ab_939_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=8C0A7C9D-D302-4E14-9584-5F4359746E36
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=8C0A7C9D-D302-4E14-9584-5F4359746E36
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=8C0A7C9D-D302-4E14-9584-5F4359746E36
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=mfy7W2616EozBEOpY27grKzhsnq8FodAye2ZoHzl8y8I+JA9X6vb4cprov3WonXWJ5Hurr8RnVeS6+vX++BUr8hqC5ZVRcU9qmnVRWqZ9ws=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/474
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/474
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0951-1000/ab_965_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0951-1000/ab_965_92_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=tFH66uKUDcTCFSE5Ss690A9/gpHjLst6fKyQY+h3VL8mZZ7O/E3HZcutZNk1Lj1dotR/6n6XjioPJgLgP5d3bBL69EP0sdtGs0sSa9Kh+UQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/308
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0951-1000/ab_971_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0951-1000/ab_971_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=AD58BEA1-4E27-4737-B327-948EE6BB8539
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=AD58BEA1-4E27-4737-B327-948EE6BB8539
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=AD58BEA1-4E27-4737-B327-948EE6BB8539
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AB 972 Maienschein, 
D 
 

Local 
Assistance and 
Grant Program 
Streamlining 
Workgroup. 

06/29/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
7/10/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law establishes the Office of Planning and Research in the Governor’s office for the 
purpose of serving the Governor and the Governor’s cabinet as staff for long-range planning and 
research and constituting the comprehensive state planning agency. This bill would require the 
Office of Planning and Research, in consultation with the League of California Cities, the California 
State Association of Counties, and the California Special Districts Association, to convene a 
statewide, cross-agency Local Assistance and Grant Program Streamlining Workgroup, no later 
than January 1, 2025, to centralize local assistance and develop a coordinated system to manage 
available state and federal funding to deliver the maximum number of projects as efficiently as 
possible. The bill would require the Office of Planning and Research to appoint the workgroup 
members, as specified. The bill would require the workgroup to develop a report that includes the 
workgroup’s findings, plans, and recommendations for short-term, medium-term, and long-term 
goals, as specified, no later than June 30, 2026.   (Based on  06/29/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 976 Ting, D 
 

Accessory 
dwelling units: 
owner-
occupancy 
requirements. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
751, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires a local ordinance to require an accessory dwelling unit to be either attached 
to, or located within, the proposed or existing primary dwelling, as specified, or detached from the 
proposed or existing primary dwelling and located on the same lot as the proposed or existing 
primary dwelling. Current law authorizes a local agency to require an accessory dwelling unit to be 
used for rentals of terms longer than 30 days. This bill, instead, would authorize a local agency to 
require terms that are 30 days or longer.    (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

AB 976 
SUPPORT_18Ap
ril23 

Support 

AB 980 Friedman, D 
 

Active 
Transportation 
Program: 
report. 

03/13/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law establishes the Active Transportation Program in the Department of Transportation for 
the purpose of encouraging increased use of active modes of transportation, such as biking and 
walking. Current law requires the California Transportation Commission to develop guidelines and 
project selection criteria for the program and authorizes the commission to amend the adopted 
guidelines after conducting at least one public hearing. This bill would require an applicant that 
receives funding under the program for a project to, within one year of completing the project, 
submit a report to the commission describing how the project met active transportation 
goals.   (Based on  03/13/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 990 Grayson, D 
 

Water quality: 
waste 
discharge 
requirements: 
infill housing 
projects. 

01/25/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
6/17/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Under current law, the State Water Resources Control Board and the 9 California regional water 
quality control boards regulate water quality and prescribe waste discharge requirements in 
accordance with the federal National Pollutant Discharge Elimination System (NPDES) permit 
program established by the federal Clean Water Act and the act. This bill would require the 
regional water board, defined to mean the regional water board with geographic boundaries for the 
San Francisco Bay region, to, by July 1, 2025, initiate modifications to its waste discharge 
requirements, as specified. The bill would require these modifications to be completed within 6 
months of initiation. Before finalizing the modifications, the bill would require the regional water 
board to make specified findings, including, among other things, that concerns regarding the 
potential impacts of the draft NPDES permit requirements on the development of housing on infill 
sites have been adequately addressed. The bill would make these provisions inoperative on July 
1, 2028, and would repeal them on January 1, 2029.    (Based on  01/25/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=d4g5l/oKPgDNrasgm2ErRKI2mD8mDbyis7qmKqdbSXPTFz/Wu5cdpyc0Wyc8K2hjZIRrcZioh635x43k3dgGgYp8hy11QoBlwfW0Ox3yuFM=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/388
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/388
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0951-1000/ab_972_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0951-1000/ab_972_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0951-1000/ab_972_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=08VbEmcHPb1LdW7NuK95l11UAs62qCsKWbaIcfiIhVkgPj8uYoL6vtVF3Dl57hSuwNUBA3IXx9S4e5Y6Lx0izFudRO89Z9i+JECKPNXejm0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/360
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0951-1000/ab_976_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0951-1000/ab_976_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=6369540E-A789-4298-804A-A92E4D6EC3DF
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=6369540E-A789-4298-804A-A92E4D6EC3DF
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=6369540E-A789-4298-804A-A92E4D6EC3DF
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=M2D7jZW84OqZFoAdNqSpH7ODnjGn/6FrO+SyUgKJrizMnr8nBbeAdw73vCu3U/M8UDKBV2U0lV7Wa5az+xOuuMluBeim4DLENHd0cO7qpEM=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/445
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0951-1000/ab_980_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0951-1000/ab_980_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0951-1000/ab_980_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=q2DLmhfzB5FE+wuO6+FYSokwej+YjJjJfDJWWJgwcvgjEGMdgettQvgJZY4iPGIxD33/MGi6Ik1iq3uGRBJZvdZv34K8mcNswvmf2oBPVxs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/433
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0951-1000/ab_990_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0951-1000/ab_990_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0951-1000/ab_990_95_A_bill.pdf


Attachment B: 2023-2024 Intergovernmental Relations Priority State Legislation Log 
 

Last Updated 12/06/24        57 
 

Measure Author Topic Current 
Text 

Status Location Brief Summary Attachments Position 

AB 994 Jackson, D 
 

Law 
enforcement: 
social media. 

09/23/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/23/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
224, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

09/23/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law prohibits a police department or sheriff's office from sharing, on social media, booking 
photos of an individual arrested on suspicion of committing a nonviolent crime, as defined, unless 
specified circumstances exist. Current law requires a police department or sheriff's office that 
shares, on social media, a booking photo of an individual arrested for the suspected commission 
of a nonviolent crime to remove the information from its social media page, upon request, unless 
the same specified circumstances exist. Current law also requires a police department or sheriff's 
office to remove the booking photo of a person who has committed any other crime from social 
media if the individual's record has been sealed, the individual's conviction has been dismissed, 
expunged, pardoned, or eradicated, the individual has been issued a certificate of rehabilitation, 
the individual is found not guilty of committing the crime for which they were arrested, or the 
individual was ultimately not charged with the crime or the charges were dismissed. With respect 
to an individual who has been arrested for any crime, this bill would require a police department or 
sheriff's office, upon posting a booking photo on social media, to use the name and pronouns 
given by the individual arrested. The bill would authorize a police department or sheriff's office to 
use other legal names or known aliases of an individual in limited specified 
circumstances.    (Based on  09/23/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1000 Reyes, D 
 

Qualifying 
logistics use 
projects. 

01/03/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would prohibit the County of Riverside, the County of San Bernardino, any city located within 
those counties, and the agencies, boards, or commissions, charter cities, joint powers authorities, 
regional agencies, public districts, and redevelopment agencies, and any other political 
subdivisions located within those counties, from approving the development or expansion of any 
qualifying logistics use, as defined, within 1,000 feet of sensitive receptors, as defined, except as 
provided. The bill would authorize a public agency, as defined, to approve the development or 
expansion of a qualifying logistics use greater than 500 feet from a sensitive receptor and within 
1,000 feet of a sensitive receptor only if the qualifying logistics use complies with certain 
requirements, including that all heavy-duty vehicles domiciled onsite meet certain requirements. 
The bill would require these minimum setback measurements to be made from the property line of 
the sensitive receptor to the property line of the qualifying logistics use by using a straight-line 
method.   (Based on  01/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1033 Ting, D 
 

Accessory 
dwelling units: 
local 
ordinances: 
separate sale 
or conveyance. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
752, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Planning and Zoning Law authorizes a local agency, by ordinance or ministerial approval, to 
provide for the creation of accessory dwelling units in areas zoned for residential use, as specified. 
Current law requires the ordinance to include specified standards, including prohibiting the 
accessory dwelling unit from being sold or otherwise conveyed separate from the primary 
residence, except as provided by a specified law. Current law, notwithstanding the prohibition 
described above, requires a local agency to allow an accessory dwelling unit to be sold or 
conveyed separately from the primary residence to a qualified buyer if certain conditions are met, 
including that the property was built or developed by a qualified nonprofit corporation and that the 
property is held pursuant to a recorded tenancy in common agreement that meets specified 
requirements. This bill would, in addition, authorize a local agency to adopt a local ordinance to 
allow the separate conveyance of the primary dwelling unit and accessory dwelling unit or units as 
condominiums, as specified, and would make conforming changes.    (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

AB 1033 
SUPPORT_27M
arch23 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=yhnTtILh+XllLRb+ZDHTrlB2R6F7bmtb2ubCL/mV3gm/bQsqXiHJKHKuBBw7xnNCKz74vbQ9U7B5YpwxTwFs13gy1BS4yjTVjsaPs59eSow=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/379
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0951-1000/ab_994_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0951-1000/ab_994_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=nGXao/xItzXpMDH3ZQ46mEa6TB3oq6UUIfiSKw59/WBYkPjyxbQI/QvclMBXvTdLUkZhb6BMxFZWy7/OKV+LQ2eh7F2/ftGNNhprmS4QWos=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/374
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0951-1000/ab_1000_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0951-1000/ab_1000_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0951-1000/ab_1000_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ef5EbgquSG5Xhz5uqPp+nOJcoqpgwOYdSpnTNOZPQkSKc0O6t+I85RUZsyJ5nTeeDn41PgXVco7xeRu21hhotXYL25KGmTvq6gtmjCPyxlU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/360
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1001-1050/ab_1033_90_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1001-1050/ab_1033_90_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=09C8488F-8318-478C-BA5F-D7C92D8EC934
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=09C8488F-8318-478C-BA5F-D7C92D8EC934
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=09C8488F-8318-478C-BA5F-D7C92D8EC934
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AB 1034 Grayson, D 
 

Labor Code 
Private 
Attorneys 
General Act of 
2004: 
exemption: 
construction 
industry 
employees. 

09/28/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/28/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
803, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/28/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Labor Code Private Attorneys General Act of 2004 (PAGA) exempts, until January 1, 2028, 
from its provisions an employee in the construction industry with respect to work performed under 
a valid collective bargaining agreement in effect any time before January 1, 2025, that expressly 
provides for the wages, hours of work, and working conditions of employees, premium wage rates 
for all overtime hours worked, and for the employee to receive a regular hourly pay rate of not less 
than 30% more than the state minimum wage rate, and does certain things, including prohibits all 
of the violations of the Labor Code that would be redressable pursuant to PAGA and provides for a 
grievance and binding arbitration procedure to redress those violations. This bill would delete the 
January 1, 2025, date described above and would extend the sunset of the exemption described 
above until January 1, 2038.   (Based on  09/28/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1046 Lowenthal, D 
 

Alquist-Priolo 
Earthquake 
Fault Zoning 
Act: 
exemptions. 

10/13/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/13/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
825, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/13/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Under the Alquist-Priolo Earthquake Fault Zoning Act, before approving a project within an 
earthquake fault zone, a city or county is directed to require the preparation of a geologic report, 
subject to certain exceptions. This bill would revise and recast the exemptions from the act to, 
among other things, exempt (1) projects for the alteration of any structure for human occupancy if 
the value of the alteration does not exceed 50% of the appraised value of the structure and, if the 
alteration results in a change in the use or occupancy of the structure, the change does not 
authorize a greater human occupant load and is less hazardous, based on life and fire risk, than 
the existing authorized use or occupancy of the structure permitted by the city or county with 
jurisdiction over the structure and (2) projects for alterations that include seismic retrofitting of 
certain types of structures for human occupancy permitted under specified prior editions of the 
Uniform Building Code.    (Based on  10/13/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1053 Gabriel, D 
 

Housing 
programs: 
multifamily 
housing 
programs: 
expenditure of 
loan proceeds. 

09/19/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/19/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
264, 
Statutes of 
2024 

09/19/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law establishes the Department of Housing and Community Development and requires it 
to administer various programs intended to promote the development of housing, including the 
Multifamily Housing Program, pursuant to which the department provides financial assistance in 
the form of deferred payment loans to pay for the eligible costs of development of specified types 
of housing projects. Current law sets forth various general powers of the department in 
implementing these programs, including authorizing the department to enter into long-term 
contracts or agreements of up to 30 years for the purpose of servicing loans or grants or enforcing 
regulatory agreements or other security documents. The Administrative Procedure Act sets forth 
procedures a state agency is required to follow when adopting, amending, or repealing any 
regulation, including providing public notice and time for public comment, with exceptions for 
emergency regulations in the case of a situation that calls for immediate action to avoid serious 
harm to the public peace, health, safety, or general welfare. This bill would authorize a borrower to 
use any funds approved, reserved, or allocated by the department following the effective date of 
specified guidelines and for purposes of providing a loan under specified multifamily housing 
programs, including the Multifamily Housing Program, or any additional multifamily housing lending 
program that the department elects, for construction financing, permanent financing, or a 
combination of construction financing and permanent financing, as provided. The bill would require 
the department, by July 1, 2026, to adopt guidelines as emergency regulations to, among other 
things, implement these provisions. The bill would also require the department, by January 1, 
2027, to adopt guidelines, in accordance with the rulemaking provisions of the Administrative 
Procedure Act, to, among other things, implement these provisions.   (Based on  09/19/2024 text) 

AB 
1053_SUPPORT
15May23 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=RJMgMLVXi+2c36HkwUsXn1/fY7e8X2/2mzGoC3gqumP2lekh+ILA2EIkf6QzpG18nzxW9J+RBGGkk5W27IhgEnky6BwxjuGwyyA+61G2yps=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/433
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1001-1050/ab_1034_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1001-1050/ab_1034_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=cAveiP08F6M8iH7in3rt4oWYuDANr+4G8FpbrCqoD1TqHf5RZ7TxukkKw+LpPj9M2G1zo857Fxe4n8jIfm608HuD9MXU35Hg7sb5w7/uX14=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/385
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1001-1050/ab_1046_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1001-1050/ab_1046_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=1RlU3CMOrFH5B/iISRM5rlSMpwX+H69TIoXYDbHS9rCMHopyNbQctSIH9b/Af0xn4X26kz0CYUrMqDdYHyt1yzPnJXXI83FCrBA2BOIEVA8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/371
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1051-1100/ab_1053_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1051-1100/ab_1053_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=0E1714C5-A862-4EC4-8D3C-889E38923E25
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=0E1714C5-A862-4EC4-8D3C-889E38923E25
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=0E1714C5-A862-4EC4-8D3C-889E38923E25
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AB 1064 Low, D 
 

Hate crimes. 03/23/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law defines “hate crime” as a criminal act committed, in whole or in part, because of actual 
or perceived characteristics of the victim, including, among other things, race, religion, disability, 
and sexual orientation. This bill would, instead, define a hate crime as a criminal act that is 
motivated in whole or in part by a bias against one or more of the protected characteristics. The bill 
would define “bias against” and would specify that evidence of bias motivation may include, among 
other things, instances when the person has selectively targeted the victim based on the actual or 
perceived characteristic of the victim.   (Based on  03/23/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1082 Kalra, D 
 

Authority to 
remove 
vehicles. 

08/23/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
INACTIVE 
FILE on 
8/31/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law authorizes a peace officer, as defined, or a regularly employed and salaried employee, 
who is engaged in directing traffic or enforcing parking laws and regulations, of a city, county, or 
jurisdiction of a state agency in which a vehicle is located, to remove a vehicle located within the 
territorial limits in which the officer or employee may act, under designated circumstances, 
including, but not limited to, when a vehicle is found upon a highway or public land or removed 
pursuant to the Vehicle Code, and has been issued 5 or more notices of parking violations to 
which the owner or person in control of the vehicle has not responded within a designated time 
period. Under current law, a vehicle that has been removed and impounded under those 
circumstances that is not released may be subject to a lien sale to compensate for the costs of 
towage and for caring for and keeping safe the vehicle. This bill would delete the authority of a 
peace officer or public employee, as appropriate, to remove a vehicle under these circumstances. 
The bill would delete the related authority to conduct a lien sale to cover towing and storage 
expenses, except as specified.   (Based on  08/23/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1085 Maienschein, 
D 
 

Medi-Cal: 
housing 
support 
services. 

10/07/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

01/25/2024 - 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto stricken 
from file.  

10/07/2023 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Current law, subject to implementation of the California Advancing and Innovating Medi-Cal 
(CalAIM) initiative, authorizes a Medi-Cal managed care plan to elect to cover community supports 
approved by the department as cost effective and medically appropriate in a comprehensive risk 
contract that are in lieu of applicable Medi-Cal state plan services. Under current law, community 
supports that the department is authorized to approve include, among other things, housing 
transition navigation services, housing deposits, and housing tenancy and sustaining services. 
Existing law, subject to an appropriation, requires the department to complete an independent 
analysis to determine whether network adequacy exists to obtain federal approval for a covered 
Medi-Cal benefit that provides housing support services. Current law requires that the analysis 
take into consideration specified information, including the number of providers in relation to each 
region’s or county’s number of people experiencing homelessness. Current law requires the 
department to report the outcomes of the analysis to the Legislature by January 1, 2024. This bill 
would delete the requirement for the department to complete that analysis, and instead would 
make housing support services for specified populations a covered Medi-Cal benefit when the 
department has begun a specified evaluation required under the CalAIM Waiver Special Terms 
and Conditions, and the Legislature has made an appropriation for purposes of the housing 
support services. The bill would require the department to seek federal approval for the housing 
support services benefit, as specified. Under the bill, subject to an appropriation by the Legislature, 
a Medi-Cal beneficiary would be eligible for those services if they either experience homelessness 
or are at risk of homelessness. Under the bill, the services would include housing transition and 
navigation services, housing deposits, and housing tenancy and sustaining services, as 
defined.   (Based on  09/18/2023 text) 

AB 1085 
SUPPORT_18M
ay23 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=umCei5PnyfXAiC8HlkvgUPSfRwUQyZQp4rSORFqiU5w6qbU0tiRnl932n8Zmh8UYKjjFf/i9vRrPSJgNytrwfIGk2AWCMJtE/eZ3nFnaRCE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/437
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1051-1100/ab_1064_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1051-1100/ab_1064_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1051-1100/ab_1064_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=6UzESmojKXM5wQH2dw2DAgkU30mgzLbVxUtunK4d67L9FOUn5zkncwvwftzn3AWBEfWQ+PED6CoTN9ssvYuEiFo7UfUb5ifpPOfkOGtCAfA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/436
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1051-1100/ab_1082_92_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1051-1100/ab_1082_92_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1051-1100/ab_1082_92_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=8B3kyagSbW2xSVuJu5NdtEIaT5jIy8jhlFasWGtjh12DNKdCQ4eeJ+VGJTSSucP68cPslmp6D4UN3SNFHJWadHfmWR9Sfqc+6dUga6e+av4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/388
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/388
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1051-1100/ab_1085_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1051-1100/ab_1085_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1051-1100/ab_1085_94_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=02D4B73C-D1F8-4973-84D0-A55F0CA763EA
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=02D4B73C-D1F8-4973-84D0-A55F0CA763EA
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=02D4B73C-D1F8-4973-84D0-A55F0CA763EA
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AB 1100 Low, D 
 

State 
employees: 
workweek. 

01/03/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would require the Government Operations Agency, in consultation with the Department of Human 
Resources, to evaluate how a 4-day workweek, including, but not limited to, a 32-hour workweek, 
can be implemented for state employees to improve their quality of work, health, and lifestyle. The 
bill would require the Government Operations Agency, on or before January 1, 2026, to prepare 
and submit to the Legislature a report on its evaluation, as prescribed.   (Based on  01/03/2024 
text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1111 Pellerin, D 
 

Cannabis: 
small producer 
event sales 
license. 

09/29/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/29/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
Governor. 

09/29/2024 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

The Control, Regulate and Tax Adult Use of Marijuana Act (AUMA), an initiative measure 
approved as Proposition 64 at the November 8, 2016, statewide general election, authorizes a 
person who obtains a state license under AUMA to engage in commercial adult-use cannabis 
activity pursuant to that license and applicable local ordinances. The Medicinal and Adult-Use 
Cannabis Regulation and Safety Act (MAUCRSA), among other things, consolidates the licensure 
and regulation of commercial medicinal and adult-use cannabis activities and requires the 
Department of Cannabis Control to administer its provisions. Under MAUCRSA, the Department of 
Cannabis Control has sole authority to license and regulate commercial cannabis activity, which 
MAUCRSA defines to include, among other activities, the sale of cannabis and cannabis products. 
MAUCRSA authorizes the issuance of a state temporary event license to a licensee authorizing 
onsite cannabis sales to, and consumption by, persons 21 years of age or older at certain venues 
expressly approved by a local jurisdiction, as specified. MAUCRSA requires a licensee who 
submits an application for a state temporary event license to provide to the department a list of all 
licensees that will be providing onsite sales of cannabis or cannabis products at the event. This bill 
would require the department, no later than January 1, 2026, to issue small producer event sales 
licenses that authorize the licenseholder to sell cannabis or cannabis products, containing 
cannabis cultivated by that licensee, at state temporary events licensed under the act, and would 
require the department to charge each small producer event sales licensee a licensing fee, as 
specified. The bill would authorize a licensee who holds a valid annual state cultivation license and 
a valid license, permit, or other authorization for cannabis cultivation issued by a local jurisdiction, 
and who meets specified other requirements, to apply for a small producer event sales license. 
The bill would require a small producer event sales licensee to comply with all requirements 
imposed on licensees selling cannabis or cannabis products at a state temporary event, unless 
otherwise specified. The bill would prohibit the retail sales of cannabis and cannabis products 
made by a small producer event sales licensee at state temporary events from exceeding 
$175,000 in gross revenue per year, and would authorize the department, beginning July 1, 2027, 
to increase this cap by regulation after reevaluating the cap, as provided.   (Based on  08/31/2024 
text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=kji6GWcfA0tCVG0XEVdBfPgR4HnASauU7Cs3Y9ELuwYB0S6U/DbwW/llXjWsP8m5me6eRQTciBln+nQICdwD7JJzogme8T/LiqaFcqt9srI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/437
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1051-1100/ab_1100_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1051-1100/ab_1100_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1051-1100/ab_1100_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=jLrLWe1tHF0CA7/GZXlvwnmM1doExpBAPAwCXhIlbvSdGbrnOWOuQWI4uz5BOYSskhs4TCaNtG6T3LGiwdJV2Ye/iEIB7I4TwQhvWVFfVbI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/438
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1101-1150/ab_1111_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1101-1150/ab_1111_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1101-1150/ab_1111_94_E_bill.pdf
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AB 1114 Haney, D 
 

Planning and 
zoning: housing 
development 
projects: 
postentitlement 
phase permits. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
753, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law relating to housing development approval requires a local agency to compile a list of 
information needed to approve or deny a postentitlement phase permit, to post an example of a 
complete, approved application and an example of a complete set of postentitlement phase 
permits for at least 5 types of housing development projects in the jurisdiction, as specified, and to 
make those items available to all applicants for these permits no later than January 1, 2024. 
Current law defines “postentitlement phase permit” to include all nondiscretionary permits and 
reviews filed after the entitlement process has been completed that are required or issued by the 
local agency to begin construction of a development that is intended to be at least 2/3 residential, 
excluding discretionary and ministerial planning permits, entitlements, and certain other permits 
and reviews. These permits include, but are not limited to, building permits and all 
interdepartmental review required for the issuance of a building permit, permits for minor or 
standard off-site improvements, permits for demolition, and permits for minor or standard 
excavation and grading. This bill would modify the definition of “postentitlement phase permit” to 
also include all building permits and other permits issued under the California Building Standards 
Code or any applicable local building code for the construction, demolition, or alteration of 
buildings, whether discretionary or nondiscretionary.   (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1133 Schiavo, D 
 

Firearms: 
concealed 
carry licenses. 

06/29/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/9/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law authorizes the sheriff of a county or the chief or other head of a municipal police 
department of any city or city and county to issue a license to carry a concealed firearm to an 
applicant for that license if the applicant is of good moral character, good cause exists for issuance 
of the license, the applicant meets specified residency requirements, and the applicant has 
completed a specified course of training, acceptable to the licensing authority. Current law requires 
the course of training to be no less than 8 hours, include instruction on firearm handling and 
shooting technique, as specified, and to include live-fire exercises conducted on a firing range. 
Current law provides that, for license renewal applicants, the course of training may be any course 
acceptable to the licensing authority, must be no less than 4 hours, and must meet the above-
described requirements. This bill would, on and after July 1, 2026, require the Department of 
Justice to develop, evaluate, update, maintain, and publish a standardized curricula for a license to 
carry a concealed firearm. The bill would require the department to create a standardized test, as 
specified, and to make that test available on a web portal. The bill would require an applicant to 
submit proof of passing that examination as part of an application to carry a concealed firearm. 
The bill would authorize the department to charge a reasonable fee for taking the standardized 
test, and require that fee to be used, upon appropriation by the Legislature, for the service, 
maintenance, and administration of the web portal for the test.    (Based on  06/29/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=7bnIHu7xi7dA3/QjZUbQqXAAYvj9hbhPIe5PqHwX7RZ0FiTkwpwNasGNZUGrbpBf8m8fhqXy77qwiGsdPSw35x1Gj3csvlCwGBj2+iyFEGw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/503
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1101-1150/ab_1114_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1101-1150/ab_1114_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=elpDRjOSFoIufSUJ16eBqwVKEDDdWbTPMdi5zFRkquPZllcoOQ7dMrbtHh3usjMsl6NOu0rZ1ehF29ALncwyosIEIehLhkDhgqo8++n/W7c=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/441
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1101-1150/ab_1133_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1101-1150/ab_1133_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1101-1150/ab_1133_96_A_bill.pdf
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AB 1142 Fong, Mike, D 
 

Community 
colleges: costs 
for using 
facilities or 
grounds. 

09/22/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/22/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
349, 
Statutes of 
2024 

09/22/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law authorizes the governing board of a community college district to grant without charge, 
except as otherwise provided, the use of any college facilities or grounds under its control, when 
an alternative location is not available, to nonprofit organizations and clubs and associations 
organized for athletic activities for youth, charitable purposes, educational purposes, or the civic 
well-being of the community. Current law authorizes the governing board of a community college 
district to charge an amount not to exceed its direct costs or not to exceed the fair rental value of 
college facilities and grounds under its control for activities other than those described above, as 
specified. Until January 1, 2025, current law describes “direct costs” as including the share of the 
costs of supplies, utilities, janitorial services, services of any other community college district 
employees, and salaries paid to community college district employees to operate and maintain 
college facilities or grounds that is proportional to the organization’s use of the college facilities 
and grounds, and the share of the costs for maintenance, repair, restoration, and refurbishment, 
proportional to the use of the college facilities or grounds by the organization, except for certain 
organizations. Commencing January 1, 2025, existing law describes “direct costs” as including the 
costs of supplies, utilities, janitorial services, services of any other community college district 
employees, and salaries paid to community college district employees necessitated by the 
organization’s use of the college facilities and grounds. This bill would extend those dates by 5 
years.   (Based on  09/22/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1159 Aguiar-Curry, 
D 
 

California 
Global 
Warming 
Solutions Act of 
2006: natural 
and working 
lands: market-
based 
compliance 
mechanisms. 

10/07/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/07/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
358, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/07/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The California Global Warming Solutions Act of 2006 requires the State Air Resources Board to 
ensure that statewide greenhouse gas emissions are reduced to at least 40% below the 1990 level 
by 2030. The act declares the policy of the state to achieve net zero greenhouse gas emissions as 
soon as possible, but no later than 2045, and to achieve and maintain net negative greenhouse 
gas emissions thereafter. The act requires the state board to prepare and approve a scoping plan 
for achieving the maximum technologically feasible and cost-effective reductions in greenhouse 
gas emissions and to update the scoping plan at least once every 5 years. This bill would instead 
require the state board to additionally ensure that all greenhouse gas emissions reductions and 
removals used for any market-based compliance mechanism are in addition to any reductions and 
removals that would otherwise occur.   (Based on  10/07/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1168 Bennett, D 
 

Emergency 
medical 
services 
(EMS): 
prehospital 
EMS. 

09/28/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/28/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
Governor. 

09/28/2024 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Current law requires a county to enter into a written agreement with a city or fire district that 
contracted for or provided prehospital EMS as of June 1, 1980. Current law requires, until that 
written agreement is reached, prehospital EMS to be continued at not less than the existing level 
and the administration of prehospital EMS by cities and fire districts contracting for or providing 
those services as of June 1, 1980, to be retained by those cities and fire districts. This bill would 
require a city to be treated as if it had retained its authorities regarding, and the administration of, 
prehospital EMS if specified requirements are met. If a joint powers agreement regarding 
prehospital EMS was initially executed on or after January 1, 2024, 2025, the bill would ensure a 
city or fire district retains its existing authorities regarding, and the administration of, prehospital 
EMS. The bill would set various conditions for a joint powers agreement, including, among other 
things, requiring uniform operational procedures for prehospital EMS throughout the EMS area or 
subarea covered by the agreement.   (Based on  08/29/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Kq5GmmN4mZLilaqRZZ1RvvAEXV7ZlmVvngq7k6xbbMfsHEpFKeEIL1GFT3FmpsMfyhWjkfmjZxz0qVFl1I71Z1W9IprEzictH+TOq06yo1A=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/501
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1101-1150/ab_1142_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1101-1150/ab_1142_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=FXzS6s/1hTOYs/5NHRZ57IQHEM/bOPTU4DJK0Rnnm9X3Us69NAZy64bSlpEWeMPq5RdYt3PhjkrviGiOh9FTDiGSyUycb7zrk5qy4ovVm3w=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/430
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/430
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1151-1200/ab_1159_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1151-1200/ab_1159_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=XqLuw0hCSrrT8HZijUd5tSL36+4X6R4AziAODoCnEpmElW2j7Uvezf46PP0UjJzRBBXxlKUY0tw0gp6HLW42+0hnmzvLud/kgQxnRiAa5X8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/368
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1151-1200/ab_1168_89_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1151-1200/ab_1168_89_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1151-1200/ab_1168_89_E_bill.pdf


Attachment B: 2023-2024 Intergovernmental Relations Priority State Legislation Log 
 

Last Updated 12/06/24        63 
 

Measure Author Topic Current 
Text 

Status Location Brief Summary Attachments Position 

AB 1176 Zbur, D 
 

General plans: 
Local 
Electrification 
Planning Act. 

05/29/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
E. U., & C. 
on 6/5/2024) 

07/02/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The Planning and Zoning Law requires a city or county to adopt a comprehensive general plan for 
the city’s or county’s physical development that includes various elements, including, among 
others, a land use element that designates the proposed general distribution and general location 
and extent of the uses of the land in specified categories, and a circulation element that identifies 
the location and extent of existing and proposed major thoroughfares, transportation routes, 
terminals, any military airports and ports, and other local public utilities and facilities, as specified. 
This bill, the Local Electrification Planning Act, would require a city, county, or city and county to 
prepare and adopt a specified plan, or otherwise integrate a plan into the general plan, that, 
among other things, identifies opportunities to expand electric vehicle charging to meet the needs 
of the city’s, county’s, or city and county’s current and future visitors, residents, and businesses, 
and includes policies and implementation measures that address the needs of disadvantaged 
communities, low-income households, and small businesses for investments in zero-emission 
technologies that directly benefit these groups, as specified. The bill would require a city, county, 
or city and county to adopt a specified plan, or otherwise integrate the plan into the general plan, 
on or after January 1, 2026, but no later than January 1, 2029.   (Based on  05/29/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1182 Petrie-Norris, 
D 
 

Energy: 
Decarbonizatio
n Funding Plan. 

06/20/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/14/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The California Climate Crisis Act declares that it is the policy of the state both to achieve net-zero 
greenhouse gas emissions as soon as possible, but no later than 2045, and achieve and maintain 
net-negative greenhouse gas emissions thereafter, and to ensure that by 2045, statewide 
anthropogenic greenhouse gas emissions are reduced to at least 85% below the 1990 levels. This 
bill would require the Department of Finance, in conjunction with the Governor’s Budget, to submit 
a decarbonization funding plan (plan) to the Joint Legislative Committee on Climate Change and to 
post the plan on its internet website. The bill would require the plan to, among other things, identify 
decarbonization opportunities to help the state reach its targets to reduce the effects of climate 
change and set out priorities for funding, suggest efficiencies distributing decarbonization funds, 
including expediting the application and award process, and provide recommendations on how to 
effectively align state decarbonization incentives and allocated general fund moneys with federal 
funds from the Inflation Reduction Act of 2022 and the Infrastructure Investment and Jobs Act. The 
bill would require, by July 1, 2024, the department to establish an internet web portal for purposes 
of identifying decarbonization funding opportunities with specified information. The bill would 
require GO-Biz to post a link to the internet web portal on its internet website.    (Based 
on  06/20/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1183 Holden, D 
 

Streamlined 
housing 
projects: 
construction 
permits: notice. 

03/14/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Planning and Zoning Law authorizes a development proponent to submit an application for a 
multifamily housing development that is subject to a streamlined, ministerial approval process, as 
provided, and not subject to a conditional use permit, if the development satisfies specified 
objective planning standards, including, among others, that the development is a multifamily 
housing development that contains 2 or more residential units and the development proponent 
commits to record, prior to the issuance of the first building permit, a land use restriction or 
covenant providing that any lower or moderate-income housing units remain available at 
affordable housing costs or rent to persons and families of lower or moderate income for no less 
than 55 years or 45 years, as specified. This bill, if a city or county approves a construction project 
through the expedited, streamlined permitting described above, would require the city or county to 
require the development proponent to place a sign of reasonable dimensions and design on the 
parcel in which the project is located that includes specified information, including the development 
proponent’s contact information, the construction permit numbers, and a brief project 
description.   (Based on  03/14/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=chV8/rZQ5LDpXDL3e//Nt6PTKtn8/QPIQjKPzG72hVTwPwo+uZOS3+EPuZCClolZnpne7jr7XpkD0OFHyx8H/BmS/PrQICuhTm4oInlYqDs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/468
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1151-1200/ab_1176_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1151-1200/ab_1176_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1151-1200/ab_1176_95_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=elRKkTB5FMb1zzUr2BWk7lN1Fv0vU8OaPl0lxGmPoe5rUo9pLxHLdE3r/Idj5Hxq3KerddnNEfZ+a1+aOoi9UYQo+SASLTwjDj0Wnff0400=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/454
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/454
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1151-1200/ab_1182_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1151-1200/ab_1182_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1151-1200/ab_1182_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=wY8izkcIn9eIdJb0u8BwJhXADG9ePZy0adLq3L7M/XBJfW23h/PEeiHtI2Ztvxd7xlMxGE8yL4oLWQ84/ILzw8cGJ6ZqV0Z5b+CVz7Jn47o=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/370
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1151-1200/ab_1183_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1151-1200/ab_1183_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1151-1200/ab_1183_98_A_bill.pdf
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AB 1188 Boerner, D 
 

Transportation: 
bicycle safety 
handbook. 

04/17/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would, upon appropriation by the Legislature, require the Transportation Agency to develop and 
distribute, on or before September 1, 2024, a bicycle safety handbook that includes information on, 
among other things, existing laws regulating bicycles and e-bikes, safety equipment, and sharing 
roads and bikeways with other users, as specified. The bill would require the agency to make a 
downloadable electronic version of the bicycle safety handbook available on the internet, as 
specified, and in print at all Department of Motor Vehicles offices, state libraries, Department of the 
California Highway Patrol offices, and other appropriate state offices. In developing the handbook, 
the bill would require collaboration and consultation between the agency and the Department of 
Motor Vehicles, the Department of the California Highway Patrol, the California Office of Traffic 
Safety, the Department of Transportation, and other relevant stakeholders, as specified.   (Based 
on  04/17/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1215 Carrillo, 
Wendy, D 
 

Pets 
Assistance 
With Support 
Grant Program: 
homeless 
shelters: 
domestic 
violence 
shelters: pets. 

10/07/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

01/30/2024 - 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto stricken 
from file.  

10/07/2023 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Would require the Department of Housing and Community Development, upon appropriation by 
the Legislature, to develop and administer the Pets Assistance With Support Grant Program 
(PAWS), to award grants to qualified homeless shelters and qualified domestic violence shelters, 
as defined. The bill would require grant recipients to meet certain availability and service 
requirements as they relate to the pets of people experiencing homelessness and people escaping 
domestic violence. The bill would authorize the department to use up to 7% of the funds 
appropriated in the annual Budget Act for those purposes for its costs in administering the 
program.   (Based on  09/18/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1217 Gabriel, D 
 

Business 
pandemic 
relief. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
569, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/09/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Alcoholic Beverage Control Act makes it unlawful for any person other than a licensee of the 
department to sell, manufacture, or import alcoholic beverages in this state, with exceptions. The 
department, pursuant to its powers and in furtherance of emergency declarations and orders of the 
Governor under the California Emergency Services Act regarding the spread of the COVID-19 
virus, established prescribed temporary relief measures to suspend certain legal restrictions 
relating to, among other things, the expansion of a licensed footprint, sales of alcoholic beverages 
to-go, and delivery privileges. Current law authorizes the department, for a period of 365 days 
following the end of the state of emergency proclaimed by the Governor on March 4, 2020, in 
response to the COVID-19 pandemic, to permit licensees to exercise license privileges in an 
expanded license area authorized pursuant to a COVID-19 Temporary Catering Authorization 
approved in accordance with the Fourth Notice of Regulatory Relief issued by the department, as 
specified. Existing law makes these provisions effective only until July 1, 2024, and repeals them 
as of that date. This bill, instead, would make those provisions operative only until July 1, 2026, 
repeal those provisions on that date, and make conforming changes.    (Based on  10/08/2023 
text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=xNNTmNMcQie1Rvm5ak9qxemHlMX3B1XVnFKvyJ1UDuzaizZtKGkbcT5FilsZBKDicwFMpcGJdd9t9HCsE1yalcxFTxaswJAArGJXr2g4qKk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/389
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1151-1200/ab_1188_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1151-1200/ab_1188_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1151-1200/ab_1188_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=HjyCEUbeRDDz1xzxWeBpDxWXqjrxk8RZJQrJFtcWBP2fl3HF+u8G6D2Ylrt5EQgvWjjJ3kxwdIl4GzfoFk5ttBKuVDx6v5Mmsavmv/6itbA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/411
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/411
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1201-1250/ab_1215_95_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1201-1250/ab_1215_95_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1201-1250/ab_1215_95_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Qt5tdh2X2TwnjZXNYzQrmubGD/2wwt88lo8ZMMjDacKA3oumJpIb1qqwri4hmk1LqwlEg3OpyInFMHUVs+HoNRASTFlwMmvkMmqp1OW+uwY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/371
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1201-1250/ab_1217_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1201-1250/ab_1217_94_C_bill.pdf
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AB 1237 Petrie-Norris, 
D 
 

Student 
financial aid: 
California 
Public Interest 
Veterinary Debt 
Relief Program. 

02/16/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would, upon appropriation by the Legislature, establish the California Public Interest Veterinary 
Debt Relief Program under the administration of the Student Aid Commission to award funds to 
California-licensed veterinarians, in relief of their educational loan debt, as defined, who enter into 
a contract with the commission to provide veterinary services in eligible premises settings, as 
defined, on a full-time basis, as specified. The bill, upon appropriation by the Legislature, would 
establish the California Public Interest Veterinary Debt Relief Program Fund as the initial 
depository of all moneys appropriated, donated, or otherwise received for the program and would 
require the commission to disburse moneys in the fund for purposes of the program, as provided. 
The bill would require the commission, on or before March 31, 2026, and each year thereafter, to 
submit a report to the Legislature that includes specified information on the program, including the 
number of applicants and program participants and the amount of funds expended for the 
program.   (Based on  02/16/2023 text) 

AB 1237 - 
Support_04.14.2
3.pdf 

Support 

AB 1238 Ward, D 
 

Hazardous 
waste: solar 
panels. 

06/10/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
RLS. on 
6/11/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Under current law, the purpose of the Electronic Waste Recycling Act of 2003 is to create a 
comprehensive and innovative system for the reuse, recycling, and proper and legal disposal of 
covered electronic devices, as defined, and provide incentives to design electronic devices that 
are less toxic, more recyclable, and that use recycled materials. Under current law, both the 
Department of Resources Recycling and Recovery (CalRecycle) and the Department of Toxic 
Substances Control (DTSC) administer the act and may adopt regulations to implement and 
enforce the act. The act requires a retailer selling a covered electronic device in this state to collect 
from a consumer at the time of retail sale a covered electronic waste recycling fee or covered 
battery-embedded waste recycling fee, as specified. The act defines “covered electronic device” to 
mean certain video display devices and battery-embedded products. The act requires all funds 
collected pursuant to the act to be deposited into subaccounts of the Electronic Waste Recovery 
and Recycling Account. The act continuously appropriates the funds in the subaccounts for 
specified purposes, including, but not limited to, paying covered electronic waste recycling fee 
refunds and making electronic waste recovery and recycling payments. Current law incorporates 
the act into the hazardous waste control laws, and a violation of the hazardous waste control laws 
is a crime. This bill, among other things, would add consumer-owned solar photovoltaic modules to 
the definition of covered electronic devices, thereby subjecting consumer-owned solar photovoltaic 
modules to the act, as specified. The bill, on and after January 1, 2030, would require a consumer 
or a service provider serving the consumer, including a developer or installer of a consumer-
owned solar photovoltaic system, to pay a consumer-owned solar photovoltaic module recycling 
fee in an amount determined by CalRecycle, as provided, upon the purchase of new consumer-
owned solar photovoltaic modules. The bill would require a retailer selling a consumer-owned solar 
photovoltaic module to collect a consumer-owned solar photovoltaic module recycling fee, as 
specified. The bill would require all funds collected from the consumer-owned solar photovoltaic 
module recycling fee to be deposited into the Consumer-Owned Solar Photovoltaic Module 
Recycling Fee Subaccount, which the bill would establish within the Electronic Waste Recovery 
and Recycling Account.   (Based on  06/10/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=qdOG0z+8W8vJhaebuLVmfsTi7pR4oURpC//iANmsDFcPnOg6WsCCAuTq4bRhalc9iuj+LLmK30g5p2fBuctiMbw2TKxuhlCj0H5aqNlY8kQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/454
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/454
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1201-1250/ab_1237_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1201-1250/ab_1237_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=9631EE1A-A56F-4DCF-9C2B-3F7FF67105FE
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=9631EE1A-A56F-4DCF-9C2B-3F7FF67105FE
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=9631EE1A-A56F-4DCF-9C2B-3F7FF67105FE
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=jGu0+B2T2VUY26TydWoQwrzTfiwXdE74JEOppgecHy6PxpEkffJDHSyJ2wLrrK4ow1CRQn3kAu6IBj0hVfuxZVwEDFwUicTRBZO+aOyPshw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/328
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1201-1250/ab_1238_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1201-1250/ab_1238_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1201-1250/ab_1238_97_A_bill.pdf
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AB 1250 Friedman, D 
 

Department of 
Transportation: 
low-carbon 
materials. 

08/14/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/21/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would require the Secretary of Transportation, in consultation with the Director of Transportation, 
to submit a report to the Legislature that discusses, among other things, the global warming 
potential, as defined, associated with certain materials currently used in state transportation 
projects, alternative and emerging materials with lower carbon emissions or net-negative carbon 
emissions, and strategies for using materials with lower carbon materials. The bill would require 
the department to report to the Legislature annually on the department’s progress in implementing 
the strategies described above.    (Based on  08/14/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1272 Wood, D 
 

State Water 
Resources 
Control Board: 
drought 
planning. 

07/18/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

07/18/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
Governor. 

07/18/2024 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Would require the State Water Resources Control Board, in consultation with the Department of 
Fish and Wildlife, to adopt principles and guidelines for diversion and use of water in coastal 
watersheds, as specified, during times of water shortage for drought preparedness and climate 
resiliency. The bill would require that the principles and guidelines allow for the development of 
locally generated watershed-level plans to support public trust uses, public health and safety, and 
the human right to water in times of water shortage, among other things. The bill also would 
require the state board, prior to adopting those principles and guidelines, to allow for public 
comment and hearing, as provided. The bill would make the implementation of these provisions 
contingent upon an appropriation of funds by the Legislature for this purpose.    (Based 
on  07/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=hcL2Oi+2JDw+afiB/dcabEyj3sjgSmzju1vjEewrD8osE4pUGU5AxjTnNDgEwwEQAbZniAdkThq3E/8z/C7sLIDAH5+jbFzOn+ICpDqiAm4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/445
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1201-1250/ab_1250_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1201-1250/ab_1250_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1201-1250/ab_1250_94_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Qa37Pfa776etrhLZmAjwYgRj/mEiH0tI3NZBQ/1NW5647acQ/Y5AGnnle/3ibzERf17Q7+kSunEovJBDDXFaOfN28PqtHzwb5sKc7gTT0tI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/418
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1251-1300/ab_1272_95_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1251-1300/ab_1272_95_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1251-1300/ab_1272_95_E_bill.pdf
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AB 1287 Alvarez, D 
 

Density Bonus 
Law: maximum 
allowable 
residential 
density: 
additional 
density bonus 
and incentives 
or concessions. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
755, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law defines the term “density bonus” for specified purposes to mean a density increase 
over the otherwise maximum allowable gross residential density as of the date of the application, 
as described. Current law defines the term “maximum allowable residential density” for these 
purposes to mean the maximum number of units allowed under the zoning ordinance, specific 
plan, or land use element of the general plan, or, if a range of density is permitted, the maximum 
number of units allowed by the specific zoning range, specific plan, or land use element of the 
general plan applicable to the project. Current law provides under that definition that if the density 
allowed under the zoning ordinance is inconsistent with the density allowed under the land use 
element of the general plan or specific plan, the greater density prevails. This bill would instead 
define “maximum allowable residential density” to mean the greatest number of units allowed 
under the zoning ordinance, specific plan, or land use element of the general plan, or, if a range of 
density is permitted, the greatest number of units allowed by the specific zoning range, specific 
plan, or land use element of the general plan applicable to the project. The bill would also remove 
from that definition the provision stating that the greater density prevails if the density allowed 
under the zoning ordinance is inconsistent with the density allowed under the land use element of 
the general plan or specific plan. This bill would require a city, county, or city and county to grant 
an additional density bonus, calculated as specified, when (1) an applicant proposes to construct a 
housing development that conforms to specified requirements, (2) the applicant agrees to include 
additional rental or for-sale units affordable to very low income households or moderate-income 
households, as specified, and (3) the housing development conforms to specified requirements 
and provides 24% of the total units to lower income households, conforms to specified 
requirements and provides 15% of the total units to very low income households, or conforms to 
specified requirements and provides 44% of the total units to moderate-income units. The bill 
would require a city, county, or city and county to grant four incentives or concessions for a project 
that includes at least 16% of the units for very low income households or at least 45% for persons 
and families of moderate income in a development in which the units are for sale. The bill would 
increase the incentives or concessions for a project in which 100% of all units are for lower income 
households, as specified, from 4 to 5.   (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1292 Flora, R 
 

Nursing: 
distance 
education 
nursing 
program 
students. 

04/27/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Nursing Practice Act establishes the Board of Registered Nursing to license and regulate the 
practice of nursing. The act prohibits a person from engaging in the practice of nursing without an 
active license but authorizes a student to render nursing services incidental to the student’s course 
of study, as specified. The act punishes a violation of its provisions as a misdemeanor. This bill 
would additionally authorize a student to render nursing services if the student is a resident of the 
state and enrolled in a prelicensure distance education nursing program based at an out-of-state 
private postsecondary educational institution, as defined, for the purpose of gaining clinical 
experience in a clinical setting that meets certain criteria, including that the program is accredited 
by a programmatic accreditation entity recognized by the United States Department of 
Education.   (Based on  04/27/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=lB9pqCo2zH/3Q1RGuiFvEZevJ/wdjgHx7gcsTJjbxeoPF4wBTemnYP68tdjxXXSSjQKiKNhbAGY8McsDKh8Y6IvRW3u+DgIAGjNaVob+TbY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/504
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1251-1300/ab_1287_89_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1251-1300/ab_1287_89_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=CdKoW4CJeDwezZxnUmchGjOXapL/gWx72xwgV3PUJszb7h0VJs7wrvI10chuIGv4JF/TG70QaVzS+VX1wQsB/nm7unh02BHTZsacfQceI3U=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/432
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1251-1300/ab_1292_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1251-1300/ab_1292_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1251-1300/ab_1292_97_A_bill.pdf
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AB 1293 Irwin, D 
 

Interconnection
: prioritization. 

07/13/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/21/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law requires the Public Utilities Commission to enforce rules governing the extension of 
service by electrical corporations, as specified. This bill would require the commission, no later 
than January 1, 2025, to provide guidance to electrical corporations for the prioritization of projects 
in each electrical corporation’s distribution interconnection queue and for the prioritization of 
customer service connections, including the prioritization of projects that are in the final stage 
before commencing construction, as determined by the commission.   (Based on  07/13/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1307 Wicks, D 
 

California 
Environmental 
Quality Act: 
noise impact: 
residential 
projects. 

09/07/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/07/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
160, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

09/07/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) requires a lead agency to prepare a mitigated 
negative declaration for a project that may have a significant effect on the environment if revisions 
in the project would avoid or mitigate that effect and there is no substantial evidence that the 
project, as revised, would have a significant effect on the environment. This bill would specify that 
the effects of noise generated by project occupants and their guests on human beings is not a 
significant effect on the environment for residential projects for purposes of CEQA. This bill would 
specify that institutions of public higher education, in an EIR for a residential or mixed-use housing 
project, are not required to consider alternatives to the location of the proposed project if certain 
requirements are met. This bill would declare that it is to take effect immediately as an urgency 
statute.   (Based on  09/07/2023 text) 

AB 
1307_SUPPORT
26May23 

Support 

AB 1308 Quirk-Silva, D 
 

Planning and 
Zoning Law: 
single-family 
residences: 
parking 
requirements. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
756, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Planning and Zoning Law authorizes the legislative body of any county or city to adopt 
ordinances that regulate the use of buildings, structures, and land as between industry, business, 
residences, open space, and other purposes. This bill would prohibit a public agency, as defined, 
from increasing the minimum parking requirement that applies to a single-family residence as a 
condition of approval of a project to remodel, renovate, or add to a single-family residence, except 
as specified. By imposing additional duties on local officials, the bill would impose a state-
mandated local program.   (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ngD96xK/DMuweLj5vdktfsxf3OJ9SRh0g6BqUXjoTwTYsuGHr9mFtQY2/JcaPm0+2vQ+TIMrrCtUNcs9usVn3nhxs8fHLKQJEvhaeOeDQH0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/442
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1251-1300/ab_1293_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1251-1300/ab_1293_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1251-1300/ab_1293_94_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=KhgT1iJEblIQFeQ6Evgz/2ADSDmT+RatgWd9zblTR6qunLAotNwmPsrVmeLfbhJJHnY9DdvoR3R6Ic/jdQCbD5juK/MQpPgLDCYYuc/4e2A=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/306
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1301-1350/ab_1307_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1301-1350/ab_1307_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=7A943917-C553-433A-B50A-51B1CF5D36C1
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=7A943917-C553-433A-B50A-51B1CF5D36C1
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=7A943917-C553-433A-B50A-51B1CF5D36C1
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=pxMGrASOs15FG/Kq8S3xnqpNKS59vTTeZQ3YIXeAWbfnxlkfy+cZLDz29sid4dcHwYaor6s9Z+9nZ4lUZRtbDzbM/0ur6hdW3jH+RmeReLc=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/488
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1301-1350/ab_1308_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1301-1350/ab_1308_96_C_bill.pdf
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AB 1317 Carrillo, 
Wendy, D 
 

Unbundled 
parking. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
757, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Existing law prohibits an owner of residential real property from, over the course of any 12-month 
period, increasing the gross rental rate for a dwelling or a unit more than 5% plus the percentage 
change in the cost of living, or 10%, whichever is lower, of the lowest gross rental rate charged for 
that dwelling or unit at any time during the 12 months before the effective date of the increase, as 
prescribed. This bill would require the owner of qualifying residential property, as defined, that 
provides parking with the qualifying residential property to unbundle parking from the price of rent, 
as specified. The bill would define “unbundled parking” as the practice of selling or leasing parking 
spaces separate from the lease of the residential use. The bill would define “qualifying residential 
property” as any dwelling or unit that is intended for human habitation that (1) is issued a certificate 
of occupancy on or after January 1, 2025, (2) consists of 16 or more residential units, and (3) is 
located within the County of Alameda, Fresno, Los Angeles, Riverside, Sacramento, San 
Bernardino, San Joaquin, Santa Clara, Shasta, or Ventura. The bill would provide a tenant of a 
qualifying residential property with a right of first refusal to parking spaces built for their unit, as 
specified. The bill would prohibit a tenant’s failure to pay the parking fee of a separately leased 
parking agreement from forming the basis of any unlawful detainer action against the tenant. The 
bill would authorize a property owner, if a tenant fails to pay by the 45th day following the date 
payment is owed for a separately leased parking space, to revoke that tenant’s right to lease that 
parking spot. The bill would exempt certain properties from these provisions, including residential 
properties with individual garages that are functionally a part of the property and housing 
developments where 100% of the units, exclusive of any manager’s unit or units, are restricted as 
affordable housing for persons and families of low or moderate income. This bill contains other 
related provisions.   (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1319 Wicks, D 
 

Bay Area 
Housing 
Finance 
Authority: 
housing 
revenue. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
758, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires the Bay Area Housing Finance Authority and executive board of the 
Association of Bay Area Governments to form an advisory committee composed of 9 
representatives with knowledge and experience in the areas of affordable housing finance and 
development, tenant protection, and housing preservation. This bill would require the authority and 
executive board to form an advisory committee composed of at least 9 and no more than 11 
representatives with knowledge and expertise in the areas of affordable housing finance, 
construction workforce, and development, tenant protection, and housing preservation.    (Based 
on  10/11/2023 text) 

AB 1319 
Support_17Feb2
3.pdf 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=DYRvO+fmstRULNG/R8bRrXWup5RZkUMvTNj+07bXXocuFBK6HAP2XMMsEw9v95c4YLL7ObeLB88XotiCivlAC1VOHNZUC4Z5j2QZQjxO7VQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/411
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/411
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1301-1350/ab_1317_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1301-1350/ab_1317_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=eukERPbZ1GWqFTGIm/GfwdW6OuyMo6huOJLEWGUaC81Lff9UzRULhEBspnzcTe9GsFfKkqR/Jx5I/slFbT8GqSPFFmKVINQUPH2XkQ4ZSOE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/306
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1301-1350/ab_1319_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1301-1350/ab_1319_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=4C0F2D4E-F4A4-449C-B412-8CC2B2C07B62
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=4C0F2D4E-F4A4-449C-B412-8CC2B2C07B62
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=4C0F2D4E-F4A4-449C-B412-8CC2B2C07B62
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AB 1321 Bonta, D 
 

California 
Coordinated 
Neighborhood 
and Community 
Services Grant 
Program. 

06/27/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
7/3/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law establishes the Cradle-to-Career Data System for the purpose of connecting 
individuals and organizations to trusted information and resources, as a source for actionable data 
and research on education, economic, and health outcomes for individuals, families, and 
communities, and to provide for expanded access to tools and services that support the education-
to-employment pipeline, as specified. This bill, the It Takes a Village Act of 2023, subject upon an 
appropriation in the annual Budget Act or another statute for these purposes, would establish the 
California Coordinated Neighborhood and Community Services Grant Program to be administered 
by the State Department of Social Services or another department within the California Health and 
Human Services Agency. The bill would require the department to grant awards on a competitive 
basis for the 2025–26 through 2027–28 fiscal years to eligible entities that are Promise 
Neighborhoods, other community-based networks, or multi-neighborhood regional cradle-to-career 
networks, as those terms are defined, to either implement a comprehensive, integrated continuum 
of cradle-to-career solutions at the neighborhood level or support the civic infrastructure and 
backbone of cradle-to-career networks that support their network partners to accomplish systems 
change. The bill would define “cradle-to-career” to mean a system of integrated services that 
begins before birth and leads to appropriate postsecondary success, including academic, 
occupational, and independent living, that benefits the individual and community as a 
whole.    (Based on  06/27/2023 text) 

AB 1321 
Support6June23 

Support 

AB 1332 Carrillo, Juan, 
D 
 

Accessory 
dwelling units: 
preapproved 
plans. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
759, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Planning and Zoning Law authorizes a local agency, by ordinance or ministerial approval, to 
provide for the creation of accessory dwelling units in areas zoned for residential use, as specified. 
Current law authorizes a local agency to impose standards on accessory dwelling units that 
include, but are not limited to, parking, height, setback, landscape, architectural review, and 
maximum size of a unit. This bill would require each local agency, by January 1, 2025, to develop 
a program for the preapproval of accessory dwelling unit plans, whereby the local agency accepts 
accessory dwelling unit plan submissions for preapproval and approves or denies the preapproval 
applications, as specified. The bill would authorize a local agency to charge a fee to an applicant 
for the preapproval of an accessory dwelling unit plan, as specified. The bill would require the local 
agency to post preapproved accessory dwelling unit plans and the contact information of the 
applicant on the local agency’s internet website. The bill would require a local agency to either 
approve or deny an application for a permit for a proposed accessory dwelling unit within 30 days 
that utilizes either an accessory dwelling unit plan preapproved within the current triennial 
California Building Standards Code rulemaking cycle or a plan that is identical to a plan used in an 
application for a detached accessory dwelling unit approved by the local agency within the current 
triennial California Building Standards Code rulemaking cycle.    (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=X875xckixlmNqfpbWKzhXcv2EWuqEbJcF+WBctkPo1+W4xvX4hSVUCapnwVZJaaO7yvssnIdm9RaTpVHpeCOlfL8t841Xgno1U4HNDNA5Sk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/495
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1301-1350/ab_1321_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1301-1350/ab_1321_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1301-1350/ab_1321_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=8585E706-5737-4F2A-A808-F997EA9649D1
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=8585E706-5737-4F2A-A808-F997EA9649D1
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=cNfy54pK+RP1dqReBYVTqZBqIqmEYY7vxoJsn8xREdnrGSWtP/rm7od3BwaY953908JqRpIkovUDBIccAvG+gNKRrjABc1j1EQS4u0wQw9Q=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/474
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/474
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1301-1350/ab_1332_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1301-1350/ab_1332_92_C_bill.pdf
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AB 1334 Pellerin, D 
 

Mobilehome 
parks: 
additional 
spaces: 
exemption from 
additional fees 
or charges. 

04/20/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
7/10/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The Mobilehome Parks Act authorizes any person to file an application with the governing body of 
a city or county for a conditional use permit for a mobilehome park. The act requires a person, 
before operating a mobilehome park, and each year thereafter, to obtain a valid permit from the 
enforcement agency in order to operate the park. The act also requires the owner of a mobilehome 
park to obtain a permit to create, move, shift, or alter park lot lines. This bill would authorize an 
owner of an existing mobilehome park that is subject to, or intends to qualify for, a valid permit to 
operate the park, to apply to the enforcement agency to add additional specified spaces to the 
mobilehome park not to exceed 10% of the previously approved number of spaces in the 
mobilehome park, if the owner has not been served with a notice of violation that constitutes an 
imminent threat to health and safety. The bill would exempt the additional spaces from any 
business tax, local registration fee, use permit fee, or other fee, except those fees that apply to the 
existing spaces in the park.    (Based on  04/20/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1347 Ting, D 
 

Solid waste: 
paper waste: 
proofs of 
purchase. 

07/13/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/21/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would, on and after January 1, 2026, require a business, as defined, that accepts payment 
through cash, credit, or debit transactions, subject to certain exceptions, to provide a consumer 
with the option to receive or not receive a proof of purchase. On and after January 1, 2026, the bill 
would prohibit a business from printing a paper proof of purchase if the consumer opts to not 
receive a proof of purchase, unless otherwise required by state or federal law. The bill would also 
exempt a business from the requirement to provide the consumer with an option to not receive a 
proof of purchase if a consumer voluntarily opts in to receive a proof of purchase through the rules 
of an association, warehouse, or other club to which the consumer belongs. The bill would prohibit, 
on and after January 1, 2024, a paper proof of purchase provided to a consumer by a business 
from containing bisphenol A, and, on and after January 1, 2025, from containing any bisphenols. 
The bill would specify that a violation would be punishable by a civil penalty of $100 for each day 
the business is in violation, not to exceed an annual total of $3,000. The bill would authorize the 
Attorney General, a county counsel, a district attorney, or a city attorney to enforce those 
provisions.   (Based on  07/13/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1371 Low, D 
 

Unlawful sexual 
intercourse with 
a minor. 

10/13/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/13/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
838, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/13/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law makes it a crime, known as unlawful sexual intercourse, to commit an act of sexual 
intercourse with a person who is not the spouse of the perpetrator, if the person is a minor. Under 
existing law, if a person 21 years of age or older engages in an act of unlawful sexual intercourse 
with a minor who is under 16 years of age they are guilty of either a misdemeanor or a felony, as 
specified. This bill would prohibit a person convicted of this crime who is granted probation from 
completing community service at a school or location where children congregate.   (Based 
on  10/13/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=j6Z5l0QSSHKrlvxeJC08tYFklw8TfCEDakrhCBw9pDMvGiySIZrH/G7okQA9NuwZ6KQh18kdVxTDbuXqUpRylQ+uV/q+X/YkJB8sOWMKiss=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/438
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1301-1350/ab_1334_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1301-1350/ab_1334_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1301-1350/ab_1334_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=QQotqcj+RKjcq7/v8/T3s1gfQ5pFmJlAdttsA1KIst8K/xpqs5vwezazYwAjffXD9Gg0KkYJFofRDspQ0xA9wJufHlPMO/rPKERISB+YbpY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/360
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1301-1350/ab_1347_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1301-1350/ab_1347_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1301-1350/ab_1347_94_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=+7rQ72sAJEMD/3Pf3FlWgadsAeqV7xqObc4yzQAOHnFiqKoGhutAT1VDfG91QHKHYmbA3if5LnALQn5BZ7Y05VOqZl6i5wK/PORZrX+VTGM=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/437
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1351-1400/ab_1371_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1351-1400/ab_1371_95_C_bill.pdf
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AB 1373 Garcia, D 
 

Energy. 10/07/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/07/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
367, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/07/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires the State Energy Resources Conservation and Development Commission 
(Energy Commission), in consultation with specified entities, to adopt a biennial integrated energy 
policy report containing certain information, including an overview of major energy trends and 
issues facing the state. This bill would require, as part of the 2025 edition of the integrated energy 
policy report, the Energy Commission, in consultation with the Public Utilities Commission (PUC), 
to assess barriers to electricity interconnection and energization and provide recommendations on 
how to accelerate those processes, as appropriate.   (Based on  10/07/2023 text) 

AB1373.SJCE.pd
f 
Mayor's Letter on 
AB 1373.v2.pdf 

Oppose 
unless 
Amended 

AB 1374 Alvarez, D 
 

Greenhouse 
Gas Reduction 
Fund: 
investment 
plan. 

02/17/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The California Global Warming Solutions Act of 2006 authorizes the State Air Resources Board to 
include the use of market-based compliance mechanisms. Current law requires all moneys, except 
for fines and penalties, collected by the state board as part of a market-based compliance 
mechanism to be deposited in the Greenhouse Gas Reduction Fund and to be available upon 
appropriation. Current law requires the Department of Finance, in consultation with the state board 
and any other relevant state agency, to develop, as specified, a 3-year investment plan for the 
moneys deposited in the fund. Current law requires the investment plan to allocate, among other 
things, a minimum of 25% of the available moneys in the fund to projects located within, and 
benefiting individuals living in, disadvantaged communities and an additional minimum of 5% to 
projects that benefit low-income households or to projects located within, and benefiting individuals 
living in, low-income communities located anywhere in the state. This bill would increase those 
amounts from 25% to 50% and from 5% to 15%.   (Based on  02/17/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1377 Friedman, D 
 

Homeless 
Housing, 
Assistance, 
and Prevention 
Program. 

10/10/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/10/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
728, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/10/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law establishes the Homeless Housing, Assistance, and Prevention program for the 
purpose of providing jurisdictions with one-time grant funds to support regional coordination and 
expand or develop local capacity to address their immediate homelessness challenges informed 
by a best-practices framework focused on moving homeless individuals and families into 
permanent housing and supporting the efforts of those individuals and families to maintain their 
permanent housing. Current law provides for the allocation of funding under the program among 
continuums of care, cities, counties, and tribes in 4 rounds, which are to be administered by the 
Interagency Council on Homelessness. This bill would require applications or planning materials 
for additional state funding appropriated on or after July 1, 2024, as specified, to include data and 
a narrative summary of specific and quantifiable steps that the applicant has taken to improve the 
delivery of housing and services to people experiencing homelessness or at risk of homelessness 
on transit facilities owned and operated by a transit agency, as defined.   (Based on  10/10/2023 
text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=X0gOgQILlUIdBEyLriZfMbsHW1WOmyW6nESySFD7RrqCOTv3J7tnfsFs2z4IfKVovuB2WcPVmuPRbgf6fl+S+9wpqJ+HQOMIYiqn1OrxNqg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/440
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1351-1400/ab_1373_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1351-1400/ab_1373_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=27B79E07-4E28-46DC-9A49-7BE4D9BDCF89
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=27B79E07-4E28-46DC-9A49-7BE4D9BDCF89
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=C5514D81-E1B4-4801-8318-7E7DBEB3BCEA
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=C5514D81-E1B4-4801-8318-7E7DBEB3BCEA
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=yUScSIbXuXkXd+HYBlCV6oD3iXW1wXBcOWPLZF7jLLQ7sfk2vAE50xBBE3z5Ddm82FwFPUwDqAU0RbPjUxtGvPNBSbQnH1ChQbKOBR03+Vs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/504
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1351-1400/ab_1374_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1351-1400/ab_1374_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=f2Fn2aP4N0c2GGYY9uFezP0pto3u7UgtyL9XynADwzMGYdPcWeDKhPiQVrKjsrA5sW7FNsspK5mNcz+UV5lUFo9RPrM6LI2FhTM1GmavN/o=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/445
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1351-1400/ab_1377_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1351-1400/ab_1377_93_C_bill.pdf
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AB 1403 Garcia, D 
 

Public safety: 
fireworks: 
enforcement: 
funding. 

10/07/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/07/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
368, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/07/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires the State Fire Marshal to classify all fireworks and pyrotechnic devices and 
prohibits any fireworks or pyrotechnic devices from being imported, sold, or offered for sale before 
the fireworks or devices have been examined and classified by the State Fire Marshal. Current law 
authorizes the State Fire Marshal to issue licenses related to fireworks and pyrotechnic devices, 
including a wholesaler’s license. Current law makes it unlawful for a person to violate the State 
Fireworks Law and the regulations issued pursuant thereto, and to possess a specified amount of 
dangerous fireworks, punishable by a fine or by imprisonment, as specified. This bill would 
increase the amounts of the fines to be imposed for violating the State Fireworks Law or related 
regulation, would increase the amount of certain fines for possessing specified amounts of 
dangerous fireworks, and would increase the amount of certain fines for selling, giving, or 
delivering dangerous fireworks to any person under 18 years in age.    (Based on  10/07/2023 text) 

AB 1403 
SUPPORT_28Jul
y23 
AB 1403 
GOVRFS 
20Sept23 

Support 

AB 1413 Ting, D 
 

Housing 
Accountability 
Act: 
disapprovals: 
California 
Environmental 
Quality Act. 

09/19/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/19/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
265, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/19/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Housing Accountability Act prohibits a local agency from disapproving a housing development 
project, as described, unless it makes certain written findings based on a preponderance of the 
evidence in the record. The act defines “disapprove the housing development” as including, 
among other things, until January 1, 2031, any instance in which a local agency fails to adopt a 
negative declaration or addendum for the project, to certify an environmental impact report for the 
project, or to approve another comparable environmental document, if certain conditions are 
satisfied, or fails to make a determination of whether the project is exempt from the California 
Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) or commits an abuse of discretion if certain conditions are met, 
including that the applicant has given timely written notice to the local agency, as specified. The 
act requires the local agency, within 5 working days of receiving the notice, to file the notice with 
the county clerk for each county in which the project will be located, as specified. This bill would 
also require the local agency, within 5 working days of receiving the notice, to post the notice on 
the local agency’s internet website and provide a copy to specified persons. The bill would 
additionally require the local agency to consider all objections, comments, evidence, and concerns 
submitted about the project or the applicant’s written notice, and would prohibit the local agency 
from making a determination until at least 60 days after the applicant has given timely written 
notice. The bill would make technical changes to the above-described provisions of the act 
defining “disapprove the housing development.”   (Based on  09/19/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1418 McKinnor, D 
 

Tenancy: local 
regulations: 
contact with 
law 
enforcement or 
criminal 
convictions. 

10/08/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
476, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/08/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would prohibit a local government from, among other things, imposing a penalty against a 
resident, owner, tenant, landlord, or other person as a consequence of contact with a law 
enforcement agency, as specified. The bill similarly would prohibit a local government from 
requiring or encouraging a landlord to evict or penalize a tenant because of the tenant’s 
association with another tenant or household member who has had contact with a law 
enforcement agency or has a criminal conviction or to perform a criminal background check of a 
tenant or a prospective tenant. The bill would preempt inconsistent local ordinances, rules, 
policies, programs, or regulations and prescribe remedies for violations.    (Based on  10/08/2023 
text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=UkjQoMZMNOmZX4/7OczhzADg8GYBV/FHaj0MM0ESH2HxDzgH/cQoxXSbuULgP9jlrYrGN38kE6NK5vw7wBlPmIgsQQeJPXd+yWWwQlyD9kM=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/440
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1401-1450/ab_1403_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1401-1450/ab_1403_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=6C114642-3404-410A-967D-8F7691CAD47E
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=6C114642-3404-410A-967D-8F7691CAD47E
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=6C114642-3404-410A-967D-8F7691CAD47E
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=D98FD015-C04C-414B-A118-85A1CF803F85
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=D98FD015-C04C-414B-A118-85A1CF803F85
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=D98FD015-C04C-414B-A118-85A1CF803F85
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=VgN6x+VexWHgkgNl/CCeaXv5Sy/G3exb4NEzzTwgjpXZUSDWdczoyVSuuJXYVjj+GPIvYgKoKxLQ+UxwvqPV2fCyUJ8nbjxa1jr/GALIQNU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/360
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1401-1450/ab_1413_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1401-1450/ab_1413_91_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Vxg1CJF0d0PoKeNnRkrtMFsFdWEnQZYpkEEahBs9x7fAVyJwD8FLrowCEtbzELE2YVAJRFPy+Iy6D5TfcTFCaCpFr2I1J5neNTsWfJkeIrQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/380
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1401-1450/ab_1418_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1401-1450/ab_1418_94_C_bill.pdf
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AB 1447 Flora, R 
 

Vehicles: 
motorized 
scooters. 

09/08/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
RLS. on 
9/11/2023) 

08/31/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Existing law defines a motorized scooter as any 2-wheeled device that has handlebars, either a 
floorboard that is designed to be stood upon when riding or a seat and footrests in place of the 
floorboard, and is powered by an electric motor. Existing law prohibits a person from operating a 
motorized scooter in excess of 15 miles per hour. Existing law prohibits an operator of a motorized 
scooter under 18 years of age from operating a motorized scooter without a specified bicycle 
helmet and requires a manufacturer of a motorized scooter to provide a disclosure to buyers that 
existing insurance policies may not provide coverage for a motorized scooter. Under existing law, 
a violation or failure to comply with a provision of the Vehicle Code constitutes an infraction. This 
bill would change the definition of a motorized scooter by including 3-wheeled devices, limiting its 
maximum weight to 200 pounds and width to 3 feet, and specifying that it is powered by a motor 
that ceases to provide power at 20 miles per hour. The bill would require a manufacturer of a 
motorized scooter to apply a sticker to certain motorized scooters certifying the scooter is capable 
of achieving braking requirements, as specified, and would prohibit a person from operating a 
motorized scooter that does not have that certifying sticker and, if the scooter is capable of 
exceeding 15 miles per hour, a speedometer in good working order. The bill would prohibit a 
person from operating a motorized scooter in excess of 15 miles per hour while standing up or in 
excess of 20 miles per hour while sitting down. This bill contains other related provisions and other 
existing laws.   (Based on  09/08/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1449 Alvarez, D 
 

Affordable 
housing: 
California 
Environmental 
Quality Act: 
exemption. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
761, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would, until January 1, 2033, exempt from the California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) 
certain actions taken by a public agency related to affordable housing projects, as defined, if 
certain requirements are met. The bill would require the lead agency, if the lead agency 
determines an action related to an affordable housing project is exempt from CEQA under this 
provision and approves or carries out the project, to file a notice of exemption with the Office of 
Planning and Research and the county clerk of each county in which the project is located. By 
increasing the duties of a lead agency, this bill would impose a state-mandated local 
program.   (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

AB 
1449_SUPPORT
26May23 

Support 

AB 1463 Lowenthal, D 
 

Automated 
license plate 
recognition 
systems: 
retention and 
use of 
information. 

07/03/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
JUD. on 
6/20/2024) 

07/02/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law requires automated license plate recognition (ALPR) operators and ALPR end-users, 
as those terms are defined, to implement usage and privacy policies and to maintain reasonable 
security procedures and practices regarding ALPR information, as specified. Current law requires 
the usage and privacy policy implemented by an ALPR operator or an ALPR end-user to include 
the length of time ALPR information will be retained and the process the ALPR operator or ALPR 
end-user will utilize to determine if and when to destroy retained ALPR information. This bill would 
require an ALPR operator or ALPR end-user that is a public agency, excluding an airport authority, 
to include in those policies, procedures, and practices a requirement that ALPR information that 
does not match information on a hot list, as defined, be purged in 30 days, as specified. The bill 
would also prohibit those ALPR operators and end-users from accessing ALPR information that is 
older than 60 days, except as specified.    (Based on  07/03/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=otagLlscd91eIeta1DyKw6MrgSLzFi54i2w2FWV7IhF2cNFPUKfvrFFhnIL05a+BPBjHa7AA7qGTiUhPufoJ2nbyNOoOXkAwcUOXqZazh8E=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/432
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1401-1450/ab_1447_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1401-1450/ab_1447_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1401-1450/ab_1447_95_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=7+TnajGyb1CTkYcwR1KyJLuQoJ4d5wyQwhXElRz+c2K+aNOiiflK6FbxQcto5qqbhlRKxYPGLn7u97RdDgAlpucTooNJJoj6QQ5L5LTRETk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/504
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1401-1450/ab_1449_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1401-1450/ab_1449_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=EB978C70-7F88-4603-AA9A-3A7826400A4C
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=EB978C70-7F88-4603-AA9A-3A7826400A4C
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=EB978C70-7F88-4603-AA9A-3A7826400A4C
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=a6sSZ59xetUAuk2jAa0ZF16CAopIwi8diDIa3JIr2eVP0pxMGqOwzZk5Y9SwU0x/I9eO844u9L5bsdyTWB4vOhHUQ8zEnbSIvHgtBOtGuNI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/385
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1451-1500/ab_1463_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1451-1500/ab_1463_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1451-1500/ab_1463_95_A_bill.pdf
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AB 1469 Kalra, D 
 

Santa Clara 
Valley Water 
District. 

10/10/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/10/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
729, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/10/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Santa Clara Valley Water District Act creates the Santa Clara Valley Water District, and 
authorizes the district to provide for the conservation and management of flood, storm, and 
recycled waters, and other waters, for beneficial uses and to enhance natural resources in 
connection with carrying out the purposes of the district. This bill would additionally authorize the 
district to take certain actions in order to assist unsheltered people living along streams, in riparian 
corridors, or otherwise within the district’s jurisdiction, in consultation with a city or the County of 
Santa Clara to provide solutions or improve outcomes for the unsheltered individuals. The bill 
would require, if the district elects to use the above-described authority, the district to provide a 
report to the appropriate committees of the Legislature on or before July 1, 2029, and a 
subsequent report on or before July 1, 2034, containing specified information, including, among 
other things, the district’s actions taken to assist unsheltered people. The bill would provide that 
the use of land by the district for these specified actions constitutes “agency’s use” for purposes of 
the prescribed requirements related to the disposal of surplus land by a local agency, and would 
make this provision operative only if SB 747 of the 2023–24 Regular Session is enacted as 
provided. This bill contains other related provisions and other existing laws.   (Based 
on  10/10/2023 text) 

AB 1469 
SUPPORT_20M
arch23 
AB 
1469_SUPPORT
21June23 
AB 1469 
GOVRFS 
20Sept23 

Support 

AB 1471 Pellerin, D 
 

Hospitals: 
seismic 
compliance: 
O’Connor 
Hospital and 
Santa Clara 
Valley Medical 
Center. 

10/04/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/04/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
304, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/04/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Alfred E. Alquist Hospital Facilities Seismic Safety Act of 1983 establishes a program of 
seismic safety building standards for certain hospitals. Current law requires hospitals that are 
seeking an extension for their buildings to submit an application to the Department of Health Care 
Access and Information by April 1, 2019, subject to certain exceptions. Current law requires that 
final seismic compliance be achieved by July 1, 2022, if the compliance is based on a replacement 
or retrofit plan, or by January 1, 2025, if the compliance is based on a rebuild plan. 
Notwithstanding the above provisions, existing law authorizes the department to waive the 
requirements of the act for the O’Connor Hospital and Santa Clara Valley Medical Center in the 
City of San Jose if the hospital or medical center submits, on or before January 15, 2022, a plan 
for compliance, and the department accepts the plan based on it being feasible to complete and 
promoting public safety. Current law requires, if the department accepts the plan, the hospital or 
medical center to report to the department on its progress to timely complete the plan by specified 
dates. This bill would extend the deadline for the hospital’s or medical center’s plan for 
compliance, and would add additional dates for the hospital or medical center to report to the 
department on its progress. The bill would apply these provisions retroactively to avoid any period 
of noncompliance. This bill would impose penalties to a hospital that fails to meet its deadline, and 
would require the county to pay these penalties to the department.    (Based on  10/04/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=GvgK72AZIGpoFa9aU2JPeb5/1vcmVDeCnI8r09c5TqxdEr75RLIXcPh/jRx2t7RZFqIc51FlZsjCOOJN+3h8DNP2HdcfVqaUDKJnGgw3WYI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/436
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1451-1500/ab_1469_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1451-1500/ab_1469_92_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=F5639A1E-0B3E-4D9D-B938-96C26A436800
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=F5639A1E-0B3E-4D9D-B938-96C26A436800
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=F5639A1E-0B3E-4D9D-B938-96C26A436800
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=9E5C85DA-8C98-40B1-8073-BA72EC2D2E7C
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=9E5C85DA-8C98-40B1-8073-BA72EC2D2E7C
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=9E5C85DA-8C98-40B1-8073-BA72EC2D2E7C
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=72C392AC-9EA7-4736-A0B9-B1A5EABF6058
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=72C392AC-9EA7-4736-A0B9-B1A5EABF6058
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=72C392AC-9EA7-4736-A0B9-B1A5EABF6058
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Yld+CMEQ3TNqdK6qeiuF9/g0qwu2Si4w3WsymksOugkM2SVrjtfgIsEPfBlb6br1YAVwSJLnVeldRqImG616WaaSRkOQTifyiNrQD+YyZgQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/438
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1451-1500/ab_1471_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1451-1500/ab_1471_95_C_bill.pdf
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AB 1484 Zbur, D 
 

Temporary 
public 
employees. 

10/10/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/10/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
691, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/10/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

This bill would impose specified requirements with respect to the temporary employees of a public 
employer who have been hired to perform the same or similar type of work that is performed by 
permanent employees represented by a recognized employee organization, subject to limited 
exceptions. In this regard the bill would require those temporary employees to be automatically 
included in the same bargaining unit as the permanent employees if the requested classification of 
temporary employees is not presently within the unit. The bill would further require the public 
employer to promptly participate in collective bargaining to establish certain employment 
conditions for the newly added temporary employees if the parties’ current memorandum of 
understanding does not address them, as specified. The bill would also require a public employer 
to, upon hire, provide each temporary employee with their job description, wage rates, and 
eligibility for benefits, anticipated length of employment, and procedures to apply for open, 
permanent positions. By imposing new duties on local agencies that employ temporary 
employees, the bill would impose a state-mandated local program. The bill would require 
complaints alleging a violation of its provisions to be processed as unfair practice charges under 
the act. The bill would additionally include the same findings and declarations as set forth above. 
This bill contains other related provisions and other existing laws.   (Based on  10/10/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1485 Haney, D 
 

Housing 
element: 
enforcement: 
Attorney 
General. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
763, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Planning and Zoning Law requires each county and city to adopt a comprehensive, long-term 
general plan for the physical development of the county or city and requires that general plan to 
include, among other mandatory elements, a housing element. Existing law authorizes the 
Department of Housing and Community Development to notify the office of the Attorney General, 
that a city, county, or city and county is in violation of state law if the department finds that the 
housing element or an amendment to the housing element does not substantially comply with 
specified provisions of the Planning and Zoning Law, or that the local government has taken action 
or failed to act in violation of specified provisions of law relating to housing, including, among 
others, the Housing Accountability Act, the Density Bonus Law, and the Housing Crisis Act of 
2019.This bill would permit both the department and the office of the Attorney General to intervene 
as a matter of unconditional right in any legal action addressing a violation of the specified housing 
laws described above, including, among others, the Housing Accountability Act, the Density Bonus 
Law, and the Housing Crisis Act of 2019. This bill contains other existing laws.   (Based 
on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=OSl09P2UReYBT/a/cxj9wToU//F+R3m3zGM4Oo+nPi2narm/K/3W3yMmWC7y3X6CfPHxjNsUUUMhQeCYoIAU4E4uwUKFFuLc1HJjHkPZB40=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/468
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1451-1500/ab_1484_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1451-1500/ab_1484_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=OuDGSENr0cAdYGgDPN+jzyQP6LJG7Pziy/NCWUqYBxzxLigUJPxNdOvIqoP6HF9aSQFJKMNg0nQYjboJ4sErY9CZ37iPhiF5tzPh5QdsF34=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/503
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1451-1500/ab_1485_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1451-1500/ab_1485_95_C_bill.pdf
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AB 1490 Lee, D 
 

Affordable 
housing 
development 
projects: 
adaptive reuse. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
764, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Under this bill, a housing development that is, among other requirements, an extremely affordable 
adaptive reuse project on an infill parcel that is not located on or adjoined to a site where more 
than 1/3 of the square footage on the site is dedicated to industrial use, as specified, would be an 
allowable use. The bill would authorize a local agency to impose objective design review 
standards, except as specified. The bill would authorize a local agency to deny the project if it is 
proposed to be located on a site or adjoined to any site where any of the square footage on the 
site is dedicated to industrial use and the local agency makes written findings that approving the 
development would have an adverse effect on public health and safety. The bill would provide that 
for purposes of the Housing Accountability Act, a proposed housing development project is 
consistent, compliant, and in conformity with an applicable plan, program, policy, ordinance, 
standard, requirement, or other similar provision if the housing development project is consistent 
with the standards specified in these provisions. The bill would require a local agency to determine 
whether the proposed development meets those standards within specified timeframes. The bill 
would define an “extremely affordable adaptive reuse project” for these purposes to mean a 
multifamily housing development project that involves retrofitting and repurposing of a residential 
or commercial building that currently allows temporary dwelling or occupancy, and that meets 
specified affordability requirements, including that 100% of the units be dedicated to lower income 
households, 50% of which shall be dedicated to very low income households, as specified. 
Because the bill would require local officials to provide a higher level of service, the bill would 
impose a state-mandated local program. This bill contains other related provisions and other 
existing laws.   (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1491 Grayson, D 
 

California 
Environmental 
Quality Act: 
master 
environmental 
impact report. 

02/17/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Died at 
Desk.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) requires a lead agency, as defined, to prepare, 
or cause to be prepared, and certify the completion of an environmental impact report on a project 
that it proposes to carry out or approve that may have a significant effect on the environment or to 
adopt a negative declaration if it finds that the project will not have that effect. CEQA also requires 
a lead agency to prepare a mitigated negative declaration for a project that may have a significant 
effect on the environment if revisions in the project would avoid or mitigate that effect and there is 
no substantial evidence that the project, as revised, would have a significant effect on the 
environment. This bill would make nonsubstantive changes to the above provision. This bill 
contains other existing laws.   (Based on  02/17/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1505 Rodriguez, D 
 

California 
Earthquake 
Authority: 
closed 
meetings. 

09/20/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/20/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
301, 
Statutes of 
2024 

09/20/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Bagley-Keene Open Meeting Act requires, with specified exceptions for authorized closed 
sessions, that all meetings of a state body be open and public and all persons be permitted to 
attend any meeting of a state body. Current law establishes the California Earthquake Authority 
(CEA), administered under the authority of the Insurance Commissioner and governed by a 3-
member governing board, to transact insurance in this state as necessary to sell policies of basic 
residential earthquake insurance. Under current law, the CEA’s governing board is advised by an 
appointed advisory panel. This bill would provide, as an exception to the Bagley-Keene Open 
Meeting Act, that the CEA’s governing board or advisory panel is authorized to hold closed 
sessions when addressing the development of rates, reinsurance, and strategy when discussion in 
open session concerning those matters would prejudice the position of the CEA. The bill would 
authorize the CEA’s governing board or advisory panel, at any regular or special meeting, to meet 
in a closed session as described above upon a 2/3 vote of the members present at the meeting 
taken after first providing an opportunity for members of the public to be heard on the issue of the 
appropriateness of meeting in closed session.   (Based on  09/20/2024 text) 

AB 1505 - 
Support_032723.
pdf 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=tifO6h7/hFKDay3ypYhn/RZ8nRrfv4bGd30hrab2cZzV5Q5dm3MS0MIVZ9YjD1NZFTYLtEizZAdrBz/mr4hEjx9m6dvIPBWnXBj3qSCfO1M=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/308
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1451-1500/ab_1490_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1451-1500/ab_1490_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=kl52za/1bH7wFD8vCXC5EYYuqnujsfGrroKn7Q9ws7yUf3tgsNBAzFA54ktGANbz95xK9kS0FmZimewpJ0/8AQ7X4GUNc0A3VNkkL95YSb4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/433
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1451-1500/ab_1491_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1451-1500/ab_1491_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=b8KMKyjWTQmxao3/QNzCNjsrBObxiQixR5+7wf1NMKM97Lb/hiuBeJ5dXbrS98AUeJuq7CtO/EwU42tPjkwPDBk44oZr9D1g9N/Uzwambxo=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/443
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1501-1550/ab_1505_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1501-1550/ab_1505_91_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=D9E84FE5-265B-4615-BE4D-0E0D088F86AA
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=D9E84FE5-265B-4615-BE4D-0E0D088F86AA
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=D9E84FE5-265B-4615-BE4D-0E0D088F86AA


Attachment B: Intergovernmental Relations Priority State Legislation Log 
 

Last Updated 12/06/24        78 
 

Measure Author Topic Current 
Text 

Status Location Brief Summary Attachments Position 

AB 1515 Papan, D 
 

Planning and 
zoning. 

02/17/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Died at 
Desk.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Planning and Zoning Law makes declarations of state policy and legislative intent, including 
finding and declaring that California’s land is an exhaustible resource, not just a commodity, and is 
essential to the economy, environment, and general well-being of the people of California. Current 
law further declares it is the policy of the state and the intent of the Legislature to protect 
California’s land resource, to ensure its preservation and use in ways that are economically and 
socially desirable in an attempt to improve the quality of life in California. This bill would make 
nonsubstantive changes to those provisions.   (Based on  02/17/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1525 Bonta, D 
 

Transportation 
projects: 
priority 
populations. 

04/19/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would require the agency, the Department of Transportation, and the California Transportation 
Commission, on or before July 1, 2025, to jointly develop and adopt criteria and an evaluation 
process for purposes of jointly evaluating each agency, Department of Transportation, or California 
Transportation Commission project, as defined, to, among other things, determine if the project 
would be located in a priority population, address an important need of a priority population, and 
provide a direct, meaningful, and assured benefit to a priority population, as specified. The bill 
would require the agency, the Department of Transportation, and the California Transportation 
Commission, on and after July 1, 2025, to jointly evaluate all new proposed projects by the criteria, 
and, on or before July 1, 2026, and annually thereafter, to jointly submit a report to the Legislature 
that evaluates how projects funded during the prior year impacted priority populations, as 
specified.   (Based on  04/19/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1532 Haney, D 
 

Office 
conversion 
projects. 

02/17/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Planning and Zoning Law requires the legislative body of each county and city to adopt a 
comprehensive, long-term general plan for the physical development of the county or city that 
includes, among other mandatory elements, a housing element. Under that law, supportive 
housing, as defined, is a use by right in zones where multifamily and mixed uses are permitted if 
the developer provides the planning agency with a plan for providing supportive services and the 
proposed housing development meets specified criteria. This bill would make an office conversion 
project, as defined, that meets certain requirements a use by right in all areas regardless of 
zoning. The bill would define “office conversion project” to mean the conversion of a building used 
for office purposes or a vacant office building into residential dwelling units. The bill would define 
“use by right” to mean that the city or county’s review of the office conversion may not require a 
conditional use permit, planned unit development permit, or other discretionary city or county 
review or approval that would constitute a “project” for purposes of the California Environmental 
Quality Act, as specified.    (Based on  02/17/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1538 Muratsuchi, D 
 

Clean Energy 
Reliability 
Program. 

04/17/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law requires the Public Utilities Commission, in consultation with the Independent System 
Operator, to establish resource adequacy requirements for all load-serving entities. Current law 
requires the commission, in establishing those resource adequacy requirements, to ensure the 
reliability of electrical service in California while advancing, to the extent possible, the state’s goals 
for clean energy, reducing air pollution, and reducing emissions of greenhouse gases. This bill 
would establish the Clean Energy Reliability Program, to be administered by the commission, upon 
appropriation, to provide incentive payments to qualifying load-serving entities that exceed 
procurement targets for eligible resources established by the commission, as specified. The bill 
would require a load-serving entity to remit incentive payments to its customers as a bill credit or 
use the payment in a manner determined by the commission to reduce ratepayer costs arising 
from the additional procurement of eligible resources. The bill would require a load-serving entity 
to meet specified conditions to be eligible for an incentive payment.   (Based on  04/17/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=sCJZVJhslwXUahmJ3s3vBMWhZQ3vcXmZWPDaNMR15VODE2I9Djc3U6DG99XCE6kEq792wpj7+IwONw9QDn+nnSM1PUI56tiGKkV+zCPtQCs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/362
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1501-1550/ab_1515_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1501-1550/ab_1515_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=oPTRqNW3ZTTnvfH4Hg993HmRWc1QsNJVOXUz23LdOuvHDxt+r6r64obRhqXOyh7/GRSmxyi+E4ukdPUUt6BWnRaFF4QHx4gJJfCAJt07dpI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/495
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1501-1550/ab_1525_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1501-1550/ab_1525_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1501-1550/ab_1525_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=nJ3oV2MKeFGyebrUjXnjVvRk1DPzU+Ixf3SnqDZGhcuUgz70U+HsP9YV9bgNG06c+aoevJCTkW9nCgq4al1ujssMiea/yzenQL+B1MIh5sA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/503
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1501-1550/ab_1532_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1501-1550/ab_1532_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=/Q1HwvMv/pDrKzKJZrGbRweq6m6MkopYb7IRX5X/1BA4P2pBlsHfdjB2e195XQ68NolPyf+tszBaN8k3MmJtAQfXJWlPdgHQRyxcrKzxa6Y=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/452
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1501-1550/ab_1538_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1501-1550/ab_1538_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1501-1550/ab_1538_97_A_bill.pdf
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AB 1565 Jones-
Sawyer, D 
 

California 
Cannabis Tax 
Fund: local 
equity program 
grants. 

02/17/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/21/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Existing law, the Control, Regulate and Tax Adult Use of Marijuana Act (AUMA), an initiative 
measure, authorizes a person who obtains a state license under AUMA to engage in commercial 
adult-use cannabis activity pursuant to that license and applicable local ordinances. The Medicinal 
and Adult-Use Cannabis Regulation and Safety Act (MAUCRSA), among other things, 
consolidates the licensure and regulation of commercial medicinal and adult-use cannabis 
activities. MAUCRSA establishes the Department of Cannabis Control within the Business, 
Consumer Services, and Housing Agency to administer the act. This bill would require, effective 
July 1, 2028, the Controller to disburse up to $15,000,000, as specified, to the department for the 
2028–29 fiscal year and every fiscal year thereafter. The bill would require the department to use 
the disbursements to support local equity programs in eligible local jurisdictions to assist local 
equity applicants and licensees gaining entry into, and to successfully operate in, the state’s 
regulated cannabis marketplace, as specified. By expanding the purposes for which continuously 
appropriated moneys may be used, the bill would make an appropriation. The bill would declare 
that its provisions further the purposes and intent of AUMA. This bill contains other existing 
laws.   (Based on  02/17/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1567 Garcia, D 
 

Safe Drinking 
Water, Wildfire 
Prevention, 
Drought 
Preparation, 
Flood 
Protection, 
Extreme Heat 
Mitigation, 
Clean Energy, 
and Workforce 
Development 
Bond Act of 
2024. 

05/26/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
N.R. & W. 
on 
5/22/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would enact the Safe Drinking Water, Wildfire Prevention, Drought Preparation, Flood Protection, 
Extreme Heat Mitigation, Clean Energy, and Workforce Development Bond Act of 2024, which, if 
approved by the voters, would authorize the issuance of bonds in the amount of $15,995,000,000 
pursuant to the State General Obligation Bond Law to finance projects for safe drinking water, 
wildfire prevention, drought preparation, flood protection, extreme heat mitigation, clean energy, 
and workforce development programs.    (Based on  05/26/2023 text) 

SB 867 and AB 
1567 - Support if 
Amended Letter 
04.22.24 (1).pdf 

Support if 
Amended 

AB 1572 Friedman, D 
 

Potable water: 
nonfunctional 
turf. 

10/13/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/13/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
849, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/13/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would make legislative findings and declarations concerning water use, including that the use of 
potable water to irrigate nonfunctional turf is wasteful and incompatible with state policy relating to 
climate change, water conservation, and reduced reliance on the Sacramento-San Joaquin Delta 
ecosystem. The bill would direct all appropriate state agencies to encourage and support the 
elimination of irrigation of nonfunctional turf with potable water. This bill contains other related 
provisions and other existing laws.   (Based on  10/13/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Jaj0mn4iKSDedSryej7+i6hBTH81Xf37deB59hVqSwwApObQhdhuP+SkiSUaOUXQI0+7OLY8jDPbGnOZau+EaZ/sXCpl9bgLGh9OL8OrFbM=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/378
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/378
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1551-1600/ab_1565_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1551-1600/ab_1565_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=+xq7jZKrzwSYJ+V2owQNiYW+vTxWPDYhYbjh4iy6AsDP6ubuJpkU8q6zUeqscpSiy5jwP8woLkGDUIdgBSg39BE2V9aV2eIhg3Lq1qxdB2E=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/440
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1551-1600/ab_1567_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1551-1600/ab_1567_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1551-1600/ab_1567_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E44E7130-AF6D-4C53-A6E6-F59A6D223B1A
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E44E7130-AF6D-4C53-A6E6-F59A6D223B1A
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E44E7130-AF6D-4C53-A6E6-F59A6D223B1A
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E44E7130-AF6D-4C53-A6E6-F59A6D223B1A
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=3mIMT/vK3q2vilv5QB7GbO/lyKul3bJoCYE4E5/YywCIXL5kBd0y1013Xgi/kI8D6tAVvdOu8BEEfbKQz+2GQ8+67wbLPkmINqrxU07bcx0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/445
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1551-1600/ab_1572_90_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1551-1600/ab_1572_90_C_bill.pdf
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AB 1588 Wilson, D 
 

State and 
federal lifeline 
programs: 
eligible 
telecommunicat
ions carrier 
designations: 
expedited 
process. 

07/03/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/5/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law vests the Public Utilities Commission (PUC) with regulatory authority over public 
utilities, including telephone corporations. The Moore Universal Telephone Service Act establishes 
the state lifeline telephone service program to provide low-income households with access to 
affordable basic residential telephone service. Federal law requires a common carrier designated 
as an eligible telecommunications carrier to be eligible to receive universal service support, which 
includes support provided by the federal lifeline program, as specified. Federal law provides 
various pathways for designation as an eligible telecommunications carrier, including, among other 
pathways, designation by a state commission. This bill would require the PUC, as part of a new or 
existing proceeding, to establish an expedited process by which a telephone corporation that 
offers broadband service may become an eligible telecommunications carrier for the purpose of 
providing stand-alone broadband service as part of the state or federal lifeline program, or 
both.   (Based on  07/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1601 Alvarez, D 
 

Jury duty: 
eligibility. 

01/03/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law makes all persons eligible and qualified to be prospective trial jurors, except persons 
who, among other things, are not citizens of the United States. This bill would instead make a 
person eligible and qualified to be a prospective juror if they are a lawful permanent 
resident.   (Based on  01/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1628 McKinnor, D 
 

Microfiber 
filtration. 

10/08/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

01/29/2024 - 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto stricken 
from file.  

10/08/2023 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Would require, on and after January 1, 2029, that all new washing machines sold or offered for 
sale in California for residential or state use contain a microfiber filtration system, as defined, with 
a mesh size not greater than 100 micrometers, and bear a label with a specified consumer notice, 
as provided. The bill would provide that a violation of these provisions is punishable by a specified 
civil penalty, upon an action brought by the Attorney General, a city attorney, a county counsel, or 
a district attorney.    (Based on  09/18/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1630 Garcia, D 
 

Planning and 
zoning: housing 
development 
approvals: 
student 
housing 
projects. 

03/21/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would enact The Student Housing Crisis Act of 2023. The bill would require a city, county, or city 
and county to classify student and faculty and staff housing as a permitted use on all real property 
within 1,000 feet of a university campus, as defined, for zoning purposes. The bill would require a 
proposed student or faculty and staff housing project, as defined, to be considered ministerially, 
without discretionary review or a hearing, if specified requirements are met, including that a 
minimum of 20% of the units in the project be rented by students or faculty and staff of the 
university. The bill would prohibit a local agency from imposing or enforcing on a student or faculty 
and staff housing project subject to ministerial consideration certain restrictions, including a 
minimum automobile parking requirement. The bill would require student or faculty and staff 
housing to have certain recorded deed restrictions, except as provided, that ensure for at least 55 
years that, among other things, at least 20% of the units are affordable to lower income 
households, as defined, except as provided. In connection with an application submitted pursuant 
to these provisions, the bill would require a city, county, or city and county to take specified 
actions, including, upon the request of the applicant, provide a list of permits and fees that are 
required by the city, county, or city and county. By imposing new duties on local jurisdictions, this 
bill would impose a state-mandated local program.    (Based on  03/21/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=pv9Vse4ogEEOHMO8pwsOLGcms6IDX6PUtNHjTkFnmH9ibavpyAHqSHXDaOuU6y632cOKF8B3UQbKDyLOY1/SgKzwLzRGksWL/6sbjLILlzk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/502
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1551-1600/ab_1588_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1551-1600/ab_1588_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1551-1600/ab_1588_94_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=O6zLNAx0SXKIXgvZAaeZIJOxsF7+RXYzjGtgcVvUIxwGlO+5TFpZMyKlcXYkTBO8q6XVlhyVgk6kkdH5/R4dZMzpGmzhAl2/TfeYNauOgoo=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/504
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1601-1650/ab_1601_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1601-1650/ab_1601_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1601-1650/ab_1601_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=76JWV98idmQpCQnM6oRtHxouMwgk4Gh0o3jvLtkrQSBISlpNnvDholoVAwoiuSzKoTbEv71cpExSwqdOAKDIqFtXAL60DkF7+mc4bez6Hnw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/380
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1601-1650/ab_1628_92_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1601-1650/ab_1628_92_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1601-1650/ab_1628_92_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=DNcDDPtuUxk1FlZ8fhrPk0R4zRIPMWfUFPUCq/zLef/SUwqFYHB0G07v3ayKhJd68Za376KZstY8rQVF/LvOs1zElRDkAyXqPEGW3xwFhwk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/440
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1601-1650/ab_1630_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1601-1650/ab_1630_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1601-1650/ab_1630_98_A_bill.pdf
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AB 1633 Ting, D 
 

Housing 
Accountability 
Act: 
disapprovals: 
California 
Environmental 
Quality Act. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
768, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Existing law, the Housing Accountability Act, prohibits a local agency from disapproving a housing 
development project, as described, unless it makes certain written findings based on a 
preponderance of the evidence in the record. The act defines “disapprove the housing 
development project” as including any instance in which a local agency either votes and 
disapproves a proposed housing development project application, including any required land use 
approvals or entitlements necessary for the issuance of a building permit, or fails to comply with 
specified time periods. Existing law, the California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA), requires a 
lead agency, as defined, to prepare, or cause to be prepared, and certify the completion of, an 
environmental impact report on a project that the lead agency proposes to carry out or approve 
that may have a significant effect on the environment or to adopt a negative declaration if the lead 
agency finds that the project will not have that effect. This bill, until January 1, 2031, would define 
“disapprove the housing development project” as also including any instance in which a local 
agency fails to make a determination of whether the project is exempt from CEQA or commits an 
abuse of discretion, as specified, or fails to adopt a negative declaration or addendum for the 
project, to certify an environmental impact report for the project, or to approve another comparable 
environmental document, if certain conditions are satisfied. Among other conditions, the bill would 
require a housing development project subject to these provisions to be located on a legal parcel 
or parcels within an urbanized area and to meet one or more of specified criteria, and to meet or 
exceed 15 dwelling units per acre. By imposing additional duties on local officials, the bill would 
create a state-mandated local program. This bill contains other related provisions and other 
existing laws.   (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1637 Irwin, D 
 

Local 
government: 
internet 
websites and 
email 
addresses. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
586, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/09/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would, no later than January 1, 2029, require a local agency, as defined, that maintains an 
internet website for use by the public to ensure that the internet website utilizes a “.gov” top-level 
domain or a “.ca.gov” second-level domain and would require a local agency that maintains an 
internet website that is noncompliant with that requirement to redirect that internet website to a 
domain name that does utilize a “.gov” or “.ca.gov” domain. This bill, no later than January 1, 2029, 
would also require a local agency that maintains public email addresses to ensure that each email 
address provided to its employees utilizes a “.gov” domain name or a “.ca.gov” domain name. By 
adding to the duties of local officials, the bill would impose a state-mandated local 
program.    (Based on  10/08/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1644 Bonta, D 
 

Medi-Cal: 
medically 
supportive food 
and nutrition 
services. 

04/27/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would make medically supportive food and nutrition interventions, as defined, a covered benefit 
under the Medi-Cal program, upon issuance of final guidance by the State Department of Health 
Care Services. The bill would require medically supportive food and nutrition interventions to be 
covered when determined to be medically necessary by a health care provider or health care plan, 
as specified. In order to qualify for coverage under the Medi-Cal program, the bill would require a 
patient to be offered at least 3 of 6 specified medically supportive food and nutrition interventions 
and for the interventions to be provided for a minimum duration of 12 weeks, as specified. The bill 
would only provide coverage for nutrition support interventions when paired with the provision of 
food through one of the 3 offered interventions. The bill would require a health care provider to 
match the acuity of a patient’s condition to the intensity and duration of the medically supportive 
food and nutrition intervention and include culturally appropriate foods whenever 
possible.   (Based on  04/27/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=cwq5Labe3sMXW0m8487wknQdciK3BKBrwPE9zBviIl1OfnEkC2k12MtJ6BpZiJ9Ii3ckynEniuI2Jm7gIHSNZHhKiFbT1wDEOO4w9BGzJ+w=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/360
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1601-1650/ab_1633_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1601-1650/ab_1633_91_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=jNy74lSsHgyx6uCvHYZyEKoZ2wz6V0dncZRUuhofCc30QhNL/NBZfhKdIcOiM1g54D/ZXHWO+EjskhJXb4mZMC9Kk+9nr5CMpxFjojxgn1Y=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/442
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1601-1650/ab_1637_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1601-1650/ab_1637_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ghevVdApMobsKV1eAgGa3Gk7nBYsS2Bq6hEi5leUw1l9xc+nozSOOpRvX2TXOA0dj3LAs/Epf7n+O9IH0x2g7Jk1BJkZdlC9HHMe5SlstIU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/495
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1601-1650/ab_1644_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1601-1650/ab_1644_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1601-1650/ab_1644_96_A_bill.pdf


Attachment B: Intergovernmental Relations Priority State Legislation Log 
 

Last Updated 12/06/24        82 
 

Measure Author Topic Current 
Text 

Status Location Brief Summary Attachments Position 

AB 1656 Wicks, D 
 

Homelessness: 
funding. 

02/17/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Died at 
Desk.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Existing law establishes various programs to prevent and ameliorate homelessness, including the 
Homeless Youth Act of 2018 and the Homeless Housing, Assistance, and Prevention program. 
This bill would state the intent of the Legislature to enact subsequent legislation to establish an 
ongoing funding source to address the state’s homelessness crisis.   (Based on  02/17/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1657 Wicks, D 
 

The Affordable 
Housing Bond 
Act of 2024. 

03/04/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. on 
3/4/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law authorizes the issuance of bonds in specified amounts pursuant to the State General 
Obligation Bond Law and requires that proceeds from the sale of these bonds be used to finance 
various existing housing programs, capital outlay related to infill development, brownfield cleanup 
that promotes infill development, and housing-related parks. This bill would enact the Affordable 
Housing Bond Act of 2024, which, if adopted, would authorize the issuance of bonds in the amount 
of $10,000,000,000 pursuant to the State General Obligation Bond Law. Proceeds from the sale of 
these bonds would be used to finance programs to fund affordable rental housing and 
homeownership programs, including, among others, the Multifamily Housing Program, the 
CalHome Program, and the Joe Serna, Jr. Farmworker Housing Grant Program. This bill would 
provide for submission of the bond act to the voters at the March 5, 2024, statewide general 
election in accordance with specified law.   (Based on  03/04/2024 text) 

AB 1657 
SUPPORT_19Ap
ril23 
Coalition Letter 
27June23 
AB 1657 Letter of 
Support 
04.03.24.pdf 

Support 

AB 1669 Quirk-Silva, D 
 

California 
Historically 
Significant 
Commercial 
District Act. 

02/17/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would, upon appropriation by the Legislature, establish the California Historically Significant 
District Program for the purpose of revitalizing and maintaining historically and culturally significant 
commercial corridors throughout the state by funding technical assistance, training, and other 
activities that increase the capacity of revitalization entities to provide business assistance 
programs and services that meet the unique needs of small businesses that operate within historic 
commercial districts. The bill would provide that the program be administered by the California 
Business Investment Service Unit within GO-Biz, in consultation with the Community and Placed-
Based Solutions Unit. The bill would require the program to award grants to eligible grantees, as 
defined, who submit an application meeting certain requirements, including, among other things, 
documentation that the applicant has the experience and capacity to provide technical assistance, 
training, and other services that increase the capacity of revitalization entities to use place-based 
tools to improve the entrepreneurial ecosystem to meet the needs of small businesses that 
operate within historic districts. The bill would require training and education topics and uses of the 
grant by the grantee to include, but not be limited to, among other things, onsite assessment and 
training of revitalization entities to develop capacity for implementation of commercial district 
revitalization plans. The bill would require that grant funds be used by the grantee consistent with 
certain requirements, including that at least 40% of the total amount of the grant be used by the 
grantee to provide capacity-building programs and services to eligible historic commercial corridor 
revitalization entities throughout the state, as specified.    (Based on  02/17/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1690 Kalra, D 
 

Universal 
health care 
coverage. 

02/17/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Died at 
Desk.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would state the intent of the Legislature to guarantee accessible, affordable, equitable, and high-
quality health care for all Californians through a comprehensive universal single-payer health care 
program that benefits every resident of the state.   (Based on  02/17/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=RQZs60DfZ6eL3Tze+dxGNt8jaYNbGCcnlsNr9ZTNwB1cTQWsz5xn0zvwWFFe0UrRWYZk2Yv41FzFgS+tsBh27TiDZ1mPzCrUscuteceJV/8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/306
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1651-1700/ab_1656_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1651-1700/ab_1656_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=o2lpobwEcu8XfmrWHHdGewaWj6IASVQDYMJ7zjIzW27zR7N+EO3Ln2UKOWeoX0i1/g1udK5NnU6edIuOrHQXwIh3JFxUM08sSEFhVVFCbhE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/306
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1651-1700/ab_1657_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1651-1700/ab_1657_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1651-1700/ab_1657_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=C5ABA032-9AAD-4439-A880-9AC071AB7E4A
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=C5ABA032-9AAD-4439-A880-9AC071AB7E4A
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=C5ABA032-9AAD-4439-A880-9AC071AB7E4A
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=6509410B-E6CD-4A3B-AB6C-7C9D9C6A49E5
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=6509410B-E6CD-4A3B-AB6C-7C9D9C6A49E5
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=C7628FE8-D335-480A-A35B-CD8DEE1C611F
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=C7628FE8-D335-480A-A35B-CD8DEE1C611F
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=C7628FE8-D335-480A-A35B-CD8DEE1C611F
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=3mLOYOc29K5f91CCyYYiMtRKhHqRkO44HR+hjYp+PBCSKAffOyVNJGGZS/twSf9IllmFzspXmJIdWQIk445ylOYMgZKAvrUh6NcknrBtyN8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/488
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1651-1700/ab_1669_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1651-1700/ab_1669_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=DVFB/UnT5wxy6ai9+ns04QuoZhjHYcl0fQyAPW1KWXNT3ERqOW1NunV95ld7Y4NFOhSF9lNwj06fcPAc0l4dv7NpCX+1pYXVTndMcorYt/o=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/436
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1651-1700/ab_1690_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1651-1700/ab_1690_99_I_bill.pdf
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AB 1700 Hoover, R 
 

California 
Environmental 
Quality Act: 
population 
growth and 
noise impacts: 
housing 
projects. 

02/17/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) requires a lead agency to prepare a mitigated 
negative declaration for a project that may have a significant effect on the environment if revisions 
in the project would avoid or mitigate that effect and there is no substantial evidence that the 
project, as revised, would have a significant effect on the environment. This bill would specify that 
population growth, in and of itself, resulting from a housing project and noise impacts of a housing 
project are not an effect on the environment for purposes of CEQA.   (Based on  02/17/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1708 Muratsuchi, D 
 

Theft. 04/12/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Safe Neighborhoods and Schools Act, enacted by Proposition 47, as approved by the voters 
at the November 4, 2014, statewide general election, defines and prohibits an act of shoplifting 
and prohibits prosecution for an act of shoplifting under any other law. This bill would refine the 
definition of shoplifting and would specifically exclude certain offenses from prosecution as 
shoplifting, including, among others, the theft of a firearm or vehicle, identity theft, and credit card 
fraud.   (Based on  04/12/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1738 Carrillo, 
Wendy, D 
 

Mobile 
Homeless 
Connect Pilot 
Program. 

09/22/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/22/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
Governor. 

09/22/2024 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Would, until January 1, 2031, require the Department of Motor Vehicles to establish the Mobile 
Homeless Connect Pilot Program in specified areas to assist persons experiencing homelessness 
with obtaining an identification card. The bill would require the department, in collaboration with the 
Business, Consumer Services, and Housing Agency, to develop guidelines for each pilot project, 
as specified. The bill would require the department to submit an annual report about the program 
to the Legislature beginning the 3rd year of the pilot program, and on or before each January 1 
thereafter.   (Based on  09/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1748 Ramos, D 
 

Logistics use 
projects: 
sensitive 
receptors. 

05/01/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
From 
committee: 
Filed with 
the Chief 
Clerk 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would prohibit the County of Riverside, the County of San Bernardino, and any of the cities, joint 
powers authorities, or agencies with land use authority within those counties from approving the 
development or expansion of any logistics use, as defined, that is adjacent to sensitive receptors, 
as defined, unless the local agency imposes certain requirements, as specified, including a 
minimum setback on the logistics use of 300 feet if the logistics use consists of 400,000 or more 
square feet of building space, including, but not limited to, warehouses. By imposing new 
requirements on local agencies, the bill would impose a state-mandated local program.    (Based 
on  05/01/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=95nglWqBMmFcK+Ld0XxWxE3yMwr59GEPK0908+hkrET2jliA5D04vzjxa0NghQ9tkFf5oOwWSTzr9a33yPqRczauFludIlvaEhdVqpWYE4E=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/431
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1651-1700/ab_1700_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1651-1700/ab_1700_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=bj71c4FLLSZvvocz8NkQM8gvUHJ0PIuQdN87Iv5opdo0nxdCA0DHHR9ep8jPsZGWvwhV3jlXHo8fEsgz1PWxzzTgZ5b5lU7kxDJRVkQeXU8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/452
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1701-1750/ab_1708_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1701-1750/ab_1708_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1701-1750/ab_1708_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=bAROj78s9z2kq/Khef3YsnAkJNIQsd0R7HsSakh9ALC56jc/X05gi0hv3OKsMmckx4fzyqWVR+lYVFuYCR51TDvDb948rN96x+T/Iz3Uz88=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/411
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/411
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1701-1750/ab_1738_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1701-1750/ab_1738_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1701-1750/ab_1738_94_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=V5fpLR4ta5vneCoab6cVK06wbG4X4dX8qy0KCuw0O1xj7ClSeVyG+CxBdxULcy5FahhNnqYJ2uzH1SO3HvIdsUyPvjIKu+SCH7lclYTKUJU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/473
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1701-1750/ab_1748_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1701-1750/ab_1748_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1701-1750/ab_1748_97_A_bill.pdf
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AB 1764 Committee on 
Housing and 
Community 
Development,  
 

Housing 
omnibus. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
770, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

(1)Existing law exempts a limited-equity housing cooperative or a workforce housing cooperative 
trust, as those terms are defined, from certain requirements governing subdivided lands, if the 
cooperative or trust complies with various conditions, including, among others, if specified federal 
or state agencies, banks, credit unions, financial institutions, or local government agencies, or a 
combination thereof, directly finance or subsidize a percentage of the total construction or 
development cost, as prescribed. This bill would also include a housing authority and a community 
development commission within the above-described entities, and would make other related and 
conforming changes to these provisions. This bill contains other related provisions and other 
existing laws.   (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

  

AB 1772 Ramos, D 
 

Theft. 04/03/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
4/24/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law makes a first conviction for petty theft involving merchandise taken from a merchant’s 
premises punishable by a mandatory fine and as a misdemeanor. This bill would require the 
Department of Justice to determine the number of misdemeanor convictions for a crime of theft for 
which the property was taken from a retail establishment during the Governor’s declared state of 
emergency related to the COVID-19 pandemic, and to report that information to the Legislature on 
or before January 1, 2026.   (Based on  04/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1774 Dixon, R 
 

Vehicles: 
electric 
bicycles. 

07/02/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 55, 
Statutes of 
2024 

07/02/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law defines an electric bicycle as a bicycle equipped with fully operable pedals and an 
electric motor of less than 750 watts, and requires electric bicycles to comply with specified 
equipment and manufacturing requirements. Current law prohibits a person from tampering with or 
modifying an electric bicycle so as to change the speed capability of the bicycle, unless they 
appropriately replace the label indicating the classification required, as specified. A violation of the 
Vehicle Code is a crime. This bill would clarify that the exception to this prohibition only applies if 
the bicycle continues to meet the definition of an electric bicycle. This bill would prohibit a person 
from selling a product or device that can modify the speed capability of an electric bicycle such 
that it no longer meets the definition of an electric bicycle.   (Based on  07/02/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=oefZ+/LrZnNpwcoTMtueqgQhcOmeGwdu5IrRwefoESRU7/LpDf74NULFN6mIRa3plg+wfdSqAvFMLjhVIBs+xPX/jMdCUfdZPTbUdlAy8lk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1764_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1764_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=kz8LK44TuwO8SBKyKv8h83IG2SUXP5+kSVDHe/WKthcKjPgI5lQvkg8XJy0kOtqM03Svd1tTG+gHBu8hv89y57i+fGo87v9Igsy1daLGWtk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/473
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1772_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1772_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1772_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=9qmAAfEptC8oeFzuNC9LV4srFIelS8X8iwzpJcX8qVJMG0TGwtOd6MLEX8U5efBY4uIO2RvirU/eCK3uSG+rSXCl0CdWxPoYcU0vz2LlmAI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/386
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1774_97_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1774_97_C_bill.pdf
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AB 1775 Haney, D 
 

Cannabis: retail 
preparation, 
sale, and 
consumption of 
noncannabis 
food and 
beverage 
products. 

09/30/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/30/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
1004, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/30/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Medicinal and Adult-Use Cannabis Regulation and Safety Act (MAUCRSA) establishes the 
Department of Cannabis Control (department) within the Business, Consumer Services, and 
Housing Agency to administer the act, and requires the department to be under the supervision 
and control of a director. Current law provides that a local jurisdiction may allow for the smoking, 
vaporizing, and ingesting of cannabis or cannabis products on the premises of a retailer or 
microbusiness licensed under this division if certain conditions are met. Current administrative law 
specifies that a licensed retailer or licensed microbusiness authorized for retail sales who operates 
a consumption area on the licensed premises in accordance with this provision may also sell 
prepackaged, noncannabis-infused, nonalcoholic food and beverages if the applicable local 
jurisdiction allows. This bill would authorize a local jurisdiction, if specified conditions are met, to 
allow for the preparation or sale of noncannabis food or beverage products, as specified, by a 
licensed retailer or microbusiness in the area where the consumption of cannabis is allowed, and 
to allow, and to sell tickets for, live musical or other performances on the premises of a licensed 
retailer or microbusiness in the area where the consumption of cannabis is allowed. The bill would 
additionally specify that these provisions do not authorize a licensed retailer or microbusiness to 
prepare or sell industrial hemp or products containing industrial hemp, as provided.   (Based 
on  09/30/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1777 Ting, D 
 

Autonomous 
vehicles. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
682, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/27/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would, commencing July 1, 2026, require manufacturers of autonomous vehicles that operate 
without a human operator physically present in the vehicle, except as provided to comply with 
certain requirements, including, among other things, to maintain a dedicated emergency response 
telephone line that is available for emergency response officials, as defined, and to equip each 
autonomous vehicle with a 2-way voice communication device that enables emergency response 
officials that are near the vehicle to communicate effectively with a remote human operator, as 
specified. The bill would, commencing July 1, 2026, authorize an emergency response official to 
issue an emergency geofencing message, as defined, to a manufacturer and would require a 
manufacturer to direct its fleet to leave or avoid the area identified within 2 minutes of receiving an 
emergency geofencing message, as specified.   (Based on  09/27/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1778 Connolly, D 
 

Vehicles: 
electric 
bicycles. 

09/30/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/30/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
1005, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/30/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would establish the Marin Electric Bicycle Safety Pilot Program that would, until January 1, 2029, 
authorize a local authority within the County of Marin, or the County of Marin in unincorporated 
areas, to adopt an ordinance or resolution that would prohibit a person under 16 years of age from 
operating a class 2 electric bicycle or require a person operating a class 2 electric bicycle to wear 
a bicycle helmet, as specified. The bill would require an ordinance or resolution that is adopted for 
this purpose to make a violation punishable by warning notices for the first 60 days after the 
prohibition comes into effect. After the 60-day period, the bill would require a violation to be an 
infraction punishable by a fine of $25. The bill would prohibit a record of the action from being 
transmitted to the court and a fee from being imposed if the person who violates the ordinance or 
resolution delivers proof to the issuing agency within 120 days after the citation was issued that 
the person has completed specified requirements. The bill would, if an ordinance or resolution is 
adopted, require the county to, by January 1, 2028, submit a report to the Legislature that 
includes, among other things, the total number of traffic stops initiated for violations, the results of 
the traffic stops, and the actions taken by peace officers during the traffic stops, as specified. The 
bill would require the local authority or county to administer a public information campaign for at 
least 30 calendar days prior to the enactment of the ordinance or resolution, as specified.   (Based 
on  09/30/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=lR6LrHCHjjInyXKcweXAS3MQxOccvYPJDByv7R9duv9rgOGZqIDp1iSQnJpcOgtdPA0CxieOGF8PFOZRYYkbkDoBOglPwXw1lrXJk0GLIYs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/503
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1775_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1775_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=RtXgkcGhjtV81Zut519WlMgk3TILkPAjgHlyKNxd0EBiHoaQbskNqcG2ZvXeSv29LLdfdFs3+btCdqypHdUpAfUuFdhzXPZMO2jRjzb+Btk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/360
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1777_90_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1777_90_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=/80N5hY6OAv5nFXMMO/CaaQqmL8Yu1HJCMZdH/mnpWdC/axh1mxVlsWuo5RSLqy0du4Vn/wnaGoSE7hxPTgH4aWhAtlMsZv9nwvWsiacarg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/310
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1778_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1778_93_C_bill.pdf
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AB 1785 Pacheco, D 
 

California 
Public Records 
Act. 

09/25/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/25/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
551, 
Statutes of 
2024 

09/25/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The California Public Records Act prohibits a state or local agency from posting the home address 
or telephone number of any elected or appointed official on the internet without first obtaining the 
written permission of that individual. This bill would instead prohibit a state or local agency from 
publicly posting, as defined, the home address, telephone number, or both the name and assessor 
parcel number associated with the home address of any elected or appointed official on the 
internet without first obtaining the written permission of that individual. By expanding the scope of 
a current provision and thereby increasing the duties of local agencies, the bill would impose a 
state-mandated local program.   (Based on  09/25/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1786 Rodriguez, D 
 

California 
Individual 
Assistance Act: 
California Local 
Assistance Act. 

04/16/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
5/8/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Existing law, the California Emergency Services Act, empowers the Governor to proclaim a state 
of emergency under certain circumstances. This bill would add climate change and climate change 
exacerbated conditions to the list of conditions for which a state of emergency or local emergency 
may be proclaimed.   (Based on  04/16/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1787 Villapudua, D 
 

Theft: 
shoplifting. 

03/18/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
PUB. S. on 
3/18/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Safe Neighborhoods and Schools Act, enacted as an initiative statute by Proposition 47, as 
approved by the electors at the November 4, 2014, statewide general election, makes the theft of 
money, labor, or property petty theft punishable as a misdemeanor, whenever the value of the 
property taken does not exceed $950. Under current law, if the value of the property taken 
exceeds $950, the theft is grand theft, punishable as a misdemeanor or a felony. Proposition 47 
requires shoplifting, defined as entering a commercial establishment with the intent to commit 
larceny if the value of the property taken does not exceed $950, to be punished as a 
misdemeanor. This bill would reduce the threshold amount for petty theft and shoplifting from $950 
to $450. The bill would make a person guilty of petty theft with a prior offense if the person is 
convicted of petty theft or shoplifting and has one or more prior convictions for specified theft-
related offenses and would make the crime punishable by imprisonment in the county jail for up to 
one year or as a felony for a term of 3, 5, or 7 years. This bill would make a person guilty of 
aggregated theft if the person commits 2 or more offenses of shoplifting within a 12-month 
period.    (Based on  03/18/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=5UCcogiWaaLQXWFZOCE/yMWNT1JvuHrgTaXoawKQb2Fn+Yg5WOr175bekxm3vTJPfVyC0tB+n+uHgcvbABNhhTqARpwEetFSNJb2yKW6m/0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/450
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1785_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1785_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=l4QQdbVEMxpjNaFHJy+Kcrx8TNk1Ia/hDkfC9LJmFeezWck0EP1F6IIP47QexvQEoJ2xflDntdLSe6nG2R4tBOTMGN9ML97C2iH9TVezFvM=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/443
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1786_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1786_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1786_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=KJodf8KuDMDE7pjat6hHY2DxhI0TEMEr+n95nG3gm6gZ2DlOOZ/4u/qUezDOiiTcZpCAy4Xe5QuuyehTFBX8Oef2s40QooGYfZbd9dmaHmU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/357
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1787_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1787_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1787_98_A_bill.pdf
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AB 1791 Weber, D 
 

Digital content 
provenance. 

06/20/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
7/1/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would, on and after January 1, 2028, require a social media platform, as defined, to redact 
personal provenance data, as defined, from content uploaded to the social media platform by a 
user, except as prescribed, and would prohibit a social media platform from redacting system 
provenance data, as defined, from content uploaded to the social media platform by a user, except 
as prescribed.   (Based on  06/20/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1794 McCarty, D 
 

Crimes: 
larceny. 

04/11/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/5/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The Safe Neighborhoods and Schools Act, enacted as an initiative statute by Proposition 47, as 
approved by the electors at the November 4, 2014, statewide general election, makes the theft of 
money, labor, or property petty theft punishable as a misdemeanor, whenever the value of the 
property taken does not exceed $950. Under current law, if the value of the property taken 
exceeds $950, the theft is grand theft, punishable as a misdemeanor or a felony. Proposition 47 
requires shoplifting, defined as entering a commercial establishment with the intent to commit 
larceny if the value of the property taken does not exceed $950, to be punished as a 
misdemeanor. Under current law, if the value of all property taken over the course of distinct but 
related acts motivated by one intention, general impulse, and plan exceeds $950, those values 
may be aggregated into a single charge of grand theft. This bill would clarify that those values may 
be aggregated even though the thefts occurred in different places or from different victims. The bill 
would also, declarative of existing law, provide that circumstantial evidence may be used to prove 
that multiple thefts were motivated by one intention, general impulse, and plan.   (Based 
on  04/11/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1798 Papan, D 
 

Department of 
Transportation: 
contaminated 
stormwater 
runoff: salmon 
and steelhead 
trout bearing 
surface waters. 

04/03/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
4/24/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would require the Department of Transportation, in conjunction with the State Water Resources 
Control Board, to develop a programmatic environmental review process to prevent 6PPD and 
6PPD-quinone from entering salmon and steelhead trout bearing surface waters of the state. The 
bill would require the state board to establish the parameters of the department’s programmatic 
environmental review process, as specified, and, to the extent practical, with the department, 
consult with the States of Washington and Oregon in the development of the programmatic 
environmental review process. The bill would require the department’s 6PPD and 6PPD-quinone 
programmatic environmental review process to include specified components, including 5 pilot 
projects at specified locations to study the effectiveness and cost effectiveness of installing and 
maintaining bioretention and biofiltration comparatively along department rights-of-way to eliminate 
the discharge of 6PPD and 6PPD-quinone into surface waters of the state, as specified. The bill 
would require all information provided by the department to the state board pursuant to these 
provisions be made publicly available through the state board’s stormwater data collection 
system.   (Based on  04/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=bjiS5wPdhlRmcW/TAS/GOZCJjpjAAt2sbszNvDDRzAyjK3400l+wLtZ/dOE6998wg9ZFsJEw9cW7wnGvmBrwMYCBYesGwIf4G/PqDKanf18=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/492
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1791_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1791_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1791_94_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=y314Nvaug2gIOTrYGOouviqiqQuBHE3mEgjBoGzqAg43r8BNyFwINNkLCjFIsTJu5drVtye37oHXeN0YlqSutnGJoJ+ALvC9Jl6n7szarXM=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/350
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1794_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1794_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1794_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=OFXAj8pwmiQTRAnqiJowmGR6T9JBLZFGrczXQIOzzdJy6f87ff5G7pVKZJAz9oPt7hCUzDf0ohOsrvyWZUoBopryKz4fY5qT43WfXBI+uo4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/362
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1798_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1798_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1751-1800/ab_1798_97_A_bill.pdf
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AB 1811 Alvarez, D 
 

Jury duty: 
eligibility. 

04/10/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
4/24/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The California Constitution vests the judicial power of the state in the Supreme Court, courts of 
appeal, and superior courts, and establishes the Judicial Council to, among other things, adopt 
rules of court and perform functions prescribed by statute. Current law authorizes the Judicial 
Council to publish and distribute manuals, guides, checklists, and other materials designed to 
assist the judiciary. This bill would, beginning January 1, 2026, and until January 1, 2031, make a 
person eligible and qualified to be a prospective juror if they are a lawful permanent resident. The 
bill would require the Judicial Council to develop a program by January 1, 2026, to allow lawful 
permanent residents to participate in jury duty and would require the program to include specific 
requirements, including a notice stating that lawful permanent residents are eligible, but not 
required, to participate in jury duty, and procedures for courts to limit the sharing and disclosure of 
program and participant information.   (Based on  04/10/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1814 Ting, D 
 

Law 
enforcement 
agencies: facial 
recognition 
technology. 

06/12/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/5/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Previous law, until January 1, 2023, prohibited the use of real-time facial recognition technology 
(FRT) by law enforcement agencies in connection with body-worn cameras. This bill would prohibit 
a law enforcement agency or peace officer from using an FRT-generated match as the sole basis 
for probable cause in an arrest or search. The bill would prohibit a judge from granting an 
application for a warrant based solely on an FRT match. The bill would authorize a court to award 
damages of up to $25,000 to an individual who is subjected to a violation of these provisions and 
reasonable attorney’s fees to the prevailing party.   (Based on  06/12/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1820 Schiavo, D 
 

Housing 
development 
projects: 
applications: 
fees and 
exactions. 

09/22/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/22/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
358, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/22/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires a city or county to deem an applicant for a housing development project to 
have submitted a preliminary application upon providing specified information about the proposed 
project to the city or county from which approval for the project is being sought. Current law 
requires a housing development project be subject only to the ordinances, policies, and standards 
adopted and in effect when the preliminary application was submitted. This bill would authorize a 
development proponent that submits a preliminary application for a housing development project 
to request a preliminary fee and exaction estimate, as defined, and would require a city, county, or 
city and county to provide the estimate within 30 business days of the submission of the 
preliminary application. For development fees imposed by an agency other than a city, county, or 
city and county, the bill would require the development proponent to request the fee schedule from 
the agency that imposes the fee and would require the agency that imposes the fee to provide the 
fee schedule to the development proponent without delay.   (Based on  09/22/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=WRncjYFU49kVczfA6SvAla1zy0XPkDvV6+acLLv2QU1NZqBrmk6/H56WrrVU1xWPWAdnLff5R9/TSeJWho47ONlLlc/dYjO/3B03wZobZiI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/504
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1811_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1811_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1811_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=KIaX3ZumBoV1MvXWZhQJSAqdf4QD/t5tI7yAzxodlXrpOpz4gvyvUyemAU8bJ8ybDZNTM7MXKRsDnsOEL+DUVdgotJvDtewydZmQq08Kg1U=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/360
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1814_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1814_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1814_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=CI+4hNKU9fec8FJmyPf3NcyiOTCcus/fsHcsjNC4UaeZzvCdMOYZkwF/eaNlrc8AcslXS1CneMrbaxb+k/33gGNHYMG0BZt9l9IWgQss7I4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/441
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1820_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1820_91_C_bill.pdf
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AB 1824 Valencia, D 
 

California 
Consumer 
Privacy Act of 
2018: opt out 
right: mergers. 

09/29/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/29/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
940, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/29/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The California Consumer Privacy Act of 2018 (CCPA) grants a consumer various rights with 
respect to personal information that is collected or sold by a business, as defined, including the 
right to direct a business that sells or shares personal information about the consumer to third 
parties not to sell or share the consumer’s personal information, as specified. The California 
Privacy Rights Act of 2020, approved by the voters as Proposition 24 at the November 3, 2020, 
statewide general election, amended, added to, and reenacted the CCPA. This bill would require a 
business to which another business transfers the personal information of a consumer as an asset 
that is part of a merger, acquisition, bankruptcy, or other transaction in which the transferee 
assumes control of all or part of the transferor to comply with a consumer’s opt-out direction to the 
transferor.   (Based on  09/29/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1825 Muratsuchi, D 
 

California 
Freedom to 
Read Act. 

09/29/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/29/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
941, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/29/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law establishes a public library system, including school libraries, unified school district 
and union high school district public libraries, municipal libraries, county free libraries, the 
California State Library, and library districts. Under current law, the Legislature declares that the 
public library is, among other things, a source of information and inspiration to persons of all ages, 
cultural backgrounds, and economic statuses. This bill would require every public library 
jurisdiction, as defined, that directly receives any state funding to establish, adopt, and maintain a 
written and publicly accessible collection development policy for its libraries by January 1, 2026, as 
specified. The bill would require the collection development policy to, among other things, (1) 
guide the selection and deselection of library materials, as defined, and (2) establish a process for 
community members to share their concerns regarding library materials and request materials be 
reconsidered for inclusion in the library’s collection.   (Based on  09/29/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1827 Papan, D 
 

Local 
government: 
fees and 
charges: water: 
higher 
consumptive 
water parcels. 

09/22/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/22/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
359, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/22/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The California Constitution specifies various requirements with respect to the levying of 
assessments and property-related fees and charges by a local agency, including requiring that the 
local agency provide public notice and a majority protest procedure in the case of assessments 
and submit property-related fees and charges for approval by property owners subject to the fee or 
charge or the electorate residing in the affected area following a public hearing. Current law, 
known as the Proposition 218 Omnibus Implementation Act, prescribes specific procedures and 
parameters for local jurisdictions to comply with these requirements and, among other things, 
authorizes an agency providing water, wastewater, sewer, or refuse collection services to adopt a 
schedule of fees or charges authorizing automatic adjustments that pass through increases in 
wholesale charges for water, sewage treatment, or wastewater treatment or adjustments for 
inflation under certain circumstances. Current law defines, among other terms, the term “water” for 
these purposes to mean any system of public improvements intended to provide for the 
production, storage, supply, treatment, or distribution of water from any source. This bill would 
provide that the fees or charges for property-related water service imposed or increased, as 
specified, may include the incrementally higher costs of water service due to specified factors, 
including the higher water usage demand of parcels.   (Based on  09/22/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=fmSrrmuN9Tk5ML/0+aHanS/r6q+I+4rrBx0W5q881cTEpBL3oCQ7sKMvdOjNVh2d0A5bqNt1rBUYEyN1WR1uMz0k5a7I/pQzKZTsqu1fmFQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/327
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1824_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1824_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=KfiwYJVwZj8g7GXUEunOHeMzOHC7sckdJVheoAvGEiC8ANnAjfyYh8ldBQKMTvhRTVRmUKGoXxOOEWmpiW2pu6xcxFID37FDr91LWoO+rVU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/452
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1825_90_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1825_90_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Zc+2rGqzbGBY3KiWw6rLXMnsqLHOjw8wFq8Ad/DP8v/nFsaKBZIzJuqFBx7jwVIUv4S2X5GGAC5Pz1gJlwE714PwUhs68T0CH38YO0VOrhQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/362
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1827_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1827_96_C_bill.pdf
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AB 1831 Berman, D 
 

Crimes: child 
pornography. 

09/29/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/29/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
926, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/29/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law prohibits the production, development, duplication, distribution, or possession, as 
specified, of matter, in specified formats, that depicts a person under 18 years of age engaging in 
or simulating sexual conduct, as defined. Current law separately prohibits this conduct where it is 
done for consideration or where such matter is shared with a minor. Current law provides an 
enhanced punishment when these offenses are committed using government property. This bill 
would expand the scope of certain of these provisions to include matter that is digitally altered or 
generated by the use of artificial intelligence, as such matter is defined.   (Based on  09/29/2024 
text) 

SJPD Ltr of AB 
1831 Support.pdf 

Support 

AB 1836 Bauer-Kahan, 
D 
 

Use of 
likeness: digital 
replica. 

09/17/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/17/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
258, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/17/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law establishes a cause of action for damages on behalf of specified injured parties for the 
unauthorized use of a deceased personality’s name, voice, signature, photograph, or likeness in 
any manner, on or in products, merchandise, or goods, or for purposes of advertising or selling, or 
soliciting purchases of, products, merchandise, goods, or services within 70 years of the 
personality’s death, except as specified. Current law specifies that for the above-described 
provision, a play, book, magazine, newspaper, musical composition, audiovisual work, radio or 
television program, single and original work of art, work of political or newsworthy value, or an 
advertisement or commercial announcement for any of these works, shall not be considered a 
product, article of merchandise, good, or service if it is fictional or nonfictional entertainment, or a 
dramatic, literary, or musical work. This bill would make a person who produces, distributes, or 
makes available the digital replica of a deceased personality’s voice or likeness in an expressive 
audiovisual work or sound recording without specified prior consent liable to any injured party in an 
amount equal to the greater of $10,000 or the actual damages suffered by a person controlling the 
rights to the deceased personality’s likeness, except as prescribed.   (Based on  09/17/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1837 Papan, D 
 

San Francisco 
Bay area: 
public transit: 
Regional 
Network 
Management 
Council. 

03/21/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
TRANS. on 
5/29/2024) 

07/02/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law creates the Metropolitan Transportation Commission as a local area planning agency 
for the 9-county San Francisco Bay area with comprehensive regional transportation planning and 
other related responsibilities. Current law creates various transit districts located in the San 
Francisco Bay area, with specified powers and duties relating to providing public transit services. 
Current law requires the commission to adopt rules and regulations to promote the coordination of 
fares and schedules for all public transit systems within its jurisdiction, as specified. This bill would 
create the Regional Network Management Council as an 11-member council to represent the 
interests of its stakeholders, to provide leadership and critical input on regional transit policies, and 
to provide executive guidance on regional transit policies and actionable implementation plans in 
pursuit of transformative improvements in the customer experience San Francisco Bay area 
transit. The bill would require the commission to facilitate the creation of the council.   (Based 
on  03/21/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=H+9ztklhs1UxAKpfnLKb0eXqBBc60B+DfZlwHcexRrVHVt/V/aMWIVAdvg9P0JulUStbO0epJM8bg+U3PGK0mMv52NjR9RUhULsV8huoCvU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/364
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1831_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1831_91_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=6D5E2EE4-6C9C-4188-9E18-657A98A59BFC
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=6D5E2EE4-6C9C-4188-9E18-657A98A59BFC
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=pk8ksbE+eUErPR2kM9mql7nQCYdj8CT0h+OwBtfHsn3xe8p5rfDu+SD9DV/JBX7ZiEWwFFKPmMLAewOO9V13ns4LLQPSY8EydvWiF+HwJa0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/434
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/434
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1836_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1836_92_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=C638Q+K2ajbrMs+R04bwgwI7PJDlLZbfrbvMRvfA9O0Orjryxc45GtX3Xz+ulR9aOzDsw1fR0+Ovh9OHx0lQaAEyhD6yF6nazci1vfIzGV0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/362
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1837_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1837_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1837_98_A_bill.pdf
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AB 1848 Davies, R 
 

Controlled 
substances: 
fentanyl. 

03/21/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
PUB. S. on 
1/29/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law makes it a crime to solicit or encourage a minor to commit specified crimes relating to 
controlled substances, to hire or employ a minor to transport or sell controlled substances, or to 
sell or give controlled substances to minors. Current law makes a person who is 18 years of age or 
older who violates these provisions with respect to heroin, cocaine, or cocaine base on the 
grounds of specified buildings, including, among others, playgrounds and childcare facilities, 
subject to punishment with an additional enhancement in the state prison of one year. This bill 
would make that enhancement also apply to a violation of those provisions with respect to fentanyl 
if the person had knowledge that the specific controlled substance they possessed was 
fentanyl.   (Based on  03/21/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1858 Ward, D 
 

Comprehensive 
school safety 
plans: active 
shooters: 
armed 
assailants: 
drills. 

09/24/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/24/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
530, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/24/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Under current law, each school district and county office of education is responsible for the overall 
development of a comprehensive school safety plan for each of its schools operating kindergarten 
or any of grades 1 to 12, inclusive, in cooperation with certain local entities. Current law requires 
that the plan include identification of appropriate strategies and programs that will provide or 
maintain a high level of school safety and address the school’s procedures for complying with 
existing laws related to school safety. Current law requires the comprehensive school safety plan 
to include the development of procedures for conducting tactical responses to criminal incidents, 
including procedures related to individuals with guns on school campuses and at school-related 
functions. This bill would additionally require, as part of the comprehensive school safety plan, if 
the plan includes procedures to prepare for active shooters or other armed assailants by 
conducting a drill, the development of specified procedures relating to that drill.   (Based 
on  09/24/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1886 Alvarez, D 
 

Housing 
Element Law: 
substantial 
compliance: 
Housing 
Accountability 
Act. 

09/19/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/19/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
267, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/19/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Planning and Zoning Law requires a city or county to adopt a general plan for land use 
development within its boundaries that includes, among other things, a housing element. Current 
law, commonly referred to as the Housing Element Law, prescribes requirements for a city’s or 
county’s preparation of, and compliance with, its housing element, and requires the Department of 
Housing and Community Development to review and determine whether the housing element 
substantially complies with the Housing Element Law, as specified. If the department finds that a 
draft housing element or amendment does not substantially comply with the Housing Element 
Law, current law requires the legislative body of the city or county to either (A) change the draft 
element or amendment to substantially comply with the Housing Element Law or (B) adopt the 
draft housing element or amendment without changes and make specified findings as to why the 
draft element or amendment substantially complies with the Housing Element Law despite the 
findings of the department. This bill would provide that a housing element or amendment is 
considered substantially compliant with the Housing Element Law when the local agency has 
adopted a housing element or amendment, the department or a court of competent jurisdiction 
determines the adopted housing element or amendment to be in substantial compliance with the 
Housing Element Law, and the department’s compliance findings have not been superseded by 
subsequent contrary findings by the department or by a decision of a court of competent 
jurisdiction or the court’s decision has not been overturned or superseded by a subsequent court 
decision or by statute.   (Based on  09/19/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=JGSaa1ThqP9qpz1LSm2IfiHimjXaZxHxmDGII+VVnudYA8+iCEGhOM/A51DrOO6Uxn6AdMFXR8J0xyhKQ3Y9adlDJCr/3y6fW3a7Q3COOCs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/455
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1848_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1848_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1801-1850/ab_1848_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=9i/7f46T1HQFYHV6f4L6jy2QdQEpD5GzubxgXyDG8f1o8/wEm45Mbo1RmUqvFAJlp36tGN8svTV3TsVR4sPYyu6D0ztDl3rqGpvozDfMD0E=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/328
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1851-1900/ab_1858_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1851-1900/ab_1858_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ETsVCDzHOyTznmx6zTMFveCrC3LfX1efTeAXWbDhwFEdFUWqoMyezz5s0tbJtpgci28a0zVvIbGEQkdZZUcW1UJDTr0Y6xa8/LLdIkcRz3E=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/504
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1851-1900/ab_1886_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1851-1900/ab_1886_92_C_bill.pdf
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AB 1893 Wicks, D 
 

Housing 
Accountability 
Act: housing 
disapprovals: 
required local 
findings. 

09/19/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/19/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
268, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/19/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Housing Element Law prescribes requirements for a city’s or county’s preparation of, and 
compliance with, its housing element, and requires the Department of Housing and Community 
Development to review and determine whether the housing element substantially complies with 
the Housing Element Law, as specified. The Housing Accountability Act, among other things, 
prohibits a local agency from disapproving, or conditioning approval in a manner that renders 
infeasible, a housing development project for very low, low-, or moderate-income households 
unless the local agency makes written findings as to one of certain sets of conditions, as specified. 
Among these conditions, the act allows a local agency to disapprove a housing development 
project that is inconsistent with the jurisdiction’s zoning ordinances and general plan land use 
designation as it existed on the date the application was deemed complete, if the jurisdiction has 
adopted a revised housing element that is in substantial compliance with the Housing Element 
Law, as specified. This bill would make various changes to that condition. The bill would specify 
that a local agency may disapprove or condition approval of a housing development project or 
emergency shelter, as described above, if the local agency makes written findings that on the date 
the application for the housing development project or emergency shelter was deemed complete 
the jurisdiction did not have an adopted revised housing element that was in substantial 
compliance with the Housing Element Law and the housing development project is not a builder’s 
remedy project, as defined.   (Based on  09/19/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1904 Ward, D 
 

Transit buses: 
yield right-of-
way sign. 

09/25/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/25/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
555, 
Statutes of 
2024 

09/25/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law authorizes a transit bus in the Santa Cruz Metropolitan Transit District and the Santa 
Clara Valley Transportation Authority to be equipped with a yield right-of-way sign on the left rear 
of the bus if the applicable entity approves a resolution requesting that this section be made 
applicable to it. Current law requires the sign to be designed to warn a person operating a motor 
vehicle approaching the rear of the bus that the bus is entering traffic and be illuminated by a red 
flashing light when the bus is signaling in preparation for entering a traffic lane after having 
stopped to receive or discharge passengers. This bill would expand the authorization to equip 
transit buses, as described above, to apply to any transit agency if the transit agency approves a 
resolution that this authorization be made applicable to it.    (Based on  09/25/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=mLWkCTU0oewqyF37gUBKneH13QgfNNc+5ezYn120Dz/KrHp9syeqMDHJArI3+LEdS3RNysxHKG0D+DV8SE7lbcnmDhRjZI6m2wnyG65Sovk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/306
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1851-1900/ab_1893_89_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1851-1900/ab_1893_89_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=rrsfa7Rb7Ap/L4YzLCBcN/eqC/wPLsKcMP47AhGQllk2WEuYFuOyciCWort0cQFfUkeLj1wuChcylDerimAgCMp4/+t7x5XdgfNFC8CrBZ8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/328
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1901-1950/ab_1904_97_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1901-1950/ab_1904_97_C_bill.pdf
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AB 1906 Gipson, D 
 

California Law 
Revision 
Commission: 
persons with 
disabilities: 
terminology. 

09/14/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/14/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
233, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/14/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires the California Law Revision Commission to study any topic that the 
Legislature, by concurrent resolution or statute, refers to the commission. Existing law establishes 
the Committee on Revision of the Penal Code, within the commission, to study and make 
recommendations related to the Penal Code to achieve various objectives, including simplifying 
criminal law and procedure. Current law uses the terms “dependent adult” and “dependent person” 
to refer to a person, regardless of whether the person lives independently, who is between the 
ages of 18 and 64 and has physical or mental limitations that restrict their ability to carry out 
normal activities or to protect their rights, as specified. Current law uses those terms in various 
provisions related to, among other topics, prohibitions on, prescribes penalties for, mandated 
reporting of, and settlements, protective orders, and law enforcement training related to, the 
commission of specified offenses committed against those persons. Current federal law requires 
the Governor to designate a private nonprofit corporation in this state for the protection and 
advocacy of persons with disabilities, as specified. Current state law refers to this entity as “the 
protection and advocacy agency.” This bill would require the California Law Revision Commission, 
with input from stakeholders, including the protection and advocacy agency, to complete and 
submit to the Legislature a study on how to remove the terms “dependent adult” and “dependent 
person” from existing code sections, including those that use the term “dependent” in conjunction 
with the term “elder,” as specified. The bill would require the commission, as part of the study, to 
convene a working group that includes the protection and advocacy agency, the State Department 
of Social Services, persons described by those terms, and groups representing those 
persons.   (Based on  09/14/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1958 Berman, D 
 

Santa Clara 
Valley 
Transportation 
Authority: 
board of 
directors. 

06/17/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
TRANS. on 
5/1/2024) 

07/02/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law creates the Santa Clara Valley Transportation Authority (VTA) with various powers 
and duties relative to transportation projects and services and the operation of public transit in the 
County of Santa Clara. Current law vests the government of the VTA in a 12-member board of 
directors, appointed by the County of Santa Clara and the cities within the county, as specified. 
Current law requires, to the extent possible, the county and cities to appoint individuals to the 
board of directors who have expertise, experience, or knowledge relative to transportation issues. 
Existing law establishes a term length of 2 years for a member of the board of directors. This bill 
would require, to the extent possible, the county and cities to appoint individuals to the board of 
directors who have expertise, experience, or knowledge relative to transit or transportation 
issues.   (Based on  06/17/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1961 Wicks, D 
 

End Hunger in 
California Act 
of 2024. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
Governor. 

09/27/2024 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Current law establishes the Department of Food and Agriculture, under the control of the Secretary 
of Food and Agriculture, to promote and protect the agricultural industry of the state. Under current 
law, the policy of the state is that every human being has the right to access sufficient, affordable, 
and healthy food. Current law establishes various food assistance programs, including, among 
others, the federal Supplemental Nutrition Assistance Program (SNAP), known in California as 
CalFresh, under which supplemental nutrition assistance benefits allocated to the state by the 
federal government are distributed to eligible individuals by each county. This bill would require the 
Department of Food and Agriculture, in consultation with specified entities, to appoint and convene 
the End Hunger in California Master Plan Task Force to make recommendations for future 
comprehensive strategies aimed at addressing access to healthy and culturally relevant food for all 
Californians. The bill would require the task force to meet at least twice per year and to be 
composed of 25 members, from specified agencies and with specified knowledge and expertise in 
various food-related subject matters.   (Based on  09/05/2024 text) 

AB 1961 Support 
Letter 
06.04.24.pdf 
Updated Support 
Letter 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=H0yB/ktjP3s/YSLIzdHwm8HFRxJLAh/3CAS8jbWgienVsl2z7T4EHcX8WwVqnZ0/Xztl0toEcM/LELiuvGP+qkI1bB5o3qDQTILPJ5oa1SQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/451
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1901-1950/ab_1906_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1901-1950/ab_1906_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=nh3/XjXrShDogr2DH7uyIZ7iqL39dmOafMk5L5v9gLNC1J8fzfTT2jUB4tzaBR36DeKYnVlRNN/veWMFe3tC3x3EQkUJfmugDBP+7GOsqx8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/364
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1951-2000/ab_1958_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1951-2000/ab_1958_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1951-2000/ab_1958_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=en5b+rKEmb4QXh/QSzAq14wol5q/4+hJvvt8V0jTUeaxyqAavqpCEUsLhHuyl6nvCN4bk853NQdZej2nGYYIegfnUs3UGSLOufVLsMoj2GA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/306
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1951-2000/ab_1961_93_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1951-2000/ab_1961_93_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1951-2000/ab_1961_93_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=42864D28-6EEB-44EF-937D-EE9504A280F9
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=42864D28-6EEB-44EF-937D-EE9504A280F9
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=42864D28-6EEB-44EF-937D-EE9504A280F9
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=09916BF1-E5E9-4A85-ADC9-E4293F0651A3
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=09916BF1-E5E9-4A85-ADC9-E4293F0651A3
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AB 1967 Jackson, D 
 

Food Insecurity 
Officer. 

04/16/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
7/1/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would create, within the State Department of Social Services, a Food Insecurity Officer, to be 
appointed by, and serve at the pleasure of, the Governor. The Food Insecurity Officer would be 
required to report to the Secretary of California Health and Human Services, or the Secretary’s 
designee, of the California Health and Human Services Agency. The bill would require the Food 
Insecurity Officer to coordinate and address food insecurity throughout state government 
operations and would authorize the Food Insecurity Officer to engage with state entities for these 
purposes, as specified. The bill would include among the Food Insecurity Officer’s duties 
advancing the benefit adequacy and enrollment rates of the CalFresh and California Food 
Assistance Program (CFAP), as specified. The bill would require the Food Insecurity Officer to 
consult with relevant state entities and stakeholders with expertise in food insecurity and related 
best practices in carrying out their duties. The bill would also require the Food Insecurity Officer, 
beginning January 1, 2026, to submit an annual report to the relevant policy and budget 
committees of the Legislature that includes, among other things, data on food insecurity, CalFresh 
and CFAP enrollment rates, and budgetary and policy recommendations, as specified.   (Based 
on  04/16/2024 text) 

AB 1967 Support 
Letter 
06.04.24.pdf 
Updated Support 
Letter 

Support 

AB 1972 Alanis, R 
 

Regional 
property crimes 
task force. 

08/16/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

08/16/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
167, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

08/16/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law authorizes the Governor to appoint and commission individuals designated by a 
railroad company to serve as police officers. Current law, until January 1, 2026, requires the 
Department of the California Highway Patrol to coordinate with the Department of Justice to 
convene a regional property crimes task force to identify geographic areas experiencing increased 
levels of property crimes and assist local law enforcement with resources, such as personnel and 
equipment. This bill would require the task force to assist railroad police and would specify cargo 
theft as a property crime for consideration by the regional property crimes task force.   (Based 
on  08/16/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1978 Sanchez, R 
 

Vehicles: 
speed contests. 

09/23/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/23/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
501, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/23/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would authorize a peace officer to not take a person into custody for a violation of obstructing or 
placing a barricade or obstruction upon a highway or in an offstreet parking facility for the purpose 
of facilitating or aiding a motor vehicle speed contest or exhibition of speed, as specified, if the 
peace officer causes the removal and seizure of the vehicle used to commit that offense.   (Based 
on  09/23/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=AXUO/c5jaOAtpnVryTSxBVcLvcPxNbRBc41jRiPo7U/x29iCqQkmtslfrsm0SiJRhoMtGxdfvHj4jTmetNoBLFAd4Vsb8QS92EWwKcsyf9k=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/379
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1951-2000/ab_1967_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1951-2000/ab_1967_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1951-2000/ab_1967_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=7B3668E1-B418-484E-9011-8A7171F3F48E
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=7B3668E1-B418-484E-9011-8A7171F3F48E
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=7B3668E1-B418-484E-9011-8A7171F3F48E
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=ACA8C80D-14E3-497F-B3BD-7B261E0B6BD8
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=ACA8C80D-14E3-497F-B3BD-7B261E0B6BD8
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=M+BJ++Rm4tOmwzfIxd1ySSW8Icwh6WXTwKka15bnlhQLl73v5nd1f6vG9D/mzBQK+/hKOISRIkQADoLnDwzTPK8qJNt10FTykUS7VynNxIs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/363
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1951-2000/ab_1972_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1951-2000/ab_1972_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=bFc55xd8sreHPCtTLrue83oVfZK7lrLFOuPUcjQrhSTIA+TNfZ+vk2s8WT823pcyt4ync1Sm+Egwd6DcqOd9BJ6VD26aRzPFuQh6tUffjOE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/329
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1951-2000/ab_1978_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1951-2000/ab_1978_94_C_bill.pdf
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AB 1990 Carrillo, 
Wendy, D 
 

Criminal 
procedure: 
arrests: 
shoplifting. 

04/16/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
PUB. S. on 
6/5/2024) 

07/02/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law prohibits shoplifting, defined as entering a commercial establishment with intent to 
commit theft while that establishment is open during regular business hours, where the value of 
the property that is taken or intended to be taken does not exceed $950. Current law authorizes a 
peace officer to make a warrantless arrest for a misdemeanor when the officer has probable cause 
to believe the person to be arrested has committed the misdemeanor in the officer’s presence. 
Current law also authorizes a private person to make an arrest for a misdemeanor committed in 
their presence, and requires the person to deliver the arrested person to a peace officer or 
magistrate. Current law additionally authorizes a merchant to detain a person for a reasonable 
time and in a reasonable manner to determine if a person has unlawfully taken merchandise. 
Current law authorizes a peace officer to make a warrantless arrest for specified misdemeanors 
relating to domestic violence, violation of a restraining order, and carrying a concealed firearm at 
an airport that did not occur in the officer’s presence. This bill would authorize a peace officer to 
make a warrantless arrest for a misdemeanor shoplifting offense not committed in the officer’s 
presence if the officer has probable cause to believe that person has committed shoplifting, as 
specified.   (Based on  04/16/2024 text) 

AB 1990 - 
Support 
05.14.24.pdf 

Support 

AB 1993 Kalra, D 
 

Residential 
care facilities 
for the elderly: 
maximum 
number of 
residents. 

05/16/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/5/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The California Residential Care Facilities for the Elderly Act (act), requires the State Department of 
Social Services to license, inspect, and regulate residential care facilities for the elderly, as 
defined, and imposes criminal penalties on a person who violates the act or who willfully or 
repeatedly violates any rule or regulation adopted under the act. Under current law, whether or not 
unrelated persons are living together, a residential care facility for the elderly that serves 6 or 
fewer persons is considered a residential use of property, as specified. This bill would increase the 
maximum number of residents served for purposes of those provisions from 6 to 8.   (Based 
on  05/16/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 1999 Irwin, D 
 

Electricity: fixed 
charges. 

05/08/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
5/16/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law authorizes the Public Utilities Commission to adopt new, or expand existing, fixed 
charges, as defined, for the purpose of collecting a reasonable portion of the fixed costs of 
providing electrical service to residential customers. Under current law, the commission may 
authorize fixed charges for any rate schedule applicable to a residential customer account. Current 
law requires the commission, no later than July 1, 2024, to authorize a fixed charge for default 
residential rates. Current law requires these fixed charges to be established on an income-
graduated basis, with no fewer than 3 income thresholds, so that low-income ratepayers in each 
baseline territory would realize a lower average monthly bill without making any changes in usage. 
This bill would prohibit modifications to the amount of the income-graduated fixed charge from 
exceeding changes in inflation, as provided. The bill would make the provisions authorizing the 
income-graduated fixed charge inoperative on July 1, 2028. The bill, commencing July 1, 2028, 
would instead permit the commission to authorize fixed charges that, as of January 1, 2015, do not 
exceed $5 per residential customer account per month for low-income customers enrolled in the 
California Alternate Rates for Energy (CARE) program and that do not exceed $10 per residential 
customer account per month for customers not enrolled in the CARE program.   (Based 
on  05/08/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=/CsgmX82ADdGsqDXpr2oCITolkK7QAD8e7ji1McP8FSLeaOVCg8YuxCjuDpbAgaZFG/KHxlpzGc0T3GuTZH4MbbihvUElHKXKggx8wctjeU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/411
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/411
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1951-2000/ab_1990_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1951-2000/ab_1990_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1951-2000/ab_1990_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=32F5B0EE-7BDD-488B-8817-AC0266E79344
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=32F5B0EE-7BDD-488B-8817-AC0266E79344
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=32F5B0EE-7BDD-488B-8817-AC0266E79344
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=pKuI60eqEI+o2c3wW+kPuRpmiCUV0rrAB2EPRL8Yn3hZoT0aehlcty5CoIDkCb/flBuFRNwRdaxXiRqKJ39vGkGmeGoBpzEAbnklp98tHwk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/436
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1951-2000/ab_1993_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1951-2000/ab_1993_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1951-2000/ab_1993_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=+2bNahbLs1kQ/T+fi/Sl5Fc9Mh1uMTQN6pLqRKkV5zvlZLffcT+Aa7HMiDdxl+qQeo8FK5QE7fEmswAN4IsjGzfdJUcrMdBn8cABoUqKsTc=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/442
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1951-2000/ab_1999_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1951-2000/ab_1999_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_1951-2000/ab_1999_98_A_bill.pdf


Attachment B: Intergovernmental Relations Priority State Legislation Log 
 

Last Updated 12/06/24        96 
 

Measure Author Topic Current 
Text 

Status Location Brief Summary Attachments Position 

AB 2002 Sanchez, R 
 

Vehicles: public 
safety: Blue 
Envelope 
Program. 

03/06/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
4/17/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law establishes the Department of Motor Vehicles, tasked with issuance and renewal of 
licenses to drivers. Current law requires the department to prescribe and provide suitable forms of 
applications, certificates of ownership, registration cards, driver’s licenses, and all other forms that 
are deemed necessary. This bill would, by January 1, 2026, require the department, in 
consultation with relevant stakeholders, to develop a Blue Envelope Program. Under the program, 
the bill would require the blue envelope to contain specified information for requesters with a 
condition or disability, as specified.   (Based on  03/06/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2008 Wallis, R 
 

Reliable 
Energy Needs 
for Everyone in 
the West 
Program. 

03/06/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
U. & E. on 
3/7/2024) 

07/02/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law requires the State Energy Resources Conservation and Development Commission to 
administer the Clean Transportation Program to develop and deploy innovative technologies that 
transform California’s fuel and vehicle types to help attain the state’s climate change policies. This 
bill would require the commission, upon appropriation by the Legislature for the bill’s purpose, to 
establish and implement the Reliable Energy Needs for Everyone in the West Program to provide 
financial incentives for purchasing renewable propane, renewable hydrogen, or renewable 
dimethyl ether to customers in heating dominant climate zones in California where combustion 
fuels will continue to be the lowest cost and most effective means for providing space and water 
heating to buildings, as provided.   (Based on  03/06/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2023 Quirk-Silva, D 
 

Housing 
element: 
inventory of 
land: 
substantial 
compliance: 
rebuttable 
presumptions. 

09/19/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/19/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
269, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/19/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law, commonly referred to as the Housing Element Law, prescribes requirements for a 
city’s or county’s preparation of, and compliance with, its housing element, and requires the 
Department of Housing and Community Development to review and determine whether the 
housing element substantially complies with the Housing Element Law, as specified. Current law 
requires the housing element to include an inventory of land suitable and available for residential 
development. If that inventory of sites does not identify adequate sites to accommodate the need 
for groups of all household income levels, as provided, current law requires that the local 
government rezone sites within 3 years after the date the housing element is adopted or within one 
year if the local government fails to adopt a housing element that the department finds to be in 
substantial compliance with the Housing Element Law within 120 days of the statutory deadline to 
adopt the housing element. This bill, for the 7th and each subsequent revision of the housing 
element, would require a local government to complete the rezoning of sites within one year of the 
statutory deadline for the adoption of the housing element or 3 years and 90 days of the statutory 
deadline if the local government satisfies certain requirements, including submitting a draft 
element or draft amendment to the department for review within specified timeframes and adopting 
a draft element or draft amendment that the department finds to be in substantial compliance with 
the Housing Element Law, as specified.   (Based on  09/19/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=bzLSgwrhkUAbYL4PbZeZ7u3P2RpuT5pPl6fMsl2yVpaSBmfbnpfyTvRuvGD5rT3TssX4SMtS5E0v8l8RyvFG6zP4KbzNt/pCV3a7zqJx/iY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/329
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2001-2050/ab_2002_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2001-2050/ab_2002_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2001-2050/ab_2002_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=lKJMbOwkUp0lZFsS1u50nqpF076e8GCyalCyp909+EjtojnnHL5W8BI3kKD8ZsFTmmwqVn4YMhE8VGvSxzQK4qaaxXmgiL1ZfRW+1yumTsg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/372
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2001-2050/ab_2008_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2001-2050/ab_2008_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2001-2050/ab_2008_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ygQ7Up24d48agXuVN5K4+mYVaVrVuAJjAeY7jCKRBYYi4creG9mHzbGWyiiYMhCYRw8HEQjIl8+PKTyPMu0yY4nnPsNgQ6FggeFzHRWV0fg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/488
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2001-2050/ab_2023_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2001-2050/ab_2023_93_C_bill.pdf
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AB 2030 Davies, R 
 

Public 
contracts: small 
business 
participation. 

02/01/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
5/1/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Small Business Procurement and Contract Act authorizes a state agency to award a contract 
for goods, services, or information technology with an estimated value of greater than $5,000 but 
less than $250,000 to a certified small business, including a microbusiness and a disabled veteran 
business enterprise, without complying with certain competitive bidding requirements, if the 
agency obtains price quotations from 2 or more of those businesses, as specified. Current law 
requires a state agency to consider a responsive offer timely received from a responsible certified 
small business, including a microbusiness, or from a disabled veteran business enterprise. This bill 
would expand the above-described authorization to permit a state agency to award a contract for 
goods, services, or information technology with an estimated value of greater than $5,000 but less 
than $250,000 to an LGBT business enterprise, a minority business enterprise, or a women 
business enterprise, as defined.    (Based on  02/01/2024 text) 

AB 2030 Support 
05.17.24.pdf 

Support 

AB 2034 Rodriguez, D 
 

Crimes: 
loitering for the 
purpose of 
engaging in a 
prostitution 
offense. 

02/01/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
PUB. S. on 
2/12/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would make it a misdemeanor to loiter in a public place with the intent to commit prostitution, as 
defined, and make other conforming changes. By creating a new crime, this bill would impose a 
state-mandated local program.    (Based on  02/01/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2037 Papan, D 
 

Weights and 
measures: 
electric vehicle 
chargers. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
692, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/27/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law regulates advertising that indicates the price of motor vehicle fuel, including electricity 
sold as a motor vehicle fuel. Current law requires a county sealer to enforce the advertising 
requirements. Current law makes a violation of these provisions a crime. Current law defines 
“correct,” for purposes of testing and verifying the accuracy of a weighing or measuring device, as 
a weight or measure or a weighing, measuring, or counting instrument that meets certain tolerance 
and specification requirements. This bill would, beginning January 1, 2026, authorize a county 
sealer to test and verify as correct any electric vehicle charger operated by a public agency, as 
defined, that is located in the county in which the sealer has jurisdiction. The bill would require a 
county sealer, upon testing and finding that an electric vehicle charger operated by a public 
agency is incorrect, as defined, to cause it to be marked with the words “out of order” and require 
the charger to be repaired or corrected, as specified. The bill would authorize a county board of 
supervisors to charge an annual registration fee for the cost of inspecting and testing an electric 
vehicle charger operated by a public agency, as specified.   (Based on  09/27/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=CsvziziNgl9+kTQheuAt1Pq1YY5IHk0HU15kWsZ33nRhZX9E8QO3cDlbJMs803q0XvMGtPwp97qHZ2WAFLRGjqEcf6Ukl1wQKnloRldiTAQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/455
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2001-2050/ab_2030_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2001-2050/ab_2030_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=73368E42-6206-40CD-AD4B-26A7620F054C
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=73368E42-6206-40CD-AD4B-26A7620F054C
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=AL4SgWrSUapjsdM2JQoL0yxpi8ckFmU3JCQdILCfbpyJ0/C/URE/1GyXxyA2y8ROspmyjIPiDIX3s6GCu1AjmOwFYe6XviKGQhBKe0dVuJA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/443
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2001-2050/ab_2034_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2001-2050/ab_2034_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=kOVy1r2eLhYFFlYkqxcXgnTlDe5zDjhUzY3NEqT5CfeqbljY70gEfyOm+9AhMf1HejgnC2FDtcGDmIZA4s1anPEh3ueGzNckeJXmP1F5fXg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/362
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2001-2050/ab_2037_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2001-2050/ab_2037_92_C_bill.pdf


Attachment B: Intergovernmental Relations Priority State Legislation Log 
 

Last Updated 12/06/24        98 
 

Measure Author Topic Current 
Text 

Status Location Brief Summary Attachments Position 

AB 2042 Jackson, D 
 

Police canines: 
guidelines. 

07/03/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/5/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law requires all law enforcement agencies to maintain a use of force policy, as specified, 
and requires the Commission on Peace Officer Standards and Training to implement courses of 
instruction for the training of law enforcement officers in the use of force. This bill would require the 
commission, on or before July 1, 2026, to develop guidelines, as specified, for the use of canines 
by law enforcement. The bill would authorize the commission to periodically update these 
guidelines. The bill would require law enforcement agencies with a canine unit, on or before July 1, 
2027, to adopt a policy for the use of canines that, at a minimum, complies with the guidelines 
developed by the commission.   (Based on  07/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2083 Berman, D 
 

Industrial 
facilities’ heat 
application 
equipment and 
process 
emissions. 

07/03/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/5/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The Warren-Alquist State Energy Resources Conservation and Development Act requires the 
State Energy Resources Conservation and Development Commission to adopt building design 
and construction standards and energy and water conservation standards for new residential and 
nonresidential buildings to reduce the wasteful, uneconomic, inefficient, or unnecessary 
consumption of energy, including energy associated with the use of water. The act requires those 
standards to be cost effective when taken in their entirety and when amortized over the economic 
life of the structure compared with historic practice. The California Global Warming Solutions Act 
of 2006 requires the State Air Resources Board to prepare and approve a scoping plan for 
achieving the maximum technologically feasible and cost-effective reductions in greenhouse gas 
emissions and to update the scoping plan at least once every 5 years. This bill would require the 
commission, on or before July 1, 2026, to evaluate opportunities to increase electrification of 
industrial heat processes to meet the state’s industrial emissions reduction goals, as provided. The 
bill would, as part of the state board’s next update to the scoping plan occurring on or after 
January 1, 2025, require the state board to assess the potential for the state to reduce the 
emissions of greenhouse gases from the state’s industrial facilities’ heat application equipment 
and processes, as specified.   (Based on  07/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2130 Santiago, D 
 

Parking 
violations. 

09/22/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/22/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
379, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/22/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires a specified administrative hearing process in the enforcement and processing 
of parking violations and penalties, and requires the issuing agency to conduct an initial 
administrative review of the notice of parking violation at the request of the contestant to whom the 
notice was mailed. Current law provides that if the contestant is dissatisfied with the results of the 
initial review, the contestant may request by telephone, in writing, or in person, an administrative 
hearing by an examiner of the violation no later than 21 calendar days following the mailing of the 
results of the issuing agency’s initial review. Current law requires that the person requesting the 
hearing have a choice of a hearing by mail or in person. This bill would require the person 
requesting the hearing to have a choice of a hearing by mail, in person, or, if offered by the issuing 
agency, by telephone or electronic means.   (Based on  09/22/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=7BovhcGmyLqsDg0YrSOmstQZg7hgQDfwXgKaWIHIWLIBl1Yt6X/JepQdMIgkfPiUNV7Wv2mIpcKkBn3ECm1Sytc04jg39rgiZ3cPa7jH4NI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/379
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2001-2050/ab_2042_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2001-2050/ab_2042_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2001-2050/ab_2042_95_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=EJpnRx4hJR3P/v+6e/Ay9VjqWFOTW5cWK2I2sYVwt2j68u5OS588hBojZz2qCNzbIUGhPM9BK2tesq2iAfdr+4DZngLIgT4OTJyD03vyHeI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/364
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2051-2100/ab_2083_93_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2051-2100/ab_2083_93_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2051-2100/ab_2083_93_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=78IQfxjD6i4KDZr5SulVYDzCNAet7Pa0po7duYDdYfip4B25iF7kHnpHAhJ4lubTA1R/M2qJEBEhYjr28Le3PgSedxJgSXl8UW8PJgX3vkQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/494
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2101-2150/ab_2130_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2101-2150/ab_2130_96_C_bill.pdf
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AB 2133 Kalra, D 
 

Veterinary 
medicine: 
registered 
veterinary 
technicians. 

04/10/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
4/24/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would authorize a registered veterinarian technician to perform neuter surgery on a male domestic 
cat under the direct supervision of a California-licensed veterinarian, as specified. The bill would 
require a registered veterinary technician authorized to perform neuter surgery under the 
requirements of this act to obtain training, as specified, in cat neuter surgery procedures before 
receiving board approval.   (Based on  04/10/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2135 Schiavo, D 
 

Public works 
contracts: wage 
and penalty 
assessment. 

06/13/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/5/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law requires the Labor Commissioner to issue a civil wage and penalty assessment to a 
contractor or subcontractor, or both, if, after an investigation, the commissioner determines there 
has been a violation of the laws regulating public works contracts, including the payment of 
prevailing wages. Current law requires the assessment to be served not later than 18 months after 
the filing of a valid notice of completion in the office of the county recorder in each county in which 
the public work or some part thereof was performed, or not later than 18 months after acceptance 
of the public work, whichever occurs last. This bill would extend the above-described time period 
to 24 months and would authorize an extension of an additional 18 months for good cause, 
including ongoing investigation and assessment.   (Based on  06/13/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2153 Lowenthal, D 
 

California 
Public Records 
Act: public 
agency 
employees: 
notice 
requirements: 
personnel and 
medical 
information. 

02/06/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
JUD. on 
2/20/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The California Public Records Act requires public records to be open to inspection at all times 
during the office hours of the state or local agency that retains those records, and provides that 
every person has a right to inspect any public record, except as provided. Current law requires 
each agency, upon a request for records, to determine within 10 days whether that request, in 
whole or in part, seeks copies of disclosable public records in the agency’s possession and to 
promptly notify the person making the request of its determination and reasons for that 
determination. Under current law, the act generally does not require disclosure of personnel, 
medical, or similar files, the disclosure of which would constitute an unwarranted invasion of 
personal privacy. Current law requires an agency, if it determines a request seeks disclosable 
public records, to state the estimated date and time when the records will be made available. 
Current law permits the prescribed time limits of the act to be extended in unusual circumstances. 
In this connection, “unusual circumstances” include, among other reasons, the need to search for 
and collect the requested records from field facilities or other establishments separate from the 
office processing the request. This bill would require each agency, upon receipt of a request for a 
copy of, or the inspection of, any personnel, medical, or similar records of a public agency 
employee or any record that would disclose a public agency employee’s personal identity in 
connection with the performance of that employee’s work duties, to promptly and prior to the 
release of the records, provide written notice of the request to that public agency 
employee.   (Based on  02/06/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=5RqvQsLa/1UUMljAR1AIu4G/tCo+irkr0jtohxZJdj3iC26/dJo/bUyMaHkFNcpHkL3yBle6AbpNqHDpTbGaC//4YI508ebqNe8isXLPnp0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/436
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2101-2150/ab_2133_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2101-2150/ab_2133_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2101-2150/ab_2133_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Z8r4sA65PQ8GxisoNZ9+FYwhUOwiwos85PmIqbvTNBKL766RONr3/euv4LqrzloH2abJUvcY6gnjVt3eqAzKasOWgyYMRO0jPhg1k+soPug=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/441
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2101-2150/ab_2135_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2101-2150/ab_2135_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2101-2150/ab_2135_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=drV/OT/AvXDbLzUcoV131zZQrbVVmlsDT4R4oYMtBpVrW4kGRDNWv6I+Vghk3xEm3ULP3yL2ZKrhLkj2LP6es+P+QBmgJA9Csrs8Plx4Keg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/385
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2151-2200/ab_2153_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2151-2200/ab_2153_99_I_bill.pdf
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AB 2200 Kalra, D 
 

Guaranteed 
Health Care for 
All. 

04/30/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
5/15/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law provides for the regulation of health insurers by the Department of Insurance. Current 
law provides for the Medi-Cal program, which is administered by the State Department of Health 
Care Services, under which qualified low-income individuals receive health care services. The 
Medi-Cal program is, in part, governed and funded by federal Medicaid program provisions. This 
bill, the California Guaranteed Health Care for All Act, would create the California Guaranteed 
Health Care for All program, or CalCare, to provide comprehensive universal single-payer health 
care coverage and a health care cost control system for the benefit of all residents of the state. 
Under the bill, CalCare would be a health care service plan subject to Knox-Keene. The bill, 
among other things, would provide that CalCare cover a wide range of medical benefits and other 
services and would incorporate the health care benefits and standards of other existing federal 
and state provisions, including the federal Children’s Health Insurance Program, Medi-Cal, 
ancillary health care or social services covered by regional centers for persons with developmental 
disabilities, Knox-Keene, and the federal Medicare Program. The bill would make specified 
persons eligible to enroll as CalCare members during the implementation period, and would 
provide for automatic enrollment. The bill would require the board to seek all necessary waivers, 
approvals, and agreements to allow various existing federal health care payments to be paid to 
CalCare, which would then assume responsibility for all benefits and services previously paid for 
with those funds.   (Based on  04/30/2024 text) 

AB 2200 Support 
05.17.24.pdf 

Support 

AB 2216 Haney, D 
 

Tenancy: 
common 
household 
pets. 

03/18/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
JUD. on 
6/5/2024) 

07/02/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would prohibit a landlord, before the landlord has accepted a prospective tenant’s application for a 
dwelling unit, from asking the prospective tenant or otherwise inquiring into whether the 
prospective tenant plans to own or otherwise maintain a common household pet in the tenant’s 
dwelling unit. The bill would require a prospective tenant, no later than 72 hours before entering 
into a rental agreement, to inform the landlord if the prospective tenant plans to own or otherwise 
maintain a common household pet.   (Based on  03/18/2024 text) 

AB 2216 Letter of 
Support 
04.03.24.pdf 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=sglo7+SJfETiM0YJ4MZBxEfHa7YPV+/nQbtqw1piV2n188f+RJzVJiMTa7Gp4lalVI8S5Y0pfbe8uaeHX+/kchX4ro4Nv0xT6BSyEIeBX9M=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/436
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2151-2200/ab_2200_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2151-2200/ab_2200_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2151-2200/ab_2200_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=A4B54E22-F04A-4E89-9E36-8566273D6106
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=A4B54E22-F04A-4E89-9E36-8566273D6106
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=if0vJVBowg8igBWne2eus/HJzQmCoPBzt6j/OY8SZXZ1lzBM2lHLWkUBWOGbtQBOLhNyzi7rQ+L1lRPBGtYisPM7XGG+ziYuh9k2pB55iew=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/503
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2201-2250/ab_2216_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2201-2250/ab_2216_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2201-2250/ab_2216_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E3F1A93D-4DE9-4466-A404-0A8430441190
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E3F1A93D-4DE9-4466-A404-0A8430441190
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E3F1A93D-4DE9-4466-A404-0A8430441190
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AB 2234 Boerner, D 
 

Vehicles: 
electric 
bicycles. 

09/28/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/28/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
823, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/28/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law defines an electric bicycle and classifies electric bicycles into 3 classes with different 
restrictions. Under existing law, a “class 1 electric bicycle” is a bicycle equipped with a motor that 
provides assistance only when the rider is pedaling and ceases to provide assistance when the 
bicycle reaches the speed of 20 miles per hour. Under current law, a “class 2 electric bicycle” is a 
bicycle equipped with a motor that may be used exclusively to propel the bicycle and is not 
capable of providing assistance when the bicycle reaches the speed of 20 miles per hour. Under 
current law, a “class 3 electric bicycle” is a bicycle equipped with a speedometer and a motor that 
provides assistance only when the rider is pedaling, and that ceases to provide assistance when 
the bicycle reaches the speed of 28 miles per hour. Current law prohibits a person under 16 years 
of age from operating a class 3 electric bicycle. This bill, the San Diego Electric Bicycle Safety 
Pilot Program, would, until January 1, 2029, authorize a local authority within the County of San 
Diego, or the County of San Diego in unincorporated areas, to adopt an ordinance or resolution 
that would prohibit a person under 12 years of age from operating a class 1 or 2 electric bicycle. 
For the first 60 days following the adoption of an ordinance or resolution for this purpose, the bill 
would make a violation of the ordinance or resolution punishable by a warning notice. After 60 
days, the bill would make a violation of the ordinance or resolution punishable by a fine of $25, 
except as specified. This bill would make a parent or legal guardian with control or custody of an 
emancipated minor who violates the ordinance or resolution jointly and severally liable with the 
minor for the amount of the fine imposed.   (Based on  09/28/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2236 Bauer-Kahan, 
D 
 

Solid waste: 
recycled paper 
bags: 
standards: 
carryout bag 
prohibition. 

08/20/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
CONCURR
ENCE on 
8/28/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law prohibits a store, as defined, from providing a single-use carryout bag to a customer at 
the point of sale, with specified exceptions, including an exemption for bags used to contain 
unwrapped food. Current law defines a “single-use carryout bag” as a bag made of plastic, paper, 
or other material that is provided by a store to a customer at the point of sale and that is not a 
recycled paper bag or a reusable grocery bag that meets specified requirements, including that the 
bag be made by a certified reusable grocery bag producer and meets specified requirements with 
regard to the bag’s durability, material, labeling, heavy metal content, and, with regard to reusable 
grocery bags made from plastic film, recycled material content. Current law prohibits a producer of 
reusable grocery bags made from plastic film from selling or distributing those bags unless the 
producer is certified by a third-party certification entity, and provides proof of that certification and 
a certification fee to the Department of Resources Recycling and Recovery, as specified. Current 
law also prohibits a store from selling or distributing a recycled paper bag at the point of sale 
unless the store makes that bag available for purchase for not less than $0.10. Current law defines 
“recycled paper bag,” in part, as a paper carryout bag that contains a minimum of 40% 
postconsumer recycled materials, except as provided, and meets other requirements. Current law 
allows a retail establishment to voluntarily comply with these requirements, if the retail 
establishment provides the department with irrevocable notice. This bill would, commencing 
January 1, 2026, revise and recast those provisions to, among other things, recast the definition of 
a “single-use carryout bag” to a “carryout bag,” and would revise the definition to mean a bag 
made of plastic, paper, or other material that is provided by a store to a customer at the point of 
sale for the purpose of carrying purchased goods and that is not a recycled paper bag. The bill 
would create a carryout bag exception to include a bag provided to a customer before the 
customer reaches the point of sale, that is designed to protect a purchased item from damaging or 
contaminating other purchased items in a checkout bag, or to contain an unwrapped food item, as 
specified. The bill would revise the definition of “recycled paper bag” to require it be made from a 
minimum of 50% postconsumer recycled materials on and after January 1, 2028, without 
exception.   (Based on  08/20/2024 text) 

AB 2236 Support 
05.23.24.pdf 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Jsxicu834nTBRk5DDDpzbe7PiE+3WAn68EVV2ksHUsGHMBd/H5ZvsFWmPX5iCzpS1JM2Z20mSBKO3tLHUcLwUTMoMtk1kuHzDQ3ZwsonK2g=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/389
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2201-2250/ab_2234_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2201-2250/ab_2234_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=swIBbWRexuk0dQsai7fL8vzYMs3gpj7UrqIYuWUKt1jpFgJsBUAe8bS/eW5452tauLEfygYcJkEm1gQ5KLWnEZCFg9z76mUukPyO7RQ8fcs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/434
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/434
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2201-2250/ab_2236_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2201-2250/ab_2236_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2201-2250/ab_2236_94_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=767F263A-1C43-4937-BDDB-6DA676419FE3
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=767F263A-1C43-4937-BDDB-6DA676419FE3
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AB 2259 Boerner, D 
 

Transportation: 
bicycle safety 
handbook. 

05/16/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
6/24/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would, upon appropriation by the Legislature, require the Transportation Agency to develop and 
distribute, on or before September 1, 2025, a bicycle safety handbook that includes information on, 
among other things, existing laws regulating bicycles and e-bikes. The bill would require the 
agency to make a downloadable electronic version of the bicycle safety handbook available on 
specified internet websites. In developing the handbook, the bill would require collaboration and 
consultation between the agency and prescribed state entities, including, among others, the 
Department of Motor Vehicles and the Department of the California Highway Patrol.   (Based 
on  05/16/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2264 Arambula, D 
 

Occupational 
safety and 
health: heat 
illness 
prevention 
certification. 

02/08/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
L. & E. on 
2/26/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The California Occupational Safety and Health Act of 1973, requires employers to comply with 
certain safety and health standards, as specified, and charges the division with enforcement of 
those provisions. Current law requires the division to submit to the Occupational Safety and Health 
Standards Board a rulemaking proposal to consider revising, among other things, the Maria Isabel 
Vasquez Jimenez heat illness standard, as specified. Under current law, certain knowing, 
negligent, or willful violations of safety and health standards are punishable as misdemeanors. 
This bill would, commencing July 1, 2028, require an employee to obtain a heat illness prevention 
certification from the division within 30 days after the date of hire and to maintain a valid 
certification for the duration of their employment, as specified. The bill would require the division to 
develop and make accessible the heat illness prevention certification process on its internet 
website by July 1, 2028, and to offer the certification process in English and in the five most used 
non-English languages. This bill would require the certification process to include certain minimum 
requirements, including, among other things, that the training course include basic, introductory 
instruction on the elements of knowledge and heat illness prevention practices as described in the 
heat illness standard.    (Based on  02/08/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2286 Aguiar-Curry, 
D 
 

Vehicles: 
autonomous 
vehicles. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
Governor. 

09/27/2024 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Current law authorizes the operation of an autonomous vehicle on public roads for testing 
purposes by a driver who possesses the proper class of license for the type of vehicle operated if 
specified requirements are satisfied. Current law prohibits the operation of an autonomous vehicle 
on public roads until the manufacturer submits an application to the Department of Motor Vehicles, 
as specified, and that application is approved. This bill would require a manufacturer of an 
autonomous vehicle to report to the department a collision on a public road that involved one of its 
autonomous vehicles with a gross vehicle weight of 10,001 pounds or more that is operating under 
a testing or deployment permit that resulted in damage of property, bodily injury, or death within 10 
days of the collision.    (Based on  09/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=V9QyaMROaCnzVJGVGsoH1OLirRDChRPH7Zyhc3JTo45LebaW2w5PS5cNQ+kDNoQiaJg8iL/A2G10CWJPWtiXKMhAkbt1ro6BIkuBj5cLq1Q=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/389
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2251-2300/ab_2259_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2251-2300/ab_2259_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2251-2300/ab_2259_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=qb2oGAUfECArTXMakcyhwg0U8pCHz38DYNXJmJ4YIJILNDfBZAM0IolAQIwYaoJCMIBOfUJncOkd4Gj6vQDbiuQRlw2KKBhG+2cw+8UjFR0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/464
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2251-2300/ab_2264_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2251-2300/ab_2264_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=zMFuCerrKEDFedaDxPg8eVCYwm+M/pSwkmsy26cZWw8BktzKfN8Lk4tC1Bu5GePgP88ql9toQGMRdI/5n6tD6y+qoBaC65D2NVRY8zbIdIE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/430
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/430
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2251-2300/ab_2286_96_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2251-2300/ab_2286_96_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2251-2300/ab_2286_96_E_bill.pdf
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AB 2290 Friedman, D 
 

Transportation: 
Class III 
bikeways: 
bicycle 
facilities: 
Bikeway Quick-
Build Project 
Pilot Program. 

06/13/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
6/24/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Existing law establishes the Active Transportation Program in the Department of Transportation for 
the purpose of encouraging increased use of active modes of transportation, such as biking and 
walking, with specified available funds to be allocated to eligible projects by the California 
Transportation Commission and regional transportation agencies through the adoption of a 
program of projects. Existing law requires the commission to develop guidelines regarding, among 
other topics, project eligibility and project selection for the program of projects, as provided. This 
bill would prohibit, on and after January 1, 2026, the commission from adding a project that 
creates a Class III bikeway or adds a specific road marking used to inform road users that 
bicyclists might occupy the travel lane to the program of projects, unless the bikeway or road 
marking is on a highway with a design speed limit of 25 miles per hour or less or the project will 
implement improvements to reduce the design speed limit to 25 miles per hour or less.   (Based 
on  06/13/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2346 Lee, D 
 

Organic waste 
reduction 
regulations: 
procurement of 
recovered 
organic waste 
products. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
712, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/27/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires the State Air Resources Board to complete, approve, and implement a 
comprehensive strategy to reduce emissions of short-lived climate pollutants in the state to reduce 
the statewide methane emissions by 40% below 2013 levels by 2030. Current law requires the 
Department of Resources Recycling and Recovery, in consultation with the state board, to adopt 
regulations that achieve specified targets for reducing organic waste in landfills, as provided. The 
department’s organic waste regulations require local jurisdictions to annually procure a quantity of 
recovered organic waste products and to comply with their procurement targets by directly 
procuring recovered organic waste products for use or giveaway or by requiring, through a written 
agreement, that a direct service provider to the jurisdiction procure recovered organic waste 
products, or both. Those regulations specify the types of recovered organic waste products that a 
jurisdiction may procure, including compost that is produced at a compostable material handling 
operation or facility, or a specified digestion facility that composts onsite. Other regulations of the 
department require all compostable materials handling activities to obtain a facility permit from the 
department prior to commencing operations and meet other specified requirements, but exclude 
from those requirements certain activities that the regulations state do not constitute a 
compostable material handling operation or facility, including the composting of green material, 
agricultural material, food material, and vegetative food material, and the handling of compostable 
materials under certain conditions, as provided. This bill would authorize local jurisdictions to count 
towards their procurement targets compost produced and procured from specified compost 
operations and specified investments and expenditures related to meeting its procurement target, 
as provided. The bill would authorize a local jurisdiction to determine a local per capita 
procurement target using information from a local waste characterization study, as specified. The 
bill would authorize a local jurisdiction to satisfy its annual procurement obligations by procuring a 
quantity of recovered organic waste products that meets or exceeds a 5-year procurement target, 
as specified.   (Based on  09/27/2024 text) 

AB 2346 Support 
Letter 
06.04.24.pdf 
AB 2346 Support 
Letter 
08.08.24.pdf 
AB 2346 (Lee) 
Coalition Support 
Letter_Senate 
Approps_Final.p
df 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=jYSBXzGFkO3FnsXLLsR4PBkVMh3oMCT6uqZ+c3qeqySMUM6hIODSOkNEXGj1betU6l52K2B55/FS0sdygUdlAnlGgykThpv8lRkeFRD8PQU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/445
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2251-2300/ab_2290_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2251-2300/ab_2290_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2251-2300/ab_2290_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Hx64W1YMQWDEXOnHzKBNLpIK2AwWX2sYpl5ytE5amSI9PIyWFbTkDzL1ajOMuP9ChC7sHXsMJeL5qQVW03YXn+c2JGLSQ1Cuxrk309zLd8E=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/308
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2301-2350/ab_2346_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2301-2350/ab_2346_92_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=71B5005F-A9EA-477D-9C1D-EF987D0233AF
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=71B5005F-A9EA-477D-9C1D-EF987D0233AF
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=71B5005F-A9EA-477D-9C1D-EF987D0233AF
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=ACD25E95-C0E6-4EEB-B8C8-C33AC64012DC
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=ACD25E95-C0E6-4EEB-B8C8-C33AC64012DC
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=ACD25E95-C0E6-4EEB-B8C8-C33AC64012DC
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=39D02113-2A12-48CA-B646-52D47712C4F1
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=39D02113-2A12-48CA-B646-52D47712C4F1
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=39D02113-2A12-48CA-B646-52D47712C4F1
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=39D02113-2A12-48CA-B646-52D47712C4F1
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=39D02113-2A12-48CA-B646-52D47712C4F1
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AB 2347 Kalra, D 
 

Summary 
proceedings for 
obtaining 
possession of 
real property: 
procedural 
requirements. 

09/24/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/24/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
512, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/24/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires a defendant, in a summary proceeding for obtaining possession of real 
property, to file a response within five days, excluding specified days, after the complaint is served 
on the defendant. Current law permits a defendant in such a proceeding to, on or before the day 
fixed for their appearance, appear and answer or demur. This bill would extend the time in which a 
defendant, in a summary proceeding for obtaining possession of real property, must file a 
response from 5 to 10 days, excluding specified days, after the complaint is served on the 
defendant. The bill would specify additional procedures and deadlines for filing a demurrer or a 
motion to strike a complaint as well as an opposition to and reply in support of such a 
motion.    (Based on  09/24/2024 text) 

Support Letter Support 

AB 2385 Alanis, R 
 

Driver’s 
licenses: 
instruction 
permits and 
provisional 
licenses. 

04/08/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
5/15/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Brady-Jared Teen Driver Safety Act of 1997 establishes a provisional licensing program and 
generally requires that a driver’s license issued to a person at least 16 years of age, but under 18 
years of age be issued pursuant to that provisional licensing program. Current law requires a 
person to hold an instruction permit for not less than 6 months prior to applying for a provisional 
license. During the first 12 months after issuance of a provisional license, existing law prohibits the 
licensee from driving between the hours of 11 p.m. and 5 a.m. and transporting passengers who 
are under 20 years of age, as specified. Current law provides limited exceptions to these 
restrictions under which a licensee is authorized to drive under specified circumstances. A 
violation of these provisions is punishable as an infraction. This bill would, commencing January 1, 
2027, expand the scope of the provisional licensing program by expanding the applicable age 
range for the program to persons at least 16 years of age, but under 21 years of age. The 
restrictions on provisional licensees described above would apply during the first 6 months after 
issuance of a provisional license to a licensee who is 18, 19, or 20 years of age, subject to 
specified exemptions.   (Based on  04/08/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2392 Soria, D 
 

Vehicles: 
motorcycle: 
safety helmet 
exception. 

02/12/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
TRANS. on 
2/26/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law requires a driver and a passenger to wear a safety helmet meeting certain 
requirements when riding on a motorcycle, motor-driven cycle, or motorized bicycle. This bill would 
exempt from this requirement a person who wears a turban or patka as an expression of the 
person’s religious belief and practice when riding on a motorcycle, motor-driven cycle, or 
motorized bicycle.   (Based on  02/12/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=APw0KAVRI5yPsxAhC1QJhbbtGdtZSxcVcpYBabyMnJURhO/pP2MFbbWdz5iEK7YR0D3aY9PvwQzJLXMhRaIkIRuk+VwVqDWnUeXnoUeZ6Ds=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/436
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2301-2350/ab_2347_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2301-2350/ab_2347_91_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=2C8C2DED-066F-4868-AE16-5D67957B5D59
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=eLwSlFU16u/gv0ftXw/VoskaHTLmLlPj+sJU+z7A7INzlmCQ8Mv/mNGsHKXnXVHUqRTpQQaF3qD7w/Z3IEFuB30kD74SzagRY1tEZAEZrzY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/363
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2351-2400/ab_2385_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2351-2400/ab_2385_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2351-2400/ab_2385_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ebBB5ok+hoHOe8QH42e3EXs7SuDVOdfBAz6DIFLT7xZV4uo4war8I662o0XBsYf2vS99d9gfK2aO4rxrhKIiXDvPg/N6KPEzyaCWuODQNQg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/309
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2351-2400/ab_2392_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2351-2400/ab_2392_99_I_bill.pdf
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AB 2404 Lee, D 
 

State and local 
public 
employees: 
labor relations: 
strikes. 

03/21/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
5/8/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Meyers-Milias-Brown Act and the Ralph C. Dills Act regulate the labor relations of employees 
and employers of local public agencies and the state, respectively. The acts grant specified 
employees of local public agencies and the state the right to form, join, and participate in the 
activities of employee organizations of their choosing. This bill would provide, except as specified, 
that it is not unlawful or a cause for discipline or other adverse action against a public employee for 
that public employee to refuse to enter property that is the site of a primary strike, perform work for 
a public employer involved in a primary strike, or go through or work behind a primary strike line. 
The bill would prohibit a public employer from directing a public employee to take those actions. 
The bill would authorize a recognized employee organization to inform employees of these rights 
and encourage them to exercise those rights.   (Based on  03/21/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2408 Haney, D 
 

Firefighter 
personal 
protective 
equipment: 
perfluoroalkyl 
and 
polyfluoroalkyl 
substances. 

05/16/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/5/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would, commencing July 1, 2026, prohibit a person from manufacturing, knowingly selling, offering 
for sale, distributing for sale, distributing for use, or purchasing or accepting for future use in this 
state firefighter personal protective equipment containing intentionally added PFAS chemicals. The 
bill would make a violation of this provision subject to the civil penalty provisions described above. 
The bill would specify that an individual firefighter shall not be personally liable for payment of the 
civil penalty.   (Based on  05/16/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2409 Papan, D 
 

Office of 
Planning and 
Research: 
permitting 
accountability 
transparency 
dashboard. 

04/11/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
5/1/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would require the Office of Planning and Research, on or before January 1, 2026, to create and 
maintain, as specified, a permitting accountability transparency internet website (dashboard). The 
bill would require the dashboard to include a display for each permit to be issued by specified state 
agencies for all covered projects. The bill would define various terms for these purposes. The bill 
would also require the dashboard to include, but not be limited to, information for each permit to be 
issued by a state agency that is required for the completion of the project, including, among other 
requirements, the permit application submission date. The bill would require each state agency 
with a responsibility for issuing a permit for a covered project to provide information in the 
appropriate time and manner as determined by the office. The bill would also make related 
findings and declarations.   (Based on  04/11/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=S/D0QoFsdiMumqvA2NdmseeHFfKh27P2frsCcqV+8PqR5ZU8wFVVyUXqAivFBI/GnZcj9g/bnJhxBdWLKwkga/Y059jBy/rVO71PMn5JRtw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/308
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2401-2450/ab_2404_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2401-2450/ab_2404_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2401-2450/ab_2404_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=IjoP9ZD8mmK9oRV5GU5WNBYSBdA9Oms+vSLWO14XUe4qTmrzYll15kWw/W2EuPsHATAYhIOwsWyC7m8xkxVptJkmV5awEJAUXI8mn6sSrOA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/503
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2401-2450/ab_2408_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2401-2450/ab_2408_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2401-2450/ab_2408_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=AIZLVN0ZPRr9J20EvvnPTvisg+NmwfzWffmV8aC+xy5rfKhUOEU78/hx5h6g2qnH2Iwl70pOxKm+C/gNNSzmYyLYX/L6xI7ZFhadsaPVElU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/362
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2401-2450/ab_2409_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2401-2450/ab_2409_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2401-2450/ab_2409_98_A_bill.pdf
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AB 2421 Low, D 
 

Employer-
employee 
relations: 
confidential 
communication
s. 

06/17/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/5/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law that governs the labor relations of public employees and employers, including the 
Meyers-Milias-Brown Act, the Ralph C. Dills Act, and provisions relating to judicial employees, 
public schools, higher education, the San Francisco Bay Area Rapid Transit District, the Santa 
Cruz Metropolitan Transit District, the Sacramento Regional Transit District, and other public 
transit employees, prohibits employers from taking certain actions relating to employee 
organizations. This includes imposing or threatening to impose reprisals on employees, 
discriminating or threatening to discriminate against employees, or otherwise interfering with, 
restraining, or coercing employees because of their exercise of their guaranteed rights. Those 
provisions further prohibit denying to employee organizations the rights guaranteed to them by 
existing law. This bill would also prohibit a local public agency employer, a state employer, a 
judicial employer, a public school employer, a higher education employer, or the district from 
questioning any employee or employee representative regarding communications made in 
confidence between an employee and an employee representative in connection with 
representation relating to any matter within the scope of the recognized employee organization’s 
representation.   (Based on  06/17/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2427 McCarty, D 
 

Electric vehicle 
charging 
stations: 
permitting: 
curbside 
charging. 

09/25/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/25/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
567, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/25/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law continues into existence the zero-emission vehicle (ZEV) division within Governor’s 
Office of Business and Economic Development (GO-Biz) as the Zero-Emission Vehicle Market 
Development Office. Current law references GO-Biz’s Electric Vehicle Charging Station Permitting 
Guidebook, which recommends best practices for electric vehicle supply equipment permitting. 
This bill would require the office to develop a model permitting checklist, model zoning ordinances, 
and best practices for permit costs and permit review timelines to help local governments permit 
curbside charging stations as part of the office’s development of the Electric Vehicle Charging 
Station Permitting Guidebook or any subsequent updates. The bill would also require the office to 
consult with local governments, electric vehicle service providers, and utilities while developing the 
above-described materials.   (Based on  09/25/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2479 Haney, D 
 

Housing First: 
core 
components. 

04/25/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
HOUSING 
on 6/5/2024) 

07/02/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law requires agencies and departments administering state programs related to 
homelessness to adopt guidelines and regulations to incorporate core components of Housing 
First, as defined. Under current law, Housing First includes time-limited rental or services 
assistance, so long as the housing and service provider assists the recipient, among other things, 
in accessing permanent housing. Current law defines “state programs” for this purpose as any 
program a California state agency or department funds, implements, or administers for the 
purpose of providing housing or housing-based services to people experiencing homelessness or 
at risk of homelessness, except as provided. Under existing law, the core components of Housing 
First include, among others, services that are informed by a harm-reduction philosophy that 
recognizes drug and alcohol use and addiction as a part of tenants’ lives, where tenants are 
engaged in nonjudgmental communication regarding drug and alcohol use, and where tenants are 
offered education regarding how to avoid risky behaviors and engage in safer practices, as well as 
connected to evidence-based treatment if the tenant so chooses. This bill would clarify, pursuant 
to that core component, that state departments or agencies may allow programs to fund recovery 
housing, as defined, that use substance use-specific services, peer support, and physical design 
features supporting individuals and families on a path to recovery from addiction that emphasizes 
abstinence, so long as the state program meets specified requirements.   (Based on  04/25/2024 
text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=hZRWVx6YdJ/+9iYdL0d73ys7FV++BueIBajn/N5aPDRIMuHbyxPf/ZLNjoWJkt8+BVzA243103gKosMqXzl12koTPjutfSlGtycGKANa86g=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/437
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2401-2450/ab_2421_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2401-2450/ab_2421_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2401-2450/ab_2421_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=jg2Hi1qRr6BAvF1Jp1ujObhCbwUT5jolgUvdGu9NCozCOMBMluLYvetTIHZG9z4W8RAdIO7ilN8jmAFmOPKJegWtuo/zj+fG7AtHnRI70M8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/350
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2401-2450/ab_2427_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2401-2450/ab_2427_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=BMeCtDLzp4BAQawRAa3nwZZKvIX0zyq5ImBfxoceapmgtRGIFZq7Q0FnjMxDFHVRlWa5nKqhnyOwnkJ7WlYwWtYiFLgqejbJ7Q5uFMxDlIg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/503
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2451-2500/ab_2479_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2451-2500/ab_2479_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2451-2500/ab_2479_97_A_bill.pdf
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AB 2489 Ward, D 
 

Local agencies: 
contracts for 
special 
services and 
temporary help. 

04/29/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
5/15/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law relating to the government of counties authorizes a county board of supervisors to 
contract for certain types of special services on behalf of the county, any county officer or 
department, or any district or court in the county. Current law requires those special services 
contracts to be with persons who are specially trained, experienced, expert, and competent to 
perform those services. This bill would require the board or a representative, at least 10 months 
before beginning a procurement process to contract with persons for special services that are 
currently, or were in the previous 10 years, performed by employees of the county represented by 
an employee organization, to notify, in writing, the exclusive employee representative of the 
workforce affected by the contract of its determination to begin that process. The bill would provide 
that this 10-month notice requirement does not apply in the event of an emergency, as defined. 
The bill would require persons with whom the board of supervisors enter into a contract for special 
services to perform functions that are currently, or were in the previous 10 years, performed by 
employees of the county, any county officer or department, or any district or court in the county 
represented by an employee organization to use employees who meet or exceed the minimum 
qualifications and standards required of bargaining unit civil service employees who perform or 
performed the same job functions, as specified.   (Based on  04/29/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2503 Lee, D 
 

California 
Environmental 
Quality Act: 
exemption: 
passenger rail 
projects. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
718, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/27/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA), until January 1, 2030, exempts from its 
requirements certain transportation-related projects if specified requirements are met, including 
that a local agency, as defined, is carrying out the project and that the project will be completed by 
a skilled and trained workforce, as provided. CEQA includes within these exempt transportation-
related projects a public project for the institution or increase of bus rapid transit, bus, or light rail 
service, which will be exclusively used by low-emission or zero-emission vehicles, on existing 
public rights-of-way or existing highway rights-of-way. Current law requires the lead agency, if it 
determines that a transportation-related project is exempt from CEQA and determines to carry out 
the project, to file a notice of exemption with the Office of Planning and Research and the county 
clerk in which the project is located. This bill would expand that exemption from CEQA to include a 
public project for the institution or increase of other passenger rail service, which will be 
exclusively used by zero-emission trains, located entirely within existing rail rights-of-way or 
existing highway rights-of-way. Because the bill would increase the duties of the county clerk, this 
bill would impose a state-mandated local program.   (Based on  09/27/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2513 Pellerin, D 
 

Gas stoves and 
ranges: 
warning label. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
Governor. 

09/27/2024 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Would prohibit a person from selling, attempting to sell, or offering to sell to a consumer in this 
state a gas stove, as defined, that is manufactured or sold online on or after January 1, 2025, or 
sold in a store on or after January 1, 2026, unless the gas stove bears an adhesive label and, for 
online sales, unless the internet website prominently posts a warning, that sets forth a specified 
statement relating to air pollutants that can be released by gas stoves, as specified.   (Based 
on  09/05/2024 text) 

SJCE AB 2513 
LOS.pdf 
AB_2513_LOS_
SJCE.pdf 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=zOLWM/4Hq2zQvjc2KUjYREUHCTTFys87PhEPt9toss7uW8cv1BAYAE2Jf/v51zoj/xr5K3RUCzPPIdaO7UjlEnC+W/4iQsZXQfVeLpdePC4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/328
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2451-2500/ab_2489_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2451-2500/ab_2489_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2451-2500/ab_2489_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=zhdn1OamSPICb9tuyac8VUuZYAdqrK5sMCx2HCrDs8T7TDHsB4ZUEMeyV35Psd+hBOHvkWs2V9E6nbHmjmTbL7q/GfpwYoKdREqLsXcjxa0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/308
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2501-2550/ab_2503_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2501-2550/ab_2503_92_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=gXTdxKTkezcUUMQYfg4MRCKHJqL+pVftm4zlhiN6hB9BVVXJmZWzt6N38bI7Azs8wFFP5o8J11/52U6vftrYRWEdTz7CHFBn6kCOldabxVc=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/438
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2501-2550/ab_2513_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2501-2550/ab_2513_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2501-2550/ab_2513_94_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=5AE0FB97-FBA4-4DBC-89AF-EC5C9C23153E
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=5AE0FB97-FBA4-4DBC-89AF-EC5C9C23153E
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=D7844E59-B63E-45A9-997F-DBB8D1D4597D
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=D7844E59-B63E-45A9-997F-DBB8D1D4597D
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AB 2515 Papan, D 
 

Menstrual 
products: 
perfluoroalkyl 
and 
polyfluoroalkyl 
substances 
(PFAS). 

09/30/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/30/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
1008, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/30/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law, beginning January 1, 2025, prohibits a person or entity from manufacturing, selling, 
delivering, holding, or offering for sale in commerce any cosmetic product that contains 
intentionally added perfluoroalkyl and polyfluoroalkyl substances (PFAS), as defined. This bill 
would similarly prohibit any person from manufacturing, distributing, selling, or offering for sale in 
the state any menstrual products that contain regulated PFAS, as defined. The bill would require 
the Department of Toxic Substances Control to adopt regulations on or before January 1, 2029, as 
specified, for the purposes of implementing, interpreting, enforcing, or making specific these 
provisions. The bill would require the department to publish on its internet website, on or before 
January 1, 2027, a list of accepted testing methods for testing for regulated PFAS in menstrual 
products. The bill would require a manufacturer of menstrual products to register with the 
department, on or before July 1, 2029, and to provide to the department specified information and 
a registration fee. The bill would require the department to issue a notice of violation of the above 
provisions under specified circumstances, including that the department determines that a violation 
of the regulations described above has occurred or the department receives a report of an alleged 
violation and verifies the alleged report through its own independent testing, verification, or 
inspection. The bill would make a violation of these provisions punishable by administrative or civil 
penalties, as specified, and would authorize the Attorney General, on behalf of the department or 
on behalf of the people of the state at the request of the department, to bring an action to enforce 
these provisions. The bill would create, and would require all moneys collected from penalties to 
be deposited in, the T.A.M.P.O.N. Act Fund.   (Based on  09/30/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2519 Maienschein, 
D 
 

Misdemeanor 
offenses: 
deferral of 
sentencing: 
firearms 
prohibition. 

02/13/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
7/1/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law authorizes a judge in the superior court, at the judge’s discretion and over the 
objection of the prosecution, to defer sentencing a defendant who has submitted a plea of guilty or 
nolo contendere to a misdemeanor for a period not to exceed 12 months, subject to certain 
exceptions and requirements on the defendant. This bill would prohibit a defendant who is charged 
with an offense that would prohibit them from possessing a firearm if convicted of the offense from 
possessing a firearm until they successfully complete diversion.   (Based on  02/13/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=us7cdT+vtHbcCunvVlwwilh1fQN8h0bRwRYEoj5rBT8LenPHm5qf1bWGL1IlyKa8PiQPbImKhJPJ9px324c+m80lX+zekYy0It6514BFNIU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/362
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2501-2550/ab_2515_90_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2501-2550/ab_2515_90_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=JE2OE1S6kttTW6T2Zol0D4Mk48HrusLtEt66ULibi/Ro+fYdTsMWVfX+PKnBVrZmxzl+IgKYSwvPTlDYrG0canRWBWj93sko1Y/0mhNLmQ0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/388
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/388
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2501-2550/ab_2519_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2501-2550/ab_2519_99_I_bill.pdf
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AB 2535 Bonta, D 
 

Trade Corridor 
Enhancement 
Program. 

04/24/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
5/8/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law requires the California Transportation Commission, under a program commonly known 
as the Trade Corridor Enhancement Program, to allocate, upon appropriation by the Legislature, 
revenues from a specified portion of the state excise tax on diesel fuel and certain federal funds to 
infrastructure projects located on or along specified transportation corridors. Under current law, 
eligible projects under the program include, among others, highway improvements to more 
efficiently accommodate the movement of freight and environmental and community mitigation or 
efforts to reduce environmental impacts of freight movement. Under the program, existing law 
requires the commission to adopt a program of projects from projects nominated by the 
Department of Transportation and local agencies. In adopting the program of projects, existing law 
requires the commission to evaluate the total potential economic and noneconomic benefits of the 
program of projects to California’s economy, environment, and public health, and to specifically 
assess localized impacts in disadvantaged communities. Current law also requires the California 
Environmental Protection Agency to identify disadvantaged communities, and, pursuant to that 
requirement, the agency has developed a tool to identify those communities, commonly known as 
CalEnviroScreen. This bill would, commencing January 1, 2025, require the commission, the 
Department of Housing and Community Development, and the State Air Resources Board to 
create guidance for the programming of projects under the Trade Corridor Enhancement Program 
that expand the physical footprint of a highway in a community in the highest 10% of 
CalEnviroScreen communities. Commencing January 1, 2028, the bill would require this guidance 
to be incorporated into the programming cycle.   (Based on  04/24/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2553 Friedman, D 
 

Housing 
development: 
major transit 
stops: vehicular 
traffic impact 
fees. 

09/19/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/19/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
275, 
Statutes of 
2024 

09/19/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) requires a lead agency, as defined, to prepare, 
or cause to be prepared, and certify the completion of an environmental impact report on a project 
that it proposes to carry out or approve that may have a significant effect on the environment or to 
adopt a negative declaration if it finds that the project will not have that effect. CEQA also requires 
a lead agency to prepare a mitigated negative declaration for a project that may have a significant 
effect on the environment if revisions in the project would avoid or mitigate that effect and there is 
no substantial evidence that the project, as revised, would have a significant effect on the 
environment. CEQA exempts from its requirements residential projects on infill sites and transit 
priority projects that meet certain requirements, including a requirement that the projects are 
located within 1/2 mile of a major transit stop. This bill would revise the definition of “major transit 
stop” to increase the frequency of service interval to 20 minutes.   (Based on  09/19/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2554 Calderon, D 
 

Aviation: 
vertiports. 

03/21/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
TRANS. on 
3/21/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The State Aeronautics Act governs aeronautics in the state for the purpose of furthering and 
protecting the public interest in aviation and aeronautical progress through identified means, and 
authorizes the Department of Transportation to adopt, administer, and enforce rules and 
regulations for the administration of the act. Under current law, a violation of the State Aeronautics 
Act is a crime. This bill would prohibit the governing body of a local government from granting the 
exclusive right to one operator to develop vertiports or control vertiport operations within the local 
government’s jurisdiction. The bill would include findings that changes proposed by this bill 
address a matter of statewide concern rather than a municipal affair and, therefore, apply to all 
cities, including charter cities.   (Based on  03/21/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=sdz8dw6Rp9DyY84KmJds7R5uEl/5X65VGlq3akJwFQsAar+uawmFK+yox1N74phVk1c7IHxBLSvdB4yBJH25iBhq+Kj+jKOrr9Gd9x53R0g=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/495
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2501-2550/ab_2535_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2501-2550/ab_2535_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2501-2550/ab_2535_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=M71BStEcxtt9LgP9norgV+pqDiR4KEe7KPjIA5fXWKdIGjb6L/2sE/IjQiNYzprjUq3Du2sCQzqpUuV9NgGdCA5q+3HTWUauv9ngCSgpbLE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/445
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2553_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2553_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=CyO+iWZTr29cc1KA/81O0S9JgMwi8oUUeCyz/KNF+bQrCITdIAqmP2yh8A6ClgBiQMAIhfE2lI3tHMxA6JEh+GX/KFJLTTEaKDPZWVUHtnI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/448
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2554_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2554_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2554_98_A_bill.pdf
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AB 2557 Ortega, D 
 

Local agencies: 
contracts for 
special 
services and 
temporary help: 
performance 
reports. 

07/03/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/5/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would require, as of July 1, 2025, each county board of supervisors that solicits for and enters into 
a specified contract for special services, except as specified, to post that contract and any related 
documents, as specified, on its internet website. The bill would require, as of July 1, 2026, each 
contract, as described above, to include, among other things, the objectives, desirables, and goals 
of the contract. The bill would require, before beginning a procurement process to contract for 
functions, duties, responsibilities, or services, as specified, the board of supervisors, or its 
representative, to give reasonable written notice to the exclusive employee representative of the 
workforce affected by the contract of its determination to begin that process. The bill would also 
require, at least 30 days before the modification or renewal of the above-described contract, the 
board of supervisors, or its representative, to notify, as specified, the exclusive employee 
representative of the workforce affected by the contract of the intent to modify or renew the 
contract.   (Based on  07/03/2024 text) 

Oppose Letter Oppose 

AB 2559 Petrie-Norris, 
D 
 

Local planning: 
electric vehicle 
service 
equipment: 
permitting 
delays. 

05/16/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/5/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Existing law creates the Governor’s Office of Business and Economic Development (GO-Biz) and 
requires GO-Biz to serve the Governor as the lead entity for economic strategy and the marketing 
of California on issues relating to business development, private sector investment, and economic 
growth. Existing law requires every city, county, and city and county to administratively approve an 
application to install electric vehicle charging stations through the issuance of a building permit or 
similar nondiscretionary permit and requires the review of an application to install an electric 
vehicle charging station to be limited to the building official’s review of whether it meets all health 
and safety requirements of local, state, and federal law. Existing law requires an electric vehicle 
charging station to comply with, among other things, all applicable rules of the Public Utilities 
Commission regarding safety and reliability, as specified. This bill would require GO-Biz to create 
and maintain a publicly accessible internet website that contains a landing page with functionality 
to collect information and report delays and denials regarding all applicable forms of permitting for 
zero-emission vehicle infrastructure, as specified. The bill would prohibit GO-Biz from publicly 
displaying any submissions received under these provisions. The bill would require GO-Biz in a 
new or existing working group, as specified, to evaluate the data it receives from the internet 
website and direct the working group to determine recommended solutions to address permitting 
delays. The bill would require, on or before January 1, 2026, GO-Biz to submit to the Legislature 
and publish on its internet website a comprehensive report regarding the challenges identified 
throughout the data collection process, as specified. The bill would also require GO-Biz to 
establish a permit streamlining specialist to assist authorities having jurisdiction with permit delays 
and denials related to these provisions.   (Based on  05/16/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2560 Alvarez, D 
 

Density Bonus 
Law: California 
Coastal Act of 
1976. 

07/01/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/12/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The California Coastal Act of 1976, regulates development, as defined, in the coastal zone, as 
defined, and requires a new development to comply with specified requirements. The Density 
Bonus Law provides that its provisions do not supersede or in any way alter or lessen the effect or 
application of the act, and requires that any density bonus, concessions, incentives, waivers or 
reductions of development standards, and parking ratios to which an applicant is entitled under the 
Density Bonus Law be permitted in a manner consistent with the act. This bill would instead 
provide that, in the coastal zone, the Density Bonus Law does not relieve a project from the 
requirement to obtain a coastal development permit, as specified. The bill would require any 
density bonus, concessions, incentives, waivers or reductions of development standards, and 
parking ratios to which an applicant is entitled to be permitted in a manner that is consistent with 
the Density Bonus Law and does not result in significant adverse impacts to coastal resources and 
public coastal access, as specified.   (Based on  07/01/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=axJLfLB6AFGU/ziV2Q6EmWor3sSTfo81zN/f7rHZX8SXicVU2c6gJyYRokY5XMzZniZOdeHEx/Is5pa+Ac6PSea920xh5J/NOTaahqR1+KQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/361
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2557_92_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2557_92_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2557_92_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=ABA2FC8C-2CB3-483A-969F-F44D86E684E2
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=B6vV4X1k01fXiqxIrSKyevK8u36gxGFUkb+zqmPT68hvl2V9NmyC3UtBlsoWJE+0zKx83U6rt3225VUBXluCDfpIdIl6gL6qMleBm4h+91M=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/454
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/454
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2559_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2559_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2559_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Rk3cLbcUkZ/Twggh5yj8W7E3IEvE4+tjBQ+ReUWsI7yUNS5SF66iIzn37IfZjj2krb6o0T9sD+VlirXAHtXWNQ5WqzNjJWjksu9VfnwewUI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/504
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2560_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2560_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2560_97_A_bill.pdf
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AB 2561 McKinnor, D 
 

Local public 
employees: 
vacant 
positions. 

09/22/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/22/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
409, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/22/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Meyers-Milias-Brown Act (act) authorizes local public employees, as defined, to form, join, 
and participate in the activities of employee organizations of their own choosing for the purpose of 
representation on matters of labor relations. The act requires the governing body of a public 
agency to meet and confer in good faith regarding wages, hours, and other terms and conditions 
of employment with representatives of recognized employee organizations and to consider fully 
presentations that are made by the employee organization on behalf of its members before 
arriving at a determination of policy or course of action. This bill would, as specified, require a 
public agency to present the status of vacancies and recruitment and retention efforts at a public 
hearing at least once per fiscal year, and would entitle the recognized employee organization to 
present at the hearing. If the number of job vacancies within a single bargaining unit meets or 
exceeds 20% of the total number of authorized full-time positions, the bill would require the public 
agency, upon request of the recognized employee organization, to include specified information 
during the public hearing.   (Based on  09/22/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2583 Berman, D 
 

School zones: 
speed limits. 

06/27/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/5/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law establishes a prima facie speed limit of 25 miles per hour when approaching or 
passing a school building or grounds contiguous to a highway or when the school grounds are not 
separated from the highway, as specified. Current law authorizes a local authority, by ordinance or 
resolution, to reduce the prima facie speed limit based on an engineering and traffic survey, as 
specified. This bill would, until January 1, 2028, instead establish a prima facie speed limit of 25 
miles per hour in a school zone, as defined, subject to specified conditions, including, among 
others, when a school speed limit sign states “when children are present” and children are present, 
as defined, and when a school speed limit sign states specific hours, as specified. The bill would, 
notwithstanding the above provision and until January 1, 2028, authorize a local authority, by 
ordinance or resolution, to determine and declare a prima facie speed limit of 20 miles per hour in 
a school zone. The bill would, beginning on January 1, 2028, establish a prima facie speed limit of 
20 miles per hour in a school zone, subject to conditions similar to those described 
above.   (Based on  06/27/2024 text) 

Support Letter Support 

AB 2584 Lee, D 
 

Single-family 
residential real 
property: 
corporate 
entity: 
ownership. 

06/20/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
JUD. on 
5/29/2024) 

07/02/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would prohibit a business entity, as defined, that has an interest in more than 1,000 single-family 
residential properties from purchasing, acquiring, or otherwise obtaining an ownership interest in 
another single-family residential property and subsequently leasing the property, as specified. The 
bill would authorize the Attorney General to bring a civil action for a violation of these provisions, 
and would require a court in a civil action in which the Attorney General prevails to order specified 
relief, including that the business entity pay a civil penalty of $100,000 for each violation and that 
the business entity sell the property to an independent third party within one year of the date that 
the court enters judgment. The bill would require that these provisions be the exclusive means of 
enforcement of these provisions.   (Based on  06/20/2024 text) 

Support Letter Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=DF56mM1gFN0mM57Jylz+iAB55USfo98Y8aGLmI4TwXWXz5BU57bJxumbYInBPzY4ESrUqI6dm5mVlSg310hz8ApQkqIT23EeSBiUVmZ/XEU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/380
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2561_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2561_92_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=wW4mAtAaYGb5YhWEyC2y/8VTkfZpPXIVxq3yArc9oOGd65udhN0TEkgUThrq7m5FsxmaAIm9lfUP11oLDEkyy+9GzIc+6E3TtoYp8xATLFo=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/364
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2583_93_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2583_93_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2583_93_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=800FD6EB-000C-45E9-920C-CA0BFEAE838B
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=DmGR3112Bt/Wn8RrnX4ANd8O1UuQeqIHjM+8LWshh3o2U4Hks/QCSiBXBnGIWCzQ9alJO+cyo2daJ6s714WgnH/GQVEb1KSQNJNg87fV1Ho=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/308
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2584_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2584_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2584_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=4FD34699-9DCD-41AD-B2BA-2F1870A8C8D3
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AB 2592 Grayson, D 
 

Local planning: 
housing 
elements: 
water and 
sewer services. 

03/19/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
H. & C.D. on 
3/18/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Planning and Zoning Law requires that the housing element adopted by the legislative body of 
the city, county, or city and county and any amendments made to that element be delivered to all 
public agencies or private entities that provide water or sewer services, as described, within the 
territory of the legislative body. Current law requires each public agency or private entity providing 
water or sewer services to grant a priority for the provision of these services to proposed 
developments that include housing units affordable to lower income households. Existing law also 
requires a public agency or private entity providing water or sewer services to adopt written 
policies and procedures not later than July 1, 2006, and at least once every 5 years thereafter, 
with specific objective standards for provision of services, as described. This bill would instead 
require each public agency or private entity providing water or sewer services to grant a priority for 
the provision of these services to proposed housing developments, which the bill would define for 
these purposes to include both housing developments that include units sold or rented to lower 
income households, as provided in existing law as described above, and housing developments 
constructed pursuant to specified laws providing for ministerial approval of certain housing 
developments or subdivision maps. The bill would also update the compliance date to adopt 
written policies and procedures to July 1, 2025, and continue to require the adoption of those 
written policies and procedures at least once every 5 years thereafter.   (Based on  03/19/2024 
text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2597 Ward, D 
 

Planning and 
zoning: revision 
of housing 
element: 
regional 
housing need 
allocation 
appeals: 
Southern 
California 
Association of 
Governments. 

09/25/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/25/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
572, 
Statutes of 
2024 

09/25/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Planning and Zoning Law requires each county and each city to adopt a comprehensive, long-
term general plan for the physical development of the county or city, and specified land outside its 
boundaries, that includes, among other specified mandatory elements, a housing element. Current 
law requires, for the 4th and subsequent revisions of the housing element, the Department of 
Housing and Community Development (department), in consultation with the council of 
governments, to determine the existing and projected need for housing for each region, as 
specified. Current law requires the council of governments or delegate subregion, as applicable, to 
adopt a final regional housing needs plan that allocates a share of the regional housing need to 
each city, county, or city and county. Current law requires each council of governments and 
delegate subregion to distribute a draft allocation of regional housing needs to each local 
government in the region or subregion. Current law authorizes, within 45 days following receipt of 
the draft allocation, a local government within the region or the delegate subregion or the 
department to appeal to the council of governments or the delegate subregion for a revision of the 
share of the regional housing need proposed to be allocated to one or more local governments, as 
specified. This bill would reduce the period to appeal from 45 days following receipt of the draft 
allocation to 30 days.   (Based on  09/25/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2612 Hoover, R 
 

Governor’s 
Office of 
Business and 
Economic 
Development: 
International 
trade and 
investment. 

02/14/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
J., E.D. & E. 
on 3/4/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law authorizes the Governor’s Office of Business and Economic Development (GO-Biz)to 
accept nonstate moneys for the purposes of operating an international trade and investment office, 
as specified. Current law requires GO-Biz to post a report on its internet website for each donation 
that it receives to fund an international trade and investment office that is funded in whole or in part 
by nonstate funds, as specified, or operated under a contract with a nonprofit entity, as specified, 
and for each donation that it receives for the purposes of promoting international trade and 
investment events, as specified, within 30 days of receiving those donations. This bill would 
instead require GO-Biz to post the above-described reports on its internet website from within 15 
days of GO-Biz receiving those donations.   (Based on  02/14/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=kLmsGaKP99hrZ+fVIc7/Vxz/R928zG1Cz9xeDwv3BBGkfPysP1apagsGvT4abM2h5HzE1AN6ZYmtA3gjojHLkr/OSRiMshLGiKqiQOuL/j8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/433
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2592_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2592_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2592_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=P9M3dBzu/bABzkpdqtG6ud16mNeLGdmTsL8+hw7Ldu8xhhO+uuK4y/DCbqZLGb5N+gpGFl+nfdYu5sGqm0OQm0eepfozt5UnFG3tptNJI/c=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/328
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2597_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2551-2600/ab_2597_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=9lpuZt7gD/txENG5GzCBsTCk1STCS2HW+kgY6ZKTVah0f6hLs1kAlmdP1E+RpJs1u0uBUmLWXspG/IZS4e4J99G856G2M5pzBB0PDugNcas=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/431
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2601-2650/ab_2612_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2601-2650/ab_2612_99_I_bill.pdf
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AB 2615 McKinnor, D 
 

Alcoholic 
beverages: 
COVID-19 
Temporary 
Catering 
Authorization: 
airside terminal 
space. 

04/11/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
5/8/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law, until July 1, 2026, authorizes the Department of Alcoholic Beverage Control to permit 
licensees to exercise license privileges in an expanded license area authorized pursuant to a 
COVID-19 Temporary Catering Authorization, as specified. Current law includes duplicative 
provisions relating to COVID-19 Temporary Catering Authorizations. This bill would authorize an 
on-sale licensee located in an airport terminal to, under a COVID-19 Temporary Catering 
Authorization, sell alcoholic beverages for on-sale consumption in an expanded license area that 
includes the airside terminal space if certain requirements are complied with. Those requirements 
include, among others, the licensee receiving written approval from the airport operator, serving 
the alcoholic beverages in distinguishable and labeled containers, selling no more than 2 
containers to each customer per transaction, and posting appropriate signage regarding open 
container laws, as specified. The bill would make all licensees holding a COVID-19 Temporary 
Catering Authorization within a shared common licensed area jointly liable for compliance with 
laws that may subject their license to discipline in that shared common licensed area. The above-
described provisions of the bill would be repealed on July 1, 2026. The bill would repeal the 
duplicative COVID-19 Temporary Catering Authorization provisions.   (Based on  04/11/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2621 Gabriel, D 
 

Law 
enforcement 
training. 

09/24/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/24/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
532, 
Statutes of 
2024 

09/24/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law defines a “hate crime” as a criminal act committed, in whole or in part, because of 
actual or perceived characteristics of the victim, including, among other things, race, religion, 
disability, and sexual orientation. Current law requires the Commission on Peace Officer 
Standards and Training, in consultation with specified subject-matter experts, to develop a course 
of instruction that trains law enforcement on, among other things, indicators of hate crimes and 
techniques, responses to hate crime waves against certain groups, including Arab and Islamic 
communities, and methods to handle incidents of hate crimes in a noncombative manner. This bill 
would require instruction to include identifying when a gun violence restraining order is appropriate 
to prevent a hate crime and the procedure for seeking a gun violence restraining order.   (Based 
on  09/24/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2626 Dixon, R 
 

Advanced 
Clean Fleets 
regulations: 
local 
governments. 

02/14/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
TRANS. on 
3/4/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law requires the State Air Resources Board to adopt and implement motor vehicle 
emission standards, in-use performance standards, and motor vehicle fuel specifications for the 
control of air contaminants and sources of air pollution that the state board has found necessary, 
cost effective, and technologically feasible. Pursuant to its authority, the state board has adopted 
the Advanced Clean Fleets Regulation, which imposes various requirements for transitioning local, 
state, and federal government fleets of medium- and heavy-duty trucks, other high-priority fleets of 
medium- and heavy-duty trucks, and drayage trucks to zero-emission vehicles. The Advanced 
Clean Fleets Regulation authorizes entities subject to the regulation to apply for exemptions from 
its requirements under certain circumstances. This bill would extend the compliance dates for local 
government set forth in the Advanced Clean Fleets Regulation by 10 years. The bill would prohibit 
the state board from taking enforcement action against a local government for violating the 
Advanced Clean Fleets Regulation if the alleged violation occurs before January 1, 2025.   (Based 
on  02/14/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=5sCEY8FRCpettjIxgq7A32fAWYw7za1H3W4NYyhaj3ZlZXGA6LQn5dGF6BUUvEN6eCeqCupF7qbjkeRoxzVvwa8yOp2JwRzwtCvAvFOqN2Q=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/380
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2601-2650/ab_2615_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2601-2650/ab_2615_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2601-2650/ab_2615_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=NmBKaJgQbCQ05eUoNHneM2pcKo4yUko/a8BMR9Hz6PayTTOB03sZ9X+XIysgxRfGS7xHlx+29f2QT7KO5JIgzIPkjqTo9c1GDw3L0n77W7Q=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/371
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2601-2650/ab_2621_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2601-2650/ab_2621_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=egEK06VloRXRqXgM1Scc6IfKRXP21Tiq9gGAHXVnZTJa3ViSLsqGCpsiUtl5nYRvYHHhK7Y0MsvR99gdGXNjcK+VqL1CovCvnhyV3cM1l+s=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/386
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2601-2650/ab_2626_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2601-2650/ab_2626_99_I_bill.pdf


Attachment B: Intergovernmental Relations Priority State Legislation Log 
 

Last Updated 12/06/24        114 
 

Measure Author Topic Current 
Text 

Status Location Brief Summary Attachments Position 

AB 2647 Low, D 
 

Property 
taxation: 
disabled 
veterans’ 
exemption: 
welfare 
exemption: 
housing for law 
enforcement 
and firefighters. 

04/10/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
REV. & TAX 
on 3/4/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The California Constitution provides that all property is taxable, and requires that it be assessed at 
the same percentage of fair market value, unless otherwise provided by the California Constitution 
or federal law. The California Constitution and current property tax law provide various exemptions 
from taxation, including, among others, a disabled veterans’ exemption. Under existing law, the 
disabled veterans’ exemption exempts from taxation that part of the full value of property that 
constitutes the principal place of residence of a veteran, that is owned by the veteran, the 
veteran’s spouse, or the veteran and their spouse jointly, that does not exceed $100,000, or 
$150,000 in the case of an eligible veteran whose household income does not exceed $40,000, 
which amounts are subject to annual adjustment for inflation, as provided. This bill, in lieu of the 
disabled veterans’ exemption described above, would exempt from taxation that part of the full 
value of the residence that does not exceed $863,790, as provided, property owned by, and that 
constitutes the principal place of residence of, a veteran, the veteran’s spouse, or the veteran and 
the veteran’s spouse jointly, if the veteran is 100% disabled. The bill would provide an unmarried 
surviving spouse a property exemption in the same amount that they would have been entitled to if 
the veteran was alive and if certain conditions are met.   (Based on  04/10/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2649 Wicks, D 
 

State 
government: 
housing 
projects. 

02/14/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

05/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(6). 
(Last 
location was 
PRINT on 
2/14/2024) 

05/02/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would state the intent of the Legislature to enact legislation that would designate an unspecified 
state entity with permitting authority for housing projects of statewide significance, and would make 
related findings and declarations.   (Based on  02/14/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2655 Berman, D 
 

Defending 
Democracy 
from Deepfake 
Deception Act 
of 2024. 

09/17/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/17/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
261, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/17/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law establishes requirements for the conduct of election campaigns, including 
requirements regarding the endorsement of candidates, political corporations, campaign funds, fair 
campaign practices, and libel and slander. Current law, until January 1, 2027, prohibits any 
person, committee, or other entity from distributing, with actual malice, materially deceptive audio 
or visual media of a candidate for elective office with the intent to injure the candidate’s reputation 
or to deceive a voter into voting for or against the candidate, within 60 days of the election. Current 
law requires specified actions pertaining to elections to be given precedence when they are filed in 
court, including actions involving the registration of voters, the certification of candidates and 
measures, and election contests, and, until January 1, 2027, actions involving the foregoing 
prohibition against materially deceptive media. This bill, to be known as the Defending Democracy 
from Deepfake Deception Act of 2024, would require a large online platform, as defined, to block 
the posting of materially deceptive content related to elections in California, during specified 
periods before and after an election. The bill would require a large online platform to label certain 
additional content inauthentic, fake, or false during specified periods before and after an election in 
California. The bill would require a large online platform to develop procedures for California 
residents to report content that has not been blocked or labeled in compliance with the 
act.   (Based on  09/17/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=xULyzlZ3EOLeOWazEZ4zFSP6d0D0KOyUNbvJZIOtqEJA72GRy7u0aYc5B4rzPlYLZEJdMrTogJmw59zKhq5Gb+5rauYIwh3obFAUm6MbY58=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/437
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2601-2650/ab_2647_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2601-2650/ab_2647_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2601-2650/ab_2647_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=xJcSQdhnHHE7H1DzH6U8ev8cortAln/9L5dulnICHf01YN5vC8bpvw7jk4ZAcVc2TR5Zg1WztYqRaYUqDu8OsAQ2Hl2PWr8D3lNuEPj3ENU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/306
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2601-2650/ab_2649_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2601-2650/ab_2649_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=p94IueHg0G99iTRJtud6MCywQUVjkTBwgrT+GiHt29+qc6RGw3VZvg+yZg22MBKgyVSaW6/CKpDA37vVa7DUAk3kimSpo2FZt1ZN0IsnGqs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/364
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2651-2700/ab_2655_89_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2651-2700/ab_2655_89_C_bill.pdf
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AB 2661 Soria, D 
 

Electricity: 
Westlands 
Water District. 

09/25/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/25/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
573, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/25/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would authorize the Westlands Water District to provide, generate, and deliver solar photovoltaic 
or hydroelectric electricity and to construct, operate, and maintain works, facilities, improvements, 
and property necessary or convenient for generating and delivering that electricity. The bill would 
require the district to use the electricity for the district’s own purposes, and the bill would authorize 
the district to sell surplus electricity to a public or private entity engaged in the distribution or sale 
of electricity. The bill would also authorize the district to construct, operate, and maintain energy 
storage systems and electric transmission lines, and to construct, operate, and maintain works, 
facilities, improvements, and property necessary or convenient for the operation of the energy 
storage system and electric transmission lines, within the boundaries of the district, as specified. 
The bill would require the district to report the amount of income, and the purposes for expenditure 
of that income, from these electricity facilities in a specified report. The bill would require the 
district to establish a community benefits agreement plan for a specified electrical infrastructure 
development plan and related transmission and other electrical projects, as provided. This bill 
would make legislative findings and declarations as to the necessity of a special statute for the 
Westlands Water District.   (Based on  09/25/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2666 Boerner, D 
 

Public utilities: 
rate of return. 

09/22/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/22/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
413, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/22/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law authorizes the Public Utilities Commission to fix the rates and charges for every public 
utility, including electrical and gas corporations, and requires those rates and charges to be just 
and reasonable. This bill would require the commission, following the approval of each general 
rate case, to review which costs, if any, differed from the general rate case forecasts for each 
electrical corporation or gas corporation, and to adjust the authorized revenue requirement in the 
subsequent general rate case, as appropriate, based on the actual past costs the corporation 
records. The bill would require the commission to establish guidelines for electrical corporations 
and gas corporations to calculate and report annually their actual rates of return to the 
commission.   (Based on  09/22/2024 text) 

Governor 
Signature 
Request 
SJCE_AB 2666_ 
LOS.pdf 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=wkHpxj3KBMoxl7fZHSpKheVDJFmc1Tgoy/fakp7SglOTmtLRqR8yQeNp+uGMHd83WEX4MAZoaIL1Ju5+fxTKGYlbeWzNOQIgZG/uUMEgBuE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/309
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2651-2700/ab_2661_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2651-2700/ab_2661_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=tZvl+MTxNoP/66gpv95ogQ0pQGkdmDtf+FIAdpE2GRWZEc4tBz1p4t7mAHc+BRHt1bmRtsZj284BmGDcIuxHBKCpEIlcLBchVc8R/a14P2c=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/389
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2651-2700/ab_2666_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2651-2700/ab_2666_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E3682416-F8C9-4F76-9FCE-5C02420CD017
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E3682416-F8C9-4F76-9FCE-5C02420CD017
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E3682416-F8C9-4F76-9FCE-5C02420CD017
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=3344E262-ED4F-4B5F-865C-A03316EDA626
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=3344E262-ED4F-4B5F-865C-A03316EDA626
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AB 2667 Santiago, D 
 

Affirmatively 
furthering fair 
housing: 
housing 
element: 
reporting. 

09/19/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/19/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
277, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/19/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires a public agency to administer its programs and activities relating to housing 
and community development in a manner to affirmatively further fair housing, and take no action 
that is materially inconsistent with its obligation to affirmatively further fair housing. Current law 
requires a housing element to include a program that sets forth a schedule of actions during the 
planning period, each with a timeline for implementation such that there will be beneficial impacts 
of the programs within the planning period, that the local government is undertaking or intends to 
undertake to implement the policies and achieve the goals and objectives of the housing element 
through, among other things, the administration of land use and development controls and the 
provision of regulatory concessions and incentives. Current law requires this program to 
affirmatively further fair housing and consist of specified components, including a summary of fair 
housing issues in the jurisdiction and an assessment of the jurisdiction’s fair housing enforcement 
and fair housing outreach capacity. This bill would require the Department of Housing and 
Community Development to develop a standardized reporting format for programs and actions 
taken with regards to the local agency affirmatively further fair housing that enables the reporting 
of the assessment components described-above, as specified. The bill would require local 
governments to utilize the standardized reporting format for the 7th and each subsequent revision 
of the housing element. This bill would require a planning agency, for the 7th and each subsequent 
revision of the housing element, to make a draft of its inventory of sites required under the Housing 
Element Law available to the department and the public, post the draft inventory on its internet 
website, and send a notification email to individuals and organizations that have previously 
requested notices at least 90 days before the initial adoption of the housing element and at least 7 
days before any subsequent adoption submittal if changes have occurred to the inventory of 
sites.   (Based on  09/19/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2672 Petrie-Norris, 
D 
 

California 
Alternate Rates 
for Energy 
program: public 
housing 
authority 
owned or 
administered 
Homekey 
housing 
facilities. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
732, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/27/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law establishes the Multifamily Housing Program administered by the Department of 
Housing and Community Development. Existing law requires that specified funds appropriated to 
provide housing for individuals and families who are experiencing homelessness or who are at risk 
of homelessness and who are inherently impacted by or at increased risk for medical diseases or 
conditions due to the COVID-19 pandemic or other communicable diseases be disbursed in 
accordance with the Multifamily Housing Program for specified uses. This disbursement scheme is 
referred to as Homekey. This bill would require that the CARE program include public housing 
authority owned or administered Homekey housing facilities where the residents of the facility 
substantially meet the CARE program’s income eligibility requirements, as determined by the 
commission, and the account is in the name of Homekey, a nonprofit funded by Homekey, or the 
public housing authority that owns or administers the facility. The bill would require the commission 
to authorize electrical corporations and gas corporations to offer discounts to those facilities and to 
establish a feasible process for certifying that the assistance is used for the direct benefit of the 
residents of those facilities.   (Based on  09/27/2024 text) 

SJCE_LOS_AB 
2672 (PN).pdf 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Q+vyh1vXZQQ55DNWANF+dK1Vva5JU09rhPQuMO/r9C/46Qyfqj47KooATY7/oCzC0dIYSY8h53Ou1QPcoyIgD38BWFWRD8hJM7alJzu4RYY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/494
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2651-2700/ab_2667_89_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2651-2700/ab_2667_89_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=nu9Z1rs9DPjA56bnxZd0qB7XF9XQOFt0Ov2ebz1ZdwXUL23N+XO6pkQQ6/lTma9Uxh1/5zJZvHz+usKYSjVbmDyObE4UWaN1+4w34OOVD4g=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/454
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/454
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2651-2700/ab_2672_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2651-2700/ab_2672_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=1205041D-5CFA-4FBC-9C2C-EBCE92B685D3
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=1205041D-5CFA-4FBC-9C2C-EBCE92B685D3
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AB 2682 Kalra, D 
 

Santa Clara 
Valley Open-
Space 
Authority. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
733, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/27/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law authorizes the Santa Clara Valley Open-Space Authority, among other things, to 
acquire, hold, use, enjoy, and lease or dispose of real and personal property, within or without the 
authority’s jurisdiction, necessary to the full exercise of its powers. Current law requires the 
authority to acquire remote ranchlands east of the westernmost ridgeline of the Diablo Range as 
permanent open space only through conservation easement purchases or the granting of lands or 
conservation easements by owners to the authority. This bill would instead require the authority to 
acquire remote ranchlands east of the westernmost ridgeline of the Diablo Range as permanent 
open space only from willing sellers through conservation easement or fee title purchases or the 
granting of lands or conservation easements by owners to the authority.   (Based on  09/27/2024 
text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2684 Bryan, D 
 

Safety element: 
extreme heat. 

09/30/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/30/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
1009, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/30/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Planning and Zoning Law requires the legislative body of a city or county to adopt a 
comprehensive, long-term general plan that includes various elements, including, among others, a 
safety element for the protection of the community from unreasonable risks associated with the 
effects of various geologic and seismic hazards, flooding, and wildland and urban fires. This bill 
would require a city or county, upon the next update of one or more of the elements included in the 
general plan on or after January 1, 2028, to review and update its safety element as necessary to 
address the hazard of extreme heat, as specified. The bill would authorize a city or county that has 
adopted an extreme heat action plan or other document that fulfills commensurate goals and 
objectives to use that information in the safety element, as specified, and, upon doing so, would 
require the city or county to summarize and incorporate into the safety element the other plan or 
document.   (Based on  09/30/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2694 Ward, D 
 

Density Bonus 
Law: residential 
care facilities 
for the elderly. 

09/19/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/19/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
278, 
Statutes of 
2024 

09/19/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Density Bonus Law requires a city or county to provide a developer that proposes a housing 
development, as defined, within the city or county with a density bonus and other incentives or 
concessions, as specified, if the developer agrees to construct, among other options, a senior 
citizen housing development, as defined. The Density Bonus Law defines a “development” for 
these purposes to include a shared housing development, and defines various other terms, 
including “shared housing unit.” This bill would expand the definition of a development for the 
above-described purposes to include a residential care facility for the elderly, as defined. The bill 
would also specify that, in the case of a residential care facility, a “shared housing unit” includes a 
unit without an individual kitchen where a room may be shared by unrelated and a unit where a 
room may be shared by unrelated persons that meets the minimum room area requirements, as 
specified. By expanding a city or county’s duty to administer the Density Bonus Law, this bill would 
impose a state-mandated local program. The bill would include findings that changes proposed by 
this bill address a matter of statewide concern rather than a municipal affair and, therefore, apply 
to all cities, including charter cities.   (Based on  09/19/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=FOYh3tq25PwO+X5uucqKip0pEFApfPL2kjpq0RDYZkNLeTkW+tP5hKugi3kpyK3cEfXbuqxCDE/+vhPvmkIra31TTiMZGC0AOYnCCAEqW4g=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/436
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2651-2700/ab_2682_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2651-2700/ab_2682_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=NcJ1CzEHU7YflDUSM7BRyp14bcFQgWK519gvty602q56as7y3jjcFw4IpUU7F9J+iSGB7eRD53cThtkhvAG50bsZ67AoDEMHNTA7wotmgiA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/447
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2651-2700/ab_2684_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2651-2700/ab_2684_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=OYEOSKobh/HmSfAMsAcyWD1hoSaKLMRb2nzYwWwCWN9lZmsywN9Sq4wNBW+4RilAdpLDI4E0gtc3u0XMjG5fyPVo2BSKASWseRscm9Sws3Q=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/328
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2651-2700/ab_2694_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2651-2700/ab_2694_93_C_bill.pdf
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AB 2709 Bonta, D 
 

Prison 
visitation. 

07/03/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/5/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Under current law, a person sentenced to imprisonment in a state prison or in a county jail for a 
felony offense, as specified, may, during that period of confinement, be deprived of only those 
rights as is reasonably related to legitimate penological interests. This bill would prohibit a person 
sentenced to imprisonment in a state prison from being prevented from receiving personal visits, 
including, but not limited to, noncontact and family visits, unless necessary and narrowly tailored to 
further legitimate security and safety interests.   (Based on  07/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2712 Friedman, D 
 

Preferential 
parking 
privileges: 
transit-oriented 
development. 

09/22/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/22/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
415, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/22/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law authorizes a local authority, by ordinance or resolution, to prohibit or restrict the 
stopping, parking, or standing of vehicles on certain streets or highways during all or certain hours 
of the day. Current law authorizes the ordinance or resolution to include a designation of certain 
streets upon which preferential parking privileges are given to residents and merchants adjacent to 
the streets for their use and the use of their guests, under which the residents and merchants may 
be issued permits that exempt them from the prohibition or restriction of the ordinance or 
resolution. Current law prohibits a public agency from imposing any minimum automobile parking 
requirement on any residential, commercial, or other development project that is located within 1/2 
mile of public transit, as defined, unless the public agency makes written findings that not imposing 
or enforcing minimum automobile parking requirements on the development would have a 
substantially negative impact on, among other things, the city’s, county’s, or city and county’s 
ability to meet its share of the regional housing need for low- and very low income households. 
This bill would, for purposes of its provisions, define “development project” to mean a residential, 
commercial, or other development project exempt from minimum automobile parking 
requirements, or subject to parking minimum reductions based on any other applicable law, 
located within the boundaries of the City of Los Angeles. This bill, for a development project that is 
located within a preferential parking area, would require the development project to be excluded 
from the boundaries of the preferential parking area and would prohibit the local authority, as 
defined, from issuing any permit to the residents or visitors of the development project that grants 
preferential parking privileges.   (Based on  09/22/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2728 Gabriel, D 
 

Planning and 
zoning: housing 
development: 
independent 
institutions of 
higher 
education and 
religious 
institutions. 

06/17/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/5/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The Planning and Zoning Law requires each county and city to adopt a comprehensive, long-term 
general plan that includes, among other mandatory elements, a housing element. That law 
requires the city’s or county’s planning agency, after the legislative body has adopted a general 
plan, to submit an annual report to the legislative body, the Office of Planning and Research, and 
the Department of Housing and Community Development. This bill would require a local 
government to include in the annual report specified information relating to housing development 
projects under the act, including the number of applications submitted and the total number of 
building permits issued under the act.   (Based on  06/17/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=tXqocB9hE94bs1GcZC7ollybeaGnx/6H5i1innTGrbsHrOMNK+HI92AkJj8++BkqBGr7xA5byzqSSjQvcucBfYMV4rVphQGtIPQDUYcUiRs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/495
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2701-2750/ab_2709_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2701-2750/ab_2709_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2701-2750/ab_2709_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=r1oOqet78p++NkZ7NNj+WjMWpdHhz3ZEbXjCaO1MD7whF/GSSSCjYS36ywwTenop/lB1seoRFnPPeM/BuqypaqykieNgHdN2fvc3rCX1iX8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/445
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2701-2750/ab_2712_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2701-2750/ab_2712_92_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=DA14H4UuAqD34HcFbkCVFuW7eXlkb4HSQbzjrZbNZtAni+R1Rju13Ho8Ca8u2M0WDHceo4SiVXK9UvWat4RwINwB9Dn+2vF6CvEAOT1sT8M=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/371
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2701-2750/ab_2728_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2701-2750/ab_2728_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2701-2750/ab_2728_96_A_bill.pdf
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AB 2739 Maienschein, 
D 
 

Firearms. 09/24/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/24/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
534, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/24/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law prohibits the carrying of a concealed firearm, as specified and except as exempted. 
Under current law, a handgun carried in violation of this provision is a nuisance and is subject to 
forfeiture and destruction, as specified. Current law also prohibits carrying a loaded firearm in 
public, as specified and except as exempted, and openly carrying an unloaded handgun in public, 
as specified and except as exempted. This bill would deem any firearm carried in violation of either 
of these provisions to be a nuisance and subject to forfeiture and destruction, as 
specified.   (Based on  09/24/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2744 McCarty, D 
 

Vehicles: 
pedestrian, 
bicycle, and 
vehicle safety. 

04/15/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
TRANS. on 
3/4/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law authorizes the legislative body of a city to do any and all things necessary to lay out, 
acquire, and construct a section or portion of a street or highway within its jurisdiction as a freeway 
and to make an existing street or highway a freeway. Current law authorizes a legislative body of a 
city, whenever this legislative body determines that it is necessary for the more efficient 
maintenance, construction, or repair of streets and roads within the city, to contract with the board 
of supervisors of any county for the rental of the county’s equipment, as specified. This bill would, 
beginning on January 1, 2025, prohibit the construction of slip lanes, as defined.   (Based 
on  04/15/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2772 Quirk-Silva, D 
 

California Rent 
Relief Program. 

03/21/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
H. & C.D. on 
3/21/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would establish the California Rent Relief Program, which would be administered by the 
Department of Housing and Community Development. The bill would require the department, upon 
appropriation by the Legislature, to make block grant allocations to grantees to provide rental 
assistance to eligible households. This bill contains other related provisions.   (Based 
on  03/21/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2776 Rodriguez, D 
 

Recovery from 
disaster or 
emergency: 
funding priority. 

05/20/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/5/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The California Emergency Services Act, among other things, creates the Office of Emergency 
Services (OES), which is responsible for the state’s emergency and disaster response services, as 
specified. The OES is under the supervision of the Director of Emergency Services. During a state 
of war emergency, a state of emergency, or a local emergency, current law requires the director to 
coordinate the emergency activities of all state agencies in connection with that emergency. This 
bill would authorize the OES to prioritize funding and technical assistance under specified 
programs, including, but not limited to, for infrastructure and housing recovery projects, in 
communities that suffered a loss in population and businesses due to a major federal disaster, 
state of emergency, or local emergency and have unmet recovery needs as a result of a major 
federal disaster, state of emergency, or local emergency.   (Based on  05/20/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=69yMy8HR++HuTXqgB8AmjFftB+Ba6QQqtogZc2E+vvOLMt/SYsIxWhEx439kGBkSvHg8YSg/GuzqlgFzz1S03Zyktj1oGpjF02exo3KKpnA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/388
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/388
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2701-2750/ab_2739_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2701-2750/ab_2739_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=VR0gJxJMESlCdc30cbyBdeMqLBFdYJvbfAYkQNHE1BtFHXv0XO4I3B8Z5xyEqPkuj+Jln4ph3xkNAnAUZ/cUzJpZME6MTe2MeLqs5lI82cs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/350
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2701-2750/ab_2744_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2701-2750/ab_2744_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2701-2750/ab_2744_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=iFCgLlN6VT2YcJywFEIIBUHcdcljJ5JW1XAA5Rju6dRDuZfK6izzToUWf1by2sFTcuOdlRW6qtq8MpEBux90DHeEIRvQcyoJojF4Q+f4HWw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/488
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2751-2800/ab_2772_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2751-2800/ab_2772_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2751-2800/ab_2772_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ENxYr6h04gy0r0qdQhf6pkvnO7PuAHsJ9fSKWqYt7At6FHtwF0+nuI4rVcx7aJzQphBsc7//ghQBduFtzI9KhygSiGYeNEKMTwa2Cg/Gh/A=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/443
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2751-2800/ab_2776_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2751-2800/ab_2776_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2751-2800/ab_2776_96_A_bill.pdf
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AB 2779 Petrie-Norris, 
D 
 

Independent 
System 
Operator: 
transmission 
planning. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
741, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/27/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would require the Independent System Operator, upon approval of each transmission plan, to 
report to the Public Utilities Commission and to the relevant policy committees of each house of 
the Legislature any new use of any grid enhancing technology that is deemed reasonable by the 
Independent System Operator in that plan and the cost and efficiency savings of the deployment 
of that grid enhancing technology.   (Based on  09/27/2024 text) 

AB 
2779_SJCE_LO
S.pdf 
Governor 
Signature 
Request 

Support 

AB 2790 Pacheco, D 
 

Crimes: 
organized retail 
theft. 

03/21/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
PUB. S. on 
3/21/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Existing law, until January 1, 2026, prohibits organized retail theft, described as acting in concert 
with one or more persons to steal merchandise from one or more merchant’s premises or online 
marketplaces with the intent to sell or return the merchandise for value, acting in concert with 2 or 
more persons to receive, purchase, or possess merchandise knowing or believing it to have been 
stolen, acting as an agent of another to steal merchandise from one or more merchant’s premises 
or online marketplaces as part of an organized plan to commit theft, or recruiting, coordinating, 
organizing, supervising, directing, managing, or financing another to undertake acts of theft. Under 
existing law, a violation of organized retail theft is punishable as either a misdemeanor or a 
felony.This bill would additionally define organized retail theft to include acting in concert with one 
or more persons to steal specified types of merchandise, including infant formula, baby food, over-
the-counter medications, and blood glucose testing strips, with the intent to sell those items. The 
bill would make a violation of this provision punishable as a felony. This bill contains other related 
provisions and other existing laws.   (Based on  03/21/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2793 Gabriel, D 
 

Housing 
elements: 
prohousing 
incentives. 

02/15/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

05/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(6). 
(Last 
location was 
PRINT on 
2/15/2024) 

05/02/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Planning and Zoning Law requires a city or county to adopt a general plan for land use 
development within its boundaries that includes, among other things, a housing element. Current 
law requires the Department of Housing and Community Development to determine whether the 
housing element is in substantial compliance with those provisions. Current law requires the 
department to designate jurisdictions as prohousing pursuant to emergency regulations adopted 
by the department, as prescribed. Current law awards jurisdictions that are prohousing and that 
are in substantial compliance with specified provisions additional points or preference in the 
scoring of applications for specified state programs. This bill would make nonsubstantive changes 
to those provisions.    (Based on  02/15/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=K2ikxFkPiL2K5FCGmV+P7Sk3rR2RYVSJfPJP9QVgU4QSNmGIUMMVqMcHpEXh7vYISYAHCNv0AXr9BxthiIo4yn0IKYxjwKxwLe8utaIdMPA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/454
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/454
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2751-2800/ab_2779_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2751-2800/ab_2779_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=A567A92A-1E45-410E-B3D9-B8C2462FA65F
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=A567A92A-1E45-410E-B3D9-B8C2462FA65F
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=A567A92A-1E45-410E-B3D9-B8C2462FA65F
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=15E1009C-A467-419E-8DBF-99B5ECD392C3
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=15E1009C-A467-419E-8DBF-99B5ECD392C3
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=15E1009C-A467-419E-8DBF-99B5ECD392C3
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=cW8U58T32hK/9bNlUqH1p617rzx3VhuHaLDxDyI/nrOiTIksiIVb2EEXiMjc8hTfawATCy8WrFk5xyxPa3r6pf41Y1WgVYtS4arMBvcM5t8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/450
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2751-2800/ab_2790_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2751-2800/ab_2790_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2751-2800/ab_2790_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=0+LW0dzbHBWGZScx7COD0dVRP97+tHUR+WaEJTwPGjywoPfEAF1Erp4HjTmiXg2p5XW6oFSV3yCKMtvGr8cczLWbezPOiBmlVh1xwt6feAY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/371
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2751-2800/ab_2793_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2751-2800/ab_2793_99_I_bill.pdf
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AB 2794 Bryan, D 
 

Community 
development: 
Antidisplaceme
nt Commercial 
Property 
Acquisition 
Program. 

04/04/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
5/8/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would establish the Antidisplacement Commercial Property Acquisition Program, to be 
administered by GO-Biz to provide low-interest loans to eligible community-based acquisition 
partners to acquire commercial property in communities that are vulnerable to gentrification and 
displacement. The bill would specify the goals of the program, including ensuring local businesses 
remain in high-risk communities vulnerable to gentrification and displacement. The bill would 
establish the Antidisplacement Commercial Property Acquisition Revolving Loan Fund, and would 
authorize GO-Biz, upon appropriation by the Legislature to the fund for purposes of the program, 
to provide low-interest loans for purposes of the program. The bill would require GO-Biz to adopt 
regulations to administer the program, including qualifications that prioritize the preservation of 
Black-, indigenous-, people of color-, and women-owned businesses and the acquisition of 
commercial property in culturally significant commercial corridors. The bill would require GO-Biz to 
report to the Legislature on the progress of the program by January 1, 2030, or 5 years after the 
disbursement of the first loan by GO-Biz, whichever is later. The bill would make the program 
contingent upon appropriation by the Legislature in the annual Budget Act or another statute for its 
purposes.   (Based on  04/04/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2796 Alvarez, D 
 

Equitable 
Access to Zero-
Emissions 
Vehicles Fund. 

02/15/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
TRANS. on 
3/11/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would establish the Equitable Access to Zero-Emission Vehicles Fund and would make moneys in 
the fund available, upon appropriation by the Legislature, for a new vehicle rebate program and for 
other specified purposes. The bill would require the State Air Resources Board, by July 1, 2025, to 
establish a program to offer rebates for the purchase of zero-emission vehicles and other specified 
vehicles from moneys made available from the fund. The bill would require the state board to 
submit a biennial report to the Legislature that includes certain information relating to the 
expenditures from the fund.   (Based on  02/15/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2809 Haney, D 
 

Vehicles: 
automated 
speed 
enforcement. 

04/08/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
TRANS. on 
3/18/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would require the Secretary of Transportation to develop guidelines for the implementation of a 
state highway work zone speed safety program using automated speed enforcement systems, as 
specified. The bill would authorize the Department of Transportation to establish a state highway 
work zone speed safety program in accordance with those guidelines. The bill would require the 
department, if a program is established, to prepare and submit a report to the Legislature, as 
specified. The bill would require any moneys generated from the issuance of the citations to be 
deposited in the Safe Highway Work Zone Account, created in the State Transportation Fund, and 
for the moneys to be allocated, upon appropriation by the Legislature, to the Department of 
Transportation for administration of the program. The provisions of the bill would become 
inoperative on July 1, 2030.   (Based on  04/08/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ihwE0+ChTn1H/lqhm/8DsSffg4Xeaz9DvbLiYm0inQEH4RGvXB072ZcTSaMEe2aLP+MKUIYj24USwNV9xvhaI8Yd90LPk3Zpi6VbuPXe3FU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/447
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2751-2800/ab_2794_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2751-2800/ab_2794_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2751-2800/ab_2794_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=eqOvpy/HbdoEHVHk0Iqpiy0KyzVpdo2+R2biLt8xgW4YOpGCAnICcjh/AOLZjdcDpryoSC7l+xjmCw6n1BOKNZYYHICtGLF6uowlRUcQJ0c=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/504
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2751-2800/ab_2796_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2751-2800/ab_2796_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=vr+XcthwzHZPkR/od4KNnQHQMY9LXF69hv+8LXfLKxVqOXSghyt0W7HLu6bby0R7s6Z3gYnDvP4eN6bpPvuEdcVAk0xewc5acesriPUVJgs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/503
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2801-2850/ab_2809_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2801-2850/ab_2809_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2801-2850/ab_2809_98_A_bill.pdf
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AB 2813 Aguiar-Curry, 
D 
 

Government 
Investment Act. 

07/18/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

07/18/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
155, 
Statutes of 
2024 

07/18/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Proposition 218 Omnibus Implementation Act defines various terms and prescribes 
procedures and parameters for local jurisdictions to comply with specified provisions of the 
California Constitution. This bill, for purposes of ACA 1, would define "affordable housing" to 
include rental housing, ownership housing, interim housing, and affordable housing programs such 
as downpayment assistance, first-time homebuyer programs, and owner-occupied affordable 
housing rehabilitation programs, that are affordable to households earning up to 150% of 
countywide median income. The bill would require a local government to ensure that any project 
that is funded with ACA 1 bonded indebtedness to have an estimated useful life of at least 15 
years or 5 years if the funds are for specified public safety facilities, infrastructure, and equipment. 
The bill would define "public infrastructure" to exclude the construction, reconstruction, 
rehabilitation, or replacement of a sports stadium or arena where the majority of the use of the 
facility is for private ticketed activities. The bill would prohibit ACA 1 bonded indebtedness from 
being used for the acquisition or lease of any real property that has, at the time of acquisition or 
lease, been improved with one to 4 dwelling units, except as specified.   (Based on  07/18/2024 
text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2814 Low, D 
 

Crimes: 
unlawful entry: 
intent to 
commit 
package theft. 

02/15/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
4/17/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would prohibit a person from entering the curtilage of a home, as defined, with the intent to 
commit theft of a package shipped through the mail or delivered by a public or private carrier. The 
bill would make a violation of that prohibition punishable as either a misdemeanor or a felony, as 
specified. By creating a new crime, the bill would impose a state-mandated local 
program.   (Based on  02/15/2024 text) 

AB 2814 - 
Support 
05.14.24.pdf 

Support 

AB 2815 Petrie-Norris, 
D 
 

Clean 
Transportation 
Program: 
electric vehicle 
chargers. 

07/02/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/5/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law establishes the Clean Transportation Program, administered by the State Energy 
Resources Conservation and Development Commission, to provide funding to certain entities to 
develop and deploy innovative technologies that transform California’s fuel and vehicle types to 
help attain the state’s climate change policies. Current law limits funding under the program to 
specified categories of programs and projects. Current law creates the Alternative and Renewable 
Fuel and Vehicle Technology Fund, to be administered by the commission, and requires the 
moneys in the fund, upon appropriation by the Legislature, to be expended by the commission to 
implement the program. This bill would add to the categories of programs and projects eligible for 
funding under the Clean Transportation Program a program to repair or replace nonoperational 
electric vehicle chargers that are at least 5 years old and that are located in a publicly available 
parking space, as provided. The bill would require the commission to allocate at least 50% of the 
funding allocated for the repair or replacement program to low-income communities and 
disadvantaged communities.   (Based on  07/02/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=1WrHWNKCfvOYZLVQRIIlVopkigle1gV1nCpGl6KNMpADIusoaZ9xF0l5SDuxMNLpzvYaOHeT0S6NYCrUm+U4qxOsywzvMQHsVRPlGTKhFMA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/430
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/430
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2801-2850/ab_2813_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2801-2850/ab_2813_92_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=1jjXBLFQ0nZ5zILDYRlzB8XFodLdcvPWykW9ZQnT0b5WSn2V70+XhQczzBZIt/dLd+8FxxJ8pIg0Gq9U3JGHSR+BUPFqC18y+DPtlGCmTcM=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/437
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2801-2850/ab_2814_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2801-2850/ab_2814_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=F92A9B24-C492-4E6D-B120-AE6867E89B28
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=F92A9B24-C492-4E6D-B120-AE6867E89B28
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=F92A9B24-C492-4E6D-B120-AE6867E89B28
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=SRQgPWzTZRa2TFr/X64jEJ0vohfYEzfX3nw6xx5an/JON2zv74JMP4vsnTgIgr+VZC+B9Q1frJOeMUTPX582P1I8WustJmOoapj4ksXQQOA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/454
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/454
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2801-2850/ab_2815_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2801-2850/ab_2815_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2801-2850/ab_2815_95_A_bill.pdf


Attachment B: 2023-2024 Intergovernmental Relations Priority State Legislation Log 
 

Last Updated 12/06/24        123 
 

Measure Author Topic Current 
Text 

Status Location Brief Summary Attachments Position 

AB 2827 Reyes, D 
 

Invasive 
species: 
prevention. 

06/11/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/5/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would find and declare that it is a primary goal of the state to prevent the introduction, and 
suppress the spread, of invasive species within its borders. The bill would require, in carrying out 
this goal, the Department of Food and Agriculture, in collaboration with relevant state agencies 
and stakeholders, to develop and implement strategies to detect, control, monitor, and eradicate 
invasive species to protect the state’s agriculture, environment, and natural resources. The bill 
would require the department, in consultation with other relevant state agencies, to allocate funds, 
if available, to implement and enforce these provisions.   (Based on  06/11/2024 text) 

AB 2827 - 
Support 
05.14.24.pdf 

Support 

AB 2839 Pellerin, D 
 

Elections: 
deceptive 
media in 
advertisements
. 

09/17/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/17/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
262, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/17/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law prohibits certain distribution of materially deceptive audio or visual media of a 
candidate within 60 days of an election at which the candidate will appear on the ballot, unless the 
media includes a disclosure stating that the media has been manipulated, subject to specified 
exemptions. Current law authorizes a candidate whose voice or likeness appears in audio or visual 
media distributed in violation of these provisions to file specified actions, and it requires a court to 
place such proceedings on the calendar in the order of their date of filing and give the proceedings 
precedence. This bill would prohibit a person, committee, or other entity from knowingly 
distributing an advertisement or other election communication, as defined, that contains certain 
materially deceptive content, as defined, with malice, as defined, subject to specified exemptions. 
The bill would apply this prohibition within 120 days of an election in California and, in specified 
cases, 60 days after an election.   (Based on  09/17/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2854 Irwin, D 
 

Bradley-Burns 
Uniform Local 
Sales and Use 
Tax Law. 

09/28/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/28/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
842, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/28/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Bradley-Burns Uniform Local Sales and Use Tax Law (Bradley-Burns) authorizes counties 
and cities to impose local sales and use taxes in conformity with the Sales and Use Tax Law. 
Current law, on or after January 1, 2016, prohibits a local agency from entering into any form of 
agreement that would result, directly or indirectly, in the payment, transfer, diversion, or rebate of 
Bradley-Burns local tax revenues to any person, as defined, for any purpose, if the agreement 
results in a reduction in the amount of Bradley-Burns local tax revenues that, in the absence of the 
agreement, would be received by another local agency and the retailer continues to maintain a 
physical presence within the territorial jurisdiction of that other local agency, with specified 
exceptions. This bill would require a local agency, as defined, to annually provide specified 
information relating to each agreement resulting in the direct or indirect payment, transfer, 
diversion, or rebate of Bradley-Burns local tax revenues to the California Department of Tax and 
Fee Administration.   (Based on  09/28/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=XTdKdY/u04f18LBLaWSQfIIbAljIPPIO7COeEQLzLC2gXOJs5v/wkUqQZvgVjU7FrV2OPHfCsNI39iI+5FtkVFAn/nE7eGF3CkqH5roej8M=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/374
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2801-2850/ab_2827_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2801-2850/ab_2827_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2801-2850/ab_2827_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E41CB63F-1E72-4E1F-8F57-6BB273076960
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E41CB63F-1E72-4E1F-8F57-6BB273076960
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E41CB63F-1E72-4E1F-8F57-6BB273076960
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=J1HC7EteHCik0oh4tqRZyiBFFTLtm7gqACZBIGFYfPFCwS0olTiyJ9RjDQkFpysJJ+xEJSrHfC7wtrXRZfu80B1QosMC17scIhPfIkPVfxA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/438
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2801-2850/ab_2839_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2801-2850/ab_2839_91_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=KDttgLudho90AnWjiG7h503g73lUyrH7Z04yaKVW+nKGZDErcHqbBKbK7NjAtlmTBdNuEglBcIgNit+Bce4vbKToksPPt9XVdyHxLIULUpw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/442
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2851-2900/ab_2854_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2851-2900/ab_2854_93_C_bill.pdf
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AB 2881 Lee, D 
 

The Social 
Housing Act. 

02/15/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
5/8/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would enact the Social Housing Act and would create the California Housing Authority as an 
independent state body, the mission of which would be to ensure that social housing 
developments that are produced and acquired align with the goals of eliminating the gap between 
housing production and regional housing needs assessment targets and preserving affordable 
housing. The bill would prescribe a definition of social housing that would describe, in addition to 
housing owned by the authority, housing owned by other entities, as specified, provided that all 
social housing developed or authorized by the authority would be owned by the authority. This bill 
would prescribe the composition of the California Housing Authority Board, which would govern 
the authority, and which would be composed of appointed members and members who would be 
elected by residents of social housing developments, as specified. The bill would set forth the 
powers and duties of the authority and the board. The bill would require the authority to seek to 
achieve revenue neutrality, as defined, and would require the authority to seek to recuperate the 
cost of development and operations over the life of its properties through mechanisms that 
maximize the number of Californians who can be housed without experiencing rent 
burden.   (Based on  02/15/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2886 Aguiar-Curry, 
D 
 

Gambling 
Control Act: 
injunctive relief. 

03/21/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
INACTIVE 
FILE on 
8/30/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law requires the Department of Justice to investigate any violations of, and to enforce, the 
Gambling Control Act. Current law prohibits a court from issuing a temporary injunction or other 
provisional order to restrain, stay, or otherwise interfere with any action by the department or the 
California Gambling Control Commission, except upon a finding by the court, based on clear and 
convincing evidence, that the public interest will not be prejudiced. Current law prohibits an order 
from being effective for more than 15 days and a preliminary order from being effective for more 
than 45 days, except by stipulation of the department or commission. This bill would extend the 
period an order may be effective to 21 days and extend the period a preliminary order may be 
effective to 60 days.   (Based on  03/21/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2898 Carrillo, 
Wendy, D 
 

Unbundled 
parking: 
exemptions: 
Housing 
Choice 
Vouchers. 

09/22/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/22/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
420, 
Statutes of 
2024 

09/22/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires the owner of qualifying residential property, as defined, that provides parking 
with the qualifying residential property to unbundle parking from the price of rent, as specified. 
Current law defines “unbundled parking” as the practice of selling or leasing parking spaces 
separate from the lease of the residential use. Current federal law provides housing assistance to 
low-income individuals and households in the form of vouchers, commonly known as Housing 
Choice Vouchers. This bill would exempt any residential unit that is leased to a tenant who 
receives a federal Housing Choice Voucher, including a federal Veterans Affairs Supportive 
Housing voucher, from the above-described requirement to unbundle parking.   (Based 
on  09/22/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=wnFF20BnVOMRouzKVLkmZpbwzcnyWgzkBdyG43x7wleVjjsAGfjaEMkJQX3Ge0iDtKuta8w24xiuo0HaF9GzBTX5eNcfDUdkUyi734TrLik=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/308
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2851-2900/ab_2881_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2851-2900/ab_2881_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=GK/CwoneoIVayxh2b53uzxN7lEb2upEaaUQHgn1yjGIbaekwDn79wbSYj/JwhkZxzzg31RqTr8lr7bYyC8P4PGabrp/HC2xuHUfpvYn0NNg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/430
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/430
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2851-2900/ab_2886_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2851-2900/ab_2886_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2851-2900/ab_2886_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=fwa0qp05FGBKmfeuMpEJ6yKlaykyx3udLpfSF7usTeb4a2OebF86+TuznWN7n6bgq1BIW1D4+cQi4pikWBROakS3EUjTvUy+k+LJdUAPFsE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/411
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/411
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2851-2900/ab_2898_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2851-2900/ab_2898_96_C_bill.pdf
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AB 2904 Quirk-Silva, D 
 

Zoning 
ordinances: 
notice. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
747, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/27/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law requires the planning commission to hold a public hearing on any zoning ordinance or 
an amendment to a zoning ordinance that changes any property from one zone to another. If the 
proposed ordinance or amendment to a zoning ordinance affects the permitted uses of real 
property, current law requires notice of the hearing to be, among other things, mailed or delivered 
at least 10 days prior to the hearing to the owner of the subject real property, as specified. This bill 
would instead require notice of the planning commission’s hearing on a proposed zoning 
ordinance or amendment to a zoning ordinance, if the proposed ordinance or amendment to a 
zoning ordinance affects the permitted uses of real property, to be published, posted, mailed, and 
delivered, or advertised, as applicable, at least 20 days before the hearing.   (Based 
on  09/27/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2905 Low, D 
 

Telecommunic
ations: 
automatic 
dialing-
announcing 
devices: 
artificial voices. 

09/20/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/20/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
316, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/20/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law authorizes the Public Utilities Commission to control and regulate the connection of an 
automatic dialing-announcing device, as defined, to a telephone line. Current law imposes various 
requirements on the use of an automatic dialing-announcing device, including that whenever 
telephone calls are placed through the use of an automatic dialing-announcing device, the device 
may be operated only after an unrecorded, natural voice announcement has been made to the 
person called by the person calling. Currrent law requires the announcement to state the nature of 
the call and provide specified information about the business or organization being represented, if 
any, and inquire as to whether the person called consents to hear the prerecorded message. This 
bill would require the announcement to also inform the person called if the prerecorded message 
uses an artificial voice, as defined.   (Based on  09/20/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2910 Santiago, D 
 

State Housing 
Law: City of 
Los Angeles: 
conversion of 
nonresidential 
buildings. 

09/23/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/22/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
Governor. 

09/22/2024 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

The California Building Standards Law establishes the California Building Standards Commission 
within the Department of General Services. Current law requires the commission to approve and 
adopt building standards and to codify those standards in the California Building Standards Code, 
which is required to be published once every 3 years. The State Housing Law establishes 
statewide construction and occupancy standards for buildings used for human habitation. That law 
requires the building department of every city or county to enforce within its jurisdiction the 
provisions of the California Building Standards Code, the provisions of the State Housing Law, and 
specified other rules and regulations promulgated pursuant to that law. That law authorizes a city 
or county to adopt alternative building regulations for the conversion of commercial or industrial 
buildings to joint living and work quarters, as specified. This bill would additionally authorize the 
City of Los Angeles (city) to adopt alternative building regulations for the conversion of 
nonresidential buildings to residential uses, as specified. The bill would prohibit these alternative 
building regulations from applying to nonresidential buildings with industrial uses.   (Based 
on  08/29/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=5BujuHbJL10RekggRfjg5nID+RuhDikYIov7iuTloSNeJH2vf+gKUnNKePkE+OJPQcOxdI9ir2O+wWlrOU9aF59OCex7B+3eBx74ZRAM5kE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/488
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2904_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2904_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=RkTmc8LsJxqYju51spGUjHppEOQBH6vXqyC+Aaz1ZDvnTBhlk+umvhKyP9ouE6WMx+51NlBB5eydpBtpRwJc8ntZF1sIT+fg2jDqr4TgNZY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/437
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2905_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2905_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=O+laVG7oXNVL9gj6UuVpEB63kWa0VYTJuTPICBKPPfiWBPpii2iyrf7ZTd2M/1AEjdyuYPJDd3tXd3TCUaYsKHklulZ165AiTVtCUBv9yk4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/494
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2910_93_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2910_93_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2910_93_E_bill.pdf
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AB 2919 Papan, D 
 

State Housing 
Law. 

02/15/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

05/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(6). 
(Last 
location was 
PRINT on 
2/15/2024) 

05/02/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Existing law, the State Housing Law, generally provides for the regulation of buildings used for 
human habitation. The law makes its provisions inapplicable to any building regulated by the 
Manufactured Housing Act of 1980, the Mobilehome Parks Act, and the California Factory-Built 
Housing Law unless those acts specifically require application. This bill would make 
nonsubstantive changes to the latter provision.   (Based on  02/15/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2922 Garcia, D 
 

Economic 
development: 
capital 
investment 
incentive 
programs. 

09/25/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/25/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
581, 
Statutes of 
2024 

09/25/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Prior law, until January 1, 2024, authorized a county, city and county, or city to establish a capital 
investment incentive program, pursuant to which the county, city and county, or city was 
authorized to pay, upon request, a capital investment incentive amount that does not exceed the 
amount of property tax derived from that portion of the assessed value of a qualified manufacturing 
facility, as defined, that exceeds $150,000,000 to a proponent of a qualified manufacturing facility 
for up to 15 years. Prior law required the proponent to enter into a community services agreement 
with the county, city and county, or city, including, among other things, a job creation plan. This bill 
would reestablish the authorization for capital investment incentive programs until January 1, 
2035. The bill would additionally authorize the above-described capital investment incentive 
program for proponents of a qualified manufacturing facility with an assessed value that exceeds 
$25,000,000 and would include additional requirements for the above-described job creation plan 
for these proponents. The bill would make conforming changes.   (Based on  09/25/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2923 Jones-
Sawyer, D 
 

Peace officers: 
public 
complaints. 

04/17/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
PUB. S. on 
3/4/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law requires each department or agency that employs peace officer to establish a 
procedure to investigate complaints by members of the public against the personnel of the 
department or agency. This bill would require a form used during the complaint process to include 
a provision inquiring whether the complaint includes an allegation of racial or identify profiling and 
a space to describe the allegation. The bill would define “complaint” for these purposes to mean a 
report, given either in writing or verbally, that brings to the attention of a department or agency an 
incident during which the complainant perceives that a department or agency employee engaged 
in misconduct, as specified. The bill would require a department or agency to develop a process 
whereby a member of the public may submit a concern that a policy of the department could result 
in harm to an individual, as specified, and if the department or agency discovers conduct that 
could be a basis for a complaint, to report the conduct to a supervisor, as specified.   (Based 
on  04/17/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=A8MydyUbkpY3QRvRngT2C0s26iVOOgwWh+w21TyMnwGWh2u5EwgYu+ZDTZp/ocfe6HB/XJ/7/mEd3iQLxTlQoDV88upgx7IqdzSPLq8aEwA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/362
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2919_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2919_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=wzn6btzsyOoQai3e45Dmr/XO+hlB48hmAa0CpGZA5yozgrVY4/Av4Kjpdh/peIwK+f4z2MIWIURaXMFYMRPbKO/+AJJpNRKAtMLIOPfSSrc=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/440
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2922_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2922_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=0SLpvdRY02ekf7RqlL6oTy1/EAxOD6kpE8Vz2CzEOBWO+AbU7dvORxDj/NsXUKgEwQMrFAk27+wFQIpZHUyaFwKKZpwVNw9DCtHXM6t35W4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/378
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/378
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2923_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2923_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2923_98_A_bill.pdf


Attachment B: 2023-2024 Intergovernmental Relations Priority State Legislation Log 
 

Last Updated 12/06/24        127 
 

Measure Author Topic Current 
Text 

Status Location Brief Summary Attachments Position 

AB 2926 Kalra, D 
 

Planning and 
zoning: 
assisted 
housing 
developments: 
notice of 
expiration of 
affordability 
restrictions. 

09/19/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/19/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
281, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/19/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Planning and Zoning Law requires an owner of an assisted housing development proposing 
the termination of a subsidy contract or prepayment of governmental assistance or of an assisted 
housing development in which there will be the expiration of rental restrictions to provide a notice 
of the proposed change to each affected tenant household residing in the assisted housing 
development, as specified. The Planning and Zoning Law defines “assisted housing development” 
for these purposes to mean a multifamily rental housing development of 5 or more units that 
receives governmental assistance under any of specified programs, including assistance provided 
by counties or cities under specified law in exchange for restrictions on the maximum rents, as 
specified, and on the maximum tenant income, as specified. The Planning and Zoning law defines 
a “termination” for these purposes to mean an owner’s decision to extend or renew its participation 
in a federal, state, or local government subsidy program or private, nongovernmental subsidy 
program for an assisted housing development, as specified. The Planning and Zoning Law defines 
the “expiration of rental restrictions” for these purposes to mean the expiration of rental restrictions 
for an assisted housing development, as specified, unless the development has other recorded 
agreements restricting the rent to the same or lesser levels for at least 50% of the units. This bill 
would instead impose the above-described notice requirement on an owner prior to the anticipated 
date of termination of a subsidy contract or expiration of rental restrictions or prepayment on an 
assisted housing development, as specified. The bill would expand the definition of “assisted 
housing development” to include a development that receives assistance from counties or cities in 
exchange for affordability restrictions, as described above, pursuant to the Middle Class Housing 
Act of 2022; streamlining assistance pursuant to the Affordable Housing and High Road Jobs Act 
of 2022; specified law providing a streamlined, ministerial approval process for certain housing 
developments; or the Affordable Housing on Faith and Higher Education Lands Act of 2023. The 
bill would revise the definition of “termination” for these purposes to instead mean the failure of an 
owner to extend or renew its participation in the above-described programs, as specified.   (Based 
on  09/19/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2934 Ward, D 
 

Residential 
developments: 
building 
standards: 
review. 

05/16/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/5/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Existing law, the California Building Standards Law, establishes the California Building Standards 
Commission (commission) within the Department of General Services and sets forth its powers 
and duties, including approval and adoption of building standards and codification of those 
standards into the California Building Standards Code (code). Existing law requires the 
commission to publish, or cause to be published, editions of the code in its entirety once every 3 
years. This bill would require the department to convene a working group no later than December 
31, 2025, to research and consider identifying and recommending amendments to state building 
standards allowing residential developments to be built, as specified. The bill would require the 
department, no later than December 31, 2026, to provide a one-time report of its findings to the 
Legislature in the annual report described above. The bill, if the report identifies and recommends 
amendments to building standards, would require the department to research, develop, and 
consider proposing such standards for adoption by the commission, as specified. This bill contains 
other existing laws.   (Based on  05/16/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=KUBTZVQQfVIa5DvqfJSJASYCRtUFgAZsJwGQJIpnGYN6iGCSGvjgL0+sLySOh6lLrWlCEjuOdYtzqaFl1JKwrTKoQOvHDt6rJqO7qIuGXZk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/436
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2926_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2926_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=llOORVOccPzOv38gluiFown0FJNSe7ZF9BNjh4l/axcbsQ0DBfG5ws9qyr9QHGgvloTHCiKkIXBn6ysgPXE6Jq3U20kMWAR1SgETwvYWtSg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/328
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2934_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2934_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2934_98_A_bill.pdf
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AB 2937 Wicks, D 
 

California 
Environmental 
Quality Act: 
streamlined 
environmental 
reviews. 

02/15/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

05/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(6). 
(Last 
location was 
PRINT on 
2/15/2024) 

05/02/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) requires a lead agency, as defined, to prepare, 
or cause to be prepared, and certify the completion of an environmental impact report (EIR) on a 
project that it proposes to carry out or approve that may have a significant effect on the 
environment or to adopt a negative declaration if it finds that the project will not have that effect. 
CEQA also requires a lead agency to prepare a mitigated negative declaration for a project that 
may have a significant effect on the environment if revisions in the project would avoid or mitigate 
that effect and there is no substantial evidence that the project, as revised, would have a 
significant effect on the environment. CEQA establishes certain processes, such as the 
preparation of a master EIR or a focused EIR, to streamline the environmental review of projects. 
CEQA states the intentions of the Legislature in enacting those streamlined environmental review 
processes. This bill would make nonsubstantive changes to those statements of intent.   (Based 
on  02/15/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 2943 Zbur, D 
 

Crimes: 
shoplifting. 

08/16/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

08/16/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
168, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

08/16/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law divides theft into grand theft and petty theft. Existing law punishes petty theft as a 
misdemeanor while grand theft is punished as either a misdemeanor or a felony. Current law lists 
specific types of theft which are grand theft and all other cases of theft as petty theft. Current law 
authorizes a person to be charged with grand theft if the property taken exceeds $950 over the 
course of distinct but related acts. This bill would clarify that those related acts include acts 
committed against multiple victims or in counties other than the county of the current offense. The 
bill would also clarify that evidence that distinct acts are motivated by one intention, one general 
impulse, and one plan may include, but is not limited to, evidence that the acts involve the same 
defendant or defendants, are substantially similar in nature, or occur within a 90-day 
period.   (Based on  08/16/2024 text) 

AB 2943 Letter of 
Support 
04.03.24.pdf 

Support 

AB 2945 Alvarez, D 
 

Reconnecting 
Communities 
Redevelopment 
Act. 

04/18/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
5/15/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The California Constitution, with respect to any taxes levied on taxable property in a 
redevelopment project established under the Community Redevelopment Law, as it then read or 
may be amended, authorizes the Legislature to provide for the division of those taxes under a 
redevelopment plan between the taxing agencies and the redevelopment agency, as provided. 
Current law dissolved redevelopment agencies as of February 1, 2012, and designates successor 
agencies to act as successor entities to the dissolved redevelopment agencies. This bill, the 
Reconnecting Communities Redevelopment Act, would authorize a city or county, or two or more 
cities acting jointly, to propose the formation of a reconnecting communities investment agency by 
adoption of a resolution of intention that meets specified requirements, including that the resolution 
of intention include a passthrough provision and an override passthrough provision, as defined. 
The bill would require the city or county to submit that resolution to each affected taxing entity and 
would authorize an entity that receives that resolution to elect to not receive a passthrough 
payment, as provided. The bill would require the city or county that adopted that resolution to hold 
a public hearing on the proposal to consider all written and oral objections to the formation, as well 
as any recommendations of the affected taxing entities, and would authorize that city or county to 
adopt a resolution of formation at the conclusion of that hearing.   (Based on  04/18/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=x/1AamLojUXAQA/wsm9TDyirSklmaPYVbRQqpbiWNYjzt8ePKMpU/uf+Ym3c4XlOEeQuzvvTfXKVh0ggEt4GaghU3vLPRHfFu0Vb54mgfe8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/306
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2937_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2937_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=b5oqJCuguMbLjZ7P51ugT1mWo33aoewIy15Tb79WqQb6x5bPY/4iQpfEh4iO6cDwRVT0+2aGSzrJJef+HdwRfz3PnCVIJc029FTWnyH0Dog=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/468
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2943_90_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2943_90_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=BAB17420-07D3-441B-ABEE-1C3A417588A4
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=BAB17420-07D3-441B-ABEE-1C3A417588A4
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=BAB17420-07D3-441B-ABEE-1C3A417588A4
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=rRE1UF0O0FGyV9qIonUUywoqZzfpnxzaSYBAQUvmQbnm/+bL/sgY6TKEHJWZ0EIGEAaFZxcRyV66qK9m0qG4RI8FxLyhB0NQelfFgkn6BYc=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/504
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2945_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2945_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_2901-2950/ab_2945_97_A_bill.pdf
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AB 3006 Zbur, D 
 

Energy: 
offshore wind 
generation. 

06/26/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/5/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law requires the State Energy Resources Conservation and Development Commission 
(Energy Commission), in coordination with specified agencies, to develop a strategic plan for 
offshore wind energy developments installed off the California coast in federal waters, and 
requires the Energy Commission to submit the strategic plan to the Natural Resources Agency and 
the Legislature on or before June 30, 2023, as specified. Current law requires the Energy 
Commission, in coordination with relevant state and local agencies, to develop a plan to improve 
waterfront facilities that could support a range of floating offshore wind energy development 
activities, as specified. The California Infrastructure Planning Act requires the Governor to annually 
submit a 5-year infrastructure plan to the Legislature in conjunction with the Governor’s Budget. 
Under existing law, “infrastructure” means real property, including land and improvements to the 
land, structures and equipment integral to the operation of structures, easements, rights-of-way, 
and other forms of interest in property, roadways, and water conveyances. This bill would amend 
the definition of “infrastructure” described above to include port infrastructure for offshore wind 
energy development, and would require the 5-year infrastructure plan to include, beginning in the 
2026–27 fiscal year, an assessment of funding needs for port infrastructure for offshore wind 
energy development.   (Based on  06/26/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 3035 Pellerin, D 
 

Farmworker 
housing. 

09/24/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/24/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
524, 
Statutes of 
2024 

09/24/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Employee Housing Act generally regulates employee housing, as defined. Among other 
things, the act authorizes a development proponent to submit an application for a development 
that is subject to a streamlined, ministerial process, as specified, and is not subject to a conditional 
use permit if certain requirements are met, including that the development is located on land 
designated as agricultural in the applicable city or county general plan, and that the development 
is an eligible agricultural employee housing development. The act defines eligible agricultural 
housing development as, among other things, an agricultural employee housing development that 
consists of no more than 36 units or spaces designed for use by a single family or household and 
is not ineligible for state funding under a provision that prohibits state funding from being provided 
to an employer who employs at least one H-2A worker, as specified. This bill would additionally 
authorize a development proponent to submit an application for a development that would subject 
to the above-described conditions, if the development is located on land in the County of Santa 
Clara or the County of Santa Cruz that is within 15 miles of an area designated as farmland or 
grazing by the Department of Conservation and is not a site or adjoined to a site where more than 
1/3 of the square footage on the site is dedicated to industrial use, as specified. The bill would also 
increase the maximum number of units in an eligible agricultural employee housing development 
from 36 units to 150 units if the development is located with the County of Santa Clara or the 
County of Santa Cruz.   (Based on  09/24/2024 text) 

 Support if 
Amended 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ZHULEGFTmawDK6PGlTbi5XPnRaSl7hvCbzZeGF2JnFTukvh2UgmGG9NqZepyp/5YGUQuy23T9c9rayTo6DHOUtX1PwoOv2ldruX+rSbedwQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/468
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3001-3050/ab_3006_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3001-3050/ab_3006_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3001-3050/ab_3006_95_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=meU40c6rcVw9kcQXrXqmTU1iYDPlE0XofzjjWimIjCfGdjeYXHQ8tApsv6ceQrwREK/DKGXw5hi84anCNxiiPniKaqwq4x03iE9zpWfmZt4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/438
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3001-3050/ab_3035_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3001-3050/ab_3035_93_C_bill.pdf
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AB 3061 Haney, D 
 

Vehicles: 
autonomous 
vehicle incident 
reporting. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
Governor. 

09/27/2024 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Would, commencing July 31, 2025, require a manufacturer of autonomous vehicles to report to the 
Department of Motor Vehicles (DMV) a vehicle collision or disengagement, as defined, that occurs 
when a manufacturer’s vehicle is operating in autonomous mode on California public roads 
regardless of whether the vehicle is in the testing or deployment phase. The bill would require 
these reports to contain specified information and to be submitted, at minimum, on an annual 
basis, as specified. The bill would require these reports to be submitted on timelines adopted by 
the DMV that do not exceed reporting deadlines required by the federal National Highway Traffic 
Safety Administration. The bill would additionally, commencing July 31, 2025, require a 
manufacturer to submit quarterly reports to the department that summarize the vehicle miles 
traveled, vehicle immobilizations, and certain traffic violations, as specified. The bill would, 
commencing July 1, 2025, require the DMV to maintain all reports submitted pursuant to the 
above-described provisions and make the reports available to local and state transportation 
authorities upon request. The bill would, commencing January 1, 2028, require the department to 
publish reports in an electronic, open, and machine-readable format on the department’s internet 
website within 90 days of receipt, but would require the department to redact the personal 
information of any passengers, drivers, or other road users, and any information that divulges 
trade secrets identified by the autonomous vehicle manufacturer prior to releasing these reports. 
The bill would authorize the department to establish additional reporting requirements for purposes 
of these provisions by regulation. The bill would also authorize the department to establish and 
assess fees to recover costs reasonably incurred by the department for implementing these 
provisions by regulation.   (Based on  08/31/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 3067 Gipson, D 
 

Interscholastic 
athletics: 
California 
Interscholastic 
Federation: 
notice of 
sanctions. 

08/05/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
INACTIVE 
FILE on 
8/29/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would require the California Interscholastic Federation and its sections, whenever a sanction is 
imposed on a member school or on an interscholastic team of a member school, to post on its 
respective internet website the name of the member school, the interscholastic team that has been 
sanctioned, if any, the violation that has occasioned the sanction, and a description of the sanction 
being imposed.   (Based on  08/05/2024 text) 

AB 3067 Letter of 
Support 
04.03.24.pdf 

Sponsor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=0hH+LcJKv5t39NcOGLTz7TvYaV6E2ILyIYYJMCQ5UgLxV8svVsIVyxctm8Br3PmqPnugHnOb0JuQAflPmB9Lji5FAppKiioKTPtMP+K91aw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/503
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3051-3100/ab_3061_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3051-3100/ab_3061_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3051-3100/ab_3061_94_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=6Pp9GDG3X0qdJ0EuNe56EuvDW8odxqwKAhaaYJanOc9bH9SgSjgTTLitvIhuLVPWytzuxmGPM/9tfFO/ruM7v4uqXGvrxuXLjKAJ/20BXu0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/451
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3051-3100/ab_3067_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3051-3100/ab_3067_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3051-3100/ab_3067_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=CE38010C-EB38-46D5-B858-09C08AA2EB84
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=CE38010C-EB38-46D5-B858-09C08AA2EB84
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=CE38010C-EB38-46D5-B858-09C08AA2EB84
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AB 3068 Haney, D 
 

Adaptive reuse: 
streamlining: 
incentives. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
Governor. 

09/27/2024 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

The Planning and Zoning Law requires each county and city to adopt a comprehensive, long-term 
general plan for its physical development, and the development of certain lands outside its 
boundaries, that includes, among other mandatory elements, a housing element. That law allows a 
development proponent to submit an application for a development that is subject to a specified 
streamlined, ministerial approval process not subject to a conditional use permit, if the 
development satisfies certain objective planning standards, including that the development is a 
multifamily housing development that contains two or more residential units. This bill would deem 
an adaptive reuse project a use by right in all zones, regardless of the zoning of the site, and 
subject to a streamlined, ministerial review process if the project meets specified requirements, 
subject to specified exceptions. In this regard, an adaptive reuse project, in order to qualify for the 
streamlined, ministerial review process, would be required to be proposed for an existing building 
that is less than 50 years old or meets certain requirements regarding the preservation of historic 
resources, including the signing of an affidavit declaring that the project will comply with the United 
States Secretary of the Interior’s Standards for Rehabilitation for, among other things, the 
preservation of exterior facades of a building that face a street, or receive federal or state historic 
rehabilitation tax credits, as specified. The bill would require an adaptive reuse project to meet 
specified affordability criteria. In this regard, the bill would require an adaptive reuse project for 
rental housing to include either 8% of the unit for very low income households and 5% of the units 
for extremely low income households or 15% of the units for lower income households. For an 
adaptive reuse project for owner-occupied housing, the bill would require the development to offer 
either 30% of the units at an affordable housing cost to moderate-income households or 15% of 
the units at an affordable housing cost to lower income households. The bill would require at least 
one-half of the square footage of the adaptive reuse project to be dedicated to residential 
uses.   (Based on  09/05/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 3073 Haney, D 
 

Wastewater 
testing: illicit 
substances. 

03/21/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
4/24/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would require the State Department of Public Health, in consultation with participating wastewater 
treatment facilities, local public health agencies, and other subject matter experts, to create a pilot 
program to test for high-risk substances and related treatment medications in wastewater. Under 
the bill, the goal of the program would be to determine how wastewater data can be used by state 
and local public health programs to address substance abuse in California. The bill would require 
the department to develop a list of target substances to be analyzed during the program that may 
include cocaine, fentanyl, methamphetamine, xylazine, methadone, buprenorphine, and naloxone. 
The bill would require the department, on or before July 1, 2025, to solicit voluntary participation 
from local public health agencies and wastewater treatment facilities, as specified. The bill would 
require the department to work with the participating agencies and facilities to collect samples and 
to arrange for those samples to be tested by qualified laboratories. The bill would require the 
department, in consultation with public health agencies and subject matter experts, to analyze test 
results to determine possible public health interventions.   (Based on  03/21/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=NXw5P/QnibPf9szvFV2iaKTXgLFDoKRcg0O88xgM2PqD5NUbyDo+Gf1JVi4jOXyxdNzhqM7WIhvlhajC7i0w1471e9xEWZYV+ILWPwBs0qY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/503
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3051-3100/ab_3068_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3051-3100/ab_3068_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3051-3100/ab_3068_94_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=uBKZzweYdvOKqyjCcMIkFRKJ1/1pWdqSauhJpLAmuHUV31YRUu/oUlGprqkPMBdVlRji8ONTLm6WRRZFrZHiwlAInuiwXxg54qEVkLuINk8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/503
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3051-3100/ab_3073_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3051-3100/ab_3073_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3051-3100/ab_3073_98_A_bill.pdf
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AB 3085 Gipson, D 
 

Vehicles: 
removal and 
impoundment. 

09/23/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/23/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
504, 
Statutes of 
2024 

09/23/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Existing law requires a magistrate to issue a warrant or order authorizing a peace officer to 
immediately seize and cause the removal of a vehicle if the magistrate is presented with a peace 
officer's affidavit establishing reasonable cause to believe that the vehicle was an instrumentality 
used in the peace officer's presence in violation of specified offenses, including, among others, a 
person who, while operating a motor vehicle and with the intent to evade, willfully flees or 
otherwise attempts to elude a pursuing peace officer's motor vehicle. Existing law makes it a crime 
for a person to engage in a motor vehicle speed contest or exhibition of speed on a highway or in 
an offstreet parking facility, as specified. This bill would include this crime in the list of offenses for 
which a peace officer may impound a vehicle pursuant to a warrant or order issued by a 
magistrate, and make other technical changes, as specified. This bill contains other related 
provisions and other existing laws.   (Based on  09/23/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 3086 Santiago, D 
 

General plan: 
annual report: 
housing units. 

02/16/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
H. & C.D. on 
3/11/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Planning and Zoning Law requires a city or county to adopt a general plan for land use 
development of the city or county that includes, among other elements, a housing element. That 
law requires the housing element to include, among other things, an identification and analysis of 
existing and projected housing needs. That law requires the city or county to provide by April 1 of 
each year an annual report to, among other entities, the Department of Housing and Community 
Development that includes, among other specified information, the number of units of housing 
demolished and new units of housing that have been issued a completed entitlement, a building 
permit, or a certificate of occupancy. This bill would additionally require the city or county to 
include in the annual report the number of units in the city or county with long-term affordable 
covenants or restrictions that expired in the prior year and the number of units in the city or county 
subject to a local rent control or any form of rent or price control that were withdrawn from rent or 
lease.   (Based on  02/16/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 3089 Jones-
Sawyer, D 
 

Chattel slavery: 
formal apology. 

09/26/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/26/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
624, 
Statutes of 
2024 

09/26/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would provide that the State of California recognizes and accepts responsibility for all of the harms 
and atrocities committed by the state, its representatives thereof, and entities under its jurisdiction 
who promoted, facilitated, enforced, and permitted the institution of chattel slavery and the 
enduring legacy of ongoing badges and incidents from which the systemic structures of 
discrimination have come to exist. The bill would further provide that the State of California 
apologize for perpetuating the harms African Americans have faced and affirms its role in 
protecting the descendants of enslaved people and all Black Californians. The bill would require a 
plaque memorializing this apology to be publicly and conspicuously installed and maintained in the 
State Capitol Building. The bill would impose various duties on the Department of General 
Services and the Joint Rules Committee relating to the installation and maintenance of the plaque. 
The bill would authorize the Department of General Services and the Joint Rules Committee to 
receive money from grants and private donations and would continuously appropriate those funds 
for this purpose, as specified.   (Based on  09/26/2024 text) 

AB 3089 Support 
05.17.24.pdf 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=F1S+/q9szKGf07mrzJQh6AS/SqoqhD/NB/t9RRsjoS6+VnZNXjvjqn3tRuP1MihRU+U+MCJp7e+nyQS7lSs7tYZfIXXy2T0iKdrgc+jUYT4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/451
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3051-3100/ab_3085_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3051-3100/ab_3085_96_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=QjL6ynKPMMK2f2ae7bV6ZvWBcdBhpsG1n9m3u5jZtIm97dYTPEnsz92ixhsDBAxw+SSvMAf/R17kcHx7EgnrqwVoA2IHCtEYQGaM6o+GrRA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/494
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3051-3100/ab_3086_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3051-3100/ab_3086_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=pp8idaHyuCLu2nlyl0r3fUoB+mjYPxgAUf5jHgE2MO5I+Ajf1X3mmTh4swQkeKhWkYq1HUSfDMkni4MJHiQctdg8asS/W9sbi1sBldsglEU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/378
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/378
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3051-3100/ab_3089_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3051-3100/ab_3089_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=38E51A89-44EF-4A10-99FA-55547DE0406F
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=38E51A89-44EF-4A10-99FA-55547DE0406F
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AB 3093 Ward, D 
 

Land use: 
housing 
element. 

09/19/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/19/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
282, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/19/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Planning and Zoning Law requires a city or county to adopt a general plan for land use 
development that includes, among other things, a housing element. Existing law requires a city or 
county to provide by April 1 of each year an annual report to, among other entities, the Department 
of Housing and Community Development. The annual report is required to include, among other 
things, the city’s or county’s progress in meeting its share of regional housing needs, as specified. 
This bill would require a city or county to include in the report on the progress in meeting the city’s 
or county’s share of regional housing need the progress in meeting the need for the 6th and 
previous revisions of the housing element.   (Based on  09/19/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 3107 Connolly, D 
 

State Energy 
Resources 
Conservation 
and 
Development 
Commission: 
microgrids: 
study. 

04/16/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
5/15/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would require the State Energy Resources Conservation and Development Commission (Energy 
Commission) to conduct a study on the benefits of microgrids for local governments and 
communities and would require the Energy Commission, on or before January 1, 2027, to submit a 
report on that study to the Legislature. The bill would repeal its provisions on January 1, 
2031.   (Based on  04/16/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 3114 Low, D 
 

California 
Environmental 
Quality Act: 
expedited 
judicial review: 
sustainable 
aviation fuel 
projects. 

03/18/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
NAT. RES. 
on 
3/18/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law authorizes the Governor to certify projects meeting certain requirements as 
infrastructure projects and provide those certified projects with certain streamlining benefits, 
including requiring the lead agency to prepare the record of proceedings concurrently with the 
environmental review process and requiring the resolution of an action or proceeding challenging 
the certification of an EIR for certified projects or the granting of any project approvals, to the 
extent feasible, within 270 days of the filing of the record of proceedings with the court, as 
specified. Current law requires the lead agency, within 10 days of the certification of an 
infrastructure project, to provide a public notice of the certification, as provided. If a lead agency 
fails to approve a project certified as an infrastructure project before January 1, 2033, existing law 
specifies that the certification is no longer valid. This bill would authorize the Governor to certify 
sustainable aviation fuel projects, as defined, meeting certain requirements as infrastructure 
projects, thereby providing the above streamlining benefits to those projects. By expanding the 
duties of a lead agency as they relate to infrastructure projects to sustainable aviation fuel 
projects, this bill would impose a state-mandated local program.   (Based on  03/18/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=whkdUHAq3+5C0yczGy98DI+bZOWUwQAssSSVICUyWPor7kJZV5Tr3tvRWgTl4MBOSUs+Ev5ID+KXKcNPNg01uo+4+deVhC1AplVjE67qmeg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/328
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3051-3100/ab_3093_90_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3051-3100/ab_3093_90_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=fFBQp/ax7ul613DvuR8dfzTeRFHrtS9WPYHxXQ8hZJBQfdVP0Fiukd870J1B97ToRPGuh1+vW/R2XNOZaneA+H5YsPHuBBOz/M4eaLuiuHY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/310
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3101-3150/ab_3107_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3101-3150/ab_3107_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3101-3150/ab_3107_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=qaEaQqoxldCfVUnkD//KAlbaqtab6JpAWGTmeVQKdWi7BmtOxEQhwPLp8p6D3y5wjDupwd4mx8O+61skl+QRgeis3MbZgAKYU+qU1n1n+JA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/437
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3101-3150/ab_3114_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3101-3150/ab_3114_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3101-3150/ab_3114_98_A_bill.pdf
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AB 3116 Garcia, D 
 

Housing 
development: 
density 
bonuses: 
student 
housing 
developments. 

09/22/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/22/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
432, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/22/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Current law, commonly referred to as the Density Bonus Law, requires a city or county to provide a 
developer that proposes a housing development, as defined, within the city or county with a 
density bonus and other incentives or concessions, as specified, if the developer agrees to 
construct, among other options, 20% of the total units, as defined, for lower income students in a 
student housing development that meets certain requirements. Current law requires that all units in 
the student housing development be used exclusively for undergraduate, graduate, or professional 
students enrolled full time at an institution of higher learning, as specified. To be eligible under this 
provision, existing law requires a developer, as a condition of receiving a certificate of occupancy, 
provide evidence to the city, county, or city and county that the developer has entered into an 
operating agreement or master lease with one or more institutions of higher education, as 
specified. Current law also requires the development to provide priority for the applicable 
affordable units for lower income students experiencing homelessness, as specified. Current law 
requires units described in these provisions to be subject to a recorded affordability restriction of 
55 years. This bill would define “student housing development” to mean a development that 
contains bedrooms containing 2 or more bedspaces that have a shared or private bathroom, 
access to a shared or private living room and laundry facilities, and access to a shared or private 
kitchen. The bill would authorize units in the student housing development to be used for 
undergraduate, graduate, or professional students enrolled currently or in the past 6 months in at 
least 6 units at an institution of higher learning, as specified. The bill would additionally authorize 
eligibility under this provision if the developer, as a condition of receiving a certificate of 
occupancy, established a system for confirming its renters’ status as students to ensure all units of 
the student housing development are occupied with students from an institution of higher 
education, as specified.   (Based on  09/22/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 3122 Kalra, D 
 

Streamlined 
housing 
approvals: 
objective 
planning 
standards and 
subdivision 
applications. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
754, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/27/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The Planning and Zoning Law authorizes a development proponent to submit an application for a 
multifamily housing development that is subject to a streamlined, ministerial approval process, as 
provided, and not subject to a conditional use permit, if the development satisfies specified 
objective planning standards, including, among others, that the development is subject to a 
requirement mandating a minimum percentage of below market rate housing based on, among 
other things, that (1) the locality’s latest production report reflects that there were fewer units of 
housing issued building permits affordable to either very low income or low-income households by 
income category than were required for the regional housing needs assessment cycle for that 
reporting period and (2) the project seeking approval dedicates 50% of the total number of units, 
as specified, to housing affordable to households making at or below 80% of the area median 
income. This bill would also include as an objective planning standard that (1) the locality’s latest 
production report reflects the requirements described above and (2) the project application was 
submitted prior to January 1, 2019, and the project includes at least 500 units of housing, that the 
project dedicates 20% of the total number of units, as specified, as affordable units, with at least 
9% affordable to households making at or below 50% of the area median income and the 
remainder affordable to households making at or below 80% of the area median income.   (Based 
on  09/27/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=NHc+UImgSRWX7yt+SJxILUaitNHR02jkxqUDbrH0tPqVfvkYxWWk2LNhnKYB5E4qxpkIfFSiPPlE6slIXy9hui83dZZm4byrxbeLmrNn8Xc=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/440
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3101-3150/ab_3116_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3101-3150/ab_3116_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=yjm6dPDnt06kZlu/BXmCOy0SMnEje93Mc9yr+JNfm9o2DeMOeWooRqrsCiDrP69uwgzIHng8XnMB9zV1TNIxoQKrqF6+ABpgTxEBjuSDRLE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/436
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3101-3150/ab_3122_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3101-3150/ab_3122_94_C_bill.pdf
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AB 3126 Bauer-Kahan, 
D 
 

Department of 
Transportation: 
state highway 
property: 
information 
requests. 

03/21/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
TRANS. on 
3/21/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law vests the Department of Transportation with full possession and control of all state 
highways and all property and rights on property acquired for state highway purposes. Existing law 
authorizes the department to acquire any real property that it considers necessary for state 
highway purposes. This bill would require the department to provide information regarding the 
acquisition of, and funding sources used to acquire, real property held by the department for state 
highway purposes within 30 days of receiving a request for that information.   (Based 
on  03/21/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 3160 Gabriel, D 
 

Insurance, 
income, and 
corporation 
taxes: credits: 
low-income 
housing. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
Governor. 

09/27/2024 - 
Assembly  VE
TOED 

Current law establishes a low-income housing tax credit program pursuant to which the California 
Tax Credit Allocation Committee provides procedures and requirements for the allocation, in 
modified conformity with federal law, of state insurance, personal income, and corporation tax 
credit amounts to qualified low-income housing projects that have been allocated, or qualify for, a 
federal low-income housing tax credit, and farmworker housing. Current law limits the total annual 
amount of the state low-income housing credit for which a federal low-income housing credit is 
required to the sum of $70,000,000, as increased by any percentage increase in the Consumer 
Price Index for the preceding calendar year, any unused credit for the preceding calendar years, 
and the amount of housing credit ceiling returned in the calendar year. Current law provides for an 
additional allocation of $500,000,000 in low-income housing tax credits for the 2020 calendar year 
and up to $500,000,000 for the 2021 calendar year and thereafter. Existing law provides that the 
additional amount for the 2021 calendar year and thereafter is available only if the Budget Act or 
related legislation specifies an amount available for allocation. This bill would instead require that 
this additional allocation of low-income housing tax credits be $500,000,000 for the 2020 calendar 
year through the 2030 calendar year, and up to $500,000,000 for the 2031 calendar year and 
every year thereafter.   (Based on  09/04/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 3171 Soria, D 
 

Controlled 
substances: 
fentanyl. 

04/23/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
5/1/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law classifies controlled substances into 5 schedules and places the greatest restrictions 
and penalties on the use of those substances placed in Schedule I. Current law classifies the drug 
fentanyl in Schedule II. Current law makes possession of a controlled substance for the purposes 
of sale of the substance punishable by imprisonment in a county jail for a period of 2, 3, or 4 years. 
Current law makes transportation and sales of a controlled substances punishable by 
imprisonment in a county jail for a period of 3, 4, or 5 years and transportation to a noncontiguous 
county within the state punishable by imprisonment in a county jail for a period of 3, 6, or 9 years. 
This bill would increase the above-described penalties, as specified, if the controlled substance 
involved was more than more than 28.35 grams of fentanyl, more than 28.35 grams of an analog 
of fentanyl, a substance containing more than 28.35 grams of fentanyl, or a substance containing 
more than 28.35 grams of an analog of fentanyl and the individual knew that the specific controlled 
substance was fentanyl.   (Based on  04/23/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=PQ/ae3gRB944KQZzw0MKDf+CNBdeXJmn0C1mui0N2gg8c3nuxcizBKcX+kL/QFqhkkGQ5q24Aj8cNrcoV4cARehLTmM7phXzYdEGIzubiz8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/434
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/434
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3101-3150/ab_3126_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3101-3150/ab_3126_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3101-3150/ab_3126_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=zO2fkqAfKEc32/vOdfdV69lxMHI7Anmtb6aSOuFoGMutuC1JhX86JpeldvuwJ5/LDm1UhqpUTw5MJU3d5V+yaoMn4TPwDgdAWkF9f65JEk8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/371
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3151-3200/ab_3160_93_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3151-3200/ab_3160_93_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3151-3200/ab_3160_93_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=RwN/ZTGCt2jiTKGh9GpzersOrEGKKwn+3WVhaosf4ahAH1yI56O39QDwkSfgjhH5kIJuits8p2x+NZdparrV0HGNqu/DoBq3s5nHYV4ZGro=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/309
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3151-3200/ab_3171_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3151-3200/ab_3171_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3151-3200/ab_3171_98_A_bill.pdf
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AB 3181 Pellerin, D 
 

Electricity: 
outages. 

02/16/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
U. & E. on 
3/11/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would require, if one or more customers served by an electrical distribution circuit experiences 4 
or more discrete electrical outages, as defined, during a single calendar year, the electrical 
corporation that owns and operates that circuit to perform a review of that circuit to determine the 
cause of the outages and implement system improvements to reduce the anticipated risk of future 
outages on that circuit below the threshold level of 4 outages per calendar year. The bill would 
require the electrical corporation to make the findings of the circuit review, the scope of work 
expected to be performed to reduce the anticipated risk of future outages on that circuit, and the 
expected reduction in the risk of future outages resulting from that work available to the impacted 
customers and the city, county, or city and county in which the circuit is located.   (Based 
on  02/16/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 3201 Carrillo, Juan, 
D 
 

Planning and 
Zoning Law: 
housing 
elements. 

02/16/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

05/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(6). 
(Last 
location was 
PRINT on 
2/16/2024) 

05/02/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Planning and Zoning Law requires that the housing element of a city’s or county’s general 
plan consist of an identification and analysis of existing and projected housing needs and a 
statement of goals, policies, quantified objectives, financial resources, and scheduled programs for 
the preservation, improvement, and development of housing. The law requires the Department of 
Housing and Community Development to determine the existing and projected need for housing 
for each region, as specified. This bill would make nonsubstantive changes to those 
provisions.   (Based on  02/16/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 3219 Sanchez, R 
 

Advanced 
Clean Fleets 
Regulation: 
local 
governments. 

03/11/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(6). 
(Last 
location was 
TRANS. on 
3/11/2024) 

05/02/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The California Global Warming Solutions Act of 2006 establishes the State Air Resources Board 
as the state agency responsible for monitoring and regulating sources emitting greenhouse gases 
and requires the state board to adopt rules and regulations to achieve the maximum 
technologically feasible and cost-effective greenhouse gas emission reductions from those 
sources. Pursuant to its authority, the state board has adopted the Advanced Clean Fleets 
Regulation, which imposes various requirements for transitioning local, state, and federal 
government fleets of medium- and heavy-duty trucks, other high-priority fleets of medium- and 
heavy-duty trucks, and drayage trucks to zero-emission vehicles. The Advanced Clean Fleets 
Regulation authorizes entities subject to the regulation to apply for exemptions from its 
requirements under certain circumstances. This bill would provide that the requirements of the 
Advanced Clean Fleets Regulation do not apply to the purchase by a local government of vehicles 
with a gross vehicle weight rating greater than 8,500 pounds if the price of the zero-emission 
version of a vehicle is more than an unspecified percentage of the price of a comparable internal 
combustion engine version of that vehicle.   (Based on  03/11/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=BfjyVlvpwzsOsC4YqvWuOziWYSVJcv9NFXp0+H4oPZmL3kj4VPm+2USZMqWK15z9tq3zieA2ZHxGH5Mat4PPoDO6svCqvFzo4ORmtunG37w=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/438
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3151-3200/ab_3181_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3151-3200/ab_3181_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=IMWfbgtkY0rR77Z8rK6OXt4F9jwlCK8dvu0Q/sO3JpfdoKG7rVeqxhAjLvNB/gop+BJwJDOvdbTSluDhtLZ8aUXVgTbCGKHQ3q1LZYHJ9Kw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/474
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/474
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3201-3250/ab_3201_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3201-3250/ab_3201_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ob4rwfRzKCnTqTt1T/9KhQdTVP5ZPeDMC1RnyA0odEtKxg9ITws3qqM/Ly+kCPGOMOuNRSxpc79CTn9Cbv2G51r7+caOe1qII86v1EZxXr8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/329
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3201-3250/ab_3219_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3201-3250/ab_3219_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3201-3250/ab_3219_98_A_bill.pdf
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AB 3238 Garcia, D 
 

California 
Environmental 
Quality Act: 
electrical 
infrastructure 
projects. 

07/08/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/12/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) requires a lead agency to prepare a mitigated 
negative declaration for a project that may have a significant effect on the environment if revisions 
in the project would avoid or mitigate that effect and there is no substantial evidence that the 
project, as revised, would have a significant effect on the environment. The CEQA exempts certain 
projects from its requirements, including actions necessary to prevent or mitigate an emergency. 
Current law prohibits an electrical corporation from beginning the construction of a line, plant, or 
system, or extensions of those facilities without first having to obtain from the Public Utilities 
Commission a certificate that the present or future convenience and necessity require or will 
require the construction. Current law specifies that the certificate is not required for the extension, 
expansion, upgrade, or other modification of existing electrical transmission facilities. This bill 
would, for electrical infrastructure projects, as defined, designate the commission as the lead 
agency for purposes of the CEQA, would require the commission to prescribe procedures for the 
preparation of the appropriate environmental review document for those projects, and would 
specify the manner in which the environmental review for those projects is to be conducted. The 
bill would repeal these provisions on January 1, 2035.   (Based on  07/08/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

AB 3246 Garcia, D 
 

Electricity: 
permit to 
construct: 
advanced 
reconductoring: 
exemption. 

06/06/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/5/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law vests the Public Utilities Commission with regulatory jurisdiction over public utilities, 
including electrical corporations. The commission, through a general order, prohibits an electrical 
corporation from beginning construction in this state of any electrical line facilities or substations 
meeting certain requirements without the commission having first authorized the construction of 
those facilities by issuing a permit to construct. This bill would require the commission, on or 
before January 1, 2026, to update the above-described general order to provide an exemption that 
would instead authorize an electrical corporation to seek the commission’s approval of advanced 
reconductoring, as defined, of its existing electrical transmission facilities through the 
commission’s informal advice letter process, as specified.   (Based on  06/06/2024 text) 

AB 
3246_SJCE_LO
S.pdf 

Support 

ABX1 2 Fong, Vince, 
R 
 

Motor Vehicle 
Fuel Tax Law: 
suspension of 
tax. 

12/05/2022 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
PRINT on 
12/5/2022) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would suspend the imposition of the tax on motor vehicle fuels for one year. The bill would require 
that all savings realized based on the suspension of the motor vehicle fuels tax by a person other 
than an end consumer, as defined, be passed on to the end consumer, and would make the 
violation of this requirement an unfair business practice, in violation of unfair competition laws, as 
provided. The bill would require a seller of motor vehicle fuels to provide a receipt to a purchaser 
that indicates the amount of tax that would have otherwise applied to the transaction.    (Based 
on  12/05/2022 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=tWAvdz+1z1qM/pLBV7f1Kx1TX4jo5bYK+8W249YunfEkVkM6iU8KO5FaoqwS7WMiAnB972CI4Obqqx4WscJfB2ZSQRSIEoWZ5FrUDst+oBg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/440
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3201-3250/ab_3238_93_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3201-3250/ab_3238_93_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3201-3250/ab_3238_93_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=57Gqxkk2L8alxNyvncerluuw2mejJGhs9ViB9qHENqNTOQmzM6EidS8gm9q+2VZEuSegtCLj7O219hk2+MK7OLokcgSymGmlbzLx41i3Azs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/440
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3201-3250/ab_3246_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3201-3250/ab_3246_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_3201-3250/ab_3246_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=584E4357-647B-4106-94A5-F6796EAE9861
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=584E4357-647B-4106-94A5-F6796EAE9861
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=584E4357-647B-4106-94A5-F6796EAE9861
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=4Eoe9e1M1Nt+gbfgjWeXIJEB0TAxdtbnsS6T9JCUB/MJ1kU21cJFZuvJqZru1RtuBUSjfWJ4Ir9ivDBLHNp3bf6lJO2ElI9kGyK2/6VJG5I=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/315
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/315
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/abx1_2_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/abx1_2_99_I_bill.pdf
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ACA 1 Aguiar-Curry, 
D 
 

Local 
government 
financing: 
affordable 
housing and 
public 
infrastructure: 
voter approval. 

09/20/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/20/2023 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Res. 
Chapter 
173, 
Statutes of 
2023. 

09/20/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The California Constitution prohibits the ad valorem tax rate on real property from exceeding 1% of 
the full cash value of the property, subject to certain exceptions. This measure would create an 
additional exception to the 1% limit that would authorize a city, county, city and county, or special 
district to levy an ad valorem tax to service bonded indebtedness incurred to fund the construction, 
reconstruction, rehabilitation, or replacement of public infrastructure, affordable housing, including 
downpayment assistance, or permanent supportive housing, or the acquisition or lease of real 
property for those purposes, if the proposition proposing that tax is approved by 55% of the voters 
of the city, county, city and county, or special district, as applicable, and the proposition includes 
specified accountability requirements. The measure would prohibit a city, county, city and county, 
or special district from placing a proposition on the ballot pursuant to these provisions if the voters 
have previously approved a proposition pursuant to these provisions or the below special tax 
provisions until all funds from the previous proposition are committed to programs and projects 
listed in the specific local program or ordinance, as described. The measure, subject to certain 
vote thresholds, would authorize the Legislature to enact laws establishing additional 
accountability measures and laws for the downpayment assistance programs authorized by the 
measure, as specified.   (Based on  09/20/2023 text) 

ACA 1 
SUPPORT 
30June23 
ACA 1 
SUPPORT 
30Aug23 
ACA 1 - CASQA 
Amendment 
Support 
09.05.23.pdf 

Support 

ACA 2 Alanis, R 
 

Water 
Resiliency Act 
of 2024. 

03/06/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
W.,P. & W. 
on 
4/20/2023) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The California Constitution declares that the general welfare requires that the water resources of 
the state be put to beneficial use to the fullest extent of which they are capable, and that the right 
to the use of water does not extend to the waste or unreasonable use, method of use, or method 
of diversion of water. This measure would require the Treasurer to annually transfer an amount 
equal to 1.5% of all state revenues from the General Fund to the California Water Resiliency Trust 
Fund, which the measure would create. The measure would continuously appropriate moneys in 
the fund to the California Water Commission for its actual costs of implementing these provisions 
and for specified water infrastructure projects.   (Based on  03/06/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

ACA 3 Lee, D 
 

Wealth tax: 
appropriation 
limits. 

01/19/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
REV. & TAX 
on 
3/30/2023) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would authorize the Legislature to impose a tax upon all forms of personal property or wealth, 
whether tangible or intangible, and would require any tax so imposed to be administered and 
collected by the Franchise Tax Board and the Department of Justice, as determined by the 
Legislature in statute. The measure would authorize the Legislature to classify any form of 
personal property or wealth for differential taxation or for exemption by a majority vote.    (Based 
on  01/19/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=oZCzExgAJpmDD5JJXeaVGOj6KhYM6uxEVpRZB+dW+fI9rCwRayj5faf+2yJ2xQF9L+wV1DzE5nZJK0gXDmqMPlLM+YAPOxQDRXRQyX/NKGI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/430
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/430
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/aca_1_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/aca_1_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=41735749-489F-4A46-B22C-8DF49F395551
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=41735749-489F-4A46-B22C-8DF49F395551
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=41735749-489F-4A46-B22C-8DF49F395551
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=0DAF82F7-4902-49A2-A639-CC4A212A312A
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=0DAF82F7-4902-49A2-A639-CC4A212A312A
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=0DAF82F7-4902-49A2-A639-CC4A212A312A
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=117875E6-B9FB-46E3-8410-1EEEFFBFEC56
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=117875E6-B9FB-46E3-8410-1EEEFFBFEC56
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=117875E6-B9FB-46E3-8410-1EEEFFBFEC56
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=117875E6-B9FB-46E3-8410-1EEEFFBFEC56
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=1m4E3Q7gM3gq6sIn/kCRCsFHhRliUG5RJDrKUzWsKJD9Xw1RxeWjHBdn95aAFnuo0/tNUmH1l2m0TJQkxJmL78WV2bVsjUmmxb2rqnlvALg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/363
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/aca_2_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/aca_2_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/aca_2_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=tA7HGZCh4d46/8+6KXp4KaOSFvO3L7T9tWydHRZthtkkKVkn3TaM4EDlh6m2kjVJ/gjX6b9N5svAgqAqAA3975OVM7RnMYH/zy1pG1JUMk8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/308
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/aca_3_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/aca_3_99_I_bill.pdf
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ACA 7 Jackson, D 
 

Government 
preferences: 
programs: 
exceptions. 

07/03/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
JUD. on 
6/19/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The California Constitution, pursuant to provisions enacted by the initiative Proposition 209 in 
1996, prohibits the state from discriminating against, or granting preferential treatment to, any 
individual or group on the basis of race, sex, color, ethnicity, or national origin in the operation of 
public employment, public education, or public contracting. The California Constitution defines the 
state for these purposes to include the state, any city, county, public university system, community 
college district, school district, special district, or any other political subdivision or governmental 
instrumentality of, or within, the state. This measure would instead prohibit the state from harmfully 
discriminating against, or granting preferential treatment to, any individual or group on the basis of 
race, sex, color, ethnicity, or national origin in the operation of public employment or public 
education, except as provided. The measure would provide that, except as specified, a state 
agency or a local agency may use state moneys to fund research-based or research-informed and 
culturally specific programs in any industry if certain conditions are satisfied, including that those 
programs are established or otherwise implemented by the state for purposes of eliminating legal 
barriers to the creation of equality and equitable outcomes for all residents of the state in a 
specified manner.   (Based on  07/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

ACA 10 Aguiar-Curry, 
D 
 

Local 
government 
financing: 
affordable 
housing and 
public 
infrastructure: 
voter approval. 

06/27/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

06/27/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
134, 
Statutes of 
2024 

06/27/2024 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Assembly Constitutional Amendment No. 1 of the 2023–24 Regular Session (ACA 1) would, if 
adopted by the people, amend Section 4 of Article XIIIA, Section 2 of Article XIIIC, and Section 3 
of Article XIIID of, and would add Section 2.5 of Article XIIIC to, the California Constitution, relative 
to local finance. Under these provisions, ACA 1 would condition the imposition, extension, or 
increase of a sales and use tax or transactions and use tax imposed in accordance with specified 
law or a parcel tax by a local government for the purposes of funding the construction, 
reconstruction, rehabilitation, or replacement of public infrastructure, affordable housing, including 
downpayment assistance, or permanent supportive housing, or the acquisition or lease of real 
property for those purposes, on the proposition proposing that tax being approved by a majority 
vote of the membership of the governing board of the local government and by 55% of its voters 
voting on the proposition and the proposition includes specified accountability requirements. ACA 
1 would also make conforming changes. This measure would remove the above-described 
provisions of ACA 1 relating to special taxes and make conforming changes in other provisions of 
ACA 1.   (Based on  06/27/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

ACA 12 Dixon, R 
 

Controlled 
substances. 

06/05/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
PRINT on 
6/5/2023) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law makes it a crime to possess for sale or purchase for purpose of sale, transport, import, 
sell, furnish, administer, give away, manufacture, compound, convert, produce, derive, process, or 
prepare various controlled substances, including, among others, fentanyl, peyote, and various 
other opiates and narcotics. This measure would require a criminal court to advise a person who is 
convicted of, or who pleads guilty or no contest to, the above-described crimes, as specified, of the 
danger of selling or administering illicit drugs and counterfeit pills and that, if a person dies as a 
result of that action, the defendant can be charged with homicide. The measure would require the 
court to read the advisory statement in a case in which the defendant exchanged a controlled 
substance containing fentanyl or its analogs for anything else of value, as specified. The measure 
would require the advisory statement to be included in a plea form, if used, and specified on the 
record. The measure would require that the fact the advisory was given be recorded in the abstract 
of conviction and would prohibit the advisement from being used as evidence in the prosecution of 
a minor in juvenile court.   (Based on  06/05/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=eDRSqTt9L4DmuelO4FpUNvt/yb4nkynvWHseTkFcSvppIsGn5loNXjmYdFTttOqyEeJHpycbk+tAcwzfw1tJSRDbwItVgg5pDyzdZwHyUl4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/379
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/aca_7_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/aca_7_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/aca_7_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=bZu1vuYqexxR2wZ2SvYi6mmpt78aUfOBilUp7j30G8HKisg5Gm+xsmgpqD9XuShP4gn3CMCiTznnQMwTelVEY0Gb5ALGefqxkoFrHtohpzQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/430
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/430
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/aca_10_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/aca_10_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=6srOdwn80IDYQBUYxoNTpA2nd1OAvkH9zwNZqTEul4aMePKyLWdVxECkBoGd+cZFcEywH5JxVbegX8RW4azq1jd4MSPOlna/ufIHzL9dIB4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/386
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/aca_12_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/aca_12_99_I_bill.pdf


Attachment B: Intergovernmental Relations Priority State Legislation Log 
 

Last Updated 12/06/24        140 
 

Measure Author Topic Current 
Text 

Status Location Brief Summary Attachments Position 

ACA 13 Ward, D 
 

Voting 
thresholds. 

11/02/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

11/02/2023 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State- 
Chapter 
176, 
Statutes of 
2023 

11/02/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

The California Constitution provides that a proposed constitutional amendment and a statewide 
initiative measure each take effect only if approved by a majority of the votes cast on the 
amendment or measure. This measure would further provide that an initiative measure that 
includes one or more provisions that would amend the Constitution to increase the voter approval 
requirement to adopt any state or local measure would be approved by the voters only if the 
proportion of votes cast in favor of the initiative measure is equal to or greater than the highest 
voter approval requirement that the initiative measure would impose. The measure would specify 
that this voter approval requirement would apply to statewide initiative measures that appear on 
the ballot on or after January 1, 2024.   (Based on  11/02/2023 text) 

ACA 13 Support 
BCM 30Aug23 

Monitor 

ACA 18 Wallis, R 
 

Road usage 
charges: vote 
and voter 
approval 
requirements. 

02/16/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
PRINT on 
2/16/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The California Constitution requires any change in state statute that increases the tax liability of 
any taxpayer to be imposed by an act passed by 2/3 of the membership of each house of the 
Legislature, and prohibits specified taxes on real property from being so imposed. For these 
purposes, the California Constitution defines a “tax” as any state levy, charge, or exaction, except 
as described in certain exceptions. The California Constitution describes one of those exceptions 
as a charge imposed for entrance to or use of state property, or the purchase, rental, or lease of 
state property, except charges governed by a specified provision of the California Constitution. 
This measure, on or after its effective date, would provide that the exception described above does 
not include a road usage charge, as described, thereby requiring the imposition of this type of 
charge to be subject to the 2/3 vote requirement.    (Based on  02/16/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

ACR 16 Fong, Mike, D 
 

Needs of 
opportunity 
youth. 

08/22/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

08/22/2023 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Res. 
Chapter 
130, 
Statutes of 
2023. 

08/22/2023 - 
Assembly  CH
APTERED 

Would declare that the Legislature recognizes the importance of creating pathways to success for 
California’s opportunity youth and the need to develop a statewide comprehensive plan that will 
reduce persistent economic inequities endured by California’s opportunity youth.    (Based 
on  08/22/2023 text) 

ACR 16 Support 
3April23 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=wW/ZUBuldIcmmvsJ5M48zmdWVm2NCkTBjShfiCThM9CMuOvWVn8GMUuSFQv8xBb+Z2UBbCvub53lHrEVn848BF82ptHQa/L4Re2cPQiEdbU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/328
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/aca_13_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/aca_13_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=B4595919-C05D-4222-994A-3E710B9477F0
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=B4595919-C05D-4222-994A-3E710B9477F0
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=FtNaIdSwBMVpRibtIS8GTzRo/sjaw1RoZXGeBljebVgY5BzreHwRAeJk8drQvO8xO4SndkGPeVsv0nOvaxFSKPe8iFykdsj+gR14WVubbNc=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/372
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/aca_18_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/aca_18_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=76zbkVO9fbbfBqLyiVnF3rfC5zF1hJUfhuXrFJ5rAQbbmmWqPFai5QTXMuiuIK7sXPBLNGi4NOLV62RhH5WfOH50T9pA5N9l5RPFrPhcLOw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/501
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/acr_16_97_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//asm/ab_0001-0050/acr_16_97_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=18683C2C-3F2B-403D-A99A-13112DDDDBE8
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=18683C2C-3F2B-403D-A99A-13112DDDDBE8
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SB 2 Portantino, D 
 

Firearms. 09/26/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/26/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
249, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

09/26/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law prohibits a person from carrying a concealed firearm or carrying a loaded firearm in 
public. Current law authorizes a licensing authority, as specified, if good cause exists for the 
issuance, and subject to certain other criteria including, among other things, the applicant is of 
good moral character and has completed a specified course of training, to issue a license to carry 
a concealed handgun or to carry a loaded and exposed handgun, as specified. Under current law, 
the required course of training for an applicant is no more than 16 hours and covers firearm safety 
and laws regarding the permissible use of a firearm. This bill would require the licensing authority 
to issue or renew a license if the applicant is not a disqualified person for the license and the 
applicant is at least 21 years of age. The bill would remove the good character and good cause 
requirements from the issuance criteria. Under the bill, the applicant would be a disqualified 
person if they, among other things, are reasonably likely to be a danger to self, others, or the 
community at large, as specified. This bill would add the requirement that the applicant be the 
recorded owner, with the Department of Justice, of the pistol, revolver, or other firearm capable of 
being concealed upon the person. This bill would change the training requirement to be no less 
than 16 hours in length and would add additional subjects to the course including, among other 
things, the safe storage and legal transportation of firearms. The bill would require an issuing 
authority, prior to that issuance, renewal, or amendment to a license, if it has direct access to the 
designated department system to determine if the applicant is the recorded owner of the pistol, 
revolver, or other firearm.    (Based on  09/26/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 4 Wiener, D 
 

Planning and 
zoning: housing 
development: 
higher 
education 
institutions and 
religious 
institutions. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
771, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law, the Zenovich-Moscone-Chacon Housing and Home Finance Act, establishes the 
California Tax Credit Allocation Committee within the Department of Housing and Community 
Development. Current law requires the committee to allocate state low-income housing tax credits 
in conformity with state and federal law that establishes a maximum rent that may be charged to a 
tenant for a project unit constructed using low-income housing tax credits. The bill would define 
various terms for these purposes. Among other things, the bill would require that 100% of the 
units, exclusive of manager units, in a housing development project eligible for approval as a use 
by right under these provisions be affordable to lower income households, except that 20% of the 
units may be for moderate-income households, and 5% of the units may be for staff of the 
independent institution of higher education or the religious institution that owns the land, provided 
that the units affordable to lower income households are offered at affordable rent, as set in an 
amount consistent with the rent limits established by the California Tax Credit Allocation 
Committee, or affordable housing cost, as specified. The bill would authorize the development to 
include ancillary uses on the ground floor of the development, as specified.    (Based 
on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 5 Nguyen, R 
 

Motor Vehicle 
Fuel Tax Law: 
limitation on 
adjustment. 

12/05/2022 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

02/01/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The Motor Vehicle Fuel Tax Law, administered by the California Department of Tax and Fee 
Administration, imposes a tax upon each gallon of motor vehicle fuel removed from a refinery or 
terminal rack in this state, entered into this state, or sold in this state, at a specified rate per gallon. 
Current law requires the department to annually adjust the tax imposed by increasing the rates 
based on the California Consumer Price Index, as specified. This bill would limit the above-
described annual adjustment to a maximum of 2% for rate adjustments made on or after July 1, 
2023. This bill contains other related provisions.   (Based on  12/05/2022 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=xhDGxNE9xIdDnIPfqr9WLhnX0cBIOg1eK/jltvPh2lI6POilcTd0Jvoagf/4Zv4dxxRZ5PYSeLg3oQbHtel9wtcKhZ15C27/F1OSKyGQ5TY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/262
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_2_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_2_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=fkTHVzYVzgofo95qlyfjnDGHTV0fIvT6WgXRxaJDfeXfgc+moY19rVdj+u9WUZe2T4BIgfegeTEkBhZD1/abXbYJOzAxB8+rAuKoh20dt/I=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/257
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_4_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_4_91_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Filc8+zML2NpJ0xpsE7Hfazu+Z7VEqBED2ZE9PAYysIzp6b1qUM8TGVwY7kinwYOy07yMn7RIKhsdyk5t4SyTImDZxjwwiGZ9VU3/q2qGoQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/428
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_5_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_5_99_I_bill.pdf
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SB 7 Blakespear, D 
 

Regional 
housing need: 
determination. 

09/19/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/19/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
283, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/19/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The Planning and Zoning Law requires, for the 4th and subsequent revisions of the housing 
element, the Department of Housing and Community Development (department) to determine the 
existing and projected need for housing for each region, as specified. That law requires the 
department, in consultation with the council of governments, to determine the existing and 
projected need of housing for each region in a specified manner. That law requires the 
department’s determination to be based upon population projections produced by the Department 
of Finance, as specified. That law also requires the department to meet and consult with the 
council of governments regarding the assumptions and methodologies to be used to determine 
each region’s housing need and requires the council of governments to provide data assumptions 
from the council of governments’ projections, as specified. That law authorizes the department to 
accept or reject the information provided by the council of governments and, after consultation with 
each council of governments, to make determinations on the council of governments’ data 
assumptions and the methodology the department will use to determine each region’s housing 
need. That law requires the department to provide its determinations to each council of 
governments, as specified. That law, upon making that determination, authorizes the council of 
governments to object to the determination. This bill, for regions in which the department is 
required to distribute the regional housing need, would prohibit a city or county from filing an 
objection to the regional housing need determination.   (Based on  09/19/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 8 Blakespear, D 
 

Firearms 
liability 
insurance. 

03/23/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would, commencing on January 1, 2025, require a person who owns a firearm to obtain and 
continuously maintain in full force and effect a homeowner’s, renter’s, or gun liability insurance 
policy specifically covering losses or damages resulting from any negligent or accidental use of 
that firearm, including, but not limited to, death, injury, or property damage. This bill would require 
a person to keep written evidence of coverage in the place where a firearm is stored.    (Based 
on  03/23/2023 text) 

SB 8 
SUPPORT_17Ap
ril23 

Sponsor 

SB 10 Cortese, D 
 

Pupil health: 
opioid 
overdose 
prevention and 
treatment: 
Melanie’s Law. 

10/13/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/13/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
856, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/13/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law authorizes a public or private elementary or secondary school to determine whether or 
not to make emergency naloxone hydrochloride or another opioid antagonist and trained 
personnel available at its school, and to designate one or more volunteers to receive related 
training to address an opioid overdose, as specified. This bill would state the Legislature's 
encouragement of county offices of education to establish a County Working Group on Fentanyl 
Education in Schools, as provided, for the purposes of outreach, building awareness, and 
collaborating with local health agencies regarding fentanyl overdoses. The bill would require the 
State Department of Education to curate and maintain on its internet website, among other things, 
informational materials containing awareness and safety advice, for school staff, pupils, and 
parents or guardians of pupils, on how to prevent an opioid overdose. This bill contains other 
related provisions and other existing laws.   (Based on  10/13/2023 text) 

Support  Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=pfouyxu3921YOLxCxPNeDFNAvc1D8AAJQyJW+VFpy6o1CJmc0jEm7WSlR4AtuYb0idFjnky5XhpVpXPVh/31mwtPJog4pCjPiO2YB1vldVU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/342
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_7_89_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_7_89_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=vwjpfhF+imyYq2O4a+MwvuRSbcvInTjduIAeo33+atIuDtzEASbiUsUBgKErhKCqeR9qjyaod1GbrDyo4Y/I6BdVSKWvcFVeKc6e6ES60OY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/342
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_8_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_8_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_8_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=5D694424-A53C-4E8A-AEF7-289F1F4D608A
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=5D694424-A53C-4E8A-AEF7-289F1F4D608A
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=5D694424-A53C-4E8A-AEF7-289F1F4D608A
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=9wWHhvncieUY9sUF4SN8pQbjBOiXtLjZ10ivZsIJxNL7k/ub/xNMEoijFyd+ONx06+lT4KUrtoO3Ad86Jx4wx21JBMp3BwPa8s3H2nTgNPU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/393
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_10_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_10_91_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=02FA184C-D4C0-464A-9699-BEF6FD5EAC1D
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SB 12 Stern, D 
 

California 
Global 
Warming 
Solutions Act of 
2006: 
emissions limit. 

12/05/2022 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Under the California Global Warming Solutions Act of 2006, the State Air Resources Board is 
required to approve a statewide greenhouse gas emissions limit equivalent to the statewide 
greenhouse gas emissions level in 1990 to be achieved by 2020 and to ensure that statewide 
greenhouse gas emissions are reduced to at least 40% below the 1990 level by no later than 
December 31, 2030. Under the act, a violation of a rule, regulation, order, emission limitation, 
emission reduction measure, or other measure adopted by the state board under the act is a 
crime. This bill instead would require the state board to ensure that statewide greenhouse gas 
emissions are reduced to at least 55% below the 1990 level by no later than December 31, 
2030.    (Based on  12/05/2022 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 13 Ochoa Bogh, 
R 
 

Controlled 
substances. 

12/05/2022 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law makes it a crime to possess for sale or purchase for purpose of sale, transport, sell, 
furnish, administer, give away, manufacture, compound, convert, produce, derive, process, or 
prepare various controlled substances, including, among others, fentanyl, peyote, and various 
other opiates and narcotics. This bill would require a person who is convicted of, or who pleads 
guilty or no contest to, the above crimes to receive a written advisory of the danger of 
manufacturing or distribution of controlled substances and that, if a person dies as a result of that 
action, the manufacturer or distributor can be charged with voluntary manslaughter or murder. The 
bill would require that the fact the advisory was given be on the record and recorded on the 
abstract of conviction.   (Based on  12/05/2022 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 14 Grove, R 
 

Serious 
felonies: 
human 
trafficking. 

09/25/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/25/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
230, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

09/25/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law defines the term "serious felony" for various purposes, including, among others, 
enhancing the punishment for felonies pursuant to existing sentencing provisions commonly 
known as the Three Strikes Law. This bill would include human trafficking of a minor within the 
definition of a serious felony for all purposes, including for purposes of the Three Strikes Law, 
except as specified. By expanding the scope of an enhancement, this bill would impose a state-
mandated local program.    (Based on  09/25/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 17 Caballero, D 
 

Senior housing: 
tax credits. 

10/07/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

01/25/2024 - 
Stricken 
from file. 
Veto 
sustained.  

10/07/2023 - 
Senate  VETO
ED 

Current law, enacted to implement a specified low-income housing tax credit established by 
federal law, requires the California Tax Credit Allocation Committee to annually determine and 
allocate the state ceiling in accordance with those provisions and in conformity with federal law. 
Current law authorizes the committee to adopt, amend, or repeal rules and regulations for the 
allocation of housing credits. Current law requires that specified amounts of the low-income 
housing tax credits be set aside for allocation to rural areas, small developments, and farmworker 
housing, as specified. This bill would require the committee to revise its regulations to increase the 
housing type goal for senior developments to 20 percent.   (Based on  09/15/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=PdRgOy81wautMYXD4BO2KuWuNhh45ymYLWTpah6HrTm4tuMNq0nIc9slKCeeYJubj0+xLBQRb9ztnR63G1fWTlj18A9we0ESs0Is2dYDsJU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/263
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_12_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_12_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=7B/WEMKlCL7i9R1QI+4WFIoOc+qJgvRgJAWrXPLC/DPcmTe/v6hPlJbqdkCU8MPouvFsUot1zs+5LsucfokOubkcmCCHaXph6zV4ej8Syo4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/415
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/415
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_13_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_13_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=NOq3/p17cIQS0ENjGV1nRqXsVU+QUQdJk/ytWW8ZkSrIz6f9SitfnDXePOkBsrelYK6dB/yPYtRAVduz4nFp9aFf/TPAqLwBCayxGuBx7aA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/334
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_14_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_14_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ez68/IqxeVCbfZfiqPK7oGV6xE7n2tWiQnrRVtWsD9UiYcmr3BqVcBOj/emjJwUwOvDV9YU+IBySG9aiIql1mIRE+S62Q0Tw6IVNcLRsQ7s=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/403
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_17_96_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_17_96_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_17_96_E_bill.pdf
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SB 19 Seyarto, R 
 

Fentanyl 
Misuse and 
Overdose 
Prevention 
Task Force. 

10/13/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/13/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
857, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/13/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Would, upon appropriation by the Legislature, establish the Fentanyl Misuse and Overdose 
Prevention Task Force to undertake various duties relating to fentanyl misuse including, among 
others, collecting and organizing data on the nature and extent of fentanyl misuse in California and 
evaluating approaches to increase public awareness of fentanyl misuse. The bill would require the 
task force to be co-chaired by the Attorney General and the State Public Health Officer or their 
designees, and would specify the membership of the task force. The bill would require the first 
meeting of the task force to take place no later than June 1, 2024, and would require the task force 
to meet at least once every 2 months. The bill would require the task force to submit an interim 
report on its findings and recommendations to the Attorney General, the Governor, and the 
Legislature by July 1, 2025, and submit a final report by December 1, 2025. The bill would repeal 
these provisions on January 1, 2026.    (Based on  10/13/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 20 Rubio, D 
 

Joint powers 
agreements: 
regional 
housing trusts. 

09/01/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/01/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
147, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

08/22/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The Joint Exercise of Powers Act specifically authorizes the creation of the Orange County 
Housing Finance Trust and the San Gabriel Valley Regional Housing Trust, both joint powers 
authorities, for the purpose of funding housing to assist the homeless population and persons and 
families of extremely low, very low, and low income within their respective regions, as specified. 
This bill would authorize 2 or more local agencies, as defined, to create a regional housing trust for 
the purpose of funding housing to assist the homeless population and persons and families of 
extremely low, very low, and low income within their jurisdictions by entering into a joint powers 
agreement pursuant to the Joint Exercise of Powers Act. The bill would also authorize a federally 
recognized tribal government to enter into the joint powers agreement. The bill would require a 
regional housing trust created pursuant to these provisions to be governed by a board of directors 
consisting of a minimum of 5 directors, as specified. The bill would authorize a regional housing 
trust to fund the planning, construction, and acquisition of housing, receive public and private 
financing and funds, and authorize and issue bonds, as specified. The bill would require the joint 
powers agreement establishing the regional housing trust to incorporate specified annual financial 
reporting and auditing requirements.   (Based on  09/01/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 30 Umberg, D 
 

Transportation: 
zero-emission 
vehicle 
signage. 

06/19/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/23/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would require the Department of Transportation, in coordination with the Governor’s Office of 
Business and Economic Development (GO-Biz) and the State Energy Resources Conservation 
and Development Commission, to develop and design light-duty zero-emission vehicle charging 
and fueling station signage to be placed along state highways based on charger or fueling type 
and vehicle compatibility, in order to increase consumer confidence in locating electric vehicle 
chargers and hydrogen fueling stations. The bill would authorize the department to adopt rules and 
regulations for these purposes.   (Based on  06/19/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Yzufu/hRsw1v3JntGtWGVkR2Uz+zBP0xrlbL9bhIE685He24KA6Q3uT2OXAw51l71Ivki5UjZTXCV7i4NYslciDE4VTazEzljm+asZ5lSMQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/476
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_19_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_19_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Z1F1CZPf3soRCKWwJdja8cA+2rqBx3fIU9bLXCEGp73FP3XAlHYdFhCU/PXrHKoTWC1g02PfTId3QIdYvUvXfB1FlLj/5W8mLMEY2AFq5KA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/340
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_20_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_20_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Zxj8t1ue9NqQEIfapqlPquM2m/+lQ0UYEKixIqn57+oJ/LGPQejOsRqnqflVBClwIvGWGVzaUWYFu4l1wB+UIYFhzWQLy4N2a8TGZsH0vks=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/427
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_30_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_30_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_30_97_A_bill.pdf
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SB 31 Jones, R 
 

Encampments: 
sensitive areas: 
penalties. 

03/22/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would prohibit a person from sitting, lying, sleeping, or storing, using, maintaining, or placing 
personal property upon any street, sidewalk, or other public right-of-way within 1000 feet of a 
sensitive area, as defined. The bill would specify that a violation of this prohibition is a public 
nuisance that can be abated and prevented, as provided. The bill would also provide that a 
violation of the prohibition may be charged as a misdemeanor or an infraction, at the discretion of 
the prosecutor. The bill would prohibit a person from being found in violation of the bill’s provisions 
unless provided notice, at least 72 hours before commencement of any enforcement action, as 
provided. By imposing criminal penalties for a violation of these provisions, this bill would impose a 
state-mandated local program.   (Based on  03/22/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 32 Jones, R 
 

Motor vehicle 
fuel tax: 
greenhouse 
gas reduction 
programs: 
suspension. 

12/05/2022 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

02/01/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The California Global Warming Solutions Act of 2006 requires the state board to adopt rules and 
regulations to achieve the maximum technologically feasible and cost-effective greenhouse gas 
emissions reductions to ensure that the statewide greenhouse gas emissions are reduced to at 
least 40% below the statewide greenhouse gas emissions limit, as defined, no later than 
December 31, 2030. Pursuant to the act, the State Air Resources Board has adopted the Low 
Carbon Fuel Standard regulations. The act authorizes the state board to include in its regulation of 
those emissions the use of market-based compliance mechanisms. Current law requires all 
moneys, except for fines and penalties, collected by the state board from the auction or sale of 
allowances as part of a market-based compliance mechanism to be deposited in the Greenhouse 
Gas Reduction Fund. This bill would suspend the Low Carbon Fuel Standard regulations for one 
year. The bill would also exempt suppliers of transportation fuels from regulations for the use of 
market-based compliance mechanisms for one year.    (Based on  12/05/2022 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 37 Caballero, D 
 

Older Adults 
and Adults with 
Disabilities 
Housing 
Stability Act. 

09/25/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/25/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
the 
Governor. In 
Senate. 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto 
pending.  

09/25/2024 - 
Senate  VETO
ED 

Current law establishes various programs to address homelessness, including requiring the 
Governor to create an Interagency Council on Homelessness and establishing the Homeless 
Emergency Aid program for the purpose of providing localities with one-time grant funds to 
address their immediate homelessness challenges, as specified. Current law commits to the 
Department of Housing and Community Development the administration of various housing 
assistance programs, including provisions relating to residential hotel rehabilitation and tasks the 
department, in consultation with each council of governments, with the determination of each 
region’s existing and projected housing need. This bill would, upon an appropriation by the 
Legislature for this express purpose, require the Department of Housing and Community 
Development, commencing January 1, 2025, to begin developing the Older Adults and Adults with 
Disabilities Housing Stability Pilot Program.   (Based on  08/28/2024 text) 

SB 37 
SUPPORT_20M
arch23 

Support 

SB 43 Eggman, D 
 

Behavioral 
health. 

10/10/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/10/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
637, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/10/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The Lanterman-Petris-Short Act provides for the involuntary commitment and treatment of a 
person who is a danger to themselves or others or who is gravely disabled. Current law, for 
purposes of involuntary commitment, defines “gravely disabled” as either a condition in which a 
person, as a result of a mental health disorder, is unable to provide for their basic personal needs 
for food, clothing, or shelter or has been found mentally incompetent, as specified. This bill 
expands the definition of “gravely disabled” to also include a condition in which a person, as a 
result of a severe substance use disorder, or a co-occurring mental health disorder and a severe 
substance use disorder, is, in addition to the basic personal needs described above, unable to 
provide for their personal safety or necessary medical care, as defined.   (Based on  10/10/2023 
text) 

BCM Support SB 
43_ 28Feb23 

Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=tNxYFTD4opXfL3M9JxoJojzbxJhulLUBIV0IHeQiS64tUJl5F+h0WEXd5za1ift3HJ2NwBCUM/qroHYThnPRALpir72hj4aonCQYjrS5JdE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/404
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_31_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_31_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_31_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=t3rReQNNShN6t691PZBS/wXaIiSdWSYJQIba+c2ftKa+BMsx+pvyWc3t9UR6rred0RLARAXu6WM4Dno61Iuoq31Vl4C4IBGm2prTjRGasqY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/404
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https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/403
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sb_37_95_E_bill.htm
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SB 44 Umberg, D 
 

Controlled 
substances. 

04/13/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

01/12/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(1). 
(Last 
location was 
PUB. S. on 
04/13/2023) 

01/12/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law makes it a crime to possess for sale or purchase for purpose of sale, transport, import, 
sell, furnish, administer, give away, manufacture, compound, convert, produce, derive, process, or 
prepare various controlled substances, including, among others, fentanyl, peyote, and various 
other opiates and narcotics. This bill, Alexandra’s Law, would require the court to advise a person 
who is convicted of, or who pleads guilty or no contest to, the above crimes, as specified, of the 
danger of selling or administering illicit drugs and counterfeit pills and that, if a person dies as a 
result of that action, the defendant can be charged with homicide. The bill would require the court 
to read the advisory statement in a case in which the defendant exchanged a controlled substance 
containing fentanyl or its analogs for anything else of value, as specified. The bill would require the 
advisory statement to be included in a plea form, if used, and specified on the record.    (Based 
on  04/13/2023 text) 

SB 
44_SUPPORT 
BCM 22March23 

Support 

SB 48 Becker, D 
 

Building Energy 
Savings Act. 

10/07/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/07/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
378, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/07/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law requires each utility to maintain records of the energy usage data of all buildings to 
which they provide service for at least the most recent 12 complete calendar months, and to 
deliver or otherwise provide that aggregated energy usage data for each covered building, as 
defined, to the owner, as specified. Current law requires the State Energy Resources 
Conservation and Development Commission (Energy Commission) to adopt regulations providing 
for the delivery to the Energy Commission and public disclosure of benchmarking of energy use for 
covered buildings, and specifies that this requirement does not require the owner of a building with 
16 or fewer residential utility accounts to collect or deliver energy usage information to the Energy 
Commission. This bill would additionally specify that the requirement does not require the owner of 
a building with less than 50,000 square feet of gross floor space to collect or deliver energy usage 
information to the Energy Commission.   (Based on  10/07/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 49 Becker, D 
 

Renewable 
energy: 
Department of 
Transportation: 
evaluation. 

10/07/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/07/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
379, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/07/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law authorizes the Department of Transportation to lease, for up to 99 years, areas above 
or below state highways to public or private entities, as specified. Current law also authorizes the 
department to issue certain permits for a state highway’s right-of-way necessary for telegraph, 
telephone, or electrical lines or of any ditches, pipes, drains, sewers, or underground structures, 
unless otherwise specifically provided in the instrument conveying title. This bill would require the 
department, in coordination with the State Energy Resources Conservation and Development 
Commission and the Public Utilities Commission, to evaluate the issues and policies impeding the 
development of land within department-owned rights-of-way for renewable energy generation 
facilities, energy storage facilities, and electrical transmission and distribution facilities, as 
specified. The bill would require the evaluation to, among other things, consider the department 
owning the facilities, or leasing, granting easements, or entering into joint-use agreements with 
public utilities or other entities for this purpose.   (Based on  10/07/2023 text) 
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SB 50 Bradford, D 
 

Vehicles: 
enforcement. 

09/07/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
INACTIVE 
FILE on 
9/14/2023) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current case law deems a temporary detention of a person during an automobile stop by the 
police, even if only for a brief period and for a limited purpose, a seizure, under the Fourth 
Amendment of the Constitution of the United States, and as such, requires the actions to be 
reasonable. Under current case law, the decision to stop an automobile is reasonable if the police 
have probable cause to believe that a traffic violation has occurred. Current case law holds that 
constitutional reasonableness of traffic stops does not depend on the actual motivations of the 
individual officers involved and that ulterior motives do not invalidate police conduct that is 
justifiable on the basis of probable cause to believe that a violation of law has occurred. This bill 
would prohibit a peace officer from stopping or detaining the operator of a motor vehicle or bicycle 
for a low-level infraction, as defined, unless a separate, independent basis for a stop exists or 
more than one low-level infraction is observed. The bill would state that a violation of these 
provisions is not grounds for a defendant to move for return of property or to suppress evidence. 
The bill would authorize a peace officer who does not have grounds to stop a vehicle or bicycle, 
but can determine the identity of the owner, to send a citation or warning letter to the 
owner.   (Based on  09/07/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 54 Skinner, D 
 

Venture capital 
companies: 
reporting. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
594, 
Statutes of 
2023. 

10/08/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Would, commencing on March 1, 2025, and annually thereafter, require a covered entity, defined 
as a venture capital company that meets specified criteria, to report to the Civil Rights Department 
specified information about their funding determinations, including, at an aggregate level, specified 
demographic information for the founding teams of all of the businesses in which the covered 
entity made a venture capital investment in the prior calendar year to the extent the information 
was provided pursuant to a survey the bill would require a covered entity to provide to each 
founding team member of a business that has received funding from a venture capital company to 
which the covered entity has acted as an investment adviser, as specified. The bill would require 
this information to be collected and reported in a manner that does not associate the survey 
response data with an individual founding team member. The bill would require the department to 
charge and collect fees to administer these provisions, as specified. The bill would require the 
department to notify the covered entity that the covered entity must submit the report within 60 
days of the notification. If the covered entity has not submitted the report after those 60 days have 
elapsed, the bill would authorize the department to commence prescribed proceedings seeking 
specified relief, including a penalty, as specified. The bill would require moneys collected pursuant 
to these provisions to be deposited in the fund, and would express the intent of the Legislature that 
these moneys be appropriated in the Budget Act to the department for administration of these 
provisions.   (Based on  10/08/2023 text) 

 Monitor 
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SB 56 Skinner, D 
 

University of 
California: 
transfer of real 
property. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
764, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/27/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current provisions of the California Constitution provide that the University of California constitutes 
a public trust and requires the university to be administered by the Regents of the University of 
California, a corporation in the form of a board, with full powers of organization and government, 
subject to legislative control only for specified purposes, including such competitive bidding 
procedures as may be applicable to the university by statute for the letting of construction 
contracts, sales of real property, and purchasing of materials, goods, and services. Current law 
requires the regents to give prescribed public notice to bidders of the sale of university real 
property situated in California that is estimated at more than $1,000,000 in net value to the 
university. Current law requires the regents to accept in public a bid for the sale that offers the best 
combination of price, terms, and bidder’s qualifications to the university, or reject all bids or 
proposals. Existing law exempts certain transactions from these publication and award 
procedures. This bill would additionally exempt from the publication and award procedures the 
transfer of specified real property in the City of Berkeley from the regents to the Berkeley Student 
Cooperative for the purpose of maintaining affordable housing.   (Based on  09/27/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 58 Wiener, D 
 

Controlled 
substances: 
decriminalizatio
n of certain 
hallucinogenic 
substances. 

10/07/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

01/25/2024 - 
Stricken 
from file. 
Veto 
sustained.  

10/07/2023 - 
Senate  VETO
ED 

Would, on and after January 1, 2025, make lawful the possession, preparation, obtaining, or 
transportation of, specified quantities of psilocybin, psilocyn, dimethyltryptamine (DMT), and 
mescaline, for personal use, as defined, by and with persons 21 years of age or older. The bill 
would provide penalties for possession of these substances on school grounds, or possession by, 
or transferring to, persons under 21 years of age.    (Based on  09/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 62 Nguyen, R 
 

Controlled 
substances: 
fentanyl. 

01/04/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law prohibits a person from possessing for sale or purchasing for purposes of sale, 
specified controlled substances, including fentanyl, and provides for imprisonment in a county jail 
for 2, 3, or 4 years for a violation of this provision. Current law also imposes an additional term, 
and authorizes a trial court to impose a specified fine, upon a person who is convicted of a 
violation of, or of a conspiracy to violate, specified provisions of law with respect to a substance 
containing heroin, cocaine base, and cocaine, if the substance exceeds a specified weight. This 
bill would impose that additional term upon, and authorize a fine against, a defendant who violates 
those laws with respect to a substance containing fentanyl. By increasing the penalty for a crime, 
the bill would impose a state-mandated local program.    (Based on  01/04/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 63 Ochoa Bogh, 
R 
 

Homeless and 
Mental Health 
Court and 
Transitioning 
Home Grant 
Programs. 

01/04/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Under current law, the Board of State and Community Corrections administers several grant 
programs, including a mentally ill offender crime reduction grant program, a medication-assisted 
treatment grant program, and a violence intervention and prevention grant program. This bill would 
establish two new grant programs until January 1, 2028: the Homeless and Mental Health Court 
Grant Program that would, subject to an appropriation by the Legislature, be administered by the 
Judicial Council and provide grants to counties for the purpose of establishing or expanding 
homeless courts and mental health courts, as specified; and the Transitioning Home Grant 
Program that would, subject to an appropriation by the Legislature, be administered by the board 
and provide grants to county sheriffs and jail administrators to fund programs aimed at reducing 
homelessness among inmates released from custody, as specified.    (Based on  01/04/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=gwlM4suExpRfppH2XmexZSHHSLlVhMWvLZUR74F1SWBCftornWrObpRZpk6sVhMSaj4Kux0Yd84Bb7fg3/e4NRMjnB1hkzgxWM1mGNtY4kI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/260
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_56_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_56_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=VD0f8ZvR8noowA99Pp7Y77HeA0jPDLFgoPiccpeTu7tmsqkq3IebMUYAM7mMRLPhF3AgsUY99yXNgnJ7jBsMUaqhi3n4n9BhWjzcmDN51ng=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/257
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_58_93_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_58_93_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_58_93_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=sPovx6pMYoaXzK0IqV0/LklOTmV7CZdBpGrJ019uMC0U9hEV8zSBNHDSX+6uyhC2kBBT+DGt31BkEZUsk9aEHz96E3k3Uv88qW1QNp4HBtE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/428
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_62_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_62_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=2lM0yUDVso4r/OtHVXS1krf8IvdibFSCbT1Vy+c9RZ/RTAQBRhAtcykGaXx6QPJVKlHxpsFhg6uRiNMACagBzWVowt1Ui+7TqKsRdBvSKbI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/415
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/415
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_63_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_63_99_I_bill.pdf
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SB 69 Cortese, D 
 

California 
Environmental 
Quality Act: 
local agencies: 
filing of notices 
of 
determination 
or exemption. 

10/13/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/13/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
860, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/13/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Would require a local agency to file a notice of determination with the State Clearinghouse in the 
Office of Planning and Research in addition to the county clerk of each county in which the project 
will be located. The bill would authorize a local agency to file a notice of exemption with the State 
Clearinghouse in the Office of Planning and Research in addition to the county clerk of each 
county in which the project will be located. The bill would require the notice, including any 
subsequent or amended notice, to be posted both in the office and on the internet website of the 
county clerk and by the Office of Planning and Research on the State Clearinghouse internet 
website within 24 hours of receipt. The bill would specify that the posting of the notice by the Office 
of Planning and Research would not affect the applicable time periods to challenge an act or 
decision of a local agency, as described above. By imposing duties on local agencies, the bill 
would create a state-mandated local program.   (Based on  10/13/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 76 Wiener, D 
 

Alcoholic 
beverages: 
music venue 
license: 
entertainment 
zones: 
consumption. 

10/10/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/10/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
700, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/10/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The Alcoholic Beverage Control Act contains various provisions regulating the application for, the 
issuance of, the suspension of, and the conditions imposed upon alcoholic beverage licenses by 
the Department of Alcoholic Beverage Control. This bill would authorize a licensee under a music 
venue license to apply to the department for a duplicate license or licenses, as prescribed. The bill 
would also authorize a music venue licensee to sell, serve, and permit consumption of alcoholic 
beverages during private events or private functions not open to the general public within any 
hours of operation permitted by its license, regardless of whether any live performance occurs. 
The bill would exempt the licensee from having to meet certain requirements generally imposed on 
a music entertainment facility in connection with and during a private event or private function if 
specified conditions are met. The bill would require the licensee to keep records demonstrating 
compliance with these provisions for the preceding 3 calendar years and to provide these records 
to the department upon request. The bill would make a licensee’s failure to keep the required 
records or provide them to the department grounds for disciplinary action punishable as a 
misdemeanor and would, therefore, expand the scope of a crime, thereby imposing a state-
mandated local program.   (Based on  10/10/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 83 Wiener, D 
 

Public utilities: 
electrical 
distribution 
grid: 
energization. 

05/03/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law authorizes the Public Utilities Commission to establish an expedited distribution grid 
interconnection dispute resolution process with the goal of resolving disputes over interconnection 
applications within the jurisdiction of the commission in no more than 60 days from the time the 
dispute is formally brought to the commission. This bill would require the commission, on or before 
September 30, 2024, to establish maximum energization time periods by when an electrical 
corporation would be required to energize a development project, including the maximum time 
period for the energization ready phase of a project. The bill would require an electrical corporation 
to energize a development project with the electrical corporation’s electrical distribution grid within 
the maximum energization time period established by the commission, after receiving a notification 
from a development project applicant that the development project is energization ready, as 
defined. The bill would specify that the maximum energization time period established by the 
commission does not apply if an issue specific to the development project or the project site arises 
that would prevent the electrical corporation from safely completing the energization within that 
time period and would require the electrical corporation to work with the development project 
applicant to establish an alternative time period.    (Based on  05/03/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=MQgcnYl2GIaJWhH03pMdCBz1Q7ngopbrN6hWC2uy1fDW78XN/JtWsOk3NeqB1uSy78h2FaMwbXtsFQL+IAJ/83EvmC+SuIkVRMsThZh7xgs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/393
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_69_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_69_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=RDQsKK8/EZAu/0lbayGXauzATFIMG6oDkrMOz88jx32EyA3LGt1Apm3FqQoQrYSQ3PgJJhn7ZHONF0I62XDmT9eTdIdKc6OP8fAniVtTLYI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/257
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_76_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_76_92_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=keIr6ENyLeNuBZUZU5Q4dPElBsbx/qQCKwCLCA3PN6GSM9dFgUrg0M8M7EmKMo5gogGwTrms+spFvyXbpBjhign0Yl7QLTH+QcOoBZ3aKfw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/257
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_83_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_83_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_83_96_A_bill.pdf
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SB 84 Gonzalez, D 
 

Air quality 
programs: 
funding. 

05/18/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Died on file 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

02/01/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law creates the Enhanced Fleet Modernization Program to provide compensation for the 
retirement and replacement of passenger vehicles and light-duty and medium-duty trucks that are 
high polluters. Existing law requires the Bureau of Automotive Repair to administer the program 
and the State Air Resources Board to adopt the guidelines for the program. Current law requires 
the guidelines to ensure vehicle replacement or a mobility option be an option for all motor vehicle 
owners and may be in addition to compensation for vehicles retired. Current law creates the 
Enhanced Fleet Modernization Subaccount in the High Polluter Repair or Removal Account and 
makes available, upon appropriation, all moneys in the account to establish, implement, and 
administer the program. This bill would require the guidelines to ensure each replacement vehicle 
in the program be either a plug-in hybrid or zero-emission vehicle unless the state board makes a 
specified determination in consultation with the State Energy Resources Conservation and 
Development Commission, as specified.   (Based on  05/18/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 91 Umberg, D 
 

California 
Environmental 
Quality Act: 
supportive and 
transitional 
housing: motel 
conversion: 
environmental 
leadership 
transit projects. 

10/10/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/10/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
732, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/10/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) requires a lead agency, as defined, to prepare, 
or cause to be prepared, and certify the completion of an environmental impact report (EIR) on a 
project that it proposes to carry out or approve that may have a significant effect on the 
environment or to adopt a negative declaration if it finds that the project will not have that effect. 
CEQA also requires a lead agency to prepare a mitigated negative declaration for a project that 
may have a significant effect on the environment if revisions in the project would avoid or mitigate 
that effect and there is no substantial evidence that the project, as revised, would have a 
significant effect on the environment. Current law, until January 1, 2025, exempts from CEQA 
projects related to the conversion of a structure with a certificate of occupancy as a motel, hotel, 
residential hotel, or hostel to supportive or transitional housing, as defined, that meet certain 
conditions. This bill would extend indefinitely the above exemption.   (Based on  10/10/2023 text) 

SB 
91_SUPPORT15
May23 

Support 

SB 94 Cortese, D 
 

Recall and 
resentencing: 
special 
circumstances. 

09/07/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
THIRD 
READING 
on 
8/13/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law provides for various specified special circumstances, including murder committed for 
financial gain or committed during the commission or attempted commission of certain felonies, 
which, if found true as specified, require a defendant found guilty of murder in the first degree to be 
sentenced to death or imprisonment for life without the possibility of parole. Current law, added by 
Proposition 115 of the June 5, 1990, statewide primary election, prohibits a judge from striking or 
dismissing any special circumstance that is admitted by plea or found true by a jury or court, as 
specified. Current law generally authorizes a court to dismiss an action or to strike or dismiss an 
enhancement in the furtherance of justice, except if dismissal of that enhancement is prohibited by 
any initiative statute. This bill would authorize an individual serving a sentence of life imprisonment 
without the possibility of parole for a conviction in which one or more special circumstances were 
found to be true to petition for recall and resentencing if the offense occurred before June 5, 1990, 
and the individual has served at least 25 years in custody. The bill would exempt individuals from 
relief under these provisions under certain circumstances, including if the individual was convicted 
of first degree murder of a peace officer, as specified. The bill would authorize the court to modify 
the petitioner’s sentence to impose a lesser sentence and apply any changes in law that reduce 
sentences or provide for judicial discretion, or to vacate the petitioner’s conviction and impose 
judgment on a lesser included offense, as specified.    (Based on  09/07/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=6sXgky1pPMbAESmi6CfpPtUUquJQ4OF1Jw5GYSSAu/eQIM0LBgwBN8lqgod6rz8mwr0av3Q8AqUH9iCwJPOdvjjNAuOm70KJAuUIFsnXXCs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/479
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_84_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_84_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_84_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=wsAvHQmAU23mmsd5MN4ZYf9WdzV07Dat4tKYBUb6KpY8tuM2bCKqGRQj7I77EZ/nnh9gGbmOqT2JRcuvK2/rsG7pXEBzfg8d972+Y1buTqk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/427
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_91_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_91_96_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=092ADAF3-FB1D-409E-B06D-B8EF69A5FAC5
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=092ADAF3-FB1D-409E-B06D-B8EF69A5FAC5
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=092ADAF3-FB1D-409E-B06D-B8EF69A5FAC5
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=8fTjFMD3UkVcWIZ60jmoJpEF1VTpW6/g4f3+DFadK2T3ztgO2iXT4trxjprYII4yhNuhtAy+v24Ds/MzMP4J09/taoIcS7tr0xAsoKQlAGM=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/393
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_94_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_94_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0051-0100/sb_94_94_A_bill.pdf
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SB 106 Wiener, D 
 

Budget Acts of 
2022 and 2023. 

04/08/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
BUDGET on 
4/15/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would amend the Budget Act of 2022 and the Budget Act of 2023 by amending, adding, and 
repealing items of appropriation and making other changes. This bill would declare that it is to take 
effect immediately as a Budget Bill.   (Based on  04/08/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 145 Newman, D 
 

Environmental 
mitigation: 
Department of 
Transportation. 

07/10/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

07/10/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 57, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

07/10/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The California Endangered Species Act (CESA) requires the Fish and Game Commission to 
establish a list of endangered species and a list of threatened species and to add or remove 
species from either list if it finds, upon the receipt of sufficient scientific information, as specified, 
that the action is warranted. CESA prohibits the taking of an endangered, threatened, or candidate 
species, except as specified. Under the act, the Department of Fish and Wildlife may authorize the 
take of listed species if the take is incidental to an otherwise lawful activity, the impacts are 
minimized and fully mitigated, and the applicant ensures adequate funding for implementing the 
mitigation measures and for monitoring compliance with, and the effectiveness of, those 
measures. This bill would specify that any transportation funding identified in the State Highway 
System Management Plan for purposes of these provisions is presumed to provide adequate 
funding for the long-term maintenance of a habitat connectivity or wildlife corridor structure on the 
state highway system, but not for the habitat on or around the structure, and would require an 
applicant to provide an endowment.    (Based on  07/10/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 146 Gonzalez, D 
 

Public 
resources: 
infrastructure: 
contracting. 

07/10/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

07/10/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 58, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

07/10/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Existing law authorizes the Secretary of Transportation to assume the responsibilities of the United 
States Secretary of Transportation under the federal National Environmental Policy Act of 1969 
(NEPA) and other federal environmental laws for any railroad, public transportation, or multimodal 
project undertaken by state agencies, as specified. Existing law provides that the State of 
California consents to the jurisdiction of the federal courts with regard to the compliance, 
discharge, or enforcement of these responsibilities. Existing law repeals these provisions on 
January 1, 2025. This bill would extend the above authorization to December 31, 2033. The bill 
would additionally authorize the Secretary of Transportation, consistent with, and subject to the 
requirements of, any memorandum of understanding between the state and federal government 
and upon the request of a local or regional agency with the authority to implement transportation 
projects, to assume responsibilities under the NEPA and other federal environmental laws for any 
railroad, local public transportation, or multimodal project implemented by the requesting local or 
regional agency. The bill would impose terms and conditions similar to those with respect to the 
above-described authority to assume those responsibilities for projects undertaken by state 
agencies, including providing consent for the jurisdiction of the federal courts, as provided. The bill 
would require the secretary to report to the transportation policy committees of the Legislature 
regarding the assumption of responsibilities under the NEPA requested by a local or regional 
agency by December 31, 2033.   (Based on  07/10/2023 text) 
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https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=iM9GxHXbSL1FyKCHQsPM8h4B0HfP6KWABoy3koP4rWRXyLyQdxh6TWjyWnTt8q0gUac3uS6A1KZQskvW1VvveC011NSHY/P1Q/XTfHZWSsk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/257
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0101-0150/sb_106_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0101-0150/sb_106_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0101-0150/sb_106_98_A_bill.pdf
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https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/475
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0101-0150/sb_145_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0101-0150/sb_145_96_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=cgTC/bQ5MHDEmN2DzkxWTv0ec5iXJ0fY9ZfyuoDq0wC+MAV0CktydbaqZeliTlLocgqddJZerUxgdNy9O7WJnCQEtpboPFDlr0LJu4geOGA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/479
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0101-0150/sb_146_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0101-0150/sb_146_96_C_bill.pdf
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SB 147 Ashby, D 
 

Fully protected 
species: 
California 
Endangered 
Species Act: 
authorized 
take. 

07/10/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

07/10/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 59, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

07/10/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The California Endangered Species Act (CESA) requires the Fish and Game Commission to 
establish a list of endangered species and a list of threatened species and to add or remove 
species from either list if it finds, upon the receipt of sufficient scientific information, as specified, 
that the action is warranted. The act prohibits the taking of an endangered or threatened species, 
except in certain situations, including, if specified conditions are met, through the issuance of a 
permit commonly known as an incidental take permit. This bill would, until December 31, 2033, 
authorize the Department of Fish and Wildlife to issue a permit under CESA that would authorize 
the take of a fully protected species resulting from impacts attributable to the implementation of 
specified projects if certain conditions are satisfied, including, among others, the conditions 
required for the issuance of an incidental take permit. The bill would require the department to 
develop a plan on or before July 1, 2024, to assess the population status of each fully protected 
species.    (Based on  07/10/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 149 Caballero, D 
 

California 
Environmental 
Quality Act: 
administrative 
and judicial 
procedures: 
record of 
proceedings: 
judicial 
streamlining. 

07/10/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

07/10/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 60, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

07/10/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) requires a lead agency, as defined, to prepare, 
or cause to be prepared, and certify the completion of an environmental impact report (EIR) on a 
project that it proposes to carry out or approve that may have a significant effect on the 
environment or to adopt a negative declaration if it finds that the project will not have that effect. 
CEQA also requires a lead agency to prepare a mitigated negative declaration for a project that 
may have a significant effect on the environment if revisions in the project would avoid or mitigate 
that effect and there is no substantial evidence that the project, as revised, would have a 
significant effect on the environment. CEQA provides that, in certain specified actions or 
proceedings, the plaintiff or petitioner may elect to prepare the record of proceedings, subject to 
certification of its accuracy by the public agency. CEQA requires that a copy of the certified record 
of proceedings be lodged with the court. This bill would authorize the public agency to deny the 
request of the plaintiff or petitioner to prepare the record of proceedings, as provided, in which 
case the bill would require the public agency or the real party in interest to bear the costs of 
preparation and certification of the record of proceedings and would prohibit the recovery of those 
costs from the plaintiff or petitioner. The bill would require the court to schedule a case 
management conference within 30 days of the filing of an action to review the scope, timing, and 
cost of the record of proceedings.    (Based on  07/10/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 150 Durazo, D 
 

Construction: 
workforce 
development: 
public 
contracts. 

07/10/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

07/10/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 61, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

07/10/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Existing law establishes the Department of Transportation in the Transportation Agency. Existing 
law establishes the California Workforce Development Board as the body responsible for assisting 
the Governor in the development, oversight, and continuous improvement of California's workforce 
investment system and the alignment of the education and workforce investment systems to the 
needs of the 21st century economy and workforce. Under existing law, the California Workforce 
Development Board assists the Governor in the administration, promotion, and expansion of high 
road construction careers. This bill would require the Department of Transportation to work in 
partnership with the California Workforce Development Board to support California's high road 
construction careers program. The bill would require the department to reserve a minimum 
aggregate total of $50,000,000 of federal funds from the federal Infrastructure Investment and 
Jobs Act to be allocated over 4 years to support the program.    (Based on  07/10/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=NDOLYzVsmJfV1f+9Kr5HeSlh1DG+g/OCLoEEJMANGchFjaAOBd9MMG2RzqzIiRvEc7dgCNjpWh6rLfCiebrvfdxQglkZym+5NYG7nC0Py6Y=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/335
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0101-0150/sb_147_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0101-0150/sb_147_96_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=8NI4N2DqkgwDock2kJ/1BeWL8woLw+NomQs1qUBSFx8tTCx6WZip0d6N8dr7cbjlC3lZp0mjg5k45jC+1jWKcebqvva8i4rjXbU2htcKkkc=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/403
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0101-0150/sb_149_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0101-0150/sb_149_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Nz8VSIpZaYYyNXAazD3QbqexJCG0MaWpRYU9DeBMyJAteaaSSwDOst+mgSMMdytAZRXHq8VPZs4lArl2lskeu2vXjeCfIccFqZs82VbDnx0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/424
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0101-0150/sb_150_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0101-0150/sb_150_96_C_bill.pdf
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SB 222 Nguyen, R 
 

Outdoor 
advertising: 
applications. 

03/21/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The Outdoor Advertising Act, provides for the regulation by the Department of Transportation of an 
advertising display, as defined, within view of public highways. Current law requires the director to 
prescribe the form of all applications, licenses, permits, and other appurtenant written matter. This 
bill would require the department to consider the approval or denial of a pending outdoor 
advertising application before construction on an applicable highway project is completed.   (Based 
on  03/21/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 225 Caballero, D 
 

Community 
Anti-
Displacement 
and 
Preservation 
Program: 
statewide 
contract. 

06/22/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
INACTIVE 
FILE on 
8/20/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law, upon appropriation, authorizes the Department of Housing and Community 
Development to make either or both loans and grants to rehabilitate, capitalize operating subsidy 
reserves for, and extend the long-term affordability of department-funded housing projects that 
have an affordability restriction that has expired, that have an affordability restriction with a 
remaining term of less than 10 years, or are otherwise at risk for conversion, as provided. This bill 
would establish the Community Anti-Displacement and Preservation Program for purposes of 
funding the acquisition and rehabilitation of unrestricted housing units, as defined, and attaching 
long-term affordability restrictions on the housing units, while safeguarding against the 
displacement of current residents. The bill would require the department to issue a request for 
qualification to select a private sector entity or consortium to manage the program for a period of 5 
years. The bill would require the program manager to make loans to eligible borrowers, as defined, 
based on underwriting guidelines approved by the department. The bill would authorize the 
department to issue grants or loans from program funds to local public entities upon request for 
purposes of allowing the local public entity to use the moneys to issue loans to eligible borrowers 
within its jurisdiction in accordance with the bill’s provisions and department regulations.    (Based 
on  06/22/2023 text) 

SB 225 
SUPPORT_4Apri
l23 

Support 

SB 226 Alvarado-Gil, 
R 
 

Controlled 
substances: 
armed 
possession: 
fentanyl. 

07/03/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/7/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law classifies certain substances, including cocaine, heroin, and fentanyl, as controlled 
substances and generally prohibits the possession, sale, transportation, and use of these 
substances. Current law additionally prohibits the possession of certain of these controlled 
substances including cocaine, heroin, and methamphetamine while armed with a loaded and 
operable firearm. A violation of this prohibition is punishable as a felony punishable by 
incarceration in the state prison. This bill would additionally prohibit the possession of fentanyl, as 
specified, while armed with a loaded and operable firearm if the person has knowledge that the 
specific controlled substance is fentanyl.   (Based on  07/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=hNw7jw1TibSzxI3ET54qQKvvWEMKnLcqX4nTtYcc8vZXwvXq1ucUaCGKIiTQvAqE0+0JbcX0Th64wtBvR5lzwWsCRTWcuZ6nMqLbqbzILaY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/428
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0201-0250/sb_222_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0201-0250/sb_222_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0201-0250/sb_222_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=XQRcSq91lnDLJMWds5dc7x6WuSh6RLVYGgI0V9FTiAUyKJwlLDKBZZb0+asmrW3oEHYaEE3AMgdR1ep+QCdO3o7OePiV6IyBP1IPPJy+vPk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/403
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0201-0250/sb_225_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0201-0250/sb_225_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0201-0250/sb_225_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=C3CACF00-4602-4024-B6BB-05D52B534DA5
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=C3CACF00-4602-4024-B6BB-05D52B534DA5
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=C3CACF00-4602-4024-B6BB-05D52B534DA5
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=7k8/0xuoFn2L2wII9Z8AmCLb50kHkK2F0MIjiZdpzOfmPOiUUcRvodqqQWbZBopvLTJLXs9Tb9oK6ZPkm63LLCzDqO1rV/WR1qoTVKQlw6g=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/352
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/352
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0201-0250/sb_226_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0201-0250/sb_226_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0201-0250/sb_226_96_A_bill.pdf
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SB 233 Skinner, D 
 

Practice of 
medicine: 
Arizona 
physicians: 
abortions and 
abortion-related 
care for 
Arizona 
patients. 

05/23/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

05/23/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 11, 
Statutes of 
2024 

05/23/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Existing law, the Medical Practice Act, establishes the Medical Board of California and the 
Osteopathic Medical Board of California to license and regulate the practice of medicine, and 
establishes examination, training, and other requirements for licensure as a physician and 
surgeon. A violation of the act is a misdemeanor. This bill, through November 30, 2024, would 
authorize a physician licensed to practice medicine in Arizona who meets certain requirements to 
practice medicine in California for the purpose of providing abortions and abortion-related care to 
patients who are Arizona residents traveling from Arizona, upon application for registration with the 
Medical Board of California or the Osteopathic Medical Board of California, as applicable. The bill 
would prohibit the physician from providing care or consultation for other purposes or to other 
patients, except under specified circumstances. The bill would require an Arizona physician, 
before practicing in California, to submit specified information to the Medical Board of California or 
the Osteopathic Medical Board of California, as applicable, including, among other information, 
written verification from the Arizona Medical Board or the Arizona Board of Osteopathic Examiners 
in Medicine and Surgery, or documentation printed from an online licensing system, that the 
physician's Arizona license to practice medicine is in good standing and confers on the physician 
the authority to practice abortions and abortion-related care. The bill would require the applicant to 
provide an affidavit attesting that, among other things, the applicant meets all of the requirements 
for registration, as specified, and would make it a misdemeanor for a person to provide false 
information. The bill would limit the information the California boards are required to disclose about 
a registrant. The bill would deem a physician registered pursuant to the bill's provisions a licensee 
of the applicable board, would authorize the applicable board to take enforcement against a 
person registered pursuant to the bill's provisions, and would prohibit the applicable boards from 
collecting any fees for registration. By creating a new crime, the bill would impose a state-
mandated local program. The bill would repeal the bill's provisions on January 1, 2025.    (Based 
on  05/23/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 236 Jones, R 
 

Human 
trafficking: 
vertical 
prosecution 
program. 

04/11/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
7/12/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law establishes the Office of Emergency Services, which is required to, among other 
things, allocate and award funds to communities developing and providing ongoing citizen 
involvement and crime resistance programs. This bill would require the office, to the extent funds 
are available for this purpose and until January 1, 2029, to allocate and award funds to up to 11 
district attorney offices that employ a vertical prosecution methodology for the prosecution of 
human trafficking crimes and that meet other specified criteria, including minimum staffing levels 
for the program.    (Based on  04/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=nt3u2AiAKV0bHlzUdRINkYMQhJlYgydEoE6MRC+JpjNm7B0K72Q3e17hVrViDw8G1xdFwtvawBZp0OsX+EPECsRBqVM2F3vOYrCDjYDYXAc=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/260
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0201-0250/sb_233_89_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0201-0250/sb_233_89_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=XOUDgl8tk38twEwu5Fa+ss/UWXtC58612KEKQrm0w6llhXK92iiJ1ZHSXHul+l1S5uCtPwcWAIwgx8r4L0zUJFtjzK+tebQYQRd+JWCF/Qk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/404
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0201-0250/sb_236_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0201-0250/sb_236_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0201-0250/sb_236_98_A_bill.pdf
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SB 237 Grove, R 
 

Controlled 
substances: 
fentanyl. 

01/24/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law prohibits a person from possessing for sale or purchasing for purposes of sale 
specified controlled substances, including fentanyl, and punishes a violation of that prohibition by 
imprisonment in a county jail for 2, 3, or 4 years. `Current slaw also prohibits transporting, 
importing into this state, selling, furnishing, administering, or giving away specified controlled 
substances, including fentanyl, and punishes a violation of that prohibition by imprisonment in a 
county jail for 3, 4, or 5 years. Current law also prohibits the trafficking of specified controlled 
substances, including fentanyl, and punishes a violation of that prohibition by imprisonment in a 
county jail for 3, 6, or 9 years. The bill would punish the possession, sale, or purchase for sale of 
fentanyl by imprisonment in a county jail for 4, 5, or 6 years, the transportation, importation, sale, 
furnishing, administering, or giving away of fentanyl by imprisonment in a county jail for 7, 8, or 9 
years, and the trafficking of fentanyl by imprisonment in a county jail for 7, 10, or 13 
years.   (Based on  01/24/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 239 Dahle, R 
 

California 
Environmental 
Quality Act: 
housing 
development 
projects: 
judicial 
proceedings. 

01/24/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) requires a court, in an action or proceeding 
brought challenging any determination, finding, or decision of a public agency on the grounds of 
noncompliance with CEQA and a finding by the court of such noncompliance, to enter an order 
that includes one or more of specified mandates, one of which may be a mandate to suspend any 
or all specific project activity or activities, as provided. CEQA provides that, except as otherwise 
specified, it is not intended to limit the equitable powers of the courts. This bill would limit the 
standing to file and maintain the above action or proceeding to the Attorney General. The bill 
would authorize the court, upon its own motion or of a party, to conduct a hearing to determine if 
the Attorney General is bringing and maintaining an action or proceeding for nonenvironmental 
purposes, as defined. If the court determines that the action is brought or maintained for 
nonenvironmental purposes, the bill would authorize the court to take necessary actions, including 
the dismissal of the action or proceeding, award of attorneys’ fees, or both dismissal and 
award.    (Based on  01/24/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 241 Min, D 
 

Firearms: 
dealer 
requirements. 

09/26/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/26/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
250, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

09/26/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law prescribes certain requirements and prohibitions for licensed firearms dealers. A 
violation of any of these requirements or prohibitions is grounds for forfeiture of a firearms dealer’s 
license. Commencing on July 1, 2026, this bill would require a licensee and any employees that 
handle firearms to annually complete specified training. The bill would require the Department of 
Justice, on or before February 1, 2026, to develop and implement a training course, as specified, 
including a testing certification component. The bill would authorize the department to adopt 
regulations to carry out the provisions of the bill.   (Based on  09/26/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=UyZ75gHXNwj2pUm8WJFDsTTXLrKbQZdi3ROtH/2OMPo5uvVEd+tXRIr4EZsQahxupQq55O3F0IFl79sCIBVCQYzylEIhEqrQcu/k3iGMOWg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/334
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0201-0250/sb_237_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0201-0250/sb_237_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=LLs3t/lUhV8Kb5wanlhWRFqgee2krjkm2lYj9RazDkLTnOwTU9RD3HSi7eATylXCZlWviO8SvHgGgu5zbxLQtTFVoJhJaan67v1n9RKZem8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/480
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0201-0250/sb_239_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0201-0250/sb_239_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=nQwKUrj5+8I+pAT4FiszgJGzz4wAc5q2VlIwIsjgExo0kESda/VYrgFqGipDUxBnNdvslUDp8TiHTAvKbNh8kyYcM2lVD44fbSRKH0436Bg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/461
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0201-0250/sb_241_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0201-0250/sb_241_94_C_bill.pdf
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SB 250 Umberg, D 
 

Controlled 
substances: 
punishment. 

07/21/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

07/21/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
106, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

07/21/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law provides that it is not a crime for a person who experiences a drug-related overdose 
and who, in good faith, seeks medical assistance, or any other person who, in good faith, seeks 
medical assistance for the person experiencing a drug-related overdose, to be under the influence 
of, or to possess for personal use, a controlled substance, controlled substance analog, or drug 
paraphernalia, under certain circumstances related to a drug-related overdose that prompted 
seeking medical assistance if that person does not obstruct medical or law enforcement personnel. 
This bill would define “seeking medical assistance” for the purposes of the above-described 
exemption. The bill would also provide that it is not a crime for a person to possess for personal 
use a controlled substance, controlled substance analog, or drug paraphernalia, if the person 
delivers the controlled substance or controlled substance analog to the local public health 
department or law enforcement and notifies them of the likelihood that other batches of the 
controlled substance may have been adulterated with other substances, if known.    (Based 
on  07/21/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 253 Wiener, D 
 

Climate 
Corporate Data 
Accountability 
Act. 

10/07/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/07/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
382, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/07/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Would require the State Air Resources Board, on or before January 1, 2025, to develop and adopt 
regulations requiring specified partnerships, corporations, limited liability companies, and other 
business entities with total annual revenues in excess of $1,000,000,000 and that do business in 
California, defined as “reporting entities,” to publicly disclose to the emissions reporting 
organization, as defined, and obtain an assurance engagement on, starting in 2026 on a date to 
be determined by the state board, and annually thereafter, their scope 1 and scope 2 greenhouse 
gas emissions, as defined, and, starting in 2027 and annually thereafter, their scope 3 greenhouse 
gas emissions, as defined, from the reporting entity’s prior fiscal year, as provided. The bill would 
require the state board to review during 2029, and update as necessary on or before January 1, 
2030, these deadlines to evaluate trends in scope 3 emissions reporting and to consider changes 
to the deadlines, as provided. The bill would require a reporting entity to obtain an assurance 
engagement, performed by an independent third-party assurance provider, of the entity’s public 
disclosure as provided. The bill would require the state board, in developing these regulations, to 
consult with the Attorney General, other government stakeholders, investors, stakeholders 
representing consumer and environmental justice interests, and reporting entities that have 
demonstrated leadership in full-scope greenhouse gas emissions accounting and public disclosure 
and greenhouse gas emissions reductions. The bill would also require the state board to ensure 
that the assurance process minimizes the need for reporting entities to engage multiple assurance 
providers and ensures sufficient assurance provider capacity, as well as timely reporting 
implementation, as required. The bill would further require the state board to contract with an 
emissions reporting organization to develop a reporting program to receive and make publicly 
available the required disclosures. The bill would authorize the state board, starting in 2033 and 
every 5 years thereafter, to assess the global greenhouse gas accounting and reporting standards 
and to adopt an alternative standard if it determines that using the alternative standard would more 
effectively further the goals of the bill.    (Based on  10/07/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=PXZbmJI50SAcr7wh/JhwajCV4m9y+S5sUukyTyGFc4nXKhPbhxW7//7GiL7HArJuMkqEzUjj4IOtqvqvGR/r1Awar6Kjq2ncdOsBektXs14=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/427
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0201-0250/sb_250_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0201-0250/sb_250_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=vLoZgA5AtuVKTRLA991SVDpyGlLdsICzkZsgset20ODx29wTYJWzC9pxrxo2LzQhnUTJfYuLi8YXEmlw64oy8wGgvny33kSHkovBCWHbXvg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/257
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0251-0300/sb_253_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0251-0300/sb_253_92_C_bill.pdf
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SB 266 Newman, D 
 

Public safety 
collaborative. 

03/08/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would create the Public Safety Collaborative Fund in the State Treasury. The bill would require the 
board, upon appropriation by the Legislature, to administer public safety collaborative grants from 
the fund to regional public safety collaboratives established for violence prevention, intervention, 
and suppression activities. The bill would require a collaborative applying for a grant to establish a 
coordinating and advisory board with membership, including city officials, local law enforcement, 
and local stakeholders, to prioritize the use of the funds. The bill would authorize grant funds to be 
utilized for a range of programs, services, and activities designed to reduce violence, including 
programs to address youth violence prevention and intervention in K–12 schools and homeless 
outreach and intervention efforts. The bill would require a public safety collaborative to distribute at 
least 60% of the funds to one or more community-based organizations to assist with violence 
prevention, intervention, and suppression activities. The bill would require a public safety 
collaborative to report to the board annually by June 30 on the use of the funds and the 
effectiveness of the collaborative and the board to report annually to the Governor and Legislature 
by December 31.   (Based on  03/08/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 267 Eggman, D 
 

Credit history of 
persons 
receiving 
government 
rent subsidies. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
776, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The California Fair Employment and Housing Act (FEHA) prohibits, in instances in which there is a 
government rent subsidy, the use of a financial or income standard in assessing eligibility for the 
rental of housing that is not based on the portion of the rent to be paid by the tenant. FEHA 
requires the Civil Rights Department to enforce specific provisions of the act, including the 
provision described above. This bill would additionally prohibit the use of a person’s credit history 
as part of the application process for a rental housing accommodation without offering the 
applicant the option of providing lawful, verifiable alternative evidence of the applicant’s 
reasonable ability to pay the portion of the rent to be paid by the tenant, including, but not limited 
to, government benefit payments, pay records, and bank statements, in instances in which there is 
a government rent subsidy.    (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 268 Alvarado-Gil, 
R 
 

Crimes: serious 
and violent 
felonies. 

09/28/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/28/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
855, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/28/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law classifies certain criminal offenses as a “violent felony” for the purposes of various 
provisions of the Penal Code, including sentencing enhancements for prior convictions, as well as 
numerous other provisions. This bill would also include the rape of an intoxicated person wherein 
the defendant drugged the victim, as specified, in the list of violent felonies.   (Based 
on  09/28/2024 text) 

SB 268 
Support_11April2
3  

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=K9iT3mtW/HNZ/Xu+JpFJHZHcAcilI8I1WJMsyoyHSGuhSP+Rxl+OxBnFjJxGuW+0oJp336HSC4G1qQrVVPEl9tZDh4tWoz/505yArChxEXs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/475
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0251-0300/sb_266_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0251-0300/sb_266_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0251-0300/sb_266_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=eOUqwZ/cZe7fh8u2t+i2Dgy2pjTDw3jLCclq6S/O5gaEOBJO3uxOFovbBcD03ZN77pyMFULIZ0huBDYmKkCoJwnZva3g/GGNzLhf7fHyDzQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/391
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0251-0300/sb_267_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0251-0300/sb_267_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Rf6yLPaOuBM/bEpPICe89x/y0paTKFj/U3TOEHCBByJjs9gY22d199ikSoTSNU51T8ivnXvWMbNmZlDe/s20glffVC46C1MO2UEOOHugcdU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/352
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/352
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0251-0300/sb_268_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0251-0300/sb_268_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=5154E385-3F98-492C-A2ED-E9A5A902C8D8
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=5154E385-3F98-492C-A2ED-E9A5A902C8D8
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=5154E385-3F98-492C-A2ED-E9A5A902C8D8
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SB 270 Wiener, D 
 

California 
Environmental 
Quality Act: 
university 
housing 
development 
projects: 
exemption. 

04/18/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) requires a lead agency to prepare a mitigated 
negative declaration for a project that may have a significant effect on the environment if revisions 
in the project would avoid or mitigate that effect and there is no substantial evidence that the 
project, as revised, would have a significant effect on the environment. This bill would revise the 
exemption for a university housing development project to require each building within the project 
to be certified as LEED gold with a point total of 79 or better. Because the bill would result in 
additional university housing development projects being exempt from CEQA, thereby increasing 
the duties of the county clerk, this bill would impose a state-mandated local program.    (Based 
on  04/18/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 272 Laird, D 
 

Sea level rise: 
planning and 
adaptation. 

10/07/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/07/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
384, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/07/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Would require a local government, as defined, lying, in whole or in part, within the coastal zone, as 
defined, or within the jurisdiction of the San Francisco Bay Conservation and Development 
Commission, as defined, to develop a sea level rise plan as part of either a local coastal program, 
as defined, that is subject to approval by the California Coastal Commission, or a subregional San 
Francisco Bay shoreline resiliency plan that is subject to approval by the San Francisco Bay 
Conservation and Development Commission, as applicable, on or before January 1, 2034, as 
provided. By imposing additional requirements on local governments, the bill would impose a 
state-mandated local program. The bill would require local governments that receive approval for a 
sea level rise plan to be prioritized for funding, upon appropriation by the Legislature, for the 
implementation of sea level rise adaptation strategies and recommended projects in the local 
government’s approved sea level rise plan. The bill would require, on or before December 31, 
2024, the California Coastal Commission, in close coordination with the Ocean Protection Council 
and the California Sea Level Rise State and Regional Support Collaborative, to establish 
guidelines for the preparation of the sea level rise plan. The bill would also require, on or before 
December 31, 2024, the San Francisco Bay Conservation and Development Commission, in close 
coordination with the California Coastal Commission, the Ocean Protection Council, and the 
California Sea Level Rise State and Regional Support Collaborative, to establish guidelines for the 
preparation of the sea level rise plan. The bill would make the operation of its provisions 
contingent upon an appropriation for its purposes by the Legislature in the annual Budget Act or 
another statute. This bill contains other related provisions and other existing laws.   (Based 
on  10/07/2023 text) 

SB 272 LOCAL 
GOV SUPPORT 
LETTER (1).pdf 

Support 

SB 280 Laird, D 
 

Review of 
conservatorshi
ps: care plans. 

10/10/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/10/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
705, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/10/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law generally provides for the establishment, review, and termination of conservatorships. 
Current law specifies the persons who may be appointed as a conservator and requires the court 
to review a conservatorship 6 months after the initial appointment of the conservator, one year 
after the appointment of the conservator, and annually thereafter. Current law sets forth the 
powers and duties of a conservator for the care, custody, and control of a conservatee. This bill, 
commencing January 1, 2025, would require a conservator, within 120 calendar days of 
appointment and not later than 10 days before a hearing to determine the continuation or 
termination of an existing conservatorship, and to file a care plan regarding the care, custody, and 
control of the conservatee. The bill would require delivery of the care plan to specified persons, 
including the conservatee and their attorney, but would otherwise make the care plan confidential, 
except as specified, thereby limiting public access to the records. The bill would require the 
Judicial Council to develop a mandatory form for the care plan, which would be required to include 
specified information, including descriptions of the conservatee’s living arrangement and level of 
care and any plans to modify those within the next 12 months.    (Based on  10/10/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=9zyUk7i40hdBtP+37EC5vgZvXhCY0DravGMANR7tIc2YQJSxJqNcY2TGyyJpqUA/hKvs/srIVplhb8VFA/YonE14BYVv4i/fxsgLIevAars=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/257
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0251-0300/sb_270_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0251-0300/sb_270_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0251-0300/sb_270_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ApEdDWg8k34Jq/Q96qyJJaDos04C7s7xryQUgKiGkFhHgH9WYpfcIzlrktUaOuF2a5obRvp27ZQiUsjOaF5RhAb2c0nXf2eMGbaHfsppqhI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/394
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0251-0300/sb_272_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0251-0300/sb_272_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=2092A30F-984D-49D4-8E4D-98CAC80324A8
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=2092A30F-984D-49D4-8E4D-98CAC80324A8
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=2092A30F-984D-49D4-8E4D-98CAC80324A8
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=D3m5mABcqtJf+PuoE9po6hgVo23ltNRa+ZmeuroPZL5eJNaUlks7ZDdm7/S5PSSKKdklcBhfdQRaLz71YlJlQsAq5MdAgWJBQqfrGjwsJws=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/394
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0251-0300/sb_280_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0251-0300/sb_280_95_C_bill.pdf
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SB 285 Allen, D 
 

Criminal 
procedure: 
sentencing. 

09/29/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/29/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
979, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/29/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Prior law, in effect until January 1, 2020, required a sentencing court to impose an additional one-
year term for each prior separate prison term or county jail felony term served by the defendant for 
a nonviolent felony, as specified. Prior law, in effect until January 1, 2018, also required a 
sentencing court to impose on a defendant convicted of specified crimes relating to controlled 
substances, an additional 3-year term for each prior conviction of specified controlled substances 
crimes. Current law limits the imposition of these sentencing enhancements to certain specified 
circumstances. Current law invalidates any enhancement imposed pursuant to one of these prior 
provisions and requires the sentencing court, upon receipt of notice and verification of specified 
information, to recall the sentence and resentence the person to remove any invalid sentence 
enhancements. This bill would, commencing January 1, 2025, make an individual sentenced to 
death or a term of life without the possibility of parole, who has been convicted of a sexually violent 
offense, and who, as of January 1, 2025, has not had their judgment reviewed and verified by the 
sentencing court, as specified, ineligible for recall and resentencing under these 
provisions.   (Based on  09/29/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 294 Wiener, D 
 

Health care 
coverage: 
independent 
medical review. 

05/24/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
7/2/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Knox-Keene Health Care Service Plan Act of 1975 provides for the licensure and regulation of 
health care service plans by the Department of Managed Health Care, and makes a willful 
violation of the act a crime. Current law provides for the regulation of disability insurers by the 
Department of Insurance. Current law establishes the Independent Medical Review System within 
each department, under which an enrollee or insured may seek review if a health care service has 
been denied, modified, or delayed by a health care service plan or disability insurer and the 
enrollee or insured has previously filed a grievance that remains unresolved after 30 days. This 
bill, commencing January 1, 2026, would require a health care service plan or a disability insurer 
that upholds its decision to modify, delay, or deny a health care service in response to a grievance 
or has a grievance that is otherwise pending or unresolved upon expiration of the relevant 
timeframe to automatically submit within 24 hours a decision regarding a disputed health care 
service to the Independent Medical Review System, as well as the information that informed its 
decision, if the decision is to deny, modify, or delay specified services relating to mental health or 
substance use disorder conditions for an enrollee or insured up to 26 years of age. The bill would 
require a health care service plan or disability insurer, within 24 hours after submitting its decision 
to the Independent Medical Review System to provide notice to the appropriate department, the 
enrollee or insured or their representative, if any, and the enrollee’s or insured’s provider.   (Based 
on  05/24/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 301 Portantino, D 
 

Vehicular air 
pollution: Zero-
Emission 
Aftermarket 
Conversion 
Project. 

06/17/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

06/14/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
the 
Governor. In 
Senate. 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto 
pending.  

06/14/2024 - 
Senate  VETO
ED 

Would require the State Air Resources Board to establish the Zero-Emission Aftermarket 
Conversion Project (ZCAP), upon appropriation by the Legislature in the annual Budget Act or 
other statute or, at the discretion of the state board, using moneys available from another clean 
transportation program, to provide an applicant who is a California resident with a rebate for an 
eligible vehicle that has been converted into a zero-emission vehicle. The rebate issued pursuant 
to the ZACP would be limited to one per vehicle and a value of up to $4,000. The bill would require 
the state board to establish guidelines for the ZACP that, among other things, define qualifying 
conversion-types for used vehicles and establish minimum eligibility criteria for an applicant to be 
eligible for the rebate. The bill would also require the state board’s guidelines to require that an 
eligible zero-emission vehicle have a range of at least 100 miles and have completed an 
inspection of safety systems and components by a licensee of the Bureau of Automotive Repair, 
as provided.   (Based on  05/29/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=eh+QXziGK8mpH8ionw5vNB5k/mhC6nRtjA4tPO//IiPuM56dNl6UJ72XzzaAJ7vwHShVvxnr3cHNeXV5Q7QNl/ZGXJ96MA1EGB88TSuajxw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/339
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0251-0300/sb_285_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0251-0300/sb_285_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=mQLsON1bd95ApI3YzvFf/0Q5/zh4j4p++WV1kUWAzHvpHZ5WAnfdU0NHwu3i6WzRpPtCIrQn8rx83z1q+x3OfLHj/NC8KkZq0liQhtQB4oA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/257
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0251-0300/sb_294_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0251-0300/sb_294_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0251-0300/sb_294_95_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=dJsiMvRAORRtX0W0EGz5p5+MgOzUibQzylDb8FDONGCpFb33Rli2KqGGz4Y1dNSAlIIaNn1zrMGL9Ym0pPHHVRde1rZxS3/VpfW3R3ynDLc=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/262
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_301_95_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_301_95_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_301_95_E_bill.pdf
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SB 308 Becker, D 
 

Net zero 
greenhouse 
gas emissions 
goal: carbon 
dioxide 
removal: 
regulations. 

07/08/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/7/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The California Global Warming Solutions Act of 2006 requires the state board to approve a 
statewide greenhouse gas emissions limit equivalent to the statewide greenhouse gas emissions 
level in 1990 to be achieved by 2020 and to ensure that statewide greenhouse gas emissions are 
reduced to at least 40% below the 1990 level by 2030. The act authorizes the state board to adopt 
a regulation that establishes a system of market-based declining annual aggregate emissions 
limits for sources or categories of sources that emit greenhouse gases, applicable from January 1, 
2012, to December 31, 2030, inclusive, as specified. The act authorizes the state board to include 
in its regulation of those emissions the use of market-based compliance mechanisms. The act 
requires the state board to prepare and approve a scoping plan for achieving the maximum 
technologically feasible and cost-effective reductions in greenhouse gas emissions and to update 
the scoping plan at least once every 5 years. Current law requires the state board, as part of its 
scoping plan, to establish specified carbon dioxide removal targets for 2030 and beyond. The act 
also declares the policy of the state both to achieve net zero greenhouse gas emissions as soon 
as possible, but no later than 2045, and achieve and maintain net negative greenhouse gas 
emissions thereafter, and to ensure that by 2045, statewide anthropogenic greenhouse gas 
emissions are reduced to at least 85% below the 1990 levels. This bill would require the state 
board to develop and adopt regulations, or utilize existing programs and regulations, to ensure the 
state achieves carbon dioxide removals equivalent to at least 100% of statewide greenhouse gas 
emissions in calendar year 2045, and all subsequent years, in order to achieve the net zero and 
net negative greenhouse gas emissions goals. As part of those efforts, the bill would require the 
state board to establish separate interim targets for greenhouse gas emissions reductions and 
carbon dioxide removals, to be applicable beginning no later than calendar year 2030, and to 
report on progress toward achieving those targets.   (Based on  07/08/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 318 Ochoa Bogh, 
R 
 

“2-1-1” 
information and 
referral 
network. 

02/06/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/16/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Pursuant to authority delegated by the Federal Communications Commission to state regulatory 
bodies and its existing statutory authority, the Public Utilities Commission has established 
procedures for implementing 2-1-1 dialing in California. Current law, until January 1, 2023, 
authorized the commission, if it determined that doing so was an appropriate use of funds 
collected from ratepayers, to expend up to $1,500,000 from the California Teleconnect Fund 
Administrative Committee Fund to help close 2-1-1 service gaps in counties lacking access to 
disaster preparedness, response, and recovery information and referral services, where 
technically feasible, through available 2-1-1 service. Current law establishes various public social 
services programs, administered by the State Department of Social services. This bill would, upon 
appropriation, require the department to establish, develop, implement, and administer the 2-1-1 
Support Services Grant Program. The bill would require the department to allocate 85% of funds 
for grants to fund core activities of 2-1-1 agencies, including, among others, contact handling, as 
specified, and improving the statewide ability to manage resource and user needs data to support 
data sharing and delivery to health systems, government agencies and other key partners, and 
shared capacity for analytics and systems.   (Based on  02/06/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=kvBR6NLWN8v05IgScb02TDvxczQc3DxXlFE3e5ysDstNrpdcDIdTfJpopGP54QD6Egn9KoBXWoxRC0d1Jam30JVAFmrxJgiMUFQxdeUFzhY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/392
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_308_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_308_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_308_94_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=TRJGBsBdVneqNPFtiwpfUJ7yrrDyFK19+G5GJcVM7m6W8kh6ZqcP+zxGzsnhayk5rCvQdvkgWmrdNk8DDE3Gkc1MdWOc2AyyBXEm0jUMIfY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/415
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/415
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_318_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_318_99_I_bill.pdf
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SB 321 Ashby, D 
 

Literacy: 
libraries: Local 
Public Library 
Partnership 
Program. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
598, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/09/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law authorizes the State Librarian to give advisory, consultive, and technical assistance 
with respect to public libraries to librarians and library authorities, and assist all other authorities, 
state and local, in assuming their full responsibility for library services. This bill would establish the 
Local Public Library Partnership Program, under the administration of the State Librarian, for 
purposes of ensuring that all pupils have access to a local public library by 3rd grade.    (Based 
on  10/08/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 322 Becker, D 
 

Zero-Emission 
Vehicle Battery 
Manufacturing 
Block Grants 
Program. 

06/13/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/23/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Under current law, a project, as defined, that develops in-state production of raw materials and the 
manufacturing supply chain for zero-emission vehicle components is eligible to receive funding 
under the Clean Transportation Program. As part of that program, the State Energy Resources 
Conservation and Development Commission has awarded grant moneys through a zero-emission 
vehicle battery manufacturing block grant to promote in-state battery manufacturing for zero-
emission vehicles and related infrastructure. This bill would require the commission, or an entity it 
contracts with, to administer its Zero-Emission Vehicle Battery Manufacturing Block Grant 
Program, and would impose eligibility, application scoring, workforce, and reporting requirements 
on the program. The bill would authorize the commission, or an entity it contracts with, to adopt 
procedures and criteria to supplement these requirements.   (Based on  06/13/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 326 Eggman, D 
 

The Behavioral 
Health Services 
Act. 

10/12/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/12/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
790, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/12/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Would, If approved by the voters at the March 5, 2024, statewide primary election, recast the 
Mental Health Services Act (MHSA) by, among other things, renaming it the Behavioral Health 
Services Act (BHSA), expanding it to include treatment of substance use disorders, changing the 
county planning process, and expanding services for which counties and the state can use funds. 
The bill would revise the distribution of MHSA moneys, including allocating up to $36,000,000 to 
the department for behavioral health workforce funding. The bill would authorize the department to 
require a county to implement specific evidence-based practices. This bill would require a county, 
for behavioral health services eligible for reimbursement pursuant to the federal Social Security 
Act, to submit the claims for reimbursement to the State Department of Health Care Services (the 
department) under specific circumstances. The bill would require counties to pursue 
reimbursement through various channels and would authorize the counties to report issues with 
managed care plans and insurers to the Department of Managed Health Care or the Department 
of Insurance.   (Based on  10/12/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=snQrz3fi7FrYmfdbl6cVU82aJ1rsHRyVigv4385NXb6Oigs/ZjLOIkmZw+Tk3XoO34mvg64GqKS1WJHP2M38mId9YcgkauUrYbRlXrpG8lc=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/335
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_321_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_321_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=RDnDUyHWZJMlvSLtgZj0cNuGLzSb9KhqsvCr0EAe8blS0j95Hl7otq9lG1UNk5uH5DzG5sB1FAEPhwYBn2oAueoCjtrvm4s3IQoAx1d73R8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/392
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_322_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_322_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_322_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=OebHzzBJgBKCxRpsoqkpgRekanTxFKapBQEyeGS1ylaP4H0onJeN6Rl+Qrm57uGpjNiuNXYMJDn8vLTGBmnHVDeyEELFyGFvc0Al7mZu1Lg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/391
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_326_90_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_326_90_C_bill.pdf
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SB 333 Cortese, D 
 

Homeless 
pupils: 
California 
Success, 
Opportunity, 
and Academic 
Resilience 
(SOAR) 
Guaranteed 
Income 
Program. 

05/13/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
7/2/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would, subject to an appropriation by the Legislature for this purpose, require the State 
Department of Social Services to establish the California Success, Opportunity, and Academic 
Resilience (SOAR) Guaranteed Income Program. The program would award public school pupils 
who are in grade 12 and are homeless children or youths, as defined, a guaranteed income of 
$1,000 each month for 4 months from May 1, 2025, to August 1, 2025, inclusive, as provided. The 
bill would establish the California SOAR Guaranteed Income Fund as the initial depository of all 
moneys appropriated, donated, or otherwise received for the program, and upon appropriation by 
the Legislature, would provide moneys in the fund to counties that opt in to the program for 
distribution to eligible participants.   (Based on  05/13/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 335 Cortese, D 
 

Transactions 
and use taxes: 
County of 
Santa Clara. 

10/07/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/07/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
391, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/07/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law authorizes cities and counties, subject to certain limitations and approval 
requirements, to levy a transactions and use tax for general or specific purposes, in accordance 
with the procedures and requirements set forth in the Transactions and Use Tax Law, including a 
requirement that the combined rate of all taxes that may be imposed in accordance with that law in 
the county not exceed 2%. This bill would authorize the County of Santa Clara to impose a 
transactions and use tax for general or specific purposes at a rate of no more than 0.625% that, in 
combination with other transactions and use taxes, would exceed the above-described combined 
rate limit of 2%, if the county adopts an ordinance proposing the tax and the ordinance proposing 
the tax is approved by the voters, subject to applicable voter approval requirements, as specified. 
The bill would specify that a transactions and use tax established pursuant to its provisions would 
not be considered for purposes of the 2% combined rate limitation.    (Based on  10/07/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 341 Becker, D 
 

Housing 
development. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
777, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law establishes the Infill Infrastructure Grant Program of 2019, which requires the 
department, upon appropriation of funds by the Legislature, to establish and administer a grant 
program to allocate those funds to eligible applicants, as defined, to fund capital improvement 
projects that are an integral part of, or necessary to facilitate the development of, a qualifying infill 
project, qualifying infill area, or catalytic qualifying infill area pursuant to specified requirements. 
Current law requires the department, in its review and ranking of applications for the award of 
capital improvement project grants, to rank affected qualifying infill areas based on specified 
priorities. This bill, with respect to the Infill Infrastructure Grant Program of 2019, would specify that 
only the qualifying infill area portion of that program must be awarded additional points or 
preference. This bill would add the qualifying infill area and catalytic qualifying infill area portions of 
the Infill Infrastructure Grant Program of 2019 as one of the specified state programs for which 
additional points or preference is awarded. This bill would also make technical changes to the 
provisions of the programs.   (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=KeNZkofGkHYJyVo3yCz70UHwJABrzW2hLNzjQc93/Zugec1qk4Xn4H+RaTJ+IDNMx37GhDL+GWajtKzPELAv6EidAYRF+mkpknNwMn0hS3Y=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/393
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_333_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_333_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_333_94_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=tq791elLt0/BWqvuwepPWbnRiL5H60mVSve/w1xbbRCk+ISladAd7MPkyJRbboB4+3mY8mmUQPxEbF+sBUI56OyC1PDfoL7U2XELFQ+3asU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/393
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_335_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_335_92_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ANS2KTPZZMVoo5iU7yD/xcVw6OvP9owzjsxzQair76vyH6k75ML4RN4gAOSSdia1PPOFMpUJv5PMDkWE8wP3tFN+KdTRERHLCyHb5jK7lKE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/392
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_341_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_341_95_C_bill.pdf
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SB 345 Skinner, D 
 

Health care 
services: 
legally 
protected 
health care 
activities. 

09/27/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/27/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
260, 
Statutes of 
2023. 

09/27/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Would prohibit a healing arts board, as defined, from denying an application for a license or 
imposing discipline upon a licensee or health care practitioner on the basis of a civil judgment, 
criminal conviction, or disciplinary action in another state if that judgment, conviction, or 
disciplinary action is based solely on the application of another state's law that interferes with a 
person's right to receive sensitive services, as defined, that would be lawful if provided in this 
state, regardless of the patient's location. The bill would further provide that the performance, 
recommendation, or provision of a legally protected health care activity by a licensee or health 
care practitioner acting within their scope of practice for a patient who resides in a state in which 
the performance, recommendation, or provision of that legally protected health care activity is 
illegal, does not, by itself, constitute professional misconduct, upon which discipline or other 
penalty may be taken. In this connection, the bill would define a "legally protected health care 
activity" to mean specified acts, including, among others, the exercise and enjoyment, or 
attempted exercise and enjoyment, by a person of rights related to reproductive health care 
services or gender-affirming health care services secured by the Constitution or laws of this state 
or the provision of by a health care service plan contract or a policy, or a certificate of health 
insurance, that provides for those services.    (Based on  09/27/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 346 Ochoa Bogh, 
R 
 

Gambling 
Control Act. 

02/07/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
G.O. on 
5/18/2023) 

07/02/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Gambling Control Act establishes the California Gambling Control Commission, which is 
responsible for licensing and regulating various gambling activities and establishments. Current 
law requires the commission to maintain a public record of every vote at its principal office. This bill 
would additionally require the commission to post a public record of every vote on the 
commission’s internet website no later than the close of business on the 2nd business day after 
the meeting at which the vote was taken.    (Based on  02/07/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 352 Padilla, D 
 

California 
Workforce 
Development 
Board: 
minimum wage 
and housing. 

03/29/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would require the California Workforce Development Board, in conjunction with the Secretary of 
Labor and Workforce Development and the Director of Housing and Community Development, to 
examine housing costs by county, regionally, and in the state and create a formula to ascertain 
how much a household with at least one full-time minimum wage worker must earn to reasonably 
afford a decent standard of living, including appropriate housing and basic expenses, including 
nonhousing necessities, in that county, regionally, and in the state. The bill, commencing in 2024, 
would also require the California Workforce Development Board to recommend to the Legislature 
by December 15 of each year the minimum wage for a household with at least one full-time 
minimum wage earner to afford a decent standard of living, including appropriate housing and 
basic expenses, including nonhousing necessities, in each county, regionally, and in the state and 
recommend a method to annually adjust figures to account for housing cost inflation and inflation 
broadly.    (Based on  03/29/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=9/b6IVgRCIZeeg3BAnZwb/pfGwX//O2CQuKBeG3rmOTR/4HpmbeKAhFjqpUzwfDW4IVgu0ZGPd/5IHSdHDIfQMXtz6AWkhb+707ImTQ0aQI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/260
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_345_90_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_345_90_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=k2yPX1s9e+f/ORa9PQtCmuVu22ApZTHv20o4JFHn50rkkuxkdZh6wTmr66szPX1WaR+d8UqTPMugSjrs9fYTM6JjHknDMSRWnOm8c4mDhRk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/415
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/415
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_346_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0301-0350/sb_346_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ZWhxrL2AuZkuXetPxDXFxOa/q5ocY+oiSyU3m3D/4zdH7h6sr+TnI1/qIoitXn3JFAzNegShzkCZb2/T+eEaZYxDpjxVQ4MWkwRZzVS3Jd8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/422
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_352_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_352_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_352_98_A_bill.pdf
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SB 363 Eggman, D 
 

Facilities for 
inpatient and 
residential 
mental health 
and substance 
use disorder: 
database. 

05/18/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/23/2023) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would require, by January 1, 2026, the State Department of Health Care Services, in consultation 
with the State Department of Public Health and the State Department of Social Services, and by 
conferring with specified stakeholders, to develop a real-time, internet-based database to collect, 
aggregate, and display information about beds in specified types of facilities, such as chemical 
dependency recovery hospitals, acute psychiatric hospitals, and mental health rehabilitation 
centers, among others, to identify the availability of inpatient and residential mental health or 
substance use disorder treatment. The bill would require the database to include a minimum of 
specific information, including the contact information for a facility’s designated employee, the 
types of diagnoses or treatments for which the bed is appropriate, and the target populations 
served at the facility, and have the capacity to, among other things, enable searches to identify 
beds that are appropriate for individuals in need of inpatient or residential mental health or 
substance use disorder treatment.    (Based on  05/18/2023 text) 

BCM Support SB 
363_28Feb23 

Monitor 

SB 368 Portantino, D 
 

Firearms: 
requirements 
for licensed 
dealers. 

09/26/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/26/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
251, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

09/26/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Would require a licensed firearms dealer, as specified, to accept for storage a firearm transferred 
by an individual to prevent it from being accessed or used during periods of crisis or heightened 
risk to the owner of the firearm or members of their household. The bill would also authorize a 
licensed firearms dealer to accept for storage a firearm for a lawful purpose not otherwise stated in 
the law. The bill would make these provisions subject to certain conditions and would establish a 
procedure for the return of a firearm to the original transferor, including situations when a dealer 
cannot legally return a firearm. A violation of various provisions involving the transfer of firearms is 
a crime. By changing the scope of these offenses, this bill would impose a state-mandated local 
program. The bill would authorize a firearms dealer to charge a reasonable fee, as specified, for 
the storage of a firearm pursuant to these provisions. The bill would also state that it has no affect 
on the liability under existing law, if any, of a firearms dealer who returns a stored firearm to its 
owner, as specified.   (Based on  09/26/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 377 Skinner, D 
 

Firearms. 05/18/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/1/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law prohibits a firearms dealer from delivering a firearm within 10 days after the application 
to purchase or after notice by the Department of Justice that the applicant is not ineligible to 
possess a firearm, as specified, whichever is later. Existing law exempts from this prohibition the 
delivery of a firearm to a full-time paid peace officer, as defined, with written authorization from the 
head of the officer’s employing agency. Current law also exempts from this prohibition the delivery 
of a firearm to another dealer, the delivery of a firearm to a person possessing a special weapons 
permit issued by the Department of Justice, or the delivery of a firearm that is a curio or relic, as 
defined. This bill would remove the 10-day waiting period exemption for a peace officer and 
instead exempt the delivery of a firearm purchased by a law enforcement agency, as defined, to 
an authorized law enforcement representative of that law enforcement agency for exclusive use by 
that agency if written authorization, as defined, from the head of the agency authorizing the 
delivery is presented to the person making the delivery.   (Based on  05/18/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=0IPiu5EYvp/30jwLkWK19vpihVmrgR1wIGQSp266yAw7zY/VpfnF9p4SzP8wLCn8BotNd5Ln+IfcxIwZXK5Apbyaf5/Oac2IG6e0ZHjECHk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/391
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_363_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_363_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_363_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=83D05C4C-84E7-426F-8155-40193D305BC9
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=83D05C4C-84E7-426F-8155-40193D305BC9
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=CWF9CE9HSXaSdGjWBFgwW/+x4IjM9L4SJ1Ub1eJrb92J8NJQzTWbnZhgSXzj3ZVWRMHOSGJ6joI0cN/D0WisQ5eGtoyVYpVkSLxbwe+MNxw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/262
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_368_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_368_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=xtttq/sbVJcAgwhaIP2jLejXdmMdjLwjYlS+aHpWchUwefM5F5rvMlGkmmhcxIaKN78urv7KHo7SV/lx8UuytQZV5h57BCgvMOONp58GX3Y=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/260
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_377_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_377_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_377_97_A_bill.pdf
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SB 389 Allen, D 
 

State Water 
Resources 
Control Board: 
investigation of 
water right. 

10/08/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
486, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/08/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law provides generally for the appropriation of water. Existing law authorizes the State 
Water Resources Control Board to investigate bodies of water, to take testimony in regard to the 
rights to water or the use of water, and to ascertain whether or not water is appropriated lawfully, 
as provided. Under current law, the diversion or use of water other than as authorized by specified 
provisions of law is a trespass, subject to specified civil liability. This bill would instead authorize 
the board to investigate and ascertain whether or not a water right is valid. The bill would authorize 
the board to issue an information order in furtherance of an investigation, as executed by the 
executive director of the board, as specified. The bill would authorize a diversion or use of water 
ascertained to be unauthorized to be enforced as a trespass, as specified.   (Based 
on  10/08/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 393 Glazer, D 
 

Civil actions: 
housing 
development 
projects. 

09/19/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/19/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
285, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/19/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law provides that in a civil action brought by a plaintiff to challenge a housing development 
project that meets or exceeds the requirements for low- or moderate-income housing, a defendant 
may seek an order requiring the plaintiff to furnish an undertaking as security for costs and 
damages that may be incurred by the defendant if the bringing of the action or seeking by the 
plaintiff of particular relief, including injunctive relief, would result in a delay in carrying out the 
development project. Current law requires this motion to be made on the grounds that (1) the 
action was brought in bad faith, vexatiously, to delay or thwart the low- or moderate-income nature 
of the housing development project and (2) the plaintiff will not suffer undue economic hardship by 
filing the undertaking. If the court determines, after hearing, that the grounds for the motion have 
been established, existing law requires the court to order the plaintiff to file an undertaking that 
may not exceed $500,000 as security for the defendant’s costs and damages. This bill would 
require the motion described above to be made on the grounds that the action is without merit and 
that the action was brought in bad faith, vexatiously, for the purpose of delay, or to thwart the low- 
or moderate-income nature of the housing development project. The bill would permit the plaintiff, 
in responding to the motion, to seek to limit the amount of the undertaking by presenting evidence 
that filing the undertaking will cause the plaintiff to suffer undue economic hardship.   (Based 
on  09/19/2024 text) 

SB 393 
SUPPORT_11Ap
ril23 

Support 

SB 395 Wahab, D 
 

Leases: notice 
of termination 
or rent 
increase: 
statewide 
database. 

04/10/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law specifies various terms and conditions that apply to all persons who hire dwelling units 
located within this state, including tenants, lessees, boarders, lodgers, and others. Current law 
regulates evictions and provides that a tenant who remains in possession of a property after the 
term of the tenant’s lease expires, or who fails to pay rent, is guilty of unlawful detainer. This bill 
would, beginning January 1, 2025, require a landlord to file with the office of the Secretary of State 
a copy of any notice of termination or notice of rent increase within 10 days of serving the notice 
on the tenant, subject to specified requirements. The bill would make failure to file the notice an 
affirmative defense to a cause of action for unlawful detainer.    (Based on  04/10/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=yAo9T/32iceZ66GGNKIbYO3yjgOw5oA8jMgGMf6Lzmhre5wRQO8IFpoMoF6S7Yy2ABsQkw4Lls0tHK9or0uR0wozCaVEfR57PKd/hLENhBQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/339
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_389_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_389_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=WCFGHXlaqINPjEJltyFqM7ZlnOpJVFBXGaMO7RVe+o1BpVMx+cBP9zc28c0IZQzHKVSRHjoRzdD5fnAo+eoakUGmkpzyNoqba+eDxjmeyGI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/462
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_393_90_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_393_90_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=81211BEB-07BE-4ACA-92FB-E40CAFB6674C
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=81211BEB-07BE-4ACA-92FB-E40CAFB6674C
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=81211BEB-07BE-4ACA-92FB-E40CAFB6674C
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=hfjzhTixc8V20fq9u23DBuRBV7Wx6xVnqqjRZqHjpTi+yuG6AhDkAGHB5V3UaEBTg2lnpi2zZQZSdNC95fFyTGuGYoICdA71lj9IwV7lodU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/420
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_395_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_395_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_395_97_A_bill.pdf
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SB 396 Wahab, D 
 

Local 
government: 
excavations: 
notice. 

02/09/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law imposes various duties on local agencies relating to construction and property within 
its jurisdiction, including by requiring local agencies with jurisdiction to approve excavations to 
allow microtrenching, as defined, for the installation of underground fiber if the installation in the 
microtrench is limited to fiber, except as provided. Current law requires, during the project planning 
phase of certain department-led construction projects, the Department of Transportation to notify 
companies and organizations working on broadband deployment of the project on its internet 
website to encourage collaborative broadband installations. This bill would require, prior to 
commencing any local agency-led excavation projects, as defined, a city, county, or city and 
county to notify interested parties of the project on its internet website to encourage collaborative 
installations of important utilities and infrastructure, including, but not limited to, fiber optic cable, 
undergrounding utilities, or other important services.    (Based on  02/09/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 397 Wahab, D 
 

San Francisco 
Bay area: 
public 
transportation. 

01/03/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law creates the Metropolitan Transportation Commission as a local area planning agency 
for the 9-county San Francisco Bay area with comprehensive regional transportation planning and 
other related responsibilities. Current law establishes the Transportation Agency, consisting of 
various state agencies under the supervision of an executive officer known as the Secretary of 
Transportation, who is required to develop and report to the Governor on legislative, budgetary, 
and administrative programs to accomplish comprehensive, long-range, and coordinated planning 
and policy formulation in the matters of public interest related to the agency. This bill would require 
the Transportation Agency to develop a plan to consolidate all transit agencies, as defined, that 
are located within the geographic jurisdiction of the Metropolitan Transportation 
Commission.   (Based on  01/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 399 Wahab, D 
 

Employer 
communication
s: intimidation. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
670, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/27/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The Alatorre-Zenovich-Dunlap-Berman Agricultural Labor Relations Act of 1975 provides that it is 
the policy of the state to encourage and protect the right of agricultural employees to full freedom 
of association, self-organization, and designation of representatives of their own choosing to 
negotiate the terms and conditions of their employment, and to be free from the interference, 
restraint, or coercion of employers of labor, or their agents, in the designation of such 
representatives, self-organization, or other concerted activities for the purpose of collective 
bargaining or other mutual aid or protection. Other existing law relating to employment prohibits 
employers from making, adopting, or enforcing rules, regulations, or policies that forbid or prevent 
employees from engaging or participating in politics or from becoming candidates for public office, 
and from controlling or directing, or tending to control or direct, the political activities or affiliations 
of employees. This bill, except as specified, would prohibit an employer from subjecting, or 
threatening to subject, an employee to discharge, discrimination, retaliation, or any other adverse 
action because the employee declines to attend an employer-sponsored meeting or affirmatively 
declines to participate in, receive, or listen to any communications with the employer or its agents 
or representatives, the purpose of which is to communicate the employer’s opinion about religious 
or political matters and would require an employee who refuses to attend a meeting as described 
to continue to be paid, as specified. The bill would impose a civil penalty of $500 on an employer 
who violates these provisions.   (Based on  09/27/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=vZvH7byO4sb0A0VII7t65n0q0b6BbZ11q8EawMjiT20kReRvaiqgA8953Ue3Y5mUXUpBLfdmZh/MpoYqDuPfXb7ELpxKU0ftyOMPiBzntss=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/420
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_396_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_396_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Xxt4LKPTwwgsCxxP7rPDZST7flYQKpn3zTneyvU2auyDwMmGbfR66UA4NrR15dNKadVFl4A83yea9+BBHjGNlawch/rOPEeG2rhbgwXOmh0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/420
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_397_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_397_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_397_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Qj2YI3sfsDRZpxSMtTqv8L9dXLZdIe4GjmfUhFF4ixP1CsVsfua/rGQJTPGJVINJqQZV7bW/6FxzIEuLzDFX4qSeIiw830k6/RP51DOhVfA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/420
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_399_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_399_95_C_bill.pdf


Attachment B: 2023-2024 Intergovernmental Relations Priority State Legislation Log 
 

Last Updated 12/06/24        167 
 

Measure Author Topic Current 
Text 

Status Location Brief Summary Attachments Position 

SB 400 Wahab, D 
 

Peace officers: 
confidentiality 
of records. 

02/29/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

02/29/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 3, 
Statutes of 
2024 

02/29/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The California Public Records Act generally requires public records to be open for inspection by 
the public. Current law provides numerous exceptions to this requirement. Under current law, the 
personnel records of peace officers and custodial officers are confidential and not subject to public 
inspection. Current law provides certain exemptions to this confidentiality, including the reports, 
investigations, and findings of certain incidents involving the use of force by a peace officer. This 
bill would clarify that this confidentiality does not prohibit an agency that formerly employed a 
peace officer or custodial officer from disclosing the termination for cause of that officer, as 
specified.    (Based on  02/29/2024 text) 

 Sponsor 

SB 402 Wahab, D 
 

Involuntary 
commitment. 

07/03/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/7/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Lanterman-Petris-Short Act authorizes the involuntary commitment and treatment of persons 
with specified mental disorders. Under the act, when a person, as a result of a mental health 
disorder, is a danger to self or others, or gravely disabled, the person may, upon probable cause, 
be taken into custody by specified individuals, including, among others, by peace officers and 
designated members of a mobile crisis team, and placed in a facility designated by the county and 
approved by the State Department of Health Care Services for up to 72 hours for evaluation and 
treatment. This bill would additionally authorize, until January 1, 2030, a person to be taken into 
custody, pursuant to those provisions, by a licensed mental health professional, as defined. The 
bill would require a licensed mental health professional who is not direct staff of, or contracted by, 
a county to complete a specified training prior to exercising that authority and would prohibit those 
licensed mental health professionals from transporting a person taken into custody pursuant to the 
above-described provisions unless specifically authorized by the county to do so.   (Based 
on  07/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 405 Cortese, D 
 

Planning and 
zoning: housing 
element: 
inventory of 
sites: regional 
housing need. 

04/26/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The Planning and Zoning Law requires each county and each city to adopt a comprehensive, long-
term general plan for the physical development of the county or city, and specified land outside its 
boundaries, that includes specified mandatory elements, including a housing element. Current law 
also establishes a planning agency in each city and each county with the powers necessary to 
carry out the Planning and Zoning Law. Current law requires the housing element to include, 
among other things, an inventory of land suitable and available for residential development. For a 
housing element or amendment adopted on or after January 1, 2021, existing law requires the 
planning agency to submit to the Department of Housing and Community Development an 
electronic copy of its inventory, as specified. Existing law requires a county or city to submit each 
revision or amendment of its housing element to the department promptly following adoption of the 
revision or amendment and requires the department, within 90 days, to review the adopted 
housing element or amendment and report its findings to the planning agency. This bill would 
expand the requirement to submit an electronic copy of the above-described inventory to the 
department to additionally require the planning agency to submit a housing element or amendment 
prepared on or after January 1, 2021.   (Based on  04/26/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=prehl+fRuWEbvdZUQ6yG78U5cNchtSR3rweFVNNnNs+fC4CJ7EoAgQnLt+I1flgGpfIL1QW4aBZrWJY+NhRIoucrNiYerOANpHBQuV9xB4s=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/420
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_400_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0351-0400/sb_400_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=YwUi0mFGt4KYz1XDK/yAnqcHCcepIslES8FySxJkjUHJ4OHjpwZsg9e6yyO5AlPLkIJLUC0VaJ937lPOTYtM4opDp/DpCZ0VpqbpxRwX3fs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/420
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_402_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_402_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_402_95_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=S/fHzSudhr2dzwLKs/05MFjrW3TI05hK4kfuuMwpZTZxTfInKsEP6LPvopulKv+yRsgrYHWvFZDbaj55AxPYw+KKmAfEKXslpu9Llhm6ByI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/393
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_405_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_405_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_405_98_A_bill.pdf
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SB 406 Cortese, D 
 

California 
Environmental 
Quality Act: 
exemption: 
financial 
assistance: 
residential 
housing. 

09/01/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/01/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
150, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

08/22/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) requires a lead agency to prepare a mitigated 
negative declaration for a project that may have a significant effect on the environment if revisions 
in the project would avoid or mitigate that effect and there is no substantial evidence that the 
project, as revised, would have a significant effect on the environment. CEQA exempts for its 
requirements actions taken by the Department of Housing and Community Development or the 
California Housing Finance Agency to provide financial assistance or insurance for the 
development and construction of residential housing, as provided. This bill would extend the above 
exemption to actions taken by a local agency not acting as the lead agency to provide financial 
assistance or insurance for the development and construction of residential housing, as 
provided.   (Based on  09/01/2023 text) 

SB 
406_SUPPORT2
6May23 

Support 

SB 410 Becker, D 
 

Powering Up 
Californians 
Act. 

10/07/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/07/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
394, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/07/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law requires the State Energy Resources Conservation and Development Commission 
(Energy Commission), in collaboration with the State Air Resources Board, the Public Utilities 
Commission (PUC), and other relevant stakeholders, to annually gather from state agencies, as 
provided, specified entities’ fleet data for on-road and off-road vehicles in the medium- and heavy-
duty sectors and share that data with electrical corporations to help inform electrical grid planning 
efforts, as specified. Current law requires electrical corporations, as part of their distribution 
planning processes, to consider that produced fleet data, and other available data, to facilitate the 
readiness of their distribution systems to support the state’s anticipated level of electric vehicle 
charging, as specified. This bill, the Powering Up Californians Act, would require the PUC to 
establish, on or before September 30, 2024, reasonable average and maximum target 
energization time periods, as defined, and a procedure for customers to report energization delays 
to the PUC, as provided. The bill would require the PUC to require the electrical corporation to 
take remedial actions necessary to achieve the PUC’s targets and would require all reports to be 
publicly available, among other reporting requirements.    (Based on  10/07/2023 text) 

SB 410 - 
Support_04.07.2
3.pdf 
SB 410 - 
Support_06.21.2
3.pdf 

Support 

SB 411 Portantino, D 
 

Open 
meetings: 
teleconference
s: 
neighborhood 
councils. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
605, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/09/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Would, until January 1, 2026, authorize an eligible legislative body to use alternate 
teleconferencing provisions related to notice, agenda, and public participation, as prescribed, if the 
city council has adopted an authorizing resolution and 2/3 of an eligible legislative body votes to 
use the alternate teleconferencing provisions. The bill would define “eligible legislative body” for 
this purpose to mean a neighborhood council that is an advisory body with the purpose to promote 
more citizen participation in government and make government more responsive to local needs 
that is established pursuant to the charter of a city with a population of more than 3,000,000 
people that is subject to the act. The bill would require an eligible legislative body authorized under 
the bill to provide publicly accessible physical locations for public participation, as prescribed. The 
bill would also require that at least a quorum of the members of the neighborhood council 
participate from locations within the boundaries of the city in which the neighborhood council is 
established. The bill would require that, at least once per year, at least a quorum of the members 
of the eligible legislative body participate in person from a singular physical location that is open to 
the public and within the boundaries of the eligible legislative body.    (Based on  10/08/2023 text) 

SB 411 
Support_30Marc
h23 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=rewxCeUBGst6IvhMRxS6Jc8ENerx7OpZhm0Ys3y3rh9s/afgs07H0g9D3KGzBLU4NxLVW6oHqWBVx5gflsRwqnJ7YLcH0t+6Spro5y84PTk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/393
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_406_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_406_96_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=23B2C009-A4DC-4CAE-BEC5-A996C2738642
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=23B2C009-A4DC-4CAE-BEC5-A996C2738642
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=23B2C009-A4DC-4CAE-BEC5-A996C2738642
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=GhaduAInUv+CyyFUQU/B2UGmmFayGuhzjhLdYA6QHcGLBgQdhggb1YiyzdVsV02ZB0vEzK+5UNcGwvdM6VBIzHClOfrFNOlIOjIkf/MUt4w=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/392
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_410_90_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_410_90_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=8AFAACDF-E2F2-4A9F-8AD5-A0941A9807A0
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=8AFAACDF-E2F2-4A9F-8AD5-A0941A9807A0
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=8AFAACDF-E2F2-4A9F-8AD5-A0941A9807A0
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=B786499E-4935-461C-AE77-425C06F0D94B
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=B786499E-4935-461C-AE77-425C06F0D94B
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=B786499E-4935-461C-AE77-425C06F0D94B
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=eEiNU2VfNS8fIWKoRumlXvhQEwsphHwa+dpX0/Gx818Ob/w1fFdlM/VRzqT7YrkDs4RPxcOM94MBK4/+r0ikptXjBwRhdP7KScnxLZVysN4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/262
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_411_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_411_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=B52A9673-01A9-4C42-B805-05239C5F9327
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=B52A9673-01A9-4C42-B805-05239C5F9327
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=B52A9673-01A9-4C42-B805-05239C5F9327
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SB 420 Becker, D 
 

Electricity: 
electrical 
transmission 
facility projects. 

10/07/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

01/25/2024 - 
Stricken 
from file. 
Veto 
sustained.  

10/07/2023 - 
Senate  VETO
ED 

Current law vests the Public Utilities Commission (PUC) with regulatory authority over public 
utilities, including electrical corporations, while local publicly owned electric utilities are under the 
direction of their governing boards. Existing law, implemented by the PUC through a general order, 
generally prohibits an electrical corporation from beginning the construction of a line, plant, or 
system, or of any extension thereof, without having first obtained from the commission a certificate 
that the present or future public convenience and necessity require or will require its construction, 
as specified. However, current law exempts the extension, expansion, upgrade, or other 
modification of an existing electrical transmission facility, including transmission lines and 
substations, from that certification requirement. This bill would additionally exempt the rebuilding of 
an existing electrical transmission facility from that requirement, and would provide that the 
construction of a new electrical transmission facility, or the extension, expansion, upgrade, 
rebuilding, or other modification of an electrical transmission facility, including lines and 
substations, by an electrical corporation serving 10,000 or more retail customers does not require 
that certification, a permit to construct, or any other discretionary permit from the commission, if 
the new or modified electrical transmission facility meets certain requirements.    (Based 
on  09/18/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 422 Portantino, D 
 

Unemployment 
compensation: 
motion picture 
industry: loan-
out companies. 

09/30/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/30/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
1011, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/30/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law establishes the Employment Development Department, administered by the Director 
of Employment Development who is vested with certain duties relating to unemployment 
compensation. Current unemployment insurance law requires any employing unit that is a motion 
picture payroll services company, as defined, to be treated as an employer of a motion picture 
production worker, as defined, and to file a statement of intent with the Employment Development 
Department. Current law makes specified violations of unemployment insurance law a 
misdemeanor. This bill would specify that a loan-out company is the employer of its employee-
owners or members who are engaged to provide services to a motion picture production company 
or to an allied motion picture services company for purposes of remitting employment taxes and 
related obligations, as specified. The bill would prohibit a loan-out company or an individual whose 
services are provided by a loan-out company from being considered an employee of a motion 
picture payroll services company. The bill would require a motion picture payroll services company 
to file a quarterly report with the Director of Employment Development relating to payments made 
to a loan-out company, as specified. The bill would define “loan-out company” for these 
purposes.   (Based on  09/30/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=RgyMxYmeO0qk2MEiY9g1flT6J5r2kJtfU9FRDf0+RLbCuOu3Un/F5TErJytNcYIR513exNULCfxgpDAMK+GrDdRjzc6PoY8fhrAYkwEy9O8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/392
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_420_90_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_420_90_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_420_90_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=apm+ec6QC6HomxQYun53031YztjP/alO+b5tGuZQfkpCqk1wwjxeWNbBvLDDnyjW90oAQCjQhGx0zqnMGC9qFhsb3rH7zB+bvTVNLBWEU24=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/262
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_422_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_422_95_C_bill.pdf
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SB 423 Wiener, D 
 

Land use: 
streamlined 
housing 
approvals: 
multifamily 
housing 
developments. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
778, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Would authorize the Department of General Services to act in the place of a locality or local 
government, at the discretion of that department, for purposes of the ministerial, streamlined 
review for development in compliance with the specified-described requirements on property 
owned by or leased to the state. The bill would extend the operation of the streamlined, ministerial 
approval process to January 1, 2036. The bill would provide that the streamlined, ministerial 
approval process does not apply to applications for developments proposed on qualified sites, 
defined as a site that is located within an equine or equestrian district and meets certain other 
requirements, that are submitted on or after January 1, 2024, but before July 1, 2025. This bill 
would modify the specified-described objective planning standards, including by revising the 
standard that prohibits a multifamily housing development from being subject to the streamlined, 
ministerial approval process if the development is located in a coastal zone to apply only if the 
development located in the coastal zone meets any one of specified conditions. The bill would 
require that a development located in a coastal zone that satisfies the specified conditions obtain a 
coastal development permit. The bill would require a local government to approve a coastal 
development permit if it determines that the development is consistent with all objective standards 
of the local government’s certified local coastal program, as specified. The bill would provide that 
the changes made by this act would apply in a coastal zone on or after January 1, 2025 This bill 
would modify the objective planning standard that prohibits a development subject to the 
streamlined, ministerial approval process from being located in a high fire severity zone by deleting 
the prohibition for a development to be located within a high or very high fire hazard severity zone 
as indicated on maps adopted by the Department of Forestry and Fire Protection, and would 
instead prohibit a development from being located with the state responsibility area, as defined, 
unless the site has adopted specified standards. The bill would also remove an exception for sites 
excluded from specified hazard zones by a local agency, as specified.   (Based on  10/11/2023 
text) 

 Monitor 

SB 428 Blakespear, D 
 

Temporary 
restraining 
orders and 
protective 
orders: 
employee 
harassment. 

09/30/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/30/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
286, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

09/30/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law authorizes any employer, whose employee has suffered unlawful violence or a 
credible threat of violence from any individual that can reasonably be construed to be carried out 
or to have been carried out at the workplace, to seek a temporary restraining order and an 
injunction on behalf of the employee and other employees of the employer. Current law requires 
an employer seeking a temporary restraining order to show reasonable proof that an employee 
has suffered unlawful violence or a credible threat of violence and that a great or irreparable harm 
would result to an employee if the order is not issued. Current law prohibits issuing such an order 
to the extent that the order would prohibit constitutionally protected speech, specified activities 
related to dispute resolution between employers and employee organizations, or other law. This 
bill would additionally authorize any employer whose employee has suffered harassment, as 
defined, to seek a temporary restraining order and an injunction on behalf of the employee and 
other employees upon a showing of clear and convincing evidence that an employee has suffered 
harassment, that great or irreparable harm would result to an employee, and that the respondent’s 
course of conduct served no legitimate purpose.    (Based on  09/30/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=+Lkc29g21aaDmtrQkyiYKvnVoRrGq/WP9ETGyOPg1AMHk8kpZp/tQfbDlRnA4l4SQFSmQK10olwqCXjzmxB1+gvVwF4SbmrEcxsSde6iAfY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/257
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_423_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_423_91_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=8CzQHCqZDpRIkkf1Mqgxmo6z2HtEkWsXDuC1SH1LsCJX1WQ41EfqGZczesxP4Et6o8CMuXEP/y/QiaomtyDJmLO/pRO43rzrfWU6PLZkfog=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/342
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_428_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_428_92_C_bill.pdf
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SB 439 Skinner, D 
 

Special 
motions to 
strike: priority 
housing 
development 
projects. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
779, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law permits any party to file a notice of motion and motion to strike the whole or any part of 
a pleading. Under current law, a party may file with the trial court a special motion to strike a cause 
of action against a person arising from any act of that person in furtherance of the person’s right of 
petition or free speech under the United States Constitution or the California Constitution in 
connection with a public issue. This bill would permit a party to file with the trial court a special 
motion to strike the whole or any part of a pleading in all civil actions brought by any plaintiff to 
challenge the approval or permitting of a priority housing development project, as defined. The bill 
would require the trial court to deny the motion to strike if it determines that the plaintiff has 
established that there is a probability that the plaintiff will prevail on the claim. The bill would entitle 
a prevailing defendant on a special motion to strike to recover their attorney’s fees and costs, 
except as specified. Except as specified, the bill would require the filing of a special motion to 
strike within 60 days of the service of the complaint, or in the court’s discretion, at any later time 
the court deems proper. The bill would provide that if the court determines the administrative 
record is required for its decision, the moving party may, notwithstanding the filing deadlines 
above, file the special motion to strike within 60 days of the service of the administrative record or, 
in the court’s discretion, at any later time the court deems proper.   (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

SB439_SUPPOR
T26May23 

Support 

SB 440 Skinner, D 
 

Regional 
Housing 
Finance 
Authorities. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
767, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/27/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The San Francisco Bay Area Regional Housing Finance Act establishes the Bay Area Housing 
Finance Authority to raise, administer, and allocate funding for affordable housing in the San 
Francisco Bay area, as defined, and provide technical assistance at a regional level for tenant 
protection, affordable housing preservation, and new affordable housing production. The Los 
Angeles County Regional Housing Finance Act similarly establishes the Los Angeles County 
Affordable Housing Solutions Agency to increase the supply of affordable housing in Los Angeles 
County, as specified. This bill, the Regional Housing Finance Act, would authorize 2 or more local 
governments, as defined, to establish a regional housing finance authority to raise, administer, and 
allocate funding for affordable housing in the jurisdiction of the authority, as defined, and provide 
technical assistance at a regional level for affordable housing development, including new 
construction and the preservation of existing housing to serve a range of incomes and housing 
types. The bill would require an authority to be governed by a board composed of at least 3 
directors who are elected officials representing the local governments that are members of the 
authority.   (Based on  09/27/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=DKAaBcU1fmRAXA8SUODaIzgaUtIuNpib/IjJ1n6tejP+Fwd9L5bjMdwa5Ezy/OJg70IHoenUUHw264wF7HS+n1ilPr+B/omy7NqMhKD6itA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/260
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_439_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_439_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=42726867-7D83-4A8A-AB90-F1D12687C6C2
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=42726867-7D83-4A8A-AB90-F1D12687C6C2
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=mmKD9VKUA72cYVCJE/eYiCuZ+KIGWUQqqIhce7Cppl3ur8IKD6JLEc7xfZZWyUjOe6gtpcr3bpRVA4goP2X6j2EEYYhoLkAq1SIHB4BKThE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/260
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_440_90_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_440_90_C_bill.pdf


Attachment B: Intergovernmental Relations Priority State Legislation Log 
 

Last Updated 12/06/24        172 
 

Measure Author Topic Current 
Text 

Status Location Brief Summary Attachments Position 

SB 450 Atkins, D 
 

Housing 
development: 
approvals. 

09/19/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/19/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
286, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/19/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The Planning and Zoning law requires a proposed housing development containing no more than 
2 residential units within a single-family residential zone to be considered ministerially, without 
discretionary review or hearing, if the proposed housing development meets certain requirements, 
including that the proposed housing development does not allow for the demolition of more than 
25% of the existing exterior structural walls, except as provided. Current law authorizes a local 
agency to impose objective zoning standards, objective subdivision standards, and objective 
design standards, as defined, except as specified, on the proposed housing development. Current 
law authorizes a local agency to deny a proposed housing development if specified conditions are 
met, including that the building official makes a written finding that the proposed housing 
development project would have a specific, adverse impact upon public health and safety or the 
physical environment, as provided. This bill would remove the requirement that a proposed 
housing development does not allow for the demolition of more than 25% of the existing exterior 
structural walls to be considered ministerially. The bill would prohibit a local agency from imposing 
objective zoning standards, objective subdivision standards, and objective design standards that 
do not apply uniformly to development within the underlying zone, but would specify that these 
provisions do not prohibit a local agency from adopting or imposing objective zoning standards, 
objective subdivision standards, and objective design standards on the development if the 
standards are more permissive than applicable standards within the underlying zone. The bill 
would remove the authorization for a local agency to deny a proposed housing development if the 
building official makes a written finding that the proposed housing development project would have 
a specific, adverse impact upon the physical environment. The bill would require the local agency 
to consider and approve or deny the proposed housing development application within 60 days 
from the date the local agency receives the completed application, and would deem the application 
approved after that time.   (Based on  09/19/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 461 Wahab, D 
 

Days and hours 
of work: 
religious or 
cultural 
observance. 

10/07/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/07/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
398, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/07/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law authorizes a state department head or designee to require a state employee to 
provide 5 working days’ advance notice before a personal holiday is taken, to deny use subject to 
operational needs, and to provide by rule for the granting of the personal holiday for employees. 
Current law authorizes a state employee to elect to receive 8 hours of holiday credit for certain 
holidays in lieu of receiving 8 hours of personal holiday credit, as specified. This bill would 
authorize an employee to elect to receive 8 hours of holiday credit for observance of a holiday or 
ceremony of the state employee’s religion, culture, or heritage in lieu of receiving 8 hours of 
personal holiday credit.    (Based on  10/07/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=L0IA0Oyds459/aHDlSQFTX8hdzA7gMaMDBoE2juleLYYqHyrPjf/j8tKdUkUcbub18Epa8f6WlrTYcr1tE+Zpn6A23Tn1g0Mmgan7HQ4aN0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/399
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_450_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0401-0450/sb_450_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=7Ii3tPufyHzvbcK8pXzD4yJ13Eqxh2d9gbUd5OKXUYd6E141epF72Q4GukzFakqVNUkFg+VF4dpSHtCp0etGSdQG0cJdKJDWcaQ/izwJqow=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/420
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0451-0500/sb_461_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0451-0500/sb_461_93_C_bill.pdf
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SB 466 Wahab, D 
 

Costa-Hawkins 
Rental Housing 
Act: rental 
rates. 

05/15/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Died on file 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

02/01/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The Costa-Hawkins Rental Housing Act prescribes statewide limits on the application of local rent 
control with regard to certain properties. The act generally authorizes an owner of residential real 
property to establish the initial rental rate for a dwelling or unit, except in specified circumstances, 
including, (1) when the residential real property has a certificate of occupancy issued after 
February 1, 1995, (2) when the residential real property has already been exempt from the 
residential rent control ordinance of a public entity on or before February 1, 1995, pursuant to a 
local exemption for newly constructed units, and (3) when the residential real property is alienable 
and separate from title to any other dwelling units, except as specified. This bill would instead 
authorize an owner of residential real property to establish the initial rental rate for a dwelling or 
unit when the residential real property has been issued a certificate of occupancy within the 28 
years preceding the date on which the owner seeks to establish a rental rate under these 
provisions, except as specified for dwellings or units exempt from the residential rent control 
ordinance of a public entity on or before February 1, 1995, pursuant to a local exemption for newly 
constructed units.    (Based on  05/15/2023 text) 

SB 466 
SUPPORT 
11April23 

Support 

SB 469 Allen, D 
 

Housing: 
publicly funded 
low-rent 
housing 
projects. 

09/08/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
179, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

09/08/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The California Constitution prohibits the development, construction, or acquisition in any manner of 
a low-rent housing project by any state public body, as defined, until a majority of the qualified 
electors of the city, town, or county in which it is proposed to develop, construct, or acquire the 
same, voting upon that issue, approve the project by voting in favor at an election. The California 
Constitution, for purposes of this prohibition, defines “low-rent housing project” to mean any 
development composed of urban or rural dwellings, apartments, or other living accommodations 
for persons of low income, financed in whole or in part by the federal government or a state public 
body, or to which the federal government or a state public body extends assistance by supplying 
all or part of the labor, by guaranteeing the payment of liens, or otherwise. Current law establishes 
exclusions from this definition of “low-rent housing project,” including a development that consists 
of the acquisition, rehabilitation, reconstruction, alterations work, or any combination thereof, of 
lodging facilities or dwelling units using moneys appropriated and disbursed pursuant to specified 
provisions of the Zenovich-Moscone-Chacon Housing and Home Finance Act relating to affordable 
housing preservation, rental housing development awarded funds from certain multifamily housing 
direct loan programs, and housing for individuals and families who are experiencing homelessness 
or who are at risk of homelessness and who are impacted by the COVID-19 pandemic or other 
communicable diseases. This bill would expand that exclusion to include a development that 
consists of the acquisition, rehabilitation, reconstruction, alterations work, or any combination 
thereof, of lodging facilities or dwelling units using an allocation of federal or state low-income 
housing tax credits from the California Tax Credit Allocation Committee or moneys appropriated 
and disbursed pursuant to the Zenovich-Moscone-Chacon Housing and Home Finance Act, and 
the Affordable Housing and Sustainable Communities Program, thereby excluding the 
developments that receive money from the specified funds and programs from the scope of the 
above-described constitutional provision.   (Based on  09/08/2023 text) 

SB 
469_SUPPORT1
1April23 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Si754LmvBL4DlocoZ0N0Rv4jQi+bgxgD+LTIboVTsSTe/ERmMOhMZQh75q1z7INvM08AqN9nZZraFArV1i4STuAc7hhVGGT8sFXN+T9IAbw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/420
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0451-0500/sb_466_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0451-0500/sb_466_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0451-0500/sb_466_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=2679C3B5-138E-455B-9E67-CCA0EBB0F649
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=2679C3B5-138E-455B-9E67-CCA0EBB0F649
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=2679C3B5-138E-455B-9E67-CCA0EBB0F649
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=wgRriGmjsAf99wcGW55P8oi0XrXxydSXPh3fT/p2So6WotQsk8NIrJRq2cUsytY9Wnct9xjkEN8RofHr9UD9YRJhHa+T8jZwL7UrzCtHe4s=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/339
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0451-0500/sb_469_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0451-0500/sb_469_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=9D3B3F30-0FDC-41B7-9D3C-5ECAA6FE22EA
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=9D3B3F30-0FDC-41B7-9D3C-5ECAA6FE22EA
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=9D3B3F30-0FDC-41B7-9D3C-5ECAA6FE22EA
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SB 497 Smallwood-
Cuevas, D 
 

Protected 
employee 
conduct. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
612, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/09/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law prohibits a person from discharging an employee or in any manner discriminating, 
retaliating, or taking any adverse action against any employee or applicant for employment 
because the employee or applicant engaged in protected conduct, as specified. Under current law, 
an employee who is discharged, threatened with discharge, demoted, suspended, retaliated 
against, subjected to adverse action, or in any other manner discriminated against in the terms 
and conditions of their employment because among other things, the employee engaged in 
protected conduct, as specified, the employee shall be entitled to reinstatement and 
reimbursement for lost wages and work benefits caused by those acts of the employer. This bill 
would create a rebuttable presumption in favor the employee’s claim if an employer engages in 
any action prohibited by this provision within 90 days of the protected activity specified in this 
provision.   (Based on  10/08/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 511 Blakespear, D 
 

Greenhouse 
gas emissions 
inventories. 

04/24/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/23/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The California Global Warming Solutions Act of 2006 requires the State Air Resources Board to 
prepare and approve a scoping plan for achieving the maximum technologically feasible and cost-
effective reductions in greenhouse gas emissions and to update the scoping plan at least once 
every 5 years. This bill would require the state board, before January 1, 2028, to develop, and 
publish on its internet website, a report on greenhouse gas emissions inventories for the calendar 
year 2025 for each city, county, or city and county that requests inclusion in the report, as 
provided. The bill would require the state board, consistent with the preparation of the updates to 
the scoping plan and before January 1, 2033, and every 5 years thereafter, to update the 
inventories, for each city, county, or city and county that requests inclusion in the respective 
update, for the calendar year 2030 and every 5th year thereafter. The bill would authorize the state 
board to solicit bids and enter into contracts for the development of the inventories. The bill would 
require the state board, before January 1, 2026, to establish a local government advisory 
committee to inform its development of the greenhouse gas emissions inventories.   (Based 
on  04/24/2023 text) 

SB511 - 
Support_03.22.2
3.pdf 

Support 

SB 512 Bradford, D 
 

Cannabis: 
taxation: gross 
receipts. 

05/03/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
7/10/2023) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would, beginning January 1, 2024, exclude from the terms “gross receipts” and “sales price” under 
the Sales and Use Tax Law the amount of the cannabis excise tax imposed under the Cannabis 
Tax Law and the amount of any tax imposed by a city or county on the privilege of engaging in 
commercial cannabis activity, as specified. The bill would also prohibit a city or county from 
including in the definition of gross receipts, for purposes of any local tax or fee on a licensed 
cannabis retailer the amount of any cannabis excise tax imposed under the Cannabis Tax Law or 
any sales and use taxes. By imposing new requirements on local governments with respect to 
their taxes and fees, the bill would impose a state-mandated local program.   (Based 
on  05/03/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=mtqlwCMLIqTA/WV9nYPAUE98TffdVYrkEHReBCayDTbwFwSiMVJJtzpMu/QCkDVoxTGA1jwS8pxUvdzdab3MZZKnnh/LaflfCcUNFFfenIs=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/487
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/487
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0451-0500/sb_497_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0451-0500/sb_497_96_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=FLdAQSkgLYkfipZ6hsBFoQ+kyqLb4UgUu+zcDJTqQzHrCME9H8ubqzPHWrEgSDa4Rj5DLlZ7bOZa1j95FcXDeTNfO3okflgzgyVKGInoxOE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/342
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0501-0550/sb_511_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0501-0550/sb_511_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0501-0550/sb_511_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=9DB8FDF0-65BB-4458-91F5-1A9F585D26E8
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=9DB8FDF0-65BB-4458-91F5-1A9F585D26E8
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=9DB8FDF0-65BB-4458-91F5-1A9F585D26E8
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=voGGMH9MajtxKA7Od8o3aG7p3YTJSeX9/46AYCfGK8JjIJ5+A5pHUvx2EWf3mCoK2yPkZeuybEUKSiZvhMrgaekZR9te3pH773EO+9+QzsI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/456
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0501-0550/sb_512_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0501-0550/sb_512_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0501-0550/sb_512_97_A_bill.pdf
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SB 527 Min, D 
 

Neighborhood 
Decarbonizatio
n Program. 

05/03/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law requires the State Energy Resources Conservation and Development Commission to 
establish the Equitable Building Decarbonization Program, which includes establishing the direct 
install program to fund certain projects and remediation and safety measures to facilitate the 
installation of new technologies, and a statewide incentive program for low-carbon building 
technologies, as specified. This bill would, until January 1, 2030, require the Public Utilities 
Commission, in consultation with gas corporations, to develop and supervise the administration of 
the Neighborhood Decarbonization Program to facilitate the cost-effective decarbonization of 
targeted natural gas zones with the intent to provide benefits that include, but are not limited to, 
reduced emissions of greenhouse gases and air pollution, the maintenance of reliable, safe, and 
resilient energy service, and the maintenance of rate affordability for California gas customers, and 
with the intent to decommission gas assets in zones with the highest community burdens and 
those that would result in the highest projected ratepayer cost savings. The bill would require the 
commission, in consultation with each gas corporation, to adopt guidelines and regulations for the 
program, as specified.    (Based on  05/03/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 529 Gonzalez, D 
 

Electric vehicle 
sharing 
services: 
affordable 
housing 
facilities. 

04/18/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would require the Energy Commission to create a program to award grants to facilitate electric 
vehicle sharing services, as defined, operated at affordable housing facilities, as defined. The bill 
would specify the eligible entities that may be awarded grants pursuant to the program, and would 
require those eligible entities to submit an application to the Energy Commission, as specified. The 
bill would require the Energy Commission to consider specified criteria in awarding grants and 
would require a grant recipient to only use grant funds for specified purposes to facilitate an 
electric vehicle sharing service operated at an affordable housing facility. The bill would require 
that a grant recipient, at a minimum, purchases, or commits to purchase, 2 electric vehicles and 2 
electric vehicle charging stations with Level 2 electric vehicle service equipment. The bill would 
provide that a grant recipient may be eligible to purchase up to 2 direct current fast chargers if the 
grant recipient meets specified requirements. The bill would require, as a condition of receiving a 
grant, a grant recipient to annually submit a report to the Energy Commission that includes 
specified information. The bill would require implementation of the program to be subject to an 
appropriation of funds by the Legislature for purposes of developing and implementing the 
program.   (Based on  04/18/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 532 Wiener, D 
 

Parking 
payment 
zones. 

09/28/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/28/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
858, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/28/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law allows a local authority to establish parking meter zones and fix the rate of fees for 
those zones by ordinance. Current law prohibits a local authority from requiring payment of parking 
meter fees by a mobile device, as specified. This bill would instead authorize, until January 1, 
2033, in the City and County of San Francisco, City of Long Beach, and City of Santa Monica, a 
local authority to require payment of parking fees by a mobile device, if it meets certain 
requirements, such as adopting an accessible and equitable parking cash payment plan that does 
not utilize parking meters or payment centers in parking payment zones to provide reasonably 
accessible alternative means for payment of parking fees using cash. The bill would also authorize 
the local authority in the City and County of San Francisco, City of Long Beach, and City of Santa 
Monica to operate the above-described parking zones for 5 years following the date of creation, in 
each of the respective entities, of the first mobile device parking payment zone, or until January 1, 
2033, whichever is sooner.   (Based on  09/28/2024 text) 

04.06.23 Letter 
of Support_SB 
532_.pdf 
SB 532 - SJ 
Support 
06.25.24.pdf 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=fjnmkKrPN7T+WAM9E0xSs7Sufoj/kXoS4yJiwvUviFY6i2eaAiU+ASe3pNeH1C9dzj88FRIgRt65QUFXaJaXim3+abYMK9w4YcPUBHulh9s=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/461
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0501-0550/sb_527_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0501-0550/sb_527_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0501-0550/sb_527_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=SGqqmwcT7Gvl34aaQGGn9JLxQti/H7RDk2SJl9LvBX29AHlO2trqDaIugowv8UzUc8pWvZeRwaG44gcH70Jm3jt9GQMPw8Cv0Eho2AvkO7M=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/479
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0501-0550/sb_529_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0501-0550/sb_529_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0501-0550/sb_529_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ofQSCWhpYXo4lWRF/YrhYcLx6XWp7WUbtVNgYizARVUbACdssXylxdyWNIuLhr0OUJ4B+DtH2vd73NZEyyWlx20d9Hx77D4QgZbrM09tEd0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/257
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0501-0550/sb_532_86_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0501-0550/sb_532_86_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E2FCB341-E86D-4D54-899B-486DF0CBE9C2
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E2FCB341-E86D-4D54-899B-486DF0CBE9C2
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E2FCB341-E86D-4D54-899B-486DF0CBE9C2
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=23732A78-3179-4EF4-B6AC-1F9968257DE1
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=23732A78-3179-4EF4-B6AC-1F9968257DE1
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=23732A78-3179-4EF4-B6AC-1F9968257DE1
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SB 537 Becker, D 
 

City or County 
of Los Angeles: 
memorial to 
forcibly 
deported 
Mexican 
Americans and 
Mexican 
immigrants. 

09/28/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/28/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
859, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/28/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law provides for various memorials and monuments on the grounds of the State Capitol. 
Current law requires the Department of General Services to maintain state buildings and grounds. 
Existing law, the Apology Act for the 1930s Mexican Repatriation Program, makes findings and 
declarations regarding the unconstitutional removal and coerced emigration of United States 
citizens and legal residents of Mexican descent, between the years 1929 and 1944, to Mexico 
from the United States during the 1930s “Mexican Repatriation” Program. Current law expresses 
the apology of the State of California to those individuals who were illegally deported and coerced 
into emigrating to Mexico and requires that a plaque to commemorate those individuals be 
installed and maintained by the Department of Parks and Recreation in an appropriate public place 
in the City or County of Los Angeles. This bill would authorize a nonprofit organization 
representing Mexican Americans or Mexican immigrants to enter into negotiations to plan, 
construct, and maintain a memorial to Mexican Americans and Mexican immigrants who were 
forcibly deported from the United States during the Great Depression, as provided. The bill would 
require the memorial to be located at an appropriate public place in the City or County of Los 
Angeles. The bill would require the nonprofit organization to enter into negotiations with the 
Department of General Services and the state agency with jurisdiction over the state property 
where the memorial is proposed, where applicable, if the nonprofit organization proposes to locate 
the memorial on state property.   (Based on  09/28/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 538 Portantino, D 
 

Department of 
Transportation: 
Chief Advisor 
on Bicycling 
and Active 
Transportation. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
617, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/09/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law establishes the Department of Transportation and provides that the Director of 
Transportation shall perform all duties, exercise all powers and jurisdiction, assume and discharge 
all responsibilities, and carry out and effect all purposes vested by law in the department, except 
as otherwise provided by law. This bill would require the director to appoint a Chief Advisor on 
Bicycling and Active Transportation, to serve as the department’s primary advisor on all issues 
related to bicycle transportation, safety, and infrastructure, as specified.   (Based on  10/08/2023 
text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=vfQJY25PQWA2BcVOOtwijPHF+l9y5I3Oy6bIGcWJvP4cn+4XT8ZKCy9A3jJsdW5y+WX9X2MLRPLdRj4czr/wosD9tScee/7gtTFhNOpREXU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/392
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0501-0550/sb_537_90_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0501-0550/sb_537_90_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=EfRDei1+Wktowk0Wyg6Fezd+b9eQ61WwCmDnfFIRzqB3Ken4rLfNSoX0fNUB38l6t94FySWrD3AhDjqe84ueB2zxVLXpDQthgPnz+tQjzjY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/262
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0501-0550/sb_538_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0501-0550/sb_538_96_C_bill.pdf
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SB 549 Newman, D 
 

Gaming: Tribal 
Nations Access 
to Justice Act. 

09/28/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/28/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
860, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/28/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The current federal Indian Gaming Regulatory Act of 1988 provides for the negotiation and 
execution of tribal-state gaming compacts for the purpose of authorizing certain types of gaming 
on Indian lands within a state. The California Constitution prohibits the Legislature from authorizing 
casinos of the type operating in Nevada and New Jersey and authorizes the Governor to negotiate 
and conclude tribal-state gaming compacts, subject to ratification by the Legislature. Existing law 
expressly ratifies a number of tribal-state gaming compacts between the State of California and 
specified Indian tribes. The Gambling Control Act provides for the regulation, oversight, and 
licensure of gambling establishments by the California Gambling Control Commission. Existing law 
prohibits a list of specified gambling games or any banking or percentage game played with cards, 
dice, or any device, for money, checks, credit, or any representative of value, and provides that 
any person who offers for play or participates in these games is guilty of a misdemeanor and is 
punishable as specified. Current law authorizes gambling establishments to operate controlled 
games utilizing a player-dealer position, as defined, and to contract with a third party for the 
provision of proposition player services subject to specified conditions and regulatory 
requirements. Current law generally specifies the persons or entities that may bring a civil action 
as prescribed for relief. Current law authorizes a court to grant a preliminary injunction or 
temporary restraining order at any time prior to judgment, if the verified complaint or affidavits 
provide sufficient grounds to do so and the opposing party has been given notice. This bill would 
authorize a California Indian tribe, under certain conditions, to bring an action solely against 
licensed California card clubs and third-party proposition player services providers to seek a 
declaration as to whether a controlled game operated by a licensed California card club and 
banked by a third-party proposition player services provider constitutes a banking card game that 
violates state law, including tribal gaming rights under the constitutional provisions described 
above, and to request injunctive relief. The bill would require that any review of such a challenge 
be conducted de novo. The bill would prohibit a claim for money damages, penalties, or attorney’s 
fees and would require that actions be filed no later than April 1, 2025, as specified.   (Based 
on  09/28/2024 text) 

SB 549 OPPOSE 
7Jul23.pdf 
SB 549_Oppose 
01.24.24 (1).pdf 
SB 549 OPPOSE 
05.10.24.pdf 
SB 549 - SJ 
Oppose 
08.05.24.pdf 
Governor Veto 
Request 

Oppose 

SB 553 Cortese, D 
 

Occupational 
safety: 
workplace 
violence: 
restraining 
orders and 
workplace 
violence 
prevention 
plan. 

09/30/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/30/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
289, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

09/30/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Would, commencing January 1, 2025, authorize a collective bargaining representative of an 
employee, as described, to seek a temporary restraining order and an order after hearing on 
behalf of the employee and other employees at the workplace, as described. The bill would require 
an employer or collective bargaining representative of an employee, before filing such a petition, to 
provide the employee who has suffered unlawful violence or a credible threat of violence from any 
individual an opportunity to decline to be named in the temporary restraining order. Under the bill, 
an employee’s request to not be named in the temporary restraining order would not prohibit an 
employer or collective bargaining representative from seeking a temporary restraining order on 
behalf of other employees at the workplace, and, if appropriate, other employees at other 
workplaces of the employer. The bill would make various conforming changes.    (Based 
on  09/30/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=P2ToaGhcaNw7EfVJNb9mz6byEt3ReeTCddN4RaxavNCx49VTyaI0qpY7U/eXKYJIcrR3LE2NdtkdG09VRAip+cNilGd+su5t76LqTA4vj/s=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/475
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0501-0550/sb_549_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0501-0550/sb_549_92_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=F9571312-49B9-4777-A58B-E6D59D8625F9
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=F9571312-49B9-4777-A58B-E6D59D8625F9
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=C7A0730B-F47E-4A31-9EBE-FBEDDBB1110F
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=C7A0730B-F47E-4A31-9EBE-FBEDDBB1110F
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=23D23AF9-8920-40B7-8203-C8E770A92A7E
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=23D23AF9-8920-40B7-8203-C8E770A92A7E
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=45E48FC7-0EEC-410B-B3B8-0A592AE50E53
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=45E48FC7-0EEC-410B-B3B8-0A592AE50E53
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=45E48FC7-0EEC-410B-B3B8-0A592AE50E53
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=DD15C7CA-076E-4FF6-B479-2A8156CC46D1
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=DD15C7CA-076E-4FF6-B479-2A8156CC46D1
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=IR5XS9IURdmUPutdXl9W6dzwP0nwsb+8/bARXRHZ7d4IfgXxlvslWTpD+UIa5a7jmw2mPSwKJ1eyGu1obwInXNfAZqZZx431CbZ+36LwM9c=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/393
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_553_89_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_553_89_C_bill.pdf
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SB 555 Wahab, D 
 

Stable 
Affordable 
Housing Act of 
2023. 

10/07/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/07/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
402, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/07/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law establishes various programs providing assistance for, among other things, 
emergency housing, multifamily housing, farmworker housing, homeownership for very low and 
low-income households, and downpayment assistance for first-time homebuyers. Current law 
requires the department to, on or before December 31 of each year, submit an annual report to the 
Governor and both houses of the Legislature on the operations and accomplishments during the 
previous fiscal year of the housing programs administered by the department, as prescribed. This 
bill, the Stable Affordable Housing Act of 2023, would require the department, no later than 
December 31, 2026, to complete a California Social Housing Study consisting of a comprehensive 
analysis of the opportunities, resources, obstacles, and recommendations for the creation of 
housing that is affordable, as defined, and social housing, as defined, at scale, to assist in meeting 
the need identified in the statewide projections for below market rate housing affordable to 
households with extremely low, very low, low, and moderate incomes in the 6th Regional Housing 
Needs Assessment cycle.    (Based on  10/07/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 560 Laird, D 
 

Solid waste: 
gas cylinders: 
stewardship 
program. 

03/22/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The California Integrated Waste Management Act of 1989, administered by the Department of 
Resources Recycling and Recovery, generally regulates the disposal, management, and recycling 
of solid waste. The act establishes stewardship programs for various products, including, among 
others, carpet, mattresses, and pharmaceutical and sharps waste. This bill would establish a 
stewardship program for gas cylinder products, as defined, and would authorize producers of 
those products to establish one more producer stewardship organizations for that purpose. The bill 
would require each producer or producer stewardship organization to submit a gas cylinder 
stewardship plan to the department that details, among other things, convenient and accessible 
opportunities for the recovery of gas cylinders used by consumers. The bill would prohibit gas 
cylinder producers that are not participating in a department-approved stewardship plan from 
supplying, selling, or offering for sale gas cylinders in the state.    (Based on  03/22/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 567 Durazo, D 
 

Termination of 
tenancy: no-
fault just 
causes: gross 
rental rate 
increases. 

09/30/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/30/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
290, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

09/30/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law, after a tenant has continuously and lawfully occupied a residential real property for 12 
months, prohibits the owner of the residential real property from terminating the tenancy without 
just cause and requires that just cause to be stated in the written notice to terminate tenancy. 
Current law distinguishes between at-fault just cause and no-fault just cause and defines no-fault 
just cause to mean intent to occupy the residential real property by the owner or the owner's 
spouse, domestic partner, children, grandchildren, parents, or grandparents, withdrawal of the 
residential real property from the rental market, the owner complying with specified government 
orders that necessitate vacating the real property, and intent to demolish or to substantially 
remodel the residential real property. This bill would, with respect to the no-fault just cause related 
to an eviction based on an intent to occupy the residential real property, require, among other 
things, that the owner, as defined, or the owner's spouse, domestic partner, children, 
grandchildren, parents, or grandparents occupy the residential real property for a minimum of 12 
continuous months as the person's primary residence, as provided.    (Based on  09/30/2023 text) 

Sb 567 Support 
13June23 
SB 567 GOVRFS 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=kaGQlAq4nO7B78w7fmwTYi8mOtqVNj3BMYakws3ii6o31I+ghQUnZH8AI5uYsutoOX+UzTXnPUXmVTeRzlyWdGV2VGPrqGy7JdJyZ89561Y=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/420
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_555_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_555_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=NeF4mksN6tyRAxtEFjGqmb9nwL/8qprS1Nsm6ZT/8zqhS15VLtiPNWuOTHdYJa04xXa7w6LPstU5jOEYBiOrq+xYfhE0P2i3CJblcG5YrcI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/394
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_560_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_560_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_560_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=mfSj/4fKrPYzNGhyojjrmne/9xuDOeQEQnXaAg9OWVkMf76l0mwe7zfJaXJYj7fBNslwP/i9QDQXYmRzAvk0afakNSu2tmy0g5KWd4Hslj8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/424
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_567_88_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_567_88_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=6BBFDA60-B474-4C6C-A10D-1D20485ED33A
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=6BBFDA60-B474-4C6C-A10D-1D20485ED33A
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=5E2107F1-6F65-4A49-896B-0D3BCB6CF84F
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SB 569 Glazer, D 
 

Political Reform 
Act of 1974: 
audits. 

08/28/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. on 
8/28/2023) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would transfer the responsibility for conducting audits and field investigations of lobbying reports 
to the Fair Political Practices Commission. The bill would also exclude lobbying firms and lobbyist 
employers with less than one dollar in payments or contributions from being selected for audit. 
Additionally, this bill would require the Fair Political Practices Commission to adopt regulations or 
policies that would ensure the operational independence of the commission’s audit personnel from 
the Fair Political Practices Commission’s enforcement operations. Audits conducted by the 
commission would be required to be posted on the commission’s internet website for 10 years 
following the conclusion of the audit and the commission would be required to annually report to 
the Legislature on the number and types of audits completed by the commission. This bill would 
delay the operation of these provisions until the January 1 of the next odd numbered year following 
an appropriation made to support the commission’s exercise of these responsibilities.   (Based 
on  08/28/2023 text) 

SB569_SUPPOR
T5April23 

Support 

SB 580 Bradford, D 
 

Schoolbuses: 
stop signal arm 
enforcement 
system. 

02/15/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law requires the driver of any vehicle, upon meeting or overtaking any schoolbus equipped 
with required signs that is stopped for the purpose of loading or unloading any schoolchildren and 
displaying a flashing red light signal and stop signal arm, if equipped with a stop signal arm, to 
bring the vehicle to a stop immediately before passing the schoolbus and to not proceed past the 
schoolbus until the flashing red light signal and stop signal arm cease operation. A violation of 
these provisions is a crime. Under current law, a driver is not required to stop if they are on the 
other roadway of a divided or multiple-lane highway, as defined.This bill would require a driver to 
stop on a divided highway, unless there is an elevated barrier or the median is unpaved, and 
would instead punish a violation of the prohibition with a civil penalty.    (Based on  02/15/2023 
text) 

 Monitor 

SB 584 Limón, D 
 

Laborforce 
housing: Short-
Term Rental 
Tax Law. 

05/18/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
H. & C.D. on 
6/15/2023) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would enact the Laborforce Housing Financing Act of 2023, and define “laborforce housing” as 
housing that, among other things, is owned and managed by specified entities solely for the 
benefit of residents and households unable to afford market rent, and whose residents enjoy 
certain protections. The bill would establish the Laborforce Housing Fund in the State Treasury, 
and would make moneys in the fund available to the department, upon appropriation by the 
Legislature, for the creation of laborforce housing and other specified housing projects by public 
entities, local housing authorities, and mission-driven nonprofit housing providers, as 
provided.   (Based on  05/18/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 585 Niello, R 
 

Disability 
access: 
construction-
related 
accessibility 
claims: 
statutory 
damages: 
attorney’s fees 
and costs. 

05/18/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
JUD. on 
6/8/2023) 

07/02/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would prohibit a construction-related accessibility claim for statutory damages from being initiated 
in a legal proceeding against a defendant who employs 50 or fewer individuals, as specified, until 
the defendant has been served with a letter specifying each alleged violation of a construction-
related accessibility standard and given 120 days to correct the alleged violation. The bill would 
provide that a defendant is not liable for statutory damages, plaintiff’s attorney’s fees, or costs for 
an alleged violation that is corrected within 120 days of service of a letter alleging the violation. 
The bill would also prohibit a plaintiff from avoiding the notice and opportunity to correct provisions 
and the liability limitations by claiming they are seeking general discrimination damages based on 
a violation of the Americans with Disabilities Act of 1990 if the underlying claim is based on a 
defendant’s failure to comply with physical accessibility standards under California law.   (Based 
on  05/18/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=fbvlpJyJqKR9lBPeyP1mE8g6h1ZD3w58fzcr8Abi4iifD5/6dLeK8YWo+N92pOyvrJ8uJgdEL3Qu4NhdXRM24MQfL0UByQJW0QF3EKxIBGk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/462
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_569_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_569_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_569_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=FA3C8610-0833-45CD-B80C-FB475A63F51B
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=FA3C8610-0833-45CD-B80C-FB475A63F51B
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=IRCp1iYIbtpDDNFUawZ5TDuDPRP+F2GnaT4liJcpsnsmlwm4hHXJNaVoI6k2xiFaFS+OyvGQAt4DB/HhZxUL1J+S1vQdrR5fpKQjBetzOnQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/456
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_580_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_580_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=RNFpi5x4DxxYHceFoiHNAj8410O5z30ggD43rcmGEJmhPg6+/xXtdzmel7l7QDP32muMx6dxMiiN0jj7X54phFaETMdemn5WCmak+VKb+ns=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/395
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_584_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_584_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_584_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Gle+OYPCZHrb1UxSImvciAGauNe67wK78lOw9DRVnsfmOujX5LBPVRF0883CxTRU2xE72V0VnCINl65dR0qMrpAcp5F3R8JLHkpQGeaZK8c=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/419
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_585_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_585_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_585_98_A_bill.pdf
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SB 594 Durazo, D 
 

Beneficial 
owners. 

04/27/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law requires a person who is directly or indirectly the beneficial owner of more than 10% of 
any class of stock of a domestic insurer to file in the office of the Insurance Commissioner within 
10 days after that person becomes a beneficial owner a statement, in a form prescribed by the 
commissioner, of the amount of all stock of that insurer of which the person is the beneficial owner, 
as specified. The General Corporation Law (GCL) requires a domestic corporation and a foreign 
corporation to file annually, as prescribed, with the Secretary of State, a statement containing 
certain information, including the names and complete business or residence addresses of its chief 
executive officer, secretary, and chief financial officer. The GCL requires a domestic corporation to 
certify that the information it provides in that statement is true and correct. This bill would 
additionally require those corporations to include in the statement described above the names and 
complete business or residence addresses of any beneficial owner, as defined.    (Based 
on  04/27/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 615 Allen, D 
 

Vehicle traction 
batteries. 

09/29/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/29/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
the 
Governor. In 
Senate. 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto 
pending.  

09/29/2024 - 
Senate  VETO
ED 

Current law requires the Secretary for Environmental Protection to convene the Lithium-Ion Car 
Battery Recycling Advisory Group to review, and advise the Legislature on, policies pertaining to 
the recovery and recycling of lithium-ion vehicle batteries sold with motor vehicles in the state. 
Current law also requires the advisory group to submit policy recommendations to the Legislature 
aimed at ensuring that as close to 100% as possible of lithium-ion vehicle batteries in the state are 
reused or recycled at end-of-life in a safe and cost-effective manner. This bill would require vehicle 
traction batteries, as defined, in the state to be recovered, and when possible, reused, repaired, 
repurposed, or remanufactured and eventually recycled at the end of their useful life, as provided. 
The bill would also require a battery supplier, as defined, to be responsible for, among other 
duties, ensuring the responsible end-of-life management of a vehicle traction battery if it is 
removed from a vehicle that is still in service, as provided, or if the battery is offered or returned to 
its battery supplier, and reporting information regarding the sale, transfer, or receipt of a vehicle 
traction battery or module to the department, as provided. The bill would impose related duties on 
a secondary user, as defined, and a secondary handler, as defined, including, among other duties, 
ensuring the responsible end-of-life management for a battery or returning a vehicle traction 
battery to the battery supplier, and reporting information regarding the sale, transfer, or receipt of a 
vehicle traction battery or module to the department as provided.   (Based on  09/05/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 616 Gonzalez, D 
 

Sick days: paid 
sick days 
accrual and 
use. 

10/04/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/04/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
309, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/04/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Existing law, the Healthy Workplaces, Healthy Families Act of 2014 (act), establishes requirements 
relating to paid sick days and paid sick leave, as described. The act excludes specified employees 
from its provisions, including an employee covered by a valid collective bargaining agreement, as 
described (CBA employees).This bill would exclude railroad carrier employers and their employees 
from the act’s provisions. This bill contains other related provisions and other existing 
laws.   (Based on  10/04/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=73Gx79lOcCKhmi2AIs/Eh2nG945qH0GdfNtlCU9Rc8d6DD8LpkTYwvE32EP+0MlX6BsCNwfl6u43s5yyScobxY3vSGAAI4SQH134os3CUv8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/424
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_594_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_594_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0551-0600/sb_594_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=NV0hnH288ltgMQ5GU30TSvnWbTXTHof0rQmTYqegPXS9Fg3ujgVzn1vypqQVOQiJptw2BfB8Dklge8WhKCpYuSOZTZSihin7/Ix0ADjMm9I=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/339
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0601-0650/sb_615_92_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0601-0650/sb_615_92_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0601-0650/sb_615_92_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=C6ZxqJqlI0bBwA6GbUctyln5hDzGKaRLO04QsU6VTb6bSGGNb7M0TRG3J4rJMSbg8D17IOka10zqVo8IiRI+cTAmp+9MnwgoYxAl2urlUho=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/479
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0601-0650/sb_616_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0601-0650/sb_616_93_C_bill.pdf
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SB 623 Laird, D 
 

Workers’ 
compensation: 
post-traumatic 
stress disorder. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
621, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/09/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law establishes a workers’ compensation system, administered by the Administrative 
Director of the Division of Workers’ Compensation, to compensate an employee for injuries 
sustained in the course of employment. Current law provides, until January 1, 2025, that, for 
certain state and local firefighting personnel and peace officers, the term “injury” includes post-
traumatic stress that develops or manifests during a period in which the injured person is in the 
service of the department or unit and creates a disputable presumption that the injury arises out of 
and comes in the course of employment. Current law requires the compensation awarded 
pursuant to this provision to include full hospital, surgical, medical treatment, disability indemnity, 
and death benefits. This bill would instead repeal that provision on January 1, 2029, and would 
require the Commission on Health and Safety and Workers’ Compensation to submit reports to the 
Legislature analyzing the effectiveness of the presumption and a review of claims filed by specified 
types of employees, not included in the presumption, such as public safety dispatchers, as 
defined.   (Based on  10/08/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 634 Becker, D 
 

Low Barrier 
Navigation 
Center: 
opportunity 
housing: use by 
right: building 
standards. 

05/09/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law provides that the California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) does not apply to an 
action taken by a public agency to lease, convey, or encumber land owned by a public entity or to 
facilitate the lease, conveyance, or encumbrance of land owned by a public agency, or to provide 
financial assistance to, or otherwise approve, a Low Barrier Navigation Center constructed or 
allowed by existing law. CEQA does not apply to the ministerial approval of projects. Current law 
prescribes requirements for notifying a developer that its application for a Low Barrier Navigation 
Center development is complete and for the local jurisdiction to complete its review of the 
application. Current law declares that Low Barrier Navigation Center developments are essential 
tools for alleviating the homelessness crisis in this state and are a matter of statewide concern and 
thus applicable to charter cities. Current law repeals these provisions as of January 1, 2027. This 
bill would additionally require an opportunity housing project, as defined, to be a use by right if the 
project has a housing transition plan for a situation when the parcel on which the project is located 
is no longer suitable for opportunity housing projects, as specified. The bill would also expand use 
by right to include sites used pursuant to Executive Order No. N-23-20 and areas zoned for 
medical use or faith-based use. The bill would provide that these provisions do not apply to an 
opportunity housing project located on a site in a nonresidential zone unless the site is located 
near amenities and services that serve people experiencing homelessness, as specified. The bill, 
by authorizing additional developments to be a use by right under certain circumstances, would 
expand the exemption for the ministerial approval of projects under CEQA.   (Based 
on  05/09/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 638 Eggman, D 
 

Climate 
Resiliency and 
Flood 
Protection 
Bond Act of 
2024. 

06/28/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
W.,P. & W. 
on 
6/15/2023) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would enact the Climate Resiliency and Flood Protection Bond Act of 2024 which, if approved by 
the voters, would authorize the issuance of bonds in the amount of $6,000,000,000 pursuant to the 
State General Obligation Bond Law, for flood protection and climate resiliency projects.    (Based 
on  06/28/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=sRJQVSFpu9cd/2a3IxAD3drSf4kf7raz7kv3PyIhS+t3+rVel+KUomq/Lqg4e1Ab6f2j49aDyN7zhYicdHVWjCIzHkdpAqK+lsQ+AfdzC/o=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/394
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0601-0650/sb_623_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0601-0650/sb_623_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=RSqckyk5l7wP2+Lqouk0wgww2OGYXXuiZtkqwyIm/jIpbPodKqfO9Z4pKrJhrHpNV9E6mdD8vUeQ9NjCSUqHSJi4g9ZAgxR8PIKNwT+vOAg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/392
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0601-0650/sb_634_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0601-0650/sb_634_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0601-0650/sb_634_94_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=jZmm1vN82KoUioJtGfOmay3nciCxwsKZUidcDWHpeRp3i2rsm239wUjvgtLXXYOU7vMkiQvfDxvC+mvkyyWF4I1Te/kkZqKRtQjoUxFRXjk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/391
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0601-0650/sb_638_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0601-0650/sb_638_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0601-0650/sb_638_96_A_bill.pdf
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SB 641 Roth, D 
 

Public health: 
alcohol and 
drug programs: 
naloxone. 

10/08/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

01/25/2024 - 
Stricken 
from file. 
Veto 
sustained.  

10/08/2023 - 
Senate  VETO
ED 

The Naloxone Distribution Project (NDP) is administratively created by the State Department of 
Health Care Services to reduce opioid-related overdose deaths. This bill would require the State 
Department of Health Care Services within the California Health and Human Services Agency, as 
part of the NDP, to make all United States Food and Drug Administration-approved formulations 
and dosage strengths of naloxone or any other opioid antagonist that are indicated for the 
emergency treatment of known or suspected opioid overdose available through the NDP, as 
specified. The bill would make legislative findings and declarations.   (Based on  09/19/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 665 Allen, D 
 

Plastic waste: 
single-use 
plastics 
alternatives: 
working group. 

10/08/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

01/25/2024 - 
Stricken 
from file. 
Veto 
sustained.  

10/08/2023 - 
Senate  VETO
ED 

Current law establishes the Plastic Pollution Prevention and Packaging Producer Responsibility 
Act, which covers certain single-use packaging and plastic single-use food service ware, as 
provided. As part of its comprehensive statutory scheme, the act requires the producers, as 
defined, of these covered materials to source reduce plastic covered material, to ensure that 
covered material offered for sale, distributed, or imported in or into the state on or after January 1, 
2032, is recyclable or eligible to be labeled “compostable,” and to ensure that plastic covered 
material offered for sale, distributed, or imported in or into the state meets specified recycling 
rates. Current law vests the California Environmental Protection Agency with authority over various 
environmental matters and various state agencies, including the Department of Resources 
Recycling and Recovery (CalRecycle), the State Water Resources Control Board, the Department 
of Toxic Substances Control, and the Office of Environmental Health Hazard Assessment. Current 
law establishes the Ocean Protection Council to, among other things, coordinate activities of state 
agencies that are related to the protection and conservation of coastal waters and ocean 
ecosystems. Current law requires CalRecycle to consult with the council regarding its adoption of 
regulations to establish a process, and develop criteria, for determining the types of food service 
packaging that are reusable, recyclable, or compostable. Current law establishes the Department 
of Food and Agriculture to promote and protect the agricultural industry of the state. This bill would 
require the California Environmental Protection Agency, by January 1, 2025, to establish a working 
group of the above-referenced state entities that would establish a framework, by July 1, 2026, for 
evaluating novel plastic and plastic-alternative material types used to produce single-use products 
as they are developed, in order to inform state policy decisions designed to create a more 
sustainable and circular economy, as provided.    (Based on  09/19/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=RKL62s9HV1sZICNh/85IkQ3DsWL6PsrcYZVpYuNWyVnuTBYtOxyk+aHcweOpWvB2RBlg8UzXQvoqOsYP+j2MhZas86ImPN33hWMHjMsNyqg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/397
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0601-0650/sb_641_95_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0601-0650/sb_641_95_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0601-0650/sb_641_95_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=5qHz0KtMltSIhU25m9NSmlsgEHhwCQJ8KBMKKe1n99OPK8DfHpCjG9HFG969kOCoPw/EYukDif/eoKNWL6N5mG+xRZVgqhWxFTu6sBixYSg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/339
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0651-0700/sb_665_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0651-0700/sb_665_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0651-0700/sb_665_94_E_bill.pdf
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SB 670 Allen, D 
 

State Air 
Resources 
Board: vehicle 
miles traveled: 
maps. 

04/27/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/18/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law designates the State Air Resources Board as the state agency with the primary 
responsibility for the control of vehicular air pollution and the state agency charged with monitoring 
and regulating sources of emissions of greenhouse gases. Current law imposes various 
requirements related to transportation planning, including a requirement that certain transportation 
planning agencies prepare and adopt regional transportation plans directed at achieving a 
coordinated and balanced regional transportation system. Current law requires each regional 
transportation plan to include, among other things, a sustainable communities strategy prepared 
by each metropolitan planning organization, as specified, which is designed to achieve certain 
targets for 2020 and 2035 established by the state board for the reduction of greenhouse gas 
emissions from automobiles and light trucks in the region. This bill would require the state board, 
in consultation with the Office of Planning and Research and the Department of Transportation, to 
develop a methodology for assessing and spatially representing light-duty vehicle miles traveled 
and to develop maps accordingly to display average light-duty vehicle miles traveled per capita in 
the state at the local, regional, and statewide level, as provided. The bill would require the state 
board to adopt the methodology no later than January 1, 2025, and to publish the maps no later 
than 6 months after the methodology is adopted. The bill would require the state board to update 
the methodology and maps at least once every 4 years.    (Based on  04/27/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 684 Caballero, D 
 

Land use: 
streamlined 
approval 
processes: 
development 
projects of 10 
or fewer 
residential units 
on urban lots 
under 5 acres. 

10/11/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/11/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
783, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/11/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The Subdivision Map Act vests the authority to regulate and control the design and improvement 
of subdivisions in the legislative body of a local agency and sets forth procedures governing the 
local agency’s processing, approval, conditional approval or disapproval, and filing of tentative, 
final, and parcel maps, and the modification thereof. The Planning and Zoning Law contains 
various provisions requiring a local government that receives an application for certain types of 
qualified housing developments to review the application under a streamlined, ministerial approval 
process depending on the type of housing development, as specified. Current law, known as the 
Starter Home Revitalization Act of 2021, requires a city or county to approve an application for a 
small home lot housing development project, as defined, on a proposed site to be subdivided 
unless the city or county makes a finding related to the development’s compliance with certain 
requirements or the development’s specific, adverse public health or safety impact. This bill would 
require a local agency to ministerially consider, without discretionary review or a hearing, a parcel 
map or a tentative and final map for a housing development project that meets specified 
requirements. In this regard, the bill would require the proposed subdivision to result in 10 or fewer 
parcels and the housing development project to, among other things, consist of 10 or fewer 
residential units, meet certain minimum parcel size and density requirements, and be located on a 
lot zoned for multifamily residential development that is no larger than 5 acres and is substantially 
surrounded by qualified urban uses. The bill would exempt the housing development project from 
certain requirements relating to minimum parcel size and dimensions and the formation of a 
homeowners’ association, except as specified.    (Based on  10/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=XrCVuOSmjbtk9PmhlaIqQgLIhIOhDCvG+EkZUVDxL+cnaPrWGB5HpU0xEPK4VwxfLAPmTE3SzIYQJBWwDUgTfNILaBQ5dE41plyt4VgUOCo=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/339
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0651-0700/sb_670_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0651-0700/sb_670_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0651-0700/sb_670_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ADZ8lRPuy/LnCekSyO5njlJJ9NecSGts8NRtXpvoYRXl/Tn7m8nd+R7UaR11lLmyA6kpH3hhZfC6rxi38limkFNt81wHo7Ot+7fF9BN6hEo=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/403
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0651-0700/sb_684_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0651-0700/sb_684_92_C_bill.pdf


Attachment B: Intergovernmental Relations Priority State Legislation Log 
 

Last Updated 12/06/24        184 
 

Measure Author Topic Current 
Text 

Status Location Brief Summary Attachments Position 

SB 700 Bradford, D 
 

Employment 
discrimination: 
cannabis use. 

10/07/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/07/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
408, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/07/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Would make it unlawful for an employer to request information from an applicant for employment 
relating to the applicant’s prior use of cannabis, as specified. Under the bill, information about a 
person’s prior cannabis use obtained from the person’s criminal history would be exempt from the 
above-described existing law and bill provisions relating to prior cannabis use if the employer is 
permitted to consider or inquire about that information under a specified provision of the California 
Fair Employment and Housing Act or other state or federal law.   (Based on  10/07/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 706 Caballero, D 
 

Public 
contracts: 
progressive 
design-build: 
local agencies. 

10/08/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

10/08/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
500, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

10/08/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law, until January 1, 2029, authorizes local agencies, defined as any city, county, city and 
county, or special district authorized by law to provide for the production, storage, supply, 
treatment, or distribution of any water from any source, to use the progressive design-build 
process for up to 15 public works projects in excess of $5,000,000 for each project, similar to the 
progressive design-build process authorized for use by the Director of General Services. This bill 
would, until January 1, 2030, provide additional authority for cities, counties, cities and counties, or 
special districts to use the progressive design-build process for up to 10 public works in excess of 
$5,000,000, not limited to water-related projects, excluding projects on state-owned or state-
operated facilities. The bill would require information to be provided under penalty of perjury and 
would require similar reports due no later than December 31, 2028.    (Based on  10/08/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 707 Newman, D 
 

Responsible 
Textile 
Recovery Act 
of 2024. 

09/28/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/28/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
864, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/28/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Would enact a stewardship program known as the Responsible Textile Recovery Act of 2024, 
which would require a producer of apparel, as defined, or textile articles, as defined, to form and 
join a producer responsibility organization or PRO. The bill would require the PRO to be approved 
by the Department of Resources Recycling and Recovery pursuant to the requirements of the bill, 
as provided. The bill would require the department to adopt regulations to implement the program 
no earlier than July 1, 2028. The bill would require the PRO to submit to the department, for 
approval or disapproval, a complete plan for the collection, transportation, repair, sorting, and 
recycling, and the safe and proper management, of apparel, as defined, and textile articles, as 
defined, in the state. Upon approval of a plan, or commencing July 1, 2030, whichever is earlier, 
the bill would make a producer subject to specified civil penalties, unless the producer is a 
participant of a PRO, and all apparel and textiles are accounted for in the plan. The bill would 
require the PRO to review the plan at least every 5 years after approval. The bill would also 
require a PRO to submit an annual report to the department, as provided. The bill would require all 
reports and records provided to the department to be provided under penalty of perjury. By 
expanding the scope of the crime of perjury, the bill would impose a state-mandated local 
program. The bill would restrict public access to certain information collected for the purpose of 
administering the program.   (Based on  09/28/2024 text) 

CPSC Coalition 
letter of support 
SB 707 Newman 
Textiles EPR 
23.3.22.pdf 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=uqS85+7rvQ5DRUEej4VnYTKB0ITiSjzl9Yf79i9FHGo4LGL2xlVYeVNSUOMbxmQAsHBJyR+twjT5JbaMRXRuHKsm/0HkO5hOZdlGJ7tyRzA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/456
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0651-0700/sb_700_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0651-0700/sb_700_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=2hakZiLljGrFotRCT9X5OHwUTBzjglLTm6FQKwPJ3pTOgCLOxY3CSGFVleiQkdUArqGg7tgMG8sWMsrMeB5ccH6H2O/vSCHwhy0xfv2W6Rw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/403
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0701-0750/sb_706_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0701-0750/sb_706_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=eeb/HSV/XrbMz2gd9U7Ikcy4veqfWnl4i4vHdyiuv+K1LhvKxj/PusmVCQlFP3AHOq0Om5msYvuYRi2Jnc/ZkbwtViMtRimuCYm4LvVoXjA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/475
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0701-0750/sb_707_88_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0701-0750/sb_707_88_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=AFD4462E-5B5C-4821-B585-62654F17DC23
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=AFD4462E-5B5C-4821-B585-62654F17DC23
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=AFD4462E-5B5C-4821-B585-62654F17DC23
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=AFD4462E-5B5C-4821-B585-62654F17DC23
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=AFD4462E-5B5C-4821-B585-62654F17DC23


Attachment B: 2023-2024 Intergovernmental Relations Priority State Legislation Log 
 

Last Updated 12/06/24        185 
 

Measure Author Topic Current 
Text 

Status Location Brief Summary Attachments Position 

SB 719 Becker, D 
 

Law 
enforcement 
agencies: radio 
communication
s. 

01/23/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

01/30/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(3). 
(Last 
location was 
THIRD 
READING 
on 
1/23/2024) 

01/31/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law authorizes the Attorney General to adopt policies, procedures, and practices related to 
the use of the California Law Enforcement Telecommunications System (CLETS). These rules 
require a participating agency to restrict access to CLETS and define “access” as the ability to see 
or hear any information obtained from CLETS. This bill would require a law enforcement agency, 
including the Department of the California Highway Patrol, municipal police departments, county 
sheriff’s departments, and specified local law enforcement agencies, to, by no later than January 
1, 2025, ensure public access, in real time, to the radio communications of that agency, as 
specified. The bill would exempt university and college police departments from the public access 
requirement. By imposing new duties on local law enforcement, this bill would create a state-
mandated local program.    (Based on  01/23/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 720 Durazo, D 
 

Gas 
corporations: 
applications 
and 
proceedings: 
employee 
organization 
participation. 

08/19/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
INACTIVE 
FILE on 
8/22/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law requires each gas corporation to develop a plan for the safe and reliable operation of 
its Public Utilities Commission-regulated gas pipeline facility. Current law requires the commission 
and gas corporation to provide opportunities for meaningful, substantial, and ongoing participation 
by the gas corporation workforce in the development and implementation of the plan, with the 
objective of developing an industrywide culture of safety that will minimize accidents, explosions, 
fires, and dangerous conditions for the protection of the public and the gas corporation workforce. 
This bill would require a gas corporation, whenever it files a formal application with the 
commission, to serve the application on all employee organizations representing the gas 
corporation’s employees’ labor interests. The bill would require a gas corporation, whenever the 
commission, on its own motion, opens a formal proceeding to which the gas corporation is a party, 
to notify all employee organizations representing the gas corporation’s employees’ labor interests 
within 3 days of the gas corporation’s receipt of service for the proceeding.   (Based 
on  08/19/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 721 Becker, D 
 

General plan: 
annual report: 
suite-style 
student 
housing 
quarters. 

07/01/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/7/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Planning and Zoning Law requires a city or county to adopt a general plan for land use 
development of the city or county that includes, among other elements, a housing element. That 
law requires the housing element to include, among other things, an identification and analysis of 
existing and projected housing needs. That law requires the city or county to provide by April 1 of 
each year an annual report to, among other entities, the Department of Housing and Community 
Development that includes, among other specified information, the number of units of housing 
demolished and new units of housing that have been issued a completed entitlement, a building 
permit, or a certificate of occupancy. This bill would, for the 7th and subsequent revisions of the 
housing element, require the city or county to additionally include in the annual report the number 
of suite-style student housing quarters, subject to specified requirements, within the number of 
housing units demolished and new units.   (Based on  07/01/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=b3Jg6rs15SMPkHYJKLqtxa9F4OEV9/sdB720jcS7WQu39ASEtrwwKE/gxP3Dp07xZBVn9pzi1jg2RiBCtZfvI5HS+EJ76+Efyn4iJop9LdI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/392
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0701-0750/sb_719_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0701-0750/sb_719_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0701-0750/sb_719_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=3ELcGA/ZRHL0OYHeBz7UMfAk3rVN37ocJSY3EuGGdvL4txarZYtQL5sMuLKJusYK6gBT0MBu4cC6cXOsak5ub7LCe2oSV/PY3ygppPakENk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/424
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0701-0750/sb_720_92_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0701-0750/sb_720_92_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0701-0750/sb_720_92_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=/VacMM2Ved0cz/C1c605baoG5vEVwqcNmH1HSvjxPvhYvAFSAyXw80SFg79eZbYp6Bx0dO7gZlFWY/K+41l1kZEq3exVknO71LYzl+tobf8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/392
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0701-0750/sb_721_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0701-0750/sb_721_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0701-0750/sb_721_95_A_bill.pdf
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SB 731 Ashby, D 
 

Employment 
discrimination: 
unlawful 
practices: work 
from home: 
disability. 

10/09/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

01/25/2024 - 
Stricken 
from file. 
Veto 
sustained.  

10/08/2023 - 
Senate  VETO
ED 

The California Fair Employment and Housing Act (FEHA) makes it an unlawful practice for an 
employer or other entity to fail to make reasonable accommodation for the known physical or 
mental disability of an applicant or employee. FEHA further makes it an unlawful practice for an 
employer or other entity to fail to engage in a timely, good faith, interactive process with the 
employee or applicant to determine effective reasonable accommodations, if any, in response to a 
request for reasonable accommodation by an employee or applicant with a known physical or 
mental disability or known medical condition. This bill would make it an unlawful employment 
practice for an employer to fail to provide to an employee who is working from home at least 30 
calendar days’ advance notice before requiring the employee to return to work in person. The bill 
would prohibit an employee from being required to return to work in person until the employer 
provides notice in accordance with the bill. The bill would require that notice be written and sent by 
mail or email and include, at a minimum, prescribed text with information about the rights of an 
employee to reasonable accommodation for a disability.    (Based on  09/11/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 735 Cortese, D 
 

San Francisco 
Bay Area 
Regional 
Housing 
Finance Act: 
expenditure of 
funds: public 
works. 

06/27/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/7/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The San Francisco Bay Area Regional Housing Finance Act establishes the Bay Area Housing 
Finance Authority to raise, administer, and allocate funding for affordable housing in the San 
Francisco Bay area, as defined, and provide technical assistance at a regional level for tenant 
protection, affordable housing preservation, and new affordable housing production. The act vests 
the authority with various powers, including authorizing it to place a measure on the ballot to raise 
revenue and allocate funds throughout the San Francisco Bay area, apply for and receive grants 
or loans from public and private entities, incur and issue bonds and other indebtedness, and 
otherwise incur liabilities or obligations, as specified. The act authorizes the authority to allocate 
and deploy financing to cities, counties, other public agencies within the San Francisco Bay area, 
and private affordable housing developers to finance affordable housing development, as 
specified. The act requires revenue generated pursuant to the act be used for the construction of 
new affordable housing, affordable housing preservation, tenant protection programs, planning 
and technical assistance related to affordable housing, and for infrastructure to support housing 
and other purposes, as specified. Under this bill, a construction or rehabilitation project receiving 
funding or financing from revenue under the act, as specified, would constitute a public work for 
which prevailing wages are required to be paid pursuant to current law. The bill would require that 
certain projects with 40 units or more be eligible to receive funding or financing from revenue 
generated under the act only if all construction and rehabilitation will be subject to a project labor 
agreement, as defined, with the same terms as the San Francisco Bay Area Rapid Transit District 
Major Projects Project Stabilization Agreement, as specified and defined, except that if a regional 
or countywide project labor agreement, as defined, that meets certain requirements is negotiated, 
then the bill would provide that those projects are eligible for funding or financing from the agency 
only if all construction and rehabilitation is subject to that project labor agreement.   (Based 
on  06/27/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=bZ2jNlKySkjDKGHXdSqO1Dl0lrj6dlVSKvoTyyJf65AUHTESSePpl9I0yjIpHy4Z9hoHKcS4gEFxIYJcmt+/5Wyxr7peCmsTYzGcXK2UBMo=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/335
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0701-0750/sb_731_95_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0701-0750/sb_731_95_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0701-0750/sb_731_95_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=H4KbRsHUOAQsYgRRME+ZFj+vxbwDHgteXVHpPezZamGFd6UX4ukKDnsu355/GLepz5kX6MpL23XqH2FV6VJyK+eATP8xXhLZIoh/QiBRtOg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/393
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0701-0750/sb_735_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0701-0750/sb_735_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0701-0750/sb_735_94_A_bill.pdf
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SB 751 Padilla, D 
 

Franchise 
agreements: 
solid waste 
handling 
services: labor 
dispute. 

10/08/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

01/25/2024 - 
Stricken 
from file. 
Veto 
sustained.  

10/08/2023 - 
Senate  VETO
ED 

Would prohibit any franchise contracts, licenses, or permits for solid waste handling services, as 
defined, entered into or substantially amended, as defined, by a local agency on or after January 
1, 2024, from containing a force majeure provision that excuses the service provider from 
complying with the franchise contracts, licenses, or permits in the event of a work stoppage 
associated with a labor dispute, as defined. The bill would require specified provisions to be 
included in any exclusive franchise contract, license, or permit for solid waste handling services 
entered into or substantially amended by a local agency after January 1, 2024, and would require 
these provisions to apply in the event of service being disrupted by a work stoppage associated 
with a labor dispute.   (Based on  09/19/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 755 Becker, D 
 

Energy 
efficiency and 
building 
decarbonizatio
n programs. 

07/12/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/23/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law requires certain state agencies, including the Energy Commission, to develop and 
implement various energy efficiency programs. This bill, the California’s Layered Energy 
Applications for Residents (CLEAR) Act of 2023, would require the Energy Commission to develop 
and make publicly available an internet website for energy efficiency and building decarbonization 
programs administered by the Energy Commission, federal or local governmental agencies, and 
nonprofit organizations that are available in the state for residential buildings and residential 
electricity customers, as specified. The bill would require the Energy Commission to enable 
customer application for the included programs through the internet website. The bill would prohibit 
including energy efficiency and building decarbonization programs established or administered by 
the Public Utilities Commission on the internet website, but would authorize the Energy 
Commission to provide a link to programs that cannot be included.   (Based on  07/12/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 768 Caballero, D 
 

California 
Environmental 
Quality Act: 
Department of 
Housing and 
Community 
Development: 
vehicle miles 
traveled: study. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
773, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/27/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law requires the Office of Planning and Research to prepare, develop, and transmit to the 
Secretary of the Natural Resources Agency for certification and adoption proposed revisions to 
guidelines establishing criteria, for purposes of the California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA), 
for determining the significance of transportation impacts of projects within transit priority areas to 
promote the reduction of greenhouse gas emissions, the development of multimodal transportation 
networks, and a diversity of land uses. Current law establishes the Department of Housing and 
Community Development in the Business, Consumer Services, and Housing Agency and makes 
the department responsible for administering various housing programs throughout the state. This 
bill would require the department, in consultation with local governments and other interested 
parties, as specified, by January 1, 2028, and subject to an appropriation by the Legislature for this 
purpose, to conduct and post on its internet website a study on how vehicle miles traveled is used 
as a metric for measuring transportation impacts of housing projects pursuant to CEQA. The bill 
would require the study to include, among other things, an analysis of the differences in the 
availability and feasibility of mitigation measures to housing projects for vehicle miles traveled in 
rural, suburban, urban, and low vehicle miles traveled areas. The bill would repeal those 
provisions on January 1, 2029.   (Based on  09/27/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=3VrpOaTrakPPPFeB7GaqQaOQymHGNb9+6U8e9iKPDifpgMaB2JxkDF9ChA2zvkMsvO7DBhLUAKhoPMGDjyB2QONTeFH3mmup1dw769/1bE8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/422
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0751-0800/sb_751_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0751-0800/sb_751_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0751-0800/sb_751_94_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=g07RtNm659Q10xMtvbExPoj7bFph7ZQx3jaVkpjq4bPn9TnPZKfZpoTp3j2unQXln8L23VqmUBKmVht23ZKcIdNWLgZgIrsFLxfmD0Gyyw4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/392
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0751-0800/sb_755_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0751-0800/sb_755_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0751-0800/sb_755_95_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=W7cknUDabi3K7a5HOKugfBzZvi9ec8yhSRfIEzuHKpy4MZjQSDkkfm57xv1l6E9Z+yaIo8JGUHRZiPixqjFQ7mYYAGgGAsQrbT63zqPuajE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/403
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0751-0800/sb_768_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0751-0800/sb_768_92_C_bill.pdf
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SB 783 Archuleta, D 
 

Veterans: 
suicide. 

05/18/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
M. & V.A. on 
6/8/2023) 

07/02/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would authorize the Counties of Los Angeles and Nevada to create a veteran suicide prevention 
training pilot program to offer individuals in each county specialized training and certification in 
suicide prevention with military-connected populations. The bill would require the program to train 
individuals to identify indicators of elevated suicide risk and provide emergency crisis intervention 
and referrals for veterans, as specified.   (Based on  05/18/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 790 Padilla, D 
 

Public records: 
contracts for 
goods and 
services. 

07/13/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

07/13/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 77, 
Statutes of 
2023.  

07/13/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The California Public Records Act requires public records to be open to inspection at all times 
during the office hours of the state or local agency that retains those records, and provides that 
every person has a right to inspect any public record, except as provided. The act requires state 
and local agencies to make public records available upon receipt of a request for a copy that 
reasonably describes an identifiable record not otherwise exempt from disclosure, and upon 
payment of fees to cover costs. This bill would provide that any executed contract for the purchase 
of goods or services by a state or local agency, including the price and terms of payment, is a 
public record subject to disclosure under the act.    (Based on  07/13/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 794 Niello, R 
 

California 
Environmental 
Quality Act: 
judicial 
challenge: 
identification of 
contributors: 
housing 
projects. 

03/20/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) requires a lead agency, as defined, to prepare, 
or cause to be prepared, and certify the completion of an environmental impact report on a project 
that it proposes to carry out or approve that may have a significant effect on the environment, or to 
adopt a negative declaration if it finds that the project will not have that effect. CEQA authorizes 
specified entities to file and maintain with a court an action or proceeding to attack, review, set 
aside, void, or annul an act of a public agency on grounds of noncompliance with the requirements 
of the act. This bill would require an action or proceeding brought to attack, review, set aside, void, 
or annual acts or decision of a public agency for a commercial, housing, or public works project 
that helps to address longstanding critical needs in the project area and that results in an 
investment of at least $25,000,000 in the state on the grounds of noncompliance with CEQA to be 
resolved, to the extent feasible, within 365 days of the filing of the certified record of proceedings 
with the court.   (Based on  03/20/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 796 Alvarado-Gil, 
R 
 

Threats: 
schools and 
places of 
worship. 

04/27/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
7/2/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would make a person who willfully threatens to commit a crime which will result in death or great 
bodily injury to any person who may be on the grounds of a school or place of worship, with 
specific intent and under certain circumstances, and if the threat causes a person or persons 
reasonably to be in sustained fear for their own safety or the safety of another person, guilty of a 
misdemeanor or felony punishable by imprisonment in a county jail for a specified term, except 
that if the person is under 18 years of age, the bill would make the person guilty of a 
misdemeanor. By creating a new crime, this bill would impose a state-mandated local 
program.   (Based on  04/27/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=r6glUoh2KoVZdjSu0ljrKW3vgBL/sNW25yZVctAhsil+U3VbEAlOOcCCghcT1pGogTN+FYoIlaUlQ0ltXQ8wyIMd6mDK4QY9BF/qWO4+MJE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/491
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0751-0800/sb_783_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0751-0800/sb_783_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0751-0800/sb_783_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=NC9A/OrrY8IGa0nRaAUHJNp7ixz9S4QHLQmJQ8L0EcMpk1AYak4r/mBI59aFugfYYKzhtFGhqtvSy5UAHwXeWqH8OiJf1G/CN5qaqnUhvDI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/422
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0751-0800/sb_790_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0751-0800/sb_790_96_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=fE2np2ef6UZTJiJOKn8mWMMJz3dKmmHi3Fbw0O9as+hAArXLzWnrk3PdspfakGfJf4v3EMA/T8vAF26veXCacUrGWDKbUWuhWib0RN775kY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/419
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0751-0800/sb_794_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0751-0800/sb_794_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0751-0800/sb_794_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=pp4zcNJQ5HYoCgHuCSR4XSQTHY/zw8ODNQGPts8dn+ZbGqWRWj2+I/K6ehLKRXtNSt5ezYXT5I5tZE/IixTzJ7Fgx5PV/MfCKyOIaDgzFzQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/352
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/352
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0751-0800/sb_796_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0751-0800/sb_796_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0751-0800/sb_796_97_A_bill.pdf
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SB 799 Portantino, D 
 

Unemployment 
insurance: 
trade disputes: 
eligibility for 
benefits. 

09/30/2023 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

01/25/2024 - 
Stricken 
from file. 
Veto 
sustained.  

09/30/2023 - 
Senate  VETO
ED 

Current law provides for the payment of unemployment compensation benefits and extended 
benefits to eligible individuals who meet specified requirements. Under current law, unemployment 
benefits are paid from the Unemployment Fund, which is continuously appropriated for these 
purposes. Current law makes an employee ineligible for benefits if the employee left work because 
of a trade dispute and specifies that the employee remains ineligible for the duration of the trade 
dispute. Current case law holds that employees who left work due to a lockout by the employer, 
even if it was in anticipation of a trade dispute, are eligible for benefits. This bill would restore 
eligibility after the first 2 weeks for an employee who left work because of a trade dispute. The bill 
would codify specified case law that holds that employees who left work due to a lockout by the 
employer, even if it was in anticipation of a trade dispute, are eligible for benefits. The bill would 
specify that the bill’s provisions do not diminish eligibility for benefits of individuals deprived of 
work due to an employer lockout or similar action, as specified.   (Based on  09/19/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 834 Portantino, D 
 

Vehicles: 
preferential 
parking: 
residential, 
commercial, or 
other 
development 
project. 

02/22/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
RLS. on 
2/29/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law authorizes the legislative body of a city or a county to adopt ordinances establishing 
requirements for parking, and permits variances to be granted from the parking requirements of a 
zoning ordinance for nonresidential development if the variance will be an incentive to the 
development and the variance will facilitate access to the development by patrons of public transit 
facilities. Current law prohibits a public agency from imposing any minimum automobile parking 
requirement on any residential, commercial, or other development project, as defined, that is 
located within 1/2 mile of public transit, as defined. Current law, notwithstanding the above-
described prohibition, authorizes a city, county, or city and county to impose or enforce minimum 
automobile parking requirements on a housing development project if specified conditions are met. 
Current law authorizes a local authority to authorize preferential parking for designated groups to 
park on specified streets if the local authority determines that use of the permits will not adversely 
affect parking conditions for residents and merchants in the area. This bill would prohibit a local 
authority from issuing any permit conferring preferential parking privileges to any residents or 
vendors of any developments within 1/2 mile of public transit and exempt from parking minimums. 
The bill would require the local authority to revise the boundaries of any such preferential parking 
district to exclude those developments from its boundaries. The bill would make related findings 
and declarations, and state that it is the intent of the Legislature to discourage car use by 
incentivizing development near public transit.   (Based on  02/22/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 855 Archuleta, D 
 

Fair 
Employment 
and Housing 
Act: veterans. 

02/17/2023 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

02/01/2024 - 
Returned to 
Secretary of 
Senate 
pursuant to 
Joint Rule 
56.  

01/12/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law, the California Fair Employment and Housing Act, prohibits an employer from 
discriminating against an employee on account of certain characteristics, including a person’s 
veteran or military status. The act prescribes various unlawful employment practices and requires 
the Civil Rights Department to, among other things, receive, investigate, and prosecute complaints 
alleging violations of those unlawful practices.This bill would make it an unlawful employment 
practice to require an employee who is a veteran, as defined, to work on November 11, known as 
Veterans Day, if specified conditions are met.   (Based on  02/17/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=d08hw6bCV+9utRDyRAY6MXHlkrt8PyzrITPy/WxBrPvk0xCaF1F2XUGVNXXrMpqtfwPg+OOj30bgwTFcWPaePpn7r3eEQkoemoOTfKuP7dU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/262
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0751-0800/sb_799_97_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0751-0800/sb_799_97_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0751-0800/sb_799_97_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=YXf7mgMh5L/JHDEaeTxPc/5bFQHqvmFgBp/GyKm374Q8rT3fWD3yQtIqUARqV7ERgItw+PhKGcBGg2kVQYWVS1AYW2/5BKzNARYSUC+Q6I4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/262
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0801-0850/sb_834_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0801-0850/sb_834_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0801-0850/sb_834_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=MvWcQ9qYK6ZHSQF+PMDa761MNoe6oDwkoExNoWTeMB8WtTqRpbIcZ4ihq94NMYVfPBnMKc+7jtBZM8G3A9GbUc3zhvchjGeN8d0xm82kQ3o=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/491
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0851-0900/sb_855_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0851-0900/sb_855_99_I_bill.pdf
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SB 867 Allen, D 
 

Safe Drinking 
Water, Wildfire 
Prevention, 
Drought 
Preparedness, 
and Clean Air 
Bond Act of 
2024. 

07/03/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

07/03/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 83, 
Statutes of 
2024 

07/03/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Would enact the Safe Drinking Water, Wildfire Prevention, Drought Preparedness, and Clean Air 
Bond Act of 2024, which, if approved by the voters, would authorize the issuance of bonds in the 
amount of $10,000,000,000 pursuant to the State General Obligation Bond Law to finance projects 
for safe drinking water, drought, flood, and water resilience, wildfire and forest resilience, coastal 
resilience, extreme heat mitigation, biodiversity and nature-based climate solutions, climate-smart, 
sustainable, and resilient farms, ranches, and working lands, park creation and outdoor access, 
and clean air programs.   (Based on  07/03/2024 text) 

SB 867 and AB 
1567 - Support if 
Amended Letter 
04.22.24 (1).pdf 

Support if 
Amended 

SB 868 Wilk, R 
 

Pupil safety: 
trauma kits. 

07/12/2023 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/16/2023) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would, commencing with the 2024–25 school year and contingent upon an appropriation for its 
purposes, require each school district, county office of education, and charter school to (1) equip 
each classroom at each of its schoolsites with a trauma kit, as defined, (2) inspect and replace or 
replenish each trauma kit, as necessary, upon each use and at least once every three years, and 
(3) notify, at least once each school year, its employees of the location of the trauma kits and 
provide them with contact information for training in the use of the trauma kit, as provided. By 
imposing additional duties on local educational agencies, the bill would impose a state-mandated 
local program. The bill would exempt from civil liability a person who renders emergency care or 
treatment by the use of a trauma kit at the scene of an emergency, as specified.    (Based 
on  07/12/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 892 Padilla, D 
 

Public 
contracts: 
automated 
decision 
systems: 
procurement 
standards. 

09/22/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/20/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
the 
Governor. In 
Senate. 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto 
pending.  

09/20/2024 - 
Senate  VETO
ED 

Current law requires all contracts for the acquisition of information technology goods and services 
related to information technology projects, as defined, to be made by or under the supervision of 
the Department of Technology. Current law requires all other contracts for the acquisition of 
information technology goods or services to be made by or under the supervision of the 
Department of General Services. Under current law, both the Department of Technology and the 
Department of General Services are authorized to delegate their authority to another agency, as 
specified. The California Consumer Privacy Act of 2018 (CCPA) grants to a consumer various 
rights with respect to personal information, as defined, that is collected by a business, as defined, 
including the right to request that a business delete personal information about the consumer that 
the business has collected from the consumer. The California Privacy Rights Act of 2020, an 
initiative measure approved by the voters as Proposition 24 at the November 3, 2020, statewide 
general election, amended, added to, and reenacted the CCPA. The CCPA, as amended, 
establishes the California Privacy Protection Agency with full administrative power, authority, and 
jurisdiction to implement and enforce the CCPA. This bill would require the Department of 
Technology to develop and adopt regulations to create an automated decision system (ADS) 
procurement standard. To develop those regulations, the bill would require the department to 
consider principles and industry standards addressed in specified publications regarding AI risk 
management.   (Based on  09/05/2024 text) 

SB 892 - SJ 
Support 
06.25.24.pdf 
Governor 
Signature 
Request 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=WN180LmgPmK9w6FDaG+ATD6f09AQScKEHwBk0t4ycEVzFYmkYjrjHkyn/j1EoC9roBhGUiUP0Rk79ICZQQq/4EQSSnQMd0HDxr0LroWqhBY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/339
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0851-0900/sb_867_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0851-0900/sb_867_94_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=7CDE097C-B477-478E-90CA-D700E104B541
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=7CDE097C-B477-478E-90CA-D700E104B541
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=7CDE097C-B477-478E-90CA-D700E104B541
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=7CDE097C-B477-478E-90CA-D700E104B541
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=j9qfQ4den7CChviO2u3igGkVEO81O5aCJKTw/QnNVB9G3s7h++WsnHb1OSsfE2iS/trmdWhyoEZAWtnA1IQ3SEb5kiktQ20EjtVfMK080kw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/465
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0851-0900/sb_868_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0851-0900/sb_868_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0851-0900/sb_868_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=RPoKvOxYJIi+aK/J161H/zRruLdxuW6yPS8XyhtpbvWd0hefnex7GmcHKsMU01pTF0kDp1WhPSrZqpa2dfLdo4v0uODwbvowxo1NpG7Lca0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/422
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0851-0900/sb_892_93_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0851-0900/sb_892_93_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0851-0900/sb_892_93_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=BCF7937B-07DF-400F-89B8-AE2885DA683B
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=BCF7937B-07DF-400F-89B8-AE2885DA683B
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=BCF7937B-07DF-400F-89B8-AE2885DA683B
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=48C17372-7B87-4DE6-9687-7374A8FD0207
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=48C17372-7B87-4DE6-9687-7374A8FD0207
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=48C17372-7B87-4DE6-9687-7374A8FD0207
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SB 893 Padilla, D 
 

California 
Artificial 
Intelligence 
Research Hub. 

07/03/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/7/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would require the Government Operations Agency, the Governor’s Office of Business and 
Economic Development, the California Privacy Protection Agency, and the Department of 
Technology to collaborate to establish the California Artificial Intelligence Research Hub (hub) in 
the Government Operations Agency, as prescribed. The bill would require the hub to serve as a 
centralized entity to facilitate collaboration between government agencies, academic institutions, 
and private sector partners to advance artificial intelligence research and development that seeks 
to harness the technology’s full potential for public benefit while safeguarding privacy, advancing 
security, and addressing risks and potential harms to society, as prescribed.   (Based 
on  07/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 896 Dodd, D 
 

Generative 
Artificial 
Intelligence 
Accountability 
Act. 

09/29/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/29/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
928, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/29/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law requires the Secretary of Government Operations to develop a coordinated plan to, 
among other things, investigate the feasibility of, and obstacles to, developing standards and 
technologies for state departments to determine digital content provenance. For the purpose of 
informing that coordinated plan, current law requires the secretary to evaluate, among other 
things, the impact of the proliferation of deepfakes, defined to mean audio or visual content that 
has been generated or manipulated by artificial intelligence that would falsely appear to be 
authentic or truthful and that features depictions of people appearing to say or do things they did 
not say or do without their consent, on state government, California-based businesses, and 
residents of the state. This bill, the Generative Artificial Intelligence Accountability Act, would, 
among other things, require the Department of Technology, under the guidance of the Government 
Operations Agency, the Office of Data and Innovation, and the Department of Human Resources, 
to update the report to the Governor, as required by Executive Order No. N-12-23, as 
prescribed.   (Based on  09/29/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 899 Skinner, D 
 

Protective 
orders: 
firearms. 

09/24/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/24/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
544, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/24/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law prohibits a person subject to specified protective orders from owning a firearm or 
ammunition. Current law requires a person subject to those orders to relinquish any firearms or 
ammunition they own. Commencing January 1, 2026, this bill would require the court, when 
issuing those orders, to provide the person subject to the order with information on how any 
firearms or ammunition still in their possession are to be relinquished, as specified. The bill would 
require the court to review the file to determine whether the receipt has been filed and inquire as to 
whether the person has complied with the requirement. The bill would require violations of the 
firearms or ammunition prohibition to be reported to the prosecuting attorney in the jurisdiction 
where the order has been issued within 2 business days of the court hearing unless the restrained 
party provides a receipt showing compliance at a subsequent hearing or by direct filing with the 
clerk of the court.    (Based on  09/24/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=HORfSLavyD2YYjmAymBZ5BUwnnieRbpBOp9DlfnlvmFGAaocmQq78ghvr6Zec0dcf2yUEF9/Jdy6p3cldAgIQWQaJDo9K/EXyXGOAdqx+vg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/422
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0851-0900/sb_893_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0851-0900/sb_893_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0851-0900/sb_893_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Pm4izCZi371Aa9f0ybJhslBFf8nOAWdNTNGwgqSvPM3ooMfE2NCbc6qL2RyMDDOoB3IGSYG11jE4vW2VAJFoOUImRk2wlqeCMCJvDFnn0Tw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/258
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0851-0900/sb_896_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0851-0900/sb_896_92_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=oETkUQYewCiJjx0seDFz9WvRIRvFMkd6TE0AMCvBVOXs9OGrfUesG58c/C+93Dn3fBYH73jsmuhUlbjwWGo3E4Yyv60d+sglS/8c8AU+IHI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/260
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0851-0900/sb_899_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0851-0900/sb_899_91_C_bill.pdf
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SB 902 Roth, D 
 

Firearms: 
public safety. 

09/24/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/24/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
545, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/24/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law, subject to exceptions, provides that any person who has been convicted of certain 
misdemeanors may not, within 10 years of the conviction, own, purchase, receive, possess or 
have under their custody or control, any firearm and makes a violation of that prohibition 
punishable as a misdemeanor or a felony. Current law, with certain exceptions, makes it a crime to 
maliciously and intentionally maim, mutilate, torture, wound, or kill a living animal. This bill would 
provide that any person convicted of a misdemeanor violation of the above-described crimes, on 
or after January 1, 2025, may not, within 10 years of the conviction, access a firearm as described 
above, and would make a violation of that prohibition a misdemeanor.   (Based on  09/24/2024 
text) 

 Monitor 

SB 903 Skinner, D 
 

Environmental 
health: product 
safety: 
perfluoroalkyl 
and 
polyfluoroalkyl 
substances. 

04/11/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
4/29/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would, beginning January 1, 2032, prohibit a person from distributing, selling, or offering for sale a 
product that contains intentionally added perfluoroalkyl and polyfluoroalkyl substances (PFAS), as 
defined, unless the Department of Toxic Substances Control has made a determination that the 
use of PFAS in the product is a currently unavoidable use, the prohibition is preempted by federal 
law, or the product is previously used. The bill would specify the criteria and procedures for 
determining whether the use of PFAS in a product is a currently unavoidable use, for renewing that 
determination, and for revoking that determination. The bill would require the department to 
maintain on its internet website a list of each determination of currently unavoidable use, when 
each determination expires, and the products and uses that are exempt from the prohibition. The 
bill would impose an administrative penalty for a violation of the prohibition, as specified. The bill 
would establish the PFAS Penalty Account and require all administrative penalties received to be 
deposited into that account and, upon appropriation by the Legislature, to be used for the 
administration and enforcement of these provisions, as specified.   (Based on  04/11/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 905 Wiener, D 
 

Crimes: theft 
from a vehicle. 

08/16/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

08/16/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
170, 
Statutes of 
2024 

08/16/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law defines the crime of burglary to include entering a vehicle when the doors are locked 
with the intent to commit grand or petit larceny or a felony. Current law makes the burglary of a 
vehicle punishable as a misdemeanor or a felony. This bill would make forcibly entering a vehicle, 
as defined, with the intent to commit a theft or a felony therein a crime punishable by imprisonment 
in a county jail for a period not to exceed one year or imprisonment in a county jail for 16 months, 
or 2 or 3 years.   (Based on  08/16/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=sca0Y8N3jbo6ZsOmmmYwv8T3EQxS0wsCPt6UCqnbNRi7PonTnikApdUqZvS0BrWCsu8VG6DxueBvYetr2/b04aWjN2RhiII1On3Xo1XeBVI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/397
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_902_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_902_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=jlZTG0aYrSV2ZVcaMQ/s2lhSPGC3yUDbS1M/wkgaNGvMx1tgSQ/up8qqZPvdTuAo0kIS1tN2n3kOSDk1j7VskXevsgqTaPjNr7IPZo0J8BU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/260
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_903_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_903_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_903_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=vVI3Wzl0utZ5Bwiq2iE8TfRpRU+Z8jRkHucR13lnGTwDjbP6AawHjA9oLBxEhIaN0rCs28G1GQat3BPncLT3WUeZ22sZtZ5sAvvBvMuVabE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/257
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_905_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_905_92_C_bill.pdf
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SB 915 Cortese, D 
 

Local 
government: 
autonomous 
vehicle service. 

05/16/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
TRANS. on 
6/3/2024) 

07/02/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law authorizes an autonomous vehicle, as defined, to be operated on public roads for 
testing purposes by a driver who possesses the proper class of license for the type of vehicle 
being operated if certain requirements are met, including that the vehicle is being operated solely 
by employees, contractors, or other persons designated by the manufacturer. Current law prohibits 
an autonomous vehicle from being operated on public roads until the manufacturer submits an 
application to the Department of Motor Vehicles containing certain certifications regarding safety 
and other technological requirements and the department approves that application pursuant to 
adopted regulations. Current law, commencing January 1, 2030, and to the extent authorized by 
federal law, prohibits the operation of certain new autonomous vehicles that are not zero-emission 
vehicles, as defined. This bill would authorize a city with a population of 250,000 or greater that an 
autonomous vehicle service, as defined, has received authorization by the Department of Motor 
Vehicles, the Public Utilities Commission, or any other applicable state agency to operate, to 
protect the public health, safety, and welfare by enacting an ordinance in regard to autonomous 
vehicle services within that jurisdiction. The bill would require each city that enacts an ordinance to 
include certain provisions within that ordinance. These would include a policy for entry into the 
business of providing autonomous vehicle services including a permitting program that includes, 
among other things, the establishment of reasonable vehicle caps and hours of service 
restrictions. The bill would authorize a city with a population of less than 250,000 that shares a 
border or is contiguous to a city that has enacted an autonomous vehicle services ordinance to 
enact an ordinance substantially consistent with that autonomous vehicle services 
ordinance.   (Based on  05/16/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 923 Archuleta, D 
 

Theft. 03/18/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
PUB. S. on 
2/14/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The Safe Neighborhoods and Schools Act, enacted by Proposition 47, as approved by the voters 
at the November 4, 2014, statewide general election, defines and prohibits an act of shoplifting 
and prohibits prosecution for an act of shoplifting under any other law. Existing law defines 
shoplifting as entering a commercial establishment with intent to commit larceny while the 
establishment is open during regular business hours.This bill would revise the definition of 
shoplifting to require an intent to steal retail property or merchandise. This bill contains other 
related provisions and other existing laws.   (Based on  03/18/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=NUyJoo3gz2ZWhnzxTbIVeHohkdAtXi+y+dAsHt9M18T4E61trH1g3lE5MeRak7/jSgjYeCSzm0oa5ocz1TFqhhCqR2ZGAzJxxW4GUXZmA9M=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/393
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_915_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_915_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_915_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=v9LTrxj0cEQVSFI/O6vWxaQwMJzK535riR+O8yGvl6xiifaJMIAy7NrC1JTS++UaUHrkDl534fD+SoNl/8TXNdhAkoukFruyr/mY5lIhpxE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/491
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_923_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_923_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_923_98_A_bill.pdf
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SB 925 Wiener, D 
 

City and 
County of San 
Francisco: 
merchandising 
sales. 

06/26/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/7/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Under current law, knowingly buying or receiving stolen property or property that has been 
obtained in any manner constituting theft or extortion, as specified, is punishable as either a 
misdemeanor or a felony if the value of the property exceeds $950. Current law authorizes a local 
authority to, by ordinance or resolution, adopt requirements regulating the time, place, and manner 
of sidewalk vending if the requirements are directly related to objective health, safety, or welfare 
concerns. Current law prohibits a local authority from regulating sidewalk vendors, except in 
accordance with certain provisions. This bill, until January 1, 2030, would authorize the City and 
County of San Francisco to adopt an ordinance prohibiting the sale of specified merchandise on 
public property without a permit, if the ordinance includes specified written findings, including, 
among other things, that there has been a significant pattern of merchandise being the subject of 
retail theft and then appearing for sale on public property within the City and County of San 
Francisco. The bill would require an ordinance adopted by the City and County of San Francisco 
to, among other things, identify a local permitting agency that is responsible for administering a 
permit system. The bill would authorize the ordinance to provide that selling merchandise without a 
permit is punishable as an infraction, and that subsequent violations after 2 prior convictions is an 
infraction or a misdemeanor punishable by imprisonment in the county jail not exceeding 6 
months. By creating a new crime, the bill would impose a state-mandated local program.   (Based 
on  06/26/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 926 Wahab, D 
 

Crimes: 
distribution of 
intimate 
images. 

09/19/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/19/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
289, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/19/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Would make it a crime for a person who is 18 years of age or older to intentionally create and 
distribute or cause to be distributed any photo realistic image, digital image, electronic image, 
computer image, computer-generated image, or other pictorial representation of an intimate body 
part or parts of another identifiable person, or an image of the person depicted engaged in an act 
of sexual intercourse, sodomy, oral copulation, sexual penetration, or an image of masturbation by 
the person depicted or in which the person depicted participates that was created in a manner that 
would cause a reasonable person to believe the image is an authentic image of the person 
depicted, under circumstances in which the person distributing the image knows or should know 
that distribution of the image will cause serious emotional distress, and the person depicted suffers 
that distress. By expanding the scope of a crime, this bill would impose a state-mandated local 
program. This bill would incorporate additional changes to Section 647 of the Penal Code 
proposed by AB 1874, AB 1962, and SB 1414, to be operative only if this bill and some or all of 
those other bills are enacted and this bill is enacted last.   (Based on  09/19/2024 text) 

SB 926 - SJ 
Support 
06.14.24.pdf 

Support 

SB 928 Niello, R 
 

Crimes: 
organized theft. 

01/12/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
PUB. S. on 
2/14/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law, until January 1, 2026, makes a person guilty of organized retail theft, punishable as a 
misdemeanor or a felony, as specified, if the person acts in concert with one or more persons to 
steal merchandise from one or more merchant’s premises or online marketplaces with the intent to 
sell or return the merchandise for value, acts in concert with 2 or more persons to receive, 
purchase, or possess merchandise knowing or believing it to have been stolen, acts as an agent of 
another to steal merchandise from one or more merchant’s premises or online marketplaces as 
part of an organized plan to commit theft, or recruits, coordinates, organizes, supervises, directs, 
manages, or finances another to undertake acts of theft. This bill would extend the operation of the 
crime of organized retail theft indefinitely.    (Based on  01/12/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=9g5K06+Ht6u19nboTVqSos91N4OI23uJYxAFf6d5f3F0dYK+TDuhYozafwwiVWypP/HTbQXzZ0dN7TlDUMQ+eMZm7432lV6sugbnxV8H4ds=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/257
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_925_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_925_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_925_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=kCETMOd6Kk9NwH3z7SeCCnFl3KR+r2nF0KaE1qHq268IErE455Y/o6rLT7Xb8pcsHByX4nOX4YeTJGgNGp/7NaOjpYnqe5ZXebSu0yB2MdA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/420
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_926_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_926_92_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=8801826B-DED3-4037-856C-2EBE10D927EF
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=8801826B-DED3-4037-856C-2EBE10D927EF
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=8801826B-DED3-4037-856C-2EBE10D927EF
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=z3jXCiew/LGCNWSxQfW96nCtbnbi24KJh4Lz5De//R4CeRLpXGkOLprmzGwHUlmQRtm5BFWjtLvlrYi01F0BKkpR2oT3OgvmkWfNvJys/e4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/419
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_928_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_928_99_I_bill.pdf
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SB 933 Wahab, D 
 

Crimes: child 
pornography. 

07/03/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/7/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law makes it a crime to, among other things, possess any matter, representation of 
information, data, or image, including, but not limited to, any film, filmstrip, photograph, negative, 
slide, photocopy, videotape, video laser disc, computer hardware, computer software, computer 
floppy disc, data storage media, CD-ROM, or computer-generated equipment or any other 
computer-generated image that contains or incorporates in any manner, any film or filmstrip, the 
production of which involves the use of a person under 18 years of age, knowing that the matter 
depicts a person under 18 years of age personally engaging in or simulating sexual conduct. This 
bill would, for the purposes of those provisions, include an image generated through the use of 
artificial intelligence, as defined, as a computer-generated image.   (Based on  07/03/2024 text) 

SB 933 - SJ 
Support 
06.14.24.pdf 

Support 

SB 937 Wiener, D 
 

Development 
projects: fees 
and charges. 

09/19/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/19/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
290, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/19/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The Mitigation Fee Act regulates fees for development projects, fees for specific purposes, 
including water and sewer connection fees, and fees for solar energy systems, among others. The 
act, among other things, requires local agencies to comply with various conditions when imposing 
fees, extractions, or charges as a condition of approval of a proposed development or 
development project. The act prohibits a local agency that imposes fees or charges on a 
residential development for the construction of public improvements or facilities from requiring the 
payment of those fees or charges until the date of the final inspection or the date the certificate of 
occupancy is issued, whichever occurs first, except for utility service fees, which the local agency 
is authorized to collect at the time an application for utility service is received. The act exempts 
specified units in a residential development proposed by a nonprofit housing developer if the 
housing development meets certain conditions. This bill would limit the utility service fees 
exception described above to utility service fees related to connections, and cap those fees at the 
costs incurred by the utility provider resulting from the connection activities.   (Based 
on  09/19/2024 text) 

Support Letter Support 

SB 938 Min, D 
 

Electrical and 
gas 
corporations: 
rate recovery: 
political 
activities and 
advertising. 

03/21/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
E. U., & C. 
on 
2/14/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would prohibit, except as provided, an electrical or gas corporation from recording various 
expenses associated with political influence activities, as defined, or with advertising, as defined, 
to accounts that contain expenses that the electrical or gas corporation recovers from ratepayers. 
The bill also would require an electrical or gas corporation, for each business unit of the 
corporation that performs work associated with political influence activities or advertising, to 
annually file with the commission a report containing specified information. The bill would require 
the commission to make the report publicly available.   (Based on  03/21/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=GBpwpKrSGnaLZZecavCJFyFUvWRkJqVfMpbu3VGXv/lasyLGuSxzL3JAKCBH+jQpuciFOc2gPU77spCcC27aee4jYp3FEc1I5l2yEkaIawc=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/420
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_933_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_933_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_933_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=ADF4DFF0-18E4-48C7-A760-E411817FA11C
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=ADF4DFF0-18E4-48C7-A760-E411817FA11C
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=ADF4DFF0-18E4-48C7-A760-E411817FA11C
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=46n1SMcS3d0e6dR/5FhQX5R5P0IQYB8hATVChkcaGxmg0hwUjnzZ8OIM8iJGMUA/T+JZ9e5v0mmTKJ3jusHHKl0qoSPXV7+sTgaXQQdaB9c=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/257
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_937_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_937_92_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=FFB01B07-2B9C-4AF7-A562-83DAB6E541AD
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=HnjdMfGyGVxqyKCYx3kNK2VNqq/+g9m/x8HxeMfuqJKZ36xrhiOq2c9SoI6HGZxdLmFEyo9I1RXZeIUtrrIip+I8OUF0co+FrKlNh8MQuTE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/461
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_938_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_938_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_938_98_A_bill.pdf
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SB 942 Becker, D 
 

California AI 
Transparency 
Act. 

09/19/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/19/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
291, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/19/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law requires the Secretary of Government Operations to develop a coordinated plan to, 
among other things, investigate the feasibility of, and obstacles to, developing standards and 
technologies for state departments to determine digital content provenance. For the purpose of 
informing that coordinated plan, existing law requires the secretary to evaluate, among other 
things, the impact of the proliferation of deepfakes, defined to mean audio or visual content that 
has been generated or manipulated by artificial intelligence that would falsely appear to be 
authentic or truthful and that features depictions of people appearing to say or do things they did 
not say or do without their consent, on state government, California-based businesses, and 
residents of the state. This bill, the California AI Transparency Act, would, among other things, 
require a covered provider, as defined, to make available an artificial intelligence (AI) detection tool 
at no cost to the user that meets certain criteria, including that the AI detection tool is publicly 
accessible. The bill would require a covered provider to offer the user an option to include a 
manifest disclosure in image, video, or audio content, or content that is any combination thereof, 
created or altered by the covered provider’s generative artificial intelligence (GenAI) system that, 
among other things, identifies content as AI-generated content and is clear, conspicuous, 
appropriate for the medium of the content, and understandable to a reasonable person. The bill 
would require a covered provider to include a latent disclosure in AI-generated image, video, audio 
content, or content that is any combination thereof, created by the covered provider’s GenAI 
system that, among other things, to the extent that it is technically feasible and reasonable 
conveys certain information, either directly or through a link to a permanent internet website, 
regarding the provenance of the content.   (Based on  09/19/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 955 Seyarto, R 
 

Office of 
Planning and 
Research: 
Infrastructure 
Gap-Fund 
Program. 

04/04/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
4/15/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would require the Office of Planning and Research, upon appropriation by the Legislature, to 
establish the Infrastructure Gap-Fund Program to provide grants to local agencies to develop and 
construct infrastructure projects, as defined. The bill would authorize the office to provide funding 
for up to 20% of a project’s total cost, subject to specified requirements, including, among other 
things, that the office is prohibited from awarding a grant to a local agency unless the local agency 
provides funding that has been raised through local taxes for at least 10% of the infrastructure 
project’s total cost. The bill would require the office to develop guidelines to implement the 
program that establish the criteria by which grant applications will be evaluated and funded. The 
bill would make these provisions operative January 1, 2027.   (Based on  04/04/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=R4S87EYMzcUjekIuOzfvdV3UrPywXstCYHhbr5UG/o5lQkBSIFSSAzFjEjHL4Awa0pq1+wSp5BfcRmeB3CDfbXFKsWKqIlwCLfWqbMlCc8M=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/392
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_942_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0901-0950/sb_942_91_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=qTYyV+BremHnc5yVj9Q8q/uBNnbKw8yX2c0kEyPZBnniu6wNI5xyf6NE7R+vsG3q/5WWp1DSlkQDuOoy8jmiFXT0dDEqdRRMvhdr3ZHuG08=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/476
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_955_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_955_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_955_97_A_bill.pdf
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SB 960 Wiener, D 
 

Transportation: 
planning: 
complete 
streets 
facilities: transit 
priority 
facilities. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
630, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/27/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law requires the Department of Transportation to improve and maintain the state’s 
highways, and establishes various programs to fund the development, construction, and repair of 
local roads, bridges, and other critical transportation infrastructure in the state, including the state 
highway operation and protection program (SHOPP). Current law requires the department, in 
consultation with the California Transportation Commission, to prepare a robust asset 
management plan to guide selection of projects for the SHOPP. Current law requires the 
commission, in connection with the plan, to adopt targets and performance measures reflecting 
state transportation goals and objectives. Existing law requires the department to develop, in 
consultation with the commission, a plain language performance report to increase transparency 
and accountability of the SHOPP. This bill would require the targets and performance measures 
adopted by the commission to include targets and performance measures reflecting state 
transportation goals and objectives for complete streets assets that reflect the existence and 
conditions of bicycle, pedestrian, and transit priority facilities on the state highway system. The bill 
would require the department’s plain language performance report to include a description of 
complete streets facilities, including pedestrian, bicycle, and transit priority facilities on each 
project, as specified.   (Based on  09/27/2024 text) 

SB 960 Support 
Letter 
04.17.24.pdf 
Governor 
Signature 
Request 

Support 

SB 961 Wiener, D 
 

Vehicles: safety 
equipment. 

09/28/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/28/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
the 
Governor. In 
Senate. 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto 
pending.  

09/28/2024 - 
Senate  VETO
ED 

Would require, commencing with the 2030 model year, every passenger vehicle, motortruck, and 
bus manufactured, sold as new, or leased as new in the state to be equipped with a passive 
intelligent speed assistance system, as specified, that would utilize a brief, one-time, visual and 
audio signal to alert the driver each time the speed of the vehicle is more than 10 miles per hour 
over the speed limit. The bill would exempt emergency vehicles, certain motortrucks, motorcycles, 
motorized bicycles, mopeds, and certain passenger vehicles from this requirement. The bill would 
require the system to be capable of being fully disabled, by the manufacturer or a franchisee, for 
emergency vehicles. The bill would require the system, if the system receives conflicting speed 
limits for the same area, to apply the higher speed limit.   (Based on  09/05/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 968 Seyarto, R 
 

Planning and 
zoning: 
regional 
housing needs 
allocation. 

01/24/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
HOUSING 
on 
2/14/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law requires each council of governments or delegate subregion, as applicable, to develop 
a proposed methodology for distributing the existing and projected regional housing need to cities, 
counties, and cities and counties within the region or within the subregion, as provided. Current 
law requires the consideration of several specified factors in developing the methodology. Current 
law prohibits certain criteria from being a justification for a determination or reduction in a 
jurisdiction’s share of the regional housing need, including prior underproduction of housing in a 
city or county from the previous regional housing need allocation, as specified. This bill would 
permit the council of governments or delegate subregion, in developing the methodology, to 
consider prior overproduction of housing units in a city or county from the previous regional 
housing need allocation in a particular income category and to count it as credit toward the future 
regional housing need allocation of that same income category in the next cycle. The bill would 
provide that the amount eligible to count as credit toward the next cycle is determined by each 
jurisdiction’s most recent annual progress report, as specified.    (Based on  01/24/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=OvskVFDwsDCSkfS+4KDzalfPIVj79bVT4lz2/CO3PRaEvdljGyKx/pECaDJdt+AMFRjau6TI21z/juX9tu3CIVqgG0cwwUpck3CdPlIg1KA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/257
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_960_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_960_92_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=93404E7E-F8C5-411E-85BA-98AC7B5E7AC8
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=93404E7E-F8C5-411E-85BA-98AC7B5E7AC8
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=93404E7E-F8C5-411E-85BA-98AC7B5E7AC8
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=B0B4BD6A-60AF-47BD-8E6D-22075BF67130
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=B0B4BD6A-60AF-47BD-8E6D-22075BF67130
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=B0B4BD6A-60AF-47BD-8E6D-22075BF67130
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=t8G9S9fkFimcq/mSkhfV85TbzG597kGTbAornpyOoYyMdzcggrxX6V4pvB93v8BED/8/iwUgG9IhuI0V8ypDzOdBo4ktvx5DAFpPcM2NuV4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/257
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_961_92_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_961_92_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_961_92_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=FiPIA1eqItqyosA1Kn9Yzyh0A3WoK3otjcacT9LVIoiAqd5FERuRRcqYmOC7QjAcZkF6SDv+PPPWRsRwrEs7bQwSiQtnNvijqTFx8Mm8WOI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/476
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_968_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_968_99_I_bill.pdf
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SB 969 Wiener, D 
 

Alcoholic 
beverages: 
entertainment 
zones: 
consumption. 

09/28/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/28/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
869, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/28/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The Alcoholic Beverage Control Act contains various provisions regulating the application for, the 
issuance of, the suspension of, and the conditions imposed upon alcoholic beverage licenses by 
the Department of Alcoholic Beverage Control. Current law defines “entertainment zone” for 
purposes of the act as a zone created by ordinance on or after January 1, 2024, in the City and 
County of San Francisco, that authorizes consumption of one or more types of alcoholic 
beverages on public streets, sidewalks, or public rights-of-way adjacent to and during a special 
event permitted or licensed by the department. Current law authorizes the City and County of San 
Francisco to establish an entertainment zone, subject to certain requirements, including providing 
specified information relating to the entertainment zone to the department and establishing a 
process or procedure by which persons in possession of alcoholic beverages in the entertainment 
zone may be readily identifiable as being 21 years of age or older. This bill would, instead, define 
“entertainment zone” as a zone created by a city, county, or city and county ordinance on or after 
January 1, 2025, that authorizes consumption of one or more types of alcoholic beverages on 
public streets, sidewalks, or public rights-of-way. The bill would additionally authorize any city, 
county, or city and county to establish an entertainment zone, subject to the above-described 
requirements. Before enacting an ordinance to establish or modify an entertainment zone, the bill 
would require a city, county, or city and county to notify local law enforcement and request 
feedback about specific information, including, among others, the entertainment zone’s proposed 
boundaries and days and hours of operation.   (Based on  09/28/2024 text) 

SB 969_Sponsor 
02.02.24.pdf 
Governor 
Signature 
Request 

Sponsor 

SB 970 Ashby, D 
 

Artificial 
intelligence 
technology. 

04/11/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
5/6/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law prohibits the false impersonation of another person in either their personal or official 
capacity with the intent to steal or defraud, as specified. This bill would define various terms 
related to artificial intelligence and synthetic content, and would clarify that use of such synthetic 
content, as specified, is deemed to be a false personation for purposes of these and other criminal 
provisions.   (Based on  04/11/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 972 Min, D 
 

Methane 
emissions: 
organic waste: 
landfills. 

09/22/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/20/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
the 
Governor. In 
Senate. 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto 
pending.  

09/20/2024 - 
Senate  VETO
ED 

Current law requires the State Air Resources Board to approve and begin implementing a 
comprehensive strategy to reduce emissions of short-lived climate pollutants in the state and to 
achieve a reduction in specified emissions, including methane, as provided. Current law requires 
the methane reduction goals to include a 75% reduction target from the 2014 level by 2025. 
Existing law requires the Department of Resources Recycling and Recovery, in consultation with 
the state board, to adopt regulations, as provided, that achieve the targets for reducing organic 
waste in landfills. This bill would require the department to provide procedures for local 
jurisdictions to request technical assistance regarding organic waste and methane reduction 
requirements from the department, to post those procedures on its internet website, and to provide 
that technical assistance, as specified.   (Based on  08/30/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=+22VZQhhAODE0LPcotZ4WJ7vcMRPP1QL3GJ3wslpIQOQCUhijPW61QafnGE59ieDFLhI2JtEeuwR8cvA4zftIWtB/R+hnHRla5krsNfDaFY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/257
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_969_95_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_969_95_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E4986D0D-A98C-4AC8-8114-D65E7CE39107
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E4986D0D-A98C-4AC8-8114-D65E7CE39107
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=825E21F3-118C-4A60-950C-B5A547AE9036
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=825E21F3-118C-4A60-950C-B5A547AE9036
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=825E21F3-118C-4A60-950C-B5A547AE9036
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=2zR/73qdK+q0dV//Weve7U8HZx8KeqHDDgPzxf4haec3wx/ZnaxtI89aiNOXX9nW0fTmfuPFj3XccNRHE7m3IyPCiUX/sDv7zOq5a8m0X2g=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/335
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_970_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_970_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_970_98_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=9ihyoGN/NIA+/R6dl2p9QxrcwmmXGGb0EGkbr4coldWsCnNzsqaa4BzqtuhputolwOq4p0SKVBEmxVuNs5zVdYqQpoqA7+CZZECMQ1mPAzI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/461
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_972_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_972_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_972_94_E_bill.pdf
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SB 981 Wahab, D 
 

Sexually 
explicit digital 
images. 

09/19/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/19/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
292, 
Statutes of 
2024 

09/19/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Would require a social media platform to provide a mechanism that is reasonably accessible to a 
reporting user who is a California resident who has an account with the social media platform to 
report digital identify theft to the social media platform. The bill would define “sexually explicit 
digital identity theft” to mean the posting of covered material on a social media platform and would 
define “covered material” to mean material that meets certain criteria, including that the material is 
an image or video created or altered through digitization that would appear to a reasonable person 
to be an image or video of an intimate body part of an identifiable person or an identifiable person 
engaged in certain sexual acts, and that the reporting person is the person depicted in the material 
and did not consent to the use of the reporting person’s likeness in the material. The bill would 
also require a social media platform to immediately remove a reported instance of sexually explicit 
digital identity theft from being publicly viewable on the social media platform if the social media 
platform determines there is a reasonable basis to believe the reported sexually explicit digital 
identity theft is sexually explicit digital identity theft, as prescribed.   (Based on  09/19/2024 text) 

SB 981 - SJ 
Support 
06.14.24.pdf 

Support 

SB 982 Wahab, D 
 

Crimes: 
organized theft. 

08/16/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

08/16/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
171, 
Statutes of 
2024 

08/16/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Existing law, until January 1, 2026, makes a person guilty of organized retail theft, punishable as a 
misdemeanor or a felony, as specified, if the person acts in concert with one or more persons to 
steal merchandise from one or more merchant's premises or online marketplaces with the intent to 
sell or return the merchandise for value, acts in concert with 2 or more persons to receive, 
purchase, or possess merchandise knowing or believing it to have been stolen, acts as an agent of 
another to steal merchandise from one or more merchant's premises or online marketplaces as 
part of an organized plan to commit theft, or recruits, coordinates, organizes, supervises, directs, 
manages, or finances another to undertake acts of theft. This bill would extend the operation of the 
crime of organized retail theft indefinitely. By extending the operation of an existing crime, this bill 
would impose a state-mandated local program. This bill contains other related provisions and other 
existing laws.   (Based on  08/16/2024 text) 

SB 982 - Support 
05.14.24.pdf 

Support 

SB 983 Wahab, D 
 

Energy: 
gasoline 
stations and 
alternative fuel 
infrastructure. 

09/23/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/22/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
the 
Governor. In 
Senate. 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto 
pending.  

09/22/2024 - 
Senate  VETO
ED 

Current law vests the State Energy Resources Conservation and Development Commission with 
jurisdiction over various energy-related matters. This bill would require the commission, upon 
appropriation by the Legislature, to form the Alternative Fuels Infrastructure Taskforce to conduct a 
study on retail gasoline fueling stations and alternative fuels infrastructure, as provided. The bill 
would require the taskforce, on or before January 1, 2027, to submit to the Legislature a report on 
the study with information and recommendations.   (Based on  09/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=yqkM3L4/yVsZMwRpOsQp4BpTcHnxxB3hHeZaMMbJchBDLeIne2cgAnyidQ/RREUhI5E7ZLkuottz1I2coIZ+FIf88gwuq4oanxDRqju0ABQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/420
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_981_92_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_981_92_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=AD30D212-C1D0-4ED3-9418-88457AD1F41B
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=AD30D212-C1D0-4ED3-9418-88457AD1F41B
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=AD30D212-C1D0-4ED3-9418-88457AD1F41B
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Oyjy6zHert9ct23IWDchKg08z/ocTkupFvkeR4wpufbeP8IM8BrROElCcpNESbz+ircQKmTdm2eSbpUzOsldPTvxAzyhkU/iFAjrU2bkpVw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/420
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_982_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_982_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E514706D-C010-445F-ADB4-4A150C65034D
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=E514706D-C010-445F-ADB4-4A150C65034D
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=2d7skGWZxiJ9jFCCkA/CjnWtu3mrlvBhuokt9b99M75m8O6xRkDegbe41ij4HF8DO/Y4YDNX85Eemzk7dSWwN55dOSdGoMH46sRk2oUcBpI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/420
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_983_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_983_94_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0951-1000/sb_983_94_E_bill.pdf


Attachment B: Intergovernmental Relations Priority State Legislation Log 
 

Last Updated 12/06/24        200 
 

Measure Author Topic Current 
Text 

Status Location Brief Summary Attachments Position 

SB 1011 Jones, R 
 

Encampments: 
penalties. 

02/05/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
PUB. S. on 
2/14/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Under current law, a nuisance is anything that is injurious to health or indecent or offensive to the 
senses, or an obstruction to the free use of property, so as to interfere with the comfortable 
enjoyment of life or property. Current law also provides that a nuisance is anything that obstructs 
the free passage or use of any public park, square, street, or highway, among other things. Under 
current law, a public nuisance is a nuisance that affects the entire community, neighborhood, or a 
considerable number of persons. Current law provides various remedies against a public 
nuisance, including abatement by any public body or officer authorized by law. This bill would 
prohibit a person from sitting, lying, sleeping, or storing, using, maintaining, or placing personal 
property upon a street or sidewalk if a homeless shelter, as defined, is available to the person. The 
bill would also prohibit sitting, lying, sleeping, or storing, using, maintaining, or placing personal 
property within 500 feet of a public or private school, open space, or major transit stop, as 
specified. The bill would specify that a violation of this prohibition is a public nuisance that can be 
abated and prevented, as specified. The bill would also provide that a violation of the prohibition 
may be charged as a misdemeanor or an infraction, at the discretion of the prosecutor. The bill 
would prohibit a person from being found in violation of the bill’s provisions unless provided notice, 
at least 72 hours before commencement of any enforcement action, as specified.    (Based 
on  02/05/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1018 Becker, D 
 

Electricity. 07/03/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/7/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The Public Utilities Act defines “electrical corporation” to include every corporation or person 
owning, controlling, operating, or managing any electric plant for compensation within this state, 
except as specified. The act authorizes the Public Utilities Commission to fix the rates and charges 
for every public utility and requires that those rates and charges be just and reasonable. This bill 
would revise the definition of “electrical corporation” to exclude a corporation or person employing 
certain solar or wind generating technology if electricity is transmitted exclusively and directly 
through private electrical lines to a single facility owned by a different corporation or person that 
uses the electricity only for new load, not for departing load, and for an electrolytic hydrogen 
production facility, as defined, or a facility using the electricity to provide industrial process heat, or 
both.    (Based on  07/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1031 Wiener, D 
 

San Francisco 
Bay area: local 
revenue 
measure: 
transportation 
improvements. 

05/20/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
DESK on 
5/24/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law creates the Metropolitan Transportation Commission as a local area planning agency 
for the 9-county San Francisco Bay area with comprehensive regional transportation planning and 
other related responsibilities. Current law creates various transit districts located in the San 
Francisco Bay area, with specified powers and duties relating to providing public transit services. 
This bill would authorize the commission to raise and allocate new revenue and incur and issue 
bonds and other indebtedness, as specified. In this regard, the bill would authorize the 
commission, until January 1, 2041, to impose a retail transactions and use tax, a regional payroll 
tax, a parcel tax, and a regional vehicle registration surcharge in all or a subset of the 9 counties of 
the San Francisco Bay area, except as specified, in accordance with applicable constitutional 
requirements. The bill would prohibit a tax or surcharge described above from being imposed for a 
period of time of more than 30 years. The bill would require the parcel tax to be collected by 
counties and the other 3 taxes to be collected by specified state agencies, and would require the 
net revenues from those taxes to be remitted to the commission, as prescribed.   (Based 
on  05/20/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=dO4TI0uk1dN93w71TrKyF/JBKlsV/jB6IcGeZLLufbIoXXUcUddTdtJxscjJ6glYDpk4CeipWXqi1veHutLJw/XPihDWbCQeWBamBh4E3rY=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/404
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1001-1050/sb_1011_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1001-1050/sb_1011_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=p91lwXFt5BhZYsHSAkuVoxNskCcz6gugZz4VN1BYG2OkNjxevrX1J8FcsHeoqWkp2rwBZkcjTBRnIMrdV1FdnkCTYF0UKbZ7JWRCN4cIjks=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/392
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1001-1050/sb_1018_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1001-1050/sb_1018_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1001-1050/sb_1018_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=OumMcZz7mPIjZ/9evEEGaDzIk2QqZAvyFKLapfx54L0wwjtQeG23u114ol253onosIqu5OCgft+bXUw8OFv6kcb4N6TfjAZHhQDcC7c9UUc=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/257
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1001-1050/sb_1031_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1001-1050/sb_1031_94_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1001-1050/sb_1031_94_A_bill.pdf
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SB 1037 Wiener, D 
 

Planning and 
zoning: housing 
element: 
enforcement. 

09/19/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/19/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
293, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/19/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The Planning and Zoning Law requires a city or county to adopt a general plan for land use 
development within its boundaries that includes, among other things, a housing element. The 
Planning and Zoning Law requires the Department of Housing and Community Development 
(HCD) to determine whether the housing element is in substantial compliance with specified 
provisions of that law. The Planning and Zoning Law requires HCD to notify a city, county, or city 
and county, and authorizes HCD to notify the office of the Attorney General, that the city, county, 
or city and county is in violation of state law if the local government has taken action in violation of 
specified provisions of law. The Planning and Zoning Law also requires, among other things, that 
an application for a housing development be subject to a specified streamlined, ministerial 
approval process if the development satisfies certain objective planning standards. The Planning 
and Zoning Law requires a city or county to bring its general plan into substantial compliance with 
provisions regulating general plans and specifies timelines under which the city or county is 
required to bring its zoning ordinance into consistency if the court finds in favor of a plaintiff in an 
action challenging the validity of a general plan, or any mandatory element thereof, as specified. 
This bill, in any action brought by the Attorney General or HCD to enforce the adoption of housing 
element revisions, as specified, or to enforce any state law that requires a city, county, or local 
agency to ministerially approve any planning or permitting application related to a housing 
development project, as specified, would subject the city, county, or local agency to specified 
remedies, including a civil penalty of, at minimum, $10,000 per month, and not exceeding $50,000 
per month, for each violation, as specified. The bill would require that the penalties set forth in its 
provisions only apply when the local agency’s acts or omissions, as described, are arbitrary, 
capricious, or entirely lacking in evidentiary support, contrary to established public policy, unlawful, 
or procedurally unfair. The bill would require a court to modify certain of its prior orders, including 
an order directing a city or county to substantially comply with provisions regulating general plans 
and to bring its zoning ordinance into consistency, to impose, among other things, the maximum 
penalty specified in these provisions, as provided.   (Based on  09/19/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=mzVG2Ty8ZtMU0X9qCKB4Moe7GjZoEuaTFYhxm+vxXU1JEdQika7JpG23MnvRohpKcm3ktYF//vavN4PVA1pLjDo+F2yMX7z1LL6n/Bug2Xo=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/257
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1001-1050/sb_1037_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1001-1050/sb_1037_93_C_bill.pdf
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SB 1047 Wiener, D 
 

Safe and 
Secure 
Innovation for 
Frontier 
Artificial 
Intelligence 
Models Act. 

09/29/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/29/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
the 
Governor. In 
Senate. 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto 
pending.  

09/29/2024 - 
Senate  VETO
ED 

Current law requires the Secretary of Government Operations to develop a coordinated plan to, 
among other things, investigate the feasibility of, and obstacles to, developing standards and 
technologies for state departments to determine digital content provenance. For the purpose of 
informing that coordinated plan, current law requires the secretary to evaluate, among other 
things, the impact of the proliferation of deepfakes, defined to mean audio or visual content that 
has been generated or manipulated by artificial intelligence that would falsely appear to be 
authentic or truthful and that features depictions of people appearing to say or do things they did 
not say or do without their consent, on state government, California-based businesses, and 
residents of the state. This bill would enact the Safe and Secure Innovation for Frontier Artificial 
Intelligence Models Act to, among other things, require that a developer, before beginning to 
initially train a covered model, as defined, comply with various requirements, including 
implementing the capability to promptly enact a full shutdown, as defined, and implement a written 
and separate safety and security protocol, as specified. The bill would require a developer to retain 
an unredacted copy of the safety and security protocol for as long as the covered model is made 
available for commercial, public, or foreseeably public use plus 5 years, including records and 
dates of any updates or revisions and would require a developer to grant to the Attorney General 
access to the unredacted safety and security protocol. The bill would prohibit a developer from 
using a covered model or covered model derivative for a purpose not exclusively related to the 
training or reasonable evaluation of the covered model or compliance with state or federal law or 
making a covered model or a covered model derivative available for commercial or public, or 
foreseeably public, use, if there is an unreasonable risk that the covered model or covered model 
derivative will cause or materially enable a critical harm, as defined. The bill would require a 
developer, beginning January 1, 2026, to annually retain a third-party auditor to perform an 
independent audit of compliance with those provisions, as prescribed.   (Based on  09/03/2024 
text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=CObqYOVHY0tqkb2H6VJ7m75jU3WgfK6W0B5+mdBqBKWts6TmeI6HofwH3Y57eQznNcLzfJ0nUzO+t0vDr0JQouZmOBJXw0TtqJ+Do1jWp5w=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/257
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1001-1050/sb_1047_88_E_bill.htm
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https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1001-1050/sb_1047_88_E_bill.pdf
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SB 1053 Blakespear, D 
 

Solid waste: 
recycled paper 
bags: 
standards: 
carryout bag 
prohibition. 

09/22/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/22/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
453, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/22/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law prohibits a store, as defined, from providing a single-use carryout bag to a customer at 
the point of sale, with specified exceptions, including an exemption for bags used to contain 
unwrapped food. Current law defines a “single-use carryout bag” as a bag made of plastic, paper, 
or other material that is provided by a store to a customer at the point of sale and that is not a 
recycled paper bag or a reusable grocery bag that meets specified requirements, including that the 
bag be made by a certified reusable grocery bag producer and meets specified requirements with 
regard to the bag’s durability, material, labeling, heavy metal content, and, with regard to reusable 
grocery bags made from plastic film, recycled material content. Current law prohibits a producer of 
reusable grocery bags made from plastic film from selling or distributing those bags unless the 
producer is certified by a third-party certification entity, and provides proof of that certification and 
a certification fee to the Department of Resources Recycling and Recovery, as specified. Current 
law also prohibits a store from selling or distributing a recycled paper bag at the point of sale 
unless the store makes that bag available for purchase for not less than $0.10. Current law defines 
“recycled paper bag,” in part, as a paper carryout bag that contains a minimum of 40% 
postconsumer recycled materials, except as provided, and meets other requirements. Current law 
allows a retail establishment to voluntarily comply with these requirements, if the retail 
establishment provides the department with irrevocable notice. This bill would, commencing 
January 1, 2026, revise and recast those provisions to, among other things, recast the definition of 
a “single-use carryout bag” to a “carryout bag,” and would revise the definition to mean a bag 
made of plastic, paper, or other material that is provided by a store to a customer at the point of 
sale for the purpose of carrying purchased goods and that is not a recycled paper bag. The bill 
would create a carryout bag exception to include a bag provided to a customer before the 
customer reaches the point of sale, that is designed to protect a purchased item from damaging or 
contaminating other purchased items in a checkout bag, or to contain an unwrapped food item, as 
specified. The bill would revise the definition of “recycled paper bag” to require it be made from a 
minimum of 50% postconsumer recycled materials on and after January 1, 2028, without 
exception.   (Based on  09/22/2024 text) 

SB 1053 Support 
05.23.24.pdf 

Support 

SB 1095 Becker, D 
 

Cozy Homes 
Cleanup Act: 
building 
standards: gas-
fuel-burning 
appliances. 

04/08/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
4/15/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The Manufactured Housing Act of 1980 (the “act”), requires the Department of Housing and 
Community Development to enforce various laws pertaining to the structural, fire safety, plumbing, 
heat-producing, or electrical systems and installations or equipment of a manufactured home, 
mobilehome, commercial coach, or special purpose commercial coach. The act defines 
“manufactured home” and “mobilehome” to mean a structure that meets specified requirements, 
including that the structure is transportable in one or more sections and is 8 body feet or more in 
width, or 40 body feet or more in length, in the traveling mode, or, when erected onsite, is 320 or 
more square feet, and includes the plumbing, heating, air-conditioning, and electrical systems 
contained within the structure. The act specifies that it does not prohibit the replacement of water 
heaters or appliances for comfort heating in manufactured homes or mobilehomes with fuel-gas-
burning water heaters or fuel-gas appliances for comfort heating that are not specifically listed for 
use in a manufactured home or mobilehome, as specified. This bill would extend those provisions 
to also apply to electric water heaters and electric appliances for comfort heating that are not 
specifically listed for use in a manufactured home or mobilehome.   (Based on  04/08/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=12kOFrAfhOU0HoqjgkjgmeqLvp5IS6EXlWK6fRD1L49clT7kbs6M1rcj7A47NOCxxqPN9TY+N4Y+9YE51I1L8PemXhw7G89pqyiI8utc+Yw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/342
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1051-1100/sb_1053_90_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1051-1100/sb_1053_90_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=C2E4351A-115E-4904-B55C-93B9489E8CE8
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=C2E4351A-115E-4904-B55C-93B9489E8CE8
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=/Vdm1y8TVlhzIS6KkPvGK+AzMyMKWctmqm0/hR+CFKL9N2FiwblisoGyWkPVn+e7RxQQLfYfxdlSyHEKvzOMeWKafU+crmzd7sdou7Ml7Y8=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/392
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1051-1100/sb_1095_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1051-1100/sb_1095_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1051-1100/sb_1095_97_A_bill.pdf
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SB 1103 Menjivar, D 
 

Tenancy of 
commercial 
real properties: 
agreements: 
building 
operating 
costs. 

09/30/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/30/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
1015, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/30/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law requires a landlord of a residential dwelling to give notice to the tenant a certain 
number of days before the effective date of a rent increase depending on the amount of the 
increase, as specified. This bill would apply this requirement to leases of commercial real property 
by a qualified commercial tenant, as defined. The bill would specify, in all leases for commercial 
real property by a qualified commercial tenant, that a rent increase would not be effective until the 
notice period required by these provisions has expired. The bill would also specify that a violation 
of these provisions would not entitle a qualified commercial tenant to civil penalties. The bill would 
require a landlord of a commercial real property to include information on these provisions in the 
notice.   (Based on  09/30/2024 text) 

Support Letter Support 

SB 1116 Portantino, D 
 

Unemployment 
insurance: 
trade disputes: 
eligibility for 
benefits. 

02/13/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
INS. on 
6/3/2024) 

07/02/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law provides for the payment of unemployment compensation benefits and extended 
benefits to eligible individuals who meet specified requirements. Under current law, unemployment 
benefits are paid from the Unemployment Fund, which is continuously appropriated for these 
purposes. Current law makes an employee ineligible for benefits if the employee left work because 
of a trade dispute and specifies that the employee remains ineligible for the duration of the trade 
dispute. Existing case law holds that employees who left work due to a lockout by the employer, 
even if it was in anticipation of a trade dispute, are eligible for benefits. This bill would restore 
eligibility after the first 2 weeks for an employee who left work because of a trade 
dispute.    (Based on  02/13/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1130 Bradford, D 
 

Electricity: 
Family Electric 
Rate 
Assistance 
program. 

09/22/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/22/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
457, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/22/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law requires the Public Utilities Commission to continue a program of assistance to 
residential customers of the state’s 3 largest electrical corporations consisting of households of 3 
or more persons with total household annual gross income levels between 200% and 250% of the 
federal poverty guideline level, which is referred to as the Family Electric Rate Assistance (FERA) 
program. This bill would expand eligibility for the FERA program by eliminating the requirement 
that a household consist of 3 or more persons. The bill would require the commission, by March 1, 
2025, and each year thereafter, to require the state’s 3 largest electrical corporations to report on 
their efforts to enroll customers in the FERA program. The bill would require the commission, by 
June 1, 2025, and each year thereafter, to review each electrical corporation’s report to ensure it 
has made reasonable efforts to enroll eligible households in the FERA program commensurate 
with the proportion of households the commission determines to be eligible within the electrical 
corporation’s service territory.   (Based on  09/22/2024 text) 

SJCE LOS_SB 
1130 
(Bradford).pdf 

Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=3DcS0vo42gCGvBlTuK5/0Y1LO85Jwu9SDtHK9ExeMw/szcsftAESw4YJS+ADcO+ZEQrjXrJFlfOXaZxeSZWSY7W2l/QT0pe7qTfiFgAL/S4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/423
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1101-1150/sb_1103_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1101-1150/sb_1103_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=CC357543-EA36-4FDD-8395-B338588E9EFD
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=xeJRd69Vd09uUJ6DHFbE3hUUQw8/eLAmtHlhELOwGBH1h9GpPwnnr8rRUaExaWmAQxmylP2yhTErDaJxoIAOjRxGhrnqY7/ZkTFFJN9L47c=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/262
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1101-1150/sb_1116_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1101-1150/sb_1116_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Q9hRrtnSOYj8w2gyAXzeCD6YY56G3HjA3T2kwH9E6ef9iaYGd3ksIfOtJFYDRjpWTN5A20gqNbLuD3xk8tozt25VASJIFOeGuDFlOM1As5Y=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/456
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1101-1150/sb_1130_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1101-1150/sb_1130_96_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=FC847C57-6B01-41BB-A182-566E9D0D0C42
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=FC847C57-6B01-41BB-A182-566E9D0D0C42
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=FC847C57-6B01-41BB-A182-566E9D0D0C42


Attachment B: 2023-2024 Intergovernmental Relations Priority State Legislation Log 
 

Last Updated 12/06/24        205 
 

Measure Author Topic Current 
Text 

Status Location Brief Summary Attachments Position 

SB 1142 Menjivar, D 
 

Electrical and 
gas 
corporations: 
restoration and 
termination of 
services. 

09/25/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/25/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
600, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/25/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law prohibits an electrical or gas corporation from terminating residential service for 
nonpayment of a delinquent account unless the corporation first gives notice of the delinquency 
and impending termination, as provided. Existing law requires the notice to include information on 
procedures by which the affected residential customer may initiate a complaint, request an 
investigation concerning the service or charges, and request amortization of the unpaid charges. 
Current law requires that a residential customer who initiated a complaint, requested an 
investigation, or requested an extension of the payment period be given an opportunity for review 
of the complaint, investigation, or request by a review manager of the corporation. Current law 
requires the review to include a consideration of whether the customer is to be permitted to 
amortize the unpaid balance of the delinquent account over a reasonable time period, not to 
exceed 12 months.This bill would require an electrical or gas corporation to restore service to a 
residential customer whose service was previously terminated for nonpayment of delinquent 
amounts upon the customer entering into an amortization agreement or any other arrearage 
payment plan determined by the commission. The bill would require the restoration of service to 
occur by specified deadlines.   (Based on  09/25/2024 text) 

SB 1142 Support 
Letter 
04.17.24.pdf 
SB 1142 - SJ 
Support 
06.11.24.pdf 
Governor 
Signature 
Request 

Support 

SB 1143 Allen, D 
 

Paint products: 
stewardship 
program. 

09/29/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/29/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
989, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/29/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law establishes the architectural paint recovery program, which is administered by the 
Department of Resources Recycling and Recovery (CalRecycle) and requires a manufacturer or 
designated stewardship organization to develop and implement a stewardship plan. Current law 
requires the stewardship plan to include a recovery program to reduce the generation of, promote 
the reuse of, and manage the end-of-life of, postconsumer architectural paint, as provided. Current 
law prohibits a manufacturer or retailer from selling or offering for sale architectural paint in the 
state unless the manufacturer is in compliance with the program. Current law requires the 
stewardship organization to pay to CalRecycle quarterly administrative fees to cover CalRecycle’s 
full administrative and enforcement costs of the program, as provided. Existing law authorizes 
CalRecycle to impose a civil penalty on any person in violation of the program, as specified. 
Current law requires CalRecycle to adopt regulations to implement the program. Current law 
establishes the Architectural Paint Stewardship Account and the Architectural Paint Stewardship 
Penalty Subaccount in the Integrated Waste Management Fund for the deposit of fees and civil 
penalties, respectively, imposed pursuant to the program and makes moneys in the account and 
subaccount available upon appropriation by the Legislature for purposes of the program. This bill 
would revise and recast the architectural paint recovery program as the paint product recovery 
program. The bill would expand the scope of the stewardship program from architectural paint to 
paint products, and thereby subject paint products to the requirements of the program. The bill 
would define “paint product” to mean architectural coatings, aerosol coating products, nonindustrial 
coatings, and coating-related products, as provided. The bill would exempt aerosol coating 
products, coating-related products, and nonindustrial coatings added to the stewardship program 
by the bill from the requirements of the program until January 1, 2028, or the approved 
stewardship plan’s implementation date for those products, whichever occurs sooner, as specified. 
Among other changes, the bill would require a manufacturer, individually or through a stewardship 
organization, to review its plan at least every 5 years after approval by CalRecycle and determine 
whether amendments to the plan are necessary.   (Based on  09/29/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=FfGd9LSuBvJc1rLSep/8Cw2JQNTXCwnjoxzm0BDiUPhyvjujh/Ut04Mqeg68pYaqDTVufsYNIJwNW6HP84XV30DQiJ3RIL1ClyFWGih+FIE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/423
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1101-1150/sb_1142_93_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1101-1150/sb_1142_93_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=BE2CA1FF-47C1-4DAD-9B09-7B1B275E0868
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=BE2CA1FF-47C1-4DAD-9B09-7B1B275E0868
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=BE2CA1FF-47C1-4DAD-9B09-7B1B275E0868
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=C2B8D65E-7E63-45BD-AC7E-63FEF3C4F6C3
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=C2B8D65E-7E63-45BD-AC7E-63FEF3C4F6C3
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=C2B8D65E-7E63-45BD-AC7E-63FEF3C4F6C3
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=7361A0C9-C1AD-48B9-A57E-6DCB873982CD
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=7361A0C9-C1AD-48B9-A57E-6DCB873982CD
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=7361A0C9-C1AD-48B9-A57E-6DCB873982CD
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=o0E7lz6e6B4xaiIkPIKGfAAZSMQV2RfWAZFmHP1kdZy4oaYcHy8groCsSp33Eehqq/si/rz1bUXZ8PpjWq+D1TMIFA40B6M9u0TJhqWDymU=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/339
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1101-1150/sb_1143_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1101-1150/sb_1143_91_C_bill.pdf
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SB 1144 Skinner, D 
 

Marketplaces: 
online 
marketplaces. 

08/16/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

08/16/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
172, 
Statutes of 
2024 

08/16/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Existing law generally requires an online marketplace to require a high-volume third-party seller on 
the online marketplace to make certain disclosures. Existing law requires an online marketplace to 
suspend future sales activity of a high-volume third-party seller that is not in compliance with those 
information sharing requirements, as specified. Existing law imposes certain information retention 
and security requirements on an online marketplace and prohibits specified uses of that 
information. This bill would revise the types of transactions that qualify a third-party seller as a 
"high-volume third-party seller," for those purposes. Specifically, the bill would remove the 
conditions that the transactions be made through an online marketplace and that the online 
marketplace process the payment and, instead, would add the condition that the transactions were 
made utilizing an online marketplace. The bill would also revise the definition of "online 
marketplace" by removing the conditions that the above-described features be used by third-party 
sellers, and that the platform have the above-described contractual relationship with consumers. 
This bill contains other related provisions and other existing laws.   (Based on  08/16/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1160 Portantino, D 
 

Firearms. 04/24/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
5/6/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law, subject to exceptions, makes it a misdemeanor to openly carry an exposed and 
unloaded handgun in a public place. Current law generally makes that crime punishable by 
imprisonment in the county jail for up to 6 months, or by a fine not to exceed $1,000. Current law, if 
the exposed and unloaded handgun is being carried in a public place or public street in an 
incorporated city, makes that crime punishable by imprisonment in the county jail for up to one 
year or by a fine not to exceed $1,000 if the handgun and unexpended ammunition capable of 
being discharged from that handgun are in the immediate possession of that person and the 
person is not in lawful possession of the handgun. This bill would extend that increased 
punishment to also apply if the person with immediate possession of the handgun and 
unexpended ammunition capable of being discharged from that handgun is not listed with the 
Department of Justice as the owner of that firearm, as specified.   (Based on  04/24/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1164 Newman, D 
 

Property 
taxation: new 
construction 
exclusion: 
accessory 
dwelling units. 

05/16/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
REV. & TAX 
on 6/3/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The California Constitution generally limits ad valorem taxes on real property to 1% of the full cash 
value of that property. For purposes of this limitation, “full cash value” is defined as the assessor’s 
valuation of real property as shown on the 1975–76 tax bill under “full cash value” or, thereafter, 
the appraised value of that real property when purchased, newly constructed, or a change in 
ownership has occurred. This bill would exclude from classification as “newly constructed” and 
“new construction” the construction of an accessory dwelling unit, as defined, if construction on the 
unit is completed on or after January 1, 2025, and before January 1, 2030, until one of specified 
events occurs. The bill would require the property owner to, among other things, notify the 
assessor that the property owner intends to claim the exclusion for an accessory dwelling unit and 
submit an affidavit stating that the owner shall make a good faith effort to ensure the unit will be 
used as residential housing for the duration the owner receives the exclusion.   (Based 
on  05/16/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=3ERccKEe1xITnqvfxAxufQx0s2kXkbnvdmQHjiZ15UWDqwqi36sRDhwb0FnSDAuUxyLDanc9JNGjRg5Cj2swT4R3GENwS0mlsyLqqJ/DbRQ=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/260
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1101-1150/sb_1144_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1101-1150/sb_1144_91_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=hzFv4FB/BmCiSRJOpJbRaAzIOStj5kaceqiu2SEzfB59+b9RCFg9UBRylVk3HJ0m/GiCmEAO3WxCw/ifWGObLt+S20NSz95hN5lDJvtJMjg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/262
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1151-1200/sb_1160_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1151-1200/sb_1160_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1151-1200/sb_1160_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=n7QINX7FXlYQl/e9HkeW8XQJR1TCMlMhjLIvKXADmc0uJWiKbo0OwvhcVNxhAGAHqWo22+SH2PUNyyj5mutY1qLNljTac1RnV7nfEnlyfr0=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/475
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1151-1200/sb_1164_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1151-1200/sb_1164_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1151-1200/sb_1164_97_A_bill.pdf
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SB 1167 Blakespear, D 
 

Solid waste: 
single-use 
drinking 
vessels. 

04/04/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
E.Q. on 
2/21/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law prohibits a full-service restaurant, as specified, from providing single-use plastic 
straws, as defined, to consumers unless requested by the consumer. Current law requires a city, 
county, or city and county, to authorize an enforcement agency to enforce these provisions. 
Current law specifies that the first and 2nd violations of these provisions would result in a notice of 
violation and any subsequent violation would be an infraction punishable by a fine of $25 for each 
day the full-service restaurant is in violation, but not to exceed an annual total of $300. This bill 
would require a chain restaurant, before serving a beverage, to ask a customer if the customer 
intends to consume the beverage on the premises or off the premises. The bill would prohibit a 
chain restaurant from serving a beverage in a single-use vessel if a customer indicates intent to 
consume the beverage on the premises, as specified, and would subject a violator to the 
enforcement provisions described above.   (Based on  04/04/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1190 Laird, D 
 

Mobilehomes: 
solar energy 
systems. 

07/18/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

07/18/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
162, 
Statutes of 
2024 

07/18/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

This bill would make any covenant, restriction, or condition contained in any rental agreement or 
other instrument affecting the tenancy of a homeowner or resident in a mobilehome park, in a 
subdivision, cooperative, or condominium for mobilehomes, or in a resident-owned mobilehome 
park that effectively prohibits or restricts the installation or use of a solar energy system, as 
defined, on the mobilehome or the site, lot, or space on which the mobilehome is located void and 
unenforceable. The bill would make it unlawful for the management or the ownership to prohibit or 
restrict a homeowner or resident from installing or using a solar energy system on the home or the 
site, lot, or space on which the mobilehome is located or to take other specified actions in 
connection with the installation or use of a solar energy system, except as specified. The bill would 
exempt imposition of reasonable restrictions on solar energy systems, as defined. The bill would 
require a solar energy system to meet applicable health and safety standards and requirements 
imposed by state and local permitting authorities. The bill would make any entity that willfully 
violates these provisions in a subdivision, cooperative, or condominium for mobilehomes, or a 
resident-owned mobilehome park liable to the homeowner, resident, or other party for actual 
damages occasioned thereby, and for a civil penalty paid to the homeowner, resident, or other 
party in an amount not to exceed $2,000.   (Based on  07/18/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1193 Menjivar, D 
 

Airports: leaded 
aviation 
gasoline. 

09/22/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/22/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
460, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/22/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Would prohibit an airport operator or aviation retail establishment, as defined, from selling, 
distributing, or otherwise making available leaded aviation gasoline to consumers on or after 
January 1, 2031, as provided. Because these provisions would be part of the State Aeronautics 
Act, the bill would impose a state-mandated local program.   (Based on  09/22/2024 text) 

SB 1193 
Support.pdf 
SB 1193 Support 
05.09.24.pdf 
SB 1193 - SJ 
Support 
06.10.24.pdf 
SB 1193 - SJ 
Support 
08.05.24.pdf 
Governor 
Signature 
Request 

Support 
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SB 1205 Laird, D 
 

Workers’ 
compensation: 
medical 
treatment. 

08/19/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
INACTIVE 
FILE on 
8/26/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law establishes a workers’ compensation system, administered by the Administrative 
Director of the Division of Workers’ Compensation, to compensate an employee, as defined, for 
injuries that arise out of, and in the course of, employment. Current law requires employers to 
provide medical, surgical, chiropractic, acupuncture, licensed clinical social worker, and hospital 
treatment reasonably required to cure or relieve the injured worker from the effects of the injury. 
Current law makes it a misdemeanor for an employer to discharge, threaten to discharge, or 
discriminate against, or for an insurer to advise, direct, or threaten an insured to discharge, an 
employee because they have filed or made known their intention to file a claim for compensation, 
or an application for adjudication, or because the employee has received a rating, award, or 
settlement, as specified. This bill would require an employee, when possible, to make a 
reasonable effort to schedule treatment outside of work hours. The bill would require the employee 
to provide notice if treatment occurs during work hours, as specified, and require the employer to 
provide this leave during work hours unless business necessity requires the treatment to occur at 
a different time or on a different day. The bill would require that the leave taken by an employee 
pursuant to these provisions run concurrently with leave taken pursuant to the federal Family and 
Medical Leave Act of 1993 and the California Family Rights Act if the employee would have been 
eligible for that leave.   (Based on  08/19/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1210 Skinner, D 
 

New housing 
construction: 
electrical, gas, 
sewer, and 
water service: 
service 
connection 
information. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
787, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/27/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law vests the Public Utilities Commission with regulatory authority over public utilities, 
including electrical corporations, gas corporations, sewer system corporations, and water 
corporations, while local publicly owned utilities, including municipal utility districts, public utility 
districts, and irrigation districts, are under the direction of their governing boards. This bill would, 
for new housing construction, require the above-described utilities, on or before January 1, 2026, 
to publicly post on their internet websites (1) the schedule of estimated fees for typical service 
connections for each housing development type, including, but not limited to, accessory dwelling 
unit, mixed-use, multifamily, and single-family developments, except as specified, and (2) the 
estimated timeframes for completing typical service connections needed for each housing 
development type, as specified. The bill would exempt from its provisions a utility with fewer than 
4,000 service connections that does not establish or maintain an internet website due to a 
hardship and would authorize the utility to establish that a hardship exists by annually adopting a 
resolution that includes detailed findings, as provided.   (Based on  09/27/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1211 Skinner, D 
 

Land use: 
accessory 
dwelling units: 
ministerial 
approval. 

09/19/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/19/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
296, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/19/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The Planning and Zoning Law authorizes a local agency, by ordinance, to provide for the creation 
of accessory dwelling units (ADUs) in areas zoned for residential use, as specified. That law 
prohibits, if a local agency adopts an ordinance to create ADUs in those zones, the local agency 
from requiring the replacement of offstreet parking spaces if a garage, carport, or covered parking 
structure is demolished in conjunction with the construction of, or is converted to, an ADU. This bill 
would also prohibit the local agency from requiring the replacement of offstreet parking spaces if 
an uncovered parking space is demolished in conjunction with the construction of, or is converted 
to, an ADU.   (Based on  09/19/2024 text) 

 Monitor 
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SB 1212 Skinner, D 
 

Real estate 
investment 
trusts: 
purchase, 
acquisition, and 
sale of housing. 

04/22/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(6). 
(Last 
location was 
JUD. on 
2/29/2024) 

05/02/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The bill would reset that 60-day timeline if the seller changes the asking price for the housing. The 
bill would prohibit a real estate investment trust that purchases or acquires any housing in 
compliance with these provisions from paying a final sales price that less than 95% of the publicly 
listed asking price. The bill would impose civil damages upon a real estate investment trust that 
violates these provisions in an amount not to exceed $1,000,000. The bill would absolve a seller of 
housing from liability under these provisions if the seller obtains a written release signed by the 
buyer stating that the buyer is not a real estate investment trust.   (Based on  04/22/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1216 Blakespear, D 
 

Transportation 
projects: Class 
III bikeways: 
prohibition. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
788, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/27/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law establishes 4 classifications of bikeways and defines a “Class III bikeway” as a 
bikeway that provides a right-of-way on-street or off-street, designated by signs or permanent 
markings and shared with pedestrians and motorists. This bill would define “sharrow” as the 
pavement marking used to inform road users that bicyclists might occupy the travel lane. The bill 
would prohibit, on and after January 1, 2025, an agency responsible for the development or 
operation of bikeways or highways where bicycle travel is permitted from installing a new sharrow 
on a highway that has a posted speed limit greater than 30 miles per hour, except as 
specified.   (Based on  09/27/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1219 Seyarto, R 
 

Crimes: 
prostitution. 

02/15/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
PUB. S. on 
2/29/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would make it a misdemeanor to loiter in a public place with the intent to commit prostitution, as 
defined, and would make other conforming changes. The bill would make a person guilty of 
disorderly conduct if they operate a motor vehicle in any public place and repeatedly beckon to, 
contact, or attempt to contact or stop pedestrians or other motorists, or impede traffic, with the 
intent to solicit prostitution. The bill would authorize a court to suspend, for not more than 30 days, 
the privilege of a person to operate a motor vehicle for a first conviction of these offenses. The bill 
would, for a 2nd or subsequent conviction, require the vehicle used in the commission of the crime 
to be impounded for 30 days, as specified.   (Based on  02/15/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1239 Grove, R 
 

State vehicle 
fleet: zero-
emission 
vehicles: raw 
materials: child 
labor. 

04/24/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
5/13/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law requires the Department of General Services, beginning no later than the 2024–25 
fiscal year, to ensure that at least 50% of the light-duty vehicles purchased for the state vehicle 
fleet each fiscal year are zero-emission vehicles, except as provided. This bill would require the 
department to require a supplier of zero-emission vehicles purchased for the state vehicle fleet to 
certify that any raw materials used in the manufacturing of the zero-emission vehicles, including, 
but not limited to, cobalt and lithium, come from mining operations that are free of child 
labor.   (Based on  04/24/2024 text) 

 Monitor 
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SB 1243 Dodd, D 
 

Campaign 
contributions: 
agency officers. 

09/30/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/30/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
1017, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/30/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The Political Reform Act of 1974 prohibits certain contributions of more than $250 to an officer of 
an agency by any party, participant, or party or participant’s agent in a proceeding while a 
proceeding involving a license, permit, or other entitlement for use is pending before the agency 
and for 12 months following the date a final decision is rendered in the proceeding, as specified. 
The act requires disclosure on the record of the proceeding, as specified, of certain contributions 
of more than $250 within the preceding 12 months to an officer from a party or participant, or 
party’s agent. The act disqualifies an officer from participating in a decision in a proceeding if the 
officer has willfully or knowingly received a contribution of more than $250 from a party or a party’s 
agent, or a participant or a participant’s agent, as specified. The act allows an officer to cure 
certain violations of these provisions by returning a contribution, or the portion of the contribution 
of in excess of $250, within 14 days of accepting, soliciting, or receiving the contribution, 
whichever comes latest. This bill would raise the threshold for contributions regulated by these 
provisions to $500, as specified. The bill would extend the period during which an officer may cure 
a violation to within 30 days of accepting, soliciting, or directing the contribution, whichever is 
latest. The bill would specify that a person is not a “participant” for the purposes of these 
provisions if their financial interest in a decision results solely from an increase or decrease in 
membership dues.   (Based on  09/30/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1255 Durazo, D 
 

Public water 
systems: needs 
analysis: water 
rate assistance 
program. 

06/19/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/7/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law establishes the Safe and Affordable Drinking Water Fund in the State Treasury to help 
water systems provide an adequate and affordable supply of safe drinking water in both the near 
and long terms. Current law requires the state board to annually adopt a fund expenditure plan, as 
provided, and requires expenditures from the fund to be consistent with the fund expenditure plan. 
Current law requires the state board to base the fund expenditure plan on data and analysis drawn 
from a specified drinking water needs assessment. This bill would require the state board to 
update a needs analysis of the state’s public water systems to include an assessment, as 
specified, of the funds necessary to provide a 20% bill credit for low-income households served by 
community water systems with fewer than 3,300 service connections and for community water 
systems with fewer than 3,300 service connections to meet a specified affordability threshold on or 
before July 1, 2026, and on or before July 1 of every 3 years thereafter.   (Based on  06/19/2024 
text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1280 Laird, D 
 

Waste 
management: 
propane 
cylinders: 
reusable or 
refillable. 

09/22/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/22/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
466, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/22/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law, the California Integrated Waste Management Act of 1989, establishes the Department 
of Resources Recycling and Recovery and requires the department to adopt rules and regulations, 
as necessary, to carry out the act.This bill would, on and after January 1, 2028, prohibit the sale or 
offer for sale of propane cylinders other than those propane cylinders that are reusable or 
refillable, as defined. The bill would require the department to adopt regulations to implement the 
provisions of this bill with an effective date of January 1, 2028.   (Based on  09/22/2024 text) 

 Monitor 
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SB 1297 Allen, D 
 

The City of 
Malibu’s speed 
safety system 
pilot program. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
631, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/27/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law authorizes, until January 1, 2032, the Cities of Los Angeles, San Jose, Oakland, 
Glendale, and Long Beach, and the City and County of San Francisco to establish a speed safety 
system pilot program if the system meets specified requirements. Existing law requires a 
participating city or city and county to adopt a Speed Safety System Use Policy and a Speed 
Safety System Impact Report before implementing the program, and requires the participating city 
or city and county to engage in a public information campaign at least 30 days before 
implementation of the program, including information relating to when the systems would begin 
detecting violations and where the systems would be utilized. Current law requires a participating 
city or city and county to issue warning notices rather than notices of violations for violations 
detected within the first 60 calendar days of the program. This bill would authorize, until January 1, 
2032, the City of Malibu to establish a similar program for speed enforcement that utilizes up to 5 
speed safety systems on the Pacific Coast Highway.   (Based on  09/27/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1298 Cortese, D 
 

Certification of 
thermal 
powerplants: 
data centers. 

08/19/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
RLS. on 
8/27/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law vests the State Energy Resources Conservation and Development Commission with 
the exclusive power to certify all locations on which an electrical transmission line or thermal 
powerplant is constructed, or is proposed to be constructed, and related electrical transmission 
lines or thermal powerplants. Current law authorizes the commission to exempt from certification a 
thermal powerplant with a generating capacity of up to 100 megawatts, and modifications to 
existing generating facilities that do not add capacity in excess of 100 megawatts, if the 
commission finds that no substantial adverse impact on the environment or energy resources will 
result from the construction or operation of the proposed facility or from the modifications.This bill 
would additionally authorize the commission to exempt from certification a thermal powerplant with 
a generating capacity of up to 150 megawatts if specified requirements are met, including that it is 
used solely as a backup generation facility for a data center, it is located on the customer side of 
the meter and is not interconnected to the distribution system, a skilled and trained workforce is 
used to perform all construction work on the facility, as specified, the commission finds that no 
substantial adverse impact on the environment or energy resources will result from the 
construction and operation of the facility, and the commission obtains a determination from the 
applicable air pollution control district or air quality management district that the facility’s backup 
generation technology meets the best available control technology requirements. The bill would 
require the owner or operator of a facility granted an exemption under the bill to fully mitigate the 
facility’s impacts on air quality, as provided. The bill would repeal its provisions on January 1, 
2027.   (Based on  08/19/2024 text) 
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SB 1300 Cortese, D 
 

Health facility 
closure: public 
notice: inpatient 
psychiatric and 
perinatal 
services. 

09/28/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/28/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
894, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/28/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Under current law, a general acute care hospital is required to provide certain basic services, 
including medical, nursing, surgical, anesthesia, laboratory, radiology, pharmacy, and dietary 
services. Current law authorizes a general acute care hospital to provide various special or 
supplemental services if certain conditions are met. Current regulations define a supplemental 
service as an organized inpatient or outpatient service that is not required to be provided by law or 
regulation. Current law requires a health facility to provide 90 days of public notice of the proposed 
closure or elimination of a supplemental service, and 120 days of public notice of the proposed 
closure or elimination of an acute psychiatric hospital. This bill would change the notice period 
required before proposed closure or elimination of the supplemental service of inpatient psychiatric 
unit or a perinatal unit from 90 days to 120 days. By changing the definition of a crime, this bill 
would impose a state-mandated local program. The bill would require the health facility to provide 
public notice of the proposed elimination of the supplemental service of either inpatient psychiatric 
unit or perinatal unit, as specified. The bill would require the health facility to conduct at least one 
noticed public hearing within 60 days of providing public notice of the proposed elimination of the 
inpatient psychiatric unit or perinatal unit and would require the health facility to accept public 
comment. The bill would require the health facility to post the public hearing notice and the agenda 
along with the public notice.   (Based on  09/28/2024 text) 

SB 1300 Support 
05.17.24.pdf 
Updated Support 
Letter 

Support 

SB 1340 Smallwood-
Cuevas, D 
 

Discrimination. 09/26/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/26/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
626, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/26/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The Unruh Civil Rights Act generally prohibits business establishments from discriminating on 
specified bases. The California Fair Employment and Housing Act (act) prohibits discrimination in 
housing and employment on specified bases. Current law establishes the Civil Rights Department 
(department) and prescribes its functions, duties, and powers, including to receive, investigate, 
conciliate, mediate, and prosecute complaints alleging employment discrimination pursuant to 
specified laws, including the Unruh Civil Rights Act and the act. Current law specifies that while it 
is the intention of the Legislature that the act occupy the field of regulation of discrimination in 
employment and housing, the act does not limit or restrict the application of the Unruh Civil Rights 
Act. This bill would also specify that nothing in the act limits or restricts efforts by any city, city and 
county, county, or other political subdivision of the state to enforce local law prohibiting 
discrimination in employment against classes of persons covered by the act if certain requirements 
are met, including a requirement that local enforcement is pursuant to a local law that is at least as 
protective as the act.   (Based on  09/26/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1346 Durazo, D 
 

Workers’ 
compensation: 
aggregate 
disability 
payments. 

02/16/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
4/22/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law establishes a workers’ compensation system, administered by the Administrative 
Director of the Division of Workers’ Compensation, to compensate an employee for injuries 
sustained in the course of their employment. Current law requires every employer to establish a 
utilization review process, as described, and establishes an independent medical review process 
to resolve disputes over a utilization review decision, as specified. Current law requires that 
aggregate disability payments for a single injury occurring on or after certain dates be limited to no 
more than 104 or 240 compensable weeks, as provided. This bill would authorize, on or after 
January 1, 2025, the Workers’ Compensation Appeals Board to award temporary disability 
benefits, as specified, if a denial of treatment requested by a treating physician is subsequently 
overturned by independent medical review.    (Based on  02/16/2024 text) 
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SB 1361 Blakespear, D 
 

California 
Environmental 
Quality Act: 
exemption: 
local agencies: 
contract for 
providing 
services for 
people 
experiencing 
homelessness. 

08/19/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

08/19/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
188, 
Statutes of 
2024 

08/19/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

The California Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) exempts for its requirements, among other 
things, actions taken by the Department of Housing and Community Development, the California 
Housing Finance Agency, or a local agency not acting as the lead agency to provide financial 
assistance or insurance for the development and construction of residential housing for persons 
and families of low or moderate income, as provided. This bill would additionally exempt from 
CEQA’s requirements actions taken by a local agency to approve a contract for providing services 
for people experiencing homelessness, as provided.   (Based on  08/19/2024 text) 

Support Letter Support 

SB 1372 Newman, D 
 

Airports: third-
party vendors: 
security lanes. 

06/18/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
TRANS. on 
6/3/2024) 

07/02/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Would prohibit a public airport that provides commercial services from entering into an agreement 
that authorizes a private third-party vendor that provides expedited security screening to use the 
standard security lane or the Transportation Security Administration PreCheck security lane. The 
bill would provide that this prohibition does not apply if there was an agreement between the public 
airport and the private third-party vendor that was entered into before January 1, 2025. The bill 
would also provide that the prohibition does not apply to an agreement between a public airport 
and a private third-party vendor if the private third-party vendor has obtained dedicated 
Transportation Security Administration security lanes solely for use by the private third-party 
vendor at that public airport.   (Based on  06/18/2024 text) 

SB 1372 - 
Oppose 
05.14.24.pdf 

Oppose 

SB 1374 Becker, D 
 

Net energy 
metering. 

09/27/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/27/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
the 
Governor. In 
Senate. 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto 
pending.  

09/27/2024 - 
Senate  VETO
ED 

Current law vests the Public Utilities Commission with regulatory authority over public utilities, 
including electrical corporations. Current law requires the commission to develop a standard 
contract or tariff, which may include net energy metering, for eligible customer-generators, as 
defined, with a renewable electrical generation facility, as defined, that is a customer of a large 
electrical corporation. Current law requires, in developing the standard contract or tariff for large 
electrical corporations, the commission to take specified actions. This bill would require, no later 
than July 1, 2025, the commission to ensure that any contract or tariff established by the 
commission pursuant to the above-described provisions for renewable electrical generation 
facilities configured to serve multiple customers with meters at one or more apartment buildings on 
a single property, or configured to serve multiple meters of a single customer on a public school 
property, or a set of contiguous public school properties owned, leased, or rented by the public 
school customer, meets certain requirements, as specified. The bill would require the commission, 
no later than July 1, 2026, to ensure that any contract or tariff established by the commission 
pursuant to a specified commission decision meets specified requirements, as provided.   (Based 
on  09/04/2024 text) 
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SB 1381 Wahab, D 
 

Crimes: child 
pornography. 

09/29/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/29/2024 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 
929, 
Statutes of 
2024.  

09/29/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law prohibits the production, development, duplication, distribution, or possession, as 
specified, of matter, in specified formats, that depicts a person under 18 years of age engaging in 
or simulating sexual conduct, as defined. Current law separately prohibits this conduct where it is 
done for consideration or where such matter is shared with a minor. Current law also prohibits the 
employment or use of a minor, or the permitting by a parent or guardian of the employment or use 
of a minor for the production of such matter. Current law authorizes the forfeiture and destruction 
of such matter regardless of whether a conviction is sought or obtained. This bill would expand the 
scope of certain of these provisions to include matter that is digitally altered or generated by the 
use of artificial intelligence, as such matter is defined.    (Based on  09/29/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1387 Newman, D 
 

California 
Hybrid and 
Zero-Emission 
Truck and Bus 
Voucher 
Incentive 
Project: vehicle 
eligibility: 
schoolbus 
grant 
requirements. 

06/10/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
TRANS. on 
6/3/2024) 

07/02/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law establishes the State Air Resources Board as the state agency responsible for 
monitoring and regulating sources emitting greenhouse gases. The state board, in this capacity, 
administers the California Hybrid and Zero-Emission Truck and Bus Voucher Incentive Project 
under which the agency issues a limited number of vouchers to incentivize the purchase and use 
of zero-emission commercial vehicles. This bill would require the state board to authorize a 
voucher issued under the program to be used for the acquisition of any zero-emission vehicle that 
meets specified requirements, including that the vehicle has a gross vehicle weight rating that 
exceeds 8,500 pounds and the vehicle is purchased for fleet operations by a public or private fleet 
or for personal and commercial use by an individual.   (Based on  06/10/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1395 Becker, D 
 

Shelter crisis: 
Low Barrier 
Navigation 
Center: use by 
right: building 
standards. 

09/19/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/19/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
297, 
Statutes of 
2024 

09/19/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law authorizes a governing body of a political subdivision, as those terms are defined, to 
declare a shelter crisis if the governing body makes a specified finding. Upon declaration of a 
shelter crisis, existing law, among other things, suspends certain state and local laws, regulations, 
and ordinances to the extent that strict compliance would prevent, hinder, or delay the mitigation of 
the effects of the shelter crisis and allows a city, county, or city and county, in lieu of compliance, 
to adopt by ordinance reasonable local standards and procedures for the design, site 
development, and operation of homeless shelters and the structures and facilities therein. Current 
law, among other things, exempts from the California Environmental Quality Act specified actions 
by a state agency or a city, county, or city and county to lease, convey, or encumber land owned 
by a city, county, or city and county, or to facilitate the lease, conveyance, or encumbrance of land 
owned by the local government for, or to provide financial assistance to, a homeless shelter 
constructed or allowed by these provisions. Current law repeals these provisions on January 1, 
2026.This bill would expand the exemption from the California Environmental Quality Act 
described above to include action taken by a state agency or a city, county, or city and county, to 
approve a contract to provide services for people experiencing homelessness to a homeless 
shelter constructed pursuant to, or authorized by, these provisions, as specified.   (Based 
on  09/19/2024 text) 
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https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=uI0YI3gsODC5ijMlF27EeOZGxZsJuTAbDgzvlx9NU8CULOQMd8GpIw9YQGjd/IpGfN8PQRvNJIIn3UpViqcDmo/i5pJ2IjnmA5ErYJUeF4o=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/420
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1351-1400/sb_1381_94_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1351-1400/sb_1381_94_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Isw6b5q/8xHrQsummoDCqIhPqlFX4B3x8ufTncxg6m+T8uBjQNM1nBcv0duXFu5ySYipJw81RJnYg5TNqyRyVE/4iya2q3TTuHwlbNugpgE=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/475
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1351-1400/sb_1387_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1351-1400/sb_1387_96_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1351-1400/sb_1387_96_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Gw5h4MVSmLZioorTRWgnRaZDXz/6yfEYnyE57Ydf3UhqToin5wquXNtxQ7TZwAarCEKtz8QLwLDF7Iq2F6OSJopuvGREahtax0Mc4Hsd/8s=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/392
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1351-1400/sb_1395_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1351-1400/sb_1395_96_C_bill.pdf


Attachment B: 2023-2024 Intergovernmental Relations Priority State Legislation Log 
 

Last Updated 12/06/24        215 
 

Measure Author Topic Current 
Text 

Status Location Brief Summary Attachments Position 

SB 1416 Newman, D 
 

Sentencing 
enhancements: 
sale, exchange, 
or return of 
stolen property. 

08/16/2024 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

08/16/2024 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State - 
Chapter 
174, 
Statutes of 
2024 

08/16/2024 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Existing law defines types of theft, including petty theft, grand theft, and shoplifting. Existing law 
also defines the crime of burglary, which consists of entering specified buildings, places, or 
vehicles with the intent to commit grand or petty theft or a felony. This bill would, until January 1, 
2030, create sentencing enhancements for selling, exchanging, or returning for value, or 
attempting to sell, exchange, or return for value, any property acquired through one or more acts 
of shoplifting, theft, or burglary from a retail business, if the property value exceeds specified 
amounts. The bill would additionally make these enhancements apply to any person acting in 
concert with another person to violate these provisions. By adding new sentencing enhancements, 
this bill would impose a state-mandated local program. This bill contains other related provisions 
and other existing laws.   (Based on  08/16/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1419 Rubio, D 
 

Food Desert 
Elimination 
Grant Program. 

09/23/2024 
- 
Vetoed HT
ML PDF 

09/22/2024 - 
Vetoed by 
the 
Governor. In 
Senate. 
Consideratio
n of 
Governor's 
veto 
pending.  

09/22/2024 - 
Senate  VETO
ED 

Existing law creates the Office of Farm to Fork within the Department of Food and Agriculture, and 
requires the office, to the extent that resources are available, to work with various entities, as 
prescribed, to increase the amount of agricultural products available to underserved communities 
and schools in the state. Existing law requires the office, among other things, to identify distribution 
barriers that affect limited food access and work to overcome those barriers through various 
actions and to coordinate with school districts and representatives to increase the nutritional profile 
of foods provided in schools. This bill would create the Food Desert Elimination Grant Program 
under the administration of the department for the purpose of expanding access to healthy foods in 
food deserts, as defined, in the state, and areas at risk of becoming food deserts, by providing 
grants to grocery store operators, as specified. The bill would create the Food Desert Elimination 
Fund in the General Fund and would authorize the fund to be expended by the department, upon 
appropriation by the Legislature, for purposes of the program. The bill would authorize the 
department to collect nonstate, federal, and private funds, require those funds to be deposited into 
the California Equitable Food Access Account within the Food Desert Elimination Fund, and 
continuously appropriate moneys in the account to the department for purposes of the program, 
thereby making an appropriation. The bill would authorize the department to award grants to 
grocery store operators seeking to locate grocery stores in food deserts and to award grants, 
totaling no more than 20% of the total program funding, to grocery store operators for equipment 
upgrades for grocery stores located in food deserts to expand or provide healthy foods for sale. 
The bill would authorize the department to adopt guidelines to implement these provisions. The bill 
would make the implementation of these provisions contingent upon an appropriation by the 
Legislature. The bill would repeal these provisions on December 31, 2030.   (Based 
on  09/05/2024 text) 

Support Letter Support 
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https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/475
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1401-1450/sb_1416_91_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1401-1450/sb_1416_91_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=6pkFmMTH8fUrbs8qThbN2CYC8xF0iVsVi8Z2hHQ7jSMZXI0mRNc5RNMpTZc7zC2j4rFgIK7Av2q8AHafZgyqPnTvOyzmJFWntRqyGEdMYJo=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/340
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1401-1450/sb_1419_95_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1401-1450/sb_1419_95_E_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1401-1450/sb_1419_95_E_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=39288EFB-C281-47E9-9772-9CF9AE61EAF7
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SB 1426 Blakespear, D 
 

Waste 
reduction: 
undiverted 
materials. 

04/10/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(6). 
(Last 
location was 
E.Q. on 
4/3/2024) 

05/02/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The California Integrated Waste Management Act of 1989, administered by the Department of 
Resources Recycling and Recovery, generally regulates the disposal, management, and recycling 
of solid waste, as defined. Existing law authorizes each county, city, district, or other local 
governmental agency to determine aspects of solid waste handling that are of local concern and 
whether the services are to be provided by means of nonexclusive franchise, contract, license, 
permit, or otherwise. The act requires a city, county, or city and county, or regional agency formed 
under the act, to develop a source reduction and recycling element of an integrated waste 
management plan containing specified components. The act requires those jurisdictions to divert 
50% of the solid waste subject to the element, except as specified, through source reduction, 
recycling, and composting activities. This bill would prohibit an exclusive franchise, contract, 
license, or permit to provide services for diversion from exceeding the services required to be 
performed and actually performed under the exclusive authorization. The bill would require a 
person who provides services for diversion by means other than a franchise, contract, license, or 
permit, to comply with applicable law, as specified.   (Based on  04/10/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1431 Cortese, D 
 

San José State 
University: fire 
building 
protection 
standards. 

04/11/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
G.O. on 
4/10/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law, except as provided, requires the State Fire Marshal to prepare and adopt building 
standards relating to fire protection in the design and construction of the means of egress and the 
adequacy of exit from, and the installation and maintenance of fire alarm and fire extinguishment 
equipment or systems in, any state institution or other state-owned building or in any specified 
state-occupied building. Current law requires the State Fire Marshal to prepare and adopt 
regulations other than building standards for the installation and maintenance of equipment and 
furnishings that present unusual fire hazards in any state institution or other state-owned building 
or in any specified state-occupied building. Current law requires, except as provided, the State Fire 
Marshal to enforce those regulations in all state-owned buildings, specified state-occupied 
buildings, and state institutions throughout the state. Current law establishes the California State 
University, under the administration of the Trustees of the California State University, as one of the 
segments of public postsecondary education in this state. The California State University 
comprises 23 institutions of higher education, including San José State University. This bill would 
prohibit the State Fire Marshal from having authority over the development of a project known as 
Spartan Village on the Paseo for use by San José State University, including related 
improvements associated with that project, for the purpose of fire or life safety activities, other 
safety-related activities, plan checks, inspections, building permits, or certificates of occupancy, 
conditional or otherwise.   (Based on  04/11/2024 text) 

SB 1431 Support 
05.17.24.pdf 

Support 

SB 1439 Ashby, D 
 

Surplus Land 
Act: exempt 
surplus land: 
health facilities: 
City of 
Sacramento. 

06/10/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
H. & C.D. on 
6/19/2024) 

07/02/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law prescribes requirements for the disposal of surplus land by a local agency. Current law 
defines “surplus land” for these purposes to mean land owned in fee simple by any local agency 
for which the local agency’s governing body takes formal action in a regular public meeting 
declaring that the land is surplus and is not necessary for the agency’s use. Current law provides 
that an agency is not required to follow the requirements for the disposal of surplus land for 
“exempt surplus land,” except as provided. Current law defines “exempt surplus land” to include 
certain types of land, including surplus land that the local agency is exchanging for another 
property necessary for the agency’s use. This bill would define “exempt surplus land” to include 
land that: (1) is being or will be developed for a health facility, as defined and specified; (2) is 
located at one of certain sites within the City of Sacramento; (3) is not identified in the sites 
inventory in the applicable housing element for lower income households; and (4) will be subject to 
a recorded deed restriction for a period of 55 years, as specified.   (Based on  06/10/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=Q2fHqcPWjkkKKS4Akw45nd3y+pYdf1xLHpuMkpDNayPjfwRQIY2IVHWvV+7KYA8l3Npgk/554f+zCyTWdwvCY1oIK5OgqAjkfAE5ghab1Jo=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/342
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1401-1450/sb_1426_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1401-1450/sb_1426_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1401-1450/sb_1426_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=gGG/yww1k4YwYRdWsS+bOPIZ3AUfYk7RDjUllW/foTSzkcGDrmQzdQ/NXhOBQoszPK4exoLJo0eJCrqxv9CbrOwZ5NN3mcKOOqk4sFTY7Zk=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/393
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1401-1450/sb_1431_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1401-1450/sb_1431_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1401-1450/sb_1431_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=C17311B7-310B-41AC-B6D5-183FE242C3C3
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=C17311B7-310B-41AC-B6D5-183FE242C3C3
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=wOLS2JdONhdWeyxDSQ8cm1ruVpP90pvknsrsN5mAcMIaUEDROzCjFhRkd1oDvR4LpvOJwtzUrS/pxXKhQ8pNBJmtIfut18TtBMdk9BBch0o=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/335
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1401-1450/sb_1439_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1401-1450/sb_1439_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1401-1450/sb_1439_97_A_bill.pdf
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SB 1461 Allen, D 
 

State of 
emergency and 
local 
emergency: 
landslide. 

05/16/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
INACTIVE 
FILE on 
8/31/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law defines the term “state of emergency” and “local emergency” to mean a duly 
proclaimed existence of conditions of disaster or of extreme peril to the safety of persons and 
property within the state caused by, among other things, fire, storm, riot, or cyberterrorism. This bill 
would additionally include a landslide among those causes of the conditions constituting a state of 
emergency or local emergency.   (Based on  05/16/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1462 Glazer, D 
 

Subdivisions: 
disbursements 
of deposits. 

04/25/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/16/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(8). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
5/13/2024) 

05/16/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law regulates the sale of subdivided lands and prescribes definitions for this purpose. 
Current law defines a subdivision to include, among other things, condominium projects and 
planned developments, as specified, and other common interest developments. Current law 
requires a person who intends to offer subdivided lands for sale or lease to file with the 
Department of Real Estate an application for a public report, as specified. Current law prescribes 
various restrictions on the sale or lease of lots in a subdivision. In certain instances, current law 
permits lots to be sold or leased only if the money paid or advanced by a purchaser or lessee is 
placed into an escrow account or a bond furnished for the purpose of protecting purchasers or 
lessees. This bill would permit a purchaser’s deposit that is held in escrow pursuant to a binding 
sales contract for a lot or parcel within a subdivision that is not yet constructed or developed to be 
disbursed before closing to pay for project construction costs, as specified. The bill would permit 
the disbursement of a purchaser’s deposit before closing and the conveyance or leasing of any 
unit before completion of construction if specified conditions are met, including, among other 
things, that the developer has submitted to the Department of Real Estate a project budget 
showing all costs required to be paid in order to complete the project, the department has 
reviewed and approved the proposed disbursement, and the purchaser provides express informed 
consent to the disbursement, as specified. If a purchaser’s funds are to be disbursed before the 
completion of construction of the project, the bill would require the developer to submit specified 
information to the Department of Real Estate, including, among other things, a copy of the 
purchaser’s express informed consent to the disbursement.   (Based on  04/25/2024 text) 

SB 1462 Letter of 
Support 
04.03.24.pdf 

Support 

SB 1470 Glazer, D 
 

Construction 
defect cases. 

02/16/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

04/25/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(5). 
(Last 
location was 
JUD. on 
2/29/2024) 

04/25/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law sets forth standards for determining liability in an action seeking the recovery of 
damages arising out of, or related to, deficiencies in residential construction, design, and related 
issues, and specifies the characteristics of those deficiencies. This bill would require a deficiency 
in the specific standards described above to materially affect the habitability or usefulness of the 
residential dwelling unit and to be a result of a failure to meet the standard of care in order for the 
builder to be liable, as specified. The bill would define “standard of care” as the level of care 
standard in an industry for similar work performed in the state.   (Based on  02/16/2024 text) 

 Support 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=9ZRb4glkjYbxJeAp5C3l3KJ/vNa/9PIIzdY5p6TPxiGI3eechweFw7uTXhXKJ+JaOfcvgaxLHbftVB7a5ziNA6jaNv+vFct5LC7h9Dt/8ag=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/339
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1451-1500/sb_1461_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1451-1500/sb_1461_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1451-1500/sb_1461_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=jWmjupNraivSKxSSnzNwnA8JoG+8tcYwBqJRxojXgJ6qcK0gWnH/unQhcDF5ENsSTyMWEWWv28PHARm8peZ7lx3hbiUOSRgTBeh4R2jFGcI=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/462
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1451-1500/sb_1462_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1451-1500/sb_1462_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1451-1500/sb_1462_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=F1903AAB-1297-48C4-8A2E-F6B532C57E4C
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=F1903AAB-1297-48C4-8A2E-F6B532C57E4C
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=F1903AAB-1297-48C4-8A2E-F6B532C57E4C
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=PH+KzirNRRwV3Oev/EiYYFFKu++9HtfQW55w5wCutB9CJzYHWkreI4291P2ugCqRJ9mI/do/TsSwo++OwRqDRSzpGiiJ47p+AaCoPL9iXvM=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/462
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1451-1500/sb_1470_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1451-1500/sb_1470_99_I_bill.pdf
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SB 1487 Glazer, D 
 

Vehicles: 
parking 
violations. 

07/03/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/15/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(14). 
(Last 
location was 
APPR. 
SUSPENSE 
FILE on 
8/7/2024) 

08/15/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

Current law requires the schedule of parking penalties for parking violations and late payment 
penalties to be established by the governing body of the jurisdiction where the notice of violation is 
issued, as specified. This bill would specify that, when paid by mail, payment of a parking penalty 
or late payment penalty is deemed received on the date payment is postmarked. This bill would, 
notwithstanding any other law, prohibit a late payment penalty for a parking violation from 
exceeding 30% of the established parking penalty.   (Based on  07/03/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1494 Glazer, D 
 

Local agencies: 
Sales and Use 
Tax: retailers. 

05/20/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

05/24/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(11). 
(Last 
location was 
INACTIVE 
FILE on 
5/24/2024) 

05/24/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The Bradley-Burns Uniform Local Sales and Use Tax Law authorizes counties and cities to impose 
a local sales and use tax in accordance with that law for tangible personal property sold at retail in 
the city or county, or purchased for storage, use, or other consumption in the city or county. That 
law requires the city or county to contract with the California Department of Tax and Fee 
Administration for the administration of the taxes and requires the department to transmit those 
taxes to the city or county. That law provides that for the purpose of a local sales tax adopted 
pursuant to that law, all retail sales are consummated at the place of business of the retailer 
unless otherwise specified. Current law prohibits a local agency, defined to mean all cities and 
counties, from entering into any form of agreement that would result, directly or indirectly, in the 
payment, transfer, diversion, or rebate of Bradley-Burns local tax revenues to any person, as 
defined, for any purpose, if the agreement results in a reduction in the amount of Bradley-Burns 
local tax revenues that, in the absence of the agreement, would be received by another local 
agency and the retailer continues to maintain a physical presence within the territorial jurisdiction 
of that other local agency, with specified exceptions. This bill would additionally prohibit, on or after 
January 1, 2024, a local agency from entering into, renewing, or extending any form of agreement 
that would result, directly or indirectly, in the payment, transfer, diversion, or rebate of Bradley-
Burns local tax revenues to any retailer, as defined, in exchange for the retailer locating or 
continuing to maintain a place of business that serves as the place of sale, as defined, within the 
territorial jurisdiction of the local agency if that place of business would generate revenue, from the 
sale of tangible property delivered to and received by the purchaser in the territorial jurisdiction of 
another local agency, for the local agency under the Bradley-Burns Uniform Local Sales and Use 
Tax Law.   (Based on  05/20/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=LhcmfXFuxecXCgBasoYNyF2SO1of9LRyjHwzqnNyOGpI6kwo9Hu4OJeHKLV4o9ViIPAt8gAMk47ICQ8h6p/XxjFZ0My1PAMD/WFYaRWiAQw=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/462
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1451-1500/sb_1487_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1451-1500/sb_1487_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1451-1500/sb_1487_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=dCSwdi7SZXy6Zorb4BFnyvp4z/dyCAoP7OsELMmZ1PhIQQ4u6BzP9bEff8CY/TUeqG6raaCBsSa+YEdhguH4KToD8AZwvWkV0RzF8UYdxgM=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/462
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1451-1500/sb_1494_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1451-1500/sb_1494_98_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1451-1500/sb_1494_98_A_bill.pdf


Attachment B: 2023-2024 Intergovernmental Relations Priority State Legislation Log 
 

Last Updated 12/06/24        219 
 

Measure Author Topic Current 
Text 

Status Location Brief Summary Attachments Position 

SB 1497 Menjivar, D 
 

Polluters Pay 
Climate Cost 
Recovery Act 
of 2024. 

04/25/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
INACTIVE 
FILE on 
5/22/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Would enact the Polluters Pay Climate Cost Recovery Act of 2024 and would establish the 
Polluters Pay Climate Cost Recovery Program to be administered by the California Environmental 
Protection Agency to require fossil fuel polluters to pay their fair share of the damage caused by 
the sale of their products during the covered period, which the bill would define as the time period 
between the 2000 and 2020 calendar years, inclusive, to relieve a portion of the burden from 
climate harms that is borne by California taxpayers. The bill would require the agency, within 90 
days of the effective date of the act, to determine and publish a list of responsible parties, which 
the bill would define as an entity with a majority ownership interest in a business engaged in 
extracting or refining fossil fuel that, during the covered period, did business in the state or 
otherwise had sufficient contact with the state and is determined by the agency to be responsible 
for more than 1,000,000,000 metric tons of covered fossil fuel emissions, as defined, in aggregate, 
globally during the covered period.   (Based on  04/25/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1502 Ashby, D 
 

Controlled 
substances: 
xylazine. 

06/06/2024 
- 
Amended H
TML PDF 

07/02/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(13). 
(Last 
location was 
PUB. S. on 
6/3/2024) 

07/02/2024 - 
Assembly  DE
AD 

The California Uniform Controlled Substances Act categorizes controlled substances into 5 
schedules and places the greatest restrictions on those substances contained in Schedule I. 
Under current law, the substances in Schedule I are deemed to have a high potential for abuse 
and no accepted medical use while substances in Schedules II through V are substances that 
have an accepted medical use, but have the potential for abuse. Current law restricts the 
prescription, furnishing, possession, sale, and use of controlled substances, and makes a violation 
of those laws a crime, except as specified. Current law defines drug paraphernalia and prohibits, 
among other things, the manufacture, sale, and possession, as specified, of drug paraphernalia. 
Current law excludes from these prohibitions any testing equipment that is designed, marketed, 
used, or intended to be used to analyze a substance for the presence of fentanyl, ketamine, 
gamma hydroxybutyric acid, or any analog of fentanyl. This bill would add xylazine to the list of 
Schedule III substances, as specified. If an animal drug containing xylazine that has been 
approved under the federal Food, Drug and Cosmetic Act is not available for sale in California, the 
bill would create an exception for a substance that is intended to be used to compound an animal 
drug, as specified.   (Based on  06/06/2024 text) 

SB 1502 Letter of 
Support 
04.03.24.pdf 

Support 

SB 1505 Stern, D 
 

Aircraft 
registration. 

02/16/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
TRANS. on 
2/29/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law prohibits a person from driving, moving, or leaving standing upon a highway any motor 
vehicle, as defined, unless it has been registered with the Department of Motor Vehicles. Current 
law generally requires specified information to be submitted to the department and specified 
vehicle registration fees to be paid to the department at the time of a vehicle’s registration or a 
renewal of a vehicle’s registration. Under current law, it is an infraction for a person to violate, or 
fail to comply with, a provision of the Vehicle Code, unless otherwise specified. This bill would 
require the owner of an aircraft based in this state to register the aircraft with the department, as 
specified. The bill would require the original or renewal registration of an aircraft to include 
specified information. Because a violation of these provisions would be a crime, the bill would 
impose a state-mandated local program.   (Based on  02/16/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=9s/e4Yz6sTUb42cbkkG3xLm7UGwCYMj3qQkD59ZrKH93kgUj0bkAOdR/C2fazcNI1dlorXXADC6/FBTue5ZpRuJmIGHpPYlywk+HUkjnw7w=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/423
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1451-1500/sb_1497_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1451-1500/sb_1497_97_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1451-1500/sb_1497_97_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=eWvf4z1upZOA1GYYc+MYsmgfLOHMGPAcRTuAy3LZ/Vz8cIDncrZUk/rlF926rilni0bDothweUtQbMqFaWPVq1wDw460OQOORuFPrALffX4=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/335
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1501-1550/sb_1502_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1501-1550/sb_1502_95_A_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1501-1550/sb_1502_95_A_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=8C753B9E-CDAE-472C-B531-59E1D9859CDB
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=8C753B9E-CDAE-472C-B531-59E1D9859CDB
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/document/?id=8C753B9E-CDAE-472C-B531-59E1D9859CDB
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=t9vG75qirjYygRAds9i7ceKgwJu8lSRtlsvzflG6Exjutry/UXLx1QWgLIk5tlOFzRwLU5RfMebwVeBCJYyZ9KbKTi1/T//UcY1n5zxHn4M=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/263
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1501-1550/sb_1505_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1501-1550/sb_1505_99_I_bill.pdf
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SB 1506 Stern, D 
 

Housing Crisis 
Act of 2019. 

02/16/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
RLS. on 
2/16/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The Housing Crisis Act of 2019, among other things, prohibits an affected city or affected county 
from approving any development project that will require the demolition of occupied or vacant 
protected units, or that is located on a site where protected units were demolished in the previous 
5 years, unless specified requirements are satisfied. Current law defines various terms for the 
purpose of carrying out these provisions. This bill would make nonsubstantive changes to the 
definition provisions.    (Based on  02/16/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SB 1510 Stern, D 
 

Permitting: 
electric vehicle 
charging. 

02/16/2024 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
RLS. on 
2/16/2024) 

08/31/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

Current law requires every city, county, and city and county to administratively approve an 
application to install electric vehicle charging stations through the issuance of a building permit or 
similar nondiscretionary permit and requires the review of an application to install an electric 
vehicle charging station to be limited to the building official’s review of whether it meets all health 
and safety requirements of local, state, and federal law. Current law requires an electric vehicle 
charging station to comply with, among other things, all applicable rules of the Public Utilities 
Commission regarding safety and reliability, as specified. This bill would express the intent of the 
Legislature to enact subsequent legislation that would reduce state and local permitting barriers for 
electric vehicle charging.   (Based on  02/16/2024 text) 

 Monitor 

SBX1 1 Jones, R 
 

Motor vehicle 
fuel tax: 
greenhouse 
gas reduction 
programs: 
suspension. 

12/05/2022 
- 
Introduced 
HTML PDF 

08/31/2024 - 
Failed 
Deadline 
pursuant to 
Rule 
61(b)(17). 
(Last 
location was 
RLS. on 
12/5/2022) 

08/31/2024 - 
Senate  DEAD 

The California Global Warming Solutions Act of 2006 requires the State Air Resources Board to 
adopt rules and regulations to achieve the maximum technologically feasible and cost-effective 
greenhouse gas emissions reductions to ensure that the statewide greenhouse gas emissions are 
reduced to at least 40% below the statewide greenhouse gas emissions limit, as defined, no later 
than December 31, 2030. Pursuant to the act, the state board has adopted the Low Carbon Fuel 
Standard regulations. The act authorizes the state board to include in its regulation of those 
emissions the use of market-based compliance mechanisms. Current law requires all moneys, 
except for fines and penalties, collected by the state board from the auction or sale of allowances 
as part of a market-based compliance mechanism to be deposited in the Greenhouse Gas 
Reduction Fund. This bill would suspend the Low Carbon Fuel Standard regulations for one year. 
The bill would also exempt suppliers of transportation fuels from regulations for the use of market-
based compliance mechanisms for one year.   (Based on  12/05/2022 text) 

 Monitor 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=L7NJrMl4YwAld6WTcI9ncwhEveimIgAjCwxZXJnn1apTIkTauxkDIVbvy9QB4noz2psneePg+aZDssk913uDPJR3WfasPNTBC9MwZvKQ21E=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/263
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1501-1550/sb_1506_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1501-1550/sb_1506_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=wTtK0IY9XcJug5rkiZNEJDnU69r76/VUVFl4iH9qwigO/GCeL8ePUtldlEfHVRkENBI5gKtwKqMX/kwA/BtgM13R9D1fgd24AfgpBCgM2WA=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/263
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1501-1550/sb_1510_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_1501-1550/sb_1510_99_I_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=g7GdW3rb/oUaTdznFIGd7+PZ2YljKtb3fLtcBLjLiszLBkxhZ5bnqgXaVDLXzi00BQIERdsQ3KXOCLwbdZvYfALjP/TQefbc43ZW3wPAB+A=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/404
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sbx1_1_99_I_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sbx1_1_99_I_bill.pdf
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SBX1 2 Skinner, D 
 

Energy: 
transportation 
fuels: supply 
and pricing: 
maximum 
gross gasoline 
refining margin. 

03/28/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

03/28/2023 - 
Approved by 
the 
Governor. 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State. 
Chapter 1, 
Statutes of 
2023-24 
First 
Extraordinar
y Session.  

03/27/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Current law requires operators of refineries in the state that produce gasoline meeting California 
specifications, within 30 days of the end of each calendar month, to submit a report to the State 
Energy Resources Conservation and Development Commission containing certain information 
regarding its refining activities related to the production of gasoline in that month. Current law 
requires the commission to notify a refiner that has failed to timely provide the required information 
and imposes a civil penalty on the refiner that fails to submit the required information within 5 days 
of being notified of the failure. This bill would authorize the commission to establish a maximum 
gross gasoline refining margin, as provided. The bill would require the commission, if the 
commission establishes the maximum gross gasoline refining margin, to establish a penalty for 
exceeding the maximum gross gasoline refining margin, as provided. The bill would authorize the 
commission to petition the court to enjoin a refiner from exceeding the maximum gross gasoline 
refining margin. The bill would also authorize the commission to impose an administrative civil 
penalty on a refiner for exceeding the maximum gross gasoline refining margin, as provided. The 
bill would require the commission to consider a refiner’s request for an exemption from the 
maximum gross gasoline refining margin, as provided. The bill would require a refiner seeking an 
exemption to file a statement under the penalty of perjury setting forth the basis of the request for 
exemption.    (Based on  03/28/2023 text) 

 Monitor 

SJR 7 Wahab, D 
 

Federal 
constitutional 
convention: 
firearms. 

09/21/2023 
- 
Chaptered 
HTML PDF 

09/21/2023 - 
Chaptered 
by Secretary 
of State- 
Chapter175, 
Statutes of 
2023 

09/21/2023 - 
Senate  CHAP
TERED 

Would apply to the United States Congress to call a constitutional convention under Article V of 
the Constitution of the United States for the purpose of proposing a constitutional amendment 
relating to firearms, as specified. This bill contains other existing laws.   (Based on  09/21/2023 
text) 

 Monitor 

Total Measures: 627 
Total Tracking Forms: 627 
 

https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=ICyRUyCwFX/b3i/7Z6Vt+/WVHpjgUbhPfN/BHKeaPjNAZhlnPziar//GA5CmR/IyfrK+fQjRgKs1msMJwtScvwgZjzKeeeFVVujHOndul1Y=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/260
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sbx1_2_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sbx1_2_96_C_bill.pdf
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/public/23/report/bill/?id=0SfUcS6UaC2OJztA9q+qhqYbhmXgqDjAd6zpKgVoyDzsSopPNTkLBvzNzeS3cr0dzGUQTv11EJVvYp22qF6x6s5JqB/LjoYQnCZU++Vt+dg=
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/Member/Index/420
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sjr_7_96_C_bill.htm
https://ct35.capitoltrack.com/23/bill/ViewDoc/?doc=//sen/sb_0001-0050/sjr_7_96_C_bill.pdf
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The Intergovernmental Relations team closely monitored several state bills related to 
homelessness and affordable housing within the Legislative Program.   
 
 
Signed Bills 
 

• SB 7 (Blakespear): This bill adds new requirements for homelessness outcome 
reporting. 

 
• SB 450 (Atkins): This bill streamlines housing project approvals. 

 
• SB 937 (Wiener): This bill defers impact (mitigation) fees till a project’s 

completion. 
 

• SB 1211 (Skinner): This bill increases the allowable number of detached 
accessory dwelling units eligible for ministerial permitting on lots with an existing 
multifamily development. 
 

• SB 1395 (Becker): This bill supports emergency shelter by right land use. 
 

• AB 1886 (Alvarez): This bill allows builder’s remedy to take effect when a 
jurisdiction's Housing Element is found to be out of compliance by either the 
California Department of Housing and Community Development or a court. 

 
• AB 1893 (Wicks): This bill ensures that developers using builder’s remedy still 

have to comply with objective standards. 
 

• AB 2347 (Kalra): This bill expands the time that a tenant of residential real 
property has to file an answer to an unlawful detainer from five days to 10 days, 
requires that a landlord must file proof of service at least three days before they 
may request a default, and specifies timelines and procedures for a defendant to 
file a demurrer or motion to strike. 
 

• AB 3035 (Pellerin): This expands the existing streamlined, ministerial approval 
process for farmworker housing to Santa Clara and Santa Cruz counties. 
 

 
Dead Bills  
 

• SB 225 (Caballero): This bill would have supported anti-displacement efforts 
through funding and acquiring unrestricted housing units. 
 

• SB 270 (Weiner): This bill would have provided CEQA exemptions for housing 
projects. 
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• SB 363 (Eggman): This bill would have created a dashboard on the availability of 

beds in inpatient facilities. 
 

• SB 405 (Cortese): This bill would have required outreach to property owners as 
part of the housing element process. 
 

• SB 466 (Wahab): This bill would have amended the Costa-Hawkins Rental 
Housing Act to allow expansion of rent stabilization in cities with pre-1995 rent 
stabilization ordinance. 
 

• SB 634 (Becker): This bill would have supported emergency shelter by right land 
use. 
 

• SB 1462 (Glazer): This bill would have allowed developers, under certain 
circumstances, to use a buyer’s deposit for new condominium buildings towards 
construction costs. 
 

• SB 1470 (Glazer): This bill would have amended construction defect liability law 
to limit developer responsibility. 
 

• AB 59 (Gallagher): This bill would have raised the qualifying income threshold 
and increase the tax credit received for renter's tax credits. 
 

• AB 430 (Bennett): This bill would have updated the statutory definition of a 
Community Land Trust to enable utilization of the welfare tax exemption for the 
various property types that Community Land Trusts manage. 
 

• AB 919 (Kalra): This bill would have created a right of first offer requirement for 
the sale of residential property. 
 

• AB 1000 (Reyes): This bill would have limited warehouse developments. 
 

• AB 1532 (Haney): This bill would have made office conversion projects by right 
regardless of zoning. 
 

• AB 1657 (Wicks): This bill would have authorized bonds to fund affordable rental 
housing and homeownership programs. 
 

• AB 2584 (Lee): This bill would have prohibited a business entity, as defined, that 
has an interest in more than 1,000 single-family residential properties from 
purchasing, acquiring, or otherwise obtaining an ownership interest in another 
single-family residential property and subsequently leasing the property. 
 



Attachment C: Legislation Related to Legislative Priority: Reduce Unsheltered 
Homelessness, Support Unhoused Residents, and Increase Affordable Housing 
Supply 
 

3 
 

• AB 2881 (Lee): This bill would have enacted the Social Housing Act and 
establish the California Housing Authority for the purposes of development 
mixed-income social housing. 
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The Intergovernmental Relations team closely monitored several state bills related to 
safety and Vision Zero issues aligned with the Legislative Program.  
 
 
Signed Bills 
 

• SB 268 (Alvarado-Gil): This bill classifies all rape violations as violent felonies. 
 

• SB 400 (Wahab): This bill clarifies that law enforcement agencies have the 
discretion to proactively share disclosable incidents of misconduct without a 
public records request. 
 

• SB 982 (Wahab): This bill extends the operation of the crime of organized retail 
theft indefinitely. 
 

• AB 2943 (Zbur): This bill creates a new crime of retail theft with intent to sell. 
 
 
Dead Bills 
 

• SB 8 (Blakespear): This bill would have mandated a statewide gun liability 
insurance requirement modeled after San José’s 2022 ordinance. 
 

• SB 13 (Ochoa Bogh): This bill would have required a written notice to someone 
that pleads guilty or no contest to certain drug crimes to advise that future 
offenses could lead to manslaughter or murder charges. This was the Senate 
companion bill to AB 18. 
 

• SB 44 (Umberg): This bill would have required written advisory of increased 
penalties for a person convicted of selling or manufacturing controlled 
substances if a person dies as a result of future repeated action. 
 

• SB 226 (Alvarado Gil): This bill would have prohibited the possession of fentanyl 
when armed with a loaded and operable firearm. 
 

• SB 237 (Grove): This bill would have increased penalties for possession, 
production, and trafficking of fentanyl. 
 

• SB 377 (Skinner): This bill would have removed the 10-day firearm waiting period 
exemption for peace officers and allow this exemption to apply only to law 
enforcement agencies. 
 

• SB 915 (Cortese): This bill would have required autonomous vehicle service be 
authorized by local jurisdiction. 
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• AB 18 (Patterson): This bill would have required a written notice to someone that 
pleads guilty or no contest to certain drug crimes to advise that future offenses 
could lead to manslaughter or murder charges. This was the Assembly 
companion bill to SB 13. 
 

• AB 21 (Gipson): This bill would have required peace officer training on 
interactions with people Alzheimer’s disease or dementia. 
 

• AB 29 (Gabriel): This bill would have allowed a California resident the ability to 
list themselves on a firearm “do not sell” list. 
 

• AB 73 (Boerner): This bill would have required people 18 years and over who are 
riding a bicycle on a two-lane highway and approach a stop sign at an 
intersection to yield the right-of-way to any vehicles or pedestrians that are 
already at the intersection. 
 

• AB 328 (Essayli): This bill would have prohibited a court from dismissing some 
firearms-related sentencing enhancements. 
 

• AB 367 (Maienschein): This bill would have added sentence enhancements for 
providing controlled substance to someone who sustains significant harm from 
using it. 
 

• AB 667 (Maienschein): This bill would have increased gun violence restraining 
orders from a maximum of five years to 10 years. 
 

• AB 742 (Jackson): This bill would have prohibited the use of police canines in 
certain circumstances. 
 

• AB 1990: This bill would have authorized a peace officer to make a warrantless 
arrest for a misdemeanor shoplifting offense. 
 

• AB 2583 (Berman): This bill would have lowered school speed limits to 20 mph. 
 

• AB 3067 (Gipson): This bill would have required information on firearm storage 
on insurance questionnaires. This bill was gut-and-amended and was no longer 
tracked. 
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The Intergovernmental Relations team closely monitored several state bills related to 
advancing educational and employment opportunities aligned with the Legislative 
Program. 
 
 
Signed Bills 
 

• SB 1142 (Menjivar): This bill requires an electrical or gas corporation to restore 
service to a residential customer whose service was previously terminated for 
nonpayment upon entering into an amortization agreement. 

 
• AB 51 (Bonta): This bill expands access to early childhood education. 

 
• AB 1831 (Berman): This bill expands the scope of child sex crimes to include 

digitally altered or generated materials by the use of artificial intelligence. 
 
 
Vetoed Bills 
 

• SB 892 (Padilla): This bill would have required the state to develop and adopt an 
automated decision tool procurement standard. 
 

• SB 1047 (Wiener): This bill would have enacted safety standards for develops of 
artificial intelligence. 

 
 
Dead Bills 
 

• SB 933 (Wahab): This bill would have expanded the crime of child sex materials 
to include images generated by the use of artificial intelligence. 
 

• SB 1502 (Ashby): This bill would have restricted use and availability of xylazine. 
 

• AB 24 (Haney): This bill would have required overdose kits to be available in 
certain public spaces, including libraries. 
 

• AB 437 (Jackson): This bill would have defined equity for state agencies. 
 

• AB 441 (Haney): This bill would have enabled advance monthly payments of 
California Earned Income Tax Credit, Young Child Tax Credit, and Foster Youth 
Credit, if the combined value of credits is at least $1,000. 
 

• AB 605 (Arambula): This bill would have expanded CalFresh benefits for 
California-grown fruits and vegetables. 
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• AB 662 (Boerner): This bill would have required the state to use processes 

consistent with federal regulations when administering federal Broadband Equity 
Access and Deployment Program funds. 
 

• AB 679 (Wicks): This bill would have increased the reimbursement rate for meals 
served in family childcare homes. 
 

• AB 1321 (Bonta): This bill would have established a grant program to support 
California families. 
 

• AB 1565 (Jones-Sawyer): This bill would have funded equity grants for cannabis 
businesses. 
 

• AB 1588 (Wilson): This bill would have expanded access to affordable internet to 
participants of certain public assistance programs. 
 

• AB 1644 (Bonta): This bill would have created a nutrition support program 
through Medi-Cal. 
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The Intergovernmental Relations team closely monitored several state bills related to 
downtown and equitable community investment issues aligned with the Legislative 
Program. 
 
 
Signed Bills 
 

• SB 969 (Wiener): This bill allows local jurisdictions to establish entertainment 
zones. 
 

• SB 1103 (Menjivar): This bill requires commercial landlords to provide contract 
and notice translations for month-to-month rent increases or lease terminations, 
and places transparency and proportionality requirements on the fees a landlord 
may impose to recover building operating costs from qualified tenants. 
 

• AB 1775 (Haney): This bill empowers local governments to authorize cannabis 
cafes, allowing cannabis retails to sell coffee, food, and offer live entertaining on-
site. 

 
• AB 2922 (Garcia): This bill reestablishes the authorization for capital investment 

incentive programs until January 1, 2035. 
 
 
Dead Bills 
 

• SB 1462 (Glazer): This bill would have allowed a condominium deposit to be 
used towards construction costs. 
 

• SB 1470 (Glazer): This bill would have amended construction defect lability law 
on developers. 
 

• AB 930 (Friedman): This bill would have permitted two or more local 
governments to jointly form a Reinvestment in Infrastructure for Sustainable and 
Equitable California district to unlock tax increment financing for infrastructure 
and equitable development. 
 

• AB 1669 (Quirk-Silva): This bill would have established the California Historically 
Significant District Program for the purpose of revitalizing and maintaining 
historically and culturally significant commercial corridors. 
 



Attachment G – Legislation Related to Legislative Priority: Pursue Funding for 
Equitable, Sustainable, and Resilient Infrastructure and Advance San José's 
Climate Smart Goals 
 

1 
 

The Intergovernmental Relations team closely monitored several state bills related to 
infrastructure and environmental issues that are aligned with the Legislative Program. 
 
 
Signed Bills 
 

 
• SB 707 (Newman): This bill requires producers to create a stewardship program 

for collecting and recycling items like clothes and other textile products that are 
not suitable for reuse. 
 

• SB 867 (Allen): This bill authorizes the issuance of $15.5 million in bonds to 
finance projects for drought, flood, and water resilience, wildfire and forest 
resilience, coastal resilience, extreme heat mitigation, biodiversity and nature-
based climate solutions, park creation and outdoor access, and clean energy 
programs. 
 

• SB 960 (Wiener): This bill requires the California Department of Transportation to 
incorporate complete streets facilities into state transportation planning. 
 

• AB 440 (Pellerin): This bill moves Assembly Constitutional Amendment 13 from 
the November 2024 ballot to the November 2026 ballot. 
 

• AB 1505 (Rodriguez): This bill provides an exception to the Bagley-Keene Open 
Meeting Act for the California Earthquake Authority (CEA). 
 

• AB 2813 (Aguiar-Curry): This bill modifies the definition of affordable housing and 
public infrastructure for the purposes of Assembly Constitutional Amendment 1. 
 
 

Vetoed Bills 
 

• SB 301 (Portantino): This bill would have required the State Air Resources Board 
to create the Zero-Emission Aftermarket Conversion Project to provide a rebate 
of up to $4000 to any California resident who converts their vehicle into zero 
emission. 

 
 
Dead Bills 
 

• SB 83 (Wiener): This bill would have required public utility companies to provide 
comments on post-entitlement phase permit applications and connect new 
construction to the electrical grid within specific timeframes. 
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• SB 396 (Wahab): This bill would have required a city or county to provide 
notification through its website prior to any local agency-led excavation projects 
to encourage collaborative installation of utilities and infrastructure. 
 

• SB 511 (Blakespear): This bill would have required the California Air Resource 
Board to produce an inventory of greenhouse gas emissions every five years for 
every opt-in city or county along with a plan to achieve the maximum feasible 
reductions in emissions. 
 

• SB 638 (Eggman): This bill would have authorized the issuance of $6 million in 
bonds pursuant for flood protection and climate resiliency projects. 
 

• SB 1031 (Wiener): This bill would have authorized the Metropolitan 
Transportation Commission to place a regional transportation measure on the 
ballot in all nine Bay Area counties. 
 
AB 6 (Friedman): This bill would have required the state board to establish 
additional greenhouse gas emissions reduction targets for 2035 and 2045 
respectively and require a metropolitan planning organization to submit the 
technical methodology.   
 

• AB 7 (Friedman): This bill would have required government agencies related to 
transportation, such as the Department of Transportation and California 
Transportation Commission, to incorporate certain principles into their processes 
for transportation projects by 2025. 
 

• AB 9 (Muratsuchi) and SB 12 (Stern): These bills would have required the State 
Air Resources Board to ensure that statewide greenhouse gas emissions are 
reduced to at least 40% below the 1990 level by 2030.  
 

• AB 62 (Mathis): This bill would have established a statewide goal to increase 
above- and below-ground water storage capacity by a total of 3,700,000 acre-
feet by the year 2030 and a total of 4,000,000 acre-feet by the year 2040.  
 

• AB 305 (Villapudua): This bill would have authorized the issuance of $4.5 million 
in bonds to finance a program to improve California’s droughts, water parks, 
climate, coastal protection, and outdoor access for all. 
 

• AB 422 (Alanis): This bill would have required the California National Resources 
Agency to post on its website information tracking the progress to increase 
statewide water storage. 
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• AB 538 (Holden): This bill would have transitioned the California Independent 
System Operator into a regional transmission organization and is intended to 
enable more sharing of power across state lines. 
 

• AB 990 (Grayson): This bill would have required the regional water board that 
covers the San Francisco Bay area to make modifications to its waste discharge 
requirements by July 2024. 
 

• AB 1082 (Kalra): This bill would have limited the ability to remove or immobilize a 
vehicle due to unpaid parking tickets, limit lien sales to cover towing and storage 
expenses, and prohibited Department of Motor Vehicle registration holds on a 
vehicle with less than three unpaid parking citations. 
 

• AB 1538 (Muratsachi): This bill would have established the Clean Energy 
Reliability Program, which would give incentives to load-serving entities that 
purchase eligible resources with extra target procurement. 
 

• AB 1567 (Garcia): This bill would have authorized the issuance of bonds in the 
amount of $15.9 million to finance projects for safe drinking water, wildfire 
prevention, drought preparation, flood protection, extreme heat mitigation, clean 
energy, and workforce development programs. 
 

• AB 2583 (Berman): This bill would have established a speed limit of 25 miles per 
hour in school zones. 
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U.S. Representative Anna Eshoo 
• $250,000 for Happy Hollow Park Microgrid: Funding will provide for the 

construction of a microgrid system to service Happy Hollow Park. Happy Hollow 
Park, adjoining the Kelley Park-Leininger Center campus, serves disadvantaged 
communities as a planned emergency refuge for heating, cooling, power, and 
lodging. Happy Hollow Park also houses multiple endangered species and 
includes a sanitary sewer pump station that requires continuous electrical power 
to prevent wastewater from entering Coyote Creek. This project equips this 
sheltering campus with solar and battery storage to replace diesel generators for 
emergency power and mitigates hazards to critical infrastructure and wildlife 
habitats. Additionally, the development of green microgrid technology can reduce 
the impacts of persistent threats to human life, such as urban heat island effect or 
climate change, and helps the city, state, and federal governments meet 
decarbonization goals. 

 
U.S. Representatives Ro Khanna and Zoe Lofgren 

• $2,000,000 for Alum Rock Business Corridor Revitalization Project: Funding will 
aim to retain businesses, unlock investment, and drive entrepreneurship and 
wealth creation along the Alum Rock Business Corridor. Residents in the area 
have the lowest household income in Silicon Valley, and they could have the 
opportunity, through targeted investment, to benefit from the nearby planned 
BART Phase II transit infrastructure. The strategy is to target investment in critical 
sites and create new opportunities for existing and new businesses to strengthen 
the local economy and benefit from long-term change. Specifically, this project 
will: (1) Revitalize a mostly vacant 28,475 square foot commercial building (1747-
1785 Alum Rock Avenue) in the historic Mayfair neighborhood; (2) Increase the 
capacity of technical assistance providers and local small businesses to support 
in the creation of new companies and jobs; (3) Invest in restaurant and food 
sector-based businesses, and; (4) Set aside funding for streetscape investments 
and other rehabilitation projects along the corridor.   

 
U.S. Representative Jimmy Panetta 

• $2,000,000 for Cahalan Park Recreation Upgrades: Funding will support design, 
construction, and project management fees for four to eight new pickleball courts 
in District 10 at Cahalan Park located at 770 Pearlwood Way. Pickleball is a 
growing sport with a growing demand for outdoor pickleball facilities. The City 
seeks to install new pickleball courts in existing parks to provide greater access 
and a more equitable distribution. The project will also include the installation of 
accessible pathways to connect park users to the new courts, restrooms, and 
parking areas. Additionally, stormwater mitigation will be included in the project 
scope. 
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• $1,000,000 for Yerba Buena Bridge Reconstruction: Funds will support the 
development of construction plans with City staff and contracted consultants and 
will support project management, permitting, inspection services, environmental 
monitoring, demolition, construction, and improvements to the existing hillside. 
Funding provides labor costs for City staff, local consulting firms, regulatory 
agencies, and construction crews. The Yerba Buena Bridge was originally 
constructed in the early twentieth century and has been a staple of the 
community, linking neighbors to recreational access and educational centers. 
The bridge has fallen into disrepair and requires removal and replacement. The 
bridge serves as a crossing over Yerba Buena Creek and connects 
neighborhoods to high-use areas, including parks, Evergreen Community 
College, transit stops, bike lanes, workforce opportunities, and abundant open 
space. Without this vital connection, employment, education, and physical health 
opportunities are reduced. 
 

• $250,000 for Sideshow and Street Racing Deterrence in Evergreen and East San 
José: Funding will enable the Department of Transportation to implement quick-
build installation and hardscape enhancements to deter illegal and dangerous 
speeding exhibitions, known as sideshows, and street racing, which will improve 
traffic and pedestrian safety. Illegal sideshows and street racing are an ongoing 
major public safety issue in San José, as well as statewide. Sideshows are 
unauthorized events that draw large crowds of spectators, with drivers 
performing dangerous stunts in the public right of way. This often results in 
property damage, blocked roadways impacting emergency services, and risk of 
severe injuries and death, both to spectators and to the surrounding community. 
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